

SALE SUMMARY LIST

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-787-2238,
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.
WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.
No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|--|--|---------------|-----------|-------------------|
| REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles | | | | |
| Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306. | | | | |
| 1,711.00 6-001 | Car 2013 CHEVROLET, Impala LS, FWD, 3.6L, V6, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/locks/windows/driver seat, truck release, keyless entry- 2 fobs -2 keys , white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 276,847 km , , PROBLEMS: Transmission shift hard (bangs), suspension & attachments front links poor, check engine light with fault codes P0877-00 - transmissions fluid pressure 4, P0989-00 - transmission fluid pressure 5, P069E-00 - fuel pump control module, missing plastic engine cover, front left carpet worn holes, bumper front chips, left front fender dent, roof dent, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is | 276,847 km | \$1,082 | 2G1WA5E37D1187215 |
| 4,175.00 6-002 | Car 2009 CHRYSLER, Sebring LX , FWD, 2.4L, inline 4, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated mirrors/locks/windows, trunk release, keyless entry 2- key fobs , silver, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 226,442 km , , PROBLEMS: Front and rear pads/rotors need to be repaired, gas cap door does not close tight, tire pressure monitor system (TPMS) light while driving, driver sun visor poor, hood paint bubbling/hail dents/scratches, both bumpers chips/scratches, left front fender scratches, left front door rust at bottom, right side doors rusted at bottom/chips, roof hail damage, trunk lid hail/rust, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is | 226,442 km | \$980 | 1C3LC46BX9N557183 |
| 4,089.89 6-004 | Car 2011 DODGE, Avenger SXT, FWD, 2.4L, inline 4, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/windows/locks, trunk release, 2 key fobs , silver, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 245,220 km , , PROBLEMS: Shock absorbers & strut assemblies need to be repaired, both front struts leaking, both rear struts sweating, suspension/axles right front axle seal poo, front wheel alignment needed, both rocker arms have surface rust, gas door doesn't close tight, left head light fogged, right front door dent, hood paint bubbling/hail/scratches, both bumpers scratch/chips, left front door rust at bottom, right side doors rust at bottom of doors, roof hail dents, trunk lid rust bottom edge hail dents, windshield cracked, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is | 245,220 km | \$1,369 | 1B3BD4FB8BN514053 |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|-----------------------|--|---------------|-----------|-------------------|
| 4,273.57 6-005 | Car 2011 DODGE, Avenger SXT, FWD, 2.4L, inline 4, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors, power locks/windows, trunk release, keyless entry -2 key fobs , silver, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 235,349 km, Recent Repairs: Instrument lamps, PROBLEMS: Hood dents/ paint bubbling/ scratches, both bumpers chips/scratches, left front fender scratches, right rear fender crease, left rear door rust at bottom, right rear door badly rusted, roof hail, trunk lid hail dents/ rusting at bottom, windshield chips, windshield blades need replacement, head lamp foggy, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> , As is, Where is | 235,349 km | \$1,445 | 1B3BD4FB3BN528166 |
| 2,575.00 6-007 | SUV 2008 JEEP, Liberty, Sport, 4WD, 2.7L, V6, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, driving lights, power mirrors, windows, locks, keyless entry-2 key fobs Hitch, trailer wiring , white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 272,415 km, , PROBLEMS: Right lower ball joint, inner tie rod, front, rear U joints need replacement, driver belts, rear rotors, left front axels and transmission case need attention, four wheel alignment, check engine codes (PO452 EVAP pressure switch, PO456 EVAP leak, PO300 misfire), all pads and rotors need replacement, tire pressure monitor system (TPMS) on, hood prop not secured, rear right door gasket ripped, antenna on roof rusted at base, molding loose on left front door, hood chips, both bumpers' chips/scratches, right front fender scratched, both dog legs rusted, left front door rusted, rear left door rusted at bottom, both right doors rusted at bottom, roof rusted, tailgate rusted, windshield chips, both front seats missing trim, wiper blades need replacement, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is | 272,415 km | \$728 | 1J8GN28K38W251775 |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|-----------------------|---|---------------|-----------|-------------------|
| 7,575.00 6-009 | Truck 2012 DODGE, Ram 1500 , 4WD, Crew Cab, 5.7L, V8, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry -2 key fobs -2 keys Has back seat, 5'8" box, front tow hooks, grille inserts, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, electric brake control, roof rack brackets no cross bar, black Leer topper rear corners chipped, sliding windows in good condition., black, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 244,369 km , PROBLEMS: Both outer CV boots torn, front wheel alignment out of spec, exhaust manifolds leaking, rear rotors slight surface rust, right low beam not working, left plate light not working, paint worn our rear near topper, both rear fenders road rash/scratches, center console incomplete, hood dents/scratches, front bumper rusted, rear bumper scratches, left rear door scratches, right front door dent, roof small rust spots, hole in roof 2 sealed, tailgate chips/scratches/dents, windshield small chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is | 244,369 km | \$4,245 | 1C6RD7KT1CS224678 |
| 6,177.00 6-010 | Truck 2013 DODGE, Ram 1500 SLT, 4WD, Quad Cab, 6'4" box, 4.8L, V8, gas, auto, AM/FM, AC, tilt, cruise power heated mirrors, power locks/windows/left front seat, keyless entry 2 key fobs, 2 keys Front tow hooks, sidestep, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, original equipment manufacturer(OEM) electric brakes, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 272,527 km , PROBLEMS: Steering linkage inner tie rod end, transmission out put seal leaking, left and right axle shaft, both lower ball joints, bellows on rack torn, missing wheel wrench and jack, air filter dusty, poor tires, back up lamp, right cab corner dented/rusted, right and left front door glass scratched. Left rear taillight cracked, hood paint bubbling, front bumper rust/scrapes, rear bumper rusted/dents, left front fender rusted, left rear fender rusted/dents, fender right front and rear rusted, left side doors dents/road rash, right rear door road rash, roof scratched, tailgate rust/dents, windshield large stone bruises, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is | 272,527 km | \$2,898 | 1C6RR7GP4DS558864 |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|-----------------------|---|---------------|-----------|-------------------|
| 6,075.00 6-011 | Truck 2014 DODGE, Ram 2500, RWD, crew cab, 6'7" box, 5.7L, V8, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power heated mirrors, locks, windows, keyless entry – 2 key fobs, 1 key Grille inserts, mud flaps, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, original equipment manufacture (OEM) trailer brake, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 322,901 km, , PROBLEMS: Both exhaust manifolds leaking, all four tires need replacement, box damaged on left side, tailgate does not open, front bumper rust spots, left front fender dent/rust, left rear fender cracked/dents, right front fender rust, right rear fender cracked/dents, left rear door dent, windshield chips, 4 holes in front hump mat, 2 of the holes are through the floor pan, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is | 322,901 km | \$4,605 | 3C6TR4CT8EG192973 |
| 4,075.00 6-013 | Truck 2007 FORD, F150, Supercab, RWD, Extended cab, 6'6" box, 4.6L, V8, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, 2 keys Loose headache rack in box - may not be compatible with vehicle, hitch, trailer wiring., grey, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 258,022 km, , PROBLEMS: Rack and pinion steering leaking, all four tires are leaking and need an alignment, front seat stained/ripped, hood dents, front bumper dented, rear bumper rusts/dents, left front fender chips/paint chips, left rear fender rust, right front fender road rash, right rear fender rust, left front door dents/chips/weather stripping, roof scratches/stains from magnets, tailgate dents/scratches/bent, inside of box dented/scratched, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is | 258,022 km | \$1,172 | 1FTRX12W87FB24034 |
| 3,875.00 6-014 | Van 2008 CHEVROLET, Uplander, FWD, 3.9L, V6, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/locks/front windows, keyless entry- 3 fobs- 2 keys 7 passenger, 2nd row captains chairs, 3rd row split bench, brown, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 236,018 km, , PROBLEMS: Rad support bent, front and rear alignment needed, noises and vibrations clunk in rear end, lock switches condition unknown, hood chips/dent/scratches, rear bumper scratches/cracks, left front and rear fender road rash/chips/scratches, dog leg rear scratches/road rash, both rocker panel rust inside at back doors, right both rear doors chips/dents/rust at bottom, roof small rust spots, tailgate rust/glass scratched, left front seat worn/soft, missing wheel covers, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is | 236,018 km | \$1,476 | 1GNDU23W68D162812 |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|--|---|-----------|-----------|-------------------|
| 6,510.00 6-015 | Van 2006 GMC, Savana 3500, Cargo, RWD, 6.0L, V8, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, rear heat, power locks, 1 key Cargo barrier, map box, computer stand, plywood floor, shelving, generator compartment, HD rear bumper, pintle hook, electric trailer brake, Warrick ladder at rear, condition unknown, frame supports inside van for ladder., white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 98,951 km, , PROBLEMS: Front and rear brakes rotors rusted, check engine light on with fault codes, P0030/P0050/P0053/P0059, A/C not working, left front signal light not working, grille faded/missing badge, hood dents/chips/scratches, front bumper rusted/dented, left front fenders broken/paint poor rear rusted, right fenders front and rear paint poor/ rusted/dented, rocker panel both sides rusted, left front door paint poor, right sides doors paint poor, roof scratched/dented, hole in roof sealed, tailgate paint poor, inside handle loose, windshield cracked, spare tire in cargo area, left front seat worn, cushion is poor, wheel wrench missing, jack missing, no first aid or fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is | 98,951 km | \$4,210 | 1GTHG35U861239441 |
| REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment. | | | | |
| Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306. | | | | |
| No Bid * 3-101 | Cargo Cover, OEM Chrysler cargo cover, roll out. grey vinyl May be compatible with a 2006 Dodge Magnum. Good | | \$40 | 192,088 |
| No Bid * 1-104 | Floor Mats - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), rubber, light grey in colour May be compatible with Chevrolet Astro. Excellent | | \$1 | |
| 4.00 * 1-105 | Floor Mats - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), rubber, light grey in colour May be compatible with Chevrolet Astro. Excellent | | \$1 | |
| 61.02 6-110 | Chest, Titan Stainless, Aluminum Front facing lock handle, 30.25"w x 17.75"d x 19.75"h, has some mount holes, no lock or keys. Good | | \$10 | |
| 60.00 6-111 | Chest, Titan Stainless, Aluminum Front facing lock handle, 30.25"w x 17.75"d x 19.75"h, has some mount holes, no lock or keys. Good | | \$10 | |
| 60.00 6-112 | Chest, Titan Stainless, Aluminum Front facing lock handle, 30.25"w x 17.75"d x 19.75"h, has some mount holes, no lock or keys. Good | | \$10 | |
| 60.00 6-113 | Chest, Titan Stainless, Aluminum Front facing lock handle, 30.25"w x 17.75"d x 19.75"h, has some mount holes, no lock or keys. Good | | \$10 | |
| 60.00 6-114 | Chest, Titan Stainless, Aluminum Front facing lock handle, 30.25"w x 17.75"d x 19.75"h, has some mount holes, no lock or keys. Good | | \$10 | |
| 211.00 6-115 | Fork Extensions, Set of 2Arnold Welding made, not Engineered 6.5"w x 84"d, inside to inside on back side. Good | | \$25 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|----------------|---|-----|-----------|------------------------|
| 211.00 6-116 | Fork Extensions, Set of 2 Arnold Welding made, not Engineered 6.5"w x 84"d, inside to inside on back side. Good | | \$25 | |
| 441.01 6-117 | Generator, Honda 2500 WATT, 2011 Has been sitting for awhile, unknown if operational. *No Meter. Comes with manuals. Good | | \$150 | EZCN 1089019 |
| 553.00 6-118 | Generator, Honda 3000 WATT, 2011 100 hrs, has been sitting for awhile, unknown if operational. Comes with manuals. Good | | \$150 | EZGL 1039336 |
| 553.00 6-119 | Generator, Honda 3000 WATT, 2011 138 hrs, has been sitting for awhile, unknown if operational. Good | | \$150 | EZGL 1039333 |
| 517.00 6-120 | Generator, Honda 3000 WATT, 2011 65 hrs, has been sitting for awhile, unknown if operational. Good | | \$150 | EZGL 1031207 |
| 517.00 6-121 | Generator, Honda 3000 WATT, 2011 78 hrs, has been sitting for awhile, unknown if operational. Good | | \$150 | EZGL 1039522 |
| 500.00 6-122 | Generator, Honda 3000 WATT, 2011 81.5 hrs, has been sitting for awhile, unknown if operational. Comes with manuals. Good | | \$150 | EZGL 1039514 |
| No Bid * 4-125 | GPS, GPS Tattle brand, remote monitoring device Online portal or Tattle Systems "Go mobile app" required. GPS may not be functional. Fair | | \$10 | |
| 6.00 * 3-106 | Inside Tailgate Cover, Ford Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM). Moulded black plastic May be compatible with a 2003 Ford Ranger. Good | | \$5 | Part # F77J-940726-AD. |
| 7.00 * 3-105 | Inside Tailgate Cover, Ford Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM). Moulded black plastic including top of tailgate May be compatible with a 2003 Ford Ranger. Good | | \$5 | Part # F77J-940726-AD. |
| 6.00 * 3-104 | Inside Tailgate Cover, Ford Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM). Moulded black plastic including top of tailgate. May be compatible with a 2003 Ford Ranger. Good | | \$5 | Part # F77J-940726-AD. |
| No Bid * 6-103 | Ladder rack, 64" w x 90" h Metal adjustable ladder rack with beacon. Mounting brackets included. White in color, unknown manufacturer. Good | | \$150 | |
| No Bid * 1-106 | License Plate Bracket - Front, Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), NO mounting kit May be compatible with 2002-2006 Sebring. Excellent | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 1-107 | License Plate Bracket - Front, Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), NO mounting kit May be compatible with 2002-2006 Sebring. Excellent | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 1-127 | License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 1-128 | License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 1-130 | License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent | | \$1 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|-----------------------|--|-----|-----------|---------------|
| No Bid * 1-131 | License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 1-113 | License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 1-114 | License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 1-115 | License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 1-116 | License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 1-117 | License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 1-110 | License Plate Bracket - Front, Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit. May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty. Excellent | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 1-111 | License Plate Bracket - Front, Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit. May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty. Excellent | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 1-112 | License Plate Bracket - Front, Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit. May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty. Excellent | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-123 | Manhole Gate Holder, Titan Stainless, aluminum 39"w x 46.5"d x 7.5"h, door hinge broken. Good | | \$15 | |
| No Bid * 3-135 | Pillar Trim, Ford Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Grey plastic, for left side inside pillar. Compatible with many Ford F250 and F350 trucks. Fair | | \$10 | |
| 3.02 * 4-107 | Safety Triangles, Lot of 2Auto Trend 18 inches each side. Good | | \$1 | |
| 111.01 6-102 | Shelves, 4 shelf unit, 2 shelf unit First metal shelf. 39 1/2"w x 14 1/2"d x 36 1/2"h, wood backing. Second metal shelf. 48"w x 18 1/2"d x 37"hm wood backing is warped. Good | | \$100 | |
| 3.02 * 1-132 | Shield for Inner Fender, 1 SetChrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) 1 right and 1 left, rear only, may be compatible with a 2008 Chrysler 1500, 2500 or 3500. Excellent | | \$1 | |
| 201.00 * 5-101 | Tailgate, Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Chevrolet Minor dents and scratches. May be compatible with 2002 and newer 1500, 2500, 3500 trucks, yellow. Good | | \$200 | A04010. |
| 201.00 * 5-102 | Tailgate, Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), GMC Sierra Missing one support cable. Minor dents or scratches. May be compatible with 2002 and newer 1500, 2500, 3500 trucks, yellow. Good | | \$200 | A02006. |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|------------------------|--|-----|-----------|---------------|
| No Bid * 11-125 | Tires, Set of 3225/65R/16 Firestone FR710. M+S, manufacture date: week 47, year 2016. Good | | \$120 | |
| No Bid * 2-102 | Tires, Set of 316 inch, 215/65R/16, Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X manufacture date: week 27, year 2018. Good | | \$120 | |
| No Bid * 2-128 | Tire, 16 inch, 225/65R/16, Sailun IceBlazer, Snowflake manufacture date. Week 16, year 2021. Good | | \$40 | |
| No Bid * 2-130 | Tires, Set of 216 inch, 205/60R/16, Matrix Tour RD Multi-mile. manufacture date: week 44, year 2011. Fair | | \$50 | |
| No Bid * 3-107 | Tires, Set of 4Dunlop Grantrek SJB. Snowflake. 215/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 13, year 2009. Fair | | \$120 | |
| 48.02 * 3-111 | Tires, Set of 4Firestone FR710. M+S 225/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 01, year 2016 Poor | | \$40 | |
| 225.00 6-104 | Tires, Set of 4 Firestone Winter Force 2. Snow flake. Mud and Snow. 225/55R/17 Manufacture date. Week 11. Year 2018. Good | | \$160 | |
| 205.10 6-106 | Tires, Set of 4 Firestone Winter Force 2. Snow flake. Mud and Snow. 225/60R/17 Manufacture date. Week 06, year 2020. Good | | \$160 | |
| 120.00 6-107 | Tires, Set of 4 Nordman WR SUV. Snow flake. Mud and Snow. 215/70R/16 Manufacture date. Week 30. Year 2016. Fair | | \$120 | |
| No Bid * 6-108 | Tires, Set of 4 Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow flake. Mud and snow. 215/65R/16 Manufacture date. Week 22. Year 2018. Fair | | \$120 | |
| 188.88 6-109 | Tires, Set of 4 Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow flake. Mud and snow. 225/60R/16 Manufacture date. Week 15. Year 2019. Good | | \$160 | |
| 155.55 6-124 | Tires and Rims, Set of 2460 Case Trencher 5 Studded Rims 26 x 12R 12 NHS. Good | | \$20 | |
| 61.02 6-128 | Tires, Set of 4Artic Claw Winter TXI. M+S 225/65R/16, manufacture date. Week 23, year 23016. Poor | | \$40 | |
| No Bid * 6-129 | Tires, Set of 4Sumitomo Enhance HTR LX. M+S. 215/65R/17, manufacture date. Week 26, year 2017. Fair | | \$120 | |
| 171.00 6-130 | Tires, Set of 4Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow flake, M+S. 215/60R/16, manufacture date. Week14, year 2019. Good | | \$160 | |
| 179.19 6-131 | Tires, Set of 4Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow flake, M+S. 215/60R/17, manufacture date. Week 26, year 2018. Good | | \$160 | |
| No Bid * 6-132 | Tires, Set of 4Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow flake, M+S. 215/65R/16, manufacture date. Week 21, year 2018 Good | | \$160 | |
| No Bid * 6-133 | Tires, Set of 3Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow flake, M+S. 225/75R/17, manufacture date. Week 18, year 2018. Good | | \$160 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|-----------------|---|-----|-----------|---------------|
| 1,490.00 6-101 | Trailer, 1986TransportHomebuilt 10 ft X 6 ft wide enclosed trailer, total length 14 1/2 ft, has a 4 ft tongue with jack, 5 - 7.00 x 15 10 ply tires, has spare tire mount on tongue, pintle eye | | \$500 | TB001 |
| No Bid * 6-125 | Winter Front / Bug Screen, For a 2000 2002 Dodge Ram Van, Via WF 923-3 Snaps may be missing. Good | | \$5 | |
| No Bid * 6-126 | Winter Front / Bug Screen, For a 2007 2008 Dodge Durango, Via WF 929-57 Snaps may be missing. Good | | \$5 | |
| No Bid * 6-127 | Winter Front / Bug Screen, For a 2007 2008 Dodge Durango, Via WF 929-57 Snaps may be missing. Good | | \$5 | |
| 5.02 * 11-142 | Arm chairs, Lot of 2 grey, cloth, on wheels Fair | | \$1 | |
| 3.02 * 5-108 | Chair, Swivel, Cloth Blue, 5 caster. Poor | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 11-143 | Chair, task. grey cloth, no arms. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 3.02 * 11-145 | Chair, task. lever controls partially working. Poor | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 5-112 | File Cabinet, Metal 14"l x 27"w x 28"h. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 11.00 * 5-114 | File Cabinet, Metal, Vertical Locks with key. 18"l x 28"w x 51.5"h. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 11.00 * 11-160 | File cabinet, no keys, lock destroyed, scuffed and scratched 4 drawer, vertical, metal. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 5-117 | File Cabinet , Metal, Vertical 17"l x 30"w x 29.5"h. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 11.00 * 5-118 | File Cabinet , Metal, Vertical Lock with no keys, 18"l x 28"w x 51"h. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 5-120 | Table, Metal, Wood 36"l x 24.5"w x 27"h. Fair | | \$1 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|--|---|-----|-----------|---------------|
| FORT CARLTON PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks | | | | |
| Contact Shani Bear 306-492-5676, shani.bear@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| 21.00 6-501 | Bunk Trailer, Atco Dormitory style trailer with 7 exterior doors, includes furnace. Not used for several years as a trailer, used as storage, all utilities disconnected, furniture is removed and decking pulled away. Trailer is on a towable frame, buyer will need to purchase tires for towing or haul away on a flat deck trailer. Sold as is, decking not included. Poor | | \$1 | 15,415,667 |
| 22.00 6-502 | House Trailer, 1981Atco Staff quarters, 2 bedrooms. All utilities disconnected and items removed. All decking and outside structures disconnected from house trailer, dock ready to move out on a towable frame. It will be the responsibility of the buyer to determine wheels to tow away and transport. Poor | | \$1 | 152,816,664 |
| HUDSON BAY, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 501 Prince Street | | | | |
| Contact Randy Carlson (306)-865-4400, Randy.Carlson@gov.sk.ca or Shelley Kraft-Schnell (306) 865-4400, shelley.kraftschnell@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| 805.00 * 5-545 | Boat, Lund 12 ft aluminum (has small holes in bottom but repairable). Broken Repairable | | \$1 | 2LU038670181 |
| No Bid * 5-549 | Chest Waders, Acton One size 10 and one size 11 chest waders. Unknown if they leak. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 71.91 * 5-550 | Game Caller, Johnny Stewart, MS-512 Cassette tape comes with loud speaker, carry case, vehicle charger and 5 cassette tapes. Fair | | \$1 | 80,569 |
| 74.01 * 5-551 | Game Caller, Johnny Stewart, MS-512 Cassette tape comes with loud speaker, carry case, vehicle charger and 5 cassette tapes. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 76.01 * 5-552 | Game Caller, Johnny Stewart, MS-513 Cassette tape comes with loud speaker, carry case, vehicle charger and 5 cassette tapes. Fair | | \$1 | 87,572 |
| No Bid * 5-557 | Spotlight, Coleman Unknown if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| LARONGE, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, Hangar #2, LaRonge Airport | | | | |
| Contact Brent Toth 306-425-4637 brent.toth@gov.sk.ca or Meghan Houk 306-425-4596, meghan.houk@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| 4,400.00 6-530 | Aircraft Cylinders, Lot of 2210 470 Unknown if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 1,500.00 6-531 | Aircraft Cylinders, Lot of 75R2800 Unknown if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 50.00 6-532 | Aircraft Jack, Metal Unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| 50.00 6-533 | Aircraft Jack, Metal Unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| 50.00 6-534 | Aircraft Jacks, Lot of 2Metal Unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| 1.00 6-535 | Blue Storage Cabinet, Metal 28"l x 56"h x 60"w Fair | | \$1 | |
| 2,500.00 6-536 | Conversion Parts, Approx 215 parts, 500 plus piecesMiscellaneous Parts from Canadair CL- | | \$1 | |
| 1,500.00 6-538 | Engine Cowls and Parts , Approx 215 parts, 30 piecesAircraft, Canadair CL-215 Conversion, | | \$1 | |
| 100.00 6-539 | Engine Diagnostic System, For Vehicle Unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|----------------|--|-----|-----------|---------------|
| 1,500.00 6-540 | Engine Mount Tubs, Lot of 2Aircraft, Canadair CL-215, Metal Unknown if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 150.00 6-542 | Engine Mounts, Lot of 3Aircraft, I-O 470 Needs Repair Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| 500.00 6-541 | Engine Mounts, Lot of 5Aircraft, CL215, R2800 Unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| 2,500.00 6-543 | Engine Parts, Approx 300 PiecesAircraft, Miscellaneous Parts from Canadair CL-215 aircraft | | \$1 | |
| 5,757.00 6-544 | Engines, Lot of 5Aircraft, CL215, R-2800 Unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| 600.00 6-545 | Exhaust Pipes, Aircraft, 215, Metal Non-operational Poor | | \$1 | |
| 1.00 6-546 | Fire Extinguisher, Tanks and Stand, Non-operational Poor | | \$1 | |
| 300.00 6-547 | Foam Tanks, Lot of 2Aircraft, CL215, Stainless Non-operational Poor | | \$1 | |
| 300.00 6-548 | Foam Unit, Aircraft, Amerex, Metal Unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| 300.00 6-549 | Foam Unit, Aircraft, Amerex, Metal Unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| 300.00 6-550 | Foam Unit, Aircraft, Amerex, Metal Unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| 300.00 6-551 | Ground Power Units, Lot of 3Aircraft Unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| 50.00 6-552 | Hand Jack, M104 Hydraulic, unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| 389.80 6-553 | Motor Generator Set, Metal Cord broken, unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| 126.99 6-554 | Nose Casing, Aircraft, R-2800 Used in Pratt & Whitney R-2800 engine Poor | | \$1 | |
| 100.00 6-555 | Oil Coolers, Lot of 3Aircraft, Aluminum Needs Repair Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| 100.00 6-556 | Oil Tank, Aircraft, CL215, Stainless steel Unknown if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| *WD 6-557 | Power System, Generac Unknown if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 455.00 6-558 | Pressure Washer, Unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| 2,500.00 6-559 | Propeller , Aircraft, CL215P, Metal Unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| *WD 6-560 | Propeller Dome, Aircraft, 215 Unknown if operational. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 600.00 6-561 | Propeller Hub, Aircraft, CL215, Metal Unknown if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 9,000.00 6-537 | Propellers, Lot of 4Dowty Removed from a Twin Commander Aircraft, Garrett TPE331 engine, unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| *WD 6-562 | Pump and Tank, Unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| 245.75 6-563 | Tracker Propeller Blades, Aircraft, Metal Unknown if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| *WD 6-564 | Utility Heater, Herman Nelson, Portable Unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| 50.00 6-565 | Water Pump, Yamaha YP30T 4", gas powered. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number | |
|---|-------------|--|------------|---------------|-------------------|
| MEADOW LAKE, Highways, Meadow Lake Airport, Meadow Lake, SK S0M 2M0. | | | | | |
| Contact Mark Eisenkirch 306-526-9103, mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca | | | | | |
| 21,105.00 | 6-595 | Tractor, 1998New HollandTV140, Broom4WD7.5L inline 6, diesel hydrostaticA/C, tilt3 speed, single tires, tire size 480/85 R34, 10 ply, bi directionalyellow7,938 hrs.PROBLEMS: Battery, body exterior paint, windshield and windshield wipers, lights, mirrors and horn all in poor condition, tires are wore out, hood and cab are rusty and paint peeling. Unit runs and drives well, broom comes with unit, engine, transmission and hydraulics all work well. Minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | 7,938 hrs. | \$3,000 | D203898 |
| MEADOW LAKE, SaskBuilds and Procurement, 101 Railway Pl | | | | | |
| Contact Jim Wassing (306)-240-5407, jim.wassing@gov.sk.ca or Mathew Chuckrey (306)-304-5556, mathew.chuckrey@gov.sk.ca | | | | | |
| No Bid * | 5-523 | A/C Unit, Ducane Model AC10B3C-A Unknown if operational. Poor | | \$1 | 3,406,410,219 |
| MOOSE JAW, Highways & Infrastructure, Fleet Services, 1 km south of Moose Jaw on Highway #2. | | | | | |
| Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca | | | | | |
| 5,155.00 | 6-594 | Tractor, 1990FordBroom, 77102WD4.4L inline 4, diesel manualA/C, GVW 10,800 lbs.8 speed, single tires, tire size front 11L-16, rear 460/85R34, single axleyellow 3,761 hrs.PROBLEMS: Leak at hydraulic return filter, hydraulic motor on broom leaking, tail, signal and interior lights not working, instrument panel glitches in and out, sprockets and chain worn on broom, hard to shift, block heaters not working, brakes and battery poor, rear wiper not working, body paint rusty. Minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | 3,761 hrs. | \$500 | BC26710 |
| KENOSEE LAKE, Parks Culture and Sport, Moose Mountain Provincial Park | | | | | |
| Contact Leigh Potter 306-577-7810, leigh.potter@gov.sk.ca | | | | | |
| 277.00 | 6-593 | Truck, 2005FordF1504WD Supercab5.4L V8 gas Triton, autosingle tire, tire size 265/70R/17whiteTOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 298,379 kmPROBLEMS: motor, transmission, brakes, exhaust unknown, tires and paint are poor, A/C doesn't work, windshield glass cracked, front right seat worn, tow only vehicle, hasn't ran in a year, dead battery, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | 298,379 km | \$50 | 1FTPX14555NB71469 |
| NORTH BATTLEFORD, Highways 502 114th Street. | | | | | |
| Contact Mark Eisenkirch 306-526-9103, mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca | | | | | |
| 5,002.00 | 6-529 | Trailer, 1981Trailking 16 ton, tilt deck, GVW 32,000 lbs.tires dual, tire size 8.25x15, 14 plyyellowRecent Repairs: All deck boards were replace 1 year agoPROBLEMS: Unit failed SGI inspection,deck frame wrotten, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | | \$500 | TK1981-61 |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|---|--|-----|-----------|---------------|
| OUTLOOK, Agriculture, Crops and Irrigation, 410 Saskatchewan Ave W. | | | | |
| Contact Heather Duczek-Reynolds 306-867-5529, heather.duczek-reynolds@gov.sk.ca or Jason Drury 306-867-5518, jason.drury@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| No Bid * 6-566 | Auto Processor, 35mm With manual, unknown if operational. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 3.55 6-505 | Bookcase, wood, 4 shelves 36"l x 12"w * 73"h. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 3.55 6-504 | Bookcase, wooden 38"l x 12"w x 94"h, 5 shelves. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 10.00 6-567 | Camera Flash, Nikon Autofocus Speedlight SB-22 With carrying case and manual. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 3.02 6-506 | Chair, office, blue, cloth Upholstered, with castors. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-507 | Chair, occasional Green cloth with wood frame. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 100.00 6-508 | Desk, reception Great condition. Three sided receptionist "U" shaped desk. Includes one rolling under counter cabinet (3 drawer) and one fixed (2 drawer) under counter cabinet. Scalloped seating area. Will accommodate a stand up desk table top structure. Height of surround, 40"h to top of reception top. Desk Structure, 10.5' (longest side) x 91" x 66", desk width is 24 inches. Good | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-509 | Desk/Table, 3 drawer, 50"l x 30"w x 30"h. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-510 | Desk/Table, With one drawer, 50"l x 30"w x 30"h. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-511 | Drafting Table, Tech Master, metal Adjustable, with foot rail. 60"l x 40"w x 54"h. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-568 | Easel, dual purpose With carrying bag, * top cross piece fits loosely. Poor | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-512 | File Cabinet, Lot of 4lateral Beige, three drawer, 36"l x 18"w x 40"h. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-513 | File Cabinet, lateral, 3 drawer, beige 36"l x 18"w x 41"h, lock and key. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-514 | File Cabinet, lateral, 4 drawer, beige 36"l x 18"w x 64"h, lock and key. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-515 | File Cabinet, metal, lateral Three drawer, beige. *Top drawer slides open (does not stay shut). 36"l x 18"w x 39"h. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-516 | File Cabinet, vertical, 4 drawer, beige 28"w x 18"l x 51"h, lock and key. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 23.00 6-517 | Lectern, Sound-Craft Systems, Inc. With self contained speaker and microphone plug in. *All | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-518 | Map Storage Unit, metal Chest style, 34"l x 29"w x 43"h. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-570 | Overhead Projector, Elmo, HP L290 Deluxe Unknown if operational. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-569 | Overhead Projector, 3M With carrying case, unknown if operational. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-572 | Projection Screen, Draper, portable With stand and case, 5' x 5'. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-573 | Projection Screen, Portable With stand, brown casing, 5' x 5'. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 5.00 6-571 | Projection Screen, Dalite, portable With stand, green, 63"w x 57"h. Fair | | \$1 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|--|---|-------------|-----------|---------------|
| 20.00 6-575 | Reel to Reel Projector, Bell & Howell, 16 mm, Filmosound, Autoload, model 1592 With carrying case and manual, unknown if operational. Good | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-577 | Slide Projector, Lot of 2Kodak Ektagraphic, III A With carrying case, lens, spare bulb, cords and manual, unknown if operational. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-576 | Slide Projector, Lot of 2Kodak Ektagraphic AF-2 With carrying case, lens, spare bulb, cords and slide deck, unknown if operational. Fair | | \$1 | |
| *WD 6-519 | Storage Cabinet, arborite 42"l x 14"w x 36"h. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-520 | Storage Unit, 24"l x 12"w x 30"h, used for 3.5*5 floppy discs. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-521 | Table, wood With storage on wheels, 30"l x 22"w x 27"h. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-522 | Table/Desk, arborite topped, wooden With pencil drawer, 50"l x 30"w x 31"h. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 3.02 6-579 | Tripod, Manfrotto Professional Tripod, model - 183 With carrying strap. Good | | \$1 | |
| PRINCE ALBERT, Highways, Northern Operations, 81 North Industrial Dr. | | | | |
| Contact Cory Palko 306-960-5152, cory.palko@gov.sk.ca. | | | | |
| 27,777.78 6-599 | Motor Grader, 2004Volvo G720BRWD7.1L inline 6, diesel, D7D GBE2 PowershiftA/C, AM/FM radio, locking differential8 speed, single tires, tire size 17.5R25yellow12,342 hrs.PROBLEMS: Hydraulic pump leaks oil, tires and battery are poor, will need batteries to start unit, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | 12,342 hrs. | \$12,500 | 35,934 |
| *MT 6-598 | Motor Grader, 2004Volvo G720B4WD7.1L inline 6, diesel PowershiftA/C, scarified, locking differential, unit comes with various parts. 8 speed forward and reverse, single tires 11,407 hrs.PROBLEMS: May need batteries to start, tires and battery are poor, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | 11,407 hrs. | \$12,500 | 35,950 |
| 58,356.00 6-605 | Motor Grader, 2010John Deere770G4WD9L, inline 6, gas PowershiftA/C, locking differentialgear 8 forward, 8 reverse, tandem rear axle, single tires, tire size 17.5R25yellow12,252 hrs.PROBLEMS: Tires are poor, may need batteries to start, minor exterior damage.> -**Front mount scarified does not sell with unit. As is, Where is | 12,252 hrs. | \$45,000 | DW770GX626069 |
| 128.00 6-628 | Arrow board, Vermac ST4825 Unit has been sitting unused Poor | | \$1 | |
| 129.00 6-629 | Arrow board, Vermac ST4825 Unit has been sitting unused Poor | | \$1 | |
| 130.00 6-630 | Arrow board, Wanco WTSP75-LSAC Unit has been sitting unused Poor | | \$1 | |
| 751.50 6-613 | Auto Crane, Truck mounted Unit has a lot of rust and needs multiple hoses changed. Fair | | \$1 | 3,203 |
| 51.00 6-620 | Cement Bucket, Crane Attachment For moving cement, unknown condition. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 1,556.00 6-608 | Fenders, Set of 8Fits John Deere motor grader, 870G New takeoffs. Good | | \$1 | |
| 80.99 6-624 | Fuel tank, Diesel, metal Portable, square, with electric fuel pump, red. Poor | | \$1 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|----------------|--|------------|-----------|-------------------|
| 122.22 6-625 | Fuel tank, Regal diesel, metal Portable, max capacity 388L, red, not certified. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 111.11 6-626 | Fuel tank, Regal diesel, metal Portable, max capacity 388L, red, not certified. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 155.55 6-627 | Fuel tank, Regal diesel, metal Portable, max capacity 388L, red, not certified. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 156.00 6-609 | Headlight Mounts, Set of 7 Fits John Deere motor grader, 870G New takeoffs. Good | | \$1 | |
| 234.56 6-614 | Mig Welder, Miller Millermatic 200 Has been sitting unused and needs servicing. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 128.00 6-615 | Mobile Air Cleaner, Enviroflex Smoke eater, has been sitting unused and needs servicing. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 965.65 6-621 | Mobile Crane, Hiab 965 Used, missing control levers on one side. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 577.77 6-601 | Oil Distributer, 1975 International 17002 WDIHC 392, 6.4L V8, gas auto Heat, 2 speed axle, GVW 24,000 lbs. 4 speed, single axle, dual rear tires, tire size 10 x 20, 12 ply. GVW 24,000 lbs. yellow 75,675 km PROBLEMS: Rear engine needs a new clutch, spray bar is missing parts, tires and battery are poor, will need new batteries to start unit, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | 75,675 km | \$1 | D0522ECA20236 |
| 2,600.00 6-600 | Packer, 1974 Ford Bros SP3000 Rubber Wheel, RWD 3.1L inline 4, gas manual 4 speed, 9 tires, tire size 7.5 R 15, 6 ply yellow 9,069 hrs. PROBLEMS: Needs external fuel tank to run, battery poor, may need a battery to start unit, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | 9,069 hrs. | \$2,500 | 8,435 |
| 526.00 6-623 | Plow, Frinkone way, metal 11', manual blade adjustment Fair | | \$1 | 19,374 |
| 5,777.77 6-606 | Plow Truck, 1997 Volvo WG64 RWD 12.8L, VED12 inline 6, diesel RTLO-12610B, standard A/C, Cruise, locking differential 10 speed, tandem axle, dual tires, size 11R22.5. Wheel base 197", GVW 39,500 lbs. yellow 103,139 km PROBLEMS: Motor, brakes, battery, body, frame and paint, windshield, windshield wipers and horn are all in poor condition, brakes sticking, may need batteries to start, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | 103,139 km | \$5,000 | 4V5JCBGE2VR855150 |
| 510.50 6-617 | Propane Tank, metal, white 500 lb max capacity, not certified. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 5,001.00 6-597 | Steel Wheel Packer, 1982 Bros 735DDPRWD 3.48L inline 4, diesel hydrostatic 3 speed, single tire yellow 2,675 hrs. PROBLEMS: Transmission, tires, battery, body exterior and paint all in poor condition. Drive motor and drum vibrator leak oil, has various oil leaks, transmission is hard shifting, body has a lot of corrosion. Will need battery to start, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | 2,675 hrs. | \$5,000 | 1,142 |
| 625.00 6-631 | Traffic Lights, RC Flagman 2000 Solar remote, non functional controller, batteries damaged, flat tires, one unit missing lights. Not used in 10 years Poor | | \$1 | RCF0027 & RCF0028 |
| 201.00 6-604 | Trailer, 1980 Utility Steamer Single axle Unit has been sitting unused, unknown condition yellow PROBLEMS: Overall condition poor. As is, Where is | | \$1 | SK400849150 |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|---|---|-----------|-----------|-------------------|
| 1,901.00 6-607 | Trailer, 1990ArmcoTilt deck GVW 40,000 lbs.tire size 255 70R 22.5, 14 plyyellowPROBLEMS: Frame is bent, tires are poor, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | | \$500 | P6KZ000134 |
| 327.00 6-603 | Trailer, 1989HomebuiltUtility Single axle, flat bed, steelyellowPROBLEMS: Driver side wheel and rim missing. As is, Where is | | \$1 | SK400363627 |
| 1,901.00 6-602 | Trailer, 2004TrailtechTD220 20 ton, pintle hitch, tandem axleyellow19,036 kmTires, battery, body and paint all in poor condition. Substantial frame damage, will need SGI inspection to pass, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | 19,036 km | \$1 | 2CU4CAVN342016532 |
| 127.77 6-632 | Truck Box, Steel Conveyor box with floor missing, has liquid tanks, holes rusted through. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 127.77 6-633 | Truck Box, Steel Conveyor box, has holes rusted through and no chain. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 666.99 6-634 | Truck Box, Steel Conveyor box, has holes rusted through and no chain. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 127.77 6-635 | Truck Box, Steel Conveyor box, has holes rusted through and no chain. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 177.77 6-610 | Truck Fenders, Lot of 8Stainless Steel 25"w x 96"l, used on tandem axle gravel trucks, unused. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 2.01 6-618 | Winch, Truck mount type, metal Rusted, may be missing parts. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 2.01 6-619 | Winch, Truck mount type, metal Rusted, may be missing parts. Poor | | \$1 | |
| PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Avenue North | | | | |
| Contact Brent Zbaraschuk 306-953-2428, brent.zbaraschuk@gov.sk.ca or Tyla Wills 306-953-3400, Tyla.wills@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| No Bid * 3-533 | Tires, Set of 4Michelin 215/75R17.5 Manufacture date: week 39, year 2011. Poor | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-534 | Tires, Set of 2Multi Trac G/S 23 x 10.5 -12 NHS For a quad. Poor | | \$10 | |
| REGINA, Highways, Operations and Maintanance, 221 N Winnipeg St. | | | | |
| Contact Ethan Reoch 306-519-3560 ethan.reoch@gov.sk.ca or Braden Huel 306-531-4705 Braden.Huel@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| 1.00 * 4-505 | Car Seats , 2005 Dodge seats x2 seat row for dodge vehicle. Seats have never been used. Good | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 4-506 | Car Seats , Blue, three seat row with seat buckles. Unknown make. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 4-507 | Car Seats , Grey, three seat row with seat buckles. Unknown make. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 4-508 | Ducted Fume Hood, Includes vent, 30" x 65" x 47". Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| REGINA, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, Corporate Services, 1870 Albert St. | | | | |
| Contact Waneta Hardy 306-798-0312, waneta.hardy@gov.sk.ca, or Derek Wagner 306-787-1879, derek.wagner@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| 5.00 6-586 | Lab Equipment, 1 box Nalgene Tubing Four aquarium pumps (modified to suck in instead of blowing out), hand air pump, flow meter, and four filter cassette holders for sampling. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-580 | Binders, 4 boxes Mostly black and white, varying sizes, used. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-581 | Headset, Agptek Headset only, no base so unable to determine if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|--|---|-----|-----------|---------------|
| 2.00 6-582 | Headset, Mpow No base. Poor | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-583 | Headsets, Lot of 4Jabra No bases. Poor | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-584 | Headsets, Lot of 3Jabra With bases, unsure if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-585 | Headsets, Lot of 5Plantronics With bases, unsure if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-587 | Painting, Picture of a tree, 10"w x 20"h. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 6-588 | Projector, Kodak Ektagraphic III Unsure if operational Poor | | \$1 | A-631031 |
| No Bid * 6-589 | Step File, Lot of 3 Black coating. Good | | \$1 | |
| SASKATOON, Saskpolytech, 1130 Idylwyld Drive N. | | | | |
| Contact Chris Perry 306-659-4043, perrychr@saskpolytech.ca | | | | |
| 321.51 6-590 | Vinyl Plank Flooring, Lot of 12Model WD5471, 319 sq.ft 4 mm luxury vinyl plank, 6"w x 36" l, 22.79 sq.ft/box New - Unused | | \$199 | |
| SMEATON, Parks, Culture and Sports, Narrow Hills Provincial Park, Box 130 | | | | |
| Contact Tanya White (306) 426-2622, tanya.white@gov.sk.ca or Laurie Shymanski (306) 426-2624, laurie.shymanski@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| No Bid * 4-553 | Book, On The Living Edge Handbook to Waterfront Living, soft cover. Good | | \$10 | |
| No Bid * 4-554 | Book, Small Fishing Vessel Safety Manual, soft cover. Good | | \$5 | |
| TISDALE, Highways & Transportation, Northern Tisdale, 1103-12th Ave. | | | | |
| Contact David Derr, 306-878-8823 or 306-921-7202, david.derr@gov.sk.ca or Brent Douglas 306-961-0525, brent.douglas@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| 5.00 * 3-502 | Bunk Car, 1967Atco 10' x 30', trailer cannot move under its own weight, it is not floating on a base/frame that will need deconstructing, all utilities have been disconnected. Other information: loading required for removal - it is the responsibility of the buyer to measure height of unit, if necessary, for transportation route. As is, where is. 48 hours notice is required for pick up. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 21.90 6-503 | Pressure Washer, ClarkePortable Hot water, gas powered. Non operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| TISDALE, SaskBuilds and Procurement, 1105-99 St Brocklebank Pl. | | | | |
| Contact Cosette Koziel, 306-878-8800 cosette.koziel@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| No Bid * 6-523 | Dumpster, metal, plastic top Floor has rust, rest of bin is good condition. Size is 6' wide x 5.5' deep x 5' tall at front and sloping to 4' tall at back. Fair | | \$500 | |
| YORKTON, Highways, Fleet Services, 245 York Road East. | | | | |
| Contact Brian Perih 306-786-1651 or Ed Patzwald 306-786-1687 email: brian.perih@gov.sk.ca or ed.patzwald@gov.sk.ca. | | | | |
| No Bid * 6-622 | Pneumatic Torque Wrench Accessories, 2005Sioux, Model TM50AO-1075 Includes regulator, case and reaction arm ring. Torque wrench itself is not included. Fair | | \$25 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|----------------|---|----------|-----------|---------------|
| 128.00 6-527 | Posts, wooden, mostly fir 4 inches x 6 inches x 14 feet approximately, old broken sign posts, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs. ** Must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading, if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer. Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Please note lifts are now smaller to make handling safer. 55-65 posts per lift. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 136.00 6-528 | Posts, wooden, mostly fir 4 inches x 6 inches x 14 feet approximately, old broken sign posts, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs. **Must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading, if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer. Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Please note lifts are now smaller to make handling safer. 55-65 posts per lift. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 501.00 * 5-541 | Trailer, 1978GICTilt deck 16 ton, dual tires, tire size: 8.25 x R15, 14 ply. GVW 32 000. Tires are fair. Brakes, body, paint and lights all in poor condition, yellow, 7333 hrs.yellow7333 hrsPROBLEMS: Spring hangers broken, excess corrosion between springs, fishplates on hitch have excess corrosion and material loss, several cross members and deck supports rusted through decking would need to be removed for repair, landing gear in poor shape and handle is falling apart, couple of wheel hubs leaking, toolbox rusted through, wires hanging down in several areas, lamps are cracked, Brakes, body, paint and lights all in poor condition, tires are fair. As is, Where is | 7333 hrs | \$1 | G61278 |