

SALE SUMMARY LIST

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-787-2238,
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.

WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.

No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number	
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles					
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.					
3,579.00	5-001	Car 2009 CHEVROLET, Impala, FWD, 3.9L V6 gas, auto, dual zone A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks, mirrors, trunk release, power front seats, keyless entry- 2 fobs, 3 keys rubber floor liner, front bucket seats, rear vinyl covered seat, full size spare tire., white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 198,779 km, Recent Repairs: rear inside door handle and window repaired., PROBLEMS: needs front struts, front pads and rotors, left outer tie rod, needs alignment, tires poor, windshield chips and cracks, area above doors (on both sides) scratched, lower grille loose, hood scratches, left rear fender dents, right rear fender dents, right front door crease, hole in front hump, missing centre console, holes in trim around radio, left head lamp foggy, left front lights not working, roof scratches and 2 sealed holes, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	198,779 km	\$1,355	2G1WS57M591315316
*MT	5-002	Car 2013 CHEVROLET, Impala, FWD, 3.6L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks, power mirrors, trunk release, left front seat, keyless entry- 2 key fobs 2 keys. , white, PASSED SGI Inspection. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 220,622 km, , PROBLEMS: rear bumper scratches/chips, area above doors scratched, holes drilled in inside pillar trim, centre console large hole, holes in radio dash trim, holes drilled in side of console, hood chips, dog leg moldng loose, left rear door dent, roof scratches and 2 sealed holes, windshield small chips, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	220,622 km	\$1,647	2G1WA5E32D1172010
2,589.77	5-003	Car 2007 CHRYSLER, Sebring, FWD, 2.7L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks, power heated mirrors, trunk release, L/F seat, keyless entry- 2 key fobs, driving fog lights. , silver, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 275,616 km, Recent Repairs: check engine light., PROBLEMS: needs front struts, front pads and rotors, needs alignment, hood paint peeling, scratches and chips, both bumpers chips & scratches, left front fender scratches, right rear fender rusted, right front fender scrape, both left doors rust along bottom inside and out, right front door scratches, windshield chips, trunk lid scratches, roof has chips and small rust spots, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	275,616 km	\$500	1C3LC56R27N634774

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number	
7,777.77	5-004	Truck 2002 FORD, F550, RWD, regular cab, dual rear wheels, 6.8L V10 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, after market AM/FM/CD player general brand service body with 3304W Cobra crane (condition unknown, has areas of rust), front tow hooks, side steps, trailer tow mirrors, 8 compartments- some have pull out drawers, top of body slides 2 thirds open, 2 amber beacons, HD rear bumper with stabilizers, VMAC compressor mounted under hood (condition unknown), hand held control for crane in right rear compartment (condition unknown)., white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 276,125 km, , PROBLEMS: Right front exhaust manifold broken off, service body has areas of rust, windshield cracked, front bumper pitted/rusted, spare tire missing, wheel wrench & jack missing, no first aid kit, hazard kit or fire extinguisher, both wiper blades, battery poor, 2 sealed holes in roof antennae, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	276,125 km	\$3,300	1FDAF56S22EC77002
17,777.77	5-005	Truck 2008 FORD, F550, RWD, extended cab, dual rear wheels, has a back seat, 6.4L V8 turbo diesel, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, power front windows/locks/mirrors general service body (11x8 foot- condition unknown), Auto Crane brand mounted on service body, VMAC compressor (condition unknown), HD rear bumper with 2 stabilizer and 2" hitch receiver (condition unknown), no trailer wiring, front tow hooks, trailer tow mirrors, side steps, 2 beacons, after market bluetooth., white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 236,283 km, , PROBLEMS: Exhaust leak between turbo chargers, slight oil leak engine rear, transmission pan gasket,tail pipe broken, driver mirror housing broken, passenger mirror marker lamp out, hood chips, left front door and left rear door paint chips, bumper pitted/rust spots, roof dent/rust above windshield, spare tire missing, no extinguisher or hazard kit, no trailer connector, battery poor, minor exterior damage>, As is, Where is	236,283 km	\$4,100	1FDAX56RX8EB22488

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
*MT	5-006	Truck 2012 DODGE, Ram 5500 SLT, 4WD, 6.7L Inline 6 Cummins diesel, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated mirrors, power locks, power windows, keyless entry- 2 fobs, 2 keys for tool boxes. AT237 Altec manlift with rain cover (condition unknown), 1 bucket and 1 manhole tent, pintel hook with trailer wiring, original equipment manufacturer (OEM) trailer brakes, trailer tow mirrors, front tow hooks, 2 side tool boxes (condition unknown), rear bumper/deck (condition unknown), wheel wrench missing, jack missing, no first aid kit or fire extinguisher., white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 264,595 km, , PROBLEMS: Engine light on, transmission cooler lines leaking, suspension/axles right rear leaf spring broken, grille broken, rear brake pads at 2mm, hood has stone chips and rust spots, left rocker panel paint worn, right rear door chips, roof stained from rust, front seats soiled, back of driver seat soiled and frame exposed, right cab corner rusted, right side step missing, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	264,595 km	\$21,920	3C7WDNELOCG174684
*MT	5-007	Van 2008 DODGE, Grand Caravan Cargo, FWD, 3.3L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power front windows, power locks, keyless entry 2- key fobs. 2" hitch receiver, roof rack brackets- no crossmembers, steel floor, cargo barrier, map box, computer stand., white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 107,994 km, , PROBLEMS: Axles and tracking components, left front constant velocity joints, front wheel alignment, front pads need to be changed soon, fluid levels low, cross over pipe, tailgate handle, hood paint bubbling with dents, front and rear bumper cracked and scratched, left rear fender rusted/dents, left rocker panel rusted inside bottom of door, left front and rear doors rusted at bottom rear top rusted, both rear doors have dents, roof dented and 2 sealed holes/one not sealed, tailgate rusted, molding broken, windshield chips, seat front left cushion worn/ripped, battery poor, minor interior damage.>, As is, Where is	107,994 km	\$700	1D4HN11H68B143892

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
6,053.99 5-008	Van 2006 FORD, Passenger E350, RWD, 5.4L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, rear HVAC, 2 keys. hitch with trailer wiring., white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 138,371 km, , PROBLEMS: All pads and rotors, alignment needed, rear tires, left rear fender road rash/paint peeling, both right fenders paint poor, dented and rusted, both bumpers rusted/dents, driver door paint peeling, both right doors paint poor, right rear door cracked, rear bench seats- back seat bent, 1st bench seat not attached, all seats soiled, both rocker panels have rust, roof has dents, scratches, paint peeling, interior soiled, driver seat cushion sagging/ripped, wiper blades need replacement, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	138,371 km	\$1,528	1FBSS31L96DA84869

REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.

20.00 * 4-118	Booster Cables, JLM accessories LTD. T141012S 12 feet in length, storage bag, light duty. Good		\$10	
No Bid * 3-101	Cargo Cover, OEM Chrysler cargo cover, roll out. grey vinyl May be compatible with a 2006 Dodge Magnum. Good		\$40	192,088
3.21 * 5-102	Cart, Wood 22.5"w x 50"l x 36.5"h, white, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels, worn, scuffed, paint chipped/worn. Poor		\$10	
1.02 * 5-114	Cart, Wooden 22"w x 50"l x 36"h, 2 casters wheels, 2 fixed wheels, brown. Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 1-104	Floor Mats - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), rubber, light grey in colour May be compatible with Chevrolet Astro. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid * 1-105	Floor Mats - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), rubber, light grey in colour May be compatible with Chevrolet Astro. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid * 4-125	GPS, GPS Tattle brand, remote monitoring device Online portal or Tattle Systems "Go mobile app" required. GPS may not be functional. Fair		\$10	
No Bid * 3-106	Inside Tailgate Cover, Ford Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM). Moulded black plastic May be compatible with a 2003 Ford Ranger. Good		\$5	Part # F77J-940726-AD.
No Bid * 3-105	Inside Tailgate Cover, Ford Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM). Moulded black plastic including top of tailgate May be compatible with a 2003 Ford Ranger. Good		\$5	Part # F77J-940726-AD.
No Bid * 3-104	Inside Tailgate Cover, Ford Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM). Moulded black plastic including top of tailgate. May be compatible with a 2003 Ford Ranger. Good		\$5	Part # F77J-940726-AD.

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid *	1-106	License Plate Bracket - Front, Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), NO mounting kit May be compatible with 2002-2006 Sebring. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-107	License Plate Bracket - Front, Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), NO mounting kit May be compatible with 2002-2006 Sebring. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-127	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-128	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-130	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-131	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-113	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-114	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-115	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-116	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-117	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-110	License Plate Bracket - Front, Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit. May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-111	License Plate Bracket - Front, Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit. May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-112	License Plate Bracket - Front, Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit. May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	3-135	Pillar Trim, Ford Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Grey plastic, for left side inside pillar. Compatible with many Ford F250 and F350 trucks. Fair		\$10	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
191.25 *	4-126 Rear Step Bumper, Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), G.M. with mounting brackets and bolts, but missing plate lights. Compatible with a 2004 Chev Silverado 1500, 2500, 3500. May be other applications. Good		\$190	A04007
No Bid *	4-107 Safety Triangles, Lot of 2 Auto Trend 18 inches each side. Good		\$1	
75.00 *	2-124 Seat, OEM, Grey Fabric 3rd row, backrest folds down. May be compatible with a 2007 Dodge Caravan. Fair		\$1	170,076
No Bid *	1-132 Shield for Inner Fender, 1 set Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) 1 right and 1 left, rear only, may be compatible with a 2008 Chrysler 1500, 2500 or 3500. Excellent		\$1	
1.06 *	1-133 Shield for Inner Fender, 1 set Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) 1 right and 1 left, rear only, may be compatible with a 2008 Chrysler 1500, 2500 or 3500. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	2-128 Tire, 16 inch, 225/65R/16, Sailun IceBlazer, Snowflake manufacture date. Week 16, year 2021. Good		\$40	
No Bid *	2-130 Tires, Set of 216 inch, 205/60R/16, Matrix Tour RD Multi-mile. manufacture date: week 44, year 2011. Fair		\$50	
*WD	* 2-102 Tires, Set of 316 inch, 215/65R/16, Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X manufacture date: week 27, year 2018. Good		\$120	
No Bid *	11-125 Tires, Set of 3225/65R/16 Firestone FR710. M+S, manufacture date: week 47, year 2016. Good		\$120	
No Bid *	3-107 Tires, Set of 4Dunlop Grantrek SJB. Snowflake. 215/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 13, year 2009. Fair		\$120	
No Bid *	3-111 Tires, Set of 4Firestone FR710. M+S 225/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 01, year 2016 Poor		\$40	
136.60 *	3-109 Tires, Set of 4Firestone FR710. M+S 225/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 06, year 2016. Fair		\$120	
301.00 *	4-128 Tonneau Cover, Access Tonnosport brand, fabric roll up. Compatible with a 2014 GMC/Chev full-size pick up with a 5 foot 8 inch bed and still in box. Excellent		\$300	22,020,319
5.27 *	3-128 Tool Bag, Kuny Standard size: 24" x 15" x 10.5". Fair		\$1	
3.51 *	3-129 Tool Bag, Kuny Standard size: 24" x 15" x 10.5". Fair		\$1	
3.51 *	3-130 Tool Bag, Maximum Standard size: 24" x 15" x 10.5". Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	11-160 File cabinet, no keys, lock destroyed, scuffed and scratched 4 drawer, vertical, metal. Fair		\$1	

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid *	5-101	Tailgate, Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Chevrolet Minor dents and scratches. May be compatible with 2002 and newer 1500, 2500, 3500 trucks, yellow. Good		\$200	A04010.
No Bid *	5-102	Tailgate, Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), GMC Sierra Missing one support cable. Minor dents or scratches. May be compatible with 2002 and newer 1500, 2500, 3500 trucks, yellow. Good		\$200	A02006.
201.25	5-103	Tailgate, Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), GMC Sierra Minor dents or scratches. May be compatible with 2002 and newer 1500, 2500, 3500 trucks, yellow. Good		\$200	A05007.
135.55	5-104	Tires, Set of 4 Firestone All Season. Mud + Snow. 215/70R/15 Manufacture date: week 46, year 2017. Fair		\$120	
321.00	5-105	Tires, Set of 4 Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snowflake. 225/60R/17 Manufacture date: week 21, year 2017. Good		\$160	
No Bid *	11-142	Arm chairs, Lot of 2, grey, on wheels cloth Fair		\$1	
25.51	5-106	Desk, Rectangle, pepperdust wood with hutch Desk, 72"l x 36"w x 29"h, with two drawers. Hutch, 72"l x 17.5"w x 42"h, with four doors containing 2 cabinets, brackets and screws included, no locks or keys. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	11-143	Chair, grey cloth, no arms task Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	11-145	Chair, lever controls partially working task Poor		\$1	
2.00	5-107	Chair, Reception, Cloth Brown, with metal legs. Fair		\$1	
*WD	* 5-108	Chair, Swivel, Cloth Blue, 5 caster. Poor		\$1	
40.00	5-109	Chairs, Lot of 8 Reception, Cloth Blue, with wood arm rests. Fair		\$1	
50.00	5-110	Chairs, Lot of 10 Reception, Plastic Brown. Fair		\$1	
25.51	5-111	Chairs, Lot of 5 Swivel, Cloth Blue, 5 caster with arms. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	5-112	File Cabinet, Metal 14"l x 27"w x 28"h. Fair		\$1	
50.51	5-113	File Cabinet, Metal, Lateral Locks with key, 36"l x 18"w x 27"h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	5-114	File Cabinet, Metal, Vertical Locks with key. 18"l x 28"w x 51.5"h. Fair		\$1	
23.50	5-115	File Cabinet, Metal, Wood 42"l x 14"w x 36"h with sliding doors. Fair		\$1	
26.50	5-116	File Cabinet, Wood 43"l x 16"w x 42"h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	5-117	File Cabinet, Metal, Vertical 17"l x 30"w x 29.5"h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	5-118	File Cabinet, Metal, Vertical Lock with no keys, 18"l x 28"w x 51"h. Fair		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
10.00 5-119	File Cabinet , Metal, Wood 41"l x 14"w x 36"h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 5-120	Table, Metal, Wood 36"l x 24.5"w x 27"h. Fair		\$1	
11.00 5-121	Table , Wood 24.5"l x 16"w x 25.5"h. Fair		\$1	
885.85 5-122	Trailer, 1982SaturnFlat Deck Tandem axle, has a pintle eye hook up, electric trailer brakes, 6 pin round trailer connection, deck measurment: 123" x 5', has D ring and weld on hooks for tie downs, 2 short narrow adjustable beaver tails for loading, 4 ST 205/75 r15 tires, has tongue jack in middle of tongue, tongue is 51 inches.Good		\$500	S2613
803.00 5-123	Trailer, 1980UnivisionFlat Deck Tandem axle, pintle eye hook up, 6 round pin trailer connection, has trailer brakes, deck size 107 X 62 inches, has 28 inch high screen sides, tongue 78 inches deck to pintle eye, has a spare and storage box mounted on tongue, has center tongue jack, holder mounted on front rack, some light lens covers missing, plywood floor rotted bad, great for sled, quad or landscaping.Fair		\$500	H333800815M1

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
Hudson Bay, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 501 Prince Street				
Contact Randy Carlson (306)-865-4400, Randy.Carlson@gov.sk.ca or Shelley Kraft-Schnell (306) 865-4400, shelley.kraftschnell@gov.sk.ca				
5.00	5-544		ATV/Snowmobile Accessories, Choko Black gas tank bag and red and black handle bar muffs for ATV or snowmobile. Good	\$1
*WD	* 5-545		Boat, Lund 12 ft aluminum (has small holes in bottom but repairable). Broken Repairable	\$1 2LU038670181
151.99	5-546		Boat, Zodiac 11 ft inflatable comes with foot pump and transome. Has small leaks but repairable. Broken Repairable	\$1
42.59	5-547		Boat Seat, Comes with swivel base. Good	\$1
301.99	5-548		Canoe, 16' aluminum has a few dents. Unsure if it leaks. Fair	\$1
*WD	5-549		Chest Waders, Acton One size 10 and one size 11 chest waders. Unknown if they leak. Fair	\$1
*WD	* 5-550		Game Caller, Johnny Stewart, MS-512 Cassette tape comes with loud speaker, carry case, vehicle charger and 5 cassette tapes. Fair	\$1 80,569
*WD	* 5-551		Game Caller, Johnny Stewart, MS-512 Cassette tape comes with loud speaker, carry case, vehicle charger and 5 cassette tapes. Fair	\$1
*WD	* 5-552		Game Caller, Johnny Stewart, MS-513 Cassette tape comes with loud speaker, carry case, vehicle charger and 5 cassette tapes. Fair	\$1 87,572
*MT	5-553		Satelite Phone, Qualcomm GSP-1600 Tri-mode, portable Comes with wall charger and lithium battery. Fair	\$1 N10C9372X
*MT	5-554		Satelite Phone, Qualcomm GSP-1600 Tri-mode, portable Comes with wall charger and lithium battery. Fair	\$1 N10C0F9HJ
*MT	5-555		Snowmobile Trailer, Flaman Trailtech Pull out ramps, wood deck, spare tire, ski clamps and wood salt shield(removable), needs tires. Lights do not work Fair	\$1 2CU3F2A1Y2007042
No Bid	5-556		Spotlight, Brinkmann Q-Beam MaxMillion Unknown if operational. Poor	\$1
No Bid *	5-557		Spotlight, Coleman Unknown if operational. Poor	\$1
200.00	5-558		Trailer, Homebuilt, Steel 8' x 10', 2 ramps, steel deck, spare tire, needs tires. Fair	\$1 SK40226296
40.00	5-559		Vacuum Bag Sealer, Decosonic, Model KIC 828 Fair	\$1
251.99	5-560		Wall Tent, With cover tarp. Orange(has holes but repairable)10 x 12 x 4 Fair	\$1

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
Meadow Lake, SaskBuilds and Procurement, 101 Railway Pl				
Contact Jim Wassing (306)-240-5407, jim.wassing@gov.sk.ca or Mathew Chuckrey (306)-304-5556, mathew.chuckrey@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	5-523	A/C Unit, Ducane Model AC10B3C-A Unknown if operational. Poor	\$1	3,406,410,219
25.50	5-524	Commerical Doors, Lot of 2 Operational, metal push/pull handles, locks, and hinges, grey, 3' x 6' 11.25". Fair	\$1	
50.00	5-525	Dryer, Kenmore 2007, Model 970-C87012-00 Used, operational. Fair	\$5	XD70404100
389.00	5-526	Heat Pump, Lot of 4Daikin 2017, Model WGS042B New - Unused	\$300	E602024600200
1,057.00	5-527	Lawn and Garden Tractor, John Deer 1990, Model 318 Non-operational. Broken Repairable	\$1	M00318X293702
1,225.00	5-528	Mower, Kubota F2560, 1997-2005 Operational, power take-off (PTO) is locked up. Attachment not included. Broken Repairable	\$300	81,995
290.00	5-529	Snow Blower Attachment, John Deere 1990 Untested/unknown if operational. Poor	\$1	M02752X525290
*MT	5-530	Trailer, 2003, Trailtech, Model L260 Operational, needs brakes and fenders, overall decent condition. Poor	\$500	2CU123GA232013611
47.50	5-531	Unit Heater, Reznor, Model XL-170 Unknown if operational. Poor	\$40	ADH31B6N451
50.00	5-532	Washing Machine, Kenmore 2007, Model 970-C47012-00 Non-operational Broken Repairable	\$1	XC70314103
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Avenue North				
Contact Brent Zbaraschuk 306-953-2428, brent.zbaraschuk@gov.sk.ca or Tyla Wills 306-953-3400, Tyla.wills@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	3-533	Tires, Set of 4Michelin 215/75R17.5 Manufacture date: week 39, year 2011. Poor	\$1	
No Bid *	3-534	Tires, Set of 2Multi Trac G/S 23 x 10.5 -12 NHS For a quad. Poor	\$10	
REGINA, Highways, Operations and Maintanance, 221 N Winniepeg St.				
Contact Ethan Reoch 306-519-3560 ethan.reoch@gov.sk.ca or Braden Huel 306-531-4705 Braden.Huel@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	4-505	Car Seats , 2005 Dodge seats x2 seat row for dodge vehicle. Seats have never been used. Good	\$1	
No Bid *	4-506	Car Seats , Blue, three seat row with seat buckles. Unknown make. Fair	\$1	
No Bid *	4-507	Car Seats , Grey, three seat row with seat buckles. Unknown make. Fair	\$1	
No Bid *	4-508	Ducted Fume Hood, Includes vent, 30" x 65" x 47". Broken Repairable	\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
REGINA, Justice and Attorney General, Court of Appeal, 2425 Victoria Ave.				
Contact Ann Marie Melvie, 306-787-7399, amelvie@sasklawcourts.ca or Scott Polowyk, 306-787-5437, spolowyk@sasklawcourts.ca				
10.00	5-501		\$1	
	Book, 142 volumes Administrative Law Reports Containing case law from across Canada, dimensions of each book: 6"x 9" Good			
7.50	5-502		\$1	
	Book, 253 volumes Alberta Law Reports Containing case law from Alberta, dimensions of each book: 6"x 9" Good			
7.50	5-503		\$1	
	Book, 233 volumes British Columbia Law Reports Containing case law from British Columbia, dimensions of each book: 6"x 9" Good			
7.50	5-504		\$1	
	Book, 190 volumes Canadian Cases on the Law of Insurance Containing case law from across Canada dealing with insurance, dimensions of each book: 6"x 9" Good			
7.50	5-505		\$1	
	Book, 195 volumes Manitoba Reports Containing case law from Manitoba, dimensions of each book: 7" x 9.5" Good			
SASKATOON, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, SCC, 910 60th street East, Saskatoon. Loading Dock Stores				
Contact Bob Kirton 306-956-8835 bob.kirton@gov.sk.ca Danielle.Corriveau@gov.sk.ca.				
45.04 *	6-559		\$1	
	Kitchen Equipment , Lot of 9 Food serving table, 3 buffet trays, rusted, lights need repair. Broken Repairable			
SMEATON, Parks, Culture and Sports, Narrow Hills Provincial Park, Box 130				
Contact Tanya White (306) 426-2622, tanya.white@gov.sk.ca or Laurie Shymanski (306) 426-2624, laurie.shymanski@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	4-553		\$10	
	Book, On The Living Edge Handbook to Waterfront Living, soft cover. Good			
No Bid *	4-554		\$5	
	Book, Small Fishing Vessel Safety Manual, soft cover. Good			
TISDALE, Highways & Transportation, Northern Tisdale, 1103-12th Ave.				
Contact David Derr, 306-878-8823 or 306-921-7202, david.derr@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	3-502		\$1	
	Bunk Car, 1967 Atco 10' x 30', trailer cannot move under its own weight, it is not floating on a base/frame that will need deconstructing, all utilities have been disconnected. Other information: loading required for removal - it is the responsibility of the buyer to measure height of unit, if necessary, for transportation route. As is, where is. 48 hours notice is required for pick up. Poor			

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
WEYBURN, Highways, Traffic Guidance, Regina Ave & 75 St NW.				
Contact Cory Obleman 306-529--9135 or 306-526-9135, cory.obleman@gov.sk.ca				
180.00	5-506		\$1	
	Posts, Lot of 50-60Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair			
44.00	5-507		\$1	
	Posts, Lot of 35-45Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair			
150.00	5-508		\$1	
	Posts, Lot of 55-65Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair			
225.51	5-509		\$1	
	Posts, Lot of 65-75Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair			
225.51	5-510		\$1	
	Posts, Lot of 65-75Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair			
44.00	5-511		\$1	
	Posts, Lot of 40-50Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair			
150.00	5-512		\$1	
	Posts, Lot of 60-70Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair			
44.00	5-513		\$1	
	Posts, Lot of 45-55Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair			

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
44.00 5-514	Posts, Lot of 60-70 Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair		\$1	
150.00 5-515	Posts, Lot of 60-70 Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair		\$1	
225.51 5-516	Posts, Lot of 65-75 Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair		\$1	
301.00 5-517	Posts, Lot of 50-60 Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair		\$1	
120.00 5-518	Posts, Lot of 35-45 Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair		\$1	
120.00 5-519	Posts, Lot of 35-45 Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair		\$1	
225.51 5-520	Posts, Lot of 65-75 Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair		\$1	
225.51 5-521	Posts, Lot of 65-75 Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair		\$1	
331.00 5-522	Posts, Lot of 65-75 Wooden, Some Treated/Painted 4 inches x 6 inches x 8-14 feet approximately, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of the buyer. Fair		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
YORKTON, Highways, Fleet Services, 245 York Road East.				
Contact Brian Perih 306-786-1651 or Ed Patzwald 306-786-1687 email: brian.perih@gov.sk.ca or ed.patzwald@gov.sk.ca.				
255.00	5-533		\$100	Injectors and BorgWarner Turbo, Bosch 4 are still in box and plastic wrapped. For a Cummins 4BT engine, turbo still in box for a Cummins 4PT engine. New - Unused Injectors, 0 432 131 840. Turbo, 171270
179.00	5-534		\$1	Hydraulic Power Packs, SPX Stone Used, electric, both in working condition with leakage. Poor
129.00	5-535		\$25	Air Greaser, Westward With one barrel of grease, Exxon Ronex Extra Duty 2. In working condition. Fair
151.00	5-536		\$100	Parts Bin Container, Metal frame with clear solid plastic bins Tip out container with 3 sliding rows with different sizes. Good
405.00	5-537		\$100	Scraper/Underbody Plow, 2007 Munroe, Model MS3500 Was mounted on a 2008 Mack Granite tandem truck, now unmounted from truck and unused for 8 years, rebuilt in May 2014. With control box. Fair 07-06-5637 SCPRMS3511X200SCO
1,800.00	5-538	7031 hrs	\$1	Trailer, 1978 GIC Tilt deck 16 ton, dual tire, tire size: 8.25 x R15, 14 ply. GVW 32,000. yellow 7031 hrs PROBLEMS: has holes notched into it at the front of the frame, hitch fishplates are rotten and there are major frame issues with loss of material. Rust hole in frame rail on left hand side, landing gear mount twisted. Brakes, body, paint and lights are all in poor condition, tires are fair. Frame Cross members cracked so deck boards would need to be removed for repairs and boards might break and cannot be reused. Reflective tape needs to be replaced, several lights not working, junction box needs replacing, all hub caps are leaking oil, right side brakes are dragging, license plate lamp needs to be replaced. As is, Where is GL 1378
*MT	5-539	2618 hrs	\$100	Trailer, 1986 McCoyTD15T0 Tilt deck 16 ton, dual tire, tire size: 255/70 x 22.5R. GVW 40,000. yellow 2618 hrs PROBLEMS: front edge of deck toward hitch needs to be rebuilt, trailer is very rusted out in spots, rails very thin above the axles, body and lights are in poor condition, Unit would need to be inspected for repairs to be road worthy, tires, brakes and paint all in fair condition. As is, Where is 28G9003268
*MT	5-540	3347 hrs	\$100	Trailer, 1986 McCoy TD15T0 Tilt deck 16 ton, dual tire, tire size: 255/70 x 22.5R. GVW 40,000. yellow 3347 hrs PROBLEMS: Body and lights are in poor condition, trailer very rusted out in spots, unit would need to be inspected for repairs to be road worthy, unit has a modified hitch and would have to be set back to original to pass safety, under fish plating on frame there is major corrosion issue that has led to significant material loss, tires, brakes and paint all in fair condition. As is, Where is 24G9003266

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
*WD	5-541	Trailer, 1978 GIC Tilt deck 16 ton, dual tires, tire size: 8.25 x R15, 14 ply. GVW 32 000. Tires are fair. Brakes, body, paint and lights all in poor condition, yellow, 7333 hrs. yellow 7333 hrs PROBLEMS: Spring hangers broken, excess corrosion between springs, fishplates on hitch have excess corrosion and material loss, several cross members and deck supports rusted through decking would need to be removed for repair, landing gear in poor shape and handle is falling apart, couple of wheel hubs leaking, toolbox rusted through, wires hanging down in several areas, lamps are cracked, Brakes, body, paint and lights all in poor condition, tires are fair. As is, Where is	7333 hrs	\$1	G61278
303.00	5-542	Packer, 1976 Massey SP912 Self Propelled Roller Inline 6, gas Funk hydraulic Ford 300, 92 horse power, 4 speed, tire size: 7.50 x 15, 14 ply. yellow 7694 hrs PROBLEMS: Motor, transmission, tires, brakes, battery, interior, lights and horn all in poor condition. Needs new battery. Body, paint and mirrors are all in fair condition. Governor on engine does not work, engine and transmission have leaks, has coolant leaks, park is not working, hydraulic pump in poor shape. As is, Where is	7694 hrs	\$100	242
303.00	5-543	Packer, 1976 Massey SP912 Self Propelled Roller Inline 6, gas Funk hydraulic Ford 300, 92 horse power, 4 speed, tire size: 7.50 x 15, 14 ply. yellow 10,230 hrs PROBLEMS: engine will not start, engine has oil leaks, unit has hydraulic leaks, motor, transmission, tires, body exterior, exhaust, paint interior are all poor condition, Brakes battery lights and horn broken repairable. As is, Where is	10,230 hrs	\$100	241