
SALE SUMMARY LIST

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-787-2238,
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer)	This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.
WD = (Withdrawn)	This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.
No Bid =	Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Item #	Description	Km	Min Price	Serial Number	
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles					
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.					
3,507.00	4-001	SUV 2006 DODGE, Durango SLT, 4WD, 5.7L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows, locks, driver seat, heated mirrors, rear HVAC, 1 key fob. no back seats (work unit), plywood rear floor, cargo barrier, metal shelving, computer mounting bracket, fog/driving lights, hitch, trailer wiring., white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 193,026 km, , PROBLEMS: Rear rotors rusty- replacement needed, needs all 4 shocks, rear bumper broken, front bumper cracked with a hole, hood paint chips, cracked, rust, both left fenders rusted, both left doors rust along bottom, road rash, right rear door road rash, tailgate rusted, glass scratched, headlights fogged, grille chrome peeling, driver seat worn, ripped, and cushion is missing soft trim, driver door molding loose, holes in rear of front console, moldings loose on both right doors, roof small rust spots, dents, and 2 sealed holes, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	193,026 km	\$2,162	1D4HB48206F184309
2,001.00	4-002	SUV 2009 JEEP, Patriot, 4WD, 2.4L L4 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows, locks, keyless entry- 2 key fobs. brackets attached to head liner, grill inserts 1, 1/4" hitch (receiver), roof rails., white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 220,671 km, , PROBLEMS: Check engine light on, manifold leaking, catalytic convertor poor, needs front pads and rotors, tires cupped, rear differential noisy, turn signal switch does not cancel, rear bumper cracked, both left and rear fenders rusted, dog legs showing rust (inside), hood small dents, both rear doors have road rash/rust, roof small rust spots at front, poor battery, minor exterior damage. , As is, Where is	220,671 km	\$1,094	1J4FF28B39D240234
4,907.99	4-021	Van 2008 CHEVROLET, Uplander, FWD, 7 passenger (2nd row captain chairs), 3.9L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 3 keys, power front windows, mirrors, locks. , grey, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 78,646 km, , PROBLEMS: front and rear pads and rotors need replacement, right outer tie rod, front suspension link needs repair, TPMS warning light (right rear), hood scratches/chips, both bumpers scratched, both front fenders road rash, left rear door molding loose, left front door weather stripping torn, right front door small rust spots/dent, tailgate rust along bottom, headlights fogged, wiper blades need replacement, driver seat worn, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	78,646 km	\$2,901	1GNDU23W08D164698

Item #	Description	Km	Min Price	Serial Number
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.				
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.				
16.99	4-111		\$10	
	Auto Safety Kit, Blanket, tow rope, booster cables, flash light, carrying case. Other misc items included. No first aid kit. Excellent			
12.00	4-117		\$10	
	Booster Cables, AC Delco Part # 28095. 12 feet in length, 8 gauge. Medium duty. Good			
No Bid	4-118		\$10	
	Booster Cables, JLM accessories LTD. T141012S 12 feet in length. Storage bag. Light duty. Good			
12.00	4-119		\$10	
	Booster Cables, 12 feet in length. Medium duty. Good			
10.99	4-105		\$5	
	Camp Axe, Lot of 2 Coghlan 13 inch length. Fair			
No Bid *	3-101		\$40	192,088
	Cargo Cover, OEM Chrysler cargo cover, roll out. grey vinyl, May be compatible with a 2006 Dodge Magnum. Good			
No Bid *	5-102		\$1	
	Cart, Wood, 22.5"w x 50"l x 36.5"h, white, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels, worn, scuffed, paint chipped/worn. Poor			
31.29 *	5-108		\$1	
	Cart, Metal with Wood Inserts, 24"w x 47"l x 37"h, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels, 2 shelves. Fair			
No Bid *	5-114		\$1	
	Cart, Wooden, 22"w x 50"l x 36"h, 2 casters wheels, 2 fixed wheels, brown. Fair			
1.00 *	3-113		\$1	
	Drill Case, Makita, Plastic, standard size: 17.5" x 16.75" x 5". Fair			
1.00 *	3-114		\$1	
	Drill Case, Makita, Plastic, standard size: 17.5" x 16.75" x 5". Fair			
1.00 *	3-115		\$1	
	Drill Case, Makita, Plastic, standard size: 17.5" x 16.75" x 5". Fair			
1.00 *	3-116		\$1	
	Drill Case, Makita, Plastic, standard size: 17.5" x 16.75" x 5". Fair			
1.00 *	3-117		\$1	
	Drill Case, Makita, Plastic, standard size: 17.5" x 16.75" x 5". Fair			
1.00 *	3-118		\$1	
	Drill Case, Makita, Plastic, standard size: 17.5" x 16.75" x 5". Fair			
1.00 *	3-119		\$1	
	Drill Case, Makita, Plastic, standard size: 19" x 12" x 4.25". Fair			
27.51	4-123		\$1	
	Floor Mats, Lot of 2 GMC logo, rubber, Application unknown. Good			
No Bid *	1-104		\$1	
	Floor Mats - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), rubber, light grey in color, May be compatible with Chevrolet Astro. Excellent			
No Bid *	1-105		\$1	
	Floor Mats - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), rubber, light grey in color, May be compatible with Chevrolet Astro. Excellent			
10.99	4-106		\$5	
	Folding Shovels, Lot of 3 1 Coghlan and 2 World Famous brands 23 inches unfolded. Good			
11.00	4-124		\$10	1GR04DX9AE
	Front Floor Mats, Lot of 2 OEM Ram logo, fabric, black in color May be compatible with a 2013 Ram D1500. Good			
No Bid	4-125		\$10	
	GPS, GPS Tattle brand, remote monitoring device, Online portal or Tattle Systems "Go mobile app" required. GPS may not be functional. Fair			
5.02 *	3-103		\$5	Part # 0180086-A.
	Inside Tailgate Cover, Chev OEM. Moulded black plastic, May be compatible with 1999-2003 Chev Silverado. Good			

	Item #	Description	Km	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid *	3-106	Inside Tailgate Cover, Ford OEM. Moulded black plastic, May be compatible with a 2003 Ford Ranger. Good		\$5	Part # F77J-940726-AD.
No Bid *	3-105	Inside Tailgate Cover, Ford OEM. Moulded black plastic including top of tailgate, May be compatible with a 2003 Ford Ranger. Good		\$5	Part # F77J-940726-AD.
No Bid *	3-104	Inside Tailgate Cover, Ford OEM. Moulded black plastic including top of tailgate., May be compatible with a 2003 Ford Ranger. Good		\$5	Part # F77J-940726-AD.
No Bid *	1-106	License Plate Bracket - Front, Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), NO mounting kit, May be compatible with 2002-2006 Sebring. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-107	License Plate Bracket - Front, Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), NO mounting kit, May be compatible with 2002-2006 Sebring. Excellent		\$1	
1.02 *	1-108	License Plate Bracket - Front, Ford Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), NO mounting kit, May be compatible with 2005 Ford F250. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-127	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-128	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent		\$1	
1.00 *	1-129	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-130	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-131	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-113	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit, May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-114	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit, May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-115	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit, May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-116	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit, May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-117	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit, May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$1	
1.02 *	1-118	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit, May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$1	
1.02 *	1-119	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit, May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-110	License Plate Bracket - Front, Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit., May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty. Excellent		\$1	

	Item #	Description	Km	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid *	1-111	License Plate Bracket - Front, Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit., May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-112	License Plate Bracket - Front, Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit., May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty. Excellent		\$1	
*WD	* 2-123	Mud flaps, Mopar OEM (original equipment manufacturer), May be compatible with 2013, 2014, 2015 Jeep Patriot and Compass, 2 flat splash guards in package, front or rear. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	3-135	Pillar Trim, Ford Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Grey plastic, for left side inside pillar. Compatible with many Ford F250 and F350 trucks. Fair		\$10	
No Bid	4-126	Rear Step Bumper, OEM G.M. with mounting brackets and bolts, but missing plate lights., Compatible with a 2004 Chev Silverado 1500, 2500, 3500. May be other applications. Good		\$190	A04007
201.00	4-127	Rear Step Bumper, OEM G.M. with mounting brackets and bolts., Compatible with a 2004 Chev Silverado 1500, 2500, 3500. May be other applications. Good		\$200	A04010
25.99	4-120	Road Side Safety Kit, Premium kit with carry case. Has booster cables, tow rope, 12V compressor, flash light and misc. items. No first aid kit. Excellent		\$15	
40.99	4-112	Road Side Safety Kit, Premium road side kit with carry case. Has booster cables, tow rope, including 12 V compressor, flashlight and other misc items. No first aid kit. Excellent		\$15	
20.99	4-113	Safety Items, Miscellaneous, Lot of 30, Candles, pocket stoves, emergency stoves, light sticks. No first aid kit. Fair		\$1	
20.99	4-114	Safety Kit, , Blanket, shovel and carrying case. Other misc items included. No first aid kit. Good		\$1	
20.99	4-115	Safety Kit, , Blanket, tow rope, booster cables, flash light, carrying case. Other misc items included. No first aid kit. Good		\$1	
No Bid	4-107	Safety Triangles, Lot of 2 Auto Trend, 18 inches each side. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-124	Seat, OEM, Grey Fabric, 3rd row, backrest folds down. May be compatible with a 2007 Dodge Caravan. Fair		\$1	170,076
No Bid *	1-132	Shield for Inner Fender, 1 set Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), 1 right and 1 left, rear only, may be compatible with a 2008 Chrysler 1500, 2500 or 3500. Excellent		\$1	
No Bid *	1-133	Shield for Inner Fender, 1 set Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), 1 right and 1 left, rear only, may be compatible with a 2008 Chrysler 1500, 2500 or 3500. Excellent		\$1	
1.00 *	1-134	Shield for Inner Fender, 1 set Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), 1 right and 1 left, rear only, may be compatible with a 2008 Chrysler 1500, 2500 or 3500. Excellent		\$1	
1.02 *	12-118	Spare Tire, 16 inch, 135/70R/16, Continental, compact temporary spare on a steel rim. May be compatible with a 2008 Chev Uplander. Good		\$1	

Item #	Description	Km	Min Price	Serial Number
1.02 * 12-119	Spare Tire, 16 inch, 135/70R/16, Continental, compact temporary spare on a steel rim. May be compatible with a 2008 Chev Uplander. Good		\$1	
1.02 * 2-106	Spare Tire Box Mount, application specifics unknown, can be installed in truck bed. Fair		\$1	
1.21 * 2-107	Tail Light, Mopar (Chrysler), left rear, used, scratched. Good		\$1	Part# 5113205AB
No Bid * 2-128	Tire, 16 inch, 225/65R/16, Sailun IceBlazer, Snowflake, manufacture date. Week 16, year 2021. Good		\$40	
6.02 4-103	Tire, Goodyear Assurance, M+S., 215/70R/15. Manufacture date. Week 31, year 2008. Poor		\$5	
No Bid * 2-130	Tires, Set of 216 inch, 205/60R/16, Matrix Tour RD Multi-mile., manufacture date: week 44, year 2011. Fair		\$50	
No Bid * 2-102	Tires, Set of 316 inch, 215/65R/16, Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X, manufacture date: week 27, year 2018. Good		\$120	
No Bid * 11-125	Tires, Set of 3225/65R/16 Firestone, FR710. M+S, manufacture date: week 47, year 2016. Good		\$120	
No Bid * 3-107	Tires, Set of 4 Dunlop Grantrek SJB. Snow flake., 215/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 13, year 2009. Fair		\$120	
31.21 * 3-108	Tires, Set of 3 Firestone FR710 M+S, 215/60R/17, Manufacture date. Week 39, year 2012. Poor		\$30	
36.02 4-121	Tires, Set of 3 Firestone FR710. M+S, 215/65R/16. Manufacture date: week 49, year 2016. Poor		\$30	
No Bid * 3-111	Tires, Set of 4 Firestone FR710. M+S, 225/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 01, year 2016. Poor		\$40	
45.02 * 3-110	Tires, Set of 4 Firestone FR710. M+S, 225/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 04, year 2017. Poor		\$40	
No Bid * 3-109	Tires, Set of 4 Firestone FR710. M+S, 225/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 06, year 2016. Fair		\$120	
133.51 4-122	Tires, Set of 4 Firestone FR710. M+S, P215/65R/17. Manufacture date: week 07, year 2015. Fair		\$120	
201.00 * 3-112	Tires, Set of 4 Sumitomo HTR Enhance LX2. M+S, 215/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 35, year 2019. Good		\$160	
182.19 4-104	Tires, Set of 4 Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow flake., 215/60R/17. Manufacture date. Week 25, year 2018. Good		\$160	
No Bid 4-128	Tonneau Cover, Access Tonnosport brand, fabric roll up., Compatible with a 2014 GMC/Chev full-size pick up with a 5 foot 8 inch bed and still in box. Excellent		\$300	22,020,319
No Bid * 3-128	Tool Bag, Kuny, Standard size: 24" x 15" x 10.5". Fair		\$1	
*WD * 3-129	Tool Bag, Kuny, Standard size: 24" x 15" x 10.5". Fair		\$1	

	Item #	Description	Km	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid *	3-130	Tool Bag, Maximum, Standard size: 24" x 15" x 10.5". Fair		\$1	
1.21 *	3-131	Tool Bag, Maximum, Standard size: 24" x 15" x 10.5". Fair		\$1	
1,188.08	4-101	Topper, Brand FX, Made from composite material, has a roof rack with beacon and a rolling cargo bed. Has 1 key. Opening side compartments - 1 shelf on right side, 101"l x 71"w x 48.5"h. Removed from a 2007 Dodge Ram 2500, quad cab, 8 foot box. Fair		\$650	430,436
1,250.00	4-102	Topper, Brand FX, Made from composite material, has a roof rack with beacon, and a rolling cargo bed. Has 1 key. Cracked in 2 places-lower front. Opening side compartments - 1 shelf on right side, 102"l x 71"w x 55"h. Removed from a 2012 Silverado 2500 HD extended cab, 8 foot box. Fair		\$950	437,522
16.02 *	3-139	Tow Hooks - Front, Lot of 2 G.M. Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Parts # 15709728 + 15709729. Fits 84 different GM vehicles. List provided. Metal - left and right. Mounting bolts included. Good		\$15	
8.00	4-108	Tow Rope, Reese brand #19001, Use up to 2260 lbs. 14 feet, braided polpropylene with 2 steel hooks. Good		\$5	
10.00	4-109	Tow Ropes, Lot of 2, Braided with hooks. 12 feet long each. Good		\$5	
17.17	4-116	Tow Strap, Erickson 09200, Rated at 8500 lbs. 15 feet in length. 2 inch polyester webbing with steel hooks. Good		\$10	
5.51	4-110	Warning Triangle Kit, Grote, 3 weighted triangles in kit. Has red storage container. Good		\$5	
25.00 *	11-158	File cabinet, no keys, lock destoryed, scuffed and scratched, 4 drawer, vertical, metal.Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	11-160	File cabinet, no keys, lock destoryed, scuffed and scratched, 4 drawer, vertical, metal.Fair		\$1	

Item #	Description	Km	Min Price	Serial Number
LLOYDMINSTER, Highways, 3603 44th St				
Contact Mark EisenKirch 306-526-9103, Mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca				
362.02	4-533 Pull Broom, RS84A Hydraulic drive, Tire size: 225/75/15, has 6 tires. Tires, body exterior and lights are all in fair condition. Paint is poor. Unit worked when parked, unknown if it still does. yellowAs is, Where is		\$350	8,030
MOOSOMIN, SaskBuilds and Procurement, 709 Carleton Street				
Contact Wayne McGonigal 306-435-9339, wayne.mcgonigal@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	2-554 Bulbs, Halogen, Lot of 15 Sylvania Tungsten T10, 150W, 120V medium base, operational. New - Unused		\$1	
No Bid *	2-558 Floor Tiles, Lot of 13 Colors Plus , Commercial tile flooring, color: Fortress, dimensions: 12" x 12" x 1/8" thick. New - Unused		\$1	
No Bid *	2-559 Fluorescent Lights, Lot of 20 Flush Mount T8, 4ft L x 1ft W x 4" D, units are disassembled - some have no ballast or bulbs. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-560 Fluorescent Lights, Lot of 20 Flush Mount T8, 4ft L x 1ft W x 4" D, units are disassembled - some have no ballast or bulbs. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-561 Fluorescent Lights, Lot of 20 Flush Mount T8, 4ft L x 1ft W x 4" D, units are disassembled - some have no ballast or bulbs. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-562 Fluorescent Lights, Lot of 28 Flush Mount T8, 4ft L x 1ft W x 4" D, units are disassembled - some have no ballast or bulbs. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-564 Fluorescent Lights, Lot of 26 Single Tube T8, 4ft L x 2 3/4" W x 1.5" D, units are disassembled - all have ballast and some bulbs. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-565 Fluorescent Lights, Lot of 20 Surface Mount T8, 4ft L x 1ft W x 3.5" D, units are disassembled - some have no ballast or bulbs, all have plastic covers. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-566 Fluorescent Lights, Lot of 26 Surface Mount T8, 4ft L x 1ft W x 3.5" D, units are disassembled - some have no ballast or bulbs, all have plastic covers. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-567 Light Dimmer Switches, Lot of 5 Leviton, four units are 1500W and one unit is 1000W, operational, beige in color. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-568 Light Units, Lot of 4 Flush Mount with Glass Covers, 12" Round x 9" D, operational - 100 watt maximum, manufactured in 1971. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	2-569 Light Units, Lot of 16 Flush Mount with Glass Covers, 16 3/4" Round x 9" D, operational - 300 watt maximum, manufactured in 1971. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	2-570 Lights , Lot of 6 Round Glass/Globe Fixtures, 14" W x 6" D, operational, takes two 60W bulbs maximum per unit. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-571 Lights (Exterior), Lot of 3 Model MDL3 HPS, 100W medium base, 12" W x 11" H x 8" D, operational, faded, metal with plastic glass. Poor		\$1	
No Bid *	2-572 Lights (Exterior), Lot of 4 Model PCL1 HPS , 100W large base, 17.5" W x 15.5" H x 7" D, operational, faded, metal with plastic glass. Poor		\$1	
*MT	4-520 Tractor Cab, 2014 SIMS Cab Depot, Fits Massey Ferguson model GC1705, may fit more models. Operational. (cab only, tractor not included.) Good		\$250	S03451-01

Item #	Description	Km	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid * 2-574	Wall Pack Light (Exterior), Lot of 2 70 Watt HPS Type S62, 12" W x 10" H x 7 3/4" D, lamps are disassembled. Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 2-575	Wall Pack Light (Exterior), Lot of 4 70 Watt Medium HPS, 10" W x 7" H x 7" D, lamps are disassembled. Poor		\$1	
NORTH BATTLEFORD, Agriculture, Parsons Self Storage, 10021 Fyfe Ave				
Contact Galen Loy 306-446-8742 or 306-441-7308, galen.loy@gov.sk.ca				
3,055.86 4-552	Can Am ATV 2012 Outlander, 650 2PCB, 4WD, gas, Auto, Hand and thumb warmers, windshield, rear winch switch and wiring, front winch. Motor, transmission, breaks, battery and paint are good condition, fair tires, working exhaust and lights, minor exterior damage and scratched windshield., Red, 4057 km, 346 hours, Recent Repairs: Full service spring 2021 and radiator cleaned fall 2021, PROBLEMS: Left front A arm and frame are broken, replacement A arm part \$120.00, replacement frame part \$1200.00 are available from manufacturer plus labour, front push bar weld broken, top left side., As is, Where is	4057 km, 346 hours	\$500	3JBKJH10CJ000060
NORTH BATTLEFORD, Highways 502 114th Street.				
Contact Mark Eisenkirch 526-9103, mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca				
625.00 4-539	Message Board, American Signal , Does not work properly, may or may not be able to repair. Dimensions: 14 feet long from hitch to taillights and 4 feet wide. Trailer included. Broken Repairable		\$1	1A9BS331532228405
4,200.00 4-540	Utility Truck 1993 Volvo, FE42, 2WD, Volvo 409 CID, V6, diesel, manual, , A/C, tilt, cruise Cab over oil distributor, 6 speed, single axle, 1000 gallon tank, dual tires, 12 ply, tire size: 11R 22.5, wheel base: 168, gross vehicle weight: 14,968 kg. Truck runs and drives well., yellow, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 200,135 km, , PROBLEMS: Oil spray bar worn badly worn, wings do not spray and have been capped off, large crack in windshield., As is, Where is	200,135 km	\$3,000	4V52AEHC3PR472460
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, Hwy #2 North, call for directions.				
Contact Wanda Dickie 306-953-3434, wanda.dickie@gov.sk.ca or Tammy Lukaszuk 306-953-3392, tammy.luzaszuk@gov.sk.ca				
1.00 * 2-524	Drum Unit (Remanufactured), SEBDR400R, For use with Brother DCP-1200/DCP-1400; HL-1230/1240/1250/1270N/1435/1440/1450/1470; IntelliFax-4100/IntelliFax-4100e, MFC-8300/MFC-8500/MFC-8600/MFC-9600.New - Unused		\$1	
1.00 * 2-537	HP Ink Cartridge, 45 Black, For use with: HP Deskjet 710, 712, 720, 722, 820, 830, 832, 850, 855, 870, 880, 882, 890, 895, 930, 932, 935, 950, 952, 960, 970, 990, 995, 1000, 1100, 1120, 1220, 1600, 6122, 6127, 9300, HPDesignjet 700, 750, 755, HP Office jet G55, G85, G95, K60, K80, R40, R60, R80, T45, T65, HP Officejet Pro 1150, 1170, 1175, HP Photosmart P1000, P1100, 1115, 1215, 1218, 1315, HP Color Copier 110, 120, 140, 145, 150, 155, 160, 170, 180, 190, 210, 260, 270, 280, 290, HP Fax 1220.New - Unused		\$1	

Item #	Description	Km	Min Price	Serial Number
1.00 * 2-541	HP Ink Cartridge, 97 Tri-color- Magenta, Yellow, Cyan, For use with: HP Deskjet 460, 5740, 5940, 6520, 6540, 6620, 6830, 6840, 6940, 6980, 6988, 9800, HO Officejet H470, 100, 150, 6200, 6210, 7210, 7310, 7410, HP Photosmart B8350, 325, 335, 375, 385, 422, 425, 428, 475, 2610, 2710, 8049, 8050, 8150, 8450, 8750, HP Printer/Scanner/Copier 1600, 1610, 2350, 2355.New - Unused		\$1	
1.00 * 2-542	HP Ink Cartridges, Lot of 2 78 Tri-color Cartridge - Magenta, Cyan, Yellow, For use with: HP Deskjet 920, 930, 932, 935, 940, 950, 952, 960, 970, 990, 995, 1220, 3820, 6122, 6127, 9300, HP OfficeJet 5110, G55, G85, G95, K60, K80, V40, HP Photosmart P1000, P1100, 1115, 1215, 1218, 1315, HP Color Copier 180, 190, 280, 290, HP Digital copier 310, HP Printer/Scanner/Copier 750, 950 HP Fax 1220, 1230.New - Unused		\$1	
1.00 * 2-544	HP Inkjet Print Cartridge, 23 Tri-color - Magenta, Cyan, Yellow, For use with: HP Deskjet 710, 712, 720, 722, 810, 812, 830, 832, 880, 882, 885, 887, 890, 895, 1120, HP color copier 140, 145, 150, 155, 160, 170, 260, 270, HP Printer/scanner/copier 500, HP officejet r40, r60, r80, r45, r65, HP Officejet Pro 1170c, 1175c.New - Unused		\$1	
1.00 * 2-545	HP Inkjet Print Cartridge, 99 Photo - Pink, Blue, Black, For use with: HP Deskjet C4280, C5280, D4145, D4155, D4160, 460,5440, 5740, 5940, 6520, 6540, 6620, 6830, 6840, 6940, 6980, 9800, HP Photosmart B8350, C3140, C3150, C3180, C4140, C4150, C4180, D5060, D5065, D5069, D5145, D5155, D5160, 2570, 2575, N5610, 2710, 7850, 8050, 8150, 8450, 8750, HP Officejet J5780, 6200, 6210, 6310, 7210, 7310, 7410, HP Printer/Scanner/Copier 1507, 1510, 1600, 1610, 2350, 2355.New - Unused		\$1	
1.00 * 2-546	Inkjet Cartridge (Remanufactured), 96 Black, Compatible with: Deskjet 5740, 5740XI, 5940, 5940XI, 6520, 6520XI, 6540,6540DT, 6540XI, 6620, 6620XI, 6830V, 6840, 6840DT, 6840XI, 6940, 6940DT, 6980, 6980DT, 6988, 6988DT, 9800, 6800D, Officejet: 7210, 7210V, 7210XI, 7310, 7310XI, 7410, 7410XI, Photosmart: 2610, 2610V, 2610XI, 2710, 2710XI, 8050, 8150V, 8150XI, B8350, 8450, 8450XI, 8750.New - Unused		\$1	
1.00 * 2-547	Inkjet Printer Cartridges, Lot of 8 Combo-pack 2-HP Inkjet print Cartridges - 15 Black & 78 Tri-color (Magenta, Cyan, Yellow), For use with: HP Deskjet 920, 940, 3820, HP Officejet v40, 5110, HP Digital Copier 310, HP Printer/Scanner/Copier 750, 950, HP Fax 1230.New - Unused		\$1	
1.00 * 2-525	Laser Cartridges, Lot of 2TN460 - Black, For use with Brother DCP-1200/1400/1230/1240/1250/1270/1270N/1440,1450,1470N.New - Unused		\$1	
1.00 * 2-526	Printer Cartridges, Lot of 2 HP Laserjet 82X - Black, For use with HP Laserjet 8100, 8150.New - Unused		\$1	
1.00 * 2-527	Toner Cartidge (Remanufactured), SEBM451CR - Cyan, For use with HP Laserjet Pro 300 Color M351/ MFP M375/MFP M375NW, Pro 400 Color M451/M451DN/M451DW/M451NW/MFP M475/MFP M475DN/MFP M475DW.New - Unused		\$1	

Item #	Description	Km	Min Price	Serial Number
1.00 * 2-528	Toner Cartridges, Lot of 2 SAMSUNG 209, For use with SCX-4824, 4826, 4828, ML-2855.New - Unused		\$1	
1.00 * 2-529	Toner Cartridges (Remanufactured), Lot of 3 SEBM451BR - Black, For use with HP LaserJet Pro300 Color M351/MFP M375/MFP M375NW; Pro 400 color M451/M451DN/M451DWM451NW/MFP M475/MFP M475DN/MFP M475DW.New - Unused		\$1	
1.00 * 2-530	Toner Cartridge, Brother TN-450, High yield - Black, For use with HL-2220/2230/2240/2240D HL-2270DW/2275DW/2280DW, DCP-7060D/7065DN, MFC-7240/7290/7360/7360N, MFC-7365DN/7460DN/7860DW, FAX-2840/2940.New - Unused		\$1	
1.00 * 2-531	Toner Cartridge, HP Laserjet 501A, Q6470A - Black, For use with CP3505/3600/3800.New - Unused		\$1	
1.00 * 2-532	Toner Cartridge, HP Laserjet 83A, CF-283A - Black, For use with MFP M125, M127, M201, M225.New - Unused		\$1	
1.00 * 2-534	Toner Cartridges, Lot of 3 HP Laserjet 29X C4129X - Black, For use with HP Laserjet 5000, 5000N, 5000GN.New - Unused		\$1	
1.00 * 2-535	Toner Cartridges, Lot of 3 HP Laserjet 35A, CB435A - Black, For use with P1005, P1006.New - Unused		\$1	
PRINCE ALBERT, Highways, Northern Operations, 81 North Industrial Dr.				
Contact Cory Palko 306-960-5152, cory.palko@gov.sk.ca.				
2,000.00 4-541	Plasma Cutting Table, 2006 Fast Cut G5 Fabricator , , 6 x 12 water table, all drives and motors working when removed from service. Requires software to be operational. 2 torches and owners manual included. , , , , Fair		\$1	
7,900.00 4-542	Broom Tractor 1990 Ford, 7710, RWD, Inline 4 diesel, manual, 4 speed with L and H range, independent rear brakes, single tires, tires size: 11L x 16, 8 ply, wheel base: 101., yellow, 8,524 hours, , PROBLEMS: tires and battery poor, may need a new battery to start, minor exterior damage.>. As is, Where is	8,524 hours	\$5,000	BC26711
4,501.00 4-543	Broom Tractor 1995 Ford, 8240SL, RWD, FS6 Inline 6 diesel, manual, A/C 4 speed with L, M and H range, independent rear brakes, single tires, tire size: 11l x 16, 8 ply., yellow, 6,778 hours, , PROBLEMS: motor, tires and battery all poor condition, engine has blow by, steering doesn't work., As is, Where is	6,778 hours	\$1	BD96655
5,500.00 4-544	Motor Grader 2001 Champion, 730A, , Cummins 8.3L V6 diesel, Powershift, A/C 16 foot moldboard., yellow, 12,182 hours, , PROBLEMS: Engine poor/hydrolocked, transmission oil leaks, tires and battery poor. Sandvik board shown in photos attached to moldboard does not sell with unit, minor exterior damage.>. As is, Where is	12,182 hours	\$5,000	30,903
667.00 4-546	Motor Grader 2004 Volvo, G720B, , D7D GBE2 7.1L, Powershift, 8 speed., yellow, 7,603 hrs, , 7,603 hrs PROBLEMS: Grader caught on fire and burnt most of the unit. Unit has been used as a parts grader and has multiple parts stripped and removed, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>. As is, Where is		\$1	35,953

Item #	Description	Km	Min Price	Serial Number
2,777.77	4-547 Steel Wheel Packer 1981 Case 251, Hatz Z788H V2, Hydrostatic, yellow 3,470 hours, PROBLEMS: Battery poor, may need a battery to start, has some oil leaks, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	3,470 hours	\$1	840,237,519
16,555.00	4-548 Motor Grader 2008 John Deere, 770D, , 9L V6 diesel, Powershift, A/C Locking differential, 8 speed, tire size: 17.5 x 25., yellow 11,474 hours, , PROBLEMS: Moldboard missing from unit, side shift cylinder is broken/hydraulic hoses ripped off, extensive damage to blade mouting area. May need new batteries to start, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	11,474 hours	\$7,500	DW770DX616169
11,500.00	4-549 Motor Grader 2001 Champion, 740A, , Cummins M11-c V6 diesel, Powershift, A/C 8 speed, locking differential, tire size: 17.5 x 25., yellow, 16,531 hours, , PROBLEMS: Unit has various oil leaks, grading device has quite a bit of play, may require new batteries to start unit, minor exterior damage.>. As is. Where is	16,531 hours	\$7,500	33,059
2,100.00	4-550 Steel Wheel Packer 1975 Gallion 6 Ton, Inline 4 gas, Hydrostatic, Double wheel, converts into a towable trailer. yellow PROBLEMS: May need a battery to start unit, minor exterior damage.>As is, Where is		\$1	H46G57923
14,177.77	4-551 Plow Truck 2000 MackRD688S, Mack E7-350 12L V6 diesel, Eaton RTOF14610B, 10 speed, locking differential, tandem axle, dual tires, tire size: 11R x 22.5., yellow, 101,851 km, , PROBLEMS: Excessive amount of frame corrosion, box condition poor, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	101,851 km	\$2,500	1M2P267C9YM049807
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Avenue North				
Contact Brent Zbaraschuk 306-953-2428, brent.zbaraschuk@gov.sk.ca or Tyla Wills 306-953-3400, Tyla.wills@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	3-533	Tires, Set of 4Michelin 215/75R17.5, Manufacture date: week 39, year 2011. Poor	\$1	
No Bid *	3-534	Tires, Set of 2Multi Trac G/S 23 x 10.5 -12 NHS, For a quad. Poor	\$10	
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 47 12th Street East				
Contact Carole Stewart carole.stewart@gov.sk.ca, 306-940-7808 or Wanda Dickie 306-953-3434, wanda.dickie@gov.sk.ca				
2.00 *	3-504	Chair, Side, metal, cloth, 2 tone colour, with arms, needs to be cleaned. Fair	\$1	
1.00 *	3-513	Printer Cartridge, Laserjet 85A, Used for P1102, P1102w, M1132, M1212, M1214, M1217. New - Unused	\$1	
REGINA, Highways, Operations and Maintanance, 221 N Winniepeg St.				
Contact Ethan Reoch 306-519-3560 ethan.reoch@gov.sk.ca or Braden Huel 306-531-4705 Braden.Huel@gov.sk.ca				
259.00	4-503	Boat Motor , Johnson, 65 Powershift, model 65ES 73R, Includes gas tank and throttle. Unsure if operational. Fair	\$1	C 6981
225.00	4-504	Boat Motor , Johnson, 65 Powershift, model 65ES 73R, Motor only, missing propeller and leg. Unsure if operational. Broken Repairable	\$1	C 6982
No Bid	4-505	Car Seats , 2005 Dodge seats , x2 seat row for dodge vehicle. Seats have never been used. Good	\$1	
No Bid	4-506	Car Seats , , Blue, three seat row with seat buckles. Unknown make. Fair	\$1	
No Bid	4-507	Car Seats , , Grey, three seat row with seat buckles. Unknown make. Fair	\$1	

	Item #	Description	Km	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid	4-508	Ducted Fume Hood, , Includes vent, 30" x 65" x 47". Broken Repairable		\$1	
251.51	4-509	Freezer , Model QL-48-T, Foster Commando 90 , Commercial two door freezer, operational when last used, keys for the lock on the door are missing. Broken Repairable		\$1	
22.50	4-510	Fume Hood, Lot of 2 Labonco Protector Laboratory Hood, Two identical units. 27" x 12" x 48". Broken Repairable		\$1	
2,477.30	4-511	Lathe, Enterprise NO 10, metal, Canter, operational when placed in storage. Assorted accessories included. Fair		\$1	
51.00	4-512	Paper Bag Bundles, Lot of 10 250 bags per bundle, Bag size 16" x 8" x 5". Good		\$1	
230.00	4-513	Portable Generator , Honda, AC 120 V, Max Load 11A. Operational when last used. Good		\$1	
480.00	4-514	Portable Generator , Honda GX340 11.0, Gasoline. 29" x 28" x 29". Operational when last used. Good		\$1	SM6000LHE
38.00	4-515	Service Van Insert, metal, 74"x 48" x 20". Fair		\$1	
25.00	4-516	Tailgate, , For F350 truck, white, 64" x 24". Poor		\$1	
219.29	4-518	Tires, Set of 4 for trailer, Road Rider St, ST235/80R16, On rims, for trailer service only. Manufacture Date: January 2010. Fair		\$1	
400.00	4-517	Tires, Set of 8 Goodyear - G114 Unisteel, 8.25 R15TR, Load Range G. Manufacture date: October, 2002 TIN: DOT PAPP 6UOW 4402. New - Unused		\$1	
89.99	4-519	Van/Truck Cabinet, Filing/storage cabinet truck mount. 57" x 18" x 24". Fair		\$1	
189.00	4-545	Geotechnical Misc. Equipment, 1 Bundle Various geotechnical field testing equipment. Selling as one lot of items, not individually. It is unknown if the items are operational, however, all items were still operational when placed in storage approximately 12 years ago. , 1. 28 bags of "Fed Wate" drilling mud (45.4kg/bag) 2. 10 pails of Bentonite pellets "Enviroplug Tablets 1/2" (5 gal pails) 3. Various drill heads 4. Pneumatic Piezometers coils (5 x 60 m coils) 5. Standpipe Piezometer (includes tubing) 6. SAA probe on wooden spool (approx. 100 ft) 7. In-place inclinometers (x5) 8. Tube/pipe drill casings (6" metal, 70 ft total) 9. French drain reel 10. Material testing device "Marsh Bellofram Press" 11. Wax (approx. 25 slabs. Dim: 12"x19"x2") 12. Various length Shelby tubes 13. Field vane shear Set (x4) Fair		\$100	

Item #	Description	Km	Min Price	Serial Number
ROWAN'S RAVINE Provincial Park, Parks Culture and Sport, Call for location directions.				
Contact Abby Fuller 306-725-5200, abby.fuller@gov.sk.ca, or Tim Gelinis 306-725-5210, tim.gelinis@gov.sk.ca				
971.21	4-501	194,064	\$1	2G1WB58K081356853
	Car 2008 Chevrolet, Impala LS, 2WD, 3.5L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise tire size unknown., brown, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 194,064 km, Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: windshield, tires, paint and exterior all in poor condition. Has anti-freeze leak on one head, needs new brakes, no battery. No other known issues; vehicle ran when parked. , As is, Where is			
SASKATOON, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, SCC, 910 60th street East, Saskatoon. Loading Dock Stores				
Contact Bob Kirton 306-956-8835 bob.kirton@gov.sk.ca Danielle.Corriveau@gov.sk.ca.				
No Bid *	6-559		\$1	
	Kitchen Equipment , Lot of 9, Food serving table, 3 buffet trays, rusted, lights need repair. Broken Repairable			
SASKATOON, Highways, 126 105th St E				
Contact Richard Leibel 306-933-5262, Richard.Leibel@gov.sk.ca				
*WD	4-521		\$1	
	Crimping Tool, With hose cutter. Both crimp and cutter work, missing foot feed and dies. Fair			
*WD	4-522		\$1	
	Pallet Racking, 12' high, 8'wide, with metal grates. Fair			
38.48	4-530		\$1	
	Plow, Underslung Attachment, , Was mounted under a 2008 Mack tandem truck. Item is missing frame mounts Poor			
42.68	4-528		\$1	
	Plow, Underslung Attachment, , Was mounted under a 2008 Mack tandom truck. Item has the frame mounts attached. Poor			
42.68	4-529		\$1	
	Plow, Underslung Attachment, , Was mounted under a 2008 Mack tandom truck. Item has the frame mounts attached. Poor			
38.48	4-531		\$1	
	Plow, Underslung Attachment, , Was mounted under a 2008 Mack tandom truck. Item is missing frame mounts. Poor			
*WD	4-523		\$1	
	Service Truck Crane, Maxilift, 3304W, Functional but hasn't been used in some time. Fair			
*WD	4-524		\$1	
	Shelving, Lot of 2, Missing hardware. Poor			
65.00	4-525		\$1	
	V-Plow Attachment, , Missing mounting pieces, non-funtional. Poor			
53.00	4-526		\$1	
	V-Plow Attachments, , Missing mounting pieces, non-funtional. Poor			
150.00	4-527		\$1	
	V-Plow Attachments, , Missing mounting pieces, non-funtional. Poor			
SMEATON, Parks, Culture and Sports, Narrow Hills Provincial Park, Box 130				
Contact Tanya White (306) 426-2622, tanya.white@gov.sk.ca or Laurie Shymanski (306) 426-2624, laurie.shymanski@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid	4-553		\$10	
	Book, On The Living Edge, Handbook to Waterfront Living, soft cover.Good			
No Bid	4-554		\$5	
	Book, Small Fishing Vessel , Safety Manual, soft cover.Good			

Item #	Description	Km	Min Price	Serial Number
SWIFT CURRENT, Highways, Fleet Services, 1200 South Service Road W				
Contact Josh Lafontaine 306-778-8353, Josh.lafontaine@gov.sk.ca or Tayler Sanderson 306-778-8353, Tayler.Sanderson@gov.sk.ca				
273.00	4-534 Sign Posts, Lot of 88 , 4" x 6" Fair		\$2	
161.00	4-535 Sign Posts, Lot of 51 , 4" x 6" Fair		\$2	
130.00	4-536 Sign Posts, Lot of 41 , 4" x 6" Fair		\$2	
130.00	4-537 Sign Posts, Lot of 41 , 4" x 6" Fair		\$2	
140.00	4-538 Sign Posts, Lot of 44 , 4" x 6" Fair		\$2	
TISDALE, Highways & Transportation, Northern Tisdale, 1103-12th Ave.				
Contact David Derr, 306-878-8823 or 306-921-7202, david.derr@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	3-502 Bunk Car 1967 Atco, 10' x 30', trailer cannot move under its own weight, it is not floating on a base/frame that will need deconstructing, all utilities have been disconnected. Other information: loading required for removal - it is the responsibility of the buyer to measure height of unit, if necessary, for transportation route. As is, where is. 48 hours notice is required for pick up. Poor		\$1	
YORKTON, Highways, Fleet Services, 245 York Road East.				
Contact Brian Perih 306-786-1651 or Ed Patzwald 306-786-1687 email: brian.perih@gov.sk.ca or ed.patzwald@gov.sk.ca.				
310.00	4-532 Posts, Lot of 75 to 100 Wooden, mostly fir, 4" x 6" x 14' approximately, old broken sign posts, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs. Must bring deck-over trailer for assistance with loading. If deck-over trailer cannot be provided, loading is responsibility of buyer. Fair		\$1	
350.00	4-502 Posts, Wooden, mostly fir, 4" x 6" x 14' approximately, old broken sign posts, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs. Must bring deck-over trailer for assistance with loading. If deck-over trailer cannot be provided, loading is responsibility of buyer. Fair		\$1	
*WD	* 2-583 Gravel Truck 1999 Volvo, WG64, Tandem Truck, Volvo VED12B V6 diesel, Eaton Fuller RTX14710B, Motor has leaks, transmission, exhaust, battery, paint and interior are fair. Tires, brakes and lights are poor. Exterior, windshield and wipers are good, including mirrors and horn. 197 wheel base, dual tires, Yellow, 14,578 hours, , PROBLEMS: a lot of hydraulic leaks, coolant leaks, cross members need replacing as they are cracked, front pins and bushings need replacing. Main and cross chain need repair work, a lot of air leaks, electrical needs repair, rear shocks need replacing, oil pan gasket needs replacing, needs new fender brackets, unit has no box. >, As is, Where is	14,578 hours	\$1,000	4VHJCAGF9XN865383
YORKTON, SaskBuilds and Procurement, Whitespruce, NE-35-TP26-R5-W2. Call for directions.				
Contact Mark Bigoraj 306-786-5871, 306-621-3051 mark.bigoraj2@gov.sk.ca.				
10.02	* 2-549 Street Light Heads, Lot of 22, To attach to metal street poles, operational. Fair		\$1	