

SALE SUMMARY LIST

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-787-2238,
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.
WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.
No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number	
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles					
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.					
3,987.87	3-001	Car 2007 CHRYSLER, Sebring, FWD, 2.7L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, CD player, power windows, locks, driver seat, trunk release, heated mirrors, keyless entry- 2 fobs, driving/fog lights , silver, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 204,174 km, Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: left front axles, left front CVJ, foggy headlights, hood road rash, scratches, minor dents, front bumper chips/scratches, both rear fenders have rust, right rear door rust at bottom inside and out, trunk lid slight scratches, windshield chips, driver seat stained, head liner loose, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	204,174 km	\$2,115	1C3LC56R47N634761
1,316.00	3-003	Car 2008 CHRYSLER, Sebring, FWD, 2.4L L4 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, CD player, power locks, windows, trunk release, heated mirrors, keyless entry- 1 fob , blue, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 263,273 km, Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: check engine light on, P2017- intake manifold runner position (bank 1), P0700- transmission control system, P0562 battery low, rear struts, front pads/rotors, alignment out, A/C noise, left rear tail light assembly cracked, headlights fogged, hood paint bubbling, scratched, dents, both rocker panels road rash, left rear door dent, trunk lid scratches, windshield chips, wiper blades poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	263,273 km	\$916	1C3LC46K38N268130
3,798.00	3-004	Car 2009 CHRYSLER, Sebring, FWD, 2.4L L4 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, CD player, power locks, windows, trunk release, heated mirrors, keyless entry- 2 fobs , beige, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 255,881 km, Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: front and rear struts, front links, alignment needed, 3rd brake light out, hood paint bubbling, scratches, rear bumper scrape, left front fender rust/scrape, right rear fender rust, left rear door rust at bottom/dent, windshield chips, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	255,881 km	\$1,753	1C3LC46B89N573477

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number	
4,787.87	3-005	SUV 2008 JEEP, Liberty, 4WD, 3.7L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, CD player, power locks, windows, mirrors, 1 key fob front tow hooks, hitch, trailer wiring, red, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 273,816 km, Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: front struts noisy, muffler, right front axle leaking, two lower control arm bushings, rear rotors rusted, windshield cracked, missing "JE" from emblem, hood scratches, both bumpers scratched, all doors have rust at the bottom, tailgate rust/scratches, road rash on front wheel flares, roof rust along front, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	273,816 km	\$1,987	1J8GN28K68W251771
5,431.00	3-006	Truck 2015 CHRYSLER, Ram 3500, 4WD crew cab, 5.7L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power locks, windows, heated mirrors, keyless entry- 1 fob grille inserts, front tow hooks, trailer tow mirror, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, original trailer brakes, head ache rack (no beacon), spare tire (loose in box), wheel wrench and jack (loose under back set), white, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 247,009 km, Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: engine blown, does not run, transmission pan leaking, park brake not holding, rear and front pads separating 2mm, windshield cracked, rear bumper bent, sensors missing, both rear fenders dented, tailgate bent, dented, missing moulding/badge, right front mirror missing, license plate bulbs out, mud flaps missing, both rear doors have loose weather stripping, right front inside door panel loose, interior soiled/scuffed, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	247,009 km	\$4,431	3C63R3GT9FG592689
4,298.00	3-007	Truck 2006 FORD, F150, RWD, extended cab, (has a back seat), 6'6" box, 4.6L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, 2 keys hitch, trailer wiring, white, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 208,527 km, Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: power steering hose and rack leaking, rear rotors poor, alignment out, rear tires poor, front bumper rusted, rear bumper rust, dents, bent, left front fender rust, left rear fender rust/dent, right front fender rust, left rear door rust inside bottom, tailgate bent, rust, paint cracked and missing moulding, front box bent behind cab, hole in front grille, seats stained, driver seat worn- foam and frame exposed, battery poor, wiper blades poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	208,527 km	\$3,188	1FTRX12W86NB52033

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
8,487.87	3-008	161,866 km	\$1,932	1GCHG35UX71233092
	Van 2007 Chevrolet, Express, RWD, 6.0L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, power locks, rear aux. heater, 2 keys hitch, trailer wiring, trailer brake, plywood floor, shelving, map box, cargo barrier, roof rack with beacon (condition unknown), second jack in cargo area, white, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 161,866 km, , PROBLEMS: all 4 tires need replacement, alignment needed, right headlight repair needed, hood paint poor and peeling, front bumper dented and rusting, rear bumper bent, dented and scratched, all fenders peeling and dented, all doors paint peeling, trunk has peeling and chips in paint, wiper blades poor, roof paint peeling and 3 sealed holes, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is			
1,701.00	3-009	246,474 km	\$1,691	2D8HN44EX9R685307
	Van 2009 DODGE, Grand Caravan, FWD, 7 passenger Stow-N-Go (rear seat only), 3.3L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors, locks, front windows, rear HVAC, keyless entry- 1 original fob & 1 remote start fob , silver, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 246,474 km, Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: transmission gets stuck in reverse, all tires poor/cracked side walls, windshield cracked, hood paint peeling, dents, scratches, front bumper dent, all fenders have rust, dog legs rusted, hole in left dog leg, both left doors rusted along bottom (inside and out), both right doors rusted, tailgate rust on inside, scratches, rear bumper broken, paint poor, battery poor, head lights foggy, driver's sunvisor clip broken, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is			
4,501.11	3-010	152,939 km	\$1,462	1D4HN11H18B172703
	Van 2008 Dodge, Grand Caravan Cargo, FWD, 3.3L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, CD player, power mirrors, windows, locks, keyless entry, 2 fobs map box, computer stand, metal floor, shelving, cargo barrier, tailgate handle, hitch, roof rack with beacon (condition unknown), wheel wrench and jack (loose in shelving), white, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 152,939 km, , PROBLEMS: oil pan gasket leaking, both inner tie rods need attention, front tires poor, hood hail damage and bubbling, front left fender rusted, rear bumper chipped and scratched, tailgate rusted and dented, right front mirror housing damaged, left rear wheel cover missing, left front headlight foggy, windshield chips, rear wiper blade needs to be replaced, both front window switches loose, driver cushion worn, roof dented with rust spots and two sealed holes, battery is poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is			

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.				
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.				
10.00	3-134	Bench Seat, G.M. Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Grey fabric, seats 3 people. May be compatible with a 2005 Chev Astro van. Fair	\$5	191,395
No Bid	3-101	Cargo Cover, OEM Chrysler cargo cover, roll out. grey vinyl, May be compatible with a 2006 Dodge Magnum. Good	\$40	192,088
No Bid	3-113	Drill Case, Makita, Plastic, standard size: 17.5" x 16.75" x 5" Fair	\$1	
No Bid	3-114	Drill Case, Makita, Plastic, standard size: 17.5" x 16.75" x 5" Fair	\$1	
No Bid	3-115	Drill Case, Makita, Plastic, standard size: 17.5" x 16.75" x 5" Fair	\$1	
No Bid	3-116	Drill Case, Makita, Plastic, standard size: 17.5" x 16.75" x 5" Fair	\$1	
No Bid	3-117	Drill Case, Makita, Plastic, standard size: 17.5" x 16.75" x 5" Fair	\$1	
No Bid	3-118	Drill Case, Makita, Plastic, standard size: 17.5" x 16.75" x 5" Fair	\$1	
No Bid	3-119	Drill Case, Makita, Plastic, standard size: 19" x 12" x 4.25" Fair	\$1	
No Bid *	1-104	Floor Mats - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), rubber, light grey in color , May be compatible with Chevrolet Astro. Excellent	\$10	
No Bid *	1-105	Floor Mats - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), rubber, light grey in color , May be compatible with Chevrolet Astro. Excellent	\$10	
10.00	3-102	Folding Shovel, Coghlan Brand. Metal, Length folded 10 inches. Length open 23 inches. Still in box. Excellent	\$5	
No Bid	3-103	Inside Tailgate Cover, Chev OEM. Moulded black plastic, May be compatible with 1999-2003 Chev Silverado. Good	\$5	Part # 0180086-A.
No Bid	3-104	Inside Tailgate Cover, Ford OEM. Moulded black plastic including top of tailgate., May be compatible with a 2003 Ford Ranger. Good	\$5	Part # F77J-940726-AD.
No Bid	3-105	Inside Tailgate Cover, Ford OEM. Moulded black plastic including top of tailgate, May be compatible with a 2003 Ford Ranger. Good	\$5	Part # F77J-940726-AD.
No Bid	3-106	Inside Tailgate Cover, Ford OEM. Moulded black plastic, May be compatible with a 2003 Ford Ranger. Good	\$5	Part # F77J-940726-AD.
No Bid *	1-106	License Plate Bracket - Front, Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), NO mounting kit , May be compatible with 2002-2006 Sebring. Excellent	\$10	
No Bid *	1-107	License Plate Bracket - Front, Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), NO mounting kit , May be compatible with 2002-2006 Sebring. Excellent	\$10	
No Bid *	1-108	License Plate Bracket - Front, Ford Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), NO mounting kit., May be compatible with 2005 Ford F250. Excellent	\$5	

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid *	1-113	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit, May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-114	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit, May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-115	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit, May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-116	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit, May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-117	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit, May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-118	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit, May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-119	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit, May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500. Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-110	License Plate Bracket - Front, Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit., May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty. Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	1-111	License Plate Bracket - Front, Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit., May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty. Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	1-112	License Plate Bracket - Front, Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit., May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty. Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	1-127	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-128	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-129	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-130	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-131	License Plate Bracket - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	2-123	Mud flaps, Mopar OEM (original equipment manufacturer), May be compatible with 2013, 2014, 2015 Jeep Patriot and Compass, 2 flat splash guards in package, front or rear. Excellent		\$10	
No Bid	3-135	Pillar Trim, Ford Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Grey plastic, for left side inside pillar. Compatible with many Ford F250 and F350 trucks. Fair		\$10	
38.00	3-136	Roof Rack Brackets - Universal, Lot of 4Aluminum, Mounts to roof drip rails. No cross bars. Good		\$10	

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid *	2-124	Seat, OEM, Grey Fabric, 3rd row, backrest folds down. May be compatible with a 2007 Dodge Caravan. Fair		\$5	170,076
No Bid *	1-132	Shield for Inner Fender, 1 setChrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), 1 right and 1 left, rear only, may be compatible with a 2008 Chrysler 1500, 2500 or 3500. Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	1-133	Shield for Inner Fender, 1 setChrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), 1 right and 1 left, rear only, may be compatible with a 2008 Chrysler 1500, 2500 or 3500. Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	1-134	Shield for Inner Fender, 1 setChrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), 1 right and 1 left, rear only, may be compatible with a 2008 Chrysler 1500, 2500 or 3500. Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	12-119	Spare Tire, 16 inch, 135/70R/16, Continental, compact temporary spare on a steel rim. May be compatible with a 2008 Chev Uplander. Good		\$10	
No Bid *	12-118	Spare Tire, 16 inch, 135/70R/16, Continental, compact temporary spare on a steel rim. May be compatible with a 2008 Chev Uplander. Good		\$10	
No Bid *	2-106	Spare Tire Box Mount, application specifics unknown, can be installed in truck bed. Fair		\$5	
No Bid *	2-107	Tail Light, Mopar (Chrysler) left rear, used, scratched. Good		\$25	Part# 5113205AB
66.70 *	12-104	Tailgate, Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), yellow in color, May be compatible with a 2004 Chev. Siverado 3500 extended cab. May not be complete. Good		\$1	A04007
100.33 *	12-105	Tailgate, Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), yellow in color, May be compatible with a 2004 Chev. Siverado 3500 extended cab. May not be complete. Good		\$1	
111.11 *	12-106	Tailgate, Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), yellow in color, May be compatible with a 2004 Chev. Siverado 3500 extended cab. May not be complete. Good		\$1	
26.55 *	1-151	Tire, 17 inch, P225/55R/17, Goodyear, Assurance. M+S. Manufacture date: week 02, year 2017. Fair		\$10	
No Bid *	2-102	Tires, Lot of 316 inch, 215/65R/16, Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X, manufacture date: week 27, year 2018. Good		\$120	
No Bid *	2-128	Tire, 16 inch, 225/65R/16, Sailun IceBlazer, Snowflake, manufacture date. Week 16, year 2021. Good		\$40	
No Bid *	2-130	Tires, Lot of 216 inch, 205/60R/16, Matrix Tour RD Multi-mile., manufacture date: week 44, year 2011. Fair		\$50	
No Bid	3-107	Tires, Set of 4 Dunlop Grantrek SJB. Snow flake., 215/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 13, year 2009. Fair		\$120	
No Bid	3-108	Tires, Set of 3 Firestone FR710 M+S, 215/60R/17, Manufacture date. Week 39, year 2012. Poor		\$30	
No Bid	3-109	Tires, Set of 4 Firestone FR710. M+S, 225/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 06, year 2016. Fair		\$120	

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid	3-110	Tires, Set of 4 Firestone FR710. M+S, 225/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 04, year 2017. Poor		\$40	
No Bid	3-111	Tires, Set of 4 Firestone FR710. M+S, 225/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 01, year 2016 Poor		\$40	
No Bid	3-112	Tires, Set of 4 Sumitomo HTR Enhance LX2. M+S, 215/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 35, year 2019. Good		\$160	
151.01	3-137	Tool Box, Challenger, 70 inches long, 16.5 inches wide, 14 inches tall. Fire extinguisher mounting bracket on front. Diamond plate aluminum. Gull wing crossover, no tray, includes keys. Good		\$125	430,470
151.01	3-138	Tool Box, Challenger, 70 inches long, 16.5 inches wide, 14 inches tall. Fire extinguisher mounting bracket on front. Diamond plate aluminum. Gull wing crossover, no tray, includes keys. Good		\$125	430,520
5.55	3-120	Tool Box/Cart, Stanley, On wheels, dimensions: 24.18" x 14.75" x 16.5". Fair		\$1	
22.00	3-121	Tool Box/Cart, Stanley, On wheels, dimensions: 24.18" x 14.75" x 16.5". Fair		\$1	
5.55	3-122	Tool Box/Cart, Stanley, On wheels, dimensions: 24.18" x 14.75" x 16.5". Fair		\$1	
22.00	3-123	Tool Box/Cart, Stanley, On wheels, dimensions: 24.18" x 14.75" x 16.5". Fair		\$1	
22.00	3-124	Tool Box/Cart, Stanley, On wheels, dimensions: 24.18" x 14.75" x 16.5". Fair		\$1	
8.50	3-125	Tool Box/Cart, Stanley, On wheels, dimensions: 24.18" x 14.75" x 16.5". Fair			
26.25	3-126	Tool Box/Cart, Stanley, On wheels, dimensions: 24.18" x 14.75" x 16.5". Fair		\$1	
70.01	3-127	Tool Boxes with Carrier, Dewalt, Two tool boxes, standard size, attached to L-cart carrier on wheels. Can hold three tool boxes total. 21" x 21.25" x 43.5". Fair		\$1	
No Bid	3-128	Tool Bag, Kuny, Standard size: 24" x 15" x 10.5". Fair		\$1	
No Bid	3-129	Tool Bag, Kuny, Standard size: 24" x 15" x 10.5". Fair		\$1	
No Bid	3-130	Tool Bag, Maximum, Standard size: 24" x 15" x 10.5". Fair		\$1	
No Bid	3-131	Tool Bag, Maximum, Standard size: 24" x 15" x 10.5". Fair		\$1	
12.00	3-132	Tool Cart, Stanley Mobile job chest on wheels, dimensions: 29.87" x 18.62" x 19.12". Fair		\$1	
27.50	3-133	Tool Cart, Stanley Fat Max On wheels, standard size: 13.33" x 21" x 29". Fair		\$1	
No Bid	3-139	Tow Hooks - Front, Lot of 2G.M. Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Parts # 15709728 + 15709729. Fits 84 different GM vehicles. List provided. Metal - left and right. Mounting bolts included. Good		\$15	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
22.51 *	2-109 Utility Lights, Lot of 2 Red lights for a vehicle, to be mounted on rear frame. Fair		\$20	
22.51 *	2-110 Utility Lights, Lot of 2 Red lights for a vehicle, to be mounted on rear frame. Fair		\$20	
MOOSE JAW, Highways & Infrastructure, Fleet Services, 1 km south of Moose Jaw on Highway #2.				
Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca				
99.00	3-514 Asphalt Storage Tank, Tires are flat and poor condition. Unknown if lights or brakes work. Poor		\$1	
MOOSOMIN, SaskBuilds and Procurement, 709 Carleton Street				
Contact Wayne McGonigal 306-435-9339, wayne.mcgonigal@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	2-554 Bulbs, Halogen, Lot of 15, Sylvania Tungsten T10, 150W, 120V medium base, operational. New - Unused		\$1	
No Bid *	2-558 Floor Tiles, Lot of 13, Colors Plus , Commercial tile flooring, color: Fortress, dimensions: 12" x 12" x 1/8" thick New - Unused		\$1	
No Bid *	2-559 Fluorescent Lights, Lot of 20, Flush Mount T8, 4ft L x 1ft W x 4" D, units are disassembled - some have no ballast or bulbs. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-560 Fluorescent Lights, Lot of 20, Flush Mount T8, 4ft L x 1ft W x 4" D, units are disassembled - some have no ballast or bulbs. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-561 Fluorescent Lights, Lot of 20, Flush Mount T8, 4ft L x 1ft W x 4" D, units are disassembled - some have no ballast or bulbs. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-562 Fluorescent Lights, Lot of 28, Flush Mount T8, 4ft L x 1ft W x 4" D, units are disassembled - some have no ballast or bulbs. Good		\$1	
2.50 *	2-563 Fluorescent Lights, Lot of 4, Metal T8, 4' L x 4" W, operational with ballast, tubes and plastic covers. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-564 Fluorescent Lights, Lot of 26, Single Tube T8, 4ft L x 2 3/4" W x 1.5" D, units are disassembled - all have ballast and some bulbs. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-565 Fluorescent Lights, Lot of 20, Surface Mount T8, 4ft L x 1ft W x 3.5" D, units are disassembled - some have no ballast or bulbs, all have plastic covers. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-566 Fluorescent Lights, Lot of 26, Surface Mount T8, 4ft L x 1ft W x 3.5" D, units are disassembled - some have no ballast or bulbs, all have plastic covers. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-567 Light Dimmer Switches, Lot of 5, Leviton, four units are 1500W and one unit is 1000W, operational, beige in color. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-568 Light Units, Lot of 4, Flush Mount with Glass Covers, 12" Round x 9" D, operational - 100 watt maximum, manufactured in 1971. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	2-569 Light Units, Lot of 16, Flush Mount with Glass Covers, 16 3/4" Round x 9" D, operational - 300 watt maximum, manufactured in 1971. Fair		\$1	

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid *	2-570	Lights , Lot of 6, Round Glass/Globe Fixtures, 14" W x 6" D, operational, takes two 60W bulbs maximum per unit. Good		\$1	
No Bid *	2-571	Lights (Exterior), Lot of 3, Model MDL3 HPS, 100W medium base, 12" W x 11" H x 8" D, operational, faded, metal with plastic glass. Poor		\$1	
No Bid *	2-572	Lights (Exterior), Lot of 4, Model PCL1 HPS , 100W large base, 17.5" W x 15.5" H x 7" D, operational, faded, metal with plastic glass. Poor		\$1	
No Bid *	2-574	Wall Pack Light (Exterior), Lot of 2, 70 Watt HPS Type S62, 12" W x 10" H x 7 3/4" D, lamps are disassembled. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	2-575	Wall Pack Light (Exterior), Lot of 4, 70 Watt Medium HPS, 10" W x 7" H x 7" D, lamps are disassembled. Poor		\$1	
PRINCE ALBERT, Highways, Northern Operations, 81 North Industrial Dr.					
Contact Ivan Lavoie 306-940-6257, ivan.lavoie@gov.sk.ca					
2,100.00	3-515	Signposts, Lot of 40 Bundles, Scrap bundles of posts with 25 posts in a bundle. Various sizes Fair		\$1	
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, Hwy #2 North, call for directions.					
Contact Barb Chartier 306-953-3240, barb.chartier@gov.sk.ca for office furniture, Carol Stewart 306-940-7808 for the truck.					
2.00 *	2-515	Bookcase, Wooden, 3 shelves, brown, 48"L x 16"W x 47.5"H, operational. Good		\$1	125,501
6.00 *	2-518	Chair, Side, with arms, cloth, blue/grey, operational. Fair		\$1	125,512
6.00 *	2-519	Chair, Side, with arms, multi-color pattern, operational. Fair		\$1	102,828
1.50 *	2-521	Hutch, Pepperdust, 2 doors, 42"L x 17.5"W x 42"H, operational. Good		\$1	108,640
4,473.00	3-544	Truck 2008 Dodge Dakota 4x4, crew cab, 1/2 ton, 5' 5" box 3.7L, V6, gas auto cruise, tilt, tow package, air GVW 6500lbs. Standard differential, single tire, tire size: 245/75/16., silver, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 163,273 km, Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: Mechanic recommended it is not safe to drive for any distance. Many issues with front end. Must be towed due to safety reasons. Transmission is in poor condition, pan is rusty and seeping, rack and pinion wet and leaking, pinion seal is wet. Battery is dead. Issues with steering and suspension, Body has some rust.>, As is, Where is	163,273 km	\$500	1D7HW38K58S634984

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, Hwy #2 North, call for directions.				
Contact Wanda Dickie 306-953-3434, wanda.dickie@gov.sk.ca or Tammy Lukaszuk 306-953-3392, tammy.luzaszuk@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	2-524	Drum Unit (Remanufactured), SEBDR400R For use with Brother DCP-1200/DCP-1400; HL-1230/1240/1250/1270N/1435/1440/1450/1470; IntelliFax-4100/IntelliFax-4100e, MFC-8300/MFC-8500/MFC-8600/MFC-9600 New - Unused		\$1
No Bid *	2-537	HP Ink Cartridge, 45 Black For use with: HP Deskjet 710, 712, 720, 722, 820, 830, 832, 850, 855, 870, 880, 882, 890, 895, 930, 932, 935, 950, 952, 960, 970, 990, 995, 1000, 1100, 1120, 1220, 1600, 6122, 6127, 9300, HPDesignjet 700, 750, 755, HP Office jet G55, G85, G95, K60, K80, R40, R60, R80, T45, T65, HP Officejet Pro 1150, 1170, 1175, HP Photosmart P1000, P1100, 1115, 1215, 1218, 1315, HP Color Copier 110, 120, 140, 145, 150, 155, 160, 170, 180, 190, 210, 260, 270, 280, 290, HP Fax 1220 New - Unused		\$1
No Bid *	2-541	HP Ink Cartridge, 97 Tri-color- Magenta, Yellow, Cyan For use with: HP Deskjet 460, 5740, 5940, 6520, 6540, 6620, 6830, 6840, 6940, 6980, 6988, 9800, HO Officejet H470, 100, 150, 6200, 6210, 7210, 7310, 7410, HP Photosmart B8350, 325, 335, 375, 385, 422, 425, 428, 475, 2610, 2710, 8049, 8050, 8150, 8450, 8750, HP Printer/Scanner/Copier 1600, 1610, 2350, 2355 New - Unused		\$1
No Bid *	2-542	HP Ink Cartridges, Lot of 278 Tri-color Cartridge - Magenta, Cyan, Yellow For use with: HP Deskjet 920, 930, 932, 935, 940, 950, 952, 960, 970, 990, 995, 1220, 3820, 6122, 6127, 9300, HP Officejet 5110, G55, G85, G95, K60, K80, V40, HP Photosmart P1000, P1100, 1115, 1215, 1218, 1315, HP Color Copier 180, 190, 280, 290, HP Digital copier 310, HP Printer/Scanner/Copier 750, 950 HP Fax 1220, 1230 New - Unused		\$1
No Bid *	2-544	HP Inkjet Print Cartridge, 23 Tri-color - Magenta, Cyan, Yellow For use with: HP Deskjet 710, 712, 720, 722, 810, 812, 830, 832, 880, 882, 885, 887, 890, 895, 1120, HP color copier 140, 145, 150, 155, 160, 170, 260, 270, HP Printer/scanner/copier 500, HP officejet r40, r60, r80, r45, r65, HP Officejet Pro 1170c, 1175c New - Unused		\$1
No Bid *	2-545	HP Inkjet Print Cartridge, 99 Photo - Pink, Blue, Black For use with: HP Deskjet C4280, C5280, D4145, D4155, D4160, 460,5440, 5740, 5940, 6520, 6540, 6620, 6830, 6840, 6940, 6980, 9800, HP Photosmart B8350, C3140, C3150, C3180, C4140, C4150, C4180, D5060, D5065, D5069, D5145, D5155, D5160, 2570, 2575, N5610, 2710, 7850, 8050, 8150, 8450, 8750, HP Officejet J5780, 6200, 6210, 6310, 7210, 7310, 7410, HP Printer/Scanner/Copier 1507, 1510, 1600, 1610, 2350, 2355 New - Unused		\$1
No Bid *	2-546	Inkjet Cartridge (Remanufactured), 96 Black Compatible with: Deskjet 5740, 5740XI, 5940, 5940XI, 6520, 6520XI, 6540,6540DT, 6540XI, 6620, 6620XI, 6830V, 6840, 6840DT, 6840XI, 6940, 6940DT, 6980, 6980DT, 6988, 6988DT, 9800, 6800D, Officejet: 7210, 7210V, 7210XI, 7310, 7310XI, 7410, 7410XI, Photosmart: 2610, 2610V, 2610XI, 2710, 2710XI, 8050, 8150V, 8150XI, B8350, 8450, 8450XI, 8750 New - Unused		\$1

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid *	2-547	Inkjet Printer Cartridges, Lot of 8 Combo-pack 2-HP Inkjet print Cartridges - 15 Black & 78 Tri-color (Magenta, Cyan, Yellow) For use with: HP Deskjet 920, 940, 3820, HP Officejet v40, 5110, HP Digital Copier 310, HP Printer/Scanner/Copier 750, 950, HP Fax 1230 New - Unused		\$1	
No Bid *	2-525	Laser Cartridges, Lot of 2 TN460 - Black For use with Brother DCP-1200/1400/1230/1240/1250/1270/1270N/1440,1450,1470N New - Unused		\$1	
No Bid *	2-526	Printer Cartridges, Lot of 2 HP Laserjet 82X - Black For use with HP Laserjet 8100, 8150 New - Unused		\$1	
No Bid *	2-527	Toner Cartridge (Remanufactured), SEBM451CR - Cyan For use with HP Laserjet Pro 300 Color M351/ MFP M375/MFP M375NW, Pro 400 Color M451/M451DN/M451DW/M451NW/MFP M475/MFP M475DN/MFP M475DW New - Unused		\$1	
No Bid *	2-528	Toner Cartridges, Lot of 2, SAMSUNG 209, For use with SCX-4824, 4826, 4828, ML-2855 New - Unused		\$1	
No Bid *	2-529	Toner Cartridges (Remanufactured), Lot of 3, SEBM451BR - Black, For use with HP LaserJet Pro300 Color M351/MFP M375/MFP M375NW; Pro 400 color M451/M451DN/M451DWM451NW/MFP M475/MFP M475DN/MFP M475DW New - Unused		\$1	
No Bid *	2-530	Toner Cartridge, , Brother TN-450, High yield - Black, For use with HL-2220/2230/2240/2240D HL-2270DW/2275DW/2280DW, DCP-7060D/7065DN, MFC-7240/7290/7360/7360N, MFC-7365DN/7460DN/7860DW, FAX-2840/2940 New - Unused		\$1	
No Bid *	2-531	Toner Cartridge, , HP Laserjet 501A, Q6470A - Black, For use with CP3505/3600/3800 New - Unused		\$1	
No Bid *	2-532	Toner Cartridge, , HP Laserjet 83A, CF-283A - Black, For use with MFP M125, M127, M201, M225 New - Unused		\$1	
No Bid *	2-534	Toner Cartridges, Lot of 3, HP Laserjet 29X C4129X - Black, For use with HP Laserjet 5000, 5000N, 5000GN New - Unused		\$1	
No Bid *	2-535	Toner Cartridges, Lot of 3, HP Laserjet 35A, CB435A - Black, For use with P1005, P1006 New - Unused		\$1	
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Avenue North					
Contact Brent Zbaraschuk 306-953-2428, brent.zbaraschuk@gov.sk.ca or Tyla Wills 306-953-3400, Tyla.wills@gov.sk.ca					
1,189.00	3-523	Loader, Clark 35C CM, year unknown, With 2-3 yard bucket. Machine has been stripped of it's engine and other parts. Bascially for parts. Beyond Repair		\$1	472A158 CB
1,533.55	3-524	Piping, Lot of 34, Plastic, 4" x 12 '. Good		\$100	
157.00	3-525	Piping, 1 pallet, Plastic, Various diameters from 3" to 6" with some being up to 8' long. Fair		\$100	

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
501.00	3-526	Pump Trailers, Lot of 8, Home Built, With either 1 7/8" or 2" hitches. Written off stock as they are 20 + years old and agency has moved to new tandem axel pumper trailers. Some are complete, others have no tanks or parts are missing. Beyond Repair		\$20	
1,557.00	3-527	Racking, 2 Pallets, Upright, 10 - 36"w x 12'h, 24 - 4 & 6" mixture of 10' bunk racking. No hardware included. Good		\$1	
1,257.00	3-528	Racking, 2 Pallets, Upright, 13 - 36"w x 10'h, 19 - 4 & 6" mixture of 10' bunk racking. No hardware included. Good		\$1	
638.00	3-529	Shed, Wooden, 8' x 10', on 6"x6" wood skids. Shed is insulated and finished with wood sheeting and electrified 110 volt. Asphalt shingles in poor shape and wood door on front -no windows or eavestrough. Fair		\$10	
208.75	3-530	Shower Kits, 34 Units, Bosch Portable Propane , Written off stock as they are 10 + years old and agency has moved away from these types of kits due part availability and usage. Some are complete, others have parts missing. No guarantee of completeness. Beyond Repair		\$1	
75.00	3-531	Suction Hose, 3 Pallets, 1.5", black, some with white metal fittings. Poor		\$1	
351.51	3-532	Tires, Lot of 5, Conntinental 225/70R19.5, Manufacture date: week 11, year 2011. Poor		\$1	
No Bid	3-533	Tires, Lot of 4, Michelin 215/75R17.5, Manufacture date: week 39, year 2011. Poor		\$1	
No Bid	3-534	Tires, Lot of 2, Multi Trac G/S 23 x 10.5 -12 NHS, For a quad Poor		\$10	
35.00	3-535	Water Packs, 2 Pallets, , Various plastic and metal water packs (approximately 2 gallons). Poor		\$1	
47.99	3-536	Wildland Fire Hose 1.5", 8 pallets (Approx 75 hoses/pallet), , Written off 1.5" Wildland Fire hose to being under 80", holes, burn marks and general wear and tear from being dragged. Pallet contains a minimum of 50 hoses in various lengths and condition. Broken Repairable		\$1	
157.00	3-537	Wire, Electrical, 1 pallet, , Various types and lengths. Poor		\$100	
855.00	3-538	Yard Tractor and Mower, , John Deere 345 , with a 54" mower attachment. Have not been used for 5 years, condition of engine or components are unknown. Hour meter shows 2556 hrs. Broken Repairable		\$100	Tractor M00345B022469 Mower M0054DA062699
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 47 12th Street East					
Contact Carole Stewart carole.stewart@gov.sk.ca, 306-940-7808 or Wanda Dickie 306-953-3434, wanda.dickie@gov.sk.ca					
No Bid	3-504	Chair, Side, metal, cloth, 2 tone colour, with arms, needs to be cleaned. Fair		\$1	
6.00	3-505	Chair, Side, metal, cloth, Brown, with arms, needs to be cleaned. Fair		\$1	

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
10.00	3-506	Chair, Lot of 2 Swivel, cloth, Blue adjustable, with arms 5 casters. Fair		\$1	
6.00	3-507	Chair, Swivel, cloth, Dark grey, adjustable, with arms, dirty and needs to be cleaned, 5 casters. Fair		\$1	
15.00	3-508	Chair, Lot of 3, Swivel, vinyl, Black, adjustable with arms, some wear on seams, 5 caster. Fair		\$1	
15.00	3-509	Chairs, Lot of 4, Ergonomic, cloth, Black, mesh back, adjustable with arms. Three chairs are broken, one chair is operational. 5 casters. Poor		\$1	
20.80	3-510	Chairs, Lot of 5, Swivel, cloth, Blue/grey. 5 casters, adjustable with arms. Two are dirty and need to be cleaned (operational), two are good (operational) and one needs caster replaced. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	3-513	Printer Cartridge, Laserjet 85A Used for P1102, P1102w, M1132, M1212, M1214, M1217. New - Unused		\$1	
REGINA, SaskPower, 2901 Powerhouse Drive					
Contact Daniel Molder 306-527-0665, dmolder@saskpower.com or Mitch Miller 306-566-3083, mlmiller@saskpower.com					
2,501.00	3-516	50 Ton Press, with enerpac pump and ram Pump leaks bad at valve when under load. Broken Repairable		\$100	
133.33	3-517	6" Jointer, Rockwell, Model 37-220 Functional. Fair		\$1	261,375
225.23	3-518	Die Filer, Keller, Model 256 115v, functional. Fair		\$1	6,333
133.33	3-519	Drill Grinder, Black and Webster DD2 1/8 to 1-1/2" capacity. 1/3hp single phase 115v.		\$1	14,162
209.00	3-520	Hydraulic Pump, Roussea Controls Model L757002C. 550v 5hp, functional. Fair		\$1	C55
450.00	3-521	Tablesaw, General International, Model 50-175ML. 120v, functional, belt guard may need to be fixed or replaced. Fair		\$1	51,649,404

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
SASKATOON, Highways, 126 105th St E.				
Contact Richard Leibel 306-933-5262, Richard.Leibel@gov.sk.ca				
337.50	3-539	Crimping Tool, hydraulic hose with hose cutter Both crimp and cutter work, missing foot feed and dies. Fair	\$1	
161.79	3-545	Garden Tractor, 1981 Ford 2WD16 HP, gas, hydrostatic, Roll cage, high, low and reverse gears. Motor, tires, battery and paint all in poor condition. Tires are flat. Will need new a battery, belts, blades, mower deck and seat. Will also require a tune up and carb cleaned. Unit is not running. yellow As is, Where is	\$1	T18918
157.77	3-543	Oil Tank and Spray Bar, Etnyre Black-Topper Series 2000 Oil Tank is 1750 U.S.Gal. Spray bar has been removed and numerous hoses have been cut and/or missing. No ground speed radar. No controls. ** Tank was used to store HF150s - Antistrip, has been emptied, but not cleaned out. Fair	\$1	
567.69	3-540	Pallet Racking, with metal grates standard pallet racks, 12'h x 8'w. Fair	\$1	
5,351.00	3-541	Service Truck Crane, Maxilift 3304W functional but hasn't been used in some time. Fair	\$1	
11.11	3-542	Shelving, Lot of 2 metal missing hardware. Poor	\$1	
SMEATON, Parks, Culture & Sport, Narrow Hills Provincial Park				
Contact Tanya White 306-426-2622, tanya.white@gov.sk.ca				
2.00 *	2-509	Topographical Map, Birchbark Lake, Printed Fair	\$1	73 H/11
TISDALE, Highways & Transportation, Northern Tisdale, 1103-12th Ave.				
Contact David Derr, 306-878-8823 or 306-921-7202, david.derr@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid	3-502	Bunk Car, 1967Atco 10' x 30', trailer cannot move under its own weight, it is not floating on a base/frame that will need deconstructing, all utilities have been disconnected. Other information: loading required for removal - it is the responsibility of the buyer to measure height of unit, if necessary, for transportation route. As is, where is. 48 hours notice is required for pick up.Poor	\$1	
WINGARD FERRY SITE, Highways & Infrastructure, Call for directions				
Contact John Moynham 306-933-5251, john.moynham@gov.sk.ca or Wayne Brown 306-933-5838, wayne.brown@gov.sk.ca				
2,175.00 *	2-506	Mobile Office Bunkhouse, 1981 pintle hitch, dual axles, dual tires flat or rotten, propane furnace, all utilities disconnected. Known issues: roof leaks. Other information: loading required for removal - it is the responsibility of the buyer to measure the unit dimensions for transportation. As is, where is. Poor	\$1	10,557

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
YORKTON, SaskBuilds and Procurement, Whitespruce, NE-35-TP26-R5-W2. Call for directions.				
Contact Mark Bigoraj 306-786-5871, 306-621-3051 mark.bigoraj2@gov.sk.ca.				
455.55	3-522	Chain Link Fence, 380'l x 6'h, with poles and gates. Operational Fair	\$1	
No Bid *	2-549	Street Light Heads, Lot of 22, attach to metal street poles, operational. Fair	\$1	
MOOSE JAW, Highways & Infrastructure, Fleet Services, Riverhurst Ferry operations yard- located 5km west of Riverhurst				
Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca				
851.00 *	2-503	Cable 1", 2019, approximately 8000 feet of used cable on a spool (right regular lay), 8x26WS, MBS 105,000 lbs., nom. weight 1.97 lbs/ft, some strands breaking due to wear. Poor	\$1	
ROWAN'S RAVINE Provincial Park, Parks Culture and Sport, Call for location directions.				
Contact Abby Fuller 306-725-5200, abby.fuller@gov.sk.ca, or Tim Gelinis 306-725-5210, tim.gelinis@gov.sk.ca				
1,366.00	3-503	Gravel Truck 1982 Chevrolet, Heavy Truck, 2WD, 366 V8 gas, standard, 5 speed, single axle, gravel box, flip front end, rear dual tires, tire size: 900-20, white, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 64,274 km, , PROBLEMS: tires, brakes, body exterior, whindshield glass, windshield washer and wipers, paint and interior all in poor condition. Needs brake work. Does not have a battery. Was in running condition when parked. As is. Where is	\$1	1GBJ7D1B2CV108882
SASKATOON, Highways, 126 105th St E				
Contact Richard Leibel 306-933-5262, Richard.Leibel@gov.sk.ca				
151.77	3-546	Sand/Salt Spreader Insert Box, Henderson Chain seized, bearings need to be replaced, chain frame rotted out, electrical issues, hydraulic issues. Unit has been sitting outside and will not function. Broken Repairable	\$1	FSP2-13634
1.11	3-547	Sand/Salt Spreader Insert Box, Western Tornado Parted out, chain seized, bearings need to be replaced, electrical issues. Unit has been sitting outside and will not function. Broken Repairable	\$1	