SaskBuilds and Procurement

BSOS SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales

SaskSurplus Sale #2
From May 4 to May 11, 2022

f
| Saskatzhewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

SALE RESULTS

Fax: 306-787-2092

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete
or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and

evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold “AS IS, WHERE IS”, there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.

- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.
It is the Bidder’s responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.
Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.
Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,

- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-787-2238,

- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or

- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.

WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller or the item did not meet the minimum selling price.

No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

6/20/2022,10:44 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.



SaskBuilds and Procurement SaskSurplus Sale #2

Goveror]:ment SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From May 4 to May 11, 2022
A Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092
Highest Item # Description Kms Min. Price Serial Number
Bid Price

REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.

$4,101.00 2-001 Car 2013 Chevrolet Impala FWD, 4 door 3.6L V6 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, CD 246,286 $1,651 2G1WAS5E34D1249783
player, power mirrors, windows, locks, trunk release, driver seat, kelyess entry- 2 keys and 2 km
fobs , grey, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed.
Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently
provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 246,286 km, , PROBLEMS:
left outer tie rod needs attention, front pads and rotors need attention, front brake pulsation,
alignment needed, windshield cracked, hood is badly scratched and dented, front bumper
scraped, rear bumper scratched and dented, left fenders scratched and dented, left doors
both badly scratched, right rear door scratched, trunk lid badly scratched and missing bow tie,
roof scratched and dented, front tires cupped, battery is poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is,

Where is
*MT 2-002 Car 2008 Chevrolet Impala LS FWD, 4 door 3.5L V6 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, CD 213,564 $991 2G1WB58k181359809
player, power locks, windows, mirrors, front seat, trunk release, keyless entry- 2 fobs, 2 keys, km

blue, Passed SGI Inspection. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid
for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 213,564 km, , PROBLEMS: front bumper
cracked (screws holding it together), front fenders scraped, rear right fender dented, all four
doors have minor rust, hood is scratched with road rash, trunk lid is scratched with rust spots,
windshield chipped, battery is poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

$3,628.99 2-003 Car 2006 Chrysler Sebring FWD, 4 door 2.7L V6 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, CD 159,489 $655 1C3EL56RX6N236221
player, power windows, locks, mirrors, trunk release, driving lights, keyless entry- 2 fobs, 1 km
key , grey, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed.
Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently
provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 159,489 km, , PROBLEMS:
exhaust leak, brakes require attention, tires starting to show wear, right rear fender has rust,
right front fender dented, hood is scratched, bumpers have chips and scratches, windshield
chipped, right headlight fogged, battery is poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

6/20/2022,10:44 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 2



SaskBuilds and Procurement SaskSurplus Sale #2

of SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From May 4 to May 11, 2022
A Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

Government

Highest Item # Description Kms Min. Price Serial Number
Bid Price

$1,719.00 2-004 Car 2007 Chrysler Sebring FWD, 4 door 2.7L V6 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, CD 251,905 $566 1C3LC56R37N626781
player, power windows, locks, driver seat, trunk release, heated mirrors, fog lights, keyless km
entry- 2 key fobs , gold, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to
be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection
currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 251,905 km, ,
PROBLEMS: left lower ball joint needs attention, right inner tie rod needs attention, front and
rear rotors and pads poor, alignment needed, tires poor, hood has paint bubbling and
scratches, front bumper broken and chipped, left fenders scratched, right rear fender rust,
both right side doors scraped, trunk lid has small dents and scratches, front seats stained,
windshield chipped, headlights fogged, front door weather stripping poor, plate lights out,
battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

$3,601.00 2-005 Car 2008 Chrysler Sebring FWD, 4 door 2.7L V6 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, CD 228,470 $1,523 1C3LC56R78N230533
player, power windows, locks, mirrors (heated), trunk release, keyless entry- 2 fobs, beige, km
TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer
assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is
only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 228,470 km, , PROBLEMS: wheel
bearings require attention (tire noise), windshield chipped and cracked, right rear fender has
rust spots, both bumpers scratched and chipped, front doors have scratches on glass, left rear
door has a dent, trunk lid has small rust spots, hood chipped, battery poor, minor exterior
damage.>, As is, Where is

$3,801.00 2-006 Car 2008 Chrysler Sebring FWD, 4 door 2.7L V6 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, CD 238,765 $1,923 1C3LC56R08N230468
player, power locks, windows, heated mirrors, trunk release, fog lights, keyless entry- 1 fob , km
silver, Passed SGI Inspection. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only
valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 238,765 km, Recent repairs: Check engine
light (PO562 battery voltage low), TPMS light, , As is, Where is

6/20/2022,10:44 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 3
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$3,801.00 2-007 Car 2009 Chrysler Sebring FWD, 4 door 2.4L L4 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, CD 215,629 $896 1C3LC46B09N573425
player, power heated mirrors, locks, windows, trunk release, keyless entry- 1 fob , blue, TOW km
ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes
full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only
valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 215,629 km, , PROBLEMS: rear struts
leaking, power steering return hose leaking, left doors have scrapes, dents and rust along the
bottom, left front fender scraped, left rear fender dented, right doors have small dents, left
tail light broken, missing lower grille, front bumper scraped, both bumpers cracked, scratched
and chipped, trunk lid scratched, windshield chipped, roof scratches and dents, battery poor,
minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

$3,677.00 2-008 Car 2009 Chrysler Sebring FWD, 4 door 2.4L L4 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, CD 249,486 $996 1C3LC46BX9IN573478
player, power locks, windows, trunk release, heated mirrors, keyless entry- 2 fobs , beige, km
TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer
assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is
only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 249,486 km, , PROBLEMS: left outer
tie rod needs attention, front and rear struts need attention, alignment needed, front bumper
scratched, dented and cracked, hood has paint bubbling and scratches, all doors have rust
along bottom, trunk lid is scratched/has rust inside bottom, windshield chipped, gas tank door
does not close tight, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

$3,889.89 2-009 Car 2013 Dodge Avenger FWD, 4 door 2.4L L4 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, CD 265,098 $2,386 1C3CDZAB7DN604521
player, power mirrors, windows, locks, trunk release, keyless entry- 2 fobs , blue, TOW ONLY, km
Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full
responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid
for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 265,098 km, , PROBLEMS: rear struts require
attention, alignment needed, all doors have rust along the bottom, hood has paint bubbling,
left rear fender dented, right rear fender and door creased, front and rear bumper scratched
and chipped, windshield chipped, trunk lid has scratches, wiper blades need replacement,
battery is poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

6/20/2022,10:44 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 4
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From May 4 to May 11, 2022

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
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Highest
Bid Price

Item #

Description

Kms

Min. Price Serial Number

$5,491.99

2-010

Truck 2011 Ram 1500 4x4, quad cab, 6'4" box 5.7L V8 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio,
CD player, power locks, windows, power heated mirrors, 2 keys has a back seat, grille inserts,
front tow hooks, side steps, challenger tool box mounted behind cab with 2 keys, trailer hitch,
trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, red, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed
SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note:
the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the
inspection.** 292,252 km, , PROBLEMS: CEL on PO301 (Cyl 1 misfire), engine has a tick,
recommened to replace engine, intake valve travel out of spec, drive belt requires attention,
heater works only on high setting, TMPS light on, tire sensor not reading properly, hood
scratched and cracked paint, left rear fender dented, right rear fender has rust and road rash,
driver seat worn, rust on box, windshield chipped, roof is scratched, battery is poor, minor
exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

292,252
km

$3,779 1D7RV1GT8BS592386

$2,515.89

2-011

Van 2013 Dodge Grand Caravan FWD, 7 passenger Stow 'N Go (rear seat only) 3.6L V6 gas
auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, CD player, power windows (4 front), mirrors, locks,
keyless entry- 2 fobs , grey, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGlI
Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the
SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.**
275,659 km, , PROBLEMS: CV joints need attention, noisy transmission, out of alignment,
chrome broken on rear bumper, 3rd row seating damaged, missing roof vents, head liner
covers missing, hood bubbling, dents and scratches, all fenders are scraped or missing
moulding, front bumper chipped and scratched, right rear door bent, left rear door has road
rash, right front door has road rash, tailgate scratched, windshield has small chips, front arm
rests worn, roof is scratched, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

275,659
km

$1,784 2CARDGBGODR634144

REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.

$15.00

2-105

Booster Cables 12'in length, 6 gauge, , ,,, Excellent

$10

$10.00

2-111

Caliper Protector  may be compatible with 2007 Tahoe. May have other applications.
Installation instructions included. ,, ,,, Excellent

$5 437434

$31.00

2-112

Door Handle OEM (orginal equipment manufacturer) black, fits 1989 Chev Silverado K1500,
left front exterior door. May have other applications. ,, ,,, Excellent

$30 G.M. Part # 15968163

6/20/2022,10:44 AM
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$20.51 1-101 Floor Liners - Back Husky brand, custom fit, grey in color For 1999-2003 Chevrolet/GMC, $10 Part # 61352
full size truck, 3 and 4 door extended cab.,, ,,, Excellent

$11.11 1-103 Floor Liners - Back Husky brand, custom fit, grey in color For 1999-2003 Chevrolet/GMC, $10 Part # 61352
full size truck, 3 and 4 door extended cab.,, ,,, Excellent

$25.51 1-141 Floor Liners - Front  Husky brand, custom fit Grey in color, may be compatible with 1998- $10 Part # 30782
2000 Dodge Durango or 2000-2003 Dakota.,, ,,, Excellent

No Bid * 1-104 Floor Mats - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), rubber, light grey in color $10
May be compatible with Chevrolet Astro.,, ,,, Excellent

No Bid * 1-105 Floor Mats - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), rubber, light grey in color $10
May be compatible with Chevrolet Astro.,, ,,, Excellent

$21.51 1-144 Floor Mats - Front and Rear 1set Mopar OEM, rubber Black in color, may be compatible $10
with 2007-2010 Chrysler Sebring or 2011 Chrysler 200.,, ,,, Excellent

$11.51 1-145 Floor Mats - Rear Mopar OEM, rubber Grey in color.,, ,,, Excellent $10 Part # 82203904

No Bid * 12-114 Hitch OEM Ford (receiver) with mounting bolts black in color, accepts a 2 inch draw bar. $50
May be compatible with a 2005 Ford E350.,, ,,, Good

No Bid * 12-116 Hitch OEM Ford (receiver), with mounting bolts black in color, accepts a 2 inch draw bar. $50
May be compatible with a 2006 Ford E350.,, ,,, Good

No Bid * 12-117 Hitch OEM Ford (receiver), with mounting bolts and trailer wiring black in color, accepts a 2 $60
inch draw bar. May be compatible with a 2008 Ford E350.,, ,,, Good

No Bid * 1-106 License Plate Bracket - Front Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), NO $10
mounting kit May be compatible with 2002-2006 Sebring.,, ,,, Excellent

No Bid * 1-107 License Plate Bracket - Front Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), NO $10
mounting kit May be compatible with 2002-2006 Sebring.,, ,,, Excellent

$6.00 1-109 License Plate Bracket - Front Ford OEM. NO mounting kit. May be compatible with 2005 $5

Ford F250,, ,,, Excellent

No Bid * 1-113 License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes $5
mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500, , ,,, Excellent

NoBid * 1-114 License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes $5

mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500, , ,,, Excellent

6/20/2022,10:44 AM
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No Bid * 1-114 License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes $5
mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500, , ,,, Excellent

No Bid * 1-115 License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes $5
mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500, , ,,, Excellent

No Bid * 1-116 License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes $5
mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500, , ,,, Excellent

No Bid * 1-117 License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes $5
mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500, , ,,, Excellent

No Bid * 1-118 License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes $5
mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500, , ,,, Excellent

No Bid * 1-119 License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes $5
mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500, , ,,, Excellent

No Bid * 1-110 License Plate Bracket - Front Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes $10
mounting kit. May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty,, ,,, Excellent

No Bid * 1-111 License Plate Bracket - Front Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes $10
mounting kit. May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty,, ,,, Excellent

No Bid * 1-112 License Plate Bracket - Front Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes $10
mounting kit. May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty,, ,,, Excellent

$5.00 1-126 License Plate Bracket - Front  GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with $5

2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. ,, ,,, Excellent

NoBIld * 1-127 License Plate Bracket - Front  GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with $5
2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. ,, ,,, Excellent

No Bid * 1-128 License Plate Bracket - Front  GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with $5
2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. ,, ,,, Excellent

No Bid * 1-129 License Plate Bracket - Front  GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with $5
2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. ,, ,,, Excellent

No Bid * 1-130 License Plate Bracket - Front  GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with $5

2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. ,, ,,, Excellent

6/20/2022,10:44 AM
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No Bid * 1-131 License Plate Bracket - Front  GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with $5
2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. ,, ,,, Excellent
$20.51 2-115 Mud Flap Front Only may be compatible with 2009-2013 Dodge Ram 1500, , ,,, Excellent $10 800128
$20.51 2-116 Mud Flap Rear Only may be compatible with 2009-2013 Dodge Ram 1500, , ,,, Excellent $10 800128
$22.00 2-114 Mud flaps 1 Set Cloud Rider "Stone Guard" best suited for full and mid size trucks, vans and $10
SUV's.,, ,,, Excellent
No Bid * 2-123 Mud flaps Mopar OEM (orginal equipment manufacturer) May be compatible with 2013, $10
2014, 2015 Jeep Patriot and Compass, 2 flat spash gaurds in package, front or rear., , ,,,
Excellent
No Bid * 2-124 Seat OEM, Grey Fabric 3rd row, backrest folds down. May be compatible with a 2007 $5 170076
Dodge Caravan. ,, ,,, Fair
$40.51 2-127 Seats Set of 4 Grey Cloth three seats are 53 inches long. One seat is 64 inches long. May be $10 422758
compatible with a 2007 E350 Ford van.,, ,,, Fair
No Bid * 1-132 Shield for Inner Fender 1 set Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) 1 right and $10
1 left, rear only, may be compatible with a 2008 Chrysler 1500, 2500 or 3500, , ,,, Excellent
NoBid * 1-133 Shield for Inner Fender 1 set Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) 1 right and $10
1 left, rear only, may be compatible with a 2008 Chrysler 1500, 2500 or 3500, , ,,, Excellent
NoBid * 1-134 Shield for Inner Fender 1 set Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) 1 right and $10
1 left, rear only, may be compatible with a 2008 Chrysler 1500, 2500 or 3500, , ,,, Excellent
No Bid * 12-118 Spare Tire Lof of 4, 16 inch, 135/70R/16, Continental compact temporary spare on a steel $10
rim. May be compatible with a 2008 Chev Uplander.,, ,,, Good
No Bid * 12-119 Spare Tire 16 inch, 135/70R/16, Continental compact temporary spare on a steel rim. May $10
be compatible with a 2008 Chev Uplander.,, ,,, Good
No Bid * 2-106 Spare Tire Box Mount application specifics unknown, can be installed in truck bed , , ,,, S5
Fair
$27.55 2-113 Storage Cabinet Metal 65" tall - 36" wide - 18" deep. 1 adjustable shelf, 2 doors, 1 key, , ,, $10
, Fair
No Bid * 2-107 Tail Light Mopar (Chrysler) left rear, used, scratched,, ,,, Good $25 Part# 5113205AB

6/20/2022,10:44 AM
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$223.00 1-150 Tailgate Chevrolet, metal may be compatible with several years of Chevrolet Silverado $200
(1500, 2500, 3500) starting with 2004. Has paint chips and slight scratches, missing support
cables, white in color.,, ,,, Good
$101.00 * 2-125 Tailgate OEM (orginal equipment manufacturer) may be compatible with several years of $200
Silverado starting with 2004 - 1500, 2500, 3500, slight scratches and dents, white in color. , , ,
,, Good
$75.00 * 2-126 Tailgate OEM (orginal equipment manufacturer) may be compatible with several years of $200
Silverado starting with 2004 - 1500, 2500, 3500, slight scratches and dents, white in color. , , ,
,, Good
No Bid * 12-104 Tailgate, Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) yellow in color May be compatible with a $200 A04007
2004 Chev. Siverado 3500 extended cab. May not be complete.,, ,,, Good
No Bid * 12-105 Tailgate, Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) yellow in color May be compatible with a $200
2004 Chev. Siverado 3500 extended cab. May not be complete.,, ,,, Good
No Bid * 12-106 Tailgate, Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) vyellow in color May be compatible with a $200
2004 Chev. Siverado 3500 extended cab. May not be complete.,, ,,, Good
No Bid * 1-151 Tire 17 inch, P225/55R/17, Goodyear Assurance. M+S. Manufacture date: week 02, year $10
2017.,, ,,, Fair
No Bid * 12-110 Tire 17 inch, P225/55R/17, Firestone All Season, M+S. Manufacture date: week 44, year $50
2019.,, ,,, Good
$55.51 12-113 Tire 17 inch, P245/70R/17, General Grabber HTS, M+S. Manufacture date: week 30, year $50
2015.,, ,,, Good
No Bid * 2-102 Tires Lot of 3 16 inch, 215/65R/16, Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X manufacture date: week 27, $120
year 2018.,, ,,, Good
*MT 2-103 Tires Lot of 4 17 inch, 265/70R17, Bridgestone Dueler A/T manufacture date: week 18, year $250
2021.,, ,,, Excellent
$75.00 2-104 Tires Lot of 4 16 inch, P205/60R/16, Goodyear Assurance. M+S manufacture date: week 42, $40
year 2011.,, ,,, Poor
$212.12 2-118 Tires Lot of 4 16 inch, P225/60R/16, Firestone FR710. M+S manufacture date: week 02, year $160
2017.,, ,,, Good
*MT 2-119 Tires Lot of 4 17 inch, 215/60R/17, Sumitomo HTR LX2 Enhance. M+S manufacture date: $160
week 22, year 2019.,, ,,, Good
$178.22 2-120 Tires Lot of 4 17 inch, P215/60R/17, Firestone FR710. M+S manufacture date: week 41, year $120

2016.,, ,,, Fair

6/20/2022,10:44 AM
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$381.00 2-121 Tires Lot of 4 17 inch, P265/60R/17, Firestone Firehawk GT Pursuit. M+S manufacture date: $200
week 21, year 2019. ,, ,,, Good
$58.00 2-122 Tires Lot of 2 17 inch, P265/60R/17, Goodyear Eagle RS-A. M+S manufacture date: week 17, $25
year 2017. ,, ,,, Poor
No Bid * 2-128 Tire 16inch, 225/65R/16, Sailun IceBlazer, Snowflake manufacture date. Week 16, year $40
2021.,, ,,, Good
$218.14 2-129 Tires Lot of 4 16 inch, 225/60R/16, Firestone All Season. M+S. manufacture date: week 25, $160
year 2020.,, ,,, Good
No Bid * 2-130 Tires Lot of 2 16 inch, 205/60R/16, Matrix Tour RD Multi-mile. manufacture date: week 44, $50
year 2011, , ,,, Fair
$102.02 2-131 Tires Lot of 4 16 inch, 225/60R/16, Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X. M+S manufacture date: $40
week 19, year 2017, , ,,, Poor
$204.47 2-132 Tires Lot of 4 16 inch, 215/65R/16, Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X. M+S. manufacture date: $160
week 05, year 2018.,, ,,, Good
$36.53 2-108 Tow Rope  total length measures 18', 2' of chain at each end with hooks, nylon, yellow in $20
color.,, ,,, Good
$1,531.77 2-133 Trailer Brandt, Cable Reel, Hydraulic pintle eye hook up, 196" length 196" x 101" wide, $500 36508
hydraulic cable dolly, with 3 hydraulic pump jacks: 1 for lifting the tongue, 2 to lift the arms.
RV 7 flat blade style connection, 1 rear stabilizer jacks, tires 1200x20 14 ply, 1 small reel bar.,
, +,, Good
$5,100.00 2-135 Trailer 2009 Majestik-Curtis, L260C-TILT Tandem Axle Flat Deck adjustable pintle eye hook $500 2M9FS52C79R151605
up, 12,000Ib, 7' wide by 6' on non-tilt part, tilt deck part: 7' x 12' long, total length: 24, pin
style deck hold down, 2 load ramps, small round pin style trailer connection, electric trailer
brakes, has frt bulk head 18" by 7 ft, has 8 D ring tie down hooks on tilt deck. has tongue jack,
tongue is 63", 4 bunk holders on front deck, metal floor plates, 5 ST235-80/R16 tires includes
spare mounted on tongue, and storage bin on tongue. ,, ,,, Good
$3,207.00 2-134 Trailer 1999 Trail Tech, Tandem Flat Deck equipment trailer 16,000 Ib., adjustable pintle $500 2CU138G96X2005419
eye, 7 flat blade RV style trailer connection, 80" wide, 98" outside fender to outside fender,
166" over all length of deck, has 6 D-ring tie down holders, has two 5' x 16" slide ramps, 65"
tongue, 20" rear slope deck, electric trailer brakes, tongue jack, has spare tire on tongue, LT
235 85R16 tires.,, ,,, Good
No Bid * 11-127 TV Samsung 14" screen, unsure if operational,, ,,, Poor S1 CT-3371XVM
$5.00 * 2-109 Utility Lights $20
Lot of 2 red lights for a vehicle, to be mounted on rear frame.,, ,,, Fair

6/20/2022,10:44 AM
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SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
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SaskSurplus Sale #2

From May 4 to May 11, 2022
Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

Highest Item # Description Kms Min. Price Serial Number
Bid Price
$5.00 * 2-110 Utility Lights $20
Lot of 2 red lights for a vehicle, to be mounted on rear frame. ,, ,,, Fair
$20.00 9-101 Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 $1
drawer banks. Left Hand L-shaped,locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled -
joining brackets may not be included*, , ,,, Fair
No Bid * 11-128 Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 $1
drawer banks. Right Hand L-shaped,locks but no keys, , ,,, Fair
$11.50 2-101 File Cabinet Vertical, 4 Drawer green in color, no keys, scuffed, scratched ,, ,,, Poor S5
$37.55 2-117 Storage Cabinet Acco brand, metal 83" tall x 42" wide x 21 3/4" deep, 2 door. Doors slide $15

open to partially "disappear”, no key, no shelves. ,, ,,, Fair

6/20/2022,10:44 AM
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SaskBuilds and Procurement SaskSurplus Sale #2

Goveror;ment SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From May 4 to May 11, 2022
A Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092
Highest Item # Description Kms Min. Price Serial Number
Bid Price

DUCK MOUNTAIN PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks, Culture and Sport, NW 27-30-30 W1, call for directions.
Contact Samantha Klapatiuk 306-542-5505, Samantha.klapatiuk@gov.sk.ca or Greg Podovinnikoff 306-542-5504, Greg.podovinnikoff@gov.sk.ca

No Bid * 1-502 DVDs Lotof5 Saskatchewan Parks: Our Treasures, Our Legacy Sealed,, ,,, New - $1
Unused

MOOSE JAW, Highways & Infrastructure, Fleet Services, 1 km south of Moose Jaw on Highway #2.
Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca

$6.00 1-503 Air Compressor Curtis Pneumatic Machinery non-operational/motor siezed,, ,,, Broken $1 9804-108
Repairable

MOOSE JAW, Highways & Infrastructure, Fleet Services, Riverhurst Ferry operations yard- located 5km west of Riverhurst

Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca

$547.77 2-502 Cable 1" 2018 approximately 8000 feet of used cable on a spool (right regular lay), 8x26WS, S1
MBS 105,000 Ibs., nom. weight 1.97 Ibs/ft, some strands breaking due to wear.,, ,,, Poor

*WD 2-503 Cable 1" 2019 approximately 8000 feet of used cable on a spool (right regular lay), 8x26WS, $1
MBS 105,000 Ibs., nom. weight 1.97 Ibs/ft, some strands breaking due to wear.,, ,,, Poor

NIPAWIN, Environment, Compliance and Field Service, 210 - 1st St East.

Contact John Worsley 306-862-1790, john.worsley@gov.sk.ca

$11.50 1-567 File Cabinet, Vertical, 4 Drawer Metal 18"wx 28"dx51"h,, ,,, Fair $1
$10.50 1-568 File Cabinet, Vertical, 4 Drawer Metal 18"wx28"dx51"h,, ,,, Fair $1
$12.50 1-569 File Cabinet, Vertical, 4 Drawer Metal 18"w x 28"d x 51"h - with lock and key, , ,,, Fair $1

OUTLOOK, Agriculture, Crops and Irrigation, 410 Saskatchewan Avenue W.
Contact Heather Duczek-Reynolds at 306-867-5527, 306-541-4408 or heather.duczek-reynolds@gov.sk.ca
No Bid 1-509 File Cabinet Lateral, 4 Drawer 36w x 18d x 64h, lock and key, beige, , ,,, Fair $1

PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, Hwy #2 North, call for directions.
Contact Barb Chartier 306-953-3240, barb.chartier@gov.sk.ca

No Bid * 2-515 Bookcase Wooden 3 shelves, brown, 48"L x 16"W x 47.5"H, operational.,, ,,, Good $1 125501
*MT 2-516 Cabinet Lateral, 2 Drawer mobile pedestal, beige, 36"L x 24"W x 27"H, operational., , ,,, $1 108375
Good

6/20/2022,10:44 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 12



SaskBuilds and Procurement SaskSurplus Sale #2

Government . )
of SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From May 4 to May 11, 2022
A Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092
Highest Item # Description Kms Min. Price Serial Number
Bid Price
$5.00 2-517 Chair Ergonomic with arms, black leather-look, operational.,, ,,, Fair $1 991355
No Bid * 2-518 Chair Side with arms, cloth, blue/grey, operational.,, ,,, Fair $1 125512
No Bid * 2-519 Chair Side with arms, multi-color pattern, operational.,, ,,, Fair S1 102828
*MT 2-520 Desk Pepperdust 59.5"L x 30"W x 29"H, has two drawers on both left and right hand side, $1 108620
operational.,, ,,, Good
No Bid * 2-521 Hutch Pepperdust 2 doors, 42"Lx 17.5"W x 42"H, operational.,, ,,, Good $1 108640
*MT 2-522 File Cabinet Lateral, 3 Drawer 36"L x 18"W x 40.5"H, beige metal, operational.,, ,,, Fair $1 102609
*MT 2-523 File Cabinet Lateral, 4 Drawer 36"Lx 18"W x 51.5"H, beige metal, operational.,, ,,, Fair $1 125528

PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, Hwy #2 North, call for directions.
Contact Wanda Dickie 306-953-3434, wanda.dickie@gov.sk.ca or Tammy Lukaszuk 306-953-3392, tammy.luzaszuk@gov.sk.ca

No Bid * 2-524 Drum Unit (Remanufactured) SEBDR400OR For use with Brother DCP-1200/DCP-1400; HL- $1
1230/1240/1250/1270N/1435/1440/1450/1470; IntelliFax-4100/IntelliFax-4100e, MFC-
8300/MFC-8500/MFC-8600/MFC-9600,, ,,, New - Unused

No Bid * 2-525 Laser Cartridges Lot of 2 TN460 - Black For use with Brother DCP-1200/1400/1230/ $1
1240/1250/1270/1270N/1440,1450,1470N, , ,,, New - Unused

No Bid * 2-526 Printer Cartridges Lot of 2 HP Laserjet 82X - Black For use with HP Laserjet 8100, 8150, , ,,, S1
New - Unused

No Bid * 2-527 Toner Cartidge (Remanufactured) SEBMA451CR - Cyan For use with HP Laserjet Pro 300 $1
Color M351/ MFP M375/MFP M375NW, Pro 400 Color
M451/M451DN/M4A51DW/M451NW/MFP M475/MFP M475DN/MFP M475DW ,, ,,, New -
Unused

No Bid * 2-528 Toner Cartidges Lot of 2 SAMSUNG 209 For use with SCX-4824, 4826, 4828, ML-2855, , ,,, $1
New - Unused

No Bid * 2-529 Toner Cartidges (Remanufactured) Lot of 3 SEBM451BR - Black For use with HP LaserJet $1
Pro300 Color M351/MFP M375/MFP M375NW; Pro 400 color
M451/M451DN/MA451DWM45INW/MFP M475/MFP M475DN/MFP M475DW, , ,,, New -
Unused

6/20/2022,10:44 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 13
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SaskBuilds and Procurement
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From May 4 to May 11, 2022

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

Highest Item # Description Kms Min. Price Serial Number
Bid Price
No Bid * 2-530 Toner Cartridge Brother TN-450, High yield - Black For use with HL-2220/2230/2240/2240D $1
HL-2270DW/2275DW/2280DW, DCP-7060D/7065DN, MFC-7240/7290/7360/7360N, MFC-
7365DN/7460DN/7860DW, FAX-2840/2940,, ,,, New - Unused
No Bid * 2-531 Toner Cartridge HP Laserjet 501A, Q6470A - Black For use with CP3505/3600/3800,, ,,, $1
New - Unused
No Bid * 2-532 Toner Cartridge HP Laserjet 83A, CF-283A - Black For use with MFP M125, M127, M201, $1
M225,, ,,, New - Unused
$20.00 2-533 Toner Cartridge HPLaserjet 29X, C4129X - Black For use with HP Laserjet 5000, 5100, , ,,, $1
New - Unused
No Bid * 2-534 Toner Cartridges Lot of 3 HP Laserjet 29X C4129X - Black For use with HP Laserjet 5000, $1
5000N, 5000GN, , ,,, New - Unused
No Bid * 2-535 Toner Cartridges Lot of 3 HP Laserjet 35A, CB435A - Black For use with P1005, P1006, , ,,, $1
New - Unused
$20.00 2-536 Toner Cartridges Lot of 2 HPLaserjet 29X, C4129X - Black For use with HP Laserjet 5000 $1
Series,, ,,, New - Unused
No Bid * 2-537 HP Ink Cartridge 45 Black For use with: HP Deskjet 710, 712, 720, 722, 820, 830, 832, 850, $1
855, 870, 880, 882, 890, 895, 930, 932, 935, 950, 952, 960, 970, 990, 995, 1000, 1100, 1120,
1220, 1600, 6122, 6127, 9300, HPDesignjet 700, 750, 755, HP Office jet G55, G85, G95, K60,
K80, R40, R60, R80, T45, T65, HP Officejet Pro 1150, 1170, 1175, HP Photosmart P1000,
P1100, 1115, 1215, 1218, 1315, HP Color Copier 110, 120, 140, 145, 150, 155, 160, 170, 180,
190, 210, 260, 270, 280, 290, HP Fax 1220,, ,,, New - Unused
$7.85 2-538 HP Ink Cartridge 951XL- Cyan For use with: HP Officejet Pro 200z, 251dw, 276dw, 8100, $1
8110, 8600, 8610, 8615, 8620, 8625, 8630, 8700, , ,,, New - Unused
$7.85 2-539 HP Ink Cartridge 951XL - Magenta For use with: HP Officejet Pro 200z, 251dw, 276dw, $1
8100, 8110, 8600, 8610, 8615, 8620, 8625, 8630, 8700,, ,,, New - Unused
$7.85 2-540 HP Ink Cartridge 951XL - Yellow For use with: HP Officejet Pro 8100, 8110, 8600,, ,,, New $1
- Unused
No Bid * 2-541 HP Ink Cartridge 97 Tri-color- Magenta, Yellow, Cyan For use with: HP Deskjet 460, 5740, $1

5940, 6520, 6540, 6620, 6830, 6840, 6940, 6980, 6988, 9800, HO Officejet H470, 100, 150,
6200, 6210, 7210, 7310, 7410, HP Photosmart B8350, 325, 335, 375, 385, 422, 425, 428, 475,
2610, 2710, 8049, 8050, 8150, 8450, 8750, HP Printer/Scanner/Copier 1600, 1610, 2350,
2355,, ,,, New - Unused

6/20/2022,10:44 AM
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of SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From May 4 to May 11, 2022
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Government

Highest Item # Description Kms Min. Price Serial Number
Bid Price

No Bid * 2-542 HP Ink Cartridges Lot of 2 78 Tri-color Cartridge - Magenta, Cyan, Yellow For use with: HP $1
Deskjet 920, 930, 932, 935, 940, 950, 952, 960, 970, 990, 995, 1220, 3820, 6122, 6127, 9300,
HP Officelet 5110, G55, G85, G95, K60, K80, V40, HP Photosmart P1000, P1100, 1115, 1215,
1218, 1315, HP Color Copier 180, 190, 280, 290, HP Digital copier 310, HP
Printer/Scanner/Copier 750, 950 HP Fax 1220, 1230,, ,,, New - Unused

$10.00 2-543 HP Ink Cartridges Lot of 2 950XL HP High Capacity - Black For use with: HP Officejet Pro S1
200z, 251dw, 276dw, 8100, 8110, 8600, 8610, 8615, 8620, 8625, 8630, 8700,, ,,, New -
Unused

No Bid * 2-544 HP Inkjet Print Cartridge 23 Tri-color - Magenta, Cyan, Yellow For use with: HP Deskjet 710, $1
712,720, 722, 810, 812, 830, 832, 880, 882, 885, 887, 890, 895, 1120, HP color copier 140,
145, 150, 155, 160, 170, 260, 270, HP Printer/scanner/copier 500, HP officejet r40, r60, r80,
rd5, r65, HP Officejet Pro 1170c, 1175c,, ,,, New - Unused

No Bid * 2-545 HP Inkjet Print Cartridge 99 Photo - Pink, Blue, Black For use with: HP Deskjet C4280, S1
C5280, D4145, D4155, D4160, 460,5440, 5740, 5940, 6520, 6540, 6620, 6830, 6840, 6940,
6980, 9800, HP Photosmart B8350, C3140, C3150, C3180, C4140, C4150, C4180, D5060,
D5065, D5069, D5145, D5155, D5160, 2570, 2575, N5610, 2710, 7850, 8050, 8150, 8450,
8750, HP Officejet 15780, 6200, 6210, 6310, 7210, 7310, 7410, HP Printer/Scanner/Copier
1507, 1510, 1600, 1610, 2350, 2355, , ,,, New - Unused
No Bid * 2-546 Inkjet Cartridge (Remanufactured) 96 Black Compatible with: Deskjet 5740, 5740XI, 5940, $1
5940XI, 6520, 6520XI, 6540,6540DT, 6540XI, 6620, 6620XI, 6830V, 6840, 6840DT, 6840XI,
6940, 6940DT, 6980, 6980DT, 6988, 6988DT, 9800, 6800D, Officejet: 7210, 7210V, 7210XI,
7310, 7310XI, 7410, 7410XI, Photosmart: 2610, 2610V, 2610XI, 2710, 2710XI, 8050, 8150V,
8150XI, B8350, 8450, 8450XI, 8750,, ,,, New - Unused

No Bid * 2-547 Inkjet Printer Cartridges Lot of 8 Combo-pack 2-HP Inkjet print Cartridges - 15 Black & 78 Tri- $1
color (Magenta, Cyan, Yellow) For use with: HP Deskjet 920, 940, 3820, HP Officejet v40,
5110, HP Digital Copier 310, HP Printer/Scanner/Copier 750, 950, HP Fax 1230,, ,,, New -
Unused
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Goveror]:ment SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From May 4 to May 11, 2022
A Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092
Highest Item # Description Kms Min. Price Serial Number
Bid Price
SASKATOON, Environment, Fish, Wildlife and Lands Branch, 112 Research Dr.
Contact Amy Nixon 306-220-2846, amy.nixon@gov.sk.ca
$7.85 1-557 Gas Detector MSA Altair maintenance free single gas detector, like new condition.,, ,,, $1

Good

SASKATOON, Western Canada Lotter Corp, 1935 1st Ave North

Contact Kevin Petersen 306-933-6816 / 306-230-4247, petersenk@wclc.com

$1,777.77 2-504

Van 2012 Dodge Grand Caravan 2WD L3.3 V6 gas auto air, tilt, cruise, power windows, power 363,278
doors, power steering single axle, 3030mm wheel base, standard differential, tire size: km
225/65/16, white, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety

concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full

responsibility for repairs if required. 363,278 km, , PROBLEMS: tires, brakes, body exterior,

whindshield glass, windshield washer and wipers, paint and interior all in poor condition.

Needs brake work. Does not have a battery. Was in running condition when parked. , As is,

Where is

s1

2C4RDGBG8CR347519

$3,261.68 2-553

Van 2013 Dodge Ram Cargo Van 2WD L3.3 V6 gas auto air, tilt, cruise, power windows, power 252,264
doors, power steering single axle, 3030mm wheel base, standard differential, tire size: km
225/65/16, white, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety

concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full

responsibility for repairs if required. 252,264 km, Recent repairs: new fuel pump and a recent
transmission service., PROBLEMS: vehicle will shut down intermittently while driving, no

warnings or error codes. Possiblility of not starting, not having gear access, and possible

electrical problems may exist. Tires in poor condition., As is, Where is

s1

2C4JRGAG3DR724047

SMEATON, Parks, Culture & Sport, Narrow Hills Provincial Park

Contact Tanya White 306-426-2622, tanya.white@gov.sk.ca

$2.00 2-507

Topographical Map Bedard Creek Printed,, ,,, Fair

s1

73 H/10

$2.00 2-508

Topographical Map Birchbark Lake Printed,, ,,, Fair

s1

73 H/11

No Bid * 2-509

Topographical Map Birchbark Lake Printed,, ,,, Fair

s1

73 H/11

$10.00 2-510

Topographical Map Candle Lake Printed,, ,,, Fair

s1

73 H/14

6/20/2022,10:44 AM
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Fax: 306-787-2092
Highest Item # Description Kms Min. Price Serial Number
Bid Price
$2.00 2-511 Topographical Map Summit Lake Printed,, ,,, Fair $1 731/2
$2.00 2-512 Topographical Map Torch River Printed,, ,,, Fair $1 73 H/9
$2.00 2-513 Topographical Map White Gull Creek Printed,, ,,, Fair $1 73 H/15
$2.00 2-514 Topographical Map Whiteswan Lake Printed,, ,,, Fair $1 731/13
ST. LAURENT FERRY SITE, Highways & Infrastructure, Call for directions
Andrew Fehr 306-221-2015, andrew.fehr@gov.sk.ca
$2,174.00 2-505 Mobile Office Bunkhouse 1981 dimensions: 12' x 44', pintle hitch, dual axles, dual tires flat $1 10551

or rotten, propane furnace, all utilities disconnected. Known issues: roof leaks. Other
information: loading required for removal - it is the responsibility of the buyer to measure
height of unit, if necessary, for transportation route. As is, where is. , , ,,, Poor

SWIFT CURRENT, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, Field Offices, Box 516 - 350 Cheadle St W

Contact Mattea Almond 306-778-8208, mattea.almond@gov.sk.ca or Jaymie Freeman 306-778-8205, jaymie.freeman@gov.sk.ca

$827.00 2-501 Snowmobile 1999, Polaris Trail Touring 2 stroke 500cc. Has not run in 3-4 years. General $1 AXAET4ESXXC068577
mechanical servicing needed, including possible carburetor servicing. , , ,,, Poor
WINGARD FERRY SITE, Highways & Infrastructure, Call for directions
Contact John Moynham 306-933-5251, john.moynham@gov.sk.ca or Wayne Brown 306-933-5838, wayne.brown@gov.sk.ca
No Bid * 2-506 Mobile Office Bunkhouse 1981 pintle hitch, dual axles, dual tires flat or rotten, propane $1 10557
furnace, all utilities disconnected. Known issues: roof leaks. Other information: loading
required for removal - it is the responsibility of the buyer to measure the unit dimensions for
transportation. As is, where is. ,, ,,, Poor
YORKTON,SaskBuilds and Procurement, Whitespruce, NE-35-TP26-R5-W2. Call for directions.
Contact Mark Bigoraj 306-786-5871, 306-621-3051 mark.bigoraj2@gov.sk.ca.
$25.00 2-548 Scale Decto, Model Crowfoot 35 LB capacity, operational.,, ,,, Fair $1 3U 6044
No Bid * 2-549 Street Light Heads Lot of 22  attach to metal street poles, operational.,, ,,, Fair S1
$2.03 2-550 Unit Heater Inter-city Model UFE-90 natural-gas 90,000 BTU, operational.,, ,,, Fair $1 E424968
$2.03 2-551 Unit Heater Inter-city Model UFE-90 natural-gas 90,000 BTU, operational.,, ,,, Fair $1 E423418
$5.00 2-552 Wall Lights (Outside) Lot of 4 Make and model unknown, operational.,, ,,, Fair $1
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Highest Item # Description Kms Min. Price Serial Number
Bid Price

MOOSOMIN, SaskBuilds and Procurement, 709 Carleton Street

Contact Wayne McGonigal 306-435-9339, wayne.mcgonigal@gov.sk.ca

2-554 Bulbs, Halogen Lot of 15 Sylvania Tungsten T10 150W 120V medium base, operational. ,, , $1
No Bid * ,, New - Unused

2-555 Doors Lot of 2 Solid Wood 35 3/4" W x 79" H x 1 3/4" thick, grey and blue, left and right in $1
$15.00 swings .. ., Fair

2-556 Drill Maktec 14.4V Cordless, non-operational- missing parts, case included. ,, ,,, Broken $1

$1.03 Repairable
2-557 Drill Maktec 14.4V Cordless, non-operational- missing parts, case included. ,, ,,, Broken $1
$1.03 Repairable

2-558 Floor Tiles Lot of 13 Colors Plus Commercial tile flooring, color: Fortress, dimensions: 12" x $1
No Bid * 12" x 1/8" thick,, ,,, New - Unused

2-559 Fluorescent Lights Lot of 20 Flush Mount T8 4ft L x 1ft W x 4" D, units are disassembled - $1
No Bid * some have no ballast or bulbs.,, ,,, Good

2-560 Fluorescent Lights Lot of 20 Flush Mount T8 4ft L x 1ft W x 4" D, units are disassembled - $1
No Bid * some have no ballast or bulbs.,, ,,, Good

2-561 Fluorescent Lights Lot of 20 Flush Mount T8 4ft L x 1ft W x 4" D, units are disassembled - $1
No Bid * some have no ballast or bulbs.,, ,,, Good

2-562 Fluorescent Lights Lot of 28 Flush Mount T8 4ft L x 1ft W x 4" D, units are disassembled - $1
No Bid * some have no ballast or bulbs.,, ,,, Good

2-563 Fluorescent Lights Lot of 4 Metal T8 4'L x 4" W, operational with ballast, tubes and plastic $1
No Bid * covers.,, ,,, Good

2-564 Fluorescent Lights Lot of 26 Single Tube T8 4ft Lx 2 3/4" W x 1.5" D, units are disassembled - $1
No Bid * all have ballast and some bulbs.,, ,,, Good

2-565 Fluorescent Lights Lot of 20 Surface Mount T8 4ft L x 1ft W x 3.5" D, units are disassembled - $1
No Bid * some have no ballast or bulbs, all have plastic covers.,, ,,, Good

2-566 Fluorescent Lights Lot of 26 Surface Mount T8 4ft L x 1ft W x 3.5" D, units are disassembled - $1
No Bid * some have no ballast or bulbs, all have plastic covers.,, ,,, Good

2-567 Light Dimmer Switches Lot of 5 Leviton four units are 1500W and one unit is 1000W, $1
No Bid * operational, beige in color.,, ,,, Good

2-568 Light Units Lot of 4 Flush Mount with Glass Covers 12" Round x 9" D, operational - 100 watt S1
No Bid * maximum, manufactured in 1971.,, ,,, Fair

2-569 Light Units Lot of 16 Flush Mount with Glass Covers 16 3/4" Round x 9" D, operational - 300 $1
No Bid * watt maximum, manufactured in 1971.,, ,,, Fair

2-570 Lights Lot of 6 Round Glass/Globe Fixtures 14" W x 6" D, operational, takes two 60W bulbs $1
No Bid * maximum per unit.,, ,,, Good

2-571 Lights (Exterior) Lot of 3 Model MDL3 HPS 100W medium base, 12" W x 11" Hx 8" D, $1
No Bid * operational, faded, metal with plastic glass.,, ,,, Poor
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of
A Saskatchewan

SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #2

From May 4 to May 11, 2022

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

Highest Item # Description Kms Min. Price Serial Number
Bid Price
2-572 Lights (Exterior) Lot 4 Model PCL1 HPS 100W large base, 17.5" W x 15.5" Hx 7" D, S1
No Bid * operational, faded, metal with plastic glass.,, ,,, Poor
2-573 Sump Pumps Lot of 2 1/3 HP Thermoplastic pedestal superior pump, operational - new in S1
$35.00 box.,, ,,, New - Unused
2-574 Wall Pack Light (Exterior) Lot of 2 70 Watt HPS Type S62 12" W x 10" H x 7 3/4" D, lamps are S1
No Bid * disassembled. ,, ,,, Fair
2-575 Wall Pack Light (Exterior) Lot of 4 70 Watt Medium HPS 10" W x 7" Hx 7" D, lamps are S1
No Bid * disassembled.,, ,,, Poor

6/20/2022,10:44 AM
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