

SALE RESULTS

Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to (306)787-2092; by phone (306)787-2062 or (306)787-2238,
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer)	This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred.
WD = (Withdrawn)	This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller,
No Bid =	Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Highest	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum	Serial Number
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles					
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.					
\$1,079.00	1-001	Car 2013 Dodge Avenger SE FWD, 4 door 2.4L L4 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors, locks and windows, keyless entry- 1 fob , grey, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.**, 236,209 km, , PROBLEMS: MOTOR BLOWN - HOLE IN PISTON 3, coolant leak (thermostat housing), battery dead, windshield cracked, surface rust on floor boards, hood has bubbling paint and dents, interior soiled with strong odor, front bumper scratched and chipped, rear bumper skirt damaged, front left fender scraped, both rocker panels scraped and have road rash, left rear door has road rash, no plate lights, wheel cover missing, brake pedal rubber worn, roof has dents, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is	236,209 km	\$506	1C3CDZAB3DN604516
\$6,145.00	1-002	SUV 2014 Chevrolet Tahoe 2WD, 5 passenger 5.3L V8 Gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks, windows, mirrors, front seats, rear HVAC, keyless entry- 3 fobs, 4 keys steel wheels, side steps, mud flaps, front tow hooks, white, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.**, 247,858 km, , PROBLEMS: Check engine light: P0300 random misfire, rear shocks, steering knuckle, front pads and rotors, steering rack all need attention, alignment needed, tires very poor, front bumper has cracks and chips, front right fender is scratched and chipped, front left fender chipped, hood is chipped, windshield chipped, holes in dash, head liner and rear seat and luggage area, center council missing, B pillar trim notched, front vents loose, upper cover on door lock/handle loose, missing trim on front seats and luggage area, roof has scratches/7 sealed holes, battery is poor, minor exterior damage.> As is. Where is	247,858 km	\$2,200	1GNLC2E02ER205483
\$5,103.00	1-003	Truck 2009 Chevrolet Silverado 2500 Extended Cab, 4x4, 8' box 6.0L V8 Gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, 2 keys, box liner Grille inserts, front tow hooks, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, headache rack including box rails, red, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.**, 231,498 km, , PROBLEMS: check engine light on (P0050, P0155, P0154, P0513, CO550, U0140), left upper ball joint needs attention, transfer case worn out, transmission shift cable worn, rear pads and rotors, left lower ball joint slight play, brake rubber and park brake require attention, left rear quarter panel badly damaged, right rear quarter panel badly dented and scratched, all fenders chipped and have road rash/rust, right front fender creased, left rear cab corner rusted and dented, holes in front hump, box floor dented, grille has peeling chrome, hood is dented and scratched/trim broken, rear bumper loose and dented, front bumper extension broken, tailgate is rusted/dented, front center arm rest worn out, inside left front door missing trim, left front back rest adjustment lever missing, right rear tail light broken, left front seat worn/frame visible, no plate lights, left front door weather stripping missing, chipped windshield, roof has scratches and small rust spots/1 sealed hole, spare tire missing, battery poor, minor exterior damage > As is. Where is	231,498 km	\$2,212	1GCHK49K29E149910

Highest	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum	Serial Number
\$8,177.00	1-004	Van 2009 Chevrolet Express, Cargo AWD 5.3L V8 Gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, power locks, rear heater computer stand, cargo barrier, plywood floor, shelving, hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, handle on left rear cargo door, white, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.**, 200,547 km, , PROBLEMS: transmission leaking, transfer case leaking, both outer tie rods need attention, front bumper rusted, rear bumper rusted and bent, right rear fender rust, right dog leg rusted, both rocker panels rusted, left front fender dented, both left fenders and right front fender paint peeling, hood has paint peeling/dents, front left door has chips/paint in poor condition, right rear cargo door is hard to open, right rear tailgate peeling/rust/chips, tailgate glass scratched/chipped, front bumper cover broken/bent/dented, driver seat is worn with a hole through the cushion, driver door weather stripping missing, left headlight bracket needs attention, roof has small rust spots/peeling paint/3 sealed holes, wheel wrench and jack loose in back, battery poor, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is	200,547 km	\$1,170	1GCFH154091153229
\$5,400.06	1-005	Van 2009 Dodge Caravan FWD 3.3L V6 Gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors, front windows, locks, keyless entry- 2 key fobs 150W power inverter (condition unknown), computer stand, map box, cargo barrier, steel floor, shelving, handle on tail gate, trailer hitch (1.5 - 2 inch), roof rack with beacon (unknown condition), white, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.**, 104,750 km, , PROBLEMS: rack leaking, right front inner tie rod needs attention, right front wheel bearing needs attention, coolant bypass pipe requires attention, front left fender rusted, right front fender has rust, hood paint bubbling and hail dents, front bumper is cracked, rear left fender creased and dented, right rear tail light broken, rear bumper has scratches and chips, headlights foggy, tailgate window scratched, windshield chips, roof has small rust chips and 3 sealed holes- one hole is rusted through, tire warning light on, battery is poor, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is	104,750 km	\$987	2D4HN11E09R613732
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.					
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.					
\$85.51	8-144	Concrete Vibrator Dreyer Operational , , , , , Fair		\$1	JE76103
No Bid *	1-101	Floor Liners - Back Husky brand, custom fit, grey in color For 1999-2003 Chevrolet/GMC, full size truck, 3 and 4 door extended cab. , , , , , Excellent		\$10	Part # 61352
\$12.00	1-102	Floor Liners - Back Husky brand, custom fit, grey in color For 1999-2003 Chevrolet/GMC, full size truck, 3 and 4 door extended cab. , , , , , Excellent		\$10	Part # 61352
No Bid *	1-103	Floor Liners - Back Husky brand, custom fit, grey in color For 1999-2003 Chevrolet/GMC, full size truck, 3 and 4 door extended cab. , , , , , Excellent		\$10	Part # 61352
No Bid *	1-141	Floor Liners - Front Husky brand, custom fit Grey in color, may be compatible with 1998-2000 Dodge Durango or 2000-2003 Dakota. , , , , , Excellent		\$10	Part # 30782

Highest	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum	Serial Number
\$16.00	1-140	Floor Liners - Front Husky brand, custom fit Grey in color, various applications years 2000-2003. Trucks and sedans. GM products , , , , , Excellent		\$10	Part# 10302
\$12.00	1-142	Floor Liners - Front Mopar OEM, rubber Black in color, may be compatible with 2000-2003 Dakota with Ram and Dakota logo , , , , , Excellent		\$10	
\$16.00	1-143	Floor Liners - Front Mopar OEM, rubber Black in color, may be compatible with 2000-2003 Dakota with Ram and Dakota logo , , , , , Excellent		\$10	
\$5.00	1-125	Floor Mats Lot of 11 Rubber Various colors and sizes , , , , , Good		\$1	
No Bid *	1-104	Floor Mats - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), rubber, light grey in color May be compatible with Chevrolet Astro. , , , , , Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	1-105	Floor Mats - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), rubber, light grey in color May be compatible with Chevrolet Astro. , , , , , Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	1-144	Floor Mats - Front and Rear 1 set Mopar OEM, rubber Black in color, may be compatible with 2007-2010 Chrysler Sebring or 2011 Chrysler 200. , , , , , Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	1-145	Floor Mats - Rear Mopar OEM, rubber Grey in color. , , , , , Excellent		\$10	Part # 82203904
No Bid *	12-114	Hitch OEM Ford (receiver) with mounting bolts black in color, accepts a 2 inch draw bar. May be compatible with a 2005 Ford E350. , , , , , Good		\$50	
No Bid *	12-116	Hitch OEM Ford (receiver), with mounting bolts black in color, accepts a 2 inch draw bar. May be compatible with a 2006 Ford E350. , , , , , Good		\$50	
No Bid *	12-117	Hitch OEM Ford (receiver), with mounting bolts and trailer wiring black in color, accepts a 2 inch draw bar. May be compatible with a 2008 Ford E350. , , , , , Good		\$60	
No Bid *	1-106	License Plate Bracket - Front Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), NO mounting kit May be compatible with 2002-2006 Sebring. , , , , , Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	1-107	License Plate Bracket - Front Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), NO mounting kit May be compatible with 2002-2006 Sebring. , , , , , Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	1-109	License Plate Bracket - Front Ford OEM. NO mounting kit. May be compatible with 2005 Ford F250 , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-108	License Plate Bracket - Front Ford Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), NO mounting kit. May be compatible with 2005 Ford F250 , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-113	License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-114	License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-115	License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-116	License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-117	License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 , , , , , Excellent		\$5	

Highest	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum	Serial Number
No Bid *	1-118	License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-119	License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit May be compatible with 2003-2007 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-110	License Plate Bracket - Front Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit. May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty , , , , , Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	1-111	License Plate Bracket - Front Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit. May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty , , , , , Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	1-112	License Plate Bracket - Front Jeep Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), includes mounting kit. May be compatible with 2005-2007 Liberty , , , , , Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	1-126	License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-127	License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-128	License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-129	License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-130	License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
No Bid *	1-131	License Plate Bracket - Front GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) Compatible with 2006-2016 Impala, includes mounting kit. , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
\$10.19	1-121	Mud Flaps Set of 4 Chevrolet Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Molded May be compatible with a 2008-2012 Chevrolet Colorado, 1 front set and 1 rear set. , , , , , Good		\$5	
\$5.19	1-123	Mud Flaps Set of 4 Chevrolet Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Molded May be compatible with a 2008-2012 Chevrolet Colorado, 1 front set and 1 rear set. , , , , , Good		\$5	
\$5.19	1-124	Mud Flaps Set of 4 Chevrolet Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Molded May be compatible with a 2008-2012 Chevrolet Colorado, 1 front set and 1 rear set. , , , , , Good		\$5	
\$5.19	1-122	Mud Flaps Set of 4 Chevrolet Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), Molded May be compatible with a 2008-2012 Chevrolet Colorado. 1 front set and 1 rear set , , , , , Good		\$5	
\$158.00	10-107	Rear Bumper Ford, black scratched. Removed from a 2006 Ford F250. , , , , , Good		\$100	438275
\$12.00	1-146	Second Seat Liners Husky brand, custom fit Grey in color, may be compatible with 2000-2003 Dakota Quad Cab. , , , , , Excellent		\$10	Part # 60772
No Bid *	1-132	Shield for Inner Fender 1 set Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) 1 right and 1 left, rear only, may be compatible with a 2008 Chrysler 1500, 2500 or 3500 , , , , , Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	1-133	Shield for Inner Fender 1 set Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) 1 right and 1 left, rear only, may be compatible with a 2008 Chrysler 1500, 2500 or 3500 , , , , , Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	1-134	Shield for Inner Fender 1 set Chrysler Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) 1 right and 1 left, rear only, may be compatible with a 2008 Chrysler 1500, 2500 or 3500 , , , , , Excellent		\$10	

Highest	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum	Serial Number
No Bid *	12-118	Spare Tire 16 inch, 135/70R/16, Continental compact temporary spare on a steel rim. May be compatible with a 2008 Chev Uplander. , , , , , Good		\$10	
No Bid *	12-119	Spare Tire 16 inch, 135/70R/16, Continental compact temporary spare on a steel rim. May be compatible with a 2008 Chev Uplander. , , , , , Good		\$10	
No Bid *	1-150	Tailgate Chevrolet, metal may be compatible with several years of Chevrolet Silverado (1500, 2500, 3500) starting with 2004. Has paint chips and slight scratches, missing support cables, white in color. , , , , ,		\$200	
\$375.00	1-148	Tailgate Chevrolet, metal white in color, may be compatible with several years of Chev Silverado's starting 2004. . 1500, 2500, 3500 , , , , , Good		\$200	
\$200.00	1-149	Tailgate Chevrolet, metal white in color, may be compatible with several years of Chev Silverado's starting 2004. . 1500, 2500, 3500 , , , , , Good		\$200	
No Bid *	12-104	Tailgate, Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) yellow in color May be compatible with a 2004 Chev. Siverado 3500 extended cab. May not be complete. , , , , , Good		\$200	A04007
No Bid *	12-105	Tailgate, Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) yellow in color May be compatible with a 2004 Chev. Siverado 3500 extended cab. May not be complete. , , , , , Good		\$200	
No Bid *	12-106	Tailgate, Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM) yellow in color May be compatible with a 2004 Chev. Siverado 3500 extended cab. May not be complete. , , , , , Good		\$200	
No Bid *	12-110	Tire 17 inch, P225/55R/17, Firestone All Season, M+S. Manufacture date: week 44, year 2019. , , , , , Good		\$50	
No Bid *	12-113	Tire 17 inch, P245/70R/17, General Grabber HTS, M+S. Manufacture date: week 30, year 2015. , , , , , Good		\$50	
No Bid *	1-151	Tire 17 inch, P225/55R/17, Goodyear Assurance. M+S. Manufacture date: week 02, year 2017. , , , , , Fair		\$10	
\$350.00	1-152	Tires Lot of 5 17 inch, LT 245/75R/17, Firestone Transforce. M+S. Manufacture date: week 48, year 2020. , , , , , Good		\$275	
\$25.00	12-125	Tonneau Cover for Truck Box Retractable. Fabric-condition unknown. Included 5 pieces of trim. Mounting bracket broken. Parts maybe missing. May be compatible with a 2004 Chev Silverad , , , , ,		\$20	
\$1,201.00	1-136	Trailer 2001 Majestik Flat Deck adjustable, pintle eye hook up, 6 flat bar RV style wire connection, has 2 beaver tails (ramps), 14 inch high side deck guards, tongue jack, spare tire on 'A' frame , deck		\$500	MAJECCUT01656
\$1,011.11	1-137	Trailer 1985 Mechanical reel, homebuilt winch for reels, pintle eye hook up, 6 pin round style wire connection, 10' long x 81" wide, spare tire, 5/16 inch winch cable, 2 rear stabilizer legs, 3 tires		\$500	SK400054441
\$1,668.00	1-138	Trailer 1977 Brandt Reel hydraulic cable dolly, with 3 hydraulic pump jacks, 1 for lifting the tongue, 2 to lift the arms, RV 6 flat blade style connection, has tool box on tongue 'A' frame, pintle eye hook up,		\$500	91977
\$1,011.11	1-139	Trailer 1998 Tech winch to lift reels, pintle eye hook up, 6 flat RV style wire connection, has spare tire, 5/16 inch winch cable, has a tongue jack, tires 205 75R15, 1 reel bar, 10' long x 87" wide, 2500 lb		\$500	2CU1PG911W2003911
\$45.00	11-126	Truck Box Tonneau Cover Roll N Lock brand included-box of hardware, 6 pieces of trim and tonneau cover. Parts maybe missing. May be compatible with a 2013 Dodge 1500 short box. , , , , , Fair		\$40	800083
No Bid *	11-127	TV Samsung 14" screen, unsure if operational , , , , , Poor		\$1	CT-3371XVM
\$6.00	12-121	Warning Triangle Kit Grote 3 weighted triangles , , , , , Fair		\$5	

Highest	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum	Serial Number
\$6.00	12-122	Warning Triangle Kit Grote 3 weighted triangles , , , , , Fair		\$5	
\$67.97	1-135	Winter Front Mopar Compatible with 2012-13 Ram 3500. 6.7L V8 diesel + 5.7L V8 gas, instructions included, black in color. , , , , , Excellent		\$40	
No Bid *	9-101	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Left Hand L-shaped, locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled - joining		\$1	
No Bid *	11-128	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Right Hand L-shaped, locks but no keys , , , , , Fair		\$1	
\$16.00	11-129	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d, 2 drawer bank, 3 drawer bank, locks but no keys , , , , , Fair		\$1	
\$36.00	1-147	File Cabinet, Vertical 4 drawer, metal beige in color, no key, 51" tall, 28" deep, 18" wide , , , , , Fair		\$10	
\$20.00	1-120	Whiteboard wood trim 49.5"w x 5"d x 35.5"h , , , , , Fair		\$1	

Highest	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum	Serial Number
DUCK MOUNTAIN PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks, Culture and Sport, NW 27-30-30 W1, call for directions.					
Contact Samantha Klapatiuk 306-542-5505, Samantha.klapatiuk@gov.sk.ca or Greg Podovinnikoff 306-542-5504, Greg.podovinnikoff@gov.sk.ca					
\$10.00	1-501	Books Lot of 22 Saskatchewan Trails: A Guide to Nature Walks and Easy Hikes 1999, soft cover , , , , , New - Unused		\$1	
No Bid *	1-502	DVDs Lot of 5 Saskatchewan Parks: Our Treasures, Our Legacy Sealed , , , , , New - Unused		\$1	
HUDSON BAY, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 101 Stimpson Road.					
Contact Kim Haugen 306-865-4440, kim.haugen@gov.sk.ca or Derrick Wiwcharuk/Earl Cook 306-865-4500, earl.cook@gov.sk.ca					
\$38.55	1-533	Air Conditioner 2002 Fedders Model A6T12F2A 120 volt operational , , , , , Fair		\$1	GN9849252061
\$55.00	1-534	Air Conditioner 2002 Fedders, Model A6T12F2A 120 volt, operational , , , , , Fair		\$1	GN9849252062
\$43.35	1-535	Air Conditioner 2007 Climette, Model CA1826BR-A 220 volt, operational , , , , , Fair		\$1	CR233544073Y
\$78.56	1-536	Air Conditioner 2016 Kool King, Model MWECK-10CRN1-BCLO 120 volt, operational , , , , , Good		\$1	3812-992
\$4.04	1-537	Base Board Heaters Lot of 4 electric 120V, 66" long, operational , , , , , Fair		\$1	
\$200.00	1-538	Cement Mixer Monarch Model C6 SD year unknown, gas powered, non-operational, has not been operational for years. , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	B 673
\$62.24	1-539	Cement Mixer year, make and model unknown, electric powered, non-operational, has not been operational for years. , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	
\$20.00	1-540	Electric base board heaters Lot of 2 120V 48" long functional , , , , , Fair		\$1	
\$108.67	1-541	Exterior Doors Lot of 3 metal 32" X 80" 2 - funtional, 1 - repairable , , , , , Poor		\$1	
\$50.00	1-542	Furnace 1999 Lennox natural gas, 110,000 BTU, operational , , , , , Fair		\$1	T5720
\$57.00	1-543	Furnace 1999 Lennox natural gas, 70,000 BTU, operational , , , , , Fair		\$1	22274
\$56.57	1-544	Lights Lot of 3 LED bulbs with metal fixtures 24"x 48", 4 tube fixture, functional, no covers, some tubes missing. , , , , , Good		\$1	
\$56.57	1-545	Lights Lot of 4 LED bulbs with metal fixtures 8"x 48", 2 tube fixture, functional, no covers. , , , , , Good		\$1	
\$17.78	1-546	Map Cabinet metal 20" deep x 60" wide x 42" high , , , , , Poor		\$1	
\$121.00	1-547	Safe Coffre Fort National year unknown, class C, 18.5" W x 18.5" D x 23.5" H, functional, combination available. , , , , , Good		\$1	
\$27.00	1-548	Shower Stalls Lot of 2 plastic 32" deep x 32" wide x 74" high, functional , , , , , Fair		\$1	

Highest	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum	Serial Number
\$6.00	1-549	Storm Door metal 32" X 80", functional , , , , Fair		\$1	
\$99.00	1-550	Storm Doors Lot of 3 metal 32" x 80", functional , , , , Fair		\$1	
\$5.00	1-551	Vacuum Shop Vac 6.5 gallon, non-operational , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	5272A67
\$43.75	1-552	Water Heater 2003 Rheem natural gas, 50 US gallon, operational , , , , Good		\$1	0403J07917
\$45.00	1-553	Window PVC slider 30" W x 31" H, functional , , , , Good		\$1	
\$82.00	1-554	Window Lot of 2 PVC slider 35 3/4" W x 35 1/4" H, functional , , , , Good		\$1	
\$80.00	1-555	Window PVC slider 63" W x 54" H, functional , , , , Good		\$1	
\$153.00	1-556	Windows Lot of 3 PVC slider 47 1/2" x 47 1/2", functional , , , , Good		\$1	
MOOSE JAW, Highways & Infrastructure, Fleet Services, 1 km south of Moose Jaw on Highway #2.					
Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3788, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca					
No Bid *	1-503	Air Compressor Curtis Pneumatic Machinery non-operational/motor siezed , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	9804-108
\$126.00	1-504	Air Compressor Honda GX340 11.0 engine , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	
\$311.00	1-505	Engine Volvo non-operational/unknown problems , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	
\$4.00	1-506	Transmissions Lot of 2 Eaton used, non-functional , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	
\$334.00	1-507	Welder 2001, Miller Mig operational , , , , Fair		\$1	LB271739
\$125.00	1-531	Welder 1970, Miller electric, SRH444 40 amp, plug in cord missing , , , , Poor		\$1	CH22851
\$202.70	1-532	Welder 1988, Miller Matic 200 working when last used , , , , Poor		\$1	JH292089
NIPAWIN, Environment, Compliance and Field Service, 210 - 1st St East.					
Contact John Worsley 306-862-1790, john.worsley@gov.sk.ca					
\$15.01	1-560	ATV Storage Box Plastic 21"l x 35"w x14"h , , , , Fair		\$1	
\$39.00	1-561	Cabinet Metal 42"w x 14"d x 37"h , , , , Fair		\$1	

Highest	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum	Serial Number
\$6.00	1-563	Desk Wood 37"w x 19"d x 28"h , , , , , Poor		\$1	
\$11.00	1-564	Desk Piece, Corner Wood 21"w x 30"d x 29"h, pepperdust , , , , , Fair		\$1	
\$15.42	1-565	File Cabinet, Lateral, 3 Drawer Metal 36"w x 18"d x 39"h , , , , , Fair		\$1	
\$20.00	1-566	File Cabinet, Lateral, 4 Drawer Metal 36"w x 19"d x 53"h , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	1-567	File Cabinet, Vertical, 4 Drawer Metal 18"w x 28"d x 51"h , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	1-568	File Cabinet, Vertical, 4 Drawer Metal 18"w x 28"d x 51"h , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	1-569	File Cabinet, Vertical, 4 Drawer Metal 18"w x 28"d x 51"h - with lock and key , , , , , Fair		\$1	
\$56.00	1-570	Fridge Zenith 26"l x 24"w x 56"h. Operational. , , , , , Fair		\$1	23GD923
\$12.00	1-571	Shelving Unit Wood, 2 Shelves 42"w x 16"d x 44"h , , , , , Fair		\$1	
\$21.00	1-572	Vacuum ShopVac 8Gal/30.3L 5.5HP. Operational. , , , , , Fair		\$1	
\$27.00	1-573	Wardrobe Cabinet, 2 Door Wood 39"w x 22"d x 7"h , , , , , Fair		\$1	
OUTLOOK, Agriculture, Crops and Irrigation, 410 Saskatchewan Avenue W.					
Contact Heather Ducek-Reynolds at 306-867-5527, 306-541-4408 or heather.ducek-reynolds@gov.sk.ca					
*WD	1-508	File Cabinet Lateral, 3 Drawer 36w x 18d x 41h, lock and key, beige , , , , , Fair		\$1	
\$287.50	1-509	File Cabinet Lateral, 4 Drawer 36w x 18d x 64h, lock and key, beige , , , , , Fair		\$1	
PRINCE ALBERT, Highways, Northern Operations, 81 North Industrial Dr.					
Contact Cory Palko 306-960-5152, cory.palko@gov.sk.ca.					
\$5,032.00	1-527	Gravel Truck 1991 GMC Topkick C7H042 RWD Cat 3116, Inline 6, diesel Allison MT653 Heated mirrors 5 speed, 37,00 kg, single axle, standard differential. Dual tires, tire size: 11R22.5. 14 ply., yellow, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 359,909 km, , PROBLEMS: Engine smokes at start-up, block heater doesn't work, inner hood fenders gone, tires side walls cracked. Brakes, battery, windshield glass and lights all in poor condition. Box is rusty with holes in it. As is, Where is	359,909 km	\$1	1GDP7H1J5MJ517712

Highest	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum	Serial Number
\$1,555.55	1-526	Gravel Truck 1990 International 4700 RWD DTA360, Inline 6, diesel Allison MT643 Oiler, 29,000 kg, 4 speed, single axle, standard 2 speed differential. Dual tires, tires size: 11R22.5. 14 ply, 206 wheel base. , yellow, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 320,042 km, , PROBLEMS: Battery in poor condition, left hand rear axle hub has broken studs. Right hand rear axle hub bearing has spun in housing. Quad valve handle and air cylinder have been removed. As is, Where is	320,042 km	\$1	1HTSCFN0LH221630
\$2,700.00	1-528	Gravel Truck 1991 International 4700 RWD DTA360, Inline 6 , diesel EatonFuller RT7608LL A/C, tilt Oiler, 14,600 kg, 8 speed, single axle, standard locking differential. Dual tires, tire size: 11R22.5. 14 ply., yellow, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 10,962 km - odometer was replaced April 30, 2018 at 195,939 km, , PROBLEMS: Rate controller operation erratic. As is, Where is	10,962 km - odometer was replaced April 30, 2018 at 195,939 km	\$1	1HTSCNPN4MH367654
\$17,777.99	1-525	Gravel Truck 2003 Sterling LT9511 RWD Detroit Series 60 , Inoine 6, diesel manual A/C, cruise 10 speed, 42,00 kg, tandem axle, standard locking differential. Dual rear tires, tire size: 385/65R22.5, 214 wheel base., yellow, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 362,537 km, , PROBLEMS: Battery, body exterior, exhaust and interior all in poor condition. Holes rusted through cab and frame cross members, has a battery draw. As is, Where is	362,537 km	\$500	2FZHAZCGX3AK77537
\$4,750.11	1-522	Gravel Truck 2002 Volvo VHD64F RWD 12.1L, Inline 6, diesel, VED12C Eaton Super 10 A/C, cruise Cab and chassis, 10 speed, 42,000 kg, tandme axle, standard locking differential. Dual wheels in rear, tire size: 385/65R22.5, 11R22.5. 225 wheel base., yellow, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 432,008 km, , PROBLEMS: Brakes, battery, body exterior, windshield washer and wipers and interior all in poor condition. Failed frame thickness test, needs repair to pass SGI inspection. Holes rusted through bottom of cab. Anti-locking break system (ABS) light is on. Horn does not work. As is, Where is	432,008 km	\$500	4V5KC9GG72N329873
\$5,555.99	1-524	Gravel Truck 2002 Volvo VHD64F RWD 12.1L VED12C, Inline 6, diesel Eaton Super 10 A/C, cruise Cab and chassis, 35,00 kg, 10 speed, standard locking differential. Dual rear tires, tire size: 385/65R22.5, 11R22.5, 224 wheel base., yellow, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 329,470 km, , PROBLEMS: Battery, body exterior, windshield washer/wipers and interior all in poor condition. Unit failed frame thickness test, needs repairs before it can pass SGI inspection. Unit has holes rusted though cab. Driver's door lock sticks and is hard to turn, passenger door handle is broken. As is, Where is	329,470 km	\$500	4V5KC9GG92N329874
\$11,521.00	1-521	Motor Grader 2004 Volvo G720B 4 rear wheel 7.1L, Inline 6, diesel PowerShift A/C, tilt 8 speed, locking differential, single tire, 16' blade., yellow, , 6359.1 hrs, , PROBLEMS: Transmission, tires and battery all in poor conditon. Loss of multiple forward gears. As is, Where is	6359.1 hrs	\$5,000	35949

Highest	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum	Serial Number
\$7,520.00	1-520	Motor Grader 2004 Volvo G720B RWD 7.1L, Inline 6, diesel PowerShift A/C, blade float Speed: 8 forward, 8 reverse, tandem axle, locking differential. Single tires, tire size: 17.5R25. Mid mount scarifier., yellow, , 15,638 hrs, , PROBLEMS: Transmission leaks oil, engine pressurizing coolant system issues, motor, tires, and battery all in poor condition. No signals, no rear marker light, no rear work lights, left hand door handle broken off, air intake has been removed. As is, Where is	15,638 hrs	\$500	X035932X
\$3,799.99	1-523	Plow/Gravel Truck 2000 Mack RD6885 RWD 12L E7-350, Inline 6, diesel Eaton AutoShift A/C, cruise Tandem axle, standard locking differential, 10 speed, 24,300 kg. Dual rear wheel tires, tire size: 385/65R22.5, 11R22.5, 5 ply, 214 wheel base. , yellow, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 265,906 km, , PROBLEMS: Battery, body exterior and lights all in poor condition. Unit needs frame repair in order to pass SGI inspection, failed frame density test and has rust jacking on rear frame and cross members. Driver's door sill plate in poor condition. As is, Where is	265,906 km	\$500	1M2P267C2YM049826
\$9,511.00	1-511	Trailer 2006 Majestik TD325 Flat deck 25 ton tridem, dual tires Inspected, not certified. See attached., , , , Frame failed SGI inspection. Deck boards weathered and rotting, metal surfaces rusty, body exterior and paint are poor. As is, Where is		\$100	2M9FSA3V46R151159
\$1,017.77	1-559	Gravel Truck 2003 Sterling M8500 RWD 6.4L MBE900, Inline 6, diesel Fuller Standard A/C, cruise 8 speed, 21,900 kg, single axle, standard locking differential, dual rear tires, tire size: 315/80R22.5, 11R22.5, yellow, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , mileage N/A, , TOTAL LOSS - unit was rolled over, to be sold for parts ONLY. As is, Where is	mileage N/A	\$1	2FZACHCS83AL77422
PRINCE ALBERT, Justice Corrections and Policing, Prince Albert Correctional Centre 3021 1st Ave West					
Don Balan donald.balan@gov.sk.ca 306-953-3000 or Dean Schmalz dean.schmalz@gov.sk.ca 306-953-3039					
\$2.50	9-515	Incline Ab Bench Metal/Rubber/Wood Operational. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , Poor		\$1	
REGINA, Sask Liquor and Gaming Authority, SLGA Retail, Store 580, 2550 Quance St.					
Contact Julie Mack, 306 787 7541, jmack@slga.gov.sk.ca or Travis Wock 306-787-0179, twock@slga.com					
\$409.00	1-512	Pallet Jack Model 102T-F45L. Electric, Raymond. non-operational, battery needs to be replaced. Might work with a new battery, however, there is no guarantee. Jack has been sitting for 3 years. , , , ,		\$1	102-08-11671
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, Property Management - South Region, 1660 Park Street.					
Contact Aaron Meyer 306-537-5193, aaron.meyer@gov.sk.ca or Rhonda Gelowicz 306-552-8049, rhonda.gelowicz@gov.sk.ca					
\$207.00	1-513	Paving Stones (Interlocking) Lot of 4 (pallets) 4 pallets 3 pallets of interlocking paving stones stacked 4 deep. 4th pallet of interlocking paving stones is approx 3 deep. , , , , , Good		\$1	
\$157.00	1-514	Plywood 1 pallet used plywood approx. size 48"x40" approx 25-30 sheets , , , , , Fair		\$1	
\$257.00	1-515	Plywood 1 pallet used plywood approx. size 48"x40" approx 40-45 sheets , , , , , Fair		\$1	

Highest	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum	Serial Number
\$281.00	1-516	Plywood 1 pallet used plywood approx. size 48"x40" approx 40-45 sheets ,,,,, Fair		\$1	
\$307.00	1-517	Plywood 1 pallet used plywood approx. size 48"x40" approx 40-45 sheets ,,,,, Fair		\$1	
ROWAN'S RAVINE Provincial Park, Parks Culture and Sport, Call for location directions.					
Contact Abby Fuller 306-725-5200, abby.fuller@gov.sk.ca, or Tim Gelinis 306-725-5210, tim.gelinis@gov.sk.ca					
\$911.99	1-529	Quad Honda 4trax 250 4 Stroke Not in operational condition, has not ran in the past 3 to 4 years. Battery in poor condition, either dead or missing and some cables are seized. Engine will turn over with the pull rope. Overall condition is fair. , red, , , , Fair		\$1	JH3TE0601GC110749
\$888.88	1-530	Quad Honda 4trax 250 4 Stroke Not in operational condition, has not ran in the past 3 to 4 years. Battery in poor condition, either dead or missing and some cables are seized. Engine will turn over with the pull rope. Overall condition is fair. , red, , , , Fair		\$1	JH3TE0601GC110668
SASKATOON, Environment, Fish, Wildlife and Lands Branch, 112 Research Dr.					
Contact Amy Nixon 306-220-2846, amy.nixon@gov.sk.ca					
No Bid *	1-557	Gas Detector MSA Altair maintenance free single gas detector , like new condition. , , , , , Good		\$1	
\$15.55	1-558	Wildlife Caller MS512MR from Johnny Stewart, no cassettes included. , , , , , Poor		\$1	
TISDALE, Highways & Infrastructure, 1103-112th Avenue.					
Contact Michael Wallis at 306-878-8823, 306-873-6727 or michael.wallis@gov.sk.ca					
\$25.58	1-518	Air Compressor DeVilbiss Air Compressor Model 44643 three phase, 300 Min RPM, orange, tank is rusted through, weak pump. , , , , , Poor		\$1	R72545E
YORKTON, Highways, Fleet Services, 245 York Road East.					
Contact Brian Perih 306-786-1651 or Ed Patzwald 306-786-1687 email: brian.perih@gov.sk.ca or ed.patzwald@gov.sk.ca.					
\$135.80	1-519	Message Board, Vehicle Mountable 2009 Wanco Model WVMBB3X8-10PU housing is rusted out and needs replacement, all panels inside board not repairable and need replacement. , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	104515-01-10
HAGUE, Highways, Operations, Ferry Crossing (call for directions)					
Contact Andrew Fehr 306-221-2015, andrew.fehr@gov.sk.ca					
\$2,074.00	1-574	Bunkhouse / Office Car 1974 Dimensions: 10'x28', "A" frame hitch at front, pintle hitch at back, dual tires (may be flat), dual axles, propane furnace, all utilities disconnected. Known issues: roof leaks. Other information: Jackstands must be removed and can be taken along with unit, loading required for removal. As is, where is, , , , , , Poor		\$1	74281631