

Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to (306)787-2092; by phone (306)787-2062 or (306)787-2238,
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred.
WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller,
No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Item #	Description	Km	Min. price	Serial Number
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles.				
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.				
1,100.00	11-001	Car 2008 CHEVROLET Impala FWD 3.5L V6 Gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/windows/locks/driver seat, trunk release, keyless entry (2 fobs) , black, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection posted below is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection form.** , PROBLEMS: Major oil leak, left outer tie rod, alignment, TPMS light on, front bumper cracked and chipped, front fenders have minor dents and chips, rust along bottom of all doors, some paint peeling on doors, small chips and pits on windshield, scratches and rust on trunk lid, rear bumper has scratches, scratched hood, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	257,349 km	2G1WB58K281358443
4,151.98	11-002	Car 2008 CHRYSLER Sebring FWD 2.7L V6 Gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated mirrors, locks, windows, trunk release, keyless entry (2 key fobs) , blue, Passed SGI Inspection. **Please note: the SGI Inspection posted below is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection form.** , Recent Repairs: left outer tie rod, steering linkage, alignment, wiper blades, PROBLEMS: windshield chips, right rear fender rust, roof small rust spots, hood scratches/paint bubbling, both bumpers scraped/chipped/scratched, left front fender scratches, right front fender scape/dent, right rear door dent, trunk lid scratches, both mirrors paint peeling, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	171,713 km	\$1,100 1C3LC56R28N230519
4,089.89	11-003	Truck 2007 DODGE Dakota 4x4, extended cab, 5 passenger, 6'6" box 3.7L V6 Gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 2 keys, power driver seat front tow hooks, trailer hitch and wiring, mud flaps, white, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection posted below is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection form.** , PROBLEMS: Air bag light on (cod B1BB4, B1BB5), rear break adjusters seized, steering rack right boot requires attention, windshield cracked, hood has some rust spots, both right doors rusted, both left doors rust along the bottom, left rear and right front fender rusted, right rear fender dents, rear bumper rusted, tailgate is dented/rusted, both rear fender wells rusted through, left rear door hard to open, headlights fogged, box rails dented, left front seat ripped/worn/trim loose, right front seat has a hole, front grille chrome pitted, washer nozzle non operational, middle seat missing seatbelt, seatbelt light on, battery poor and not secure, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	239,989 km	\$1,050 1D7HW22K57S228396

Item #	Description	Km	Min. price	Serial Number
5,389.99 11-004	Truck 2013 DODGE Ram 1500 4x4, quad cab, 6'3" box, has a back seat 4.8L V8 Gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power windows/locks/drivers seat, heated mirrors, keyless entry (2 fobs) Front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer break, white, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection posted below is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection form.** , PROBLEMS: Timing cover leaks, small anti freeze leak, P0300 misfire, P0307 cylinder 7 misfire, right front axle boot needs attention, alignment, hole in floor board under left front seat, hail damage on hood, trailer wiring cut, tail gate does not open, rear bumper has chrome peeling off, both front fenders rusted/hole, rear right fender dented/road rash, rear left fender chipped/rust spot, road rash on right rocker panel, front doors have road rash, windshield chips, hole in front seat, right tail light out, right plate light out, front bumper scratched, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	285,184 km	\$3,360	1C6RR7GP6DS566383
6,262.00 11-005	Van 2008 DODGE Grand Caravan FWD 3.3L V6 Gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power front windows, mirrors, locks, keyless entry (1 key fob) top handle on tailgate, trailer hitch, map box, cargo barrier, steel floor, shelving, computer stand, roof rack brackets (no cross pieces), white, Passed SGI Inspection. **Please note: the SGI Inspection posted below is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection form.** , Recent Repairs: rear wiper blade, PROBLEMS: rust on rockers, left rear fender rust, right rear rust/dents, both front doors rust at bottom, windshield stone chip/pits, hood paint bubbling, front bumper cracked, missing fog lamp cover, grille missing lower right trim, left front fender trim loose, tailgate glass scratched, driver seat hole, missing rear seats, 2 sealed holes in roof, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	108,784 km	\$916	1D4HN11H68B172714
3,755.00 11-006	Van 2009 DODGE Grand Caravan FWD 3.3L V6 Gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, keyless entry (2 fobs), aftermarket remote start with fob, power locks, mirrors and front windows cargo barrier, map box, roof rack with beacon (condition unknown), trailer hitch, computer stand, shelf unit, steel floor, handle at top of tailgate, spare tire in back of vehicle, white, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection posted below is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection form.** , PROBLEMS: Front wheel bearings, right lower ball joint, rear shocks all require attention, out of alignment, rust along top edge of passenger rear door, windshield has chips, paint bubbling on hood, damaged front bumper, scratches and chips on rear bumper, 2 sealed holes in roof, rear window scratched, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	172,843 km	\$901	2D4HN11E39R683399

Item #	Description	Km	Min. price	Serial Number
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.				
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. NO ON-SITE VIEWING. Contact SaskSurplus (306) 787-2062 or (306) 798-3306.				
5.00	11-101 Book Case wood, 2 shelves 36" L x 14" W x 30" H , , , , , Fair		\$1	
*MT	11-102 Booster Cables Napa Ultra Pro 12 feet in length, 6 gauge with plastic carrying case. , , , , , Good		\$1	
10.00	11-103 Candles Lot of 3 Coghlan's, Model 9248, survival 3 wicks, matches included, burns maximum 36 hours. , , , , , Good		\$1	
85.50	11-136 Cart metal on wheels, 28 L x 18 W x 35 H , , , , , Fair		\$1	
5.00	11-104 Cassette Deck Technics Stereo Cassette Deck RS-T575 unsure if operational , , , , , Poor		\$1	n/a
2.00	6-147 Core and Coil HID Replacement Advance ballast, capacitor, fittings in box. , , , , , New - Unused		\$1	
10.00	11-105 Emergency Stoves Lot of 6 Coghlan's, Model 9560. 24 fuel tablets with metal stand , compact. Cup not included. , , , , , Good		\$1	
Renege *	11-106 File Cabinet wood, lateral, 2 drawer 30" W x 18 " D x 29" H, no keys , , , , , Good		\$1	
Renege *	11-107 File Cabinet wood, lateral, 2 drawer 30" W x 18 " D x 29" H, no keys , , , , , Good		\$1	
No Bid *	11-108 File folders lot of 116 Hanging, used various colors, 9" x 15" , , , , , Poor		\$1	
42.07	2-113 Floor Mats Set of 3 801635 Ram fabric floor mats Original Equipment Manufacturer(OEM), 2-front, 1 full width rear, may fit Ram 1500 Tradesman Crew Cab. Black in color. , , , , , Excellent		\$40	
8.25	11-109 Glucose Monitor Case lot of 5 medical, One Touch unsure if operational , , , , , Good		\$1	
13.66	11-137 Hubcaps Ford OEM, plastic, silver May fit 2004 Ford f150 , , , , , Good		\$1	
80.00	11-110 Parts Washer Citation brand model C20, 20 gallon, metal constuction. paint flaking, 30 inches long, 20 1/2 inches wide, 34 1/2 inches high, parts basket, Electric pump - NOT WORKING. , , , , , Fair		\$75	
*MT	11-111 Pedestal wood face, black laminate 16" W x 18" D x 30" H, 3 drawer, no keys , , , , , Good		\$1	
*MT	11-112 Pedestal wood, laminate 16" W x 18" D x 30" H, 2 drawer, no keys , , , , , Good		\$1	
*WD	10-107 Rear Bumper Ford, black scratched. Removed from a 2006 Ford F250. , , , , , Good		\$100	438275
28.00	11-138 Scale medical weigh scale, metal, heavy Unsure if operational , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	10-110 Seat 3rd row seat, seats 2 people Removed from a 2009 Dodge Durango, grey cloth , , , , , Fair		\$1	434842
No Bid *	10-111 Seat Bench seat. Cloth. Grey 52 inches in length. May be compatible with a 2004 Ford Econoline E150. , , , , , Poor		\$1	
No Bid *	10-113 Seats Lot of 2 Bench seats, grey, cloth 1-53 inch seat, 1-63 inch seat. May be compatible with a 2004 E350 extended van. , , , , , Fair		\$1	422121
No Bid *	10-114 Seats Lot of 2 Bench seats, grey, cloth Both seats are 53 inches in length. May be compatible with a 2004 Chev Astro van. , , , , , Fair		\$1	190470
No Bid *	10-115 Seats Lot of 2 Bench seats, grey, cloth Both seats are 53 inches in length. May be compatible with a 2006 E350 extended van. , , , , , Fair		\$1	422485
No Bid *	10-112 Seats Lot of 2 2nd row and 3rd row seat. 2nd row seats 3, 3rd row seats 2. Removed from a 2009 Dodge Durango, grey cloth. , , , , , Fair		\$15	434883

Item #	Description	Km	Min. price	Serial Number
8.00 11-114	Shovels Lot of 2 Coghlan's, folding, Model 9065, survival, metal Open length 23 inches, Folded length 10 inches. , , , , , Excellent		\$1	
9.99 11-115	Shovels Lot of 4 Garant, 1 blue and 1 red, 2 black True Temper Two plastic scoop, 53 inch with D-plastic handle, fiberglass shaft. Two metal scoop, 20 inch with D-plastic handle, wood shaft. , , , , , Good		\$1	
Renege * 11-116	Shovels lot of 4 Miscellaneous, plastic scoop various lengths, 28-36 inches , , , , , Fair		\$1	
10.00 11-117	Shovels lot of 4 Miscellaneous, plastic scoop various lengths, 28-36 inches , , , , , Fair		\$1	
40.00 11-118	Shovels lot of 4 Miscellaneous, wood shaft and fiber glass shaft, metal scoop. various lengths, 36-43 inches. , , , , , Fair		\$5	
40.00 11-119	Shovels lot of 4 Miscellaneous, wood shaft, metal scoop. various lengths, 40-47 inches. , , , , , Fair		\$5	
1.25 11-120	Speakers lot of 2 unknown brand 11" tall x 7" Wide x 5" Deep , , , , , Poor		\$1	n/a
*MT 11-121	Survival Kit Voyageur brand. blue carry case. blanket, socks, booster cables, shovel and other miscellaneous items. , , , , , Good		\$10	
16.00 6-205	Table Metal 30"w x 60"l x 29"h, laminate top, grey , , , , , Good		\$1	
46.88 2-158	Tire 16 inch, 225/60R/16 Firestone, FR710 M+S. Manufacture Date week 50 year 2016 , , , , , Fair		\$40	
41.01 11-124	Tire 16 inch, P225/65R16 Firestone All Season M+S, manufacture date. Week 41, year 2017. , , , , , Good		\$40	
41.01 11-123	Tire 17 inch, P225/55R 17 Sumitomo Ice Edge Snow Flake, manufacture date: week 18, year 2018. , , , , , Good		\$40	
No Bid * 8-105	Tire Artic Claw Winter TKI M+S 16 inch, 205/60R/16 , , , , , Excellent		\$40	
44.77 8-107	Tire Hankook Winter Pike RSV 16 inch, 225/60R/16 Manufacture Date: week 25, year 2018 , , , , , Excellent		\$40	
31.21 X-415	Tire and Steel Rim P225/60R/16, Goodyear Integrity may fit a 2008 Chev. Impala. Manufacture Date: week 15 year 2010 , , , , , Fair		\$25	316232
48.66 11-122	Tire on rim 16 inch, P225/60R/16, Firestone All Season M+S, may be compatible with a 2009 Chev Impala. Manufacture date: week 31, year 2017. , , , , , Good		\$40	316992
*WD' 11-125	Tires lot of 3 225/65R/16 Firestone FR710. M+S, manufacture date: week 47, year 2016. , , , , , Good		\$120	
*WD 8-163	Tires Set of 4 Sumitomo HTR Enhance. M+S 215/60R/17, manufacture date: week 41, year 2016. , , , , , Fair		\$120	
1,051.60 11-132	Trailer 1977, cable dolly/reel, hydraulic pintle eye hook up, 3 hydraulic pump jacks (1 for lifting the tongue, 2 for lift the arms), tool box with reel arms shock springs, RV 6 pin flat style connection, 2 rear stabilizer jacks, tires 1200x20 14 ply, has a 1 small & 1 large reel bar, 196" long, 101" wide, 14,000 lb , , , , , Good		\$500	61977

Item #	Description	Km	Min. price	Serial Number
1,118.50 11-131	Trailer 1980, Reel, dolly, hydraulic pintle eye hook up, 3 hydraulic pump jacks, 1 for lifting the tongue, 2 to lift the arms, has tool box with parts in it, RV 6 pin flat blade style connection, electric break away brakes, 2 rear stabilizer jacks, 1 axle oil cap cracked up, has 1 small reel bar, tires 1200x20, 14 ply. Dimensions: 196" long, 101" wide, 14,000 lb Good		\$500	3216429
1,150.00 11-133	Trailer 1999, Majestic, cable dolly, mechanical pintle eye hook up, 2 7.00x15 tires, has a tongue jack, 6 round pin trailer connection, 2 rear stablizer stands, small reel bar, has a hand cable winch, dimensions: 83" wide, 10 1/2' long, 2700 lb Good		\$500	MAJECCUT99435
1,150.00 11-134	Trailer mech, 1968, cable dolly, home built pindle eye hook up, 6 round pin trailer connection, 2 6.70 X 15 tires, tongue jack, has a hand cable winch, has a small reel bar, dimensions: 83" wide, 10 1/2' long, 2700 lbs Good		\$500	SASK90577000171
996.00 11-135	Trailer, cable dolly, mech 1980, home built pintle eye hook up, hand cable winch, tongue jack, 2 7.00 X 15 LT tires, 6 pin round trailer connection, 2 rear stablizer stands, has a small reel bar, dimensions: 83" wide, 10 1/2' long, Good		\$500	3211989
*WD 11-126	Truck Box Tonneau Cover Roll N Lock brand included-box of hardware, 6 pieces of trim and tonneau cover. Parts maybe missing. May be compatible with a 2013 Dodge 1500 short box. Fair		\$40	800083
*MT 11-139	Tub plastic, on wheels 51 L x 33 W x 37 H. white Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 11-127	TV Samsung 14" screen, unsure if operational Poor		\$1	CT-3371XVM
*MT 11-142	Arm chairs lot of 2 grey, on wheels cloth Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 11-150	Chair blue, with wooden arms and legs wooden Fair		\$1	
*MT 11-143	Chair grey cloth, no arms task Fair		\$1	
*MT 11-144	Chair lever controls partially working task Poor		\$1	
*MT 11-145	Chair lever controls partially working task Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 11-146	Chair lever controls partially working task Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 11-147	Chair lever controls partially working task Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 11-148	Chair lever controls partially working task Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 11-149	Chair lever controls partially working task Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 11-151	Chairs Lot of 2 one grey, one brown arm Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 11-128	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Right Hand L-shaped,locks but no keys Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 11-129	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d, 2 drawer bank, 3 drawer bank, locks but no keys Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 11-152	File cabinet no keys, scuffed and scratched 4 drawer, vertical, metal Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 11-153	File cabinet no keys, scuffed and scratched 4 drawer, vertical, metal Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 11-154	File cabinet no keys, scuffed and scratched 4 drawer, vertical, metal Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 11-155	File cabinet no keys, scuffed and scratched 4 drawer, vertical, metal Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 11-156	File cabinet no keys, scuffed and scratched 4 drawer, vertical, metal Fair		\$1	

	Item #	Description	Km	Min. price	Serial Number
*WD	11-158	File cabinet no keys, scuffed and scratched 4 drawer, vertical, metal , , , , Fair		\$1	
*WD	* 11-159	File cabinet no keys, scuffed and scratched 4 drawer, vertical, metal , , , , Fair		\$1	
*WD	11-160	File cabinet no keys, scuffed and scratched 4 drawer, vertical, metal , , , , Fair		\$1	
675.00	11-130	Office Desk Includes 2 pedestals with key, arborite top, wood grain finish 112.5"W x 29.5 "H x 84"D, hutch piece is 107"W x 44"H x 14.5"D, light brown , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid	* 11-164	Pedestal 3 drawer, with drafting pull out metal , , , , Fair		\$1	
4.72	11-165	Pedestal 4 drawer, with drafting pull out metal , , , , Fair		\$1	
*MT	11-161	Pedestal 3 drawer, 18"W x24"D x 27"H, no key laminate , , , , Fair		\$1	
*MT	11-162	Pedestal 3 drawer, 18x24x27, no wheels, no key laminate , , , , Fair		\$1	
*MT	11-163	Pedestal 3 drawer, 18x24x27, with key laminate , , , , Fair		\$1	
15.00	11-167	Table 30"W x 48"L x 30"H metal, wood-look top , , , , Good		\$1	
15.00	11-168	Table 30"W x 48"L x 30"H metal, wood-look top , , , , Good		\$1	
15.00	11-169	Table 30"W x 48"L x 30"H metal, wood-look top , , , , Good		\$1	
*MT	11-170	Table 42" diameter round, laminate top , , , , Good		\$1	
*MT	11-166	Table light grey, on wheels laminate table , , , , Good		\$1	

Item #	Description	Km	Min. price	Serial Number
DANIELSON PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks Culture and Sport, Box 39				
Contact Joel Perry 306-854-6267 Joel.Perry@gov.sk.ca				
141.00	11-504 Drill Press Gorilla, Model LC-20AEM non-operational , , , , , Poor		\$1	12218
No Bid *	11-505 Electric Mower Black & Decker, LM100 18", 7amps - unknown if it works , , , , , Poor		\$1	0216C
1,200.00	11-510 Golf Cart Jacobsen Hauler 1110, gas 11HP engine, 4 cycle air cooled, 1000lb payload. Non-operational , , , , , Poor		\$1	serial # unknown
Rene,	* 11-517 Lawn Sweeper - bag attachment is in back of Hauler Golf Cart Craftsman Light Duty 32" Pull behind sweeper attachment for lawn clippings and light debris , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	SK9834
45.00	11-506 Power Hacksaw With cast table complete with some guards, non-operational , , , , , Poor		\$1	3J359DE
1,015.00	11-507 Power Mower John Deere, F525 48" deck, non-operational , , , , , Fair		\$1	Serial number decal on the
*WD	* 11-511 Propane Heater PowerFist 49600 BTU Forced Air. Non operational , , , , , Fair		\$1	361301984
15.50	11-512 Propane Heater Radiant non-operational , , , , , Poor		\$1	
56.88	11-508 Radial Arm Saw DeWalt, 770 Deluxe Powershop 10" blade - unknown if it works , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	n/a
777.00	11-513 Riding Mower 6' Toro 322 D 1987, has 3799 hours, been parked outdoors unused for numerous years. Non operational , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	70392
1,029.00	11-514 Riding Mower John Deere F620 ZTRAK 60" most likely 1999, 1042 hours, has known clutch issues. Non operational , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	TC60ZTX010388
777.00	11-515 Riding Mower Toro 322D - 6' Groundmaster 1987, has 3510 hours, been parked outdoors unused for numerous years. Non operational , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	30782-70558
*MT	11-516 Rotary Mower Attachment Attachment for tractors uses the hydraulic lines from tractor, sides raise and lower by winch system, looks to be complete. Non operational , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	SK9544
No Bid	11-509 Rototiller Sears, 5hp approx 18", non-operational , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	1057
327.00	11-502 Truck 1998 CHEVROLET 2500 2 door, ext. cab, 1/2 ton 5.0L V8 Gas auto A/C, AM/FM radio, 1/2 ton, ext. cab, long box, red, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection posted below is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection form.** , , PROBLEMS: Been parked for at least 2 years, unknown if it will start/run, missing windshield wiper arm on passenger side, passenger mirror - cracked, windshield cracked, rust on fenders above rear wheels, Front grill - chrome worn off, various minor dents and some rust marks. Motor, transmission, tires, brakes, body exterior and paint, windshield glass and wipers, lights, mirrors all in poor condition. Interior checks out fair condition. Horn is unknown.>, As is, Where is	234,909 km	\$100	1GCGC29R0WE203033

Item #	Description	Km	Min. price	Serial Number
1,052.00 11-503	Truck 1998 DODGE Ram 1500 2 wheel drive, ext. cab 5.2L V8 Gas auto A/C, AM/FM radio, cassette player, 2 door, 1/2 ton lo-rider box cover, white, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection posted below is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection form.** , , PROBLEMS: Been parked for at least 2 years - unknown if it will start/run, small tear in headliner by light, unable to open lo-rider topper, dents/paint chips/rust on tailgate, paint chips/scratches/rust in various spots around the rest of the truck. Motor, transmission, brakes, battery, body exterior, exhaust, windshield washer and wipers, paint, lights, mirrors are all poor condition. Tires, windshield, interior are fair condition. Horn is unknown. >, As is, Where is	303,458 km	\$50	3B7HC12Y0WG201517
1,057.00 11-501	Truck 1998 CHEVROLET 2500 4X4, ext. cab 5.0L V8 Gas auto A/C, AM/FM radio Topper with roof rack, single loop style truck step, fender flares , white, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection posted below is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection form.** , , PROBLEMS: Known transmission issues, hard to start. Motor, tires, brakes, battery, exterior body, interior, lights, paint, mirrors and windshield washer and wipers are in fair condition, transmission and windshield poor shape, Horn is unknown.>, As is, Where is	275,555 km	\$50	1GCGK29R3WE222940
Meadow Lake, Highways, Fleet Services, Hwy #4 305- 9th St West.				
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Mark Eisenkirch 306-526-9103, mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca.				
2,587.00 11-518	Gravel Truck 2000 Mack Gravel Truck tandem axle, gravel box 6 l, diesel, manual A/C, tilt, cruise , Yellow, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection posted below is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection form.** , , PROBLEMS: Frame left thin, electrical issues with headlights and taillights, hood hinge broken, blower motor non-operational, bent bumper, clutch worn, poor mechanical condition. Motor, transmission, tires, windshield and mirror in fair condition, paint, brakes, interior, lights and battery in poor condition, horn is not working.>, As is, Where is	442,047 km	\$100	1M2P267C3YM049818
MOOSE JAW, Highways & Infrastructure, Fleet Services, 1 km south of Moose Jaw on Highway #2.				
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773,				
255.55 11-534	Air Systems brand new, never used , , , , , New - Unused		\$10	
111.00 11-535	Drill Press Jet-13R needs motor , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$10	MFG#: 54273
42.50 11-536	Grease Pump Aro Grease Pump w/ gear oil , , , , , Poor		\$1	
15.00 11-537	Harness, hoses MSA workman harness 2 hoses, 1 harness , , , , , Fair		\$1	Harness: Q0022
11.00 11-538	Headlight Alignment Hoppy , , , , , Fair		\$1	
41.00 11-539	Jack Strongarm - 20 Ton doesn't lift , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$10	
12.85 11-540	Jack Strongarm - 20 Ton doesn't lift , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$10	
311.00 11-541	Jack Titan - 22 Ton works, air hydraulic, has small hole for attachments , , , , , Fair		\$10	
56.00 11-542	Jack Unknown works, piston is rusty and pitted , , , , , Poor		\$10	

Item #	Description	Km	Min. price	Serial Number
55.00 11-543	Ladder AGF, rolling, safety 27" tall , , , , , Poor		\$10	
55.00 11-544	Ladder AGF, rolling, safety 27" tall , , , , , Poor		\$10	
23.00 11-545	Lockers Lot of 3 76" tall, 12" wide, 15" deep , , , , , Fair		\$10	
29.00 11-546	Misc. Items 6" vice, assorted air oiler, outlets, hoses , , , , , Poor		\$1	
46.00 11-547	Misc. Items Nibbler, bender, electric water pipe freeze protection cable , , , , , Fair		\$1	
Renege * 11-548	Pedestal Grinder King 8" Pedestal Grinder , , , , , Fair		\$10	Model: KC-880
334.00 11-549	Plasma Cutter Hypertherm Powermax600 Worked when last used , , , , , Fair		\$10	PMX600-02009
*WD 11-519	Tandem Truck 2000 Mack RD688S Gravel truck, tandem axle, gravel box 6 l, diesel manual A/C, tilt, cruise, 14ft box, 4x4, Yellow, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. **Please note: the SGI Inspection posted below is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection form.** , PROBLEMS: Cross chain floor, and top of fram rusted away, passanger door rusted out on bottom. Motor and trans run ok, brakes, body, windshield/wipers, lights, interior, paint and mirros in fair condition. Tires, horn and battery all in poor condition.>, As is, Where is	462,475 km	\$500	1M2P267C5YM049822
NORTH BATTLEFORD, Highways 502 114th Street.				
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Mark Eisenkirch 306-526-9103 email: mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca				
1,707.00 11-520	Gravel Truck 2005 Sterling LT 9511 Gravel truck, tandem axle, gravel box 6 l, diesel, MBE-4000 manual A/C, tilt, cruise, Yellow, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. **Please note: the SGI Inspection posted below is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection form.** , PROBLEMS: Blown front differential, no hydraulic controls or valves, rotted out box, blower fan non-operational, front steer brake pots leaking, power steering leak, hydraulic leaks, air leak, rear backing plates need replacement, 3 universal joints loose, loose steady bearing, leaking box cylinder, stab link bushings wore out. Motor, transmission, lights and mirrors in good conditioin. Tires, brakes, windshield, wipers, interior, and horn in fair condition. Exterior, paint, and battery all poor condition. Horn is unknown.>, As is, Where is	460,666 km	\$1,500	2FZHAZCVX5AN89570
OUTLOOK, Agriculture, Crops and Irrigation, 410 Saskatchewan Avenue W.				
Contact Heather Duczak-Reynolds 306-867-5527 or 306-541-4408, heather.duczak-reynolds@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 10-508	File Cabinets lot of 3 vertical, 4 drawer 18"W x 28"D x 51"H, lock and key, beige or dark grey , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 10-509	File Cabinets lot of 3 vertical, 4 drawer 18"W x 28"D x 51"H, lock and key, beige or dark grey , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 10-510	File Cabinets lot of 3 vertical, 4 drawer 18"W x 28"D x 51"H, lock and key, beige or dark grey , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 10-511	File Cabinets lot of 3 vertical, 4 drawer 18"W x 28"D x 51"H, lock and key, beige or dark grey , , , , , Fair		\$1	

Item #	Description	Km	Min. price	Serial Number
No Bid * 10-512	File Cabinets lot of 3 vertical, 4 drawer 18"W x 28"D x 51"H, lock and key, beige or dark grey , , , , , Fair		\$1	
PIKE LAKE, Parks, Culture and Sports, Operations, Call for physical location				
Contact Dwight Martin 306-250-8490 dwight.martin@gov.sk.ca				
39.94 9-556	Blue water pump Gorman Rupp Diaphragm Pump with 5 hp Briggs and Stratton engine. Non-functional , , , , , Good		\$1	Dura Blue 1000
18.50 9-563	Floor Jack Model # G1300 2 ton hydraulic floor jack. Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1	
PRINCE ALBERT, Justice Corrections and Policing, Prince Albert Correctional Centre 3021 1st Ave West				
Don Balan donald.balan@gov.sk.ca 306-953-3000 or Dean Schmalz dean.schmalz@gov.sk.ca 306-953-3039				
175.00 9-507	Bar Bells Assorted Metal Operational/Fixed Plates Attached. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , , #9 Renege, Poor		\$1	
225.00 9-508	Bar Bells Assorted, Metal Operational/Fixed Plates Attached. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , , #9 Renege, Poor		\$1	
*WD 9-511	Bench Metal/Plastic Operational. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , , Poor		\$1	
837.00 11-524	Canvas Quonset wooden door, steel poles single man door. 20-30 feet, estimate , , , , , Poor		\$1	
87.77 9-521	Squat Rack Metal Operational. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , , Poor		\$1	
46.00 9-523	Tower of Power Metal/Plastic Bench Operational/No Pull Up Bar Attached. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , , Poor		\$1	
PRINCE ALBERT, Justice Corrections and Policing, Prince Albert Correctional Centre 3021 1st Ave West				
Contact Candice Dawson 306-953-300, candice.dawson@gov.sk.ca				
6.00 11-553	Bathroom Scale electronic new in box , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
6.00 11-554	Bathroom Scale electronic new in box , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
5.00 11-555	Bathroom Scale mechanical new in box , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
5.00 11-556	Bathroom Scale mechanical new in box , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
6.80 11-557	Bed Tray Beachwood new in box , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
6.00 11-558	Popcorn Popper Rival electric popcorn popper new in box , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
6.00 11-559	Popcorn Popper Rival electric popcorn popper new in box , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
5.00 11-560	Popcorn Popper Rival electric popcorn popper new in box , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
5.00 11-561	Popcorn Popper Rival electric popcorn popper new in box , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
6.00 11-562	Popcorn Popper Rival electric popcorn popper new in box , , , , , Excellent		\$5	
PRINCE ALBERT, Highways, Northern Operations, 81 North Industrial Dr.				
Contact Cory Palko 306-960-5152 email: cory.palko@gov.sk.ca.				
1,780.00 11-550	20 Ton Tilt Trailer 1989 Armco 20 ton Flat Deck Tilt Trailer Tandem axle, tire size: 255 70R22.5 , , , , , Frame Damage from corrosion. Brakes, paint and lights are fair, Body exterior is poor. ,		\$100	P4KZ000133, VIN Illegible

Item #	Description	Km	Min. price	Serial Number
REGINA, Justice, Court of Appeal, 2425 Victoria Avenue.				
Contact Ryley Hobbs 306-787-3107 rhobbs@sasklawcourts.ca or Scott Polowyk 306-787-5437, spolowyk@sasklawcourts.ca				
25.01	10-516 Dell Power Supply RPS720 external power supply 19", 720W, 4 DC out. , , , , , New - Unused		\$1	
8.00	10-521 Tape Rack Dell PowerVault 114T and rackmount rails purchased 2008 storage removed. For more information on this product check the following link with the serial number: https://www.dell.com/support/home/en-ca Item is heavy and purchaser must be able to move/load/transport without assistance. , , , , , Beyond Repair		\$1	3H5CJD1
ROWAN'S RAVINE Provincial Park, Parks, Culture and Sport, Call for directions.				
Contact Tim Gelinias 306-725-5200, tim.gelinias@gov.sk.ca or Abby Fuller 306-725-5200, abby.fuller@gov.sk.ca.				
No Bid *	11-523 Executive Office Suite corner piece - 42"; LR 60"x30"; RR 48"x30"; circle table 60" diameter, 34" base at widest; 2 Dark brown , , , , , Fair		\$1	
	11-521 File Cabinet Lateral, 3 drawer, Metal 42"Hx19.5"Wx36"L. no key , , , , , Fair		1	
10.00	11-522 File Organization Lot Lot of 6 Mesh, black plastic, metal One Set book ends, desk organizers, desk top organizers, mesh filing tray, metal basket, desk , , , , , Fair		\$1	
ROWAN'S RAVINE Provincial Park, Parks, Culture and Sport, Call for directions.				
Contact Tim Gelinias 306-725-5200, tim.gelinias@gov.sk.ca or Abby Fuller 306-725-5200, abby.fuller@gov.sk.ca.				
285.71	11-525 Aerator Land Pride 3-point PTO ground aerator, rusty , , , , , Good		\$1	326008
No Bid *	11-526 Sprayer HARDI, Tow behind for quads , , , , , Fair		\$1	B1700&300
SASKATOON, Environment, Compliance and Field Services, 101-112 Research Dr.				
Contact Michelle Baran 306-933-6240, saskatoon.field@gov.sk.ca				
57.99	11-527 Pressure Washer Panther doesn't work well, low pressure , , , , , Fair		\$1	MB513010
SASKATOON, Highways 126 105th St E				
Contact Richard Leibel 306-933-5262 email: Richard.Leibel@gov.sk.ca				
1,555.00	9-535 Trailer Majestic 2007 L235 16ft Utility Deck boards busted, deck supports bent and broken, lights and plug not working, brakes seized and unit is badly rusted , , , , , Poor		\$1	2M9FS42737R151319
SASKATOON, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, Corporate Services, 122 3rd Ave.				
Contact Karen Paulson 306-933-5295, karen.paulson@gov.sk.ca or Sandra Falk 306-933-5395, sandra.falk@gov.sk.ca				
15.00	11-528 Tow Rope Redi-Pull , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	11-529 Chair plastic frame, blue fabric 5 castor legs , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	11-530 Table Rectangular, wood grain top. metal legs, 30" X 57" , , , , , Fair		\$1	
10.21	11-531 Table Square, wood 24" X 30" , , , , , Poor		\$1	
SASKATOON, Saskatchewan Research Council, 2901 Cleveland Avenue.				
Contact Roger Dauvin 306-385-4035, roger.dauvin@src.sk.ca				
755.00	11-532 Surface Grinder/Polisher R.Luscher FA000328. WS400. 1967. Green in Colour , , , , , Fair		\$750	1003

Item #	Description	Km	Min. price	Serial Number
WADENA, Environment, 77 1st Street NE				
Contact Dale Achtymichuk, 306-338-8184, dale.achtymichuk@gov.sk.ca or Scott harvey 306-338-8174 scott.harvey@gov.sk.ca				
83.00 * 11-551	Gun Cabinet Wooden, locking, gun cabinet, home built Overall height: 74.25" Top: 13.5 L "X33.5 W "X52.75 H " Base:19.5L "X33.5 W "X21.5 H" , , , , , Good		\$1	n/a
46.50 * 11-552	Gun Cabinet Wooden, locking, gun cabinet, home built Overall height: 74.25" Top: 13.5 L "X33.5 W "X52.75 H" Base: 19.5 L "X33.5 W "X21.5 H" , , , , , Good		\$1	n/a
WEYBURN, Agriculture, RSB, 113-110 Souris Avenue.				
Contact Karen Hennig 306-848-2373, karen.hennig@gov.sk.ca Or Darla Kwochka 306-848-2857				
No Bid * 10-529	Califone stand metal Stand 37-59" and mounting bracket 7"x11" . , , , , , Good		\$10	
*WD 10-533	File Cabinet lateral, five drawer operational. Metal - 51"H x 36"W x 18"D - missing drawer face. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Fair		\$1	
*WD 10-534	File Cabinet lateral, five drawer operational. Metal - 64.5"H x 36"W 17.5"D. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Fair		\$1	
51.00 10-542	File Cabinet lateral, four drawer operational metal- 53"H x 36"W x 19"D. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Good		\$1	
51.00 10-543	File Cabinet lateral, four drawer operational metal- 53"H x 36"W x 19"D. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Good		\$1	
No Bid * 10-532	Slide Projector Kodak Ektagraphic III Comes with case, user manual and slide advancer. 14" high x 14.75" wide x 9" depth , , , , , Good		\$10	A-569034
WEYBURN, Highways & Infrastructure, Fleet Services, 680 Regina Ave.				
Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca				
2,777.77 11-533	Roller 1980, MCINTY, WP67 13 wheel tow type roller, Yellow, functional , , , , , Fair		\$1	7004
YORKTON, Highways, Fleet Services, 245 York Road East.				
Contact Brian Perih 306-786-1651 or Ed Patzwald 06-786-1687 email: brian.perih@gov.sk.ca or ed.patzwald@gov.sk.ca.				
777.77 2-583	Gravel Truck 1999 Volvo WG64 Tandem Truck Volvo VED12B, 6 cylinder, diesel Eaton Fuller RTX14710B Motor has leaks, transmission, exhaust, battery, paint and interior are fair. Tires, brakes and lights are poor. Exterior, windshield and wipers are good, including mirrors and horn. 197 wheel base, dual tires, Yellow, , , PROBLEMS: a lot of hydraulic leaks; coolant leaks; cross members need replacing as they are cracked; front pins and bushings need replacing; main and cross chain need repair work; a lot of air leaks; electrical needs repair; rear shocks need replacing; oil pan gasket needs replacing; needs new fender brackets; unit has no box. >, As is, Where is	14,578 hours	\$1,500	4VHJCAGF9XN865383