

Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to (306)787-2092; by phone (306)787-2062 or (306)787-2238,
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT (Ministry Transfer) ---- This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred.

WD (Withdrawn) ----- This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller,

No Bid ----- Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref #	
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles							
Contact SaskSurplus (306) 787-2062 or (306) 798-3306.							
5,389.89	12-001	SUV 2008 JEEP Liberty 4x4, 4 door, 5 passenger 3.7L V6 Gas auto air, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 264,810 km power windows, locks, mirrors, keyless entry- 2 key fobs hitch, trailer wiring, green, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 264,810 km, , PROBLEMS: Rough idle, driver door pins do not lineup, glove box broken, rear back rest will not fold down, rust on rear tailgate hinges, hole in grille, front bumper has chips and scratches, front right fender flare has scratches, left front door has loose molding, windshield chipped, front seats missing trim, roof has small rust spots and scratches, battery is poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	264,810 km	\$2,700	1J8GN28K18W251774	CVA	443101
*MT	12-002	Truck 2014 DODGE Ram 1500 SLT 4x4, crew cab, 6'4" box, has a back seat 5.7L V8 Gas auto air, tilt, 310,650 km cruise, AM/FM/Bluetooth, keyless entry- 2 key fobs, power windows, doors, locks, driver seat, heated mirrors, sliding rear window, trailer tow mirrors box rail protectors, grille inserts, side steps, front tow hooks, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, white, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 310,650 km , , PROBLEMS: Front pads and rotors, drive belt requires attention, windshield cracked, hood paint peeling and bubbling, tailgate dents/rust/molding cracked, left front inner fender damaged, right front bumper badly rusted, right rear bumper has small dents, left front fender road rash/rust, left rear fender has dents, left rear door has dents, right front mud flap missing, both box rail protectors loose and holes drilled, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	310,650 km	\$4,350	1C6RR7TT8ES200414	CVA	800123
12,777.77	12-003	Truck 2009 DODGE Ram 5500 RWD, quad cab, dual rear wheels, has a back seat 6.7L V8 Diesel auto air, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows and locks, trailer tow mirrors, 2 key fobs, keyless entry, 8'6" x 10'2" dump body with steel fold down sides (rusty - condition unknown) hitch, trailer brake wiring, side steps, grille inserts, arrow board with hazard lights (condition unknown), remote wired inside cab, liftgate with tailgate/platform in box (condition unknown), white, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 462,695 km 10,129 hours, , PROBLEMS: Check engine light P0471 - exhaust pressure sensor 1 low, exhaust missing from rear axle backwards, drive belt cracked, hood has chips, front bumper dented, front fender chipped, left front door dented, plate light inoperable, missing spare tire and wrench/jack, no extinguisher or hazard kit, windshield chips, right front seat has a hole, road rash on cab corners, tar on roof, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	462,695 km 10,129 hours	\$6,900	3D6WC78L99G554343	CVA	517326

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref #
6,689.89 12-004	Truck 2013 FORD F250 Superduty 2WD, extended cab, 6'9" box with box liner, has a back seat 6.2L V8 Gas auto air, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power front windows/locks, heated mirrors, keyless entry- 2 key fobs front tow hooks, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, headache rack, white, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 332,589 km , , PROBLEMS: Rear shocks and exhaust manifold require attention, TPMS light on, windshield is chipped and cracked, rear fenders have chips, rust and road rash, tailgate is chipped and dented, rear bumper has rust spots and chips, hood chips, left front door has loose weather stripping, left front mirror has a hole in housing, left front seat worn, back seat soiled, left box rail bent, holes drilled in box rails, plate lights need replacement, spare tire is loose in box (unsure if compatible with vehicle), battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	332,589 km	\$5,850	1FT7X2A60DEB48554	CVA	800071
18,900.00 12-005	Truck 2012 FORD F550 4x4, super cab, dual rear wheels 6.8L V10 Gas auto air, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 2 sets of keys for vehicle warwick ladder (condition unknown), Brand FX service body (condition unknown), HD rear bumper, pintle hook, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, front tow hooks, side steps, trailer tow mirrors, keys for accessories, inspection and service manual, white, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 276,170 km, Recent Repairs: fuel cap replaced, left front door repairs, engine stalled and would not stay running (problem may reappear), PROBLEMS: Engine light on, rear wheels bolt holes damaged (wheels may come loose if driven), traction control light on, right exhaust manifold lower bolts missing, front rotors rusted, windshield is cracked, no wheel chocks, pintle hook seized, rust on cab corners, left front door road rash, left rear door rust/road rash, front bumper is rusty, rear bumper bent, right front door road rash/rust at bottom, hood has chips/dents and scratches, left front seat worn/cushion & frame visible, rear seat and seat belts missing, roof top cab lights not working, roof has dents and rust spots, jack missing, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	276,170 km	\$11,875	1FD0X5HY0CEA99327	CVA STEL	517862 627592

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref #
5,850.00 12-006	Truck 1985 GMC C6000 RWD, regular cab, dual rear wheels, bucket truck (condition of bucket components unknown) 366 CID / 6L V8 Gas manual (5 speed, 2 speed axle) AM Radio, 2 sets of keys Wajax service body (rusted, poor condition), Pitman hotstik 7 man lift (condition unknown), front tow hooks, HD rear bumper, 2 saddle gas tanks, wheel chaulks, safety cones, orange, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 89,803 km, , PROBLEMS: Power steering leak at brake pressure sensor, fuel leak at carburator, brake fluid leak near master cylinder, front struts leaking, coolant leak, transmission leak, blower motor noisy/cuts out (needs repair or replacement), accelerator pedal pad missing, missing wiper blades, windshield cracked, driver door saging/doesn't close properly- hinges are loose, service body rusted, front fenders rusting, grille is cracked/broken, right front door bent, washer nozzle non-operational, side mirror lamps out, left front seat ripped, hood is scratched, paint faded, roof has dents, battery poor condition, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	89,803 km	\$2,850	1GDG6D1B8FV631669	CVA	801555
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.						
Contact SaskSurplus (306) 787-2062 or (306) 798-3306.						
75.00 12-120	Arrow Light for Traffic Control Manufactured by SWS, Model 5800 48 inches X 10 inches, comes with controller and cables. May not be complete. May not be operational. , , , , Fair		\$25		CVA	381
20.00 11-106	File Cabinet wood, lateral, 2 drawer 30" W x 18 " D x 29" H, no keys , , , , Good		\$1		SaskSurplus	334
20.00 11-107	File Cabinet wood, lateral, 2 drawer 30" W x 18 " D x 29" H, no keys , , , , Good		\$1		SaskSurplus	335
1.77 11-108	File folders lot of 116 Hanging, used various colors, 9" x 15" , , , , Poor		\$1		SaskSurplus	7
No Bid * 12-114	Hitch OEM Ford (receiver) with mounting bolts black in color, accepts a 2 inch draw bar. May be compatible with a 2005 Ford E350. , , , , Good		\$50		CVA	374
40.01 12-115	Hitch OEM Ford (receiver), NO mounting bolts black in color, accepts a 2 inch draw bar. May be compatible with a 2006 Ford E350. , , , , Good		\$40		CVA	375
No Bid * 12-116	Hitch OEM Ford (receiver), with mounting bolts black in color, accepts a 2 inch draw bar. May be compatible with a 2006 Ford E350. , , , , Good		\$50		CVA	376
No Bid * 12-117	Hitch OEM Ford (receiver), with mounting bolts and trailer wiring black in color, accepts a 2 inch draw bar. May be compatible with a 2008 Ford E350. , , , , Good		\$60		CVA	377
201.00 12-103	OEM rear bumper chrome May be compatible with a 2004 Chev Silverado , , , , Good		\$100		CVA	364
*WD * 12-104	OEM tailgate yellow in color May be compatible with a 2004 Chev. Siverado 3500 extended cab. May not be complete. , , , , Good		\$200	A04007	CVA	361

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref #
No Bid * 12-105	OEM tailgate yellow in color May be compatible with a 2004 Chev. Siverado 3500 extended cab. May not be complete. , , , , Good		\$200		CVA	362
*WD * 12-106	OEM tailgate yellow in color May be compatible with a 2004 Chev. Siverado 3500 extended cab. May not be complete. , , , , Good		\$200		CVA	363
No Bid 10-110	Seat 3rd row seat, seats 2 people Removed from a 2009 Dodge Durango, grey cloth , , , , Fair		\$1	434,842	CVA	198
No Bid 10-111	Seat Bench seat. Cloth. Grey 52 inches in length. May be compatible with a 2004 Ford Econoline E150. , , , , Poor		\$1		CVA	216
5.00 10-113	Seats Lot of 2 Bench seats, grey, cloth 1-53 inch seat, 1-63 inch seat. May be compatible with a 2004 E350 extended van. , , , , Fair		\$1	422,121	CVA	222
No Bid 10-114	Seats Lot of 2 Bench seats, grey, cloth Both seats are 53 inches in length. May be compatible with a 2004 Chev Astro van. , , , , Fair		\$1	190,470	CVA	223
No Bid 10-115	Seats Lot of 2 Bench seats, grey, cloth Both seats are 53 inches in length. May be compatible with a 2006 E350 extended van. , , , , Fair		\$1	422,485	CVA	224
No Bid 10-112	Seats Lot of 2 2nd row and 3rd row seat. 2nd row seats 3, 3rd row seats 2. Removed from a 2009 Dodge Durango, grey cloth. , , , , Fair		\$15	434,883	CVA	199
21.00 11-116	Shovels lot of 4 Miscellaneous, plastic scoop various lengths, 28-36 inches , , , , Fair		\$1		CVA	232
No Bid * 12-118	Spare Tire 16 inch, 135/70R/16, Continental compact temporary spare on a steel rim. May be compatible with a 2008 Chev Uplander. , , , , Good		\$10		CVA	378
No Bid * 12-119	Spare Tire 16 inch, 135/70R/16, Continental compact temporary spare on a steel rim. May be compatible with a 2008 Chev Uplander. , , , , Good		\$10		CVA	379
421.00 12-101	Tailgate OEM, metal, white in color May be compatible with a 2007-2013 Chevrolet Silverado , , , , Good		\$200		CVA	366
422.00 12-102	Tailgate OEM, metal, white in color May be compatible with a 2007-2013 Chevrolet Silverado , , , , Good		\$200		CVA	367
50.00 12-124	Tailgate OEM GMC Sierra, white. Some dents. Bent. Can be used for parts. May be compatible with a 2008 GMC Sierra. , , , , Poor		\$25		CVA	380
80.20 1-123	Tire 16 inch 225/60R/16, Winter Claw Extreme Grip. M+S. Manufacture date: week 24, year 2014. , , , , Good		\$40		CVA	SS3608
185.75 2-108	Tires Set of 4 16 inch, 215/65R/16 , Sumitomo Ice Edge, Snow flake, manufacture date- week 23, year 2017 , , , , Good		\$160		CVA	SS3153
40.00 8-105	Tire 16 inch, 205/60R/16, Artic Claw Winter TKI M+S , , , , Excellent		\$40		CVA	SS3657
137.77 12-107	Tires lot of 4 17 inch, P225/55R/17, Firestone FR710. M+S. Manufacture date: week 05, year 2015. , , , , Fair		\$120		CVA	365
125.00 12-108	Tires lot of 4 16 inch, P225/60R/16, Firestone All Season, M+S. Manufacture date: week 31, year 2017. , , , , Fair		\$120		CVA	368
*MT 12-109	Tires lot of 4 16 inch, P225/65R/16, Sumitomo Ice Edge, Snow Flake. Manufacture date: week 21, year 2018. , , , , Excellent		\$250		CVA	371

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref #
No Bid * 12-110	Tire 17 inch, P225/55R/17, Firestone All Season, M+S. Manufacture date: week 44, year 2019. , , , , Good		\$50		CVA	373
141.00 12-111	Tires lot of 4 17 inch, P225/55R/17, Goodyear Assurance. M+S. Manufacture date: week 29, year 2017. , , , , Fair		\$120		CVA	369
166.78 12-112	Tires lot of 4 17 inch, P235/65R/17, Continental Cross Contact RX, M+S. Manufacture date: week 42, year 2020. , , , , Good		\$160		CVA	370
No Bid * 12-113	Tire 17 inch, P245/70R/17, General Grabber HTS, M+S. Manufacture date: week 30, year 2015. , , , , Good		\$50		CVA	372
No Bid * 12-125	Tonneau Cover for Truck Box Retractable. Fabric-condition unknown. Included 5 pieces of trim . Mounting bracket broken. Parts maybe missing. Maybe compatible with a 2004 Chev Silverad , , , , Broken Repairable		\$20		CVA	385
No Bid * 11-127	TV Samsung 14" screen, unsure if operational , , , , Poor		\$1	CT-3371XVM	SaskSurplus	1
No Bid * 12-121	Warning Triangle Kit Grote 3 weighted triangles , , , , Fair		\$5		CVA	382
No Bid * 12-122	Warning Triangle Kit Grote 3 weighted triangles , , , , Fair		\$5		CVA	383
5.01 12-123	Warning Triangle Kit Grote 3 weighted triangles , , , , Fair		\$5		CVA	384
1,010.10 12-126	Trailer utility, 1993 Wylie mechanical cable dolly, pintle eye hook up, tongue jack, hand cable winch, RV flat blade trailer connection, 225/75 R15 tires, has two rear stablizer stands, has a small reel bar, 83 inches wide, 10.5 feet long, 2700 lb , , , , Good		\$500	2W9MD12B8P1005023	STEL	934972
850.00 12-127	Trailer utility, 1990 Mallard mechanical cable dolly, pintle eye hook up, hand cable winch, has a tongue jack, RV flat blade trailer connection, two 7.00 x 1515 tires, has a small reel bar, has spare tire on tongue, 83 inches wide, 10.5 feet long, 2700 lb. , , , , Good		\$500	2D94R8DF5L1010270	STEL	904689
601.00 12-128	Trailer cable splice, enclosed, 1979, home built pintle eye hook up, RV style flat blade connection, has tongue jack, 6 door compartments, front lower compartment has a roll out tray for generator, upper slide out for parts, storage compartment on rear bumper, middle compartment is open, rear compartment has slide out tray, rack on top for 10 ft ladder, top measurement is 93" x 61" across, overall length is 137", P205/75R15 tires, uses a Ch504 key for the locks, key will be tied on the back bar. , , , , Good		\$500		79,102 STEL	991887
1,128.90 12-129	Trailer reel, 1982 Brandt hydraulic cable dolly, pintle eye hook up, 3 hydraulic pump jacks, one for lifting the tongue, two to lift the arms, RV 6 pin flat style connection, two rear stabilizer jacks, tires 1200 x 20 14 ply, has a one small & one large reel bar, length 196 inches, 101 inches wide, 14,000 lb dolly. , , , , Good		\$500		1,706 STEL	920790
10.01 11-150	Chair blue, with wooden arms and legs wooden , , , , Fair		\$1		ATC	250

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref #
2.01 11-146	Chair lever controls partially working task , , , , Poor		\$1		ATC	255
2.01 11-147	Chair lever controls partially working task , , , , Poor		\$1		ATC	256
2.01 11-148	Chair lever controls partially working task , , , , Poor		\$1		ATC	257
2.01 11-149	Chair lever controls partially working task , , , , Poor		\$1		ATC	258
21.01 11-151	Chairs Lot of 2 one grey, one brown arm , , , , Fair		\$1		ATC	251
45.00 9-101	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Left Hand L-shaped,locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled - joining brackets may not be included* , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI	
55.00 11-128	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Right Hand L-shaped,locks but no keys , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI	246
25.00 11-129	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d, 2 drawer bank, 3 drawer bank, locks but no keys , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI	245
101.75 11-523	Executive Office Suite corner piece - 42"; LR 60"x30"; RR 48"x30"; circle table 60" diameter, 34" base at widest; 2 Dark brown , , , , Fair		\$1		LRWS	42023
33.10 11-152	File cabinet no keys, scuffed and scratched 4 drawer, vertical, metal , , , , Fair		\$1		ATC	260
33.10 11-153	File cabinet no keys, scuffed and scratched 4 drawer, vertical, metal , , , , Fair		\$1		ATC	261
33.10 11-154	File cabinet no keys, scuffed and scratched 4 drawer, vertical, metal , , , , Fair		\$1		ATC	262
33.10 11-155	File cabinet no keys, scuffed and scratched 4 drawer, vertical, metal , , , , Fair		\$1		ATC	263
50.00 11-156	File cabinet no keys, scuffed and scratched 4 drawer, vertical, metal , , , , Fair		\$1		ATC	264
50.00 11-159	File cabinet no keys, scuffed and scratched 4 drawer, vertical, metal , , , , Fair		\$1		ATC	267
11.01 11-164	Pedestal 3 drawer, with drafting pull out metal , , , , Fair		\$1		ATC	270
*MT 4-120	Pedestal 3 drawers, wood Pepper dust 17"W x 25.5"D x 27.5"H, on casters , , , , Fair		\$1		SaskSurplus	X-373

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref #
*MT 4-127	Pedestal 3 drawers, wood Pepper dust 17"W x 25.5"D x 27.5"H, on casters , , , , Fair		\$1		SaskSurplus	X-388
*MT 4-118	Pedestal 3 drawers, wood Pepperdust 17"W x 25.5"D x 27.5"H, on casters , , , , Fair		\$1		SaskSurplus	X-371
40.00 4-135	Whiteboard Bordered by wood trim 49.5"W x 5"D x 35.5"H , , , , Fair		\$1		SaskSurplus	ss3315
40.00 4-137	Whiteboard Bordered by wood trim 49.5"W x 5"D x 35.5"H , , , , Fair		\$1		SaskSurplus	ss3317
BUFFALO NARROWS, Highways, 1900 Cummings Drive.						
Contact Mark Eisenkirch, mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca						
5,401.00 12-507	Broom Tractor 1990 New Holland 8530 2WD 401 CID, Inline 4, diesel 16x4 dual power synchronization A/C, tilt, broom 16 speed, locking differential, single tires, tire size: 11.0016.5 front, 18.4 38 rear., yellow, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 7029 hrs, , PROBLEMS: battery, windshield washer and wipers all in poor condition. Hours of unit may not be accurate, unsure if hour meter works, hydraulics slow when cold., As is, Where is	7029 hrs	\$1,000	A928602	HI	B91010
CHRISTOPHER LAKE, Environment, 379 Main Street.						
Contact Bonnie Greene 306-961-3210, bonnie.greene@gov.sk.ca or Jonas Sylvestre 306-930-7284, jonas.sylvestre@gov.sk.ca						
382.00 12-501	Boat Motor Mercury, outboard 9.8 hp. 1990's Outboard engine. Did not start last spring. Not sure why, nothing was tried. , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	7,211,427 ENV		1
DANIELSON PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks Culture and Sport, Box 39						
Contact Karen Fiske 306-854-6271, karen.fiske@gov.sk.ca						
2,795.90 12-502	Boat and Trailer 18' V-hull, Aluminum TOW ONLY - 1976 Lund boat, 70 hp Mercury motor and trailer unknown if motor works, propeller is not attached, boat interior needs to be rebuilt, fuel tank unusable, single axle trailer , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	ZLU01039G76A - boat, G#-12344 TC Reg. #	Parks	3
No Bid * 11-505	Electric Mower Black & Decker, LM100 18", 7amps - unknown if it works , , , , Poor		\$1	0216C	Parks	4
15.00 11-517	Lawn Sweeper with bag attachment Craftsman, Light Duty 32" Pull behind sweeper attachment for lawn clippings and light debris , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	SK9834	Parks	12
44.00 12-503	Mitre Saw Makita LS1020 255mm Operational when it was placed into storage. , , , , Poor		\$1	259345E ?14-75-88 SERM	Parks	2
11.27 11-511	Propane Heater PowerFist 49600 BTU Forced Air. Non operational , , , , Fair		\$1	361,301,984	Parks	1
356.00 12-504	Table Saw 2004 Delta 10" Professional Table saw, kill switch doesn't work, missing guard, newer 2 hp motor , , , , Broken Repairable		\$50	010624 Q30C4	Parks	1

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref #
156.00 11-548	Pedestal Grinder King 8" Pedestal Grinder , , , , Fair		\$10	Model: KC-880	HI	11
11,700.00 12-508	Trailer, Flat Deck 2007 Majestik 20 ton tandem, dual tires, tire size LT225/70R22.5 has a bent frame - will not pass SGI inspection (see inspection attached). Otherwise, mechanically in good shape., yellow, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. , , , As is, Where is		\$250	2M9FSA2T37R151224	HI	E07003
23,657.00 12-509	Grader 2003 Deere 770CH Series 2 RWD 8.1L 6081HDW10, Inline 6, diesel PowerShift A/C speeds: 11,593 hrs 8 forward, 8 reverse, tandem axle, locking differential, single tires, tire size: 17.5R25, yellow, 11,593 hrs, , PROBLEMS: transmission poor - will derate into first gear. Air ride seat doesn't work, packer seen in photo does not sell with unit., As is, Where is	11,593 hrs	\$15,000	DW770CH584668	HI	C03003
30,253.00 12-510	Wheel Loader 2001 Case 621C 4WD Cummins 6T-590, Inline 6, diesel ZF automatic A/C single axle, 6515 hrs, 4 speed, single tires, tires size: 20.5R25, 12 ply. Standard locking differential., orange, 6515 hrs, showing , , PROBLEMS: Brakes, battery and body exterior are all in poor condition. Rust rotting though bottom of the cab and spread to the Rollover Protection Structures (ROPS). Brake valve sticking., As is, Where is	6515 hrs	\$15,000	JEE0122869	HI	B01009
15,250.00 12-511	Motor Grader 2009 Deere 770D RWD 8.1L, Inline 6, diesel PowerShift A/C, blade float tandem axle, speeds: 8 forward, 8 reverse, locking differential, single tires, tire size: 17.5R25. 2' blade extention on left hand side, front mounted ripper., yellow, 13,791 hrs, , PROBLEMS: Motor, transmisson, tires and battery all in poor condition. Transmission is seized, engine has blow-by, 24-12v inverter has been removed., As is, Where is	13,791 hrs	\$2,500	DW770DX621311	HI	C09001
2,300.00 12-512	Bridge Crane Truck 1979 Little Giant IHC C537 RWD V8, gas manual power divider lock mobile crane with outriggers, tandem axle, 25,500 kg, 13 speed, standard differential. Single front tires, dual rear tires, tire size: 12.00X20, 16 ply., yellow, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 24,190 km, , PROBLEMS: battery in poor conditon, unit has been sitting for quite some time, operational condition unknown. Both right hand outriggers leak, both engines hard to start due to lack of use., As is, Where is	24,190 km	\$1	7,904,487,845	HI	D79002
2,885.15 12-513	Gravel Truck 2000 Mack RD688S RWD 12L E7-350, Inline 6, diesel Eaton AutoShift A/C, cruise, heated mirror, engine brake tandem axle, 39500 kg, 10 speed, standard locking differential. Dual rear wheels, 385/65R 22.5, 11R 22.5, 214 wheel base., yellow, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 493,445 km, , PROBLEMS: Rear tires, brakes, battery, body exterior, whindshield washer and wipers, paint, interior all in poor condition. Frame is in need of repair to pass SGI inspection, seized S-cam, hydraulic controls removed and no longer able to operate hydraulics., As is, Where is	493,445 km	\$500	1M2P267C4YM049827	HI	D00017

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref #
10,255.00 12-514	Plow/Dump Truck 1999 Volvo WG64 RWD VED 12B, Inline 6, Diesel Eaton Fuller A/C, cruise, heated mirrors tandem axle, 10 speed, 24,300 kg, engine brake, standard, locking differential, dual tires, tire size: 425/65R22.5, 11R22.5, 197 wheel base, yellow, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 194,887 km, , PROBLEMS: Rear differential has been taken apart and needs to be rebuilt, battery poor., As is, Where is	194,887 km	\$2,500	4VHJCAGF3XN865377	HI	D99002
PRINCE ALBERT, Justice Corrections and Policing, Prince Albert Correctional Centre 3021 1st Ave West Don Balan donald.balan@gov.sk.ca 306-953-3000 or Dean Schmalz dean.schmalz@gov.sk.ca 306-953-3039						
21.01 9-511	Bench Metal/Plastic Operational. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , Poor		\$1		CPPS	13
ROWAN'S RAVINE Provincial Park, Parks, Culture and Sport, Call for directions. Contact Tim Gelinis 306-725-5200, tim.gelinis@gov.sk.ca or Abby Fuller 306-725-5200, abby.fuller@gov.sk.ca						
285.85 12-505	Mower Land Pride 3-point PTO, unsure if operational , , , , Poor		\$1	307,527	Parks	1
444.56 12-506	Rototiller MISCHIO, 3 point hitch rusted, Was operational when put into storage, might need some maintenance now. , , , , Poor		\$1	A160336138	Parks	1
15.00 11-526	Sprayer HARDI, Tow behind for quads , , , , Fair		\$1	B1700&300	Parks	1
SASKATOON, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, Corporate Services, 122 3rd Ave. Contact Karen Paulson 306-933-5295, karen.paulson@gov.sk.ca or Sandra Falk 306-933-5395, sandra.falk@gov.sk.ca						
2.01 11-529	Chair plastic frame, blue fabric 5 castor legs , , , , Fair		\$1		LRWS	42046
39.00 11-530	Table Rectangular, wood grain top. metal legs, 30" X 57" , , , , Fair		\$1		LRWS	42054
11.99 10-529	Califone stand metal Stand 37-59" and mounting bracket 7"x11". , , , , Good		\$10		AG	14
21.11 10-532	Slide Projector Kodak Ektagraphic III Comes with case, user manual and slide advancer. 14" high x 14.75" wide x 9" depth , , , , Good		\$10	A-569034	AG	21

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref #
YORKTON, Highways, Fleet Services, 245 York Road East.						
Contact Brian Perih 306-786-1651, brian.perih@gov.sk.ca or Ed Patzwald 306-786-1687, ed.patzwald@gov.sk.ca						
10,777.00	12-515	7706 hrs	\$2,000	JAK0020815	HI	B90005
<p>Wheel Loader 1989 Case 621 4WD Case 6T590, V6, diesel Clarke 2 cubic yard bucket capacity, 4 speed, standard differential. 24,500 kg. Single tires, tire size: 20.5 x 25, 12 ply., orange, 7706 hrs, , PROBLEMS: Transmission, battery, exhaust, lights and horn all in poor condition. Unit needs new cab, Rollover Protection Structure (ROPS) damaged. Transmission noisy, piece of roller bearing found at bottom of transmission. Play in bucket pins, steering hinge and cylinder pins. Muffler rusted out, air seat does not work. Fuel sediment bowl is corroded, hydraulic sight glass is clouded, air pressure gauge sticks, no low air alarm, valve cover gasket leaking, air dryer filter and purge valve need replacing. Replace batteries and clean connections. Right rear four way light not working, front signal lights flash, rear signal lights do not work. Exhaust stack corroded out at bottom. Right hand window is not working. Replace belt and tensioner. Front and rear pinion seals leaking, all four wheel seals leaking. Front and rear transmission output seals leaking, park brake shoes oil soaked, need replacing. Transmission input seal leaking, under load engine stalls, fuel filter has water in it, dash does not work (no fuel gauge and no coolant temperature gauge working)., As is, Where is</p>						