

As a reminder there is **NO ONSITE VIEWING, ONLINE-ONLY VIEWINGS** of sale items.

Thank you for your cooperation.

Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to (306)787-2092; by phone (306)787-2062 or (306)787-2238,
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred.
WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller,
No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles								
Contact SaskSurplus (306) 787-2062 or (306) 798-3306.								
\$2,589.89	9-001	Car 2009 CHRYSLER Sebring 2WD 2.4L L4 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/trunk release, heated mirrors, keyless entry (2 fobs) , Silver, 195,982 Kms, , PROBLEMS: front pads & rotors, both front doors rust at bottom/inside & out, trunk lid rust, lug nut on left rear wheel "appears" loose, head liner loose, left visor clip broken, battery poor, minor exterior damage., As is, Where is	195,982 Kms	\$589	1C3LC46B09N573411	CVA	157800	2111-507
\$3,790.02	9-002	Van 2013 DODGE Grand Caravan FWD 3.6L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows (all doors)/trunk release, heated mirrors, side vent windows, rear HVAC, keyless entry (2 fobs) 7 passenger, Stow 'n go (3rd row of seats), Grey, 257,884 Kms, , PROBLEMS: rear shocks, hood hail damage/paint bubbling, roof hail damage, both left fenders scrapes/small dents, right rear fender scrape, rear bumper broken/hole, front bumper road rash, rear window scratched, scratches on both left doors, battery poor, small chips om windshield, minor exterior damage., As is, Where is	257,884 Kms	\$2,830	2C4RDGBG5DR634141	CVA	173492	2111-508
\$4,989.99	9-003	Truck 2008 FORD F250 4WD, Crew cab, 6'9" box 6.4L V8 Diesel Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power windows/locks/mirrors front tow hooks, grille inserts, side steps, mudflaps, headache rack, tailgate protector, hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, beacon, White, 184,603 Kms, , PROBLEMS: reduced engine power/intermittent (do not run for long periods), park brake won't release, fuel leaks, engine oil diluted (hint of diesel), right outer steering linkage at center link, rear fittings, rotors are a few mm above discard, secondary coolant low (no visible leaks), no windshield wash function, windshield cracked, hoist broken, front bumper dented, rear bumper rusted/pad bolted down, left rear fender rusted/dents, right rear fender rust/dents, rust on all doors and roof rust, front of box pushed to rear of cab, left top box cracked (siliconed), cab corners road rash, driver seat missing trim, battery poor, tires 14 mm, spare 13 mm (mounted in bed - has some cracking), minor exterior damage., As is, Where is	184,603 Kms	\$1,106	1FTSW21R98EE29815	CVA	433083	2111-509

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
WD	9-004	Van 2012 CHEVROLET Express Cargo 1500 AWD 5.3L V8 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, power locks/mirrors, rear aux heater, 1 key cargo barrier, wood floor, shelving, hitch, trailer brakes, trailer wiring, mud flaps, White, 124,697 Kms, , PROBLEMS: manifold leak, exhaust leak, rack leaking, front & rear pads & rotors, alignment, hood & roof small hail damage, front bumper dented - bumper pad cracked/bent, right rear fender dents, driver door dents, both rear doors large dents/crease, driver seat ripped/badly worn, driver's side mirror cracked, battery poor, 1 sealed hole in roof, minor exterior damage., As is, Where is	124,697	\$1,591	1GCSHAF42C1129910	CVA STEL	410316 227525	2111-504
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.								
Contact SaskSurplus (306) 787-2062 or (306) 798-3306.								
No Bid	* 8-164	Folding Bench Seat 2nd row, 2 person, black cloth with head rests cup holder, wheels on rear mounting frames to assist in removal, may fit a 2006 or 2007 Dodge Caravan , , , , , Fair		\$10		CVA	194	2111-469
No Bid	* 8-165	Folding Bench Seat 2nd row, 2 person, black cloth with head rests cup holder, wheels on rear mounting frames to assist in removal, may fit a 2006 or 2007 Dodge Caravan , , , , , Fair		\$10		CVA	195	2111-469
No Bid	* 8-167	Seats Lot of 4 cloth grey, may be compatible with a 2006 Ford Econoline E350, 15 passenger , , , , , Fair		\$40	422543	CVA	196	2111-469
\$125.00	* 5-138	Tires Set of 4 16 inch, 225/60R/16, Cooper Grand Touring, M+S, Manufacture date - week 48, year 2016, 6/32 tread depth , , , , , Fair		\$120		CVA	SS4299	2107-202
No Bid	* 8-163	Tires Set of 4 Sumitomo HTR Enhance. M+S 215/60R/17, Manufacture date. Week 41, year 2016. , , , , , Fair		\$120		CVA	193	2110-443
\$811.00	9-116	Trailer 1978 14,000 dolly, real type Hydraulic cable, length 196 inches, 101 inches wide, 3 hydraulic pump jacks, 1 for lifting the tongue, 2 to lift the arms, pintle eye hitch, RV flat blade style connection, 2 rear stabilizer jacks, tires 1100 x 20 14 ply, hand pumps on the side , , , , , Good		\$500	SASK90578003595	Stel	981765	2111-512
\$556.00	9-117	Trailer 1975, flat deck, home built 2 tires with side wall cracks, G78 x 15, pindle eye hitch, round pin style trailer connection, wiring poor, no tongue jack, deck 10 ft by 4 ft, width outside fender to out fender is 71 inches, cable reel frame that is removable, total length of trailer 162 inches , , , , , Fair		\$250	SASK90577000179	Stel	950758	2111-513

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
\$5,399.99	9-118	Trailer 2008 Saturn Industries ltd, Tandem/Flat Deck Trailer deck wood is in good shape, 5 tires LT235/80 R16, 5 D rings welded on floor on each side for tie down, spare tire mounted on tongue with guard, Rv style flat bladed trailer connection, pindle eye hitch, has tongue jack, width 103 inchs out side fender to outside fende, 17 ft long deck, tongue is 63 inches, total length of trailer is 267 inches long, equilizer bracket welded on tongue. , , , , , Good		\$500	2S917B3238W010055	Stel	987180	2111-514
\$545.22	9-119	Trailer 1979, Enclosed, Home Built Tires 225 /75 R15, Rv style flat blade trailer connection, pindle eye hitch, has tongue jack, front lower compartment has roll out for generator, upper slide-out for parts, rack on top for 10 ft ladder, storage compartment on rear bumper, rear compartment has a slide out tray, height 93 inches x 61 inches wide, trailer length 137 inches. , , , , , Good		\$250	79100	Stel	991886	2111-515
\$5.00	9-104	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Left Hand L-shaped,locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled - joining brackets may not be included* , , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$5.00	9-105	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Left Hand L-shaped,locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled - joining brackets may not be included* , , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$5.00	9-102	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Left Hand L-shaped,locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled - joining brackets may not be included* , , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
*WD	* 9-101	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Left Hand L-shaped,locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled - joining brackets may not be included* , , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$5.00	9-103	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Left Hand L-shaped,locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled - joining brackets may not be included* , , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$40.00	9-109	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Right Hand L-shaped,locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled -joining brackets may not be included* , , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
\$5.00	9-110	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Right Hand L-shaped,locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled -joining brackets may not be included* , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$20.01	9-106	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Right Hand L-shaped,locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled -joining brackets may not be included* , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$5.00	9-107	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Right Hand L-shaped,locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled -joining brackets may not be included* , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$25.00	9-108	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Right Hand L-shaped,locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled -joining brackets may not be included* , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$5.00	* 8-175	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d, 2 drawer bank, 3 drawer bank, locks and keys *please note the desk comes disassembled* , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$5.00	9-111	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d, 2 drawer bank, 3 drawer bank, locks and keys , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$20.00	9-112	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d, 2 drawer bank, 3 drawer bank, locks and keys , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$5.00	9-113	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d, 2 drawer bank, 3 drawer bank, locks and keys , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$5.00	9-114	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d, 2 drawer bank, 3 drawer bank, locks and keys , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$5.00	9-115	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d, 2 drawer bank, 3 drawer bank, locks and keys , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$67.29	9-120	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Left Hand L-shaped,locks and keys. *Please note this desk is fully assembled* , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
\$45.00	9-121	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Left Hand L-shaped,locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled - joining brackets may not be included* , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$20.01	9-122	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Right Hand L-shaped,locks and keys. *Please note this desk is fully assembled* , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$5.00	9-123	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Right Hand L-shaped,locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled -joining brackets may not be included* , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$5.00	9-124	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d, 2 drawer bank, 3 drawer bank, locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled* , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$5.00	9-125	Desk Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top 60w x 30d, 2 drawer bank, 3 drawer bank, locks and keys. *Please note the desk comes disassembled* , , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
\$7.50	* 7-206	Printer Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise M651DN Model number CZ256A Manufacture date May 12 2015 Large Printer on pallet, hard drive removed, unsure if operational. , , , , Fair		\$1	JPCCH5COLN	SBP ITD	521411 93	2108-297
\$10.00	* 7-208	Printer Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 8100DN Model number-C4216A Manufacture date August 9th 2000 Large Printer on pallet, no hard drive unsure if operational. , , , , Fair		\$1	USJG006999	SBP ITD	412683 95	2108-297
CHRISTOPHER LAKE, Parks Culture & Sport, Carwin Park Shop, Emma Lake								Sonnet
Contact Martin Dochylo 306-961-9051, martin.dochylo@gov.sk.ca or Kim Anderson 306-961-3798, kim.anderson@gov.sk.ca								
\$2.25	* 7-510	Coin Operated Machine Operated Timers Originally used for coin operated showers. Coins set at \$1 , , , , Good		\$1		Parks	6	2109-384
\$2.25	* 7-511	Coin Operated Machine Operated Timers Originally used for coin operated showers. Coins set at \$1 , , , , Good		\$1		Parks	6	2109-384
\$2.25	* 7-512	Coin Operated Machine Operated Timers Originally used for coin operated showers. Coins set at \$1 , , , , Good		\$1		Parks	6	2109-384

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
KINDERSLEY, Agriculture, 1120-608 12th Ave East								Michelle
Contact Patricia Lumgair 306-460-5513 email: patricia.lumgair2@gov.sk.ca								Angela
\$11.01	* 7-525	Chairs lot of 2 Wood side chair, blue in colour , , , , , Fair		\$1		AG	40710	2108-321
\$11.01	* 7-526	Chairs lot of 2 Metal side chair, grey in colour , , , , , Fair		\$1		AG	40701	2108-321
MELVILLE, SCIC, 484 Prince William Drive, Melville.								Heather
Contact Heather Ames 639-638-6281 heather.ames@scic.ca or Curtis Fleury 639-638-6280 curtis.fleury@scic.ca								
No Bid	* 8-510	Cubicle/Wall Organizer Lot of 4 Aluminum Grey 36.5 x 12 , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	6.5	2109-380
No Bid	* 8-511	Cubicle/Wall Organizer Lot of 4 Aluminum Grey 36.5 x 12 , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	6.6	2109-380
No Bid	* 8-512	Desk Top Brown Wood veneer 60 x 48 x 1 , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	6.1	2109-380
No Bid	* 8-513	Desk Top Brown Wood veneer 60 x 48 x 1 , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	6.2	2109-380
No Bid	* 8-515	Desk Top Brown Wood veneer 60 x 48 x 1 , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	6.4	2109-380
No Bid	* 8-516	Desk Top Brown Wood veneer 60 x 48 x 1 , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	6.5	2109-380
No Bid	* 8-517	Desk Top Brown Wood veneer 60 x 48 x 1 , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	6.6	2109-380
No Bid	* 8-514	Desk Top BrownWood veneer 60 x 48 x 1 , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	6.3	2109-380
\$6.01	* 8-518	Drawers Metal Grey, 15x27x22, 2 drawers, no keys , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	3.2	2109-380
\$6.01	* 8-519	Drawers Metal Grey, 15x27x22, 2 drawers, no keys , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	3.3	2109-380
\$6.01	* 8-526	Drawers Metal Grey, 15x27 x22, 2 drawers, no keys , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	3.1	2109-380
No Bid	* 8-527	Overhead Cupboards Lot of 3 Metal Grey, 36 x 17 x 16, no keys , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	1.2	2109-380
No Bid	* 8-528	Overhead Cupboards Lot of 3 Metal Grey, 36 x 17 x 16, no keys , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	1.3	2109-380
No Bid	* 8-529	Overhead Cupboards Lot of 3 Metal Grey, 36 x 17 x 16, no keys , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	1.4	2109-380

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
No Bid	* 8-530	Overhead Cupboards Lot of 3 Metal Grey, 36 x 17 x 16, no keys , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	1.5	2109-380
No Bid	* 8-531	Overhead Cupboards Lot of 3 Metal Grey, 36 x 17 x 16, no keys , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	1.1	2109-380
No Bid	* 8-536	Wardrobe Cupboards Wood Grey, 12 x 24 x 66, no keys , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	2.2	2109-380
No Bid	* 8-537	Wardrobe Cupboards Wood Grey, 12 x 24 x 66, no keys , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	2.3	2109-380
No Bid	* 8-538	Wardrobe Cupboards Wood Grey, 12 x 24 x 66, no keys , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	2.4	2109-380
No Bid	* 8-539	Wardrobe Cupboards Wood Grey, 12 x 24 x 66, no keys , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	2.1	2109-380
OUTLOOK, Agriculture, Crops and Irrigation. 401 Sask Ave W								Heather
Heather Duczek-Reynolds 306-867-5527 heather.duczek-reynolds@gov.sk.ca								
\$315.00	* 8-552	Projector, Screen & Speaker/Camera Hitachi Projector (roof mounted) Model: CP-X2510, Logitech Speaker/Camera/Mic (with remote) Model: IC 4418A-VR0004 With retractable wall mounted projection screen, all are functional/operational , , , , , Good		\$200	Speaker-1516LZ06R068, no other serial #'s available	AG	1	2110-448
PIKE LAKE, Parks, Culture and Sports, Operations, Call for physical location								Chris
Contact Dwight Martin 306-250-8490 dwight.martin@gov.sk.ca								
\$85.00	9-552	16 hp Gas Engine Vanguard V Twin Briggs and Stratton Has 12 Volt Electric starting motor Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1	Model 303447 Type 0075-01	Parks	5	2110-417
\$321.19	9-553	Augers and hydraulic drive 9", 12" amd 30" bits 3 bits and the hydraulic drive motor. Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	6	2110-417
\$6.01	9-554	Axe, 2 tire cross wrenches Bolts, hooks and trailer balls , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	20	2110-417
\$65.65	9-555	Bale fork Home built Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	27	2110-417
\$12.00	* 9-556	Blue water pump Gorman Rupp Diaphragm Pump with 5 hp Briggs and Stratton engine. Non-functional , , , , , Good		\$1	Dura Blue 1000	Parks	7	2110-417

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
\$389.60	9-557	Buzz saw Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	33	2110-417
\$20.00	9-558	Coin operated Washer and Dryer Huebsch 120 Volt 50000 BTUH Natural gas Model - HSG119WF0902. Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1	Serial #0007007339	Parks	41	2110-417
\$20.00	9-559	Coin operated Washer and Dryer Huebsch 120 Volt 50000 BTUH Natural gas Model - HSG119WF0902. Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1	Serial #0001011383	Parks	42	2110-417
\$55.00	9-560	Cultivator Massey 10 foot wide comes with hyd cylinder for lift. Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	8	2110-417
\$155.00	9-561	Delta Toolbox 60 " long, 19 " wide by 16" deep , , , , , Good		\$1		Parks	9	2110-417
\$11.12	9-562	Fertilizer Spreader Thomson Seeder Company 12 Volt DC motor drive. Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1	Model M3B400R	Parks	10	2110-417
\$25.00	* 9-563	Floor Jack Model # G1300 2 ton hydraulic floor jack. Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	1	2110-417
No Bid	* 9-564	Fluorescent Light Fixtures Fluorescent Fixtures Fluorescent fixtures taken out park buildings. Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	3	2110-417
\$67.21	9-565	Haul Master For Parts Only Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	11	2110-417
\$6.01	9-566	Hose reel 1 has hose on it Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	13	2110-417
\$63.04	9-567	Hyd driven Chainsaw Husqvarna PS 50 Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1	1120144	Parks	14	2110-417
\$12.34	9-568	hydraulic cylinder green in color with hoses Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	36	2110-417
\$6.01	9-569	hydraulic cylinder white in color with hoses Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	37	2110-417
\$13.58	9-570	Hydraulic picker Homebuilt Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	15	2110-417
\$25.30	9-571	Jacobsen 1110 Hauler For Parts Only Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	16	2110-417
\$75.00	9-572	John Deere Gator 5 wheel model For Parts Only. Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	17	2110-417
\$407.00	9-573	John Deere Mower 6 foot wide cut pull type PTO driven Has hydraulic lift cylinder and solid rear wheels. Non Functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	18	2110-417

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
No Bid	* 9-574	Light Fixtures Assorted fixtures Fixtures taken out park buildings. Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	2	2110-417
\$31.01	9-575	Lincoln welder Model AC 225-S Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1	TAC 15168	Parks	19	2110-417
\$125.00	9-576	Log splitter Home built Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	12	2110-417
\$976.00	9-577	Mig Welder Model AK Matic 1200 Functioning , , , , , Fair		\$1	CT 122521	Parks	32	2110-417
\$226.00	9-578	Onan Genset 6.5 Kva NH - 3CE ZZ236D. Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1	G783 363288	Parks	21	2110-417
\$99.00	9-579	pallet of harrows Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	34	2110-417
\$5.11	9-580	Parking lot sprayer 5 hp Briggs and Stratton. Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	22	2110-417
\$262.00	9-581	Playground structure parts On a number of pallets Slides Fence and railing, some hardware Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	23	2110-417
\$2,021.00	9-582	Polaris 400 HO Automatic Has a key. Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	24	2110-417
No Bid	* 9-583	Radial arm saw Rockwell on stand 1.5 hp 115/230 V Model # 438-02-314-0418 Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1	FM 31974CH	Parks	26	2110-417
No Bid	* 9-584	Rear seat From 2008 Silverado 2500. Has been sitting outside , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	25	2110-417
No Bid	* 9-585	Sump pump Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	40	2110-417
\$112.12	9-586	Tandem disc Three point hitch tandem disc Parts missing Unknown manufacturer. Non-operational , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	4	2110-417
\$12.89	9-587	Toro TV2002 Model 22025C Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1	7900781	Parks	29	2110-417
\$123.19	9-588	Water pump Multiquip Diaphragm with Honda GX 120 motor. Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	30	2110-417
\$5.01	9-589	Weed whipper PPT 260 Kioritz Corp Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	31	2110-417
\$11.11	9-590	Weed whipper Stihl FS85 Non-functional , , , , , Poor		\$1		Parks	28	2110-417

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
PRINCE ALBERT, Justice Corrections and Policing, Prince Albert Correctional Centre 3021 1st Ave West								
Don Balan donald.balan@gov.sk.ca 306-953-3000 or Dean Schmalz dean.schmalz@gov.sk.ca 306-953-3039								
\$160.00	* 9-507	Bar Bells Assorted Metal Operational/Fixed Plates Attached. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , #9 Renege, Poor		\$1		CPPS	17	2111-488
\$200.00	* 9-508	Bar Bells Assorted, Metal Operational/Fixed Plates Attached. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , #9 Renege, Poor		\$1		CPPS	16	2111-488
\$21.00	9-509	Bench Metal/Plastic Operational. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , Poor		\$1		CPPS	8	2111-488
\$21.00	9-510	Bench Metal/Plastic Operational. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , Poor		\$1		CPPS	12	2111-488
\$35.00	* 9-511	Bench Metal/Plastic Operational. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , Poor		\$1		CPPS	13	2111-488
\$100.00	9-512	Bench Press Metal/Plastic Operational. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , Poor		\$1		CPPS	3	2111-488
\$21.00	9-513	Bench Press Metal/Plastic Operational. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , Poor		\$1		CPPS	7	2111-488
\$101.00	9-501	Food Cart lot of 3 Metal with wheels Used to take food to units , , , , Fair		\$1		CPPS	1	2111-481
\$101.00	9-502	Food Cart lot of 3 Metal with wheels Used to take food to units , , , , Fair		\$1		CPPS	1	2111-481
\$101.00	9-503	Food Cart lot of 3 Metal with wheels Used to take food to units , , , , Fair		\$1		CPPS	1	2111-481
\$101.00	* 9-504	Food Cart lot of 3 Metal with wheels Used to take food to units , , , , Fair		\$1		CPPS	1	2111-481
\$101.00	* 9-505	Food Cart lot of 3 Metal with wheels Used to take food to units , , , , Fair		\$1		CPPS	1	2111-481
\$101.00	* 9-506	Food Cart lot of 3 Metal with wheels Used to take food to units , , , , Fair		\$1		CPPS	1	2111-481
\$50.00	9-514	Hamstring Curl Metal/Plastic Bench Operational/Fixed Plates Attached. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , Poor		\$1		CPPS	14	2111-488

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
\$30.00	* 9-515	Incline Ab Bench Metal/Rubber/Wood Operational. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , , Poor		\$1		CPPS	15	2111-488
\$21.00	9-516	Incline Bench Metal/Plastic Bench Fixed Incline/Does not move. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , , Poor		\$1		CPPS	9	2111-488
\$50.00	9-517	Leg Extension Metal/Plastic Bench Operational/Fixed Plates Attached. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , , Poor		\$1		CPPS	10	2111-488
\$21.00	9-518	Leg Extension Metal/Plastic Bench Operational/Fixed Plates Attached. Rusted , , , , , Poor		\$1		CPPS	6	2111-488
\$36.00	9-519	Preacher Curl Metal/Rubber/Wood Operational. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , , Poor		\$1		CPPS	4	2111-488
\$21.00	9-520	Preacher Curl Metal/Rubber/Wood Operational. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , , Poor		\$1		CPPS	5	2111-488
\$130.00	* 9-521	Squat Rack Metal Operational. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , , Poor		\$1		CPPS	1	2111-488
\$50.00	9-522	Squat Rack Metal Operational. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , , Poor		\$1		CPPS	2	2111-488
\$60.00	* 9-523	Tower of Power Metal/Plastic Bench Operational/No Pull Up Bar Attached. Has been stored outside and has some rust. , , , , , Poor		\$1		CPPS	11	2111-488
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Ave North								Wanda
Contact Brent Zbaraschuk 306-953-2428 brent.zbaraschuk@gov.sk.ca or Tyla Wills 306-953-3400 tyla.wills@gov.sk.ca								Wanda
\$36.88	9-543	Chainsaw STIHL , power 45CC Non-Operational, broken or missing parts. Cost prohibitive to repair versus purchase new. , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	FCS509 (227245758), FCS1232 (225806503)	SPSA	1	2111-485
\$36.88	9-544	Chainsaw STIHL , power 45CC Non-Operational, broken or missing parts. Cost prohibitive to repair versus purchase new. , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	FCS974 (249096228), FCS598 (231324692), FCS481 (227246073)	SPSA	2	2111-485
\$26.78	9-545	Chainsaw STIHL , power 45CC Non-Operational, broken or missing parts. Cost prohibitive to repair versus purchase new. , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	FCS979 (251271756), FCS528 (227245668)	SPSA	3	2111-485
\$36.88	9-546	Chainsaw STIHL , power 45CC Non-Operational, broken or missing parts. Cost prohibitive to repair versus purchase new. , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	FCS943 (243146393), FCS540 (227245848), FCS1188 (274348646)	SPSA	4	2111-485

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
\$26.78	9-547	Chainsaw STIHL , power 45CC Non-Operational, broken or missing parts. Cost prohibitive to repair versus purchase new. , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	FCS756 (238851046), FCS1084 (225009425), FCS990 (251271676)	SPSA	5	2111-485
\$50.00	9-548	Chainsaw STIHL , power 45CC Non-Operational, broken or missing parts. Cost prohibitive to repair versus purchase new. , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	FCS440 (227245867), FCS583 (231324746)	SPSA	6	2111-485
\$36.88	9-549	Chainsaw STIHL , power 45CC Non-Operational, broken or missing parts. Cost prohibitive to repair versus purchase new. , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	FCS1075 (253522045), FCS826 (239836673)	SPSA	7	2111-485
\$26.78	9-550	Chainsaw STIHL , power 45CC Non-Operational, broken or missing parts. Cost prohibitive to repair versus purchase new. , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	FCS1177 (269879470), FCS809 (239836714)	SPSA	8	2111-485
\$36.88	9-551	Chainsaw STIHL , power 45CC Non-Operational, broken or missing parts. Cost prohibitive to repair versus purchase new. , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	FCS556 (227245826), FCS445(227245855)	SPSA	9	2111-485
\$252.55	* 9-524	Drill - Cordless Dewalt DC728 14.4V. 1/2" VSR Functional retired due to age, includes battery , , , , Fair		\$1	969043	SPSA	1	2111-477
No Bid	* 9-525	Drill - Cordless Dewalt DC728 14.4V. 1/2" VSR Functional retired due to age, includes battery , , , , Fair		\$1	624991	SPSA	2	2111-477
No Bid	* 9-526	Drill - Cordless Dewalt DW953 12.0V. 3/8" Adjustable Clutch VSR Functional retired due to age. No battery , , , , Fair		\$1	157819	SPSA	3	2111-477
\$10.00	9-527	Drill - Cordless Mastercraft 18.0V. 1/2" Functional retired due to age, includes 2 batteries and charger , , , , Fair		\$1	54-2835-4	SPSA	6	2111-477
No Bid	* 9-528	Drill/Driver - Cordless Dewalt DC759 18.0V. 1/2" VSR Functional returned due to age, includes battery , , , , Fair		\$1	266167	SPSA	5	2111-477
No Bid	* 9-529	Drill/Driver - Cordless Dewalt DC920 18.0V. 1/2" XRP Functional retired due to age, includes battery , , , , Fair		\$1	836963	SPSA	4	2111-477
PRINCE ALBERT, Environment, #201 1061 Central Avenue								Twila Gola,
Contact Twila Gola 306-953-3233 twila.gola@gov.sk.ca or Lori Thompson 306-940-6509 lori.thompson@gov.sk.ca								Hetal Shah
No Bid	* 8-553	Battery Fleetnet Emerson,7.5V Fleetnet Battery , , , , Good		\$1	19A705393P3	ENV	10	2110-439
\$10.00	* 8-555	Black Case Trimble GPS Pathfinder empty , , , , Good		\$1	3612A01843	ENV	1	2110-439

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
\$3.85	* 8-562	Hip Chains Lot of 3 Metric Fieldranger 6500 Includes box of thread for use with Hip Chains , , , , , Good		\$1		ENV	2	2110-439
No Bid	* 8-564	Video/Audio Cable Kit PURE AV by Blekin Composite video & audio cable kit , , , , , New - Unused		\$5		ENV	8	2110-439
PRINCE ALBERT, Highways, Northern Operations, 81 North Industrial Dr.								Cory Palko
Contact Cory Palko 306-960-5152 cory.palko@gov.sk.ca								Nicole
\$8,383.34	9-540	Tandem Axle Truck 1983 Ford LNT9000 Cab and Chassis Detroit 6-71T Inline 6 Allison Automatic, 5 speed, diesel A/C, Tilt, Rear wheel drive, Wheel base: 186, Standard, locking, Dual rear, Yellow, 83142, , Battery is poor, Motor, Transmission, Tires, Brakes, Body exterior, exhaust, windshield glass, windshield washer and wipers, paint, interior, lights, mirrors, and horn are all fair. , As is, Where is	83,142	\$1,500	1FDYW90J4DVA31013	HI	D83023	2110-451
REGINA, AGRICULTURE, 3085 Albert Street.								Denise
Contact Denise Konieczny 306-787-5854								
No Bid	* 9-530	Cabinet Lateral 3 drawer, metal No key, Beige, 36x18x39 , , , , , Good		\$1		AG	2	2110-447
No Bid	* 9-531	Chair Lot of 2 Metal and wood, cloth Brown fabric, wood arm rests, 4 legs , , , , , Good		\$1		AG	3	2110-447
No Bid	* 9-532	Chair Lot of 8 Wood Frames, cloth 1 Swivel (5 castor), 7 standard chairs with 4 legs, Cranberry in colour , , , , , Good		\$1		AG	4	2110-447
No Bid	* 9-533	Table Laminate, Metal Stand White top, single pedestal stand, 36x29 , , , , , Good		\$1		AG	5	2110-447
*MT	9-534	Table Laminate, Metal Stand, Peppercrust Single pedestal stand, 47.5" x 30" , , , , , Good		\$1		AG	1	2110-447
SASKATOON, Highways 126 105th St E								Richard
Contact Richard Leibel 306-933-5262 email: Richard.Leibel@gov.sk.ca								Nicole
\$1,501.00	* 9-535	Trailer Majestic 2007 L235 16ft Utility Deck boards busted, deck supports bent and broken, lights and plug not working, brakes seized and unit is badly rusted , , , , , Poor		\$1	2M9FS42737R151319	HI	M-3678	2110-450

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
SASKATOON, SaskPolytech, 1130 Idylwyld Drive N.								
Contact Chris Perry 306-659-4126, email: perrychr@saskpolytech.ca or Faheem Khan 306-659-4651, email:khanmuham@saskpolytech.ca								
\$2,200.01	9-542	Planer Helical MODEL R-630 1200KG - 51"l X 38"W X 42"H. Been sitting since May 2021. Still functional. From year 1980 or so. , , , , , Good		\$400	84-63-65	SPT	1	2111-484
SASKATOON, WATER SECURITY AGENCY, locked storage compound, contact for physical location.								
Contact Iain Phillips 306-290-9483 iain.phillips@wsask.ca								
\$1,850.00	9-536	ATV Honda, 2003, Fourtrax 350cc In running condition, but the oil drain plug is stripped and leaks. , , , , , Poor		\$800	478Te25253A301066	WSA	3	2111-479
\$2,440.00	9-537	Quad Yamaha, Big Bear 400cc, 2003 It is in running condition, has a cracked rack on the back. , Green, , , , Fair		\$800	JY44SHW083C111673	WSA	2	2111-479
SWIFT CURRENT, Highways, Fleet Services, 1200 South Service Road W								
Contact Landis Sather 306-778-8353, or 306-741-7937 email: landis.sather@gov.sk.ca								
\$2,600.00	* 5-524	Boiler 1992 Homebuilt Honda EZ5000, Gas tandem, single tires, 7.00-15 Lt , Yellow, , , PROBLEMS: inactive since 2018, R/H flat tires, paint poor, motor fair, lights fair>, As is, Where is		\$250	SK400849141	HI	M-2036	2107-245
\$5,150.00	9-538	Flat Deck Trailer 1995 JC 40 Trailer Tandem Dual tires, , Yellow, , , PROBLEMS: Foundation brake issues, one axle has caged brake chamber to keep brake from sticking on. Brakes are poor, exterior paint and body, tires and lights are fair. , As is, Where is		\$500	2J9B3V4B6SK001022	HI	E95002	2110-454
YORKTON, Highways, Fleet Services, 245 York Road East.								
Contact Brian Perih 306-786-1651 or Ed Patzwald 06-786-1687 email: brian.perih@gov.sk.ca or ed.patzwald@gov.sk.ca.								
\$393.00	9-539	Posts Lot of 75 to 100 Wooden, mostly fir 4 inches x 6 inches x 14 feet approximately, old broken sign posts, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer. , , , , , Fair		\$1		HI		2111-496

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
\$2,777.77	9-541	Tandem Gravel Truck 2000 Mack RD688S Dual Tires, Wheel base is 214, Eaton 4:11, GVW: 24,300 Mack E7-350 Super 10 Speed Motor, transmission, hours body exterior, exhaust, windshield washer and wipers, paint, interior, lights, mirrors and horn are all poor condition. Tires, brakes and Battery are fair and the windshield glass is good. Box Ladder, Yellow, 12,669 hours, , PROBLEMS: transmission needs to be replaced-will shift but not move; Engine oil leak leak on both sides of engine; engine block on drivers side rusting through; oil pan leaking; head gasket has possible leak;Rear tires cupped on axle 3; rust jacking on cross members at back;electrical junction box broken at rear of truck; steering drag link and steering tie rod ends have play in them; rear hitch plate gusset broken away from frame on drivers side; hood mount cracked by hinges on both sides; hoist cylinder dripping hydraulic fluid; went on drivers side of cab rusted through, drivers side seat foam pounded out; cab doors rusted through on bottom; drip edge/pinch weld above passenger door rusted; front signal lights are weak/dim on left side; wing light not working at rear of truck; hydraulic enclosure door rusted and top hinge let go and bottom hinge very corroded; electric horn does not work; front spring pins have play in them;air to rad hoses rubbing through;fan shroud broken; fan blade corners chipped off most of blades; batteries need replacement and cables need cleaning; starter/alternator wiring corroded; major hydraulic leak under drivers side frame;air filter housing strap rusted out; 2nd axle differential leaking; 3rd axle drain plug leaking and it is tight; 3rd axle air bag mount is loose; both rear tail light boxes are rusted out; rust hole in drivers side rear of box; 2nd axle left shock loose; engine mounts in poor condition; missing hood for engine;, As	12,669	\$500	1M2P267C4YM049908	HI	D00008	2110-452
\$393.00	9-591	Posts Lot of 75 to 100 Wooden, mostly fir 4 inches x 6 inches x 14 feet approximately, old broken sign posts, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; , , , , , Fair		\$1		HI	2111-505	