

Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to (306)787-2092; by phone (306)787-2062 or (306)787-2238,
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred.

WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller,

No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles.						
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.						
\$4,099.00	10-001	Car 2013 CHEVROLET Impala LS FWD 3.6L V6 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/mirrors/driver seat/trunk release, keyless entry (2 keys, 2 fobs) , grey, 203,823 km, , PROBLEMS: This vehicle was removed from the road (high repair estimate), check engine light (P0300-00 engine misfire detected), runs rough, right outer tie rod, rear tires poor, windshield cracked, front wheel alignment needed, grille broken, front bumper cracked, RR fender small dent, LF door paint inside bottom & door panel, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	203,823 km	\$760	2G1WA5E37D1171564	CVA
\$3,598.98	10-002	Car 2007 CHRYSLER Sebring FWD 2.7L V6 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/locks/driver seat/heated mirrors, power trunk release, keyless entry (2 fobs) , blue, 198,447 km, , PROBLEMS: check engine light on (P0401 EGR performance, P0430 Catalyst efficiency B2), TPMS light on, tire light, hood scratches/paint peeling, LF fender scratches, RR fender rust, both rocker panels road rash, both right doors dents/scratches, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	198,447 km	\$662	1C3LC56R87N634715	CVA
\$4,120.00	10-003	Car 2009 CHRYSLER Sebring LX FWD 2.4L L4 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/locks/heated mirrors, trunk release, keyless entry (2 fobs) , beige, 251,684 km, , PROBLEMS: oil leak, front bumper & hood paint peeling, surface rust on rocker panels, RF door rust along bottom (inside & out), right mirror housing scratched, head liner loose above rear window, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	251,684 km	\$1,086	1C3LC46B39N573418	CVA
\$3,598.98	10-004	Car 2009 FORD Focus SE FWD 2.0L L4 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/locks/heated mirrors, keyless entry (2 keys, 2 fobs) , blue, 231,520 km, , PROBLEMS: hood scratches/dent, right dog leg road rash, rocker panel rusted/road rash, LR door rust, RR door road rash, chrome on right mirror housing flakey, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	231,520 km	\$1,358	1FAHP35N79W261968	CVA

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
\$2,398.98	10-005	Car 2009 FORD Focus SE FWD 2.0L L4 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/locks/heated mirrors, keyless entry (2 keys, 2 fobs) , red, 237,305 km, , PROBLEMS: both lower ball joints, all front & rear brakes, front pads & rotors, rear shoes & drums, all 4 tires poor, front wheel alignment needed, hood scuffs, both left fenders road rash, RR fender creased, both rocker panels road rash, LF door paint chips, RR door road rash, right and left mirrors, brakes making a noise - chrome pitted, battery poor, roof rust spots, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	237,305 km	\$558	1FAHP35N59W261970	CVA
\$3,299.00	10-006	SUV 2013 JEEP Patriot 4WD 2.4L L4 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/locks/heated mirrors, keyless entry (1 fob), driving lights 5 passenger, blue, 174,043 km, , PROBLEMS: transmission non-operational, needs to be replaced, check engine light (P0777 Secondary pressure solenoid stuck on, P0746 Line pressure solenoid performance), all brakes, front & rear pads & rotors, alignment needed, LR fender rust, LR door dents, tailgate glass scratched, roof small rust spot at front edge, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	174,043 km	\$1,080	1C4NJRAB3DD214860	CVA
MT	10-007	Truck 2009 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 2WD, ext cab 5.3L V8 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, 2 keys grille inserts, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, red, 139,510 km, , PROBLEMS: rack leaking/left front strut, alignment needed, rear bumper bent, front bumper rust spots, all fenders road rash/dents/scratches, dents & holes drilled in left & right box rails, tailgate scratches/dents/bottom corners bent, right tail light lense broken, LF & RF doors rust along bottom of weather stripping, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	139,510 km	\$2,797	1GCEC19099Z240615	CVA
MT	10-008	Truck 2013 DODGE Ram 1500 4WD, quad cab, 6'4" box, has a back seat 4.7L V8 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, power locks/windows, heated mirrors, keyless entry (2 keys, 2 fobs) front tow hooks, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, box liner, white, 274,309 km, , PROBLEMS: right inner and outer tie rod, rear links and bushings loose, front wheel alignment needed, no high mount, all fenders rusted, box damaged/rusted, hood paint bubbling, front & rear bumper rust/dents/bent, rocker panels rusted, L&R cab corners rusted, L&R front of box cracked/rusted, LF door dent, tailgate rust, both mirrors scratched, front mud flaps not secured, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	274,309 km	\$2,556	1C6RR7FP1DS515973	CVA

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
\$23,585.85	10-009	Truck 2013 DODGE Ram 5500 2WD, club cab 6.7L V6 diesel auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, power windows/locks/heated mirrors, keyless entry (2 fobs) dual rear wheels, has a back seat, Waltco power lift gate- 3092 hours on meter (condition unknown), grille inserts, side steps, front tow hooks, hitch, trailer wiring, Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), trailer brake, trailer tow mirrors, 9'5" x 7'6" steel dump body with fold down aluminum sides and beacon (condition unknown), hoist manual inside vehicle, white, 281,343 km, , PROBLEMS: RR caliper leak, both rear stabilizer links, both rear hub seals, both rear rotors, engine and transmission fluid slightly low, front bumper rust spots, dents on both left doors, driver seat worn, rear marker bulb, left washer nozzle, left mud flap, roof small rust spots/1 sealed hole, missing spare tire, wheel wrench & jack, no fire extinguisher or hazard kit, battery poor, minor exterior damage, engine oil a little low.>, As is, Where is	281,343 km	\$9,850	3C7WRMEL6DG524820	CVA
\$3,799.00	10-010	Truck 2007 FORD F150 2WD, super cab 4.6L V8 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, 3 keys hitch, trailer wiring, white, 75,087 km, , PROBLEMS: engine noise/tick (removed from road due to noise), oil leak, pinion seal leaking, belt cracked, front pads/rotors, all tires have worn side walls, hole in hood, rear bumper dents, all fenders rust, RR fender dents, tailgate dents/inside bent, driver seat worn/ripped, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	75,087 km	\$615	1FTRX12W47FB24029	CVA
\$5,299.00	10-011	Truck 2008 FORD F450 2WD, crew cab, 5 passenger 6.4L V8 diesel manual A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, power locks/windows/mirrors dual rear wheels, has a back seat, power lift gate (rusted/condition unknown) 9'10" x 7'7" dump body with fold down sides (condition unknown), screen attached to front of dump body, electric trailer brakes, trailer tow mirrors, grille inserts, front tow hooks, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, yellow, 254,982 km, , PROBLEMS: oil pan sweat, left exhaust manifold broken, drag link at pitman arm, both rear shocks, both rear tires, windshield cracked, RF fender dented, RF door dented/bent, 6 marker bulbs, LED for signal lights less than 50%, both front mud flaps, roof rust spots/1 sealed hole, fire extinguisher or hazard kit, jack missing, driver's mirror housing broken, back seat soiled, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	254,982 km	\$3,627	1FDXW46R08EB04749	CVA

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
\$5,999.00	10-012	Truck 2008 FORD F450 2WD, crew cab, 5 passenger 6.4L V8 diesel manual A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM radio, power locks/windows/mirrors dual rear wheel, has a back seat, 9' x 8' steel dump body with folding sides (condition unknown), grille inserts, front tow hooks, hitch, trailer wiring & tow mirrors, electric trailer brake, side steps, control for dump body & hazard lights on council between front seats, hazard lights - condition unknown, white, 241,473 km, , PROBLEMS: ignition switch, right outer tie rod, drag link at pitman arm, small oil pan leak, windshield cracked, tailgate loose in box, grille broken, hood hail damage, roof rust spots/hail damage/sealed hole, all door windows scratched, both bumpers rust spots, LF door stone chips, LR door rust chips, RR door rust, no fire extinguisher or hazard kit, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	241,473 km	\$3,827	1FDXW46R48EA99359	CVA
\$5,099.00	10-013	Van 2009 DODGE Grand Caravan FWD, cargo (bare to metal floor) 3.3L V6 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power front windows/locks/mirrors, keyless entry (2 keys, 2 fobs) , white, 107,173 km, , PROBLEMS: TPMS, gas cap light, windshield cracked, hood hail damage/paint bubbling & peeling, rust on all fenders, RR fender small dents, tailgate dents, roof hail damage/small rust spots/3 sealed holes, driver side floor liner worn/has a hole, holes in headliner, hood is a different shade of white, brackets for a roof rack on roof, rear seats removed, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	107,173 km	\$726	2D4HN11E09R683411	CVA STEL
\$3,698.98	* 9-002	Van 2013 DODGE Grand Caravan FWD 3.6L V6 gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows (all doors)/trunk release, heated mirrors, side vent windows, rear HVAC, keyless entry (2 fobs) 7 passenger, Stow 'n Go (3rd row of seats), grey, 257,884 km, , PROBLEMS: rear shocks, hood hail damage/paint bubbling, roof hail damage, both left fenders scrapes/small dents, right rear fender scrape, rear bumper broken/hole, front bumper road rash, rear window scratched, scratches on both left doors, battery poor, small chips on windshield, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	257,884 km	\$1,930	2C4RDGBG5DR634141	CVA

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.						
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.						
\$33.00	* 4-145	Cart on wheels Plastic, with drain hole 51"L x 33"W x 37"H. , , , , , Fair		\$1		SaskSurplus
No Bid	10-113	Seats Lot of 2 Bench seats, grey, cloth 1-53 inch seat, 1-63 inch seat. May be compatible with a 2004 E350 extended van. , , , , , Fair		\$1	422121	CVA
No Bid	10-114	Seats Lot of 2 Bench seats, grey, cloth Both seats are 53 inches in length. May be compatible with a 2004 Chev Astro van. , , , , , Fair		\$1	190470	CVA
No Bid	10-115	Seats Lot of 2 Bench seats, grey, cloth Both seats are 53 inches in length. May be compatible with a 2006 E350 extended van. , , , , , Fair		\$1	422485	CVA
\$152.12	10-129	Tires Set of 4 Arctic Claw winter TXI. M+S. Snowflake. 16 inch, 225/60R/16, manufacture date. Week 23, year 2015. , , , , , Fair		\$120		CVA
\$225.69	10-128	Tires Set of 4 Firestone All Season. M+S 15 inch, 195/60R/15, manufacture date. Week 28, year 2020. , , , , , Good		\$160		CVA
\$157.00	10-130	Tires Set of 4 Sumitomo HTR Enhance LX2. M+S 15 inch, 195/60R/15, manufacture date. Week 21, year 2019. , , , , , Fair		\$120		CVA
No Bid	* 6-147	Core and Coil HID Replacement Advance ballast, capacitor, fittings in box. , , , , , New - Unused		\$1		SaskSurplus
No Bid	* 2-113	Floor Mats Set of 3 801635 Ram fabric floor mats Original Equipment Manufacturer(OEM), 2-front, 1 full width rear, may fit Ram 1500 Tradesman Crew Cab. Black in color. , , , , , Excellent		\$40		CVA
\$21.12	10-101	Filing Cabinet Wood, laminate 36"W x 24 1/2"D x 27 1/2"H lateral, 2 drawers. , , , , , Fair		\$1		SBP Air Amb
No Bid	* 8-164	Folding Bench Seat 2nd row, 2 person, black cloth with head rests Cup holder, wheels on rear mounting frames to assist in removal, may fit a 2006 or 2007 Dodge Caravan. , , , , , Fair		\$10		CVA
No Bid	* 8-165	Folding Bench Seat 2nd row, 2 person, black cloth with head rests Cup holder, wheels on rear mounting frames to assist in removal, may fit a 2006 or 2007 Dodge Caravan. , , , , , Fair		\$10		CVA

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
\$126.01	10-102	Rear Bumper Chrome Original Equipment Manufacturer(OEM), may be compatible with a 2004 Chev Silverado 3500, extended cab. , , , , , Good		\$100	A04008	CVA
\$126.01	10-103	Rear Bumper Chrome Original Equipment Manufacturer(OEM), missing license plate lights, may be compatible with a 2004 Chev Silverado 3500, extended cab. , , , , , Good		\$100	A04006	CVA
\$215.00	10-104	Tailgate Yellow in color Original Equipment Manufacturer(OEM), extended cab, may not be complete, may be compatible with a 2004 Chev Siverado 3500. , , , , , Good		\$200	A04008	CVA
\$211.00	10-105	Tailgate Yellow in color Original Equipment Manufacturer(OEM), has duraguard protector on the inside. Small stone chips and road rash, extended cab, may not be complete, may be compatible with a 2004 Chev Silverado 3500. , , , , , Good		\$200	A04006	CVA
\$79.00	10-106	Oven metal, electric 26 1/2"W x 26"D x 30"H, scientific - unknown if it works. , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1		SBP Air Amb
No Bid	* 8-252	Rear Bench Seat May fit a 2008 Dodge 1 ton, quad cab folding, grey in colour. , , , , , Fair		\$20		CVA
No Bid	* 8-253	Rear Bench Seat May fit a 2008 Dodge 1 ton, quad cab folding, grey in colour. , , , , , Fair		\$20		CVA
No Bid	10-107	Rear Bumper Ford, black scratched. Removed from a 2006 Ford F250. , , , , , Good		\$100	438275	CVA
\$56.35	10-108	Running Boards Set of 2 Ford, black. removed from a 2018 Ford F250. , , , , , Good		\$50	800986	CVA
\$26.00	10-109	Safety Supplies Lot of 15 3 small emergency stoves, booster cables, hatchet, poncho, 2 candles 3 emergency blankets, 1 hand warmer pack, 2 small triangle warning sign kits, True Temper 36" length metal shovel. , , , , , Good		\$1		CVA
No Bid	10-110	Seat 3rd row seat, seats 2 people Removed from a 2009 Dodge Durango, grey cloth , , , , , Fair		\$1	434842	CVA
No Bid	10-111	Seat Bench seat. Cloth. Grey 52 inches in length. May be compatable with a 2004 Ford Econoline E150. , , , , , Poor		\$1		CVA

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
No Bid	10-112	Seats Lot of 2 2nd row and 3rd row seat. 2nd row seats 3, 3rd row seats 2. Removed from a 2009 Dodge Durango, grey cloth. , , , , , Fair		\$15	434883	CVA
\$25.00	10-116	Seats Lot of 3 Bench. Cloth. blue/grey 2 are 53 inches long. 1 is 63 inches long. Make and model of vehicle unknown. , , , , , Poor		\$1		CVA
No Bid	* 8-167	Seats Lot of 4 Cloth grey, may be compatible with a 2006 Ford Econoline E350, 15 passenger. , , , , , Fair		\$40	422543	CVA
\$15.00	* 6-204	Table metal 30"W x 60"L x 30"H, laminate top, grey. , , , , , Good		\$1		SaskSurplus
\$231.00	10-123	Tires Set of 4 Arctic Claw Winter TXI. M+S 215/70R/15, manufacture date: week 31, year 2015. , , , , , Excellent		\$200		CVA
\$242.33	10-122	Tires Set of 4 Bridgestone Dueler H/T. M+S 255/70R/17, manufacture date: week 20, year 2018. , , , , , Fair		\$120		CVA
\$245.18	10-121	Tires Set of 4 Bridgestone Dueler H/T. M+S 255/70R/17, manufacture date: week 21, year 2018. , , , , , Fair		\$120		CVA
\$155.12	10-124	Tires Set of 4 Firestone FR710, M+S 225/60R/16, manufacture date: week 51, year 2017. , , , , , Poor		\$40		CVA
\$351.00	10-126	Tires Set of 2 Goodyear Wrangler Duratrac LT 265/70R/17, manufacture date: week 12, year 2017. , , , , , Good		\$100		CVA
\$31.01	10-120	Tire Goodride, SA-07. M+S 16 inch, 215/55R/16, manufacture date. week 26, year 2018. , , , , , Good		\$20		CVA
\$66.01	10-118	Tires Set of 3 Continental Contlpro Contact 15 inch, 215/55R/16, manufacture date: week 20, year 2015. , , , , , Poor		\$30		CVA
\$172.38	10-119	Tires Set of 4 Firestone All Season. M+S 16 inch, 225/60R/16, manufacture date: week 28, year 2017. , , , , , Fair		\$120		CVA
\$203.33	10-117	Tires Set of 4 Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X. M+S 17 inch, 215/60R/17, manufacture date: week 05, year 2018. , , , , , Good		\$160		CVA
\$205.15	10-125	Tires Set of 4 Sumitomo HTR Enhance LX2. M+S 215/60R/17, manufacture date: week 23, year 2019. , , , , , Good		\$160		CVA

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
\$139.99	* 8-163	Tires Set of 4 Sumitomo HTR Enhance. M+S 215/60R/17, manufacture date: week 41, year 2016. , , , , , Fair		\$120		CVA
\$66.01	10-127	Tires Set of 3 Winter Claw Extreme Grip MX Snowflake 225/55R/17 Manufacture date: week 27, year 2014. , , , , , Poor		\$30		CVA
\$148.18	* 1-123	Tires Set of 4 Winter Claw Extreme Grip, M+S 225/60R/16, manufacture date: week 24, year 2014. , , , , , Fair		\$140		CVA
\$36.50	10-131	Workstation Mobile Metal Workstation 27"W x 24"L x 50"H, 2 shelves, lower cabinet, 4 casters. , , , , , Fair		\$1		SBP Air Amb

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
MELVILLE, SCIC, 484 Prince William Drive, Melville.						
Contact Heather Ames 639-638-6281, heather.ames@scic.ca or Curtis Fleury 639-638-6280, curtis.fleury@scic.ca						
No Bid	* 8-510	Cubicle/Wall Organizer Lot of 4 aluminum grey, 36.5" x 12". , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC
No Bid	* 8-511	Cubicle/Wall Organizer Lot of 4 aluminum grey, 36.5" x 12". , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC
\$1.35	* 8-512	Desk Top brown wood veneer 60"W x 48"L x 1"H. , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC
\$1.35	* 8-513	Desk Top brown wood veneer 60"W x 48"L x 1"H. , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC
\$1.35	* 8-515	Desk Top brown wood veneer 60"W x 48"L x 1"H. , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC
\$1.35	* 8-516	Desk Top brown wood veneer 60"W x 48"L x 1"H. , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC
\$1.35	* 8-517	Desk Top brown wood veneer 60"W x 48"L x 1"H. , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC
\$1.35	* 8-514	Desk Top brown wood veneer 60"W x 48"L x 1"H. , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC
\$2.00	* 8-527	Overhead Cupboards Lot of 3 metal grey, 36"L x 17"W x 16"H, no keys. , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC
\$5.00	* 8-528	Overhead Cupboards Lot of 3 metal grey, 36"L x 17"W x 16"H, no keys. , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC
\$10.00	* 8-529	Overhead Cupboards Lot of 3 metal grey, 36"L x 17"W x 16"H, no keys. , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC
\$15.00	* 8-530	Overhead Cupboards Lot of 3 metal grey, 36"L x 17"W x 16"H, no keys. , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC
\$15.00	* 8-531	Overhead Cupboards Lot of 3 metal grey, 36"L x 17"W x 16"H, no keys. , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC
\$1.35	* 8-536	Wardrobe Cupboards wood grey, 12"L x 24"W x 66"H, no keys. , , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
\$1.35	* 8-537	Wardrobe Cupboards wood grey, 12"L x 24"W x 66"H, no keys. , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC
\$1.35	* 8-538	Wardrobe Cupboards wood grey, 12"L x 24"W x 66"H, no keys. , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC
\$1.35	* 8-539	Wardrobe Cupboards wood grey, 12"L x 24"W x 66"H, no keys. , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC
NORTH BATTLEFORD, Highways 502 114th Street.						
Contact Mark Eisenkirch 306-526-9103 email: mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca						
\$139.50	10-502	Floor Jack 10 ton hydraulic red and white in colour. , , , , Good		\$10	NA	HI
\$284.99	10-503	Hydraulic Press home made worked when last used , , , , Fair		\$1	NA	HI
\$367.13	10-504	Hydraulic Press home made worked when last used , , , , Fair		\$1	NA	HU
\$835.00	10-505	Mig Welder Lincoln CV300 red in colour. Needs a clean. , , , , Good		\$20	U10000511050	HI
\$127.95	10-506	Snow Blower Hasn't ran in 10 years. Red and white. , , , , Poor		\$1	NA	HI
\$101.01	10-507	Wheel Dolly dual wheel red in colour. , , , , Good		\$10	NA	HI
\$599.00	10-501	Atco trailer 1963. Model S Has not been used in 17 years. Outside measurements are 26' 2" long and 10' wide. Structurally ugly, but sound. No mice. No utilities connected. On skids that can be winched onto a trailer. Ministry will move snow for winter access. Needs to be removed 1 month after sale. , , , , Poor		\$10	12621963	HI
OUTLOOK, Agriculture, Crops and Irrigation, 410 Saskatchewan Avenue W.						
Contact Heather Ducek-Reynolds 306-867-5527 or 306-541-4408, heather.ducek-reynolds@gov.sk.ca						
No Bid	10-508	File Cabinets lot of 3 vertical, 4 drawer 18"W x 28"D x 51"H, lock and key, beige or dark grey , , , , Fair		\$1		AG
No Bid	10-509	File Cabinets lot of 3 vertical, 4 drawer 18"W x 28"D x 51"H, lock and key, beige or dark grey , , , , Fair		\$1		AG

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
No Bid	10-510	File Cabinets lot of 3 vertical, 4 drawer 18"W x 28"D x 51"H, lock and key, beige or dark grey , , , , Fair		\$1		AG
No Bid	10-511	File Cabinets lot of 3 vertical, 4 drawer 18"W x 28"D x 51"H, lock and key, beige or dark grey , , , , Fair		\$1		AG
No Bid	10-512	File Cabinets lot of 3 vertical, 4 drawer 18"W x 28"D x 51"H, lock and key, beige or dark grey , , , , Fair		\$1		AG
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Avenue N.						
Contact Brent Zbaraschuk 306-953-2428, brent.zbaraschuk@gov.sk.ca or Tyla Wills 306-953-3400, tyla.wills@gov.sk.ca						
\$5.00	* 9-524	Drill - Cordless Dewalt DC728 14.4V. 1/2" VSR functional retired due to age, includes battery. , , , , Fair		\$1	969043	SPSA
\$5.00	* 9-525	Drill - Cordless Dewalt DC728 14.4V. 1/2" VSR functional retired due to age, includes battery. , , , , Fair		\$1	624991	SPSA
\$5.00	* 9-526	Drill - Cordless Dewalt DW953 12.0V. 3/8" adjustable clutch VSR functional retired due to age. No battery. , , , , Fair		\$1	157819	SPSA
\$17.00	* 9-528	Drill/Driver - Cordless Dewalt DC759 18.0V. 1/2" VSR functional retired due to age, includes battery. , , , , Fair		\$1	266167	SPSA
\$24.00	* 9-529	Drill/Driver - Cordless Dewalt DC920 18.0V. 1/2" XRP functional retired due to age, includes battery. , , , , Fair		\$1	836963	SPSA
PRINCE ALBERT, Environment, #201 - 1061 Central Avenue.						
Contact Twila Gola 306-953-3233, twila.gola@gov.sk.ca or Lori Thompson 306-940-6509 lori.thompson@gov.sk.ca						
No Bid	* 8-553	Battery Fleetnet Emerson,7.5V Battery. , , , , Good		\$1	19A705393P3	ENV
No Bid	* 8-564	Video/Audio Cable Kit PURE AV by Blekin Composite video and audio cable kit. , , , , New - Unused		\$5		ENV
\$26.01	10-513	Tire on Rim GoodYear Wrangler (Steel rim rusted) 17" LT 245 75 R17. 8 bolt pattern - manufacturer unknown. , , , , Poor		\$1		ENV
\$37.50	10-514	Tire on Rim GoodYear Duatrac (Chrome rim) 17" LT 265 70 R17. 6 bolt pattern - manufacturer unknown. , , , , Fair		\$1		ENV

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
PRINCE ALBERT, Environment, 63-12th St East						
Contact Michael Paschke 306-953-2985 or 306-930-9309 michael.paschke@gov.sk.ca						
\$2,099.00	10-515	Snowmobile 1998 Polaris Indy Trail Touring 550 last ran 2 years ago-issue blow back through air box, large rear rack, 2up seat, , , , , Fair		\$1	4XAET4ES8XC067315	ENV
PRINCE ALBERT, Justice Corrections and Policing, Prince Albert Correctional Centre, 3021 1st Avenue W.						
Contact Don Balan 306-953-3000, donald.balan@gov.sk.ca or Dean Schmalz 306-953-3039, dean.schmalz@gov.sk.ca						
\$234.56	* 9-501	Food Cart lot of 3 metal with wheels Used to take food to units. , , , , Fair		\$1		CPPS
\$234.56	* 9-502	Food Cart lot of 3 metal with wheels Used to take food to units. , , , , Fair		\$1		CPPS
\$234.56	* 9-503	Food Cart lot of 3 metal with wheels Used to take food to units. , , , , Fair		\$1		CPPS
REGINA, AGRICULTURE, 3085 Albert Street.						
Contact Denise Konieczny 306-787-5854, denise.konieczny@gov.sk.ca						
No Bid	* 9-530	Cabinet lateral 3 drawer, metal No key, Beige, 36"L x 18"W x 39"H. , , , , Good		\$1		AG
No Bid	* 9-531	Chair lot of 2 metal and wood, cloth brown fabric, wood arm rests, 4 legs. , , , , Good		\$1		AG
\$40.00	* 9-532	Chair lot of 8 wood frames, cloth 1 Swivel (5 castor), 7 standard chairs with 4 legs, cranberry in colour. , , , , Good		\$1		AG
\$15.00	* 9-533	Table Laminate, Metal Stand white top, single pedestal stand, 36"x29". , , , , Good		\$1		AG
REGINA, Justice, Court of Appeal, 2425 Victoria Avenue.						
Contact Ryley Hobbs 306-787-3107 rhobbs@sasklawcourts.ca or Scott Polowyk 306-787-5437, spolowyk@sasklawcourts.ca						
No Bid	10-516	Dell Power Supply RPS720 external power supply 19", 720W, 4 DC out. , , , , New - Unused		\$1		JU

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
\$36.12	10-517	Server Dell PowerEdge R2850 and rackmount rails purchased 2006 8GB ram, storage removed, 1 hot swap bay. For more information on this product check the following link with the serial number: https://www.dell.com/support/home/en-ca Item is heavy and purchaser must be able to move/load/transport without assistance. ,,,,, Good		\$1	F7HVZF1	JU
\$36.12	10-518	Server Dell PowerEdge R710 and rackmount rails purchased 2010 12GB ram, storage removed, 1 hot swap bay. For more information on this product check the following link with the serial number: https://www.dell.com/support/home/en-ca Item is heavy and purchaser must be able to move/load/transport without assistance. ,,,,, Good		\$1	DD0F4M1	JU
\$36.12	10-519	Server Dell PowerEdge R710 and rackmount rails purchased 2010 12GB ram, Storage removed, 2 hot swap bays. For more information on this product check the following link with the serial number: https://www.dell.com/support/home/en-ca Item is heavy and purchaser must be able to move/load/transport without assistance. ,,,,, Good		\$1	CD0F4M1	JU
\$36.12	10-520	Server Dell PowerEdge R710 and rackmount rails purchased 2010 12GB ram, storage removed, 7 hot swap bays. For more information on this product check the following link with the serial number: https://www.dell.com/support/home/en-ca Item is heavy and purchaser must be able to move/load/transport without assistance. ,,,,, Good		\$1	BD0F4M1	JU
No Bid	10-521	Tape Rack Dell PowerVault 114T and rackmount rails purchased 2008 storage removed. For more information on this product check the following link with the serial number: https://www.dell.com/support/home/en-ca Item is heavy and purchaser must be able to move/load/transport without assistance. ,,,,, Beyond Repair		\$1	3H5CJD1	JU

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
SASKATCHEWAN LANDING Provincial Park, Parks Culture and Sport, Maintenance Yard						
Contact Tricia Bacon 306-375-5525, 306-741-3940 email: tricia.bacon@gov.sk.ca						
\$750.00	10-522	Car 2006 Chevrolet Cobalt LS 4 door 2.2L, Inline 4, Gas auto air, tilt, AM, FM, CD radio single tires. , White, 149,672 km, , PROBLEMS: Does not start, wiring chewed by rodents/rabbits. Total extent of damage is unknown. Motor, transmission, tires, brakes, battery, body exterior, exhaust, windshield glass, windshield wipers, paint, interior, lights, mirrors are all fair condition. Horn is unknown., As is, Where is.	149,672 km	\$50	1G1AJ55F467843283	Parks
\$649.00	10-523	Car 2007 Chrysler Sebring Touring 4 door 2.4L, inline 4, gas auto air, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD radio, 4 gears, 108.9 wheel base. GVW 2087/4600LB,, grey, 276,450 km, , PROBLEMS: needs a new radiator, has rust developing in fenders over wheels. Motor, transmission, tires, windshield washer and wipers are fair. Brakes, battery, body exterior, exhaust, windshield glass, paint, interior, lights, mirrors, are good condition. Horn is unknown., As is, Where is.	276,450 km	\$50	1C3LC56RX7N634733	Parks
\$2,852.79	10-524	Truck 2005 GMC Sierra 2500 HD 4x4, 3/4 ton, Crewcab 6.0 L V8 gas auto, 4 gears air, AM/FM, radio, 4 door running boards, hitch on front and rear, single axle, and single tires. GVW is 4173kg/92000lb, black, 308,404 km, , PROBLEMS: Has a history of overheating, Motor, transmission, paint are poor condition. Tires, brakes, battery, body exterior, exhaust, windshield glass, windshield washer and wipers, interior, lights, mirrors are all fair condition. Horn is unknown., As is, Where is.	308,404 km	\$50	1GTHK23U45F924095	Parks
SASKATOON, Highways, 126 105th Street E.						
Contact Richard Leibel 306-933-5262, Richard.Leibel@gov.sk.ca						
\$5,050.00	10-525	Motor Grader 2000 JD 770CH 8.1L inline 6 cylinder JD Powershift, 8 forward-8 reverse , yellow, , , PROBLEMS: Hydraulics leak everywhere, diff leak, right front axel seal leak, door latch sticks, battery is dead, motor is pushing oil through exhaust (over filled) exhaust full of oil. Engine is not running no compression and blow by, transmission jumps out of gear. Motor, transmission, tires, brakes, battery, body exterior, exhaust, windshield washer and wiper and paint are all in poor condition. Interior is fair. Windshield glass, lights, mirrors, and horn and in good condition., As is, where is.		\$500	576023	HI

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
\$4,885.85	10-526	Wheel Loader 2004 Hyundai, 2.5 Yard HL740-3 Cummins B5.9-C, inline 6 cylinder, diesel auto 4WG-160, 4 speed , yellow, 4,500 hr , , PROBLEMS: Transmission pump not working, torque converter removed, Roll Over Protective Structure (ROPS) corroded, drive shaft removed, battery dead, rims rusted, tires are cracked and leaking, all pins are siezed, exhaust manifold is corroded. Unit will not start or drive. Paint, body exterior, exhaust and transmission are poor. Motor, tires, brakes, battery and interior are fair. Windshield glass, windshield washer and wipers, lights, mirrors and horn are all good., As is, Where is.	4,500 hr	\$2,500	L70310966	HI
SWIFT CURRENT, Highways, Fleet Services, 1200 South Service Road W						
Contact Landis Sather 306-778-8349, or 306-741-7937 email: landis.sather@gov.sk.ca						
\$2,650.00	10-528	Truck 2002 International, gravel Navistar 2574 Box length 121' L10 Cummins, inline 6, diesel Eaton RTL (O), 10 gear HC, dual tires, a locking differential, tandem axle, GVW is 39500 kg , yellow, 365491, Recent Repairs: Transmission 2016. Injectors 2020, PROBLEMS: Excessive frame deflection from rust between frames. Lots of cab and fire wall rust. Truck leans while box is in air. Battery, body exterior, exhaust, windshield glass, windshield wipers and washer, paint and interior are all poor. Motor, tires, lights are fair. Transmission, horn are good condition., As is, Where is.	365491	\$2,500	1HTGGAHT22H398253	HI
\$1,001.00	10-527	Truck 1999 Volvo, gravel Tandem WG64 VE12B, inline 6, diesel Eaton auto Select, 10 speeds A/C, box length is 12'. Dual tires, rear axle is tandem, GVW is 39500 kg , yellow, not accurate (15850 hrs) , Recent Repairs: Exhaust and transmission work, PROBLEMS: Unit was diagnosed with engine camshaft failure, running rough, smoking and towed back from section, unit is passed expected life for ministry equipment based on hours. Some rust. Motor is poor condition, Transmission, tires, brakes, battery, body exterior, exhaust, fair, windshield washer and wipers, paint, interior, lights, mirrors, horn are all fair., As is, Where is.	not accurate (15850 hrs)	\$500	4VHJCAGF7XN865382	HI
WEYBURN, Agriculture, RSB, 113-110 Souris Avenue.						
Contact Karen Hennig 306-848-2373, karen.hennig@gov.sk.ca Or Darla Kwochka 306-848-2857						
No Bid	10-529	Califone stand metal Stand 37-59" and mounting bracket 7"x11". , , , , , Good		\$10		AG
\$22.22	10-530	JVC - VCR Model HR-A56U Comes with case and remote - operational. 10.5" x 14.25" , , , , , Good		\$10	095F0629	AG

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
\$22.75	10-531	Overhead Projector Model 301 LA operational- -adjustable up to 24"H x13"W x 13"D. , , , , , Good		\$10	1210022	AG
No Bid	10-532	Slide Projector Kodak Ektagraphic III Comes with case, user manual and slide advancer. 14" high x 14.75" wide x 9" depth , , , , , Good		\$10	A-569034	AG
No Bid	10-533	File Cabinet lateral, five drawer operational. Metal - 51"H x 36"W x 18"D - missing drawer face. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Fair		\$1		AG
No Bid	10-534	File Cabinet lateral, five drawer operational. Metal - 64.5"H x 36"W 17.5"D. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Fair		\$1		AG
\$25.00	10-535	File Cabinet lateral, four drawer operational metal- 53"H x 36"W x 19"D. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Good		\$1		AG
\$10.02	10-536	File Cabinet lateral, four drawer operational metal- 53"H x 36"W x 19"D. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Good		\$1		AG
\$10.02	10-537	File Cabinet lateral, four drawer operational metal- 53"H x 36"W x 19"D. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Good		\$1		AG
\$10.02	10-538	File Cabinet lateral, four drawer operational metal- 53"H x 36"W x 19"D. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Good		\$1		AG
\$10.02	10-539	File Cabinet lateral, four drawer operational metal- 53"H x 36"W x 19"D. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Good		\$1		AG
\$10.02	10-540	File Cabinet lateral, four drawer operational metal- 53"H x 36"W x 19"D. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Good		\$1		AG
\$10.02	10-541	File Cabinet lateral, four drawer operational metal- 53"H x 36"W x 19"D. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Good		\$1		AG
No Bid	10-542	File Cabinet lateral, four drawer operational metal- 53"H x 36"W x 19"D. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Good		\$1		AG
No Bid	10-543	File Cabinet lateral, four drawer operational metal- 53"H x 36"W x 19"D. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Good		\$1		AG
\$10.02	10-544	File Cabinet lateral, four drawer operational metal- 53"H x 36"W x 19"D. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Good		\$1		AG

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
\$10.02	10-545	File Cabinet lateral, four drawer operational metal- 53"H x 36"W x 19"D. Cream colour. No keys. , , , , , Good		\$1		AG
WEYBURN, Highways, 18 Souris Ave.						
Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775 allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca						
\$6,725.48	10-546	Truck 2002 Volvo, gravel tandem VHD64F 4x4 VED 12C, inline 6 cyl, diesel Standard Super 10 air, cruise, tilt, 14' box, dual tires, Standard Super 10, GVW is 34000 kg. , yellow, 413,760 km, , PROBLEMS: Needs 3 tail lights, rear plate lights out, air horn not working, rear drive left side brake sticky, frame rails thin above rear diffs, front steer fender brackets broken, rear cab mounts rusting out (cracked and holes), (fails SGI safety), shocks rotten on cab, cab air bags need replacing, cab leveling valve issue (seized), bottom rad hose/steel pipe leaking, windshield stone chips, driver's seat belt torn, gladhand connector loose. Windshield washer and wipers, windshield glass and paint are poor condition. The tires, body exterior, mirrors and interior are fair. Brakes, battery, exhaust are OK, lights transmission, horn are working., As is, Where is.	413,760 km	\$1,500	4V5KC9GG42N329863	HI
\$2,099.00	10-547	Truck 1996 Volvo tandem, cab and chassis WG64 4x4 interlock VED 12/310 HP, inline 6, diesel standard 10 speed air, cruise, GVW 39,500 standard differential, dual tires, tandem axle , yellow, 16,942 hr, , Cross member replace between rear differential, frame rail will is fail there also rust jacking at rear cross member forcing it away from frame rail and bending cross member out of shape. Bolts on right front of rear leaf angled and don't look tight. Holes in bottom of cab around passenger front mount (some holes already filled with spray foam). Cracked right front cab mount bracket. Hole in drivers side roof. Hood hinges and rests replace (hood hitting cab). Hood is almost broken right through right bottom by mount and cracking out on left side. Rear motor mounts. Muffler replace. Radiator needs replacing (rotten). S-cams sticky (replace washers and snap rings). Air dryer and governor replace (air system acting funny in the cold) possible compressor. P/S leak at reservoir. Check engine light flashing. Passenger mirror replace. Driver door catch replace. Wires pinched for tail lights by bar lift cylinder. Steer shaft splines have a fair amount of play. Looks like steer brake shoes separating from backing plate, power steering leaks., As is, Where is.	16,942 hr	\$1,000	4V5JCBGE4TR849749	HI

Highest Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
YORKTON, Highways, Fleet Services, 245 York Road East.						
Contact Brian Perih 306-786-1651 or Ed Patzwald 06-786-1687 email: brian.perih@gov.sk.ca or ed.patzwald@gov.sk.ca.						
\$5,780.00	10-548	Loader 1996 Komatsu WA120-1 1.75 Four wheel Drive Cummins 3.9, diesel auto, 3 gears single tires, standard differential , yellow, 2916 hr, , PROBLEMS: Roll Over Protective Structure (ROPS) potential compromised, park brake worn out, engine panels missing/broken/seized/very rusted, fenders very rusty, play in steering cylinders pins and bushings, steering cylinder bosses in frame worn out, bucket cracked along bottom edge around bolt holes and rusted along the top, transmission is leaking oil, unit was run low on transmission fluid, was used and overheated, third gear very slow to engage, rear differential pinion seal is leaking and low on oil, engine oil leak, radiator is badly corroded and crumbling, heater core is leaking and structure around core in cab is rotted away, fan belt needs replacing, water pump and idler in poor shape, several hydraulic hoses leaking and need replacement, several steel hydraulic lines leaking and need replacement, air intake pipe very rusted and in bad shape, tires in poor condition 30% left, Cab very rusty, back window held in by rust, right hand door sill completely crumbled, holes in cab floor and walls, motor, transmission, tires, body exterior, paint, interior, mirrors are all poor condition. Brakes, battery, exhaust, windshield glass, washer and wipers, lights and horn are fair condition., As is, Where is.	2916 hr	\$250	A20361	HI