

As a reminder there is **NO ONSITE VIEWING, ONLINE-ONLY VIEWINGS** of sale items.

Thank you for your cooperation.

Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit [www.SaskSurplus.ca](http://www.SaskSurplus.ca) for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with \* have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on [www.SaskSurplus.ca](http://www.SaskSurplus.ca) web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from [www.SaskSurplus.ca](http://www.SaskSurplus.ca) or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to (306)787-2092; by phone (306)787-2062 or (306)787-2238,
- by email to [sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca](mailto:sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca), or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred.  
WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller,  
No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

---

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
<b>4,302.99 * 7-010</b>	SUV, 2007 CHEVROLET Tahoe, 5 passenger, 2WD, 5.3L V8 Gas, Auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/mirrors/driver seat, rear HVAC, keyless entry (3 keys, 2 fobs), vinyl rear seat, handles for B pillars in centre arm rest, front tow hooks White, 267,294 Kms, PROBLEMS: rear tires bald/extremely poor (automatically failed inspection as per SGI policy), hood small dents, rust on all fenders, RF fender dents, LF and LR doors rust inside bottom, LR door dents, RR door rust along bottom, tailgate chips, paint cracking, no first aid kit, no fire extinguisher, windshield chips, driver seat worn/holes/covered with tape, holes drilled in dash & centre arm rest, holes drilled in mirror housing, roof small dents/3 sealed holes, battery poor, minor exterior damage>, As is, Where is	267,294 Kms	<b>\$1,365</b>	1GNEC03067R401705	CVA	423830	2110-398
<b>2,589.89 8-001</b>	Car, 2007 CHEVROLET Impala LS, FWD, 3.5L V6 Gas, Auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/locks/mirrors, power driver seat & trunk release, keyless entry (2 keys, 2 fobs), Brown, 246,268 Kms, PROBLEMS: oil leak, rack leaking, left inner tie rod loose, front pads wearing on angle, alignment out, rocker panels rust & road rash, hood dents, LF fender dents/scratches, glove box does not open all the way, right sun visor clip broken, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	246,268 Kms	<b>\$569</b>	2G1WB58K679385936	CVA	313460	2111-464
<b>2,251.21 8-002</b>	Car, 2007 CHEVROLET Impala LS, FWD, 3.5L V6 Gas, Auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/locks/mirrors, power driver seat & trunk release, keyless entry (2 keys, 2 fobs), Brown, 247,253 Kms, Recent Repairs: oil leak PROBLEMS: RF lower ball joint loose, rear links loose, front and rear pads/rotors, alignment out, windshield cracked, rocker panels rusted, missing hub caps (left side), hole in front bumper, RF fender dent, all doors road rash, roof rust spot (front edge), battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	247,253 Kms	<b>\$569</b>	2G1WB58K779384892	CVA	313528	2111-463
<b>2,251.21 8-003</b>	Car, 2007 CHRYSLER Sebring, FWD, 2.7L V6 Gas, Auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/locks, power drivers seat & trunk release, heated mirrors, keyless entry (2 key fobs), driving lights, White, 244,840 Kms, Recent Repairs: P0456 EVAP small leak PROBLEMS: engine light, left lower ball joint, rear struts, hood hail damage/paint peeling, front bumper cracked/loose at RF fender, rear bumper scratches, LR fender rust, RR fender minor rust, both rocker panels road rash, LR door road rash/rust along inside bottom, RR door road rash, roof hail damage, trunk lid rust/dent, head liner loose, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	244,840 Kms	<b>\$566</b>	1C3LC56R97N634741	CVA	155218	2111-467

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
<b>3,821.21 8-004</b>	SUV, 2009 DODGE Durango SLT, 4WD, 2 passenger, rear seats (loose), 5.7L V8 Gas, Auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/drivers seat, heated mirrors, keyless entry (2 fobs), rear HVAC, roof rack with beacon (condition unknown), cargo barrier, shelving, plywood rear floor, front tow hooks, driving lights, hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake White, 156,400 Kms, PROBLEMS: check engine light & ABS, left lower ball joint, rack & pinion leaking, rear pads/rotors, C1000 & C107C brake pedal switch, P0703 brake switch 2, P0456 EVAP (small), P0457 EVAP(gas cap), all fenders rusted, both left doors road rash/rusted, RF door moulding loose, RR door road rash, tailgate rust inside seam, roof rust at front/11 sealed holes & 2 unsealed, windshield scratched, battery poor, minor exterior damage., As is, Where is	156,400 Kms	<b>\$1,002</b>	1D8HB48T39F717779	CVA STEL	434891 297293	2111-460 2109-378
<b>1,921.21 8-005</b>	SUV, 2006 JEEP Liberty, 4WD, 5 passenger, 3.7L V6 Gas, Auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD plaer, power windows/locks/mirrors, keyless entry (2 fobs), hitch, trailer wiring, driving lights, roof rails Silver, 242,118 Kms, PROBLEMS: front differential noise, no park brake, belt tensioner, all brake pads/rotors, A/C compressor, driver door window will not roll up (tape holding seal along top of windshield loose), both left doors badly rusted, both right doors rusted along bottom, RF fender scratches, both rocker panels rusted, all rims paint peeling, tailgate scratches/rust around upper brake light, roof rust along front edge, wheel wrench & jack missing, battery poor, minor exterior damage., As is, Where is	242,118 Kms	<b>\$576</b>	1J4GL48K96W224466	CVA	441162	2111-461
<b>3,889.89 8-006</b>	Truck, 2009 CHEVROLET Silverado 3500, RWD, crew cab, 8' box, has a back seat, 6.0L V8 Gas, Auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry (2 fobs, 3 keys), front tow hooks, grille inserts, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, electric brake, westward jobsite chest mounted in box (24" deep x 45" wide x 21" high - rusty exterior, oil contaminants inside- condition unknown) White, 354,063 Kms, PROBLEMS: oil cooling lines seeping, front and rear pads & rotors, tires cupped, rocker panels rusted, front bumper dent, rear bumper dents/bent, all fenders rust/dents, both left doors dents, dent on both box rails, rear seat belt (middle) doesn't work, driver seat worn/ripped, paint splatter in interior, 2 holes in centre hump & floor pan, centre arm rest worn, drivers weather stripping poor, wipers poor, battery poor, roof small rust spots, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	354,063 Kms	<b>\$572</b>	1GCHC73KX9F168626	CVA	451559	2111-465

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
<b>6,289.89 8-007</b>	Truck, 2012 DODGE Ram 1500, 4WD, crew cab, 5'7" box, has a back seat , 5.7L V8 Gas, Auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/mirrors/windows, keyless entry (2 fobs, 2 keys), Leer black fiberglass topper, sliding side windows (condition unknown), side steps, front tow hooks, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake Black, 254,889 Kms, PROBLEMS: brakes grinding, front and rear pads & rotors, right lower ball joint slight play, rear links, both outer CV boots, wheel alignment needed, all tires poor, front bumper rusted, rear bumper bent, tailgate will not open, both bumpers rusted, centre console damaged, LF fender rust/scratches/road rash, RF fender rust, RR fender road rash, windshield chips, left plate light out, cushion for jump seat missing, hood chips/scratches, roof scratches/rust spots/2 sealed holes, battery poor, minor exterior damage., As is, Where is	254,889 Kms	<b>\$2,195</b>	1C6RD7KT1CS224681	CVA	437704	2111-458
<b>5,089.89 8-008</b>	Truck, 2012 DODGE Ram 1500, 4WD, crw cab, 5'7" box, has a back seat, 5.7L V8 Gas, Auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/mirrors/windows, keyless entry (2 fobs, 2 keys), Leer black fiberglass topper, sliding side windows (condition unknown), side steps, grille inserts, front tow hooks, slide out with plywood box attached-condition unknown, hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, mud flaps Black, 303,478 Kms, PROBLEMS: both lower ball joints, wheel alignment needed, TPMS, windshield cracked, rear bumper rusted/bent, tailgate will not open, LF fender rusted, LR fender road rash, RF fender scratch, RR fender small rust spot, LF door dent, front bumper chips/scratches, hood chips, rear bumper rusted, bent, stone chips, cushion for jump seat missing (aluminum tray in its place), brackets mounted to roof frame, roof small rust spot/2 sealed holes, battery poor, minor exterior damage., As is, Where is	303,478 Kms	<b>\$1,460</b>	1C6RD7KT5CS224683	CVA	437696	2111-459
<b>3,589.89 8-009</b>	Truck, 2007 FORD F150, RWD, super cab, 6'6" box, has a back seat, 4.6L V8 Gas, Auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, 2 keys, mud flaps, head ache rack, hitch, trailer wiring White, 215,720 Kms, PROBLEMS: flagged by mechanic for rust and age of vehicle, power steering leak, front tires worn, TPMS, grille broken, front bumper small dents, rear bumper pad loose, LF fender rust, LR & RR fender dent/rust, RR door dents, tailgate dents, wiper blades poor, missing RR hub cap, floor of box has rust spots, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	215,720 Kms	<b>\$530</b>	1FTRX12W97FB24026	CVA	450569	2111-466

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
7,089.89 8-010	Truck, 2010 FORD F250, 4WD, crew cab, 6'9" box, has a back seat, 5.4L V8 Gas, Auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/heated mirrors, keyless entry (1 fob, 2 keys), front mounted receiver, side steps, mud flaps, front tow hooks, trailer tow mirrors, trailer hitch, trailer wiring (may be damaged), spare tire (loose in box, may not be compatible with vehicle) White, 225,282 Kms, Recent Repairs: TPMS, day time lights, side marker PROBLEMS: play in upper right ball joint, both rear axle seals sweating, rear bumper bent/rust, hood chips, rust spot, LF fender dented, RR fender dents, all fenders road rash, LF door dent, RR door scratch, tailgate dents/missing molding, truck box damage, LF mirror hole in housing, LF seat and back worn/trim loose, rear bumper pad bolted down, missing jump seat, holes in head liner, front bumper scratches, hood chip/rust spot, roof small rust spots/scratches/4 sealed holes, battery poor, wheel wrench & jack missing, minor exterior damage., As is, Where is	225,282	\$1,553	1FTSW2B53AEA01417	CVA	435427	2111-457
6,289.89 8-011	Truck, 2013 FORD F250 Super Duty, 4WD, super cab, 6'9" box, has a back seat, 6.2L V8 Gas, Auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD/MP3, power locks/front windows, heated mirrors, keyless entry (2 fobs), grille inserts, front tow hooks, mud flaps, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, trailer tow mirrors, headache rack with beacon (condition unknown) Blue, 313,783 Kms, PROBLEMS: brakes poor, right outer tie rod, front & rear pads & rotors, all tires poor, alignment out, engine oil 1 litre down, both rear fenders multiple scratches, LR door dented, roof small dents & rust spots, tailgate dents/scratches/molding loose, windshield cracked/chipped, driver seat ripped/worn, rear bumper small dent, driver's seatbelt buckle damaged, seats soiled, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	313,783	\$3,325	1FT7X2B68DEA00683	CVA	438470	2111-468
5,089.89 8-012	Van, 2008 FORD E350 Econoline Wagon, RWD, 15 passenger, 5.4L V8 Gas, Auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power locks/front windows, 1 key, beacon on roof & light mounted facing forward on windshield (condition unknown), hitch, trailer wiring Brown, 174,012 Kms, PROBLEMS: engine light, ABS, RSC, e-brake does not hold, P0126 coolant thermostat stuck open, P0171 & P0174 system to lean B1 & B2, C1175 & C1236 LR wheel speed sensor, B1318 battery voltage low, B1317 battery voltage high, hood small dents, RR door cracked at bottom/rust, both bumpers scratches/small dents, all fenders road rash, LF fender rust, driver seat cushion worn, all rear bench seats stained, seats in row 3 & 4 damaged, cable cut between front seats, windshield condition unknown, plate light out, crank for jack loose under back seat, spare tire not secured (may not be compatible with vehicle), battery poor, minor exterior damage., As is, Where is	174,012	\$514	1FBSS31LX8DB48730	CVA	424531	2111-462

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
<b>REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.</b>							
<b>ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. NO ON-SITE VIEWING. Contact SaskSurplus (306) 787-2062 or (306) 798-3306.</b>							
51.99 * 7-101	Aluminum Chest, , Lock handles face front, no keys, , , 30 1/4 inches W x 17 3/4 inches D x 19 3/4 inches H, lip open up, has some mount holes, , , , Good		\$15	NIL serial # KRJ made 410704	STEL	67	2107-251
50.99 * 7-102	Aluminum Chest, , Lock handles, face front, no keys, , , 30 1/4 inches W x 17 3/4 inches D x 19 3/4 inches H, lip open up, has some mount holes, , , , Good		\$15	NIL serial # Titan Stainless 437563	STEL	61	2107-251
53.00 * 7-103	Aluminum Chest, , Lock handles, face front, no keys, , , 30 1/4 inches W x 17 3/4 inches D x 19 3/4 inches H, lip open up, has some mount holes, , , , Good		\$15	NIL serial # KRJ made 417139A	STEL	66	2107-251
1.26 8-107	Ballast, Lot of 2 , Metal, , , Program start, 347 volt, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	156	2110-430
45.45 8-101	Battery charger, , Marquette model 610, , , charger/starter/booster. 6/12 volt. Some functions may not work., , , , Poor		\$20		CVA	111	2110-421
5.00 8-108	Battery Unit, , Weatherproof, , , Bolla, with heads, 12 VDE, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	157	2110-430
7.77 8-109	Cable, , Station Z, , , 200 meters, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	158	2110-430
78.00 8-140	Cable Grip-Puller, , 2.5 tonne, , , Operational, , , , Fair		\$1		SBP	155	2110-431
11.00 8-110	Chop Saw Grinding Discs, Lot of 3 , Cutting Material, , , 14X 3/32, 1 inch arbor, SAIT Brand, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	159	2110-430
66.18 8-111	Circuit Breaker, , EATON, , , 225 Amp, 600 Volt, 3 pole, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	160	2110-430
9.00 8-112	Circuit Breaker, , Square D, FAL 34060, , , 3 pole, 60 Amp , 600 Volts, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	161	2110-430
35.00 8-141	Circular Saw, , Makita, Model: 5007nb, , , Operational, , , , Fair		\$1	391,308	SBP	147	2110-431
8.00 8-142	Circular saw #389, , Milwaukee, Model: 6365, , , 7.25", Corded, , , , Fair		\$1	546B499010496	SBP	148	2110-431
150.00 8-143	Compound Miter Saw, , Makita , , , Operational, , , , Fair		\$1	LS 1013	SBP	146	2110-431
75.00 8-144	Concrete Vibrator, , Dreyer, , , Operational, , , , Fair		\$1	JE76103	SBP	152	2110-431
150.00 8-113	Copper Wire, Lot of 2 , Metal, , , #14 AWG, RW90, Black 2 rolls approximately 500 Meters, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	162	2110-430

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
24.00 8-145	Cord Reel, , Metal, , , Operational, , , , Fair		\$1		SBP	153	2110-431
101.00 8-146	Coumpound Miter saw, , Hitachi, 1016, , , Operational, , , , Fair		\$1	W872443	SBP	150	2110-431
10.51 8-114	Dimmers and Covers, Lot of 6 , Plastic and Metal, , , Lutron, 120 volt, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	163	2110-430
6.00 8-115	Disconnect, , Weatherproof, , , 30 A, 600 Volt, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	164	2110-430
2.00 8-116	Door Opener Push Buttons, Lot of 2 , Metal, electric, , , Wheel chair entry, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	165	2110-430
1.26 8-117	Down Spout Hangers, lot of 6 , Metal, , , , , , Good		\$1		SBP	166	2110-430
10.57 8-118	Downlight Fixture, , Metal, , , 6 inch, 120 volt, 4000 K, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	167	2110-430
21.00 8-147	Drill, , Dewalt, 18V XRP Cordless, , , Unknown if operational, , , , Fair		\$1	70,109	SBP	149	2110-431
42.50 8-119	Drill, Reversible, , Hitachi, 3/8 inch, DS 14DVF, , , 2 batteries, 14.4 volt, charger, case, with charger and case, operational, , , , Good		\$1	JD34155	SBP	168	2110-430
5.00 8-120	Engergi Tripak, , Plastic and Metal, , , 24 volt Lutron Power Pak, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	187	2110-430
127.57 8-152	Fiberglass truck box topper, , Cap It Genuine Truckware. Black in color, , , Keys Inside Topper, Sliding Side and Front Windows, Scratch L/R Corner, Aprox box size. 6 feet by 5 feet 2 inches, , , , Fair		\$100		CVA	116	2110-436
307.00 8-153	Fiberglass truck box topper, , Raider Vagabond, white in color, , , , No keys, Beacon-Condition Unknown, Small Side Slider Windows, Clear Coat Peeling, Aprox box size. 5 feet by 4 feet 8 inches, , , , Fair		\$75		CVA	114	2110-436
127.57 8-154	Fiberglass truck box topper, , Raider Vagabond, white in color, , , , No keys, Flip out Side Windows, Aprox box size. 6 feet by 5 feet 2 inches, , , , Fair		\$100		CVA	115	2110-436
4.50 8-121	Flange Kit, Lot of 46 , Metal, , , Row adapter brackets, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	169	2110-430
No Bid * 8-164	Folding Bench Seat, , 2nd row, 2 person, black cloth with head rests, , , cup holder, wheels on rear mounting frames to assist in removal, may fit a 2006 or 2007 Dodge Caravan, , , , Fair		\$10		CVA	194	2111-469
No Bid * 8-165	Folding Bench Seat, , 2nd row, 2 person, black cloth with head rests, , , cup holder, wheels on rear mounting frames to assist in removal, may fit a 2006 or 2007 Dodge Caravan, , , , Fair		\$10		CVA	195	2111-469
25.00 8-122	Fuses, Lot of 50 , Metal, , , Various wattage, Fuse Tek, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	170	2110-430

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
72.00 8-148	Hammer Drill, , Ramset , , , Operational, , , , Fair		\$1	1,243,249	SBP	151	2110-431
6.00 8-123	Heater Overloads, Lot of 100 , Metal, , , , , , Good		\$1		SBP	171	2110-430
9.01 8-149	Hoist, Winch, Rigging, , Lebus, , , Chain Hooks, Red, , , , Fair		\$1		SBP	154	2110-431
2.76 8-124	Light Fixture, , Metal, , , 8 feet, 120V to 277 Volt, T5, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	172	2110-430
2.76 8-125	Light Fixture, Lot of 3 , Metal, , , 8 feet, 120V to 277 Volt, T8, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	173	2110-430
18.00 8-126	Load Center, , Metal and plastic, , , 60 amp, 120/240 volt, 1 phase, Square D, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	188	2110-430
5.00 8-127	LVT Cable, , Copper, , , #18 gauge, 6 conductor, 30 meters, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	174	2110-430
1.76 * 6-174	Magnetic ballasts, Lot of 2 , Sylvania, Luminux, , , For 50 watt, high pressure sodium bulbs,.120 volt, , , , New in Box		\$1		SaskSurplus	72	2108-324
15.00 * 6-175	Manual Motor Controller, , Pass and Seymour, Legrand, , , 3-30 HP motor rating, all poles breaking, 3 P, 3PH, , , , Good		\$1	Cut 7863-R	SaskSurplus	ss4475	2108-312
76.00 8-150	Miter saw stand, , Mastercraft, , , , , , Fair		\$1		SBP	144	2110-431
12.00 8-128	Open Tank Float Switch, Lot of 3 , Metal, , , Square D, 9036GG2, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	175	2110-430
19.01 8-129	Parking Rail Receptacles, Lot of 15 , Metal, , , IPLC 120 volt, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	176	2110-430
12.00 8-130	Pressure Switch, Lot of 3 , Metal, , , Square D, 9013 GHG 2J S8X, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	177	2110-430
3.11 * 6-189	Push button sign indicators , Lot of 137 , Metal, Westinghouse, , , 1 3/4 " W, 1 /2 " open centre for Westinghouse panel, , , , Good		\$1		SaskSurplus	70	2108-324
15.00 8-131	Push on Breakers, Lot of 36 , Metal and plastic, , , Eaton, Siemens, Cutler-Hammer, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	178	2110-430
6.00 8-132	Remote Leads, Lot of 2 , Weatherproof, , , Bolla, 12 VDE, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	179	2110-430
3.59 8-133	Rope, Lot of 2 , 3/8 inch, , , 10 meters each, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	180	2110-430
107.50 8-102	Running boards, set of 2 , Ford Factory, , , OEM. Removed from a 2018 F250 Crew Cab. , , , , Excellent		\$50	800,997	CVA	112	2110-421
107.50 8-166	Running Boards, Set of 2 , removed from a 2006 Ford F250 4 door cab , , , black, , , , Fair		\$40	438,275	CVA	197	2111-469



Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
10.00 * 7-135	Seat, , grey cloth, , , may be complatible with a 2008 Ford E350 passenger van, , , , Fair		\$10	424,259	CVA	40	2109-340
No Bid * 8-167	Seats, Lot of 4 , cloth, , , grey, may be compatable with a 2006 Ford Econoline E350, 15 passenger , , , Fair		\$40	422,543	CVA	196	2111-469
22.00 8-134	Split Braided Sleeving, , Black Woven Plastic, , , 15 meters, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	181	2110-430
14.77 8-135	Strip Light Fixture, , LED, Metal, , , 4 feet, 347 volt, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	182	2110-430
5.47 8-136	Stud Mount Device Boxes, Lot of 6 , For wood mount, , , , , Good		\$1		SBP	183	2110-430
60.01 8-103	Tire on steel rim , , Goodyear Integrity. M+S, , , 225/60R/16. May be compatable with a 2007 Chev. Impala. 314526, , , Fair		\$20	Manufacture date. Week 15, year 2011	CVA	110	2110-421
29.01 8-104	Tire on steel rim , , Hercules Max Plus IV, M+S, , , 225/60R/16. May be compatable with a 2008 Chev. Impala. 316240, , , Poor		\$10	Manufacture date. Week 53, year 2012.	CVA	109	2110-421
107.77 * 7-143	Tires, Set of 2 , 16 inch, 205/60R/16, Winter TXI, , , M+S, Snowflake, manufacture date: week 24, year 2016, , , , Good		\$80		CVA	46	2109-341
127.77 * 7-144	Tires, Set of 2 , 16 inch, 205/60R/16. Sumitomo Ice Edge, , , M+S. Snowflake. Manufacture date: week 17, year 2018, , , , Good		\$80		CVA	60	2109-376
No Bid * 5-138	Tires, Set of 4 , 16 inch, 225/60R/16, Cooper , , , Grand Touring, M+S, Manufacture date - week 48, year 2016, 6/32 tread depth, , , , Fair		\$120		CVA	SS4299	2107-202
167.99 * 6-259	Tires, Set of 4 , 17 inch, 225/55R/17, Goodyear , , , Assurance All Season M+S. Manufacture date: week 44, year 2019, tread depth 8/32, , , , Fair		\$100		CVA	37	2108-311
75.00 * 7-155	Tires, Set of 2 , 17, inch 215/60R/17, Winter TXI, , , M+S, Snowflake, manufacture date: week 24, year 2016, , , , Fair		\$50		CVA	48	2109-341
100.00 8-155	Tires, Set of 2 , BF Goodrich Rugged Trail T/A, M+S, , , LT245/75R/17, Manufacture date. Week 24, year 2009., , , , Good		\$90		CVA	118	2110-436

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
61.01 8-156	Tires, Set of 4 , Firestone All Season. M+S, , , 225/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 47, year 2017., , , , Poor		\$40		CVA	117	2110-436
256.06 8-105	Tires, set of 4 , Firestone Winterforce. M+S, snowflake, , , 225/60R/16, , , , Excellent		\$200	Manufacture date. Week 05, year 2019.	CVA	108	2110-421
287.53 8-158	Tires, Set of 4 , Goodyear Ultra Grip Winter. Snow flake, M+S, , , 215/65R/17, Manufacture date. Week 25, year 2018. , , , , Good		\$160		CVA	120	2110-443
146.99 8-162	Tires, Set of 4 , Michelin Defender T+H. M+S, , , 235/55R/17, Manufacture date. Week 16, year 2016., , , , Fair		\$120		CVA	192	2110-443
No Bid * 8-163	Tires, Set of 4 , Sumitomo HTR Enhance. M+S, , , 215/60R/17, Manufacture date. Week 41, year 2016. , , , , Fair		\$120		CVA	193	2110-443
131.99 8-159	Tires, Set of 4 , Sumitomo HTR Enhance. M+S, , , 215/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 20, year 2017. , , , , Fair		\$120		CVA	189	2110-443
1,279.99 8-157	Tires, Set of 4 , Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow Flake., , , 225/60R/16, Manufacture date. Week 20. Year 2018, , , , Good		\$160		CVA	119	2110-436
215.00 8-161	Tires, Set of 4 , Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow flake. M+S, , , 215/60R/17, Manufacture date. Week 25, year 2018. , , , , Good		\$160		CVA	191	2110-443
315.50 8-160	Tires, Set of 4 , Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow flake. M+S, , , 215/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 22, year 2018. , , , , Excellent		\$250		CVA	190	2110-443
200.00 8-106	Topper, , Fiberglass Leer. Black in color. Sliding side windows., , , Removed from a 2012 Ram 1500. 5 foot 7 inch box. Keys available - locks do not work., , , , Good		\$100	437,720	CVA	113	2110-421
1,311.00 8-178	Trailer, Cable Dolly/Reel, , 1974, Home Built, Hydraulic, , , Pintle eye hook up, 6 pin round style trailer connection, electric brakes, tires- 11:00 x 20, 12 ply, 3 hydraulic jack sticks, 1 for tongue and 2 to raise reel carrier, 2 rear stabilizer drop down legs, 2 small reel bars, tongue jack, tongue is 7 1/2 ft long, trailer dimensions: 8 ft wide outside fender to outside fender, 10 ft from rear of dolly to start of tongue., , , , Good		\$500	SASK90577000263	STEL	940610	2111-474
711.00 8-180	Trailer, Cable Dolly/Reel, , 1980 Home Built, , , Pintle eye hook up, tongue jack, RV flat blade trailer connection, 2 rear stablizer stands, small reel bar, 2 tires- ST 205/75 R15, trailer dimensions: 83 inches wide, fender to outside fender, 10 1/2 ft long, hand cable winch., , , , Good		\$500	3,211,989	STEL	901758	2111-476

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
3,265.00 * 7-157	Trailer, Flat Deck, , 1997 Trail Tech , , , total length 21 feet 7 inches, 22 ft, 101 inches wide from outside fender to fender, wood deck 16 feet long, 80 inches wide with 2 beaver tails, 2 rear ramps, tires 4- ST235 85/R16, 6 pin round trailer connection, center tong jack, rear deck has a 2 ft slope, spare tire 235/65R16 on front, 1 3/4 inch thick rod pintle eye , , , , Good		\$500	2CU138GA5V2002812	STEL	975825	2110-412
1,890.00 * 7-158	Trailer, Flat Deck/Utility, , 2003 Majestic , , , total length 15 ft, 82 inches wide, fender to outside of fender, deck 10 ft long, 60 inches wide, pintle hitch with 1 3/4 inch thickness rod, wind screen checker plate 56 1/2 inch wide, 45 inches high, has 2 rear ramps, wood deck is in good shape, small 6 pin trailer connection, tires ST 225 75R15, , , , Good		\$500	2M9US11263R151711	STEL	926527	2110-410
1,601.01 8-179	Trailer, Pipe/Pole, , 1953, Home Built, , , Tandem axle, electric brakes, pintle eye hook up, RV style flat blade trailer connection, 4 tires - ST225/75 R15, 10 ply, trailer dimensions: width fender to fender 77 1/2 inches, left side storage bin 7 1/2 ft X 33 wide, 3 tie down ratchet straps on driver side, 6 removable posts, , , , Good		\$500	SASK90577000244	STEL	930700	2111-475
5.00 8-137	Transformer, , Auto, , , 7500 V A, 208-240 volt, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	184	2110-430
1.76 * 6-268	Transformer, , Standard, , , high pressure sodium for 12/277/347 volt lights, lamp ignitor, and capacitor, , , , New - Unused		\$1		SaskSurplus	ss4474	2108-312
610.50 * 4-102	Truck Bed Topper, , Capit Genuine truck wear. Aluminium. Raised. Black in color, , , 83 inches long, 63 inches wide. 52 inches tall at the back. 25 1/2 inches tall at the front. 2 rear doors 25x44 1/2 inches each. 67x30 shelving from inside. 4 hold down clamps. 4 holes in roof. 4 small holes in rear panel. Hail Damage. No keys available. door on each side of topper. may be compatible with a 2013 Ford F250 with the tailgate removed., , , Fair		\$500	438,777	SaskSurplus	ss4282	2106-110
6.00 * 6-294	Vacuum switch, , Square D, , , Class 9016, type GVG-1, Form E, On 3, Off 8, 2 pole, , , , New		\$1		SaskSurplus	73	2108-324
19.00 8-138	Variable Frequency Drive, , Metal and Plastic, , , Schneider, 3 phase, 1 HP, , , , , Good		\$1	ATV 12HO75M3	SBP	185	2110-430
12.57 8-139	Wet Location Light Fixture, , LED, Metal, , , 4 feet, 120 volt to 277 volt, , , , Good		\$1		SBP	186	2110-430
127.50 8-151	Wood Clamp, , Ramset, , , 52.5" H, , , , Fair		\$1		SBP	145	2110-431
1.25 8-168	Desk, , Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top, , , 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Left Hand L-shaped, locks and keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SGL		2110-418
1.25 8-169	Desk, , Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top, , , 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Left Hand L-shaped, locks and keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SGL		2110-418

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
1.25 8-170	Desk, , Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top, , , 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Left Hand L-shaped,locks and keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
1.25 8-171	Desk, , Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top, , , 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Left Hand L-shaped,locks and keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
4.80 8-172	Desk, , Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top, , , 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Left Hand L-shaped,locks and keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
1.50 * 7-175	Desk, , Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top, , , 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Right Hand L-shaped,locks and keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
1.50 * 7-176	Desk, , Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top, , , 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Right Hand L-shaped,locks and keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
1.50 * 7-177	Desk, , Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top, , , 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Right Hand L-shaped,locks and keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
1.50 * 7-178	Desk, , Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top, , , 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Right Hand L-shaped,locks and keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
1.50 * 7-179	Desk, , Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top, , , 60w x 30d & 60 long x 24 deep, two 2 drawer banks. Right Hand L-shaped,locks and keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
1.25 8-173	Desk, , Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top, , , 60w x 30d, 2 drawer bank, 3 drawer bank, locks and keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
1.25 8-174	Desk, , Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top, , , 60w x 30d, 2 drawer bank, 3 drawer bank, locks and keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
No Bid * 8-175	Desk, , Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top, , , 60w x 30d, 2 drawer bank, 3 drawer bank, locks and keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
5.00 8-176	Desk, , Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top, , , 60w x 30d, 2 drawer bank, 3 drawer bank, locks and keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
5.00 8-177	Desk, , Steelcase, Double Pedestal, Metal, laminate top, , , 60w x 30d, 2 drawer bank, 3 drawer bank, locks and keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SGI		2110-418
2.26 * 7-193	Picture, , Painting, , , Landscape, 23" x 19", , , , Fair		\$1		SaskSurpl US	X-V1237	2107-205
1.00 * 7-194	Picture, , Painting, Plastic Frame, , , Flower, 9.5"W x 9.5"H, , , , Fair		\$1		SaskSurpl US	126	2109-382
1.00 * 7-195	Picture, Lot of 2 , Painting, Wood Frame, , , Bathroom, 8"W x 10"H, , , , Fair		\$1		SaskSurpl US	123	2109-382

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
1.00 * 7-196	Picture, Lot of 2 , Painting, Wood Frame, , , Chef, 8"W x 8"H, 11"W x 13"H, , , , Poor		\$1		SaskSurplus	128	2109-382
1.00 * 7-198	Picture, Lot of 2 , Painting, Wood Frame, , , Flower, 8"W x 8.5"H, , , , Fair		\$1		SaskSurplus	127	2109-382
1.00 * 7-199	Picture, Lot of 2 , Painting, Wood Frame, , , Flowers, 8"W x 10"H, , , , Fair		\$1		SaskSurplus	125	2109-382
No Bid * 7-206	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise M651DN Model number-CZ256A Manufacture date May 12 2015, , , , Large Printer on pallet, hard drive removed, unsure if operational., , , Fair		\$1	JPCCH5COLN	SBP ITD	521411 93	2108-297
No Bid * 7-208	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 8100DN Model number-C4216A Manufacture date August 9th 2000, , , , Large Printer on pallet, no hard drive unsure if operational., , , Fair		\$1	USIG006999	SBP ITD	412683 95	2108-297
1.05 * 6-226	Table, , Metal Legs and Frame, , , 19.5"w x 54"l x 29.5"h, laminate top, scuffed, brown, , , , Fair		\$1		SaskSurplus	ss4452	2107-271
153.00 8-502	Snow Groomer , , Bombardier. Variable Snow Tiller, , , Non Operational, not used in past 30 years , , , Beyond Repair		\$1	351,382,253	Parks	1	2109-337
2.00 * 7-504	Coin Operated Machine, , Operated Timers, , , Originally used for coin operated showers. Coins set at \$1, , , Good		\$1		Parks	6	2109-384
2.00 * 7-505	Coin Operated Machine, , Operated Timers, , , Originally used for coin operated showers. Coins set at \$1, , , Good		\$1		Parks	6	2109-384
2.00 * 7-506	Coin Operated Machine, , Operated Timers, , , Originally used for coin operated showers. Coins set at \$1, , , Good		\$1		Parks	6	2109-384
2.00 * 7-507	Coin Operated Machine, , Operated Timers, , , Originally used for coin operated showers. Coins set at \$1, , , Good		\$1		Parks	6	2109-384
2.00 * 7-508	Coin Operated Machine, , Operated Timers, , , Originally used for coin operated showers. Coins set at \$1, , , Good		\$1		Parks	6	2109-384
2.00 * 7-509	Coin Operated Machine, , Operated Timers, , , Originally used for coin operated showers. Coins set at \$1, , , Good		\$1		Parks	6	2109-384
No Bid * 7-510	Coin Operated Machine, , Operated Timers, , , Originally used for coin operated showers. Coins set at \$1, , , Good		\$1		Parks	6	2109-384
No Bid * 7-511	Coin Operated Machine, , Operated Timers, , , Originally used for coin operated showers. Coins set at \$1, , , Good		\$1		Parks	6	2109-384

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
<b>No Bid * 7-512</b>	Coin Operated Machine, , Operated Timers, , , Originally used for coin operated showers. Coins set at \$1, , , , Good		<b>\$1</b>		Parks	6	2109-384
<b>700.00 8-503</b>	Office Skid , 1996 Super Steel Structures Bunk Car Bunk Car , , , , 12 x 32 Office Bunk Car - Separation of the office and commom area. Part of the floor by the one door is rotten. Power and Gas are diconnected. Skirting has been removed and is being stored inside, can't guarantee it can be used again. The Trailer has no wheels or axels and will need to be loaded to be removed. , , , , Poor		<b>\$1</b>	SSST96030001	HI	1	2110-446
<b>757.00 8-504</b>	Truck, 2002 Chevrolet Silverado 1500, Reg Cab, 2 door, 4.8L, V8, Gas, Auto, Long Box, single tires, Tire size: 245/75R16, Nothing else known about this vehicle. White, 308,284kms, No recent inspection done. , As Is, Where Is	308,284kms	<b>\$1</b>	1GCEC14V32Z193560	Parks		2110-424
<b>755.00 8-505</b>	Truck, 2002 Dodge Ram 2500, Quad Cab, 2 Door, 5.9L, V8, unsure fuel type, unsure, Single Tires, 90% tread left, Single axel, Nothing else known about this vehicle. White, 299,966kms, No recent inspection done. , As Is, Where Is	299,966kms	<b>\$1</b>	3B7KC23Z52M275949	Parks		2110-423
<b>31.00 8-578</b>	Auger, , Earth Auger, , , 12 inches, , , , Fair		<b>\$1</b>		Parks	1	2110-441
<b>589.89 8-540</b>	Van, 2001 GMC Safari , 4 Door, V6, Gas, Auto, Air, Cruise, 4 Wheel Drive, Motor, transmission, brakes, battery, lights and horn are unknown. Tires, Body Exterior, exhaust, windshield washer and wipers, Paint, interior are poor. Mirrors are fair. Blue, 215, 536kms, , As Is, Where Is	215, 536kms	<b>\$100</b>	1GKEL19W01B515701	Parks		2110-440
<b>5.00 * 7-524</b>	ATV Case, , Rear Mounted, , , 10 inches deep in high ends, 6.5 inches deep on mid range, 33.5 inches wide, 16.5 in depth, , , , Fair		<b>\$1</b>		AG	40699	2108-321
<b>No Bid * 7-525</b>	Chairs, lot of 2 , Wood, , , side chair, blue in colour, , , , Fair		<b>\$1</b>		AG	40710	2108-321
<b>No Bid * 7-526</b>	Chairs, lot of 2 , Metal, , , side chair, grey in colour, , , , Fair		<b>\$1</b>		AG	40701	2108-321
<b>3.39 8-506</b>	Cubicle/Wall Organizer, Lot of 4 , Aluminum, , , Grey 36.5 x 12, , , , Fair		<b>\$1</b>		SCIC	6	2109-380
<b>3.39 8-507</b>	Cubicle/Wall Organizer, Lot of 4 , Aluminum, , , Grey 36.5 x 12, , , , Fair		<b>\$1</b>		SCIC	6	2109-380
<b>3.39 8-508</b>	Cubicle/Wall Organizer, Lot of 4 , Aluminum, , , Grey 36.5 x 12, , , , Fair		<b>\$1</b>		SCIC	6	2109-380
<b>3.39 8-509</b>	Cubicle/Wall Organizer, Lot of 4 , Aluminum, , , Grey 36.5 x 12, , , , Fair		<b>\$1</b>		SCIC	6	2109-380
<b>No Bid * 8-510</b>	Cubicle/Wall Organizer, Lot of 4 , Aluminum, , , Grey 36.5 x 12, , , , Fair		<b>\$1</b>		SCIC	7	2109-380
<b>No Bid * 8-511</b>	Cubicle/Wall Organizer, Lot of 4 , Aluminum, , , Grey 36.5 x 12, , , , Fair		<b>\$1</b>		SCIC	7	2109-380
<b>No Bid * 8-512</b>	Desk Top, , Brown Wood veneer, , , 60 x 48 x 1 , , , , Fair		<b>\$1</b>		SCIC	6	2109-380

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
No Bid * 8-513	Desk Top, , Brown Wood veneer,,, 60 x 48 x 1 , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	6	2109-380
No Bid * 8-514	Desk Top, , BrownWood veneer,,, 60 x 48 x 1 , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	6	2109-380
No Bid * 8-515	Desk Top, , Brown Wood veneer,,, 60 x 48 x 1 , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	6	2109-380
No Bid * 8-516	Desk Top, , Brown Wood veneer,,, 60 x 48 x 1 , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	7	2109-380
No Bid * 8-517	Desk Top, , Brown Wood veneer,,, 60 x 48 x 1 , , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	7	2109-380
No Bid * 8-518	Drawers, , Metal, , , Grey, 15x27x22, 2 drawers, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	3	2109-380
No Bid * 8-519	Drawers, , Metal, , , Grey, 15x27x22, 2 drawers, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	3	2109-380
3.65 8-520	Drawers, , Metal, , , Grey, 15x27x22, 3 drawers, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	4	2109-380
3.65 8-521	Drawers, , Metal, , , Grey, 15x27x22, 3 drawers, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	4	2109-380
3.65 8-522	Drawers, , Metal, , , Grey, 15x27x22, 3 drawers, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	4	2109-380
3.65 8-523	Drawers, , Metal, , , Grey, 15x27x22, 3 drawers, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	4	2109-380
3.65 8-524	Drawers, , Metal, , , Grey, 15x27x22, 3 drawers, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	5	2109-380
3.65 8-525	Drawers, , Metal, , , Grey, 15x27x22, 3 drawers, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	5	2109-380
No Bid * 8-526	Drawers , , Metal, , , Grey, 15x27 x22, 2 drawers, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	3	2109-380
No Bid * 8-527	Overhead Cupboards, Lot of 3 , Metal, , , Grey, 36 x 17 x 16, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	1	2109-380
No Bid * 8-528	Overhead Cupboards, Lot of 3 , Metal, , , Grey, 36 x 17 x 16, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	1	2109-380
No Bid * 8-529	Overhead Cupboards, Lot of 3 , Metal, , , Grey, 36 x 17 x 16, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	1	2109-380
No Bid * 8-530	Overhead Cupboards, Lot of 3 , Metal, , , Grey, 36 x 17 x 16, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	2	2109-380
No Bid * 8-531	Overhead Cupboards , Lot of 3 , Metal, , , Grey, 36 x 17 x 16, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	1	2109-380
3.38 8-532	Panels, lot of 6 , Fabric, , , Beige 25 x 36 x 2, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	5	2109-380

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
3.38 8-533	Panels, lot of 6 , Fabric, , , Beige 25 x 36 x 2, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	5	2109-380
3.38 8-534	Panels, lot of 6 , Fabric, , , Beige 25 x 36 x 2, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	5	2109-380
3.38 8-535	Panels, lot of 6 , Fabric, , , Beige 25 x 36 x 2, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	5	2109-380
No Bid * 8-536	Wardrobe Cupboards, , Wood, , , Grey, 12 x 24 x 66, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	2	2109-380
No Bid * 8-537	Wardrobe Cupboards, , Wood, , , Grey, 12 x 24 x 66, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	2	2109-380
No Bid * 8-538	Wardrobe Cupboards, , Wood, , , Grey, 12 x 24 x 66, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	2	2109-380
No Bid * 8-539	Wardrobe Cupboards, , Wood, , , Grey, 12 x 24 x 66, no keys, , , , Fair		\$1		SCIC	2	2109-380
6,979.00 8-541	Tandem Truck, 2002 Volvo VHD64F, Gravel plow truck. , VED 12-385hp Inline 6, Diesel, Standard 10 speed, Air, Cruise, Tilt. Dual Tires, Wheel Base: 224, Tire size: 11R/22.5, Tandem Axel, GVW: 39,500. , 14' Box with Conveyor chain. Motor runs okayt, Transmission okay, needs 3 tires, needs brake work, battery is good, body exterior is rusty with holes in the door. Exhaust is good, windsheild has stone chips, paint is faded, interior is good, Lowbeam lights not working, mirrors are good, LFT mirror switch not working, air horn is good, no electric horn. Yellow, 474, 342kms , rusted doors, air horn brackets breaking,heater controls broken,front tires worn,front diff yoke is loose,needs brake job,cross conveyor worn out,box subframe cracked,rear fender mount rusted through, rear cross member cracked. Hyd. Leaks, steering cylinder leak, right rear engine oil leak, heater controls not working,, As Is, Where Is	474, 342kms	\$2,000	4V5KC9GG92N329860	HI	D02002	2110-434
3.25 8-542	Book shelf, , Brown, 5 shelf unit, , , 36w x 12d x 72h, woodgrain, , , , Fair		\$1		AG	6	2110-444
86.50 8-543	Cabinet, , Two Door, locking, 4 shelf unit, , , 36w x 18d x 72h, lock and key, beige, , , , Fair		\$1		AG	4	2110-444
86.50 8-544	Cabinet, , Two Door, locking, 4 shelf unit, , , 36w x 18d x 72h, lock and key, beige, , , , Fair		\$1		AG	4	2110-444
86.50 8-545	Cabinet, , Two Door, locking, 4 shelf unit, , , 36w x 18d x 72h, lock and key, beige, , , , Fair		\$1		AG	4	2110-444
21.99 8-546	File Cabinet, , Lateral, 3 Drawer, , , 36w x 18d x 41h, lock and key, beige, , , , Fair		\$1		AG	1	2110-444
21.99 8-547	File Cabinet, , Lateral, 3 Drawer, , , 36w x 18d x 41h, lock and key, beige, , , , Fair		\$1		AG	1	2110-444



Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
20.50 8-548	File Cabinet, , Lateral, 3 Drawer, , , 36w x 18d x 41h, lock and key, beige, , , , Fair		\$1		AG	1	2110-444
20.50 8-549	File Cabinet, , Lateral, 5 Drawer, , , 36w x 18d x 64h, lock and key, beige, , , , Fair		\$1		AG	2	2110-444
1.05 8-550	Micro Fiche projector, , COPEX, , , Has been sitting for 2 years, was working but unsure about now. , , , , Fair		\$1		AG	10	2110-444
1.05 8-551	Micro Fiche storage unit, lot of 2, One four drawer and one two drawer, , , , , , Fair		\$1		AG	9	2110-444
No Bid * 8-552	Projector, Screen & Speaker/Camera, , Hitachi Projector (roof mounted) Model: CP-X2510, Logitech Speaker/Camera/Mic (with remote) Model: IC 4418A-VR0004 , , , With retractable wall mounted projection screen, all are functional/operational, , , , Good		\$500	Speaker- 1516LZ06R068, no other serial #'s available	AG	1	2110-448
No Bid * 8-553	Battery, , Fleetnet Emerson,7.5V, , , Fleetnet Battery, , , , Good		\$1	19A705393P3	ENV	10	2110-439
2.34 8-554	Battery Charger, Lot of 4 , , , , for AA batteries, , , , Good		\$1		ENV	6	2110-439
No Bid * 8-555	Black Case, , Trimble GPS Pathfinder, , , , empty, , , , Good		\$1	3612A01843	ENV	1	2110-439
5.00 8-556	Calculator, , Victor 1210, , , Requires 2 AA batteries, no cord, , , , Fair		\$1		ENV	9	2110-439
+ 8-557	Cell Phone Holder, , Nokia, , , Belt Loop, , , , New - Unused		\$1		ENV	7	2110-439
20.00 8-558	GPS, , Garmin, , , GPSmap 76Cx Color Map Navigator manual included, , , , Good		\$1	010-00468-00	ENV	13	2110-439
50.00 8-559	GPS, , Garmin, , , Monterra Android powered wifi enabled GPS with accessories, , , , Good		\$1	010-01065-00	ENV	12	2110-439
55.20 8-561	HandyCam, , Sony HD. Model HDR/SR1, , , Includes 2 batteries, remote, charger, microphone, external light and external microphone, , , , Good		\$20		ENV	3	2110-439
47.50 8-560	HandyCam, , Sony Vision High 8. Model CCD/TRV95NTSC, , , Includes 3 batteries, charger, zoom lens, 14 High 8 tapes (new) never opened, , , ,		\$20		ENV	4	2110-439
No Bid * 8-562	Hip Chains, Lot of 3 , Metric Fieldranger 6500, , , Includes box of thread for use with Hip Chains, , , , Good		\$1		ENV	2	2110-439
28.50 8-563	Scientific Action Cams , Lot of 2 , Oregon Model AT18, , , Waterproof Hands Free Action Cam Flash Memory Video Recorder, , , , New - Unused		\$15		ENV	5	2110-439

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
<b>No Bid * 8-564</b>	Video/Audio Cable Kit, , PURE AV by Blekin, , , Composite video & audio cable kit, , , New - Unused		<b>\$5</b>		ENV	8	2110-439
<b>3,150.00 8-566</b>	Tandem Axle Truck, 1996 International 4900, Flat deck, Navistar DT530, Inline 6, Diesel, Eaton Fuller, 13 Speed, Rear Wheel Drive. Dual Tires, Wheel Base: 224, 315/80R22.5, 11R22.5, Motor, Battery, Body Exterior, Exhaust, Paint, Interior and Lights are all Poor. Transmission, Tires, Brakes, Windshield Glass, Windshield Washer and Wipers, Mirrors and Horn are Fair. Yellow, 24,300kms, Will need frame repair to pass SGI inspection. Engine and clutch are in poor condition. Oil leaking out of engine breathers/coolant in oil. Drive shaft between Axle 2 and 3 removed. Interior in poor condition., As Is, Where Is	24,300km	<b>\$2,500</b>	1HTSHADR2TH291173	HI	D96016	2109-375
<b>9,323.00 8-565</b>	Tandem Axle Truck, 2006 Sterling LT9511, Truck with box, Hydraulic Pump, , 12.8L MBE-4000 Inline 6 Diesel, Eaton Standard, 10 gears, A/C, Cruise, Heated mirror, engine brake. Tires are dual in rear, Tire size: 385/65R22.5, 11R22.5. Wheel Base is 214, Motor, Transmission, Brakes, Exhaust, Windshield washer and wipers, lights, mirrors and horn are fair. Battery, Body Exterior, paint, interior are poor. Windshield glass is good. Hydraulic Controls have been removed. Yellow, 704, 085KMS, Engine rebuilt Nov 24, 2017. New transmission Nov 24, 2017 Rear cross member 62% worn out, rear frame rail 51% worn out. (both to rust) Axle #3 Rh has incorrect brake pot. Axle #1 Lh spring pins and bushings worn out. Dash does not work. Cab corrosion. As Is	704, 085KMS	<b>\$5,000</b>	2FZHAZCV36AV39580	HI	D06013	2109-373
<b>328.00 8-567</b>	Overhead Door, , Steelcraft, , , 9x7x1. Was functional when removed. Minor dents and scratches. 32 pieces total. Can't confirmed if all the pieces are there. , , , Fair		<b>\$100</b>	unknown	SBP		2110-438
<b>12.00 8-568</b>	Briefcases, lot of 2 , Leather Bugatti, , , One lock is closed and has no combination, dimensions: 38 cm x 25cm x 49cm Other flip top bag is lockable, dimensions: 20cm x 33cm x 46cm, , , Poor		<b>\$1</b>		LRWS	Lot 41229	2110-432
<b>1.05 8-569</b>	Bulletin Board, , Metal frame, Cork, , , 61cmW X93cm T, , , Fair		<b>\$1</b>		LRWS	Lot 41224	2110-432
<b>1.25 8-570</b>	Chair, , Plastic Frame, Fabric Seat, , , 5 castor, with arms, blue fabric, , , Poor		<b>\$1</b>		LRWS	Lot 41227	2110-432
<b>5.50 8-571</b>	Chair, , Plastic Frame, Fabric Seat, , , 5 castor, with arms, grey fabric, , , Poor		<b>\$1</b>		LRWS	Lot 41228	2110-432
<b>3.50 8-572</b>	Coat Stand, , wood, , , 122cmW X 183cmH X 41cmD, , , Fair		<b>\$1</b>		LRWS	Lot 41226	2110-432
<b>3.25 8-573</b>	Desk, , Wood, , , 49cmD X 91cmW X 67cmH, , , Fair		<b>\$1</b>		LRWS	Lot 41225	2110-432

Item #	Description	Kms	Minimum Selling Price	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	Ministry / Client Ref.#	Disposal Request #
<b>No Bid * 7-558</b>	Art Print, , Dave Hiebert (C.D. Hiebert 92) Reflections of Saskatchewan Deer, , , 9" x 13" signed numbered art print (341/1000) on 12" x 18" paper, , , New - Unused		<b>\$75</b>		TOURIS M	6	2108-319
<b>No Bid * 7-559</b>	Art Print, , Dave Hiebert (C.D. Hiebert 92) Reflections of Saskatchewan Deer, , , 9" x 13" signed numbered art print (342/1000) on 12" x 18" paper, , , New - Unused		<b>\$75</b>		TOURIS M	7	2108-319
<b>No Bid * 7-554</b>	Art Print, , Dave Hiebert (C.D. Hiebert 92) Reflections of Saskatchewan Ducks, , , 9" x 13" signed numbered art print (341/1000) on 12" x 18" paper, , , New - Unused		<b>\$75</b>		TOURIS M	2	2108-319
<b>No Bid * 7-555</b>	Art Print, , Dave Hiebert (C.D. Hiebert 92) Reflections of Saskatchewan Ducks, , , 9" x 13" signed numbered art print (342/1000) on 12" x 18" paper, , , New - Unused		<b>\$75</b>		TOURIS M	3	2108-319
<b>No Bid * 7-553</b>	Art Print, , Dave Hiebert (C.D. Hiebert 92) Reflections of Saskatchewan Eagle, , , 9" x 13" signed numbered art print (342/1000) on 12" x 18" paper, , , New - Unused		<b>\$75</b>		TOURIS M	1	2108-319
<b>No Bid * 7-556</b>	Art Print, , Dave Hiebert (C.D. Hiebert 92) Reflections of Saskatchewan Wolf, , , 9" x 13" signed numbered art print (341/1000) on 12" x 18" paper, , , New - Unused		<b>\$75</b>		TOURIS M	4	2108-319
<b>No Bid * 7-557</b>	Art Print, , Dave Hiebert (C.D. Hiebert 92) Reflections of Saskatchewan Wolf, , , 9" x 13" signed numbered art print (343/1000) on 12" x 18" paper, , , New - Unused		<b>\$75</b>		TOURIS M	5	2108-319
<b>589.89 8-574</b>	Car, 2001 Chevrolet Cavalier, Sedan, 4 door, Gas, Auto, , Nothing else known about this vehicle. Blue, <200,000 Kms, No recent inspection done. , As Is, Where Is	<200,000 Kms	<b>\$1</b>	1G1JC524717345973	Parks		2110-427
<b>589.89 8-575</b>	Car, 2002 Chevrolet Impala, Sedan, 4 Door, 2 wheel drive, 3.4L V6, Gas, Auto, , Nothing else known about this vehicle. Green, 208, 292 Kms, No recent inspection done. , As Is, Where Is	208, 292 Kms	<b>\$1</b>	2G1WF52E929301267	Parks		2110-426
<b>589.89 8-576</b>	Car, 2002 Chevrolet Malibu, Sedan, 4 DOOR, 3.1L V6, Gas, Auto, , Nothing else known about this vehicle. Dark Grey, 216,342 Kms, No recent inspection done. Kms , As Is, Where Is	216,342 Kms	<b>\$1</b>	1G1ND52J62M633443	Parks		2110-425
<b>1,010.00 8-577</b>	Truck, 2002 GMC Sierra 1500 , Extended Cab, 4.8L V8, Gas, Auto, , Nothing else known about this vehicle. Grey, 291,786 Kms, No recent inspection done. , As Is, Where Is	291,786 Kms	<b>\$1</b>	1GTEC19V62Z297937	Parks		2110-422
<b>1,666.66 8-579</b>	Crane, 1994 Danco Atlas 35.1 , For Truck Mounting, , , Manufacture Date, 1994. Was still operational when it was removed from service, Red, , , Fair		<b>\$1</b>		HI	M-2226	2109-379