

As a reminder there is **NO ONSITE VIEWING, ONLINE-ONLY VIEWINGS** of sale items.

Thank you for your cooperation.

Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to accept the **Terms and Conditions** on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold **"AS IS, WHERE IS"**, there is no implied or expressed warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to (306)787-2092; by phone (306)787-2062 or (306)787-2238,
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred.

WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller, or if bid prices did not meet the seller's minimum selling price. In this case, the item may be carried forward to a future sale.

Item #	Description	Kms	Price Selling	Serial Number
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles				
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. NO ON-SITE VIEWING. Contact SaskSurplus (306) 787-2062 or (306) 798-3306.				
3,702.00	5-001	Car 2008 CHEVROLET Impala LS FWD, 4 Door 3.5 L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/LF seat, trunk release, mirrors, keyless entry- 2 keys, 2 fobs Extra full size spare tire in good condition (may not be compatible with vehicle), Gold, Passed SGI Inspection., Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: front rotor/pads, caliper pins, wiper blades, hail damage on hood, roof and trunk lid, front bumper chips, rear bumper dent, RF fender dent, all doors rust inside at bottom, no first aid kit or fire extinguisher, windshield chips, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	169,056 Kms	\$1,100 2G1WB58KX81352583
2,189.89	5-002	Car 2009 CHEVROLET Impala LS FWD, 4 Door 3.5L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/LF seat, trunk release, heated mirrors, keyless entry- 2 keys, 2 fobs Extra full size spare tire in good condition (may not be compatible with vehicle), Grey, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. , Recent Repairs: , Check engine - P0128, engine hot, a/c off (engine coolant temp below thermostat regulating temp), oil leak, L park brake sticking, front and rear rotors rusted, alignment out, tires cupped/noisy, hood chips/dents/scratches, both bumpers chips/scratches, LF and RF fenders scratches, RF fender rust, RR fender dents/chips, LF and LR doors rust along bottom, RF and RR doors rust inside bottom, roof rust, trunk lid scratches/dents/rust, no first aid kit or fire extinguisher, windshield large stone chips, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	271,951 Kms	\$500 2G1WB57K791325618
2,736.00	5-003	Car 2007 CHRYSLER Sebring FWD, 4 Door 2.7 L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/LF seat, trunk release, heated mirrors, keyless entry- 2 key fobs , Silver, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: LF axle seal, LR strut, hood paint bubbling/scratches, bumper scratches, RF door chips around window frame, roof scratches, no first aid kit or fire extinguisher, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	170,843 Kms	\$586 1C3LC56R67N634700
3,489.89	5-004	Car 2007 CHRYSLER Sebring FWD, 4 Door 2.7 L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/LF seat/trunk release, heated mirrors, driving lights, keyless entry, 2 key fobs , Silver, Passed SGI Inspection., Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: LF toe link bushing cracked, tires deteriorating, windshield chips, hood chips/paint bubbling, front bumper chips, rear bumper scratches, LF fender scratches, RR fender rust, rocker panels and both rear doors road rash, roof rust above windshield/scratches, trunk lid scratches, left mirror paint peeling, no first aid kit or fire extinguisher, battery poor, minor exterior damage.> , As is, Where is	169,695 Kms	\$982 1C3LC56R67N634762

Item #	Description	Kms	Price Selling	Serial Number
3,689.89	5-005 Car 2007 CHRYSLER Sebring FWD, 4 Door 2.7 L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/LF seat, heated mirrors, driving lights, keyless entry- key pad on LF door, 1 key fob , Red, Passed SGI Inspection., Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: hood scratches, both left fender scratches, both front doors rust along bottom, trunk lid scratches, dent, Chrysler badge missing, no first aid kit or fire extinguisher, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	125,689	\$982	1C3LC56R47N634730
3,689.89	5-006 Car 2007 CHRYSLER Sebring FWD, 4 Door 2.7 L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/LF seat, heated mirrors, driving lights, keyless entry- key pad on LF door, 2 key fobs , Silver, Passed SGI Inspection., Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: brake cable seized, rust on rockers, underneath and rear fenders, hood paint bubbling/scratches, front bumper paint peeling badly, LF fender scratches, LR fender rust, RR fender rust, trunk lid scratches, headliner loose at back, no first aid kit or fire extinguisher, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	135,903	\$982	1C3LC56R77N634771
2,589.89	5-007 Car 2008 CHRYSLER Sebring FWD, 4 Door 2.7L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/trunk release, heated mirrors, driving lights, keyless entry, 2 key fobs , Blue, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: power steering rack leaking, front rotors pads pulsation, RR strut leaking, alignment out, driver window control will not roll up RR window, door road rash, mild rust underneath, wipers chattering, hood paint bubbling/scratches, both bumpers scratches/chips, LF fender scratches, rocker panels road rash, roof rust spots, headliner loose at back, no first aid kit or fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left mirror paint peeling, right mirror scratches, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	200,180	\$625	1C3LC56R18N230513
3,113.13 *	4-141 Truck 2011 FORD F150 SuperCrew 4WD, crew cab, standard box 5.4L V8 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, power windows, power locks topper, Black, TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: Rear differential binding-possible transmission issues, transfer case leak, parking brakes inoperable, holes in roof from lightbar, centre console missing, windshield cracked, minor exterior damage>, As is, Where is	361,000	\$2,700	1FTFW1EF9BFB06684

Item #	Description	Kms	Price Selling	Serial Number	
6,600.00 *	4-018	Truck 2008 FORD F550 RWD, duals, club cab, has a backseat, 9'x8' dump body, sides fold down, rusting condition unknown, 6.4L V8 Diesel Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, power heated trailer tow mirrors, power windows, power locks, power mirrors Watco Model DT16 liftgate, front tow hooks, grille inserts, hitch 2" receiver, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, side steps, hood deflector, White, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. , , PROBLEMS: Engine light on, driver information centre exhaust diesel particulate filter issues, reduced engine power, LF shock, steering damper, both batteries hold downs, jump seat missing, dash warning lights on, RF tire cut, both front seats are missing side covers, front bumper dented/ chipped/ rusted, both front doors dented, roof rusted, 1 hole sealed in roof, no hazard kit and fire extinguisher, no spare tire, windshield cracked, driver signal lens broken, both front seats missing trim, liftgate rusted/ condition unknown, driver floor mat worn hole, driver mirror cracked, minor exterior damage>, As is, Where is	284,748 Kms 8389 hours	\$4,500	1FDAW56R68EE33032
4,009.00	5-008	Van 2008 DODGE Caravan CV, Cargo FWD 3.3L V6 Gas Auto A/C, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors, front windows, locks, Map box, cargo barrier, computer stand, shelves, steel floor, large metal box (loose in back), roof rack with beacon (condition unknown), hitch, rear handle of roof, White, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. , Recent Repairs: Recall W09 repaired, PROBLEMS: No oil, power steering leak, brake pads and rotors, front bumper damaged, LF fender paint bubbling/rust, RR fender dent, hood paint bubbling/scratches/dents, all doors chips/dents, tailgate dented, moulding broken, cover for rear door latch broken/glass scratched, 2 sealed holes in roof, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	86,141 Kms	\$1,545	1D4HN11H98B143899
5,200.00	5-009	Van 2009 Dodge Caravan, Cargo FWD 3.3L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/front windows/locks Computer stand, map box, cargo barrier, steel floor, shelving, large metal box (loose), roof rack with beacon- condition unknown, hitch, White, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. , Recent Repairs: recall W09 repaired, disc brake components, PROBLEMS: Brake pads and rotors, left tail light assembly, beacon light, left sliding door trim, front bumper cover damage, hood paint bubbling, front bumper broken, rear tail light, RR door missing molding, roof dents/3 sealed holes, tailgate small rust spot, windshield chips, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	66,667 Kms	\$1,425	2D4HN11E09R617652

Item #	Description	Kms	Price Selling	Serial Number
2,936.00	5-010 Van 2008 DODGE Grand Caravan FWD, 7 passenger 3.3L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, rear HVAC, power locks/front windows/mirrors, keyless entry (1 key fob) roof rack, Silver , TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. , Recent Repairs: recall W09 repaired, PROBLEMS: engine light on P0456/P0457, transmission cooler lines, power steering leak, coolant crossover pipe, rear tires poor/mismatched, rocker panels rust, hood chips/scratches, all fenders rusted, tailgate rust/dented, driver seat ripped, "A" pillar on left side dented, front wipers, no rear spray, windshield chips, spare tire loose in back, first aid kit removed, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	202,921 Kms	\$650	2D8HN44H68R779080
3,803.00	5-011 Van 2008 DODGE Grand Caravan Cargo FWD 3.3L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows, keyless entry (2 key fobs) Map box, cargo barrier, shelving, steel floor, roof rack, beacon- condition unknown, handle on rear roof, hitch, White, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. , Recent Repairs: Recall W09 repaired, driver seat tear stitched , PROBLEMS: Engine oil pan leaking, power steering rack leaking, anti-freeze leaking, transmission line coolant leaking, brake pads and rotors, TPMS light on, hood hail, crack in windshield, rear tires worn, both bumpers LF and RR fenders scratched/dented/scraped, roof surface rust/dented/3 sealed holes, tailgate molding broken/glass scratched, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	108,260 Kms	\$1,330	1D4HN11H78B143903
4,009.00	5-012 Van 2008 DODGE Grand Caravan Cargo FWD 3.3L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power front windows/mirrors, keyless entry (2 key fobs) step attached to rear hitch, hitch, map box, cargo barrier, steel floor, shelving, roof rack with beacon- condition unknown, handle on roof at rear , White , TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. , Recent Repairs: recall W09 repaired, PROBLEMS: transmission lines, power steering pressure hose, large oil leak, crossover pipe leaking, RR shock, windshield cracked, wheel alignment, TPMS light on, hood paint bubbling/scratched, both bumpers dented/scratched/chipped, both front fenders rust/dented, LF and RF door bent/rust at bottom, right side door cracked, roof rust spots, tailgate dents, head lamps foggy, LF floor mat ripped, 2 holes sealed in roof, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	95,300 Kms	\$1,065	1D4HN11H18B143895

Item #	Description	Kms	Price Selling	Serial Number	
3,814.00	5-013	Van 2009 DODGE Grand Caravan Cargo FWD 3.3L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power front windows/mirrors/locks, keyless entry (2 key fobs) Computer stand, map box, cargo barrier, steel floor, roof rack with beacon- condition unknown, step at rear bumper, handle attached to tailgate, White, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. , Recent Repairs: recall W09 repaired, PROBLEMS: transmission lines leaking, oil pan gasket leaking, rough idle, rear outer tie rod, left inner tie rod, rear shock, blower motor noisy on high, heat stuck on cold due to low anti-freeze, temperature gauge fluctuates, tires poor condition, TPMS light on, left tire sensor not reading, hood hail damage, front bumper cracked, both bumpers scratched, all fenders rusted/dented/hail damage, tailgate dented, roof hail damage/3 holes sealed, no first aid kit or fire extinguisher, windshield chips, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	100,614 Kms	\$945	2D4HN11E59R617632
4,200.00	5-014	Van 2009 DODGE Grand Caravan Cargo FWD 3.3 L V6 Gas Auto A/C, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/CD player, power front window, locks, mirrors Map box, computer stand, cargo barrier, shelving, steel floor, roof rack with beacon- condition unknown, hitch, White, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. , Recent Repairs: recall W09 repaired, PROBLEMS: L/R tail light broken, both bumpers cracked/missing molding, front bumper skirt damage, RT rear rocker rusted (not through), hood paint bubbling/scratches/dents, LF fender rust, LR fender dent, RR fender rust, LF door dent/molding broken, tailgate top handle missing/glass scratched, LF seat hole/cushion visible, windshield chips, roof rust along front edge, 2 holes in roof sealed, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	100,176 Kms	\$1,410	2D4HN11E59R617646
3,805.00	5-015	Van 2009 DODGE Grand Caravan Cargo FWD 3.3L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power front windows/mirrors/power locks, keyless entry (2 key fobs) Map box, computer stand, cargo barrier, roof rack with beacon- condition unknown, steel floor, shelving, hitch, handle attached to tailgate, White, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. , Recent Repairs: recall W09 repaired, PROBLEMS: left outer tie rod, oil leak- possible oil pan gasket, hood paint peeling/hail damage, front bumper cracked, rear bumper scratched/scraped, all fenders rusted/dented, left tail light lens broken, rear wiper arm broken, front wiper blades, windshield chipped, 4 holes sealed in roof, no first aid kit or fire extinguisher, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	115,462 Kms	\$1,370	2D4HN11E89R683415

	Item #	Description	Kms	Price Selling	Serial Number
5,200.00	5-016	Van 2009 DODGE Grand Caravan CV FWD 3.3L V6 Gas Auto A/C, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors, front windows, locks Computer stand, map box, cargo barrier, steel floor, shelving, roof rack with beacon, condition unknown, large metal box unsecured, hitch, White, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. , Recent Repairs: recall W09 repaired, PROBLEMS: Left rear shock, brake pads and rotors, front bumper cover cracked/broken, windshield cracked, tailgate window scratched, 3 holes sealed in roof, 2 holes in top of tailgate sealed, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	73,641 Kms	\$1,425	2D4HN11E39R617645
*MT	5-017	Van 2009 DODGE Grand Caravan SE FWD, 7 passenger, second row bench seat, stow and go (rear seat only) 3.3L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, rear HVAC, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/front windows/mirrors, keyless entry (2 key fobs) , Red, Passed SGI Inspection., Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: hood paint peeling, front bumper rock chipped, back bumper scraped/scratched on drivers side, LF fender rusted/scratched, both left doors rusted, tailgate rust/dented, windshield chipped, no first aid kit or fire extinguisher, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	175,973 Kms	\$1,126	2D8HN44E69R685305
2,236.00	5-018	Van 2009 DODGE Grand Caravan, 7 passenger Stow & Go FWD 3.3L V6 Gas Auto A/C, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/CD player, rear HVAC, power front windows/locks/mirrors , Red, TOW ONLY, Failed SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. , Recent Repairs: Recall W09 repaired, PROBLEMS: Front strut mounts, hood hail/paint poor, both bumpers paint poor/scratches, LF and LR fender scratches, LF and LR door dents near handle/hail damage, RF and RR door hail damage at top, roof hail damage, tailgate large dents/rust, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	272,963 Kms	\$726	2D8HN44E19R681758
*MT	5-019	Van 2010 DODGE Grand Caravan FWD 3.3L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/mirrors Computer stand, cargo barrier, shelving, steel floor, roof rack with beacon, handle mounted to tailgate, hitch, White, Passed SGI Inspection., Recent Repairs: Recall W09 repaired, PROBLEMS: Transmission pan leaking, brake pads & rotors, left rear calipers, TMPS light, hood paint poor, front bumper cracked, rear bumper scratched, both rear fenders rust, RR fender scrape, RF door scrape/dent, RR door rust at bottom, tailgate dent, driver seat torn/cushion soft, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	125,897 Kms	\$860	2D4HN11E39R683404

Item #	Description	Kms	num Selling	Serial Number
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.				
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. NO ON-SITE VIEWING. Contact SaskSurplus (306) 787-2062 or (306) 798-3306.				
7.66 *	4-188 Cabinet with Wheels wood/ laminate 2 shelves, 2 doors, 37" W x 23" D x 33" H , , , , , Poor		\$1	N/A
1.08	5-101 Canister Dolly Metal 13.5 d x 9h, rusted, 3 caster wheels, blue , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-102 Cart Wood 22.5"w x 50"l x 36.5"h, white, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels, worn, scuffed, paint chipped/worn , , , , , Poor		\$1	
15.89	5-103 Cart Metal 36"w x 19"d x 43"h, 3 shelves, with handle, 4 caster wheels , , , , , Good		\$1	
26.89	5-104 Cart Metal Frame, Wood Platform 36"w x 60"l x 42"h, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels, blue , , , , , fair		\$1	
*MT	5-105 Cart Metal Frame, Wood Platform 36"w x 60"l x 42"h, hitch and ball, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels, blue , , , , , fair		\$1	
26.79	5-106 Cart Metal Frame, Wood Platform 36"w x 60"l x 42"h, hitch and ball, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels, blue , , , , , Fair		\$1	
9.00	5-107 Cart Metal Frame, Wood Platform 62"l x 30"w x 42"h, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels, blue , , , , , Fair		\$1	
*MT	5-108 Cart Metal with Wood Inserts 24"w 47"l x 37"h, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels, 2 shelves , , , , , Fair		\$1	
2.00	5-109 Cart Metal with Wood Inserts 18"w x 33"l x 36"h, 2 shelves, 4 caster wheels , , , , , Fair		\$1	
13.99	5-110 Cart Plastic 40"l x 20"w x 38"h, 4 caster wheels, 3 shelves , , , , , Fair		\$1	
21.33	5-112 Cart Rubbermaid, Plastic 20"w x 40"l x 38"h, 3 shelves, 4 caster wheels, grey , , , , , Fair		\$1	
23.00	5-113 Cart Stainless Steel 29"w x 36"l x 36"h, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels, 3 shelves , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	4-197 Cart Wooden 20.5"W x 40"L x 37"H, all swivel casters, white , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-114 Cart Wooden 22"w x 50"l x 36"h, 2 casters wheels, 2 fixed wheels, brown , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	4-199 Cart Wooden 36"L x 24"W x 52"H, 2 shelves, swivel casters, brown , , , , , Good		\$1	
1.00	5-123 Cart Metal 24.5" w x 39.25"l x 38"h, 2 shelves, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels, bumper around base of cart , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-116 Cart Metal 18"l x 24"w x 26"h, 4 casters all swivel, lock detached, no key, rubber mat on top, orange , , , , , Fair		\$1	
9.00	5-117 Cart Metal Platform 24"w x 48"l x 46"h, blue, 2 fixed wheels, 2 caster wheels, 2 tires flat , , , , , Poor		\$1	
No Bid	5-122 Cart Metal with Wood Platform approx. 24.5"w x 61"l x 38"h, 2 fixed wheels, 2 caster wheels, platform chipped/worn at edges , , , , , Poor		\$1	
8.88	5-118 Cart Plastic 20"w x 40"l x 37"h, 4 caster wheels, 3 shelves, grey , , , , , Fair		\$1	

	Item #	Description	Kms	num Selling	Serial Number
	8.88 5-119	Cart Plastic 19"w x 40"l x 37.5"h,3 shelves, 4 caster wheels, grey , , , , , Fair		\$1	
	35.00 5-120	Cart Rubbermaid, Plastic 18"w x 33"l x 38"h, 4 caster wheels, 3 shelves, black , , , , , Fair		\$1	
	5.99 5-121	Cart Rubbermaid, Plastic 20"w x 40"l x 37"h,4 caster wheels ,3 shelves, white , , , , , Fair		\$1	
	No Bid 5-125	Cart Wood 22"w x 48"l x 37"h, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels, metal handle, worn, scuffed , , , , , Fair		\$1	
	1.00 5-124	Cart Wood 22.5"w x 49.5"l x 35.5"h, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels, wood cracked/peeling , , , , , Poor		\$1	
	2.00 5-115	Cart Wooden 22.5"w x 49.75"l x 36.5"h, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels, worn, scuffed, wood cracked around nails , , , , , Poor		\$1	
*MT	5-126	Cart Wooden Platform 22"w x 47"l x 40"h, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels , , , , , Fair		\$1	
*MT	5-127	Cart Wooden Platform 22"w x 49"l x 35"h, 4 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels , , , , , Fair		\$1	
*MT	5-128	Cart Wooden Platform 22"w x 50"l x 36"h, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels , , , , , Fair		\$1	
	9.00 5-129	Cart Wooden Platform 29"w x 59.5"l x 37"h, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels , , , , , Fair		\$1	
	9.00 5-130	Cart Wooden with Plastic Platform 22"w x 49"l x 36"h, 2 caster wheels, 2 fixed wheels , , , , , Fair		\$1	
	No Bid * 4-201	CD Player JVC model XL-FZ158BK 5-disc CD changer, unsure if operational , , , , , Poor		\$1	
	No Bid * 4-202	CD/Cassette Player Sharp unsure if operational , , , , , Poor		\$1	80,903,721
	No Bid * 4-149	Chairs Lot of 3 Metal and Fabric , , , , , Fair		\$1	
	No Bid * 2-113	Floor Mats Set of 3 801635 Ram OEM Fabric floor mats 2-front, 1 full width rear, may fit Ram 1500 Tradesman Crew Cab. Black in color. , , , , , Excellent		\$1	
	1.00 5-131	Floor scrubber Power boss 26,Minute Man, Model PB25600 26 QPI no charger, extra pad,unknown condition, grey , , , , , Poor		\$1	
	9.00 5-132	Hand Truck Dolly Steel wheels , , , , , Poor		\$1	
	\$19.00 * 4-222	Industrial Work Table metal top, wooden base caster wheels , , , , , Poor		\$1	
	No Bid * 4-223	Ironing Board metal , , , , , Fair		\$1	
	No Bid 5-133	Lamp Model 004250 black, no bulb, working condition unknown , , , , , Poor		\$1	
	No Bid * 4-224	Lamp Unknown Brand, metal Unknown if operational , , , , , Poor		\$1	
	No Bid * 4-225	Laptop and Document Bags Lot of 3 Various Brands document bag is 26" W x 18" H x 6.5" D. Mudd bag is 16.5" W x 12" H x 3" D. Samsonite bag is 20.5" W x 14" H x 7" D , , , , , Poor		\$1	Poor Condition
	No Bid * 4-156	Muffin Trays Lot of 4 Stainless steel 12" x 9" , , , , , Fair		\$1	
	10.00 * 4-226	Patient Exam Table unknown brand 23" w, 70" d, 34" h , , , , , Fair		\$1	

	Item #	Description	Kms	Price Selling	Serial Number
20.00 *	4-227	Patient Lift Arjo 220081-01, Battery-powered operability unknown, rated for 150 kg, 18" x 40", adjustable height , , , , , Poor		\$1	92422 205 / Unsafe
1.01 *	3-136	Piano Ennis 5207 Seems to be working well, no bench, some scratches , , , , , Fair		\$1	N/A
No Bid *	4-228	Pitchers Lot of 6 stainless steel 5WX8H, with top and bottom holes, 4 rubber tubes , broken , , , , , Poor		\$1	
4.15 *	4-157	Pots Lot of 5 Stainless steel Sm: 6.75"W x 7"D quantity:3, Lrg: 6.75"W x 10"D quantity:2 , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	4-230	Projector Bell & Howell Model 2592B 16mm, unsure if operational , , , , , Poor		\$1	TG-45082
75.99 *	4-103	Running boards Set of 2 Ford Factory removed from a 2018 Ford F250 crew cab , , , , , Excellent		\$50	800,998
75.99 *	4-104	Running boards Set of 2 Ford Factory removed from a 2018 Ford F250 crew cab , , , , , Excellent		\$50	800,994
75.99 *	4-105	Running boards Set of 2 Ford Factory removed from a 2019 Ford F550 Extended Cab and Chassis , , , , , Excellent		\$50	801,066
6.00	5-134	Shovel 39"l x 9"w, brown, D handle , , , , , New - Unused		\$1	
No Bid *	4-235	Speakers Lot of 2 Unknown brand, Vintage Unknown if operational , , , , , Poor		\$1	
1.99 *	3-134	Suitcases Cambridge Travelway, Protocol Platinum Cambridge suitcase measures 28.5" W x 17.5" H x 8.5" D. Protocol suitcase measures 22.5" W x 17.5" H x 8.5" D. , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	4-242	Suitcases Lot of 3 Unknown Brands, vinyl Brown suitcase measures 24.5" W x 18" H x 5" D. Brown suitcases measure 18" W x 15.5" H x 4" D. Black bag measures 12" W x 16.5" H x 3" D , , , , , Poor		\$1	
15.35	5-135	Survival Kit winter supplies, new in box , , , , , Good		\$1	
61.00	5-136	Tires Set of 2 15 inch, 215/70R/15, Artic Claw Winter TXI, Snowflake, M+S, Manufacture date - week 20, year 2015, 7/32 tread depth , , , , , Good		\$40	
71.00	5-137	Tires Set of 2 15 inch, 215/70R/15, Firestone Winter Force 2, Snowflake, M+S, Manufacture date - week 11, year 2020, 12/32 tread depth , , , , , Excellent		\$50	
No Bid	5-138	Tires Set of 4 16 inch, 225/60R/16, Cooper Grand Touring, M+S, Manufacture date - week 48, year 2016, 6/32 tread depth , , , , , Fair		\$120	
161.00	5-139	Tires Set of 4 16 inch, 225/60R/16, Firestone All Season, M+S, Manufacture date - week 24, year 2017, 8/32 tread depth , , , , , Good		\$160	
81.00	5-140	Tires Set of 2 16 inch, 225/60R/16, Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snowflake, M+S. Manufacture date - week 15, year 2019, 7/32 tread depth , , , , , Good		\$80	
43.00	5-141	Tires Set of 2 16 inch, 225/60R/16, Winter Claw Extreme Grip, Snowflake, M+S, Manufacture date - week 30, year 2014, 6/32 tread depth , , , , , Poor		\$20	
121.00 *	4-168	Tires Set of 3 17 inch, 215/60R/17, Nokian, 7/32 inch Nordman SUV, Snowflake, M+S, Manufacture date, week 25, year 2014. , , , , , Good		\$120	

	Item #	Description	Kms	num Selling	Serial Number
	302.00	5-142	Tires Set of 4 17 inch, LT245/70R/17, Wild Spirit M+S, snow flake, load range E, white lettering, manufacture date, week 39, year 2015, 12/32 tread depth , , , , , Excellent		\$250
*MT		5-143	Tires Set of 4 17 inch, LT265/70R/17, BF Goodrich All Terrain T/A KO2, Snow flake, load range E, white lettering, manufacture date, week 41, year 2018, 8/32 tread depth , , , , , Fair		\$175
	121.00 *	3-113	Tool box Metal. Enthuze brand. Model 205103-9-01 Saddle box. 17 inches high, 19 inches wide, 70 inches long. No keys , , , , , Good		\$100
	255.00	5-144	Topper Fiberglass Removed from a 2013 Ford F250, white in color, 438686, approx size 85 inches x 64 inches, rear and side windows open, 5 small holes in roof, no keys , , , , , Fair		\$250
	No Bid *	4-245	Trolley Cart wood 2 shelves, 39" W x 23.5" D x 38" H , , , , , Poor		\$1 N/A
	No Bid *	3-142	Trolley Cart wood 2 shelves, 40" W x 24" D x 36.5" H , , , , , Poor		\$1 N/A
	No Bid *	4-246	Trolley Cart wood 2 shelves, larger wheels, 45" W x 21" D x 35" H , , , , , Poor		\$1 N/A
	No Bid *	4-247	Trolley Carts wood/ laminate 2 shelves, 44" W x 21" D x 34.5" H , , , , , Poor		\$1 N/A
	No Bid *	3-148	TV CRT, Samsung CT-3371XVM unsure if operational , , , , , Poor		\$1
	18.44 *	8-125	Cabinet maple wood oversized cabinet with 2 sets of bifold doors, was custom made for flat file storage, brackets on sides, but shelving not included, natural wood colour, 72"w x 21"d x 72"h , , , , , Fair		\$1
	No Bid	5-146	Chair Ergonomic 5 caster wheels hydraulics work, worn arms, blue , , , , , Fair		\$1
	No Bid	5-147	Chair Ergonomic 5 caster wheels, hydraulics work, worn arms, blue , , , , , Fair		\$1
	No Bid	5-148	Chair Ergonomic, fabric 5 caster wheels, tilt, arm poor condition, grey , , , , , Poor		\$1
	No Bid	5-149	Chair Ergonomic, Fabric 5 caster wheels, hydraulics poor, counter height , brown , , , , , Poor		\$1
	No Bid	5-150	Chair Ergonomic, Fabric 5 caster wheels, hydraulics work, arms in poor condition, blue , , , , , Poor		\$1
	No Bid	5-151	Chair Ergonomic, Fabric 5 caster wheels, hydraulics work, arms in poor condition, blue , , , , , Poor		\$1
	No Bid	5-152	Chair Ergonomic, Fabric 5 caster wheels, hydraulics work, arms in poor condition, blue , , , , , Poor		\$1
	No Bid	5-153	Cork Board Metal frame 36"w x 48"h, brown , , , , , Fair		\$1
	No Bid	5-155	File Cabinet 3 Drawers ,Lateral 36"w x 18"d x 40"h, lock no key, beige, scuffed , , , , , Fair		\$1
	No Bid	5-156	File Cabinet 3 Drawers, Lateral 36"w x 18"d x 40"h, lock no key, beige , , , , , Fair		\$1

	Item #	Description	Kms	num Selling	Serial Number
*MT	5-157	File Cabinet Lateral, 7 doors 36"w x 16"d x 73"h , locking bar attachment, all doors open , , , , , Fair			\$1
*MT	5-158	File Cabinet Lateral, 7 doors 36"w x 16"d x 73"h , locking bar attachment, all doors open , , , , , Fair			\$1
32.55 *	4-172	Filing cabinet Wood top, metal 60"W x 20"D x 30"H, 4 drawer, no lock, missing hanging folder holders , , , , Fair			\$1
4.13 *	4-130	Pedestal 3 drawers, wood Pepper dust 17"W x 25.5"D x 27.5"H, on casters , , , , Fair			\$1
1.00 *	4-131	Pedestal 3 drawers, wood Pepper dust 17"W x 25.5"D x 27.5"H, on casters , , , , Fair			\$1
1.00 *	4-122	Pedestal 3 drawers, wood Pepperdust 17"W x 25.5"D x 27.5"H, on casters , , , , Fair			\$1

Item #	Description	Kms	num Selling	Serial Number
REGINA, Saskbuilts and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 1660 Park St				
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. NO ON-SITE VIEWING. Contact SaskSurplus (306) 787-2062 or (306) 798-3306.				
No Bid	5-501	Electric Tugger Blue Giant service hours- 7984.4, service weight of 1050 Lbs, unsure if operational ITEM MUST BE PICKED UP NO LATER THAN AUGUST 25TH, , , , , Poor	\$1	unknown
No Bid	5-502	Electric Tugger Blue Giant service hours- 8617.4, damaged differential, service weight of 1050 Lbs, unsure if operational ITEM MUST BE PICKED UP NO LATER THAN AUGUST 25TH, , , , , Poor	\$1	unknown
No Bid	5-503	Electric Tugger and Battery Charger Blue Giant, Battery Mate 80 Charging Station model 510M1-12C service hours- 3898.8, service weight of 1050 Lbs. Battery charger has a non-standard plug in, unsure if either is operational ITEM MUST BE PICKED UP NO LATER THAN AUGUST 25TH, , , , , Poor	\$1	308CS68314
No Bid	5-504	Electric Tugger and Battery Charger Blue Giant, Battery Mate 80 Charging Station model 510M1-12C service hours- 5342.1 , service weight of 1050 Lbs. Battery charger has a non-standard plug in, unsure if either is operational ITEM MUST BE PICKED UP NO LATER THAN AUGUST 25TH, , , , , Poor	\$1	RSK127534/ 408CS70224
2.00	5-505	Floor Scrubber Advance, model: 411002 24 volts, net weight: 406lbs, gross weight:774lbs, working condition unknown ITEM MUST BE PICKED UP NO LATER THAN AUGUST 25TH, , , , , Poor	\$1	132,276
REGINA, Saskbuilts and Procurement, 1660 Park St				
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. NO ON-SITE VIEWING. For information on items contact Rhonda Gelowicz 306-552-8049, email: rhonda.gelowicz@gov.sk.ca or Aaron Meyer 30				
No Bid *	4-575	3-Phase Unisaw Delta, Cat. No. 36-951 200-230/460 volts, 60Hz ITEM MUST BE PICKED UP NO LATER THAN AUGUST 25TH, , , , , Good	\$500	02J78788, type 2
10.57 *	4-577	Corning Fiberglass pipe insulation Lot of 6 boxes Owens 1 1/4" x 1", 40 pieces per box, some boxes may not be complete ITEM MUST BE PICKED UP NO LATER THAN AUGUST 25TH, , , , , New - Unused	\$1	New - Unused
10.58 *	4-578	Corning Fiberglass pipe insulation Lot of 4 boxes Owens 1 1/2" x 1", 29 pieces/box, some boxes may not be complete ITEM MUST BE PICKED UP NO LATER THAN AUGUST 25TH, , , , , New - Unused	\$1	
5.58 *	4-579	Corning Fiberglass pipe insulation Lot of 3 boxes Owens 2" x 1", 21 pieces/box, some boxes may not be complete ITEM MUST BE PICKED UP NO LATER THAN AUGUST 25TH, , , , , New - Unused	\$1	
201.00 *	4-580	Fittings Lot of 12 boxes Miscellaneous reducers, valves, copper, brass ITEM MUST BE PICKED UP NO LATER THAN AUGUST 25TH, , , , , New - Unused	\$200	
No Bid *	4-583	Swing Check Valve Jenkins 477 LJ 1255 cast iron bolted, 12" Bronze seating. Stem is flanged. Lever can be rotated through 360 degrees and is adjustable in 15 degree increments. ITEM MUST BE PICKED UP NO LATER THAN AUGUST 25TH, , , , , New - Unused	\$250	N/A

Item #	Description	Kms	Price Selling	Serial Number
MOOSE JAW, Highways & Infrastructure, Fleet Services, 1 km south of Moose Jaw on Highway #2.				
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Tara Watson 306-694-3773				
3,060.00	5-506	Truck 2003 Sterling LT9511 Tandem Detroit 60 series, Inline 6 Diesel Standard A/C, cruise, tilt, power windows, power mirrors, power locks 2002 Right Hand Wing, AT-132-11, worn out, serial # 22-410, Yellow , TOW ONLY, No SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , , PROBLEMS: motor runs but smoke excessively, coolant in fuel system, numerous hydraulic leaks, engine codes, exhaust manifolded, oil in front hubs changed, corroded wires to fuse box RH side, fuel in coolant, needs injectors and cups, turbo and pipes rusted out,oil leak on compressor, ecu rusted out on back side,cross member very thin, box latch siezed, trans. oil change, brakes/battery/mirrors/horn good condition, dash cracked and peeling, stone chips on windshield, missing wiper, some work lights out>, As is, Where is	456,281 Kms	\$3,000 2FZHAZCG83AK77522
NIPAWIN, Environment, 210- 1st St. East.				
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. NO ON-SITE VIEWING. Contact John Worsley 306-862-1790, email: john.worsley@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	4-589	Bear Bait Barrel Lot of 6 Metal, 45 gallon , , , , , Good		\$1
54.00 *	4-590	Bear Bait Barrel Lot of 6 Plastic, 45 gallon , , , , , Good		\$1
1.23 *	4-593	Cook Stove Coleman Missing hose from cook stove to propane tank, working condition unknown , , , , , Fair		\$1
3.00 *	4-595	Key Box Wooden 35 hook key box, 18" w x 24" h , , , , , Fair		\$1
No Bid *	4-603	Satellite Personal Tracker Spot FCC ID: L2V-PT2 , , , , , Beyond Repair		\$1 8,216,042
No Bid *	4-604	Satellite Phone Globestar with accessories , , , , , Poor		\$1 N10BC7JC9
1.23 *	4-606	Spotlights Lot of 4 Brinkman 400,000-1,000,000 lumens, with cigarette plugs , , , , , Beyond Repair		\$1
1.23 *	4-618	Utility Cart Plastic on castor wheels, 27" l x 23" w x 47" h , , , , , Good		\$1
NORTH BATTLEFORD, Social Services, 300 1146 102 Street				
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Leona Boehm 306-446-7893, email: leona.boehm2@gov.sk.ca or Shannen Barthel 306-446-7928, email: shannen.barthel@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid	5-507	Chair Vinyl Dark Brown, tears below cushion Approximatley 45" X 17" , , , , , Poor		\$1
No Bid	5-508	Love Seat Vinyl Dark Brown , tears in some areas and worn out. Approximatley 66" X 17" , , , , , Poor		\$1
No Bid	5-509	Sofa Vinyl Dark Brown, tears in some areas and worn out. Approximatley 87" X 17" , , , , , Poor		\$1
PRINCE ALBERT, Corrections and Policing and Public Safety, 1700 7th Ave NE.				
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Mark Halcro 306-953-3144, email: mark.halcro@gov.sk.ca or owen.stubbs@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid	5-510	Chalk Board with Ledger 12 feet , , , , , Good		\$1
10.00	5-511	Chairs Lot of 6 Plastic Moulded beige , , , , , Good		\$1

	Item #	Description	Kms	num Selling	Serial Number
	10.00	5-512	Chairs Lot of 6 Plastic Moulded red , , , , , Good		\$1
	10.00	5-513	Chairs Lot of 6 Plastic Moulded various colours: beige and grey , , , , , Good		\$1
	10.00	5-514	Chairs Lot of 6 Plastic Moulded various colours: white and blue , , , , , Good		\$1
	10.00	5-515	Chairs Lot of 6 Plastic Moulded various colours: white and blue , , , , , Good		\$1
	10.00	5-516	Chairs Lot of 6 Plastic Moulded various colours: white and blue , , , , , Good		\$1
	10.00	5-517	Chairs Lot of 6 Plastic Moulded white , , , , , Good		\$1
	10.00	5-518	Chairs Lot of 6 Plastic Moulded white , , , , , Good		\$1
	21.00	5-519	Projector Screen 1960 or 70s, Large Approximately 30 feet long , , , , , Fair		\$1
	87.00	5-520	Table Stainless Steel Aprox 6 feet x 2 Feet , , , , , Good		\$1
PRINCE ALBERT, Environment, Forest Services, #201 1061 Central Avenue					
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Dean Mamer 306-940-7840, email: dean.mamer@gov.sk.ca or Lori Thompson 306-940-6509, email: lori.thompson@gov.sk.ca					
	42.00 *	3-653	Ramps and Toolboxes Aluminum 2 sets of aluminum ATV ramps that are in various states requiring repair, 2 aluminum truck tool boxes in various states requiring repair (no keys for locks) , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1
SASKATOON, Highways, Operations and Maintenance Division, Unit 18-3603 Millar Ave.					
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Connie Olafson 306-933-7601, email connie.olafson2@gov.sk.ca					
No Bid	5-521	Film Camera Pentax SF10 Film Camera Comes with two lenses: Magnicon MC28-70 & Magnicon MC70-210, no memory card. , , , , , Fair			\$1
SASKATOON, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, ES 122 3rd Avenue N.					
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Tricia Chint 306-933-5559, tricia.chint@gov.sk.ca or Leanne McCullough 306-933-5799, leanne.mccullough@gov.sk.ca					
No Bid *	4-521	Credenza wood 66.25"L x 19.5"W x 29"H; pedestals on each end with drawers, 2 sliding doors in middle , , , , , Fair			\$1
SASKATOON, SaskPolytech, 1130 Idylwyld Drive N.					
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Chris Perry 306-659-4126, email: perrychr@saskpolytech.ca or Faheem Khan 306-659-4651, email: khanmuham@saskpolytech.ca					
501.00	5-523	Motor Hyundai Super ES, 15 HP 208 - 230/460V, 44KW 36.8/18.4 A - 60HZ - 1770 RPM , , , , , Fair		\$500	00824-048-003
SOUTHEND, Environment, 15 College Drive.					
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. NO ON-SITE VIEWING. Contact Nolan Hoggarth 306-758-6624, 3063-688-0966, email: nolan.hoggarth@gov.sk.ca					
No Bid *	4-556	Outboard Motor 1966 Johnson 5HP Has not ran in years, engine partially disassembled. Sold as is. , , , , , As is, where is		\$1	C482568
20.00 *	4-557	Outboard Motor Mercury 5HP Has not ran in years. Sold as is. , , , , , As is, where is		\$1	0E056148

Item #	Description	Kms	Price Selling	Serial Number
STONY RAPIDS, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 110 Erickson Street.				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Bryan Chartrand 306-425-4450, 306-425-0185, email: bryan.chartrand@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	3-640	Truck 2002 FORD F250 SD 8' box, 4x4, crew cab 5.4L V8 gas auto A/C standard differential, red, , , PROBLEMS: Not drivable for any distance, motor has power/fuel issues, motor still runs, Kms no battery, tires poor Brake Disc F/R good, exhaust needs hangars repairs, interior cloth has holes, exterior overall good condition, paint scratches/chips>, As is, Where is	172,442	\$750 1FTNW21L72EB48676
SWIFT CURRENT, Highways, Fleet Services, 1200 South Service Road W				
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Landis Sather 306-778-8353, or 306-741-7937 email: landis.sather@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid	5-524	Boiler 1992 Homebuilt Honda EZ5000, Gas tandem, single tires, 7.00-15 Lt , Yellow, , , PROBLEMS: inactive since 2018, R/H flat tires, paint poor, motor fair, lights fair>, As is, Where is		\$250 SK400849141
WEYBURN, Water Security Agency, New Age Storage, 933 Coteau Avenue W				
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. NO ON-SITE VIEWING. Contact Annette Lohse 306-861-3584, email: annette.lohse@wsask.ca				
11.00	5-525	Back Rack & Beacon Light Metal Base 68"x54"x1.5", no damage, no rust, 160" of wire, come with wire and switch , , , , Excellent		\$1
11.00	5-526	Back Rack & Beacon Light Metal Base 68"x54"x1.5", no damage, no rust, 160" of wire, come with wire and switch , , , , Excellent		\$1
100.00	5-527	Toolbox Brute, Metal 72", contractor tops side with sealed doors, commercial class, 72"L x 21" H x 12" W, keys included, mounting support leg included , , , , Excellent		\$1
100.00	5-528	Toolbox Brute, Metal 72", contractor tops side with sealed doors, commercial class, 72"L x 21" H x 12" W, keys included, mounting support leg included , , , , Excellent		\$1
100.00	5-529	Toolbox Brute, Metal 72", contractor tops side with sealed drawers and doors, commercial class, 72"L x 21" H x 12" W, bottom drawers have removable slats, mounting support included, keys included , , , , Excellent		\$1
100.00	5-530	Toolbox Brute, Metal 72", contractor tops side with sealed drawers and doors, commercial class, 72"L x 21" H x 12" W, bottom drawers have removable slats, mounting support included, keys included , , , , Excellent		\$1
YORKTON, Environment, Compliance & Field Services, Rm 201 - 120 Smith St. E.				
ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Sherry 306-786-1463 or email: yorktonfieldofficeenv@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	4-562	Camp Stove Coleman 2 Burner Naptha Gas Unknown if operational , , , , Poor		\$1
No Bid *	4-565	Portable Heater Igloo Master Naptha Gas Unknown if operational , , , , Poor		\$1