

COVID-19 Update

To support safe SaskSurplus Sale operations during the COVID-19 pandemic, new measures have been introduced for clients to follow. These include online-only viewings pickup screening checklist, and SaskSurplus Sales - Pick-up Guidelines.

The safety of SaskSurplus clients and employees is our top priority, and we thank you for your cooperation with these new measures. For general Government of Saskatchewan related to COVID-19, please visit saskatchewan.ca

Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- Central Services, SaskSurplus reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot.
- by fax to (306)787-2092; by phone (306)787-2062 or (306)787-2238
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred.
WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller,
or if bid prices did not meet the seller's minimum selling price. In this case, the item may be carried forward to a future sale.

Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. NO ON-SITE VIEWING. Contact SaskSurplus (306) 787-2062 or (306) 798-3306.				
2,037.00	3-001	Car 2006 CHEVROLET Impala LS FWD 3.5L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, power locks/windows/mirrors/LF seat/trunk release, keyless entry- 3 keys/1 fob , Blue, , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: oil leaks/rack leaking, brake pulsation, front & rear pads/rotors, chrome peeling, hood road rash, front bumper cracked, RR fender small dent, both rocker panels road rash, all door road rash, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	260,545 Kms	\$681 2G1WB58K269367206
2,037.00	3-002	Car 2006 CHEVROLET Impala LS FWD 3.5L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/mirrors/LF seat/trunk release, keyless entry- 1 key/1 fob , Blue, , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: RF outer tie rod loose, rear pads/rotors, windsheild cracked, LF headlight fogged, hood dents, all doors rust at bottom/inside, roof small rust spot, trunk lid rust spots, wipers, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	287,108 Kms	\$581 2G1WB58K969391129
1,937.00	3-003	Car 2008 CHEVROLET Impala LS FWD 3.5L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/mirrors/trunk release/ LF seat, keyless entry - 1 fob/2 keys , Grey, , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: right front CV joint, left outer & inner tie rod, both rear links, front & rear pads/rotors, alignment needed, windshield cracked, blower blend door, grille chrome peeling, hood road rash/dents, LF fender rust, RR fender dent, front bumper & rocker panels road rash, all doors road rash/rust at bottom, trunk lid rust/scratches, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	287,091 Kms	\$591 2G1WB58K481357228
1,937.00	3-004	Car 2008 CHEVROLET Impala LS FWD 3.5L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/mirrors/trunk release/ LF seat, keyless entry - 2 fobs/2 keys , Grey, , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: front pads/rotor, rear pads/rotors, hood chips/dents, rocker panel road rash, all doors rusted along bottom & inside, tailgate scratches/rust spots, wiper blades, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	284,497 Kms	\$691 2G1WB58K181356425
1,589.89	3-005	Car 2013 DODGE Avenger SE FWD 2.4L L4 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/locks/mirrors/LF seat/trunk release, keyless entry- 2 key fobs , Silver, , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: front rotors very rusty, rear tires loud/cupped badly, front & rear alignment, RR toe link, LF upper rear control arm has play, license plate lamps, hood dents/paint bubbling, LF door bent, RR door rust, trunk lid dents, windshield pitted, roof dent, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	304,623 Kms	\$1,386 1C3CDZABXDN604495

	Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
5,032.00	3-006	SUV 2015 CHEVROLET Equinox LS AWD, 5 passenger 2.4L L4 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/bluetooth, power locks/windows/mirrors/LF seat, keyless entry- 2 key fobs , White, , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: engine poor, trans cooler lines small leak, front & rear wheel alignment, all doors paint peeling inside bottom, tailgate rust spots, rust on rear hitch, pulled from road- excessive oil consumption, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	226,732 Kms	\$4,800	2GNFLEEK2F6314149
2,737.00	3-007	SUV 2009 DODGE Journey SXT 2WD 3.5L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/LF seat, heated mirrors, keyless entry- 1 key fob , Beige, , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: ESP light on, C1090 brake lamp control circuit low, rear rotors rusted, RR fender rust, both dog legs have rust, LF door large dent/rust, LR & RR door road rash, all 3 wiper blades, wheel wrech/jack missing, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	199,366 Kms	\$525	3D4GG57V79T606102
*WD	3-008	SUV 2009 FORD Escape XLT 4WD, 5 passenger 3.0L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, power locks/windows/LF seat, heated mirrors, keyless entry- key pad on LF door, 2 key fobs grille inserts, driving lights, roof rack (hitch 1 1/4" receiver) flat 4 trailer wiring, computer stand, Blue, , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: exhaust broken between flange and tail pipe, oil leaking onto exhaust, both front and rear control arm bushing seperated, front pads/rotors groved, RF mudflap not secured, hood hail damage, front bumper cracked, LR fender dent, RR fender rust, tailgate dent/rust at bottom, RF mud flap loose, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	138,721 Kms	\$658	1FMCU93G49KC55715
4,090.00	3-009	Truck 2006 DODGE Dakota 4x4, crew cab, 5'5" box, has a back seat 3.7L V6 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, LF power seat front tow hooks, grille inserts, beacon on topper, hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, raider box topper - condition unknown, spare tire (mounted in box), White, , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: rack is leaking, upper ball joints have play, lower ball joints- boots open, front rotors poor, front alignment, front differential fluid dark, windsheild cracked, front tires cupped, high mount brake light, tar on exterior, hood rust spots, bumper rust, tailgate dented/rust, both right fenders badly rusted, both left fenders rust/road rash, rocker panel rust, LR door badly rusted, LF door rust, RR door rust inside bottom, roof small rust spots, tires rub on mud flaps, driver front tire & spare tire low, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	202,549 Kms	\$521	1D7HW28K36S654626

	Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
5,850.00	3-010	Truck 2012 DODGE Ram 1500 4x4, quad cab, 6'4" box, has a back seat 4.7L V8 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/heated mirrors, keyless entry- 2 key fobs front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, gull wing tool box- condition unknown, White, , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: no reverse lights, passenger rear lower control arm bushing ripped out, belt cracked badly, TPMS light on, windshield cracked, headlight housing different, rear bumper dents, rust on both front fenders, road rash on on both rear fenders, wheel wrench loose under back seat, battery poor, minor exterior damage.> , As is, Where is	304,755 Kms	\$2,986	1C6RD7FPXCS218388
*MT	3-011	Truck 2008 DODGE Ram 2500 4x4, quad cab, 8' box, has a back seat 5.7L V8 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player grille inserts, front tow hooks, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, headache rack, Red, , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: left back up light, right tail light assembly, drag link, rear pad/rotor, hood scratches/chips, both bumpers rust spots/dents, all fenders rust/dents, driver door dents, RF door scrape/scratches, front of box bent, tailgate dents/scratches/bent, hole in driver seat, wheel wrench loose under back seat, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	178,439 Kms	\$808	3D7KS28D68G228149
2,077.00	3-012	Truck 2006 FORD F150 2WD, supercab, 6'6" box, has a back seat 4.6L V8 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM , Grey, , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: engine rough at idle, both rear park brake cables sticking, both lower ball joints, oil pan gasket damp, rear brake pads worn, both bumpers bent/rust spots, LF fender road rash, LR fender scratches/dents, RF fender road rash, RR fender scratches/dents/road rash, paint chipping on fender/door/rockers, LF door road rash/paint peeling, front of box bent, tailgate dented/scratched/missing moulding, driver seat ripped, holes in front hump mat, holes in box rails, roof scratches/1 sealed hole, battery weak, minor exterior damage.> , As is, Where is	270,277 Kms	\$733	1FTRX12W56FB61573
*MT	3-013	Truck 2003 FORD F550 4x4, club cab, has a back seat, 8'6" x 11' metal wood deck, goose neck compatible, removable sides, fold down tail gate 6.0L V8 Diesel Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 1 key Regal slip tank with electric pump (condition unknown), side mounted tool box on deck (condition unknown), headache rack with beacon- part of the deck (condition unknown), 2" hitch, trailer wiring, front tow hooks, trailer tow mirrors, electric trailer brake, hobbs hour meter 3909 hrs, auxiliary idle control module (condition unknown), condition of deck and components unknown , White, , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: abs light on, steering damper, hood dents, front bumper rusted, LF fender signal marker lense loose, RF fender dent, dents and road rash on all doors, all seats soiled, 1 sealed antenna, spare tire missing, no hazard kit, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	148,757 Kms	\$8,500	1FDAW57P43EC97036

Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	
*MT	3-014	Bus 2009 FORD E450 Super Duty RWD, 12 passenger, 25 foot Aerotech bus body, driver functional Ricon wheel chair lift, dual rear wheels 6.8L V10 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, auxiliary rear heat & A/C, AM/FM/CD player 21 straint wheel chair tie downs with storage bags, 6 shoulder harness restraints, seat covers on all seats- condition unknown, intelligent lift interlock system, bank of 6 auxiliary switches to support various functions, advance idle system, White, , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: frame at top of wheel chair door is separating, rear bumper bent/rusting, paint faded, tailgate door has a small dent at the bottom, missing wheel wrench/jack, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	108,761 Kms	\$14,900	1FD4E45S79DA48867
3,737.00	3-015	Van 2006 FORD Econoline E350 RWD, 15 passenger 5.4L V8 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, rear HVAC , White, , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: left rear caliper pins, rear rotors rusted, front bumper rusted/bent, rear bumper rusted, rust on rocker panels & both right doors, tailgate missing speaker cover, left & right mirrors glass loose, moulding around rear windows broken, RR door missing speaker & cover, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	160,054 Kms	\$504	1FBSS31L26HB27893
2,100.51	3-016	Van 2007 FORD Econoline E350 RWD, 15 passenger 5.4L V8 Gas Auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/locks/front doors, rear HVAC fire extinguisher, Grey, , Recent Repairs:, PROBLEMS: passenger door pins, front & rear pads/rotors, all 4 tires, rockers, exterior paint worn, front bumper rust spots, rear bumper rust/dents, all fenders rust/road rash, rocker panels rusted, all seats soiled/dirty, some seats torn, overall interior dirty/musty smell, roof dents/rust at drip rails, tailgate red tape on right door, battery poor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	190,383 Kms	\$596	1FBSS31L17DB24962

Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. NO ON-SITE VIEWING. Contact SaskSurplus (306) 787-2062 or (306) 798-3306.				
303.00 *	12-112 Letterpress Printer and Metal Type Cabinet Showcard Machine Company letterpress, "Futura" font metal type Cabinet size: 24" wide, 49" tall, 17½" deep, several weights and sizes of "Futura" font metal type. Unknown if operational. , , , , , Fair		\$250	
No Bid *	12-114 Photographic Enlarger Stand Besler 45MCRX Enlarger chassis has a triangular reinforced truss with twin girder frame which permits the enlarger to produce prints greater than 16"x20" on the baseboard from 35mm film. , , , , , Good		\$250	
450.00 *	1-117 Cargo Bed SD model, rollout, approx. 34" W, 67.5" L, bolted to plywood Top plywood 79"L, 48"W, 1 1/2" D. Bottom plywood 80"L, 48"W, 3/4" D. , , , , , Good		\$400	433,232
550.00 *	1-118 Truck Topper Raider, commercial grade, aluminum construction, white in color approx. 71" wide, 84 long. Minor hail damage, handle loose. Door on left, 2 doors on right side. , , , , , Good		\$500	433232, Key for Tailgate only.
7.51 *	2-102 Beacon Plastic with magnetic base 12 volt, operational, plugs into 12V car adapter. Single light , , , , , Poor		\$5	
7.51 *	2-104 Beacon Plastic with magnetic base 12 volt, operational. Plugs into plugs into 12V car adapter , , , , , Poor		\$5	
15.51 *	2-106 Rolling Striping Stick with Paint Set of 5 Aervoe industries model 245 1 striping stick , 4 cans of survey marking paint, not all full. 2 orange and 2 green , , , , , Fair		\$10	
No Bid *	2-113 Floor Mats Set of 3 801635 Ram OEM Fabric floor mats 2-front, 1 full width rear, may fit Ram 1500 Tradesman Crew Cab. Black in color. , , , , , Excellent		\$40	
40.00 *	2-114 Floor Mats Set of 3 801629 Ram OEM Fabric floor mats 2-front, 1 full width rear, may fit Ram 1500 Tradesman Crew Cab. Black in color. , , , , , Excellent		\$40	
*MT	* 2-125 Tire 17 inch, P265/70R/17, Goodyear Wrangler St. M+S, manufacture date, week 17, year 2005 , , , , , Good		\$50	
131.00 *	2-131 Vehicle Seat OEM, 3rd row, 1 piece seat, seats 2 people, folds into floor Black cloth, compatible with 2013-2019 Ford Explorer , , , , , Good		\$100	
No Bid *	2-132 Vehicle Seats Set of 2 OEM, 2nd row, 2 piece seat, seats 3 people Black cloth, compatible with 2013-2019 Ford Explorer , , , , , Excellent		\$100	
No Bid *	2-133 Vehicle Seats Set of 2 OEM, 2nd row, 2 piece seat, seats 3 people Black cloth, compatible with 2013-2019 Ford Explorer , , , , , Excellent		\$100	
26.01	3-102 Tire 1 Goodyear Integrity M+S 225/60R/16. Manufacture date. Week 08, year 2013 , , , , , Poor		\$10	

	Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
20.02	3-103	Tire 1 Matrix Steel belted Multi mile 215/70R/15. Manufacture date. Week 33, year 2014 , , , , , Fair		\$20	
76.20	3-104	Tires Set of 4 Matrix Tour RS Multimile 225/60R/16. Manufacture date, week 28, year 2014 , , , , , Poor		\$40	
No Bid	3-105	Tire 1 Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X. M+S 205/60R/16. Manufacture date, week 16, year 2016 , , , , Good		\$40	
No Bid	3-106	Tire 1 Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X. M+S 225/60R/16, Manufacture date, week 33, year 2018 , , , , Fair		\$25	
115.25	3-107	Tires Set of 4 Sumitomo Ice Edge, Snow flake. 225/60R/16. Manufacture date, week 23, year 2017 , , , , Fair		\$25	
No Bid	3-108	OEM Rear Bumper Metal with Plastic upper pad and mounting brackets Black in color. Scratches and small dents. Possibly compatible with a 2010 Ford F250. , , , , Fair		\$100	451,203
No Bid	3-109	OEM Tail Gate Metal . White in color Complete tailgate, Ford Super Duty, Possibly compatible with a 2010 F250 or F350 , , , , Good		\$300	451,203
No Bid	3-110	Shelving Metal/Plywood Adjustable shelving. 36-3/4 inches long, 15 inches wide, 4 feet tall. , , , , , Good		\$50	410,324
No Bid	3-111	Shelving Metal/Plywood Adjustable shelving. 7 feet long, 15 inches wide, 4 feet tall. , , , , Good		\$75	410,324
121.12	3-112	Tool box Metal. Brand - Lund Challenger 5150. Muple Vehile application gull wing - cross vehicle. 70.25 inches long, 14 inches high, 20 inches wide. Has keys , , , , Fair		\$75	1 lid support broke.
No Bid	3-113	Tool box Metal. Enthuze brand. Model 205103-9-01 Saddle box. 17 inches high, 19 inches wide, 70 inches long. No keys , , , , Good		\$200	
172.22	3-114	Tires Set of 4 Firestone FR710, 100T, M+S 225/65R/16. Manufacture date, week 12, year 2015. , , , , Fair		\$130	
202.23	3-115	Tires Set of 4 Firestone FR710, 97T, M+S 225/60R/16. Manufacture date, week 48, year 2015. , , , , Good		\$160	
134.99	3-116	Tires Set of 4 Matrix Tour R/S, Multi Mile. M+S 205/60R/16. Manufacture date, week 01, year 2014 , , , , Fair		\$130	
187.99	3-117	Tires Set of 4 Nokian Entyre 2.0, M+S 225/60R/16. Manufacture date, week 49, year 2017. , , , , , Good		\$180	
*MT	3-118	Tires Set of 4 Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X 215/65R/16. Manufacture date, week27, year 2018. , , , , Good		\$160	
No Bid	3-119	Tires Set of 4 Sumitomo Ice Edge, 98T, snow flake 215/70R/15. Manufacture date, week 22, year 2018. , , , , Good		\$160	

	Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
No Bid	3-120	Tire Firestone All Season. 96T. M+S 215/60R/17. Manufacture date, week 25, year 2018 , , , , , , Excellent		\$50	
105.54	3-121	Tires Set of 3 Firestone All Season. 98T. M+S. 215/70R/15. Manufacture date, week 04, year 2018 , , , , , Fair		\$90	
185.27	3-122	Tires Set of 4 Firestone FR710, 98H, M+S 225/60R/17. Manufacture date, week 46, year 2014. , , , , , Fair		\$120	
67.99	3-123	Tires Set of 2 Goodyear Assurance. 95H 225/55R/17. Manufacture date, week 49, year 2016 , , , , , Fair		\$50	
155.97	3-124	Tires Set of 4 Goodyear Wrangler Prograde. M+S. Snow flake. Load range E LT225/75R/16. Manufacture date, week 12, year 2009. , , , , , Fair		\$130	
110.54	3-125	Tires Set of 2 Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow flake. 98T 225/60R/16. Manufacture date, week 15, year 2019 , , , , , Good		\$100	
No Bid	3-126	Heat Seal Machine Thermopatch Thermo-Seal Model LS-12 110V, 60 Hz, 8.4 amps, operability unknown , , , , , Fair		\$1	2,610,688
11.51	3-127	2-Way Speaker System Lot of 2 Technics SB-LV310 12.5" W x 11" D x 23.5" H, unsure if operational , , , , , Fair		\$1	HM8JA09213 HL8JA09195
5.26	3-128	Shelving Unit wood 17.5" W x 12.5" D x 20" H , , , , , Fair		\$1	
10.19	3-129	Trolley Cart metal 2 shelves, handle, bumper railing around bottom, 45" W x 28" D x 34" H , , , , , Fair		\$1	N/A
25.00	3-130	Trolley Cart metal 3 shelves, no bumpers, 38" W x 21" D x 34" H , , , , , Fair		\$1	N/A
75.00	3-131	Trolley Cart metal 3 shelves, no bumpers, 38" W x 22.5" D x 37" H , , , , , Fair		\$1	N/A
12.19	3-132	Trolley Cart metal 3 shelves, no handle, 35" W x 21" D x 35" H , , , , , Fair		\$1	N/A

	Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
11.27	3-133	Ladder Unknown brand, metal 6', works well , , , , , Fair		\$1	N/A
No Bid	3-134	Suitcases Cambridge Travelway, Protocol Platinum Cambridge suitcase measures 28.5" W x 17.5" H x 8.5" D. Protocol suitcase measures 22.5" W x 17.5" H x 8.5" D. , , , , , Fair		\$1	
241.01	3-135	Drill Press Canadian Blower and Forge Co. Ltd. Newer Century AC motor, 1725 RPM, 115/230V, 7.2/3.6 amps, 60 Hz, unsure if operational , , , , , Fair		\$1	303125M
No Bid	3-136	Piano Ennis 5207 Seems to be working well, no bench, some scratches , , , , , Fair		\$1	N/A
107.77	3-137	Sewing Machine and Table Janome 5001 Unsure if operational, instruction manual included , , , , , Fair		\$1	
6.00	3-138	Shoe Laces Unknown brand 1 box, 36", Black , , , , , New - Unused		\$1	
31.63	3-139	Scale with Height Chart Detecto Scales Inc. 16.5" W x 21" D x 59" H. 350 lb capacity, still accurate , , , , , Poor		\$1	N/A
15.19	3-140	Trolley Cart metal, heavy duty 2 shelves, 2 drawers, vertical tool/ material holder, horizontal tool/ material holder, 40.5" W x 27.5" D x 37.5" H , , , , , Poor		\$1	N/A
1.05	3-141	Trolley Cart metal, wood/ laminate 2 shelves, 32.5" W x 22.5" D x 35" H, bottom shelf 25" W x 21" D , , , , , Poor		\$1	N/A
No Bid	3-142	Trolley Cart wood 2 shelves, 40" W x 24" D x 36.5" H , , , , , Poor		\$1	N/A
No Bid	3-143	Sit Bath Penner Manufacturing, Inc. Superior No. 350010-1 29" w, 63" d, 41" h, 120V, 60 Hz , , , , , Poor		\$1	
16.89	3-144	Trolley Cart metal 3 shelves, rubber bumper around the bottom, 38.5" W x 21" D x 37" H , , , , , Poor		\$1	N/A
10.00	3-145	Hole Punches Lot of 20 various brands 7 x triple-hole punch, 7 x double-hole punch, 5 x single-hole punch, 1 x slot hole punch , , , , , Poor		\$1	
1.00	3-146	Step Stool wood Heights are 6" for the wood step stool , , , , , Poor		\$1	
4.31	3-147	Storage Box wood on wheels, 26" W x 29" D x 28.5" H , , , , , Poor		\$1	N/A
No Bid	3-148	TV CRT, Samsung CT-3371XVM unsure if operational , , , , , Poor		\$1	
1.00	3-149	Suitcases Lot of 3 Samsonite 2 suitcases are 23" W x 19" H x 6.5" D. Smaller suitcase is 19.5" W x 17" H x 6.5" D. Blue , , , , , Fair		\$1	
10.19	3-150	Trolley Cart metal, small 3 shelves, no bumpers, 26.5" W x 16" D x 31.5" H , , , , , Fair		\$1	N/A

Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
DUCK MOUNTAIN PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks, Culture and Sport, Duck Mountain Maintenance Yard				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. NO ON-SITE VIEWING. Contact Ryan Bielecki 306-590-7792, ryan.bielecki@gov.sk.ca				
575.00	3-507 Boat Pacific Auto, model: 480 BRO 70HP Yamaha Outboard 70ETH, 3 cylinder, Gas 90HP, max unknown load: 1690 lbs , , , , PROBLEMS: Motor runs but cannot shift the transmission into forward or reverse, Deck rotten, Cracks in Gunwale, Cleats broken or missing, No battery. No trailer., As is, Where is		\$1	243,199
HUDSON BAY, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 101 Stimpson Road.				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Kim Haugen 306-865-4440, email: kim.haugen@gov.sk.ca or Earl Cook 306-865-4500, email: earl.cook@gov.sk.ca				
5.55	3-508 Book Shelf Metal 14"x42" , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid	3-509 Camera 2004 Fuji Fine Pix 2650 Non-operational , , , , Beyond Repair		\$1	24B06335
5.55	3-510 Desk Lot of 2 Metal 30" x 60", 2 drawer , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid	3-511 Desk Lot of 2 Metal 30" x 60", 5 drawer , , , , Fair		\$1	
48.00	3-512 Gas Furnace Nordyne Model MIGH070AAW, Year unknown Operational, Mid Mobile Home, Natural gas, 70,000 BTU , , , , Fair		\$1	M1G990909060
810.37	3-513 Generator 2007 Generac 7000 Watt Model 5251 Non-operational. Propane powered. 50 Amp breaker panel included. , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	4,708,475
No Bid	3-514 GPS 2009 Garmin 76CX Operational, unable to download data. , , , , Poor		\$1	761,170,881
No Bid	3-515 Hot Water Tank 1999 John Wood Model JW202NA04 Operational, Natural Gas 16.5 gallon capacity 22,000 BTU , , , , Fair		\$1	8,801,515,946
No Bid	3-516 Hot Water Tank GSW Model 2EC12, Year unknown Operational, 115 volt 12 gallon capacity , , , , Poor		\$1	9,301,554,040
23.00	3-517 Lawn Mower 2006 Husqvarna Model 6522 SH Self-propelled, non-operational, problem unknown. , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	121505M000705
23.00	3-518 Lawn Mower 2011 Craftsman Model 944361210 Self-propelled, non-operational, problem unknown. , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	052411M004625
66.25	3-519 Propane Range 2006 Danby, Model DGR554WLP Operational, 24" , , , , Fair		\$1	850,420
No Bid	3-520 Refrigerator 2014 White Westinghouse Model WWTR1802KWJ Non-operational. 18 cubic feet. Door handle missing. , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	BA 14812040
20.00	3-521 Television 2000 Panasonic Model TV/VCR Combo Operational, 20" television/VCR Combo , , , , Fair		\$1	C9AA21112

Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
23.00	3-522 Water Pump Honda Model GX 120, Year unknown Non-operational, gas tank rusted, other problems unknown. 2" discharge , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	GC013562757
HUMBOLDT, Environment, Bay 12- 1715 8th Ave.				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Brendon Smith 306-682-6729, email: brendon.smith@gov.sk.ca or Evan Maxwell email: evan.maxwell@gov.sk.ca				
1.00	3-523 Gun Cabinet Wooden Lock broken, 36x18"x65" , , , , Fair		\$1	
56.50	3-524 Tree stand Big Game 18' tall, 2' wide, model unknown , , , , Good		\$1	unknown
56.50	3-525 Tree stand Grey, Metal Mostly complete, 18' tall, 2' wide, strapping is broken, seat is torn, model unknown , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	unknown
KENOSEE LAKE, Parks Culture & Sport, Moose Mountain Provincial Park, vehicle compound				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Leigh Potter 306-577-7810 email: leigh.potter@gov.sk.ca				
864.00	3-503 Truck 2005 FORD Ranger Supercab, 4x4 4L V6 Gas Auto A/C, Cruise , White , , , PROBLEMS: Vehicle is in overall poor condition & there may be additional unknown issues, motor/ transmission/ brakes/ battery/ exhaust unknown condition, front bumper missing, tires/ windshield wipers and washer/ body exterior/ mirrors poor condition, interior lights do not work> , As is, Where is	283,000 Kms	\$250	1FTZR45E85PA99898
1,679.99	3-502 SUV 2007 CHEVROLET Suburban 2500 LS 4WD 6L V8 Gas Auto A/C, cruise, tilt , White , , , PROBLEMS: motor/ transmission/ brakes/ battery/ exhaust/ lights unknown condition, tires/ windshield/ body exterior fair condition, interior/windshield wipers and washer/ mirrors poor condition, running when parked> , As is, Where is	247,688 Kms	\$1,000	3GNGK26K27G318731
277.00	3-501 Van 2003 CHEVROLET Venture Ext FWD 3.4L V6 Gas Auto A/C, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks , White , , , PROBLEMS: motor/ transmission/ brakes/ battery/ exhaust/ lights unknown condition, vehicle has sat for 2 plus years, tires poor, windshield cracked, mirrors fair, body exterior and interior/ windshield washer and wipers/ horn poor condition> , As is, Where is	146,667 Kms	\$500	1GNDX03E13D234205
353.98	3-504 Truck 2006 DODGE Dakota Club Cab, 4x4 3.7L V6 Gas Manual 6 gears A/C, Cruise , White , , , PROBLEMS: Overall vehicle condition is poor. There may be additional issues with motor/transmission/brakes/battery/lights and exhaust. Tires/Windshield/wipers/Mirrors/Horn are all in porr condition. Windshield is cracked. , As is, Where is	288,000 Kms	\$250	1D7HW22KX6S626864

Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
KINDERSLEY, Environment, Compliance & Field Services, 101 - 113 - 2nd Avenue East				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. NO ON-SITE VIEWING. Contact Brant Slater 306-463-5463, brant.slater@gov.sk.ca				
1,016.01	3-505	Outboard Motor Evinrude 65 HP Jet 90 HP Gas Two stroke , Black, , RECENT REPAIRS: 2013 - Replaced worn waterpump and housing. Fixed warning buzzer, 2016 - Mouse damage repaired, PROBLEMS: Last ran in 2018, would not start in 2019, good compression, new starter, new water coolant water pump, rebuilt controls with oil reservoir>, As is, Where is		\$1 F90JB6FPJ1016413
MEADOW LAKE, Highways, Operations and Maintenance, Hwy #4 305- 9th St West.				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Mark Eisenkirch 306-526-9103, mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca.				
14,599.99	3-526	Wheel Loader 1997 CASE 621B 4x4 Cummins 6T-590 inline 6 diesel auto A/C, tilt 3 speed, standard differentials, Yellow, , , PROBLEMS: Exhaust manifold was leaking but under inspection found out exhaust ports on the head are rotted out, Cab ROPS is cracked and rotten in all 4 corners, many small engine and hydraulic leaks, bucket and boom pins and bushings wore, articulation cylinder pins and bushings are wore, motor/battery/body exterior/ lights/ mirrors/ windshield washer & wipers poor condition>, As is, Where is	3483 hours	\$5,000 JEE0054100
NORTH BATTLEFORD, Highways 502, 114th Street.				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Mark Eisenkirch 306-526-9103 email: mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca				
11,560.00	3-530	Gravel Truck 1994 VOLVO 2WD, Tandem VED12 6 cylinder diesel Manual A/C, tilt, cruise 10 speed, 323 wheel base, standard differential, dual tires, Yellow, , , PROBLEMS: Frame is deteriorated beyond repair, Box and cab are very rough shape, will not pass SGI inspection>, As is, Where is	557,620 Kms	\$500 4V2JCBLE4RR825947
22,234.19	3-531	Wheel Loader 1998 CASE 621B 4x4 5.9L Cummins straight 6 diesel auto A/C, tilt standard differentials , Yellow, , , PROBLEMS: Unit has hyd leaks at bottom of hyd tank, radiator leaks, cab ROPS is rusted through, bucket and loader pins are pretty tight, hyd and eng oil leaks, unit runs and drives well>, As is, Where is	4908 hours	\$5,000 JEE0057041
PRINCE ALBERT, Environment, Forest Services, #201 1061 Central Avenue				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Dean Mamer 306-940-7840, email: dean.mamer@gov.sk.ca or Lori Thompson 306-940-6509, email: lori.thompson@gov.sk.ca				
4,100.00	3-647	ATV 2006 Honda TRX 400cc ES Electric/auto shift, electric start, ITP Mudlite tires, winch, currently not running, needs repairs , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1 HFTE295564202249
20.00	3-648	Brushsaw 1995 Husqvarna 250 RX brushsaw has not run for a few years, will need to be serviced before use, recoil needs repair, comes with 4 harnesses, and 4 blades , , , , Good		\$1 3,050,012
35.00	3-649	Chainsaw 2000 Husqvarna 351 chainsaw has not run for a few years, will need to be serviced before use, recoil needs repair , , , , Poor		\$1 3,401,169

	Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
101.01	3-652	Chainsaw and Case 2004 Husqvarna 345 chainsaw runs, will need to be serviced before use, comes with Stihl Case , , , , , Good		\$1	41,906,895
*WD	3-653	Ramps and Toolboxes Aluminum 2 sets of aluminum ATV ramps that are in various states requiring repair, 2 aluminum truck tool boxes in various states requiring repair (no keys for locks) , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	
877.00	3-654	Snowmobile 2002 Polaris Classic 500cc Electric start, reverse, electronic fuel gauge, hand and thumb warmers, hood/windshield/seat in good shape, 2438 km, 500 Liquid Cooled Twin Cylinder, engine partially rebuilt, not currently running , , , , , Good		\$1	4XAND4BS72B266100
REGINA, Elections Saskatchewan, #301-3303 Hillsdale Street					
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. NO ON-SITE VIEWING. Contact Lindsay Staples 306-787-4000, email lindsay.staples@elections.sk.ca or Sarah Cooke 306-570-2779, email: OCEO.Admin@elections.sk.ca					
No Bid	3-645	Accessibility Ramp National Ramp: "Breeze" Model, aluminum W 46" x 64" L, between 3.5" and 5.5" high (adjustable portion of ramp). Assembly required, legs, screws, and all other pieces included , , , , , New- Unused		\$500	
No Bid	3-646	Accessibility Ramp Pride 5 piece ramp, 1.0" - 3.0" incline, W 44.5" x L 39.5" , , , , , Excellent		\$250	RAMPRB1001- HSIN/RAMPPRB1002-HSIN
REGINA, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, Employment Standards, 1870 Albert St, 3rd floor.					
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Darcy Leibel 306-787-2424, email: darcy.leibel@gov.sk.ca or Waneta Hardy 306-798-0312, email: waneta.hardy@gov.sk.ca,					
25.00	3-655	Office Supplies Lot of 6 Miscellaneous 2 single hole punch, 1 dual hole punch, 1 electric stapler, 1 step file , , , , , Fair		\$1	
25.00	3-656	Organizers Lot of 23 Plastic black, document/book organizers , , , , , Fair		\$1	
50.00	3-657	Paper Trays Lot of 15 Plastic black, stackable paper trays , , , , , Fair		\$1	
REGINA, Parks, Culture, and Sport, 1660 Park St.					
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. NO ON-SITE VIEWING. Contact: Marlon Janzen 306-580-2017, Marlon.Janzen@gov.sk.ca, or Ray Poulin 306-787-2801, ray.poulin@gov.sk.ca					
No Bid *	1-511	Movie Projector Hortson 16mm with power supply, 28" wide, 60" tall, 20" deep. Was in good working order when removed from theatre. Has been in storage for approx. 20 years. , , , , , Good		\$250	
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurements, 1660 Park Street.					
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Rhonda Gelowicz 306-552-8049, email: rhonda.gelowicz@gov.sk.ca					
327.77	3-532	Bandsaw Oliver 192 , , , , , Good		\$1	53,508

	Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
100.00	3-535	Batteries and Battery Chargers Lot of 12 Prairie Energy 12v and Infinity 12v rechargeable 4 battery chargers, 7 12v batteries, 1 rechargeable battery, battery chargers are medi-man chargers with carry handle, repaired condition, assume working , , , , , Good		\$1	
42.33	3-538	Bell Saw Sharpening system with stand CS Unknown if operating , , , , , Fair		\$1	10,550
No Bid	3-541	Bench Grinder Thor, 10" heavy duty bench grinder with custom stand and light , , , , , Good		\$1	
26.00	3-544	Bench Grinder Trademaster, Model TT20013 6" grinder on custom stand with light , , , , , Fair		\$1	
26.00	3-547	Bicycle 15 speed Storm comes with carrier, needs new seat, tires need air , , , , , Fair		\$1	
26.51	3-550	Bicycle with hand brakes 2 wheel men's 3 speed bike with gel seat, tires need air, equipped with front carrier, book rack, horn and kick stand , , , , , Good		\$1	
79.78	3-553	Drill Press A-B Rockwell 15-660 , , , , , Fair		\$1	137,344
252.99	3-556	Finger Brake unknown brand includes metal box , , , , , Good		\$1	
50.00	3-559	Machine Shop Items 1 bundle Micellaneous jack hammer with accessories, pipe cutter, misc. sized wheels , , , , , Good		\$1	
50.00	3-562	Machine Shop Items 1 bundle Micellaneous 1 lot, misc. bolts, chains, rivets screws, 2 sealmaster bearings, threaded bars , , , , , New - Unused		\$1	
50.00	3-565	Machine Shop Items 1 bundle Micellaneous 1 lot, various screws, lugnuts, briggs/stratton 4hp motor, explosion proof solinoid valves , , , , , Good		\$1	
210.00	3-568	Mortise/Tenon Machine General model 184YH-TVJA , , , , , Poor		\$1	8-144161-11
50.00	3-571	Nails 1 bundle various sizes and types of nails for finishing, roofing, drywall , , , , , New - Unused		\$1	
150.00	3-574	Pipe Bender stored in wooden box, comes with accessories , , , , , Fair		\$1	
1,405.00	3-577	Planer Delta DC-580 22-450C , , , , , Fair		\$1	216
155.00	3-580	Plumbing Supplies 1 bundle Makita, 355mm Portable cut off model 2414 sink auger and tool boxes containing various tools , , , , , Fair		\$1	
13.33	3-583	Plumbing Supplies Miscellaneous 1 lot, rivets, water meter, faucets, specialty parts, hoses, drain plugs , , , , , New - Unused		\$1	
221.00	3-586	Radial Arm Saw Delta, MX3 , 1950's , , , , , Good		\$1	MX31007
51.27	3-589	Radial Saw Craftsman 12", model 11323301 , , , , , Good		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
77.35	3-592 Scroll Saw Beaver Power Tool, Model 3100 with Leland electric motor, cast Iron, with stand , , , , , Poor		\$1	6,179
221.00	3-595 Scroll Saw Delta Milwaukee comes with manual , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid	3-598 Shock Absorbers Lot of 6 Washex, 1 3/4 x 5 for use in industrial dryers , , , , , New - Unused		\$1	
56.56	3-601 Table Saw 8" Beaver , , , , , Poor		\$1	
56.56	3-604 Table Saw Preston , , , , , Good		\$1	R2109
2,005.00	3-607 Thickness Sander SCM SandyaWin WIN CS 63 , , , , , Good		\$1	AE030220
SASKATCHEWAN LANDING Provincial Park, Parks Culture and Sport, Maintenance Yard				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Tricia Bacon 306-375-5525, 306-741-3940 email: tricia.bacon@gov.sk.ca				
1,500.00	3-609 Riding Mower 1995 Toro 325D 2WD Diesel , Red, , , PROBLEMS: Needs repairs/replacement of: steering cylinder, mower lift and deck, PTO and power train, engine service and fuel shut off solenoid>, As is, Where is	3954 hours	\$1	30788-30813
No Bid	3-610 Truck 2001 DODGE Dakota 2WD, 2 door 3.9L V6 Gas Auto A/C, cruise, tilt , White, , , PROBLEMS: Vehicle out of service, motor/body exterior/paint/interior/lights all in poor condition, needs computer module, A/C doesn't work, broken tail light cover on passenger's side>, As is, Where is	115,884 Kms	\$1	1B7FL26X91S303172
551.51	3-611 Truck 2004 DODGE Dakota 2WD, Club Cab 3.7L V6 Gas Auto A/C, cruise, tilt , White, , , PROBLEMS: Vehicle out of service, needs power steering pump and ram, cracked windshield, A/C not working, needs wipers, body exterior/paint/interior all in poor condition>, As is, Where is	145,911 Kms	\$1	1D7GL42K94S730811
651.51	3-612 Truck 2006 FORD F150 4x4, Supercab, 2 door 5.4L V8 Gas Auto A/C, cruise, tilt , White, , , PROBLEMS: NON-RUNNING - TO BE USED FOR PARTS ONLY. Has a cylinder misfire, doesn't run. Has rust along bottom of truck box on driver's side>, As is, Where is	296,991 Kms	\$1	1FTPX14516NB40009
651.51	3-613 Truck 2001 DODGE Dakota 4x4, club cab 4.7L V8 Gas auto A/C, cruise, tilt , White, , , PROBLEMS: Vehicle out of service, engine needs a computer module, driver's seat upolstry is ripped, rust on both back quarter panels, some dents on hood, mirrors are cracked, body exterior rusted>, As is, Where is	257,272 Kms	\$1	1B7GG22N01S260046
345.89	3-614 Van 2005 DODGE Grand Caravan SE 2WD 3.3L V6 Gas auto A/C, cruise, tilt , Silver, , , , PROBLEMS: Vehicle out of service, Non functioning odometer. Wiring has been chewed by rodents, extent of damage is unknown, doesn't run>, As is, Where is	N/A	\$1	1D4GP24R75B361318

Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
SASKATOON, Environment, Compliance and Field Services, 102-112 Research Drive.				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Michelle Baran 306-933-6240, email: fieldoffice.saskatoon@gov.sk.ca				
229.00	3-650 Metal Detector White's 3900/D Pro Plus Professional Series (1992) , , , , , Fair		\$1	
89.00	3-651 Metal Detector White's 3900/D Pro Plus Professional Series (1992) , , , , , Broken Repairable		\$1	
SASKATOON, Highways, Fleet Services, 126 105th st E.				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Richard Leibel 306-933-5262 or email: richard.leibel@gov.sk.ca				
325.50	3-527 Floor Drill Press 1999, Z5150A In working condition , , , , , Fair		\$10	
25.00	3-528 Mig Welder 2003 Millermatic 300 Not working, circuit board fired (no parts available); no power cord, whip, ground, or rollers , , , , , Beyond Repair		\$10	LE052062
111.00	3-529 Pedestal Grinder Unsure of make or model, working condition , , , , , Good		\$10	
SASKATOON, Justice and Attorney General, Saskatchewan Coroners Service, 3 2345 Avenue C N				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact David Bykowsky 306-230-5259, email: david.bykowsky@gov.sk.ca or Kim James 306-964-1897, email: kim.james@gov.sk.ca				
161.00	3-608 Ergotron Sit/Stand Station Metal Adjustable sit/stand computer station. Clamps on to desk, originally purchased in 2020 for approx. \$1600 , , , , , Good		\$100	33-349-200
SASKATOON, Saskatchewan Research Council, 125-15 Innovation Boulevard.				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Roger Dauvin 306-385-4035, email: roger.dauvin@src.sk.ca or purchasing@src.sk.ca				
1,551.51	3-644 Cargo Trailer 2005 Royal Cargo 5'x8', White, towable but back door hinges rough , , , , , Poor		\$1	2S9AL126553016141
SASKATOON, Sask Polytech, 1130 Idywyld Drive N Door 18.				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Chris Perry 306-659-4467, email: perrychr@saskpolytech.ca				
301.00	3-643 3 Phase Motor Hyundai, model: HKS215SR235A 10 HP - 4P - 208-230/460V , , , , , Good		\$300	OC820C05
STONY RAPIDS, Environment, Compliance & Field Services, Stony Rapids Fire Base				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Steven Asselstine 306-439-2062, 306-439-7901 or email: steve.asselstine@gov.sk.ca				
599.00	3-641 ATV 2004 Bombardier Outlander 330 HO 4X4 Runs, burns oil, minor cosmetic damage on body panels and bush bar, large cut on seat, missing rear storage compartment lid, brakes good. lights good, winch functional, tires in excellent condition - Mud Bug AT 27x12-12 and AT 27x12-10. 3976 miles. SOLD AS IS. , red, , , , Fair		\$1	SBVEGHG164V001342
220.00	3-642 Winch Warn M8000 Unknown condition, unable to verify if the unit works, no controller, mounted to frame with handles. SOLD AS IS. , , , , , Fair		\$1	843,594

Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	
STONY RAPIDS, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 110 Erickson Street.					
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Calvin Whitedeer 306-439-2150, calvin.whitedeer@gov.sk.ca					
*WD	3-640	Truck 2002 FORD F250 SD 8' box, 4x4, crew cab 5.4L V8 gas auto A/C standard differential, red, , , PROBLEMS: Not drivable for any distance, motor has power/fuel issues, motor still runs, Kms no battery, tires poor Brake Disc F/R good, exhaust needs hangars repairs, interior cloth has holes, exterior overall good condition, paint scratches/chips>, As is, Where is	172,442	\$750	1FTNW21L72EB48676
WHITE SPRUCE - ORCADIA, Central Services, Property Management, 12.2 km NW of Yorkton					
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Mark Bigoraj 306-786-5871, mark.bigoraj2@gov.sk.ca, or Val Yaholnitsky 306-786-5747, or at val.yaholnitsky@gov.sk.ca					
No Bid *	12-727	Trailer 2 89 sq meter trailer. - 3 bedroom 3 Bedroom, Trailer is 45 ft X 20 ft outside measurements, and 10 ft X 6 ft porch. This is a double wide trailer, no wheels or hitch on the unit. Trailer consists of wood frame structure and the roof is metal panels. Exterior windows are single glazed and aluminum framed. Exterior doors are wood, interior floors consist of vinyl tile, The walls are wood paneling and plywood. Ceilings are finished with plywood, and spline ceiling tiles. finishes are dated and worn, furnace dates back to 1962 and has not been operational for years. The floor tiles in the pantry/kitchen contain asbestos along with the tar sealant on the roof systems, asbestos report is available. Prior to successful bidder pickup, all furniture and appliances, shown in pictures, will be removed; furnace to remain. Water and sewer disconnected under unit. All bolting to wooded frame will be completed and trailer ready for pickup. Pickup to be June 30th or earlier, if agreed upon by facility operator. , , , , , Poor		\$1	Unknown
No Bid *	12-728	Trailer 1 Make is unknown 3 Bedroom, Trailer is 45 ft X 20 ft outside measurements and 10 ft X 6 ft porch, this is a double wide trailer, no wheels or hitch is on the unit, trailer consists of wood frame structure and the roof is metal panels, exterior windows are single glazed and aluminum framed, exterior doors are wood, interior floors consist of vinyl tile and the walls are wood paneling and plywood, ceilings are finished with plywood also and spline ceiling tiles, all finishes are dated and worn, furnace date back to 1962 and have not been operational for years, the floor tiles in the pantry/kitchen contain asbestos along with the tar sealant on the roof systems, asbestos report is available. Prior to successful bidder pickup, all furniture and appliances, shown in pictures, will be removed; furnace to remain. Water and sewer disconnected under unit. All bolting to wooded frame will be completed and trailer ready for pickup. Pickup to be June 30th or earlier, if agreed upon by facility operator. , , , , , Poor		\$1	Unknown

Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
No Bid * 12-732	Trailer 7 Make is unknown 3 Bedroom, Trailer is 45 feet X 20 feet outside measurements and 10 feet X 6 feet porch, this is a double wide trailer, no wheels or hitch is on the unit, trailer consists of wood frame structure and the roof is metal panels, exterior windows are single glazed and aluminum framed, exterior doors are wood, interior floors consist of vinyl tile and the walls are wood paneling and plywood, ceilings are finished with plywood also and spline ceiling tiles, all finishes are dated and worn, appliances and furnace date back to 1962 and have not been operational for years, the floor tiles in the pantry/kitchen contain asbestos along with the tar sealant on the roof systems, asbestos report is available. Prior to successful bidder pickup, all furniture and appliances, shown in pictures, will be removed; furnace to remain. Water and sewer disconnected under unit. All bolting to wooded frame will be completed and trailer ready for pickup. Pickup to be June 30th or earlier, if agreed upon by facility operator. , , , , , Poor		\$1	Unknown
No Bid * 12-734	Trailer 11 Make is unknown 3 Bedroom, Trailer is 45 ft X 20 ft outside measurements and 10 ft X 6 ft porch, this is a double wide trailer, no wheels or hitch is on the unit, trailer consists of wood frame structure and the roof is metal panels, exterior windows are single glazed and aluminum framed, exterior doors are wood, interior floors consist of vinyl tile and the walls are wood paneling and plywood, ceilings are finished with plywood also and spline ceiling tiles, all finishes are dated and worn, appliances and furnace date back to 1962 and have not been operational for years, the floor tiles in the pantry/kitchen contain asbestos along with the tar sealant on the roof systems, asbestos report is available, trailer has a range. Prior to successful bidder pickup, all furniture and appliances, shown in pictures, will be removed; furnace to remain. Water and sewer disconnected under unit. All bolting to wooded frame will be completed and trailer ready for pickup. Pickup to be June 30th or earlier, if agreed upon by facility operator. , , , , , Poor		\$1	Unknown
YORKTON, Central Services, Property Management, Whitespruce NE-35-TP26-R 5-W2nd. Call for directions.				
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Mark Bigoraj 306-786-5871, 306-621-3051 email: mark.bigoraj2@gov.sk.ca.				
201.00	3-636	Air Compressor Brunner Corp., Model H9-2LT, 3phaze, 7.5 hp motor unknown if operational, has not been used in years but stored under roof , , , , , Fair	\$1	1,031,128
1.50	3-637	Chain Link Fence Parts unknown make operational , , , , , New - Unused	\$1	unknown
2.02	3-638	Unit Heater Olson, Model: KAS-165 / 52,000 BTU, Natural-gas operational, fan motor squeaks , , , , , Fair	\$1	00775KEAN
220.00	3-639	Unit Heater Olson, Model: KAS-130 /104,000 BTU, Natural-gas operational , , , , , Fair	\$1	20686KABN

Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client	
YORKTON, Highways, Fleet Services, 245 York Road East.					
Due to COVID-19, ON-LINE VIEWING ONLY. Contact Brian Perih 306-786-1651 or Ed Patzwald 06-786-1687 email: brian.perih@gov.sk.ca or ed.patzwald@gov.sk.ca.					
99.00 *	2-583	Gravel Truck 1999 Volvo WG64 Tandem Truck Volvo VED12B, 6 cylinder, diesel Eaton Fuller RTX14710B Motor has leaks, transmission, exhaust, battery, paint and interior are fair. Tires, brakes and lights are poor. Exterior, windshield and windsheild wipers are good, including mirrors and horn. 197 wheel base, dual tires, Yellow, , , PROBLEMS: a lot of hydraulic leaks; coolant leaks; cross members need replacing as they are cracked; front pins and bushings need replacing; main and cross chain need repair work; a lot of air leaks; electrical needs repair; rear shocks need replacing; oil pan gasket needs replacing; needs new fender brackets; unit has no box>, As is, Where is	14,578 hours	\$1,500	4VHJCAGF9XN865383
513.00	3-615	Truck 1990 VOLVO WG64 4x4, no box Cummins L10 Diesel RT11609A A/C, tilt , Yellow , , , PROBLEMS: walking beam bushings cracked bad at axels, frame corrosion very bad- needs major repairs, hydraulic tank leaking, engine oil leak from front to rear, engine front cover leaking on inside against engine, appears head gasket leaking external on drivers side, tires poor shape, Speedometer does not work, both doors starting to rust back, no box on unit, heat does not work, washer pump not working, air horn does not work>, As is, Where is	17,339 Kms	\$500	4V2JCBMD8LR806895
220.00	3-616	Sign Posts 3 bundles Wood mostly fir, approx 75 to 100 posts per bundle, approximately 4 inches x 6 inches x 14 feet, old broken sign posts, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs, must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading, if flat deck trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer , , , , Fair		\$1	
11,000.00	3-617	Motor Grader 1995 Champion 740A Cummins LT10-C Diesel , Yellow , , , PROBLEMS: needs repair, all cylinders leaking and shafts pitted badly, drag link on steering loose, moldboard circle poor, emergency brake not holding, motor/ brakes/ battery/ lights/ mirrors good condition, tires/ exhaust/ body exterior poor condition, windshield cracked, seat torn, hood shocks on left side not working needs replacement>, As is, Where is	6911 hours	\$5,000	25,471
7,011.00	3-618	Motor Grader 1996 Champion 740A Cummins LT10-C Diesel A/C , Yellow , , , PROBLEMS: hydraulic leaks, differential has filings in it, steering cylinder ends need replacement, axle seal leaking, mold board lights do not work, has 2 flat rear tire one on each side, piece of bearing in oil, run low on oil, tandem oil contaminated>, As is, Where is	7000 hours	\$5,000	24,927
210.00	3-619	Sign Posts 1 bundle Wood mist fir, 1 lift, 4in x 6in x 14ft approximately, old and broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring flat deck trailer for assistance with loading; if flat deck trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer , , , , poor		\$1	

	Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
505.00	3-620	Gravel Truck 2002 VOLVO VHD64F Tandem VED12C 6 diesel A/C, tilt, cruise , yellow , , , PROBLEMS: Needs new engine ECU will not run without one, frame on unit very thin will not pass SGI, box is rusted out and needs major repairs, engine has oil leaks, tires need replacement, horn not working>, As is, Where is	13,500 hours	\$500	4V5KC9GG62N329864
150.00	3-621	Grader Snow Plow Blade Make and model unknown Was mounted on a 1996 Champion Model 730A Grader , , , , , Poor		\$100	
2.00	3-622	Checkerboard Visibility Mount The Scoop mounts to rear of tandem truck to make it visible in poor weather conditions , , , , , Fair		\$1	
112.19	3-623	Equipment Manuals 1 bundle Various years and models 1 pallet, include manuals for graders/ loaders/ packers/ trucks , , , , , Fair		\$1	
2.00	3-624	Equipment Springs Lot of 3 2 rear springs and 1 front spring, the rear springs fit older model Volvo, front spring model unknown , , , , , New - Unused		\$1	
37.00	3-625	Plow Attachment WearSaver Used on older model plows to help prevent plow from digging into surface; cables are worn through and will need replacement; , , , , , Fair		\$1	unknown
50.00	3-626	Tools 1 bundle Miscellaneous includes bobble light, stell wheel chucks, empty tool boxes, etc. , , , , , Fair		\$1	
500.00	3-627	Tip Out Parts Bins Lot of 2 3 sliding door Steel Frame Tip Out compartment parts bins, compartments are various sizes; part bins measure 48 " wide X 77"tall X 20" deep , , , , , Fair		\$500	unknown
4.19	3-628	Shop Supplies 1 bundle Miscellaneous 1 pallet, includes electrical wire/ bolts/ other assorted hardware , , , , , Fair		\$1	
No Bid	3-629	Portable Weigh Scales 1 bundle working condition unknown , , , , , Poor		\$1	
50.00	3-630	Hydraulic Hose and Cylinders 1 bundle Miscellaneous partial spools of various hydraulic hose, hydraulic cylinders, and air hose , , , , , Poor		\$1	
1.33	3-631	Truck Parts 1 bundle Miscellaneous Bosh Rexroth CS 520 controller, mirror for 2003 Chevy 1 ton truck, etc , , , , , Fair		\$1	na
1.33	3-632	Landa Pressure Washer Pump 1 bundle Miscellaneous Landa Pressure washer pump operating condition unknown , Fender Skirting, Universal PTO shaft , , , , , Fair		\$1	na
35.00	3-633	Tools with Empty cases 1 bundle Miscellaneous empty Milwaukee tool containers, battery chargers, Snap On Drills, empty drill indexes, 3'8" air ratchet , , , , , Fair		\$1	na

Item #	Description	Kms	Serial Number	Ministry / Client
565.00	3-634 Gravel Truck 2003 STERLING LT9511 Tandem Detroit Series 60 V6 Diesel Eaton Fuller Standard Super 10 A/C, cruise, tilt dual tires, 10 speeds, Meriter RP20-145 differential, 214 wheel base, Yellow, PROBLEMS: needs major repairs, frame corrosion very bad, unit missing complete dash, exhaust leaking, unit missing hood, drivers side window does not work, box very rusted, brakes poor, tires poor, body exterior poor, battery fair, transmission fair >, As is Where is	12,592 hours	\$500	2FZHAZCG23AK77533
7,011.00	3-635 Motor Grader 1996 John Deere 770BH 4x4 6 inline diesel auto A/C standard differential, Yellow, PROBLEMS: engine runs poorly should be repaired or replaced, metal in oil filter, leaking tandem pivot, wheel bearings need replacement, kingpins have excessive play, rear tires poor shape, multiple hydraulic hoses almost rubbed through, exhaust leak, multiple cylinders leaking and have play in them>, As is, Where is	6166 hours	\$500	555,772