
SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #2
From May 06 to May 13, 2026

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

SALE SUMMARY LIST

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as 
described.  Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding.  
Vehicles and equipment are sold “AS IS, WHERE IS”, there is no implied or express warranty. 

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.
     - Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
     - SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.
It is the Bidder’s responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.
Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.
Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways: 
     - by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
     - by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3300,
     - by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
     - by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1.
  (If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)
- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer)     This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry. 
WD = (Withdrawn)               This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller. 
No Bid =                                  Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

5/15/2026,4:08 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  1



SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #2
From May 06 to May 13, 2026

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

Bid Price Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca

S $4,045.45 2-001 Car 2013 DODGE Avenger SE FWD 2.4L, inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, power windows/ 
locks/ mirrors/trunk release, keyless entry-2 key fobs , white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 225,445 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Front links and sway bar bushings, front brake pads and rotors, alignment needed, foggy head 
lamps, sun visor clip.
Hood paint peeling/chips/scratches, both bumpers’ chips/scratches, all fenders’ 
chips/scratches, both dog legs chips/scratches/surface rust, both rocker panels chips/ surface 
rust, all doors chips/surface rust, roof paint chips/scratches, trunk lid, paint scratches, no first 
kit/fire extinguishers, hubcap cracked, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

225,445 
km

$885 1C3CDZABXDN604500

S $1,608.00 * 1-001 Car 2009 FORD Focus SE FWD 2.0L, inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 
power windows/locks/heated mirrors, keyless entry-2 key, 2 fobs , grey, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 135,708 km, , 
KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: All four tires, front pads/rotors, rear shoes, 
alignment needed, rocker panels.
Hood scratches/rear bumper scratches, right rear fender scratches, left dog leg road 
rash/rust, right dog leg rust, both rocker panels rust, left front door sill molding broke, left 
rear door road rash/rust/dent, jack missing, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield small 
chips, left and right mirrors chrome pitted, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, 
where is

135,708 
km

$524 1FAHP35N29W115638
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S $1,809.00 * 1-002 Car 2009 FORD  Focus SE FWD 2.0L, inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 
power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 keys, 2 fobs , yellow, TOW 
ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 118,459 km, , 
KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Flex pipe, both rocker panels rusted.
Hood scratches, left side fenders road rash, right front fender road rash, right rear fender 
dents, left dog leg road rash, both rocker panels rusted, left rear door scratches/road rash, 
wheel wrench/jack loose in trunk, windshield small chips, both front mirrors chrome pitted, 
three-wheel covers lose in trunk, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

118,459 
km

$521 1FAHP35N49W115639

S $5,654.00 * 1-006 Truck 2012 CHEVROLET Silverado 2500 HD 4WD, extended cab, 8' box 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, 
tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry-1 fob, 2 keys front 
tow hooks, mud flaps, pintle hook with wiring, OEM trailer brakes, converter-condition 
unknown, Brand X slide in topper, no key for topper, rollout, ladder rack with beacon 
condition of items unknown, tailgate laying on pull-out, missing rear seat, white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 144,982 km, , 
KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Right rear axle seal leaking, both lower ball joints 
loose, front left brake rotor excessively rusted, parking brake does not work, battery does not 
hold a charge, rear seats and belts missing, windshield cracked, wiper blades no good, both 
rocker panels rusted through, hole in left rear door, left front fender has rust holes, license 
plate assembly missing.
Hood chips/dents/scratches, front bumper poor/missing trim-valance ETC, rear bumper 
pad/rust/not aligned, left and right-side fenders badly rusted. Rocker panels rusted through, 
left front door road rash/ rust, left rear door dents/rust/scratches, right side doors 
scratches/dents/chips, roof dents/road rash, one hole in roof sealed, wheel wrench/jack 
loose in back seat, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, left front seat 
worn/foam visible, hook for rear seat missing, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, 
where is

144,982 
km

$5,654 1GC2KVCG1CZ204430
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S $5,604.00 * 1-007 Truck 2012 CHEVROLET Silverado 2500 HD 4WD, extended cab, 8' box 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, 
tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/windows/locks, keyless entry-2 fobs, 3 keys, 1 
key for slide in front tow hooks, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, BrandFX 
slide in, ladder rack/beacon, slide in has a cargo bed roll out with side shelfs and lighting, has 
back seat, white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 155,938 km, , 
KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Engine light on code P0442 EVAP system small leak 
detected, both outer tie rods, front brakes metal on metal, front rotors severely rusted, loose 
front wheel, alignment needed, license plate light, rust holes in both front fenders, left rear 
mud flap broken.
Hood road rash/chips, front bumper cracked/chrome peeling, rear bumper dented/pad loose, 
left and right side fenders badly rusted, all doors road rash/chips/rust, no first aid kit/fire 
extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat worn/cover hole/padding visible, right front 
floor board hole, cargo bed rust/crack at rear - condition fair, missing back seat center hook 
for rear seat, back rest is missing, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

155,938 
km

$5,604 1GC2KVCG5CZ203877

S $7,278.08 2-012 Truck 2014 DODGE/RAM 2500 4WD, crew cab, 6'2" box 5.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 
AM/FM, power locks/windows/mirrors, keyless entry-1 key fob, 1 door key side steps, mud 
flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 192,561 km, , 
KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Check engine light on – runs rough, oil leak, drive 
belt, left rear shock leak, exhaust manifold leak, windshield cracked, coolant cover, park 
brake doesn’t hold, battery not secured, rear right door doesn’t open(inside), left fender 
rusted out.
Hood paint chips/dents, both bumpers’ dents/rust/lower valance missing, left side fenders 
rusted through/chips, right rear fender rusted, both rocker panels rust, all doors paint 
chips/scratches, four holes in roof sealed, tailgate sticks/chips/rust, no spare tire, no first aid 
kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, jump seat missing/center council cut, holes in in 
floor interior, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

192,561 
km

$491 3C6TR5CT6EG207668
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S $5,800.00 2-013 Truck 2015 DODGE/RAM 2500 4WD, crew cab, 6'2" box 5.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 
AM/FM, power locks/windows/mirrors, keyless entry-1 key fob side steps, mud flaps, hitch, 
trailer wiring, grille inserts, has a back seat, brown, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 255,948 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Rear sway bar links, left rear axle seal, all four ball joints, left outer tie rod, front pads and 
rotors, park brake, windshield cracked, high mount brake light, right front mud flap, holes 
drilled through floor.
Note: Rocker panels dented, drive seat torn, B-pillar modified, rear right door molding 
missing, holes in head liner. Grille holes/logo missing, hood paint chips/scratches, both 
bumpers’ dents/trim loose, all fenders paint chips/scratches/dent, rocker panels dented, left 
side doors scratches/chips, right rear door will not open from inside, roof scratches/chipped, 
six holes filled in roof, tailgate dented/scratched/trim broken, has spare tire, wheel 
wrench/jack missing, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, driver seat hole, 
jump seat missing, center console cut out, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, 

255,948 
km

$3,474 3C6TR5CT0FG674845

S $11,300.00 2-004 Truck 2012 DODGE/RAM 5500 RWD, crew cab, 10'l x 7'4"w, dump body 6.7L, inline 6, diesel 
auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated trailer tow mirrors, power 
windows/locks, keyless entry-1 key fob dump body-2 beacons condition unknown, front tow 
hooks/side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, trailer brakes, front and rear wig wags-
condition unknown, dual wheels, lift gate condition unknown, has a back seat, white, TOW 
ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 279, 357 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Belt cracking, both upper ball joints have lateral play, rock chips on windshield, windshield 
wipers not clearing.
Hood road rash/scratches, front bumper pitted/scratches/rusted, left front fender road rash, 
right front fender tar, all doors chips/tar, left front door sill paint worn, roof small rust spots, 
one hole in roof sealed (antenna),  rear of cab covered in tar, right side of dump body 
damaged-mechanical condition unknown, front of dump body rusted, lift gate rusted-
mechanical condition unknown, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

279, 357 
km

$5,256 3C7WDMEL0CG195173
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S $16,001.01 2-014 Truck 2013 DODGE/RAM 5500 RWD, crew cab, dump body 10' x 7'4" 6.7L, inline 6, turbo 
diesel auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/Fm, power locks/windows/mirrors, keyless entry-1 key fob 
seat covers, lift gate mechanical condition unknown, mud flaps, side steps, hitch, trailer 
wiring, beacon, dump body mechanical condition unknown, grille has winter cover, has a back 
seat, white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 305,335 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Both upper ball joints have lateral play and need to be replaced, windshield wipers not 
cleaning.
Hood paint chips/scratches, left and right front fender paint chips/scratches, both rocker 
panels chips/paint peeling, all doors chips/scratches, roof antenna, tailgate lift rusted, no 
spare tire/wheel wrench/jack/firs aid kit/fire extinguisher, holes in dash, tar on rear cab, poor 

305,335 
km

$5,783 3C7WRMEL1DG524823

S $5,261.67 * 1-010 Truck 2017 FORD F250 4WD, crew cab, 6'10" box 6.2L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, 
power windows/locks, power heated trailer tow mirrors, keyless entry-2 key fobs hitch, 
trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, side steps, mud flaps, front tow hooks, jump seat loose in 
back seat, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 296,857 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Left outer tie rod, left axle U-joints, engine noise, rear pads/rotors, alignment needed, 
battery.
Grille broke/holes drilled, hood scratches/chips, front bumper scratched/road rash, rear 
bumper rusted, left rear fender dented, roof scratches, six holes sealed on roof, tailgate will 
not open/holes drilled, wheel wrench/jack loose under back seat, no first aid kit/fire 
extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat sagging, holes drilled in door frame above 
doors, holes drilled in box rails, four holes in floor of bac seat, vanity mirror cracked, holes in 
head liner, B-pillar trim modified, holes drilled in dash, rear right window switch, holes drilled 
in rear right window frame, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> , As is, where is

296,857 
km

$4,841 1FT7W2B69HEB71595
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S $6,250.00 2-006 Truck 2017 FORD F250 SD 4WD, crew cab, 6'10" box 6.2L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 
AM/FM power heated trailer mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs front 
tow hooks, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, jump seat loose in vehicle, has 
a back seat, blue, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 265,321 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Both outer tie rod, pitman arm, alignment needed, mud flaps, left rear signal and brake, 
windshield, wiper blades.
Grille holes drilled, hood chips/scratches/dents, both bumpers’ scratches/chips, all fenders 
road rash/scratches/dents, all doors road rash/scratches/dents, right rear door will not open 
from the inside, one hole in roof sealed, scratches, tailgate no handle or 
trim/dents/scratches, no first aid kit/ fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, left front seat 
worn/sagging, holes in head liner, B-pillar inside trim modified, multiple holes in rear floor 
pan, front valance broken, left taillight broken, right side of unit paint stained, right front mud 
flap missing, holes drilled in rear right door window, frame holes drilled in dash, poor battery, 
minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

265,321 
km

$4,956 1FT7W2B66HEB71599

S $8,321.00 2-008 Truck 2017 FORD F250 SD 4WD, crew cab, 6'10" box 6.2L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 
AM/FM, power heated trailer tow mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs 
front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, loose jump 
seat inside cab, has back seat, grey, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 244,429 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Right lower tie rod, alignment need, TPMS light on, 3rd brake right signal, left signal, right 
front markers, right front passenger window doesn’t roll down, a bunch of lights burnt out.
Grille holes drilled, hood chips/scratches/dents, front bumper pitted, rear bumper badly 
rusted, left rear fender scrape/scratches, right front fender scratches, right rear fender 
scrape/scratches, right side doors scratches, twelve holes in roof sealed, tailgate chips/ 
dents/scratches, missing wheel wrench/jack, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield 
chips, left front seat sagging, left and right B pillars modified, holes drilled around right rear 
inside window frame, holes drilled in dash, front valance broken, holes drilled in rear floor 
pan, left rear hanger broken, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

244,429 
km

$4,991 1FT7W2B68HEE22817
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S $5,077.00 2-009 Van 2012 CHEVROLET Express 1500 Cargo AWD 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 
player, power windows front/locks, 1 key cargo barrier, hitch, trailer wiring, white, TOW 
ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 201,130 km, , 
KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Front differential broken, cross member below is 
torn/cracked, drivers door cracked above exterior handle, left rear fender rusted through 
behind wheel, right rear fender rusted through before and after tire.
Hood chips/paint peeling, left rear fender rusted/dents/scratches, right rear fender 
rusted/scratches, both dog legs rusted, both rocker panels rusted, left front door 
cracked/rusted, left door sill rusted, right side doors rusted/scratches, roof rust spots, one 
hole in roof sealed, tailgate rusted/scratches/dents, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, 
windshield chips, left front seat sagging/worn, housing broken on rear heater fan, both visors 
broken, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> , As is, where is

201,130 
km

$652 1GCSHAF42C1129910

S $10,477.00 * 12-013 Van 2012 CHEVROLET Express 3500 Cargo RWD 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 
player, power windows/locks, keyless entry-1 fob, 2 keys cargo barrier, computer stand, 
shelving, ladder for aerial device, converter, generator, HD rear bumper with pintle hook, 2 
generator battery compartments-may have batteries, Warwick ladder aerial device with 
beacons and ladder, ladder strapped to Warwick ladder, electric trailer brake, white, TOW 
ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 160,355 km, , 
KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Transmission leaks onto mounts, both front upper 
ball joints loose, rear brake rotors rusty, battery will not hold a charge, park brake not 
working, wiper blades, drive side mirror glass cracked.
Hood chips/dents/scratches, left front fender scratches/dents/paint poor, left rear fender 
road rash/ rust, right rear fender rusted/scratches, right dog leg rusted, both rocker panels 
rusted, left front door chips, tailgate chips/rust/left door binds on blot, spare tire missing, no 
first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left mirror glass cracked, left front seat 
holes/sagging, front valance broke, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

160,355 
km

$9,693 1GCZGTCG6C1129789
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S $1,000.00 2-010 Van 2009 DODGE Grand Caravan SE FWD 3.3L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 
player, power mirrors/locks/front windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs 7 passenger, 3rd row 
seat Stow-N-Go , white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 205,585 km, , 
KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Left rocker panel rust holes.
Hood dents/scratches/paint peeling, front bumper chips/scratches, rear bumper chips/ 
scratches/paint cracked, left rear fender rusted, right rear fender rusted/dents, dog leg 
rusted, left rocker panel rusted, left front door rusted, left rear door dents/rusted, right side 
doors rusted, tailgate clear coat peeling, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, 
head light fogged, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

205,585 
km

$459 2D8HN44E69R683442

S $2,956.00 2-011 Van 2016 DODGE Grand Caravan SE FWD 3.6L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 
player, rear HVAC, power heated mirrors/windows/rear vent windows/locks, keyless entry-1 
key fob 7 passenger, Stow-N-Go 3rd seat only, roof rack, silver, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 212,714 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
left outer tie rod, steering rack is stiff in the morning, rear bumper, rear tires, alignment 
needed, parking brake broken, windshield.
Grille broke, hood chips/scratches, front bumper scratches, rear bumper broken, left side 
fenders scratches, right front fender road rash, right rear fender scratches, left front door 
rusted, left rear door road rash, right rear door scratches, tailgate scratches, no first aid 
kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, interior badly soiled, poor battery, minor exterior 
damage.>, As is, where is

212,714 
km

$1,098 2C4RDGBG2GR331712
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S $2,815.65 2-015 Van 2008 GMC Savana 1500 AWD  5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, manual 
seat/windows, power locks, keyless entry-2 key fobs, 3 keys, remote start trailer wiring, hitch, 
mud flaps, partition behind driver seat, shelving in the back with fiber floor, grille mesh cover, 
white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 235,009 km, , 
KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Left front axle seals, right lower ball joint, rear pads 
and rotors, alignment needed, air bag light on, driver door pin, driver seat ripped, both rocker 
panels.
Hood paint chips, rear bumper dents, left and right front fender chips/paint peeling, both 
rocker panels rusted holes, all doors paint peeling/dents, roof scratches/rust spots, three 
holes in roof sealed, has spare tire/wheel wrench/jack, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, drive 
seat hole/stained, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> , As is, where is

235,009 
km

$451 1GTFH154881209450
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REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca

S $20.00 * 1-140 Booster Cables,   light duty 10-11 feet in length.  Good $1

S $2.00 2-101 Booster Cables,   Motomaster  10 foot light duty, yellow & black cables, 8 gauge.  Excellent $1

S $26.40 * 12-102 Tire,   225/65R17, Goodyear Nordic Winter, Snowflake Manufacture date, week 36, year 
2019.  Good

$25 CN1493K00M

S $323.00 * 1-133 Tires, Set of 4  255/60R18, Goodyear Eagle Enforcer, M+S Manufacture date, week 28, year 
2024.  Excellent

$300

S $101.00 2-104 Tires, Set of 4  225/65R16, Winter Claw Extreme Grip, Snowflake Manufacture date, week 34, 
year 2014.  Good

$25

S No Bid 2-102 Tires, Set of 4  225/65R17, Firestone Winter Force, Snowflake, M+S Manufacture date, week 
45, year 2021.  Fair

$120

S $183.83 2-103 Tires, Set of 4  225/65R17, Sumitomo HTR Enhance LX2, M+S Manufacture date, week 27, 
year 2019.  Good

$160

S $25.01 * 1-144 Tool Box,   Brute Commercial Class 5'10" long, 2 supporting legs, has a tray, 2 keys, lid hard to 
close, side mount, damaged, removed from a 2015 Ram 2500.      Fair

$25
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ASSINIBOIA, Community Safety, 401 1st Ave West

Contact Layne Pederson 306-530-6703, layne.pederson4@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid 2-595 Film Projector,   Viewlex  Unknown if operational, unable to plug in due to damaged cord, 
comes with case, and film projector.  Broken Repairable

$1

ECHO VALLEY PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks Culture and Sports, Echo Valley Provincial Park - Call for Directions

Contact Shelley MacLean 306-332-3215, shelley.maclean@gov.sk.ca

S $959.00 * 11-007 Van 2009 DODGE Grand Caravan FWD 3.3L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 
rear HVAC, power mirrors/front windows/locks, keyless entry-2 key fobs Stow-N-Go 3rd row 
only, 7 passenger, silver, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 168,040 km, , 
KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Rear shocks, rear pads and rotors, alignment 
needed, sun visor clip, rocker panels.
Grille broke, hood scratches/paint bubbling/dents, front bumper hole, rear bumper scratches, 
left front fender scratches, left rear fender rusted/dent, right rear fender rusted, both dog 
legs rusted, both rocker panels rusted, left front door rust/dents/chips, right front door 
rust/dents, roof small rust spots, tailgate glass scratched, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, 
windshield chips, right mirror heated left is not, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, 
where is

168,040 
km

$951 2D8HN44E29R681753

MEADOW LAKE PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks, Culture and Sport, Meadow Lake Provincial Park - Highway 224 - Call for Directions

Contact Chris Greedus 306-240-7229, christopher.greedus@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 1-519 Truck 2005 Dodge Dakota RWD, club cab 3.7L, V6, gas auto air, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD GVW 
6010 lbs / 2726 kg, tire size P245/70R16, one set of keys, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI 
Inspection.  It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed 
SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. ,  
unknown, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: transmission will only engage the reverse, 1st, and 2nd 
gears, odometer non-operational - shows error message, no battery, poor tires, poor 
windshield and wipers, poor mirrors, poor interior, poor exterior, minor exterior damage.>, 
As is where is

 unknown $600 1D7HE22K45S298326

5/15/2026,4:08 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  12



SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #2
From May 06 to May 13, 2026

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

Bid Price Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

S No Bid * 1-511 Truck 2006 Dodge Dakota 4x4, club cab 3.7L, V6, gas auto air, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD, 6 foot 
box tire size P245/70R16, one set of keys, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection.  It is 
unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to 
be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 303,864 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS: no battery, burns oil, rear side window replaced with plexi-glass, rusty exterior, 
poor tires, poor windshield, poor paint, poor interior, minor exterior damage.> , As is, where 
is

303,864 
km

$800 1D7HW22K16S626865

OUTLOOK, Agriculture, 410 Saskatchewan Ave W

Contact Ben Lalonde 306-867-6469, ben.lalonde@gov.sk.ca or Outlook Front Desk 306-867-5500, stacey.stutters@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 11-509 GPS Base Radio,   Pacific Crest PDL 4335 GPS 430-450Mhz radio for GPS system, significant 
wear, unknown if still operational, stored in a cool dry place for many years, no cables 
included.  Poor

$5 8,091,658

S No Bid * 11-513 Surveying Tripod,   Duratech, wood, flat head Stored in a cool dry place, clamps are 
somewhat loose, one leg is partially detached from the hinge (needs a new screw), noticeable 
wear present, tightening and calibration likely required.  Fair

$20

S No Bid * 11-515 Surveying Tripod,   Leica, wood, telescoping antenna pole Stored in a cool dry place, clamps 
are somewhat loose, noticeable wear present, tightening and calibration likely required.  Fair

$30

OUTLOOK, Agriculture, 410 Saskatchewan Ave W

Contact Darren Clay 306-867-6733, darren.clay@gov.sk.ca or Stacey Stutters 306-867-5500, stacey.stutters@gov.sk.ca

S $30.00 2-543 Air Tank,   11 gallon  Operational.  Fair $1

S $35.00 2-544 Compound Miter Saw,   Makita LS1040 10", operational.  Fair $10 1,021,872

S $327.15 2-545 Generator,   Honda EG3500X Unknown if operational.  Fair $25 EA6-4111109

S $327.15 2-546 Generator,   Honda EM3000c Unknown if operational.  Fair $25 EZGL-1008606

S No Bid 2-547 Pipes and Fittings,   PVC and ABS Bundle of various lengths and sizes.  Good $1

S $5.00 2-548 Plan Holder,   MasterFile 4 Engineering Grey, operational, 33 3/4" w x 29" d x 42 1/2" h, no 
keys.  Good

$1

S $15.15 2-549 Side Mirrors, Set of 2  2014 Dodge Black,  driver and passenger side, operational.  Good $1 (P)68147863AG, (P)68147862AG

S $315.00 2-550 Soil Samplers, Lot of 2  Concord Truck mounted, 1 operational, 1 non-operational(parts), 
controllers.  Fair

$1
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S $35.00 2-551 Tow Hitches, Lot of 2  Pintle and Ball  Operational, 2" ball.  Fair $1

PIKE LAKE PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks, Culture and Sport, Pike Lake Provincial Park - Call For Directions

Contact Dwight Martin 306-933-6968 or 306-250-8490, Dwight.martin@gov.sk.ca

S $557.00 2-606 Golf Cart 1999 Club Car  Turf II CarryALL 2WD 1 cylinder, gas CVT Forward and reverse, 
electric dump box canopy, tire size 18-8x8, 1 set of keys, white, , , , KNOWN PROBLEMS: 
Engine removed, battery gone, other parts from engine bay may be missing, no roll over 
protection, one headlight damaged/missing, scratched plastic, brown paint overspray on 
various parts of vehicle, some of the tires do not hold air, plastic windshield is scratched, 
minor exterior damage > As is where is

$10 RG9919-763361

S $2,122.00 2-607 Truck 2009 Chevrolet  2500 HD 4X4, 8' box 6.2L V8, gas auto air, tilt, cruise, power 
locks/windows/mirrors, AM/FM/CD Tipster box with hoist, GVW 4,173 kg, tire size 
245/75R16, hitch receiver, two sets of keys, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection.  It is 
unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to 
be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 266,753 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS: Light lenses fogged, large dent in passenger side of box, rusting around wheel 
wells and fenders, stone chips on hood and sides, front bumper valence damaged, chrome 
peeling, no back seat, driver seat tearing, needs new battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, 
where is

266,753 
km

$1,000 1GCHK49K79E137154

S $2,731.12 2-608 Truck 2008 Chevrolet  2500 HD extended cab, 4X4, 8' box 6.2L V8, gas auto air, tilt, cruise, 
power windows/locks, AM/FM aluminum headache rack, GVW 4,173 kg, tire size 245/75R16, 
hitch receiver, two sets of keys, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection.  It is unknown if any 
repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. 
Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 204,702 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: 
Engine light on, camshaft problem, has not been used in 2 years, headlights foggy, dent in 
passenger side rear fender, has been repainted - rust showing through, fender flares covering 
rust, stone chips throughout, hood paint peeling, tires poor, needs battery, minor exterior 
damage > As is where is

204,702 
km

$500 1GCHK29K78E208291

PRINCE ALBERT, Environment, 201 - 1061 Central Ave

Contact Emelyn Feliciano 306-953-3233, emelyn.feliciano2@gov.sk.ca or Tammy Allan, tammy.allan@gov.sk.ca

S $10.00 2-528 Bookshelf,   wood Dark brown, 5 shelves, 37"w x 12"d x 71"h.  Good $2

S $5.00 2-529 Briefcase,   vinyl exterior, metal hardware Black.  Fair $1

S $77.77 2-530 Chair, Lot of 3  cloth Black and faded purple, adjustable, 5 casters, ergonomic, swivel, tilts.  
Fair

$2

S $1.00 2-531 Clipboard, Lot of 2  metal Silver.  Fair $1

S No Bid 2-532 Cork Board,   wood 36"h x 48"w.  Fair $1
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S $2.00 2-533 Desk Riser , Lot of 2  wood Dark walnut and gray,  34" w x  31" d x 20.5in h, keyboard tray.  
Good

$2

S $20.00 2-534 File Cabinet, Lot of 2  lateral, wood Off white, 2 drawer, 36"w x 24"d 27"h, no keys.  Good $2

S $2.00 2-535 File Cabinet,   lateral, wood Off white, pedestal, 3 drawers, 18"w x 24"d x 26"h, no keys.  
Broken Repairable

$1

S No Bid 2-536 Label Maker,   Pt-touch 2030 Non-operational.  Broken Repairable $1 UG2817-L32885761
S $11.11 2-537 Laminator,   plastic, Swingline GBC Black, non-operational.  Poor $1 WL1706000145
S No Bid 2-538 Laptop Bag,   polyester, ThinkPad Heavy duty, black.  Fair $1
S $2.00 2-539 Desk,   wood Grey, L shape with overhead cabinets, main: 29"w x 42"d x 102"h, return side:  

29"w x 38"d x 101"h. hutch: 42"w x 19"d x 72"h.  Good
$2

S No Bid 2-540 Office Partition,   wood and cloth Beige, free standing, 60"w x 72" h.  Good $2

S No Bid 2-541 Planner Case, Lot of 2  leather, Franklin Covey Brown and burgundy.  Poor $1

PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Polytechnic, 1100 15th St E

Contact Doug Wagar 306-765-1780, wagardo@saskpolytech.ca or pashipping@saskpolytech.ca or Leslie Morin 306-765-1584, pashipping@saskpolytech.ca

S $753.49 2-524 Dual Sander,   General, 100 Operational, voltage 208/2HP/6.8Amp/3PH.  Good $150 R560

S $201.00 2-526 Scaffold,   Metaltech, Bakers 69.75" w x 29.25" d x 44.5" h, plywood deck, safety rails, swing 
gate, wheels.  Good

$50

S $191.91 2-527 Scaffold,   Metaltech, Bakers 69.75" w x 29.25" d x 44.5" h, plywood deck, safety rails, swing 
gate, wheels.  Good

$50

S $125.88 2-525 Scaffold,   Metaltech, Bakers 69.75" w x 29.25" d x 44.5" h, plywood deck.  Fair $50

S $18.00 2-501 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-02rx Operational, cables included.  Good $1 525,952

S $17.00 2-502 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12i Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,500,339

S $17.00 2-503 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,355,277

S $17.00 2-504 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,354,334

S $17.00 2-505 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,328,348

S $17.00 2-506 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,328,364

S $21.00 2-507 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,328,346
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S $17.00 2-508 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,328,363

S $17.00 2-509 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,328,360

S $17.00 2-510 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,355,278

S $17.00 2-511 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,328,344

S $17.00 2-512 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,327,002

S $17.00 2-513 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,328,365

S $17.00 2-514 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,335,754

S $17.00 2-515 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,355,276

S $21.00 2-516 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,335,765

S $17.00 2-517 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12id Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,335,745

S $17.00 2-518 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 132,345

S $17.00 2-519 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,355,279

S $17.00 2-520 Document Camera,   Elmo, TT-12iD Operational, cables included.  Good $1 1,244,379

S $30.25 2-521 Projector,   NEC, VT660K VGA, operational.  Good $1 3800459NB

S $125.64 2-522 Speakers,   Octasound, SP520A/SP540A Operational.  Good $1 54007691/92
 54007842/43

S $155.55 2-523 Speakers,   Peavey, SP-5G Operational.  Good $1 09125405/09096974
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REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 12252 Ewing Avenue

Contact Al Kentz or Todd Leurer, DCMaintenance@slga.com

S $2,500.00 2-589 Reach Truck  Raymond  752-R45TT  Electric  mast approx. 14 ft high, built-in on/off key 
operational, batteries are operational but approximately 5 years old, charger included - 
#215CS32099, Important Notice - Machines are sold “as-is.”, no guarantees, warranties, 
returns, or refunds are provided, the seller assumes no responsibility for the condition, 
performance, or any issues after purchase. Removal Responsibility - the buyer is solely 
responsible for the complete removal and pickup of the machine from the property within 
seven (7) days following auction closure, the seller will not provide assistance with removal, 
laydown, or any related tasks, any damage to the premises or lot during removal will be the 
buyer’s responsibility, the buyer assumes full responsibility for all aspects of removal, 
including any associated tasks., red/black, , Key H - 17687, DdMan - 10465, Known Recent 
Repairs: Serviced twice annually., , As is, where is

Key H - 
17687, 
DdMan - 
10465

$2,000 752-15-AD48998

S $3,200.00 2-590 Reach Truck  Raymond  752-R45TT  Electric  mast approx. 14 ft high, built-in on/off key 
operational, batteries are operational but approximately 5 years old, charger included - 
#215CS32104, Important Notice - Machines are sold “as-is.”, no guarantees, warranties, 
returns, or refunds are provided, the seller assumes no responsibility for the condition, 
performance, or any issues after purchase. Removal Responsibility - the buyer is solely 
responsible for the complete removal and pickup of the machine from the property within 
seven (7) days following auction closure, the seller will not provide assistance with removal, 
laydown, or any related tasks, any damage to the premises or lot during removal will be the 
buyer’s responsibility, the buyer assumes full responsibility for all aspects of removal, 
including any associated tasks., red/black, , Key H - 19337 , DdMan - 10070, Known Recent 
Repairs: Serviced twice annually., , As is, where is

Key H - 
19337 , 
DdMan - 
10070

$2,000 752-15-AD48995

S $2,900.00 2-591 Reach Truck  Raymond  752-R45TT  Electric  mast approx. 14 ft high, built-in on/off key 
operational, batteries are operational but approximately 5 years old, charger included - 
#216CS4639, Important Notice - Machines are sold “as-is.”, no guarantees, warranties, 
returns, or refunds are provided, the seller assumes no responsibility for the condition, 
performance, or any issues after purchase. Removal Responsibility - the buyer is solely 
responsible for the complete removal and pickup of the machine from the property within 
seven (7) days following auction closure, the seller will not provide assistance with removal, 
laydown, or any related tasks, any damage to the premises or lot during removal will be the 
buyer’s responsibility, the buyer assumes full responsibility for all aspects of removal, 
including any associated tasks., red/black, , Key H - 18436, DdMan - 11777, Known Recent 
Repairs: Serviced twice annually., , As is, where is

Key H - 
18436, 
DdMan - 
11777

$2,000 752-15-AD49001
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S $2,900.00 2-592 Reach Truck  Raymond  752-R45TT  Electric  mast approx. 14 ft high, two keys operational, 
batteries are operational but approximately 5 years old, charger included - #215CS32102, 
Important Notice - Machines are sold “as-is.”, no guarantees, warranties, returns, or refunds 
are provided, the seller assumes no responsibility for the condition, performance, or any 
issues after purchase. Removal Responsibility - the buyer is solely responsible for the 
complete removal and pickup of the machine from the property within seven (7) days 
following auction closure, the seller will not provide assistance with removal, laydown, or any 
related tasks, any damage to the premises or lot during removal will be the buyer’s 
responsibility, the buyer assumes full responsibility for all aspects of removal, including any 
associated tasks., red/black, , Key H - 18409, DdMan - 10856, Known Recent Repairs: Serviced 
twice annually., , As is, where is

Key H - 
18409, 
DdMan - 
10856

$2,000 752-15-AD49004

S $2,900.00 2-593 Reach Truck  Raymond  752-R45TT  Electric  mast approx. 14 ft high, built-in on/off key 
operational, batteries are operational but approximately 5 years old, charger included - 
#215CS32101, Important Notice - Machines are sold “as-is.”, no guarantees, warranties, 
returns, or refunds are provided, the seller assumes no responsibility for the condition, 
performance, or any issues after purchase. Removal Responsibility - the buyer is solely 
responsible for the complete removal and pickup of the machine from the property within 
seven (7) days following auction closure, the seller will not provide assistance with removal, 
laydown, or any related tasks, any damage to the premises or lot during removal will be the 
buyer’s responsibility, the buyer assumes full responsibility for all aspects of removal, 
including any associated tasks., red/black, , Key H - 16600 , DdMan - 10403, Known Recent 
Repairs: Serviced twice annually., , As is, where is

Key H - 
16600 , 
DdMan - 
10403

$2,000 752-16-AD55553

REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 12252 Ewing Avenue

Contact Todd Leurer 306-510-4368, dcmaintenance@slga.com or tleurer@slga.com

S No Bid * 1-526 Cradles, Lot of 4  wood, metal Approx. 14'l x 3.5'w x 3.5'h.  Good $200

REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 1702 Park Street 

Shola Babarinde  306-787-5864, sbabarinde@slga.com or Meet Patel, mpatel4@slga.com 

S No Bid 2-596 Chairs, Lot of 2  fabric Brown and grey.  Fair $10

S $15.00 2-597 Chairs, Lot of 2  fabric Brown.  Good $10

S No Bid 2-598 Chairs, Lot of 2  fabric Navy and blue, 5 castor, adjustable, seat/arms/height, operational.  
Fair

$10
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S $25.00 2-599 Chairs, Lot of 2  fabric Navy blue, 5 castor, adjustable seat/arms/height, operational.  Good $10

S $15.00 2-600 Chairs, Lot of 2  fabric Sky blue and wine.  Good $10

S $20.00 2-601 Chairs, Lot of 2  fabric Wine.  Good $10

S $3.01 2-602 Coat Racks, Lot of 2  metal Grey.  Good $2

S $2.63 2-603 Coat Racks, Lot of 2  metal  Black.  Fair $1

S No Bid 2-604 Table,   wood  Brown, 26" w x 26" d x 16" h.  Good $10

S No Bid 2-605 Table,   wood and metal Biege, 60" w x 30" d x 29.5" h.  Fair $10

SASKATOON, Community Safety, 910 - 60th St E

Contact Terry Schreiner 306-200-2749, terry.schreiner3@gov.sk.ca or Maintenance Shop 306-956-8844

S $320.00 2-609 Boiling Pot,   Cleveland Operational, approx 40 gal, natural gas, stainless  Fair $1

S $320.00 2-610 Boiling Pot,   Cleveland, KGL-60  Operational, 60 gal, natural gas, stainless  Fair $1 110,423,056,786

S $168.58 2-611 Cooler,    Glass door, 31" w x 30" d x 79" h, non-operational, shelves are rusted.  Broken 
Repairable

$1

S $260.00 2-612 Deep Fryer,   Quest, MV 40/130 Operational,  16.5" w x 31" d x 42.5" h, natural gas, 130 
KBTU, stainless.   Fair

$1 18,239

S $250.00 2-613 Deep Fryer,   Quest, MV 40/130 Operational,  16.5" w x 31" d x 42.5" h, natural gas, 130 
KBTU, stainless.   Fair

$1 18,393

S $33.00 2-552 Dryer,   Amana YNED4655EW1 Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches, paint 
missing.  Poor

$1 MD2414377

S No Bid 2-553 Dryer,   Amana YNED4655EW1 Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches, parts 
missing.  Poor

$1 M92927380

S $33.00 2-554 Dryer,   Amana YNED4655EW1 Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches.  Fair $1 MD2413904

S $10.00 2-555 Dryer,   Huebsch HDEMNRGS173CW01 Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches, 
paint.  Poor

$1 2,012,065,119

*MT *MT 2-556 Dryer,   Huebsch SDEMNRGS173CW01 Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches, 
paint.  Fair

$1 2,012,065,121

S $10.00 2-557 Dryer,   Huebsch ZDE3SRGS173CW01 Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches, 
parts missing.  Poor

$1 1,509,051,644

S $10.00 2-558 Dryer,   Huebsch ZDE3SRGSW173CW01 Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches.  
Poor

$1 1,910,030,811
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S $10.00 2-559 Dryer,   Huebsch ZDESRGS175CW01 Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches.  Poor $1 2,010,061,489

S $33.00 2-560 Dryer,   Maytag YMED4500MW0 Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches, parts 
missing.  Poor

$1 MC0301813

S $50.99 2-561 Dryer,   Maytag YMED4500MW034F Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches.  Poor $1 MC0301804

*MT *MT 2-562 Dryer,   Speed Queen SDEMNRGS173CW01 Operational when last used, dirty, dents, 
scratches, paint missing.  Fair

$1 1,803,064,252

S $55.55 2-563 Food Trolly ,   stainless steel  2 sides, wheels, outside dimensions excluding wheels 35" w x 
25" d x 49" h, heated section cord cut - unknown if operational, dented  Fair

$1

S $55.55 2-564 Food Trolly ,   stainless steel  Operational when last used, 2 sides, wheels, out side 
dimensions excluding wheels 33" w x 25" d x 42" h.  Fair

$1

S $55.55 2-565 Food Trolly ,   stainless steel  Operational when last used, 2 sides, wheels, out side 
dimensions excluding wheels 33" w x 25" d x 42" h.  Fair

$1

S $55.55 2-566 Food Trolly ,   stainless steel  Operational when last used, 2 sides, wheels, out side 
dimensions excluding wheels 33" w x 25" d x 42" h.  Fair

$1

S $20.00 2-567 Food Trolly ,   stainless steel  Operational when last used, 2 sides, wheels, out side 
dimensions excluding wheels 33" w x 25" d x 42" h.  Fair

$1

S $20.00 2-568 Food Trolly ,   stainless steel  Operational when last used, 2 sides, wheels, out side 
dimensions excluding wheels 33" w x 25" d x 42" h.  Fair

$1

S $7.00 2-569 Food Trolly ,   stainless steel  Operational when last used, 2 sides, wheels, out side 
dimensions excluding wheels 33" w x 25" d x 42" h.  Fair

$1

S $12.00 2-570 Food Trolly ,   stainless steel  Operational when last used, 2 sides, wheels, out side 
dimensions excluding wheels 33" w x 25" d x 42" h.  Fair

$1

S $12.00 2-571 Food Trolly ,   stainless steel  Operational when last used, 2 sides, wheels, out side 
dimensions excluding wheels 33" w x 25" d x 42" h.  Fair

$1

S $12.00 2-572 Food Trolly ,   stainless steel  Operational when last used, 2 sides, wheels, out side 
dimensions excluding wheels 33" w x 25" d x 42" h.  Fair

$1

S $12.00 2-573 Food Trolly ,   stainless steel  Operational when last used, 2 sides, wheels, out side 
dimensions excluding wheels 33" w x 25" d x 42" h.  Fair

$1

S $44.44 2-574 Food Trolly ,   stainless steel  Operational when last used, 2 sides, wheels, out side 
dimensions excluding wheels 33" w x 25" d x 42" h.  Fair

$1

S $44.44 2-575 Food Trolly ,   stainless steel  Operational when last used, 2 sides, wheels, out side 
dimensions excluding wheels 33" w x 25" d x 42" h.  Fair

$1

S No Bid 2-614 Meat Slicer ,   Bizerba, M-22 non-operational  Broken Repairable $1 12,104,831

S $58.88 2-615 Oven,   Manitowoc, MCO-GD-10S Operational, natural gas, 2089/240v 1 phase, stainless, 38” 
w x 48” d x 32” h.   Fair

$1 1,611,100,102,764

5/15/2026,4:08 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  20



SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #2
From May 06 to May 13, 2026

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

Bid Price Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

S $58.88 2-616 Oven,   Manitowoc, MCO-GD-10S Operational, natural gas, 2089/240v 1 phase, stainless, 38” 
w x 48” d x 32” h.   Fair

$1 1,011,100,102,769

S $58.88 2-617 Oven,   Manitowoc, MCO-GD-10S Operational, natural gas, 2089/240v 1 phase, stainless, 38” 
w x 48” d x 32” h.   Fair

$1 1,611,100,102,768

S $58.88 2-618 Oven,   Manitowoc, MCO-GD-10S Operational, natural gas, 2089/240v 1 phase, stainless, 38” 
w x 48” d x 32” h.   Broken Repairable

$1 1,611,100,102,767

S $58.88 2-619 Oven,   Manitowoc, MCO-GD-10S Operational, natural gas, 2089/240v 1 phase, stainless, 38” 
w x 48” d x 32” h.   Fair

$1 161,100,102,766

S $58.88 2-620 Oven,   Manitowoc, MCO-GD-10S Operational, natural gas, 2089/240v 1 phase, stainless, 38” 
w x 48” d x 32” h.   Fair

$1 1,611,100,102,765

S $450.88 2-621 Steamer,   Cleveland, 22CET6.1  Operational, 22" w x 31" d x 22" h, stainless, 208V, 3 phase, 
29.8 amp.  Fair

$1 161,223,050,023

S $450.88 2-622 Steamer,   Cleveland, 22CET6.1  Operational, 22" w x 31" d x 22" h, stainless, 208V, 3 phase, 
29.8 amp.  Fair

$1 170,123,050,701

S $17.00 2-623 Stove,   Garland, G36-6R Operational, natural gas,  35" w x 35" d x 57" h , stainless  Fair $1 1,607,100,100,010

S No Bid 2-576 Washer,   Amana 4516FW4  Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches, 
corroded/rust  Poor

$1

S No Bid 2-577 Washer,   Amana 4516FW4  Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches, 
corroded/rust.  Poor

$1

S No Bid 2-578 Washer,   Amana 4516FW4  Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches, 
corroded/rust.  Poor

$1

S $33.00 2-579 Washer,   Amana 4516FW4  Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches.  Fair $1

S $33.00 2-580 Washer,   Amana 4605EW0  Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches.  Fair $1 C60629456

S $50.99 2-581 Washer,   Maytag MVW4505MW1 Non-operational, needs repair, dirty, dents, scratches.  
Broken Repairable

$1 CD1209793

S $50.99 2-582 Washer,   Maytag MVW4505MW1 Non-operational, needs repair, dirty, dents, scratches.  
Broken Repairable

$1 CD1403698

S $40.00 2-583 Washer,   Whirlpool WTW4855HW3 Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches, 
corroded/rust  Poor

$1

S $40.00 2-584 Washer,   Whirlpool WTW4855HW3 Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches, 
corroded/rust.  Poor

$1 CD3300135

S $40.00 2-585 Washer,   Whirlpool WTW4855HW3 Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches.  Fair $1 CD440490

S $40.00 2-586 Washer,   Whirlpool WTW4855HW3 Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches.  Fair $1
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*MT *MT 2-587 Washer,   Whirlpool WTW4855HW3 Operational when last used, dirty, dents, scratches.  
Good

$1 CD2300820

SASKATOON, SaskBuilds and Procurement, Hangar 17 Wayne Hicks Lane

Contact Eric Braaten 306-491-8565, eric.braaten2@gov.sk.ca or Tim Sawatzky 306-385-2164, tim.sawatzky@gov.sk.ca

S $9.00 2-624 Mobile Lifting Aid,   AMT solutions, A150001 Goes down but does not go up, folds up and 
comes apart into 3 pieces for easy transport.  Broken Repairable

$1 1

S $50.00 2-625 Videoscope,   Karl Storz, V05021AEM  Unit powers on but has limited functionality, three 
boxes are included, two boxes were used for shipping and are empty, one box contains the 
videoscope and all attachments.  Broken Repairable

$1 114,814

SASKATOON, Saskatchewan Research Council, Bay 2D, 820 51st Street E

Contact: Roger Dauvin  306-385-4035, roger.dauvin@src.sk.ca

S $1,804.00 2-594 Stacker,2022 U-Line  H-5440 Semi-Electric Straddle Stacker FA009441 Semi-Electric  137" lift, 
manual push/pull  Operational, holds charge well, 2 keysyellow 4.1 hours As is, where is

 4.1 hours $1 25,211,100,708

SASKATOON, Saskatchewan Research Council, 143 - 111 Research Dr

Contact: Roger Dauvin  306-385-4035, roger.dauvin@src.sk.ca

S $100.00 2-626 Dishwasher,   Labconco, FlaskScrubber 4420320 Operational.  Poor $1 80,253,083

S No Bid 2-627 Disintegration Apparatus,   Agilent, 100 Operational,  PN - G7962-64002.  Fair $1,500 MY21081201

S No Bid 2-628 Elemental Micro Analyzer,   VELP Scientific, EMA 502 Operational, CHNSO, PN - F30800100.  
Fair

$10,000 662,338

SASKATOON, Western Canada Lottery Corporation, 1914 1st Ave N

Contact Curtis Adair 306-933-5425 or 306-850-0165, adairc@sk-wclc.com

S $3,210.99 2-542 Van 2014 Dodge Grand Caravan SE 2WD 3.6L V6, gas 6 speed auto air, tilt, cruise, power 
windows/locks/seats cargo barrier, remote start, aftermarket stereo - Pioneer Mixtrax, GVW 
2,745 kg, wheel base 3078 mm, tire size 225/65/16, two key fobs, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI 
Inspection.  It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed 
SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 
251,226 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Rust on tailgate, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

251,226 
km

$1 2C4RDGBG1ER416053
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S $6,666.66 2-588 Van 2021 Dodge Promaster City SLT 2WD 2.4L inline 4, gas 9 speed, auto air, tilt, cruise, 
AM/FM, power windows/locks remote start, two sets of keys, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI 
Inspection.  It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed 
SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 
253,920 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Left and right front needs inner and outer tie-rod, left and 
right front ball joints are worn, left and right front disc pads, left and right front rotors are 
rusted and grooved, front brake calipers, rear brake drums rusted, power steering line 
leaking, coolant leak, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

253,920 
km

$1 ZFBHRFDBXM6V58029

SOUTHEND, Community Safety, 15 College Dr

Contact Casey Howey 306-758-6254 or 306-961-9763, casey.howey@gov.sk.ca

S $428.00 * 1-501 Towing Toboggan,   oak 10 feet long with steel hitch in addition to overall length, comes with 
canvas bag, back stand-up bar, side boards, full bottom white puck board and additional puck 
board runners.  Good

$350

S $428.00 * 1-502 Towing Toboggan,   oak 9 feet long with steel hitch in addition to overall length, comes with 
canvas bag, side boards for protection, back stand bar, puck board material on bottom for 
protection.  Good

$350
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