
SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #12
From Mar 04 to Mar 11, 2026

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

SALE SUMMARY LIST

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as 
described.  Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding.  Vehicles 
and equipment are sold “AS IS, WHERE IS”, there is no implied or express warranty. 

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.
     - Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
     - SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.
It is the Bidder’s responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.
Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.
Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways: 
     - by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
     - by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3300,
     - by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
     - by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1.
  (If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)
- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer)     This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry. 
WD = (Withdrawn)               This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller. 
No Bid =                                  Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

3/12/2026,10:55 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  1



SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #12
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Bid Price Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca

S $1,081.00 12-001 Car 2013 CHEVROLET Impala LS FWD 3.6L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 
power mirrors/locks/windows/left front seat/trunk release, keyless entry-1 fob, 1 key , white, 
TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 251,915 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Right outer tie rod, right front hub bearing, front and rear 
pads/rotors, all four tires, alignment needed, driver lock switch, driver door pins, rocker 
panels. Note: transaxle noise.
Note: Misfire at idle, cam shaft/rocker arms are rust/pitted and damaged. Hood chips/ 
scratches, front bumper broken, rear bumper scratches/clear coat peeling, left rear fender 
rusted, right front fender paint cracked, right rear fender rusted, right rocker panel rusted, left 
side doors rusted, roof rusted, trunk lid scratches, no first aid kit/fire extinguishers, no first aid 
kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat worn/ripped, left head light fogged, full 
size tire and rim in trunk may not be compatible with vehicle,  poor battery, minor exterior 
damage.> , As is, where is

251,915 
km

$481 2G1WA5E38D1248426

S $5,432.10 12-002 SUV 2014 CHEVROLET Tahoe LTZ 4WD 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 
power mirrors/locks/windows/front seats, rear HVAC, keyless entry-1 fob, 1 key front tow 
hooks, hitch, trailer wiring, 5 passenger, white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 253,707 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Both outer tie rods, alignment needed, both rear doors missing locks, both rear windows 
switches.
Hood road rash, both bumpers’ chips/scratches, left side fenders chips, right side fenders 
rust/chips, left rocker panel door sill paint off, left side doors chips, rear right door panel 
ripped, both rear door locks deactivated, no pop-up locks on rear doors, roof dents, 10 holes 
in roof sealed, tailgate chips/scratches/glue on spoiler, wheel wrench missing, no first aid 
kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat back hole, holes drilled in dash, holes 
drilled in rear cargo area, trim on inside B pillar modified, holes in head liner, missing trim in 
rear cargo area, both interior quarter trim modified, some trim on all seats loose or missing, 
missing center console, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

253,707 
km

$3,868 1GNSK2E05ER181047
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S $1,426.00 12-003 SUV 2008 Jeep Commander Sport 4WD 3.7L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 
power heated mirrors, power locks/windows/left front seat, 2 key fobs 5 passenger, driving 
lights, hitch, trailer wiring, green, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 198,026 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Left lower ball joint loose, outer tie rod boot missing cotter 
pins, front/rear rotors rusted out and pads, left inner tie rod boot not attached, front lower 
control arm bushing damaged, rockers rusted through, steering wheel not straight, rear 
differential vent broken, park brake does not hold, door switch doesn’t unlock, rear doors, 
both rear doors don’t open-locks jammed, brake rotors very rusty, minor leaks starting.
Hood dents/chips/scratches, front bumper chips/scratches, rear bumper chips/scratches/ 
missing 2 sensors, left front fender chips/road rash/rust, left rear fender road rash, right front 
fender chips/rust/road rash, right rear fender road rash, both dog legs road rash/rusted, both 
rocker panels rusted/large holes, left front door road rash, left rear door road rash/molding 
loose, right side doors road rash/chips, roof rusted, roof rails weathered, tailgate scratches, 
no OEM spare, full size tire and rim loose in rear may not be compatible with vehicle, no first 
aid kit/fire extinguishers, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, 
where is

198,026 
km

$755 1J8HG48K08C225162
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S $6,473.00 12-005 Truck 2009 CHEVROLET Silverado 2500 HD 4WD, extended cab, 8' box 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, 
tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/locks/windows, 2 keys front tow hooks, mud 
flaps, side steps, hitch with pintle insert, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, Brand FX slide-in, 
ladder rack with beacon, no back seat, white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 196,518 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Rear brake rotors excessively rusty, left low beam headlight 
out, both headlight lens fogged, both front fenders have rust holes, rear seats and seat belts 
missing.
Grille broke, front bumper rust, left front fender badly rusted, left rear fender rusted, right 
front fender badly rusted, right rear fender rusted, left side doors scratches/rusted, right rear 
door rusted, roof rust spots, one hole in roof sealed, jack missing, no first aid kit/fire 
extinguisher, windshield chips, left mirror housing broke, left front seat worn/ripped/ sagging, 
tire low pressure light on, both headlights fogged, holes drilled and bolts cut in rear seat area, 
one hanger for rear seat cut off, Brand FX slide-in roll out does not work, rear door gasket 
hanging, rusted at rear door, holes drilled in dash, no back seat or belts, poor battery, minor 
exterior damage.>, As is, where is

196,518 
km

$6,473 1GCHK49K79E134643

S $4,990.00 12-004 Truck 2017 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 4WD, crew cab, 6'6" box 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, 
cruise, AM/FM, power mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry-2 fobs, 2 keys, 1 toolbox key 
Brute Gull Wing toolbox 1 key-dented, mud flaps, side steps, front tow hooks, hitch, trailer 
wiring, OEM trailer brakes, box liner headache rack, beacon, wig wags on rack and grille, has a 
back seat, white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 346,987 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Left lower ball joint loose, left CV axle boot blown, service air bag light on.
Hood chips, front bumper road rash, rear bumper dents, left side fenders chips/road rash, 
right front fender chips, right rear fender road rash/rust, left side doors road rash, roof chips, 
tailgate chips/dents/scratches, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, seats are 
soiled, left front seat worn/sagging, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

346,987 
km

$4,989 1GCUKNEC3HF133839
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S $6,015.00 * 11-003 Truck 2018 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 4WD, crew cab, 6'7" box 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, 
cruise, AM/FM, power mirrors/locks/windows/left front seat, keyless entry-2 fobs, 2 keys side 
steps, front tow hooks, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, toolbox behind cab 
no key, has back seat, grey, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 308,303 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Front struts leak, rear shocks leaking, exhaust flex pipe separating, left upper ball joint, both 
plate bulbs non-operational, high mount bulb non-operational.
Front bumper bent/road rash, right front fender dents/scratches, right rear fender scratches/ 
road rash, right side doors scratches, roof badly dented, tailgate scratches/hard to open, no 
first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat worn/sagging, front valance 
loose, left A pillar dented/road rash, right side step bent, poor battery, minor exterior 
damage.>, As is, where is

308,303 
km

$5,295 3GCUKNEC7JG107040

S $2,676.60 12-016 Truck 2012 DODGE/RAM 1500 4WD, crew cab, 6'5" box 5.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 
AM/FM/CD player, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs, 1 
key grille inserts, front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, roof rack 
brackets-no cross bar, has a back seat, black, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 337,655 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Both front axles, left lower ball joint, left outer tie rod, rear sway bar bushing, right hub and 
bearings, alignment needed, 3rd brake light.
Hood chips/scratches/dents, front bumper rusted, rear bumper rusted/bent, left front fender 
scratches, right front fender scratches/chips, left rear fender scratches/rust, right rear fender 
rusted/scratches/road rash, both rocker panels road rash, left front door rust, right rear door 
rust, roof rusted, two holes in roof sealed, tailgate dents/scratches, no first aid kit/fire 
extinguishers, windshield chips, right mirror housing cracked/broke, left front seat 
worn/sagging, left front seat back worn, right cab corner rust, holes drilled in box rails, 
missing lower section of jump seat, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

337,655 
km

$2,516 1C6RD7KT3CS224679
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S $3,131.60 12-006 Truck 2014 DODGE/RAM 2500 4WD, crew cab, 6'5" box 5.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 
Am/FM, power windows/locks/mirrors, keyless entry-2 key fobs tow hooks, grille inserts, mud 
flaps, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, “Buyers” Gullwing toolbox-no keys, 
spare tire on truck, has back seat, red, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 268,464 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Cannot start vehicle to check items on list, all four ball joints, rear tires, rear windows 
inoperable, no road test, oil over filled, windshield cracked, washers leaking.
Engine seized, failed timing chain caused seized engine, grille loose, hood chips/ 
scratches/dents, front bumper rust/bent, rear bumper dents/bent, all fenders chips/ 
scratches/road rash, rocker panels road rash, all doors chips/scratches, roof 
dents/chips/scratches, tailgate scratches/chips, a rim and tire in box unknown condition (tire 
not on rim loose in box), wheel wrench/jack loose in toolbox, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, 
windshield cracked, right mirror housing broke, interior badly soiled, poor battery, minor 
exterior damage.>, As is, where is

268,464 
km

$1,480 3C6TR5CT5EG202283

S $4,688.88 * 11-013 Truck 2013 DODGE/RAM 1500 SLT 4WD, quad cab, 6'3" box 4.8L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 
AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows/left front seat, keyless entry-2 key fobs, 
1 key for toolbox front tow hooks, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, 
Challenger Gull wing toolbox-lid does not stay open, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 219,390 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Both lower ball joints, rear links, left front hubs, front fenders.
Hood paint peeling/chips, left side fenders badly rusted/chips, right side fenders rusted, both 
rocker panels rusted, left side doors chips/dents, tailgate will not open/rusted/dented, wheel 
wrench/jack loose under back seat, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left 
front seat worn/ripped, left side step in box, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, 
where is

219,390 
km

$2,987 1C6RR7GP1DS558868
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S $18,550.00 12-007 Truck 2012 DODGE/RAM 5500 SLT 4WD, crew cab, service body 6.7L, inline 6, diesel auto A/C, 
tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated trailer tow mirrors, power windows/locks, 
keyless entry-2 fobs, 3 keys front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, pintle hook, trailer wiring, 
dual rear wheels, BrandX service body 6 compartments-2 beacons, 5 keys, 2 additional 
storage boxes attached to service body, Altec aerial device model AT237 condition unknown, 
has a back seat loose in cab, white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 220,567 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Engine light on Code P0101 mass air flow sensor A circuit P2 BAC-not exceedance deactivated 
EGR, all upper and lower ball joints loose in front end, rear seats and belts missing (rear seat is 
loose in cab needs to be mounted)-condition unknown.
Grille broken, hood dents/chips/small rust spots, front bumper rust, both rocker panels 
rusted, left front door rust spots, left rear door rust spots/rust at bottom, left door sill 
worn/rusted, right rear door small rust spots, roof rust spots/dents, no wheel 
wrench/jack/first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior 
damage.>, As is, where is

220,567 
km

$12,388 3C7WDNEL4CG174686

S $7,890.12 12-017 Truck 2015 FORD F150 4WD, supercrew, 5'7" box 3.5L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 
AM/FM/CD player, fog lights, power locks/windows/mirrors, keyless entry-2 key fobs, keypad 
on left front door side steps, mud flaps, front tow hooks, hitch, trailer wiring, box liner, has 
back seat, red, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 288,810 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Rear rotors, passenger window does not roll down.
Grille left side broken(hole)/chrome peeling, hood chips/scratches, left side fenders 
scratches/road rash/dents, right side scratches/road rash, left side doors dents/scratches, 
roof dents/chips, tailgate scratches/chips/dents, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield 
chips, front seats soiled, left front seat sagging, both cab corners scratches, poor battery, 
minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

288,810 
km

$5,189 1FTEW1E87FFB49682
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S No Bid * 10-026 Truck 2019 FORD F150  4WD, supercrew, 6'5" box 5.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, 
power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-1 key fob, 1 key for topper front 
tow hooks, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, ARE topper, has a back seat, 
white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 420,852 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Drive belt, left inner tie rod, left outer tie rod, front and rear pads/rotors, alignment needed, 
windshield, missing mud flaps, wiper blades, washer switch, plate light.
Transmission chatters and surges, mobile for short trips, diagnosed with internal transmission 
issues, need replacement transmission, grille broken, hood chips/road rash, rear bumper 
dented, left side fenders road rash, right rear fender road rash, right front door chips, tailgate 
corner bent, unknown if wheel wrench is under the back seat, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, 
windshield cracked, left mirror housing broken, topper tailgate or lock non operational, poor 
battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

420,852 
km

$5,995 1FTFW1E5XKKE71275

S $7,230.00 * 9-019 Truck 2017 FORD F250 SD 4WD, crew cab, 6'10" box 6.2L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 
aftermarket AM/FM radio, power heated trailer tow mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless 
entry-2 key fobs front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer 
brake, box liner, headache rack, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 334,118 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Exhaust manifold, front shocks, left outer tie rod, alignment needed, rear brake line not 
secured.
Grille holes drilled, hood dents/stone chips, front bumper chips, rear bumper rusted/holes 
drilled, left front fender chips, left rear fender scratch, right rear fender small dents, left front 
door dents, tailgate chips/small dents, no first aid kit/fire extinguishers, windshield chips, left 
front seat sagging, holes drilled in box rails, front valance broken, poor battery, minor exterior 
damage.>, As is, where is

334,118 
km

$4,986 1FT7W2B60HEE88021
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S $5,497.00 12-020 Truck 2017 FORD F250 Super Duty 4WD, crew cab, 6'10" box 6.2L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, 
cruise, AM/FM, power heated trailer tow mirrors, keyless entry-1 key fob front tow hooks, 
mud flaps, side steps/right side step in box, box liner, has a back seat, grey, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 192,979 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Check engine lights on codes: P0430/ P068A/ P06E9, TPMS 
light on, left and right upper ball joints loose, right lower and upper ball joints loose, exhaust 
manifold, exhaust hanger broken in rear, exhaust not secure, Drag link loose, left outer tie rod 
and right outer loose, windshield cracked, rear tailgate damaged /does not open, front 
bumper damaged, right mirror damaged, right taillight damaged, plate lamp inoperative, no 
spare tire, left front door damaged, note: CEL on, left running board removed, missing left 
front and rear door lock buttons.

192,979 
km

$3,915 1FT7W2B69HEE88034

S $25,821.11 12-008 Truck 2012 FORD F550 RWD, extended cab, service body 6.8L, V10, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 
AM/FM/CD player, 2 keys, 1 other key Warwick (telelift) aerial device and ladder rack with 
beacon, FX brand service body-6 compartments, power inverter, HD rear bumper with pintle 
hook, trailer wring, OEM trailer brakes, dual rear wheels, generator, batteries, back seat loose 
in cab, white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 68,146 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 1 
clearance light out, battery will not hold a charge.
Hood hail(dents)/scratches, front bumper pitted, holes drilled in both rear doors inside 
panels, roof dents, wheel wrench/jack loose in cab, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, 
windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

68,146 km $25,816 1FD0X5HY7CEB01610

3/12/2026,10:55 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  9
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*MT *MT 12-019 Truck 2008 GMC Sierra 3500 4WD, crew cab, 8' box 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 
AM/FM/CD player, power locks, 2 keys aftermarket goose neck hitch, front two hooks, grille 
inserts, mud flaps, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, headache rack, box liner, has back seat, red, 
TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 209,591 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Power steering pump leaking, both sides exhaust manifold gasket leaking, park brake 
assembly not releasing, front and rear wheel alignment, clunk front, left front axle seal, gasket 
at rear of transmission, right side high mount stop lamp is out.
Grille chrome peeling, hood chips/scratches/dents, rear bumper dents/pad screwed down, 
left side fenders road rash/scratches/dents, right front fender road rash/scratches, right rear 
fender road rash/dents/rust/scratches, both rocker panels paint worn on door sills/road rash, 
left side doors road rash/scratches/dent, right side doors rash/scratches/chips, roof 
chips/letter ghosts, one hole in roof sealed, tailgate chips/scratches/dents/guard broken, no 

209,591 
km

$3,958 1GTHK33K78F219350

S $6,477.00 12-018 Truck 2009 GMC Sierra 4WD, crew cab, 8' box 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, 
power locks, 2 keys left tow hook, missing right tow hook, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer 
wiring, electric trailer brake, headache rack, rails on side box, box liner, wheel flares, new seat 
covers on back seat, has back seat, grey, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 206,048 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Drive shaft steady bearing torn/needs to be replaced, noise from drive line, transfer case 
metal in fluid.
Needs transfer case noise, oil full of fillings, oil pan gasket, two rear side bearing cap bolts, 
reseat for engine oil leak, grille holes drilled, hood chips/dents/scratches, both bumpers’ 
dents, left front fender chips/dents, right side fenders chips/scratches/dents, left side doors 
chips/scratches/dents, right side doors scratches/chips, roof scratches, one hole in roof 
sealed, tailgate chips/scratches/dents, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor 
battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

206,048 
km

$3,987 1GTHK73K69F160879

3/12/2026,10:55 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  10



SaskBuilds and Procurement
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Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

Bid Price Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

S $5,337.00 12-009 Truck 2016 GMC Sierra 1500 4WD, crew cab, 6'5" box 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 
AM/FM, power mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry-2 fobs, 2 keys, 1 tonneau key front tow 
hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, Roll-N-Lock tonneau 
cover, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 249,000 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Both front hub and bearings, alignment needed, plate light, 
windshield, rocker panels.
Left front fender dent/scratch, both rocker panels rust, left front door rust, right front door 
rust, right rear door chips/paint poor/peeling/rust, roof rusted, five holes sealed in roof, 
tailgate will not open, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front mirror glass 
chipped, dome light trim missing, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

249,000 
km

$822 3GTU2LEC1GG192566

S $11,758.00 12-010 Truck 2008 GMC Sierra 2500 HD 4WD, extended cab, utility body 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, 
cruise, AM/FM, power locks, remote start-keyless entry-1 fob/control, 2 keys front tow hooks, 
side steps, HD rear bumper, pintle hook, trailer wiring, mud flaps, Brand FX utility body 6 
compartments, 2 additional boxes on top no keys, no back seat, white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 141,102 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Engine light on, pitman arm loose, both headlight lens cloudy, rear seats and seat belts 
missing.
Hood chips/paint poor, front bumper rust/scratches/cover dented/scratches, right front 
fender rust, left side doors road rash/dents, right side doors chips, roof chips/rust spots, hole 
in roof 2 sealed, 1 spare in holder, another spare loose in box may not be compatible with 
vehicle, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, head lights foggy, holes drilled in 
dash, poor battery, minor exterior damage>, As is, where is

141,102 
km

$10,737 1GTHK29K78E209974

3/12/2026,10:55 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  11
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SaskSurplus Sale #12
From Mar 04 to Mar 11, 2026

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

Bid Price Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

S $4,708.00 12-011 Van 2012 CHEVROLET Express 1500 Cargo AWD 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 
player, rear heat, power locks/windows, keyless entry-1 fob, 3 keys hitch, trailer wiring, 
electric trailer brake, computer stand, map box-no keys, ladder rack, cargo barrier, shelving, 
wood floor, “Electron” metal rack(boxed), white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 177,382 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Left front CV axle inner boot torn, right front CV axle outer 
boot torn, front brake pads at 2mm, front rotors rusty, battery will not hold a charge, left low 
beam light out, windshield cracked, rust hole in right rear door, left rear corner molding 
broken.
Hood paint poor, front bumper pitted/scratched, rear bumper rusted/dents/cover loose, left 
front fender paint poor, left rear fender rusted/chips/dents, right front fender scratch, right 
rear fender rust, right dog leg rusted/dents, both rocker panels rusted, right side doors 
rusted/chips, roof small rust spots, tailgate rusted/hole in rear right/chips, no first aid kit/fire 
extinguisher, windshield cracked, left front seat worn sagging, left quarter panel molding 
broke, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

177,382 
km

$2,708 1GCSHAF41C1130272

S $4,708.00 12-012 Van 2012 CHEVROLET Express 1500 Cargo AWD 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 
player, rear heat, power locks/windows, 1 key map box, computer stand, cargo barrier, 
shelves, ladder rack with beacon, step attachment to hitch, plywood floor with carpet, mud 
flaps, , white, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 187,112 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Right upper ball joint loose, parking brake not working, left 
headlight not working, battery will not hold a charge, left side rocker panel rusted through, 
driver door catching/binding, driver seat torn.
Grille broke, hood chips/paint flaking, front bumper road rash, rear bumper rusted, left side 
fenders rust/scratches, right rear fender rusted, right dog leg rusted, both rocker panels 
rusted, left front door binding, right front door paint flaking, roof chips/rust, tailgate paint 
flaking/rust/chips, wheel wrench/jack loose on shelf, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, 
windshield chips, left front seat badly worn, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, 
where is

187,112 
km

$2,688 1GCSHAF4XC1129217

3/12/2026,10:55 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  12
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S No Bid 12-013 Van 2012 CHEVROLET Express 3500 Cargo RWD 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 
player, power windows/locks, keyless entry-1 fob, 2 keys cargo barrier, computer stand, 
shelving, ladder for aerial device, converter, generator, HD rear bumper with pintle hook, 2 
generator battery compartments-may have batteries, Warwick ladder aerial device with 
beacons and ladder, ladder strapped to Warwick ladder, electric trailer brake, white, TOW 
ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 160,355 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Transmission leaks onto mounts, both front upper ball joints 
loose, rear brake rotors rusty, battery will not hold a charge, park brake not working, wiper 
blades, drive side mirror glass cracked.
Hood chips/dents/scratches, left front fender scratches/dents/paint poor, left rear fender 
road rash/ rust, right rear fender rusted/scratches, right dog leg rusted, both rocker panels 
rusted, left front door chips, tailgate chips/rust/left door binds on blot, spare tire missing, no 
first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left mirror glass cracked, left front seat 
holes/sagging, front valance broke, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

160,355 
km

$10,193 1GCZGTCG6C1129789

S $1,556.00 12-014 Van 2009 DODGE Grand Caravan SE FWD 3.3L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 
player, rear HVAC, power mirrors/locks/front windows, keyless entry-3 key fobs 5 passenger, 
Stow-N-Go 3rd row only, blue, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 170,256 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Front struts, rear pads/rotors, alignment needed, both rear 
fenders, left front fender, rocker panels.
Needs new recirc door in heater box and new blend door actuator in rear heater box, hood 
scratches/chips/dents, both bumpers’ chips/scratches, left side fenders rusted, right front 
fender rusted/missing molding, right rear fender rusted, both dog legs rusted, both rocker 
panels rusted, left side doors dents/scratches, tailgate scratches including glass, wheel 
wrench missing, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, trim broke on rear 3rd row 
seat, trim broke rear cargo area broken molding, gas filler door dose not close, holes in 
headliner, missing all rear HVAC vents/rear doom light, missing center seat, poor battery, 
minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

170,256 
km

$556 2D8HN44E79R641524

3/12/2026,10:55 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  13
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S $2,522.00 12-015 Van 2013 DODGE Grand Caravan SE FWD 3.6L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 
player, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows/rear vent windows, keyless entry-2 key 
fobs 3rd row seat Stow-N-Go only, 7 passenger, silver, TOW ONLY – 
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical 
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 140,783 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Both front hubs-bearings noise, front pads/rotors, alignment 
needed, windshield, rear wiper blade, floor, rocker panels.
Hood paint peeling, both bumpers’ chips/scratches, left side fenders rusted, right rear fender 
rusted/scratches, left dog leg rusted, left side doors rust at bottom, right front door 
chip/dent, roof dents, tailgate rusted, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield large stone 
bruise, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

140,783 
km

$961 2C4RDGBG4DR634132

3/12/2026,10:55 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  14
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REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca

S $8.00 12-101 Tie Down Strap,   Erickson Ratcheting, metal hooks, 2"w x 27' long, yellow, maximum load 
10,000 lbs., maximum working load 3,300 lbs., stained.  Fair

$5

S No Bid 12-102 Tire,   225/65R17, Goodyear Nordic Winter, Snowflake Manufacture date, week 36, year 2019.  
Good

$25

S $387.00 12-103 Tires, Set of 5  265/65R18, Michelin Primacy LTX, Mud And Snow  Manufacture date, week 23, 
year 2025.  Excellent

$275

*MT *MT 12-104 Tow Strap,   Grip brand 2"w x 20' long, green, maximum weight 10,000 lbs.  Good $5

S $50.00 * 9-113 Desk,   L-shape, wood Light brown, 5 drawers with lock and 2 keys, adjustable feet, comes 
with hardware, main 66.5"w x 35.5" d x 29.5" h, return side 43.5"w x 20.5"d x 28" h, comes 
with monitor riser with pull-out tray, some scratches and water damage, missing one 
adjustable foot.  Fair

$1

S $50.00 * 9-114 Desk,   L-shape, wood Light brown, 5 drawers with lock and 2 keys, adjustable feet, no 
hardware, main 66.5"w x 35.5" d x 29.5" h, return side 43.5"w x 20.5"d x 28" h, comes with 
monitor riser with pull-out tray, some scratches and water damage.  Fair

$1

S $11.00 * 9-115 Desk,   U-shape, wood Dark brown, 1 drawer, adjustable feet, has hardware, main 108" w x 
20" w, left return, 72.25" w x 32.5" d, right return 120" w x 20.5" w  x 29.5" h, some 
scratches, surface laminate lifting, back has cracked.  Fair

$1

3/12/2026,10:55 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  15
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HUMBOLDT, Agriculture, 2414 Westwood Dr

Contact Leona Messmer 306-682-6701, leona.messmer@gov.sk.ca or Terry Bauer 306-682-6708, terry.bauer@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid 12-517 Bulletin Board, Lot of 4  cork with metal edge trim 4' w x 1" d x 3' h.  Good $1

S No Bid 12-518 Bulletin Board,   cork with metal edge trim 4'w x 4'h.  Good $1

S No Bid 12-519 Chair,   leather Seatback, 21"w x 19" d x 30" h, adjustable height, 5 star base with castors.  
Fair

$1

S No Bid 12-520 Whiteboard,    4' w x 6'h.  Good $1

HUMBOLDT, Community Safety, Unit 2, 2420 Westwood Dr

Contact: Kyle Hanson 306-682-6729 or 306-513-8596, kyle.hanson@gov.sk.ca

S $2,020.00 12-552 Snowmobile 2001 Ski-Doo Touring 500  Rotax 500F, 2-stroke, gas  Heated visor plug, 136" 
track, electric start and reverse, handwarmers, 1 key Cargo rack and bag, 2-up seat, black, , 
8,563 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Starts and runs fine but after running for a period of time, 
will not start again after being shut off, pull start recoil cord will occasionally  stick and not 
retract, it has rarely been used in past 3 years.>, As is, where is

8,563 km $500 2BPS185231v000782

KINDERSLEY, Agriculture, Unit 1120 608 12th Ave E

Contact Anne Sim 306-460-5513, anne.sim@gov.sk.ca

S $5.00 12-514 Chair,    Blue, 5 castors, adjustable arms and adjustable height.  Good $1
S $10.00 12-515 File Cabinets, Lot of 2  metal, lateral 28"w x 18"d x 51"h, 4 drawer, light beige, lock and key.  

Good
$1

S $5.00 12-516 File Cabinets, Lot of 2  metal, lateral 36"w x 18"d x 41"h, 3 drawer, light beige, lock and key  
Good

$1

LA RONGE, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, Hangar 2 Athabasca Airways Rd

Contact Mike Towill 306-425-4585, mike.towill@gov.sk.ca or JD Faubert 306-425-4587, jeandenis.faubert@gov.sk.ca

S $125.00 * 11-560 Welder,   Syncrowave 351, Millerwelder AC/DC welding power source, works intermittently, 
problem unknown.  Fair

$100

MOOSE JAW, Agriculture, 45 Thatcher Dr. E

Contact Colby Elford 306-694-3938, colby.elford@gov.sk.ca

S $40.00 12-513 Projector,   2008 Benq MP612c Operational.  Good $1

3/12/2026,10:55 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  16
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NORTH BATTLEFORD, Agriculture, A131 1192 - 102 St

Contact Melissa Welford 306-446-7964, melissa.welford3@gov.sk.ca or Jenny Ruazol 306-446-7962, jenny.ruazol@gov.sk.ca

S $55.50 12-531 Chairs, Lot of 20   Stained, grey, cloth, chrome legs with black arm rests.  Fair $1
S $107.04 12-532 Table, Lot of 8   One has a loose leg, dusty rose with chrome legs, 54" w x 27" d x 29" h  Good $1

NORTH BATTLEFORD, Community Safety, 502 - 114th St

Contact: Robbie Gaetz 306-446-7419, robbie.gaetz@gov.sk.ca or Ryan Green 306-446-7428,  ryan.green@gov.sk.ca

S $2,447.00 12-553 ATV 2008 Arctic Cat 500 ATV 4X4 493cc, 4-stroke, single-cylinder, gas manual Hand warmers, 
1 key winch, ITP Mud Lite tires, green, , 1550 miles, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: ATV has sat in a 

1550 miles $1 4UF08ATV28T212908

OUTLOOK, Agriculture, 410 Saskatchewan Ave W

Contact Ben Lalonde 306-867-6469, ben.lalonde@gov.sk.ca or Outlook Front Desk 306-867-5500, stacey.stutters@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 11-509 GPS Base Radio,   Pacific Crest PDL 4335 GPS 430-450Mhz radio for GPS system, significant 
wear, unknown if still operational, stored in a cool dry place for many years, no cables 
included.  Poor

$5 8,091,658

S No Bid * 11-511 Leveling Rod,   1 set of 5m, aluminum, unknown brand, brown leather or vinyl case Total 
height 5m, set has 4 pieces that clip together, carrying case included case is blue nylon, case is 
brown leather or vinyl, rods have not been used for decades, stored in a cool dry place, 
noticeable wear present, calibration likely required.  Fair

$10

S No Bid * 11-512 Leveling Rod,   1 set of 5m, aluminum, unknown brand, brown leather or vinyl case Total 
height 5m, set has 4 pieces that clip together, carrying case included case is blue nylon, case is 
brown leather or vinyl, rods have not been used for decades, stored in a cool dry place, 
noticeable wear present, calibration likely required.  Fair

$10

S No Bid * 11-513 Surveying Tripod,   Duratech, wood, flat head Stored in a cool dry place, clamps are somewhat 
loose, one leg is partially detached from the hinge (needs a new screw), noticeable wear 
present, tightening and calibration likely required.  Fair

$20

S No Bid * 11-515 Surveying Tripod,   Leica, wood, telescoping antenna pole Stored in a cool dry place, clamps 
are somewhat loose, noticeable wear present, tightening and calibration likely required.  Fair

$30

OUTLOOK, Agriculture, 410 Saskatchewan Ave W

Contact Stacey Sutters, stacey.stutters@gov.sk.ca or Tammie Wood, tammie.wood@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid 12-533 Chairs, Lot of 7  metal, fabric Blue, grey, 11" w x 24" d x 31" h.  Fair $1

S No Bid 12-534 Chairs, Lot of 7  metal, fabric Brown, 22" w x 25" d x 31" h.  Fair $1

S No Bid 12-535 Chair,   metal, fabric Brown, 23" w x 24" d x 30" h.  Fair $1

S No Bid 12-536 Desk Hutch,   wood Pepperdust, 72"w x 18"d x 41"h.  Good $1

3/12/2026,10:55 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  17
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S $20.00 12-537 File Cabinets, Lot of 3  metal, lateral Tan, 3 drawers, 36" w x 18" d x 40" h, no keys  Good $1

S No Bid 12-538 File Cabinet,   metal, vertical Black, 4 drawers, 18" w x 26.5" d x  52" h, no key  Good $1

S No Bid 12-539 Shredder,   plastic Black, 15" w x 17.5" d x 28" h  Good $1

PRINCE ALBERT, Community Safety, 3021 1st Ave W

Contact Tonya Granberg , tonya.granberg@gov.sk.ca or Nola Boechler, nola.boechler@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 11-507 Cups, Lot of 12  ceramic White.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 11-508 Napkin Holders, Lot of 9   Stainless steel.  Poor $1

PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, Hwy. 2 N. Nisbet Depot

Contact Kevin Frey 306-953-3423, kevin.frey2@gov.sk.ca or Scott Ackerman 306-953-3422, scott.ackerman@gov.sk.ca

S $59.59 12-501 Air Compressor,   CH Campbell Hausfeld - WL 650903AJ CH - 150psi, 22 gal - oil-free , 
operational, has a leak and not maintaining pressure.  Broken Repairable

$10

S $257.00 12-502 Gas Welder,   Oxy-acetylene torch 1 oxygen and 1 acetylene cylinder, hoses and torch on hand-
truck, was operational when last used, has not been used in 10-15 years.  Fair

$100

S $210.00 12-503 Insulation, Lot of 4  Johns Manville Batt and roll in packaging, fiberglass R20- 6"x15"x47".  
New- Unused

$100

S $50.00 12-504 Pressure Washer,   STIHL - RE 129 - PLUS  Operational but leaking.  Broken Repairable $10

REGINA, Agriculture, 125 - 3085 Albert St

Contact Keira Derkson 306-787-9719, keira.derkson2@gov.sk.ca or Tammie Wood, 306-787-8034, tammie.wood@gov.sk.ca

S $33.33 12-521 File Cabinet,   metal, lateral  Tan, 3 drawer, 36" w x 18" d x 39.25" h, no keys
 Good

$1

S $33.33 12-522 File Cabinet,   metal, lateral  Tan, 3 drawer, 36" w x 18" d x 40.5" h, no keys Good $1

S $33.33 12-523 File Cabinet,   metal, lateral  Tan, 3 drawer, 36" w x 19.3" d x 41" h, no keys Good $1

S $33.33 12-524 File Cabinet,   metal, lateral  Tan, 4 drawer, 18" w x 28" d x 51" h, no keys Good $1

S $33.33 12-525 File Cabinet,   metal, lateral  Tan, 4 drawer, 36" w x 18" d x 52.3" h, no keys Good $1

S $33.33 12-526 File Cabinet,   metal, lateral  Tan, 4 drawer, 36" w x 18" d, 51.2" h, no keys Good $1
S No Bid 12-527 File Cabinet,   metal, vertical  Black, 4 drawer, 18" w x 28" d x 51" h, no keys

 Good
$1
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S No Bid 12-528 File Cabinet,   metal, vertical  Tan, 4 drawer, 18" w x 28" d x 51" h, no keys Good $1

S No Bid 12-529 File Cabinet,   metal, vertical  Tan, 4 drawer, 18" w x 28" d x 51" h, no keys Good $1

S $62.99 12-530 File Cabinet,   metal, vertical  Tan, 4 drawer, 18.3" w x 28.5" d x 52" h, no keys Good $1

REGINA, Agriculture, 226 - 3085 Albert St

Contact Avishek Paul 306-787-5130, avishek.paul@gov.sk.ca

S $30.00 12-505 Printer Cartridge,    53A, Q7553A, HP LaserJet M2727 mfp . P2014. P2015.  New- Unused $1

S $101.00 12-506 Printer Cartridge, Lot of 4   78A, black, CE278A, HP LaserJet Pro P1566, P1606.  New- Unused $1

S $30.00 12-507 Printer Toner,    Toshiba, T-FC34U-C, cyan, e-STUDIO287CS/287CSL/347CS/347CSL/407CS.  
New- Unused

$1

S $35.00 12-508 Printer Toner, Lot of 2   Toshiba, T-FC34U-K, black, e-
STUDIO287CS/287CSL/347CS/347CSL/407CS.  New- Unused

$1

S $30.00 12-509 Printer Toner,    Toshiba, T-FC34U-M, magenta violet, e-
STUDIO287CS/287CSL/347CS/347CSL/407CS.  New- Unused

$1

S $30.00 12-510 Printer Toner,    Toshiba, T-FC34U-Y, yellow, e- STUDIO287CS/287CSL/347CS/347CSL/407CS.  
New- Unused

$1

REGINA, Health, 3475 Albert St

Contact: Steve Fairbairn 306-530-7703, steve.fairbairn@health.gov.sk.ca or Vicki Buchanan 306-787-8308, vicki.buchanan@health.gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 11-546 Truck-Mount Cold Fogger,   2003 Maxi Pro 145  Ultra-low volume aerosol generator designed 
for mosquito and fly control applications, 18 HP Briggs & Stratton gasoline engine with electric 
start, single Dyna-Fog Multi-Mist nozzle, engineered to produce 90% of droplets below 20 
microns, output control available with a gear pump or FMI piston pumping system, 
constructed with welded steel and powder-coat finishes for corrosion resistance. Unit has 
been flushed with isopropyl alcohol and washed after each use but the tanks that hold the 
pesticide cannot be cleaned.
**Please see the attached Deltagard SC Insecticide PDF below for handling instructions and 
proper Personal protective equipment (PPE) requirements. The successful bidder must sign a 
disclaimer attached below in acknowledgement of the potential hazards, and PPE 
requirements before payment will be accepted. *Online viewing only - serious inquires may 
request an appointment for viewing on-site Excellent

$2,000 293
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S No Bid * 11-547 Truck-Mount Cold Fogger,   2003 Maxi Pro 145  Ultra-low volume aerosol generator designed 
for mosquito and fly control applications, 18 HP Briggs & Stratton gasoline engine with electric 
start, single Dyna-Fog Multi-Mist nozzle, engineered to produce 90% of droplets below 20 
microns, output control available with a gear pump or FMI piston pumping system, 
constructed with welded steel and powder-coat finishes for corrosion resistance. Unit has 
been flushed with isopropyl alcohol and washed after each use but the tanks that hold the 
pesticide cannot be cleaned.
**Please see the attached Deltagard SC Insecticide PDF below for handling instructions and 
proper Personal protective equipment (PPE) requirements. The successful bidder must sign a 
disclaimer attached below in acknowledgement of the potential hazards, and PPE 
requirements before payment will be accepted. *Online viewing only - serious inquires may 
request an appointment for viewing on-site Excellent

$2,000 292

S No Bid * 11-548 Truck-Mount Cold Fogger,   2003 Maxi Pro 145  Ultra-low volume aerosol generator designed 
for mosquito and fly control applications, 18 HP Briggs & Stratton gasoline engine with electric 
start, single Dyna-Fog Multi-Mist nozzle, engineered to produce 90% of droplets below 20 
microns, output control available with a gear pump or FMI piston pumping system, 
constructed with welded steel and powder-coat finishes for corrosion resistance. Unit has 
been flushed with isopropyl alcohol and washed after each use but the tanks that hold the 
pesticide cannot be cleaned.
**Please see the attached Deltagard SC Insecticide PDF below for handling instructions and 
proper Personal protective equipment (PPE) requirements. The successful bidder must sign a 
disclaimer attached below in acknowledgement of the potential hazards, and PPE 
requirements before payment will be accepted. *Online viewing only - serious inquires may 
request an appointment for viewing on-site Excellent

$2,000 295

S No Bid * 11-549 Truck-Mount Cold Fogger,   2003 Maxi Pro 145  Ultra-low volume aerosol generator designed 
for mosquito and fly control applications, 18 HP Briggs & Stratton gasoline engine with electric 
start, single Dyna-Fog Multi-Mist nozzle, engineered to produce 90% of droplets below 20 
microns, output control available with a gear pump or FMI piston pumping system, 
constructed with welded steel and powder-coat finishes for corrosion resistance. Unit has 
been flushed with isopropyl alcohol and washed after each use but the tanks that hold the 
pesticide cannot be cleaned.
**Please see the attached Deltagard SC Insecticide PDF below for handling instructions and 
proper Personal protective equipment (PPE) requirements. The successful bidder must sign a 
disclaimer attached below in acknowledgement of the potential hazards, and PPE 
requirements before payment will be accepted. *Online viewing only - serious inquires may 
request an appointment for viewing on-site Excellent

$2,000 294
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S No Bid * 11-550 Truck-Mount Cold Fogger,   2003 Maxi Pro 145 Ultra-low volume aerosol generator designed 
for mosquito and fly control applications, 18 HP Briggs & Stratton gasoline engine with electric 
start, single Dyna-Fog Multi-Mist nozzle, engineered to produce 90% of droplets below 20 
microns, output control available with a gear pump or FMI piston pumping system, 
constructed with welded steel and powder-coat finishes for corrosion resistance. Unit has 
been flushed with isopropyl alcohol and washed after each use but the tanks that hold the 
pesticide cannot be cleaned.
**Please see the attached Deltagard SC Insecticide PDF below for handling instructions and 
proper Personal protective equipment (PPE) requirements. The successful bidder must sign a 
disclaimer attached below in acknowledgement of the potential hazards, and PPE 
requirements before payment will be accepted. *Online viewing only - serious inquires may 
request an appointment for viewing on-site Excellent

$2,000 296

REGINA, Legislative Assembly Service, 515 Henderson Drive

Contact: Karen Plumb 306-787-8167, kplumb@legassembly.sk.ca

S No Bid * 8-501 Uninterruptable Power Supply with Batteries and Power Modules, Lot of 11  APC Symmetra  1 
APC Symmetra LX UPS, SYAF16KRMT, 7 APC Symmetra LX Battery Module, SYBT5, 2 APC 
Symmetra LX Power Module, SYPM4KP, 1 APC Symmetra LX Power Module, SYPM4KPQ. UPS: 
19”w x 27”d x 33”h, (shipping 42 x 24 x 40) 500lbs, each battery is 18 kg, 4 batteries in box, 3 
loose, unknown what condition batteries are in, no power cord as it has to be direct wired 
into building power. Sold as is. UPS: QD1037260148, in-box batteries: 5D2007T60139, 
5D2018T65313, 5D2018T65320, 5D2007T60123, loose batteries: 5D2005T15219, 
5D2007T60147, 5D2007T60138, SYPM4KP, power modules: QD1513380215, AD2033110087, 
SYPM4KPQ power module: AQ2106210005, operational.  Fair

$1,000

REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 1702 Park St

Contact Shola Babarinde 306-787-5864, sbabarinde@slga.com or Tyrone Smith 306-787-1934, tsmith1@slga.com

S $15.01 * 11-533 Cabinet ,   wood, lateral Brown, 2 drawers, few scratches, 20" w x 36" l x 29" h.
  Fair

$15

S No Bid * 11-534 Cabinet ,   wood, lateral Brown, few scratches with tape residue, 20" w x 37" d x 29" h.
  Fair

$15

S $47.00 * 11-536 Desk,   wood, lateral Brown, few scratches, 21.5" w x 72" d x 30" h  Fair $25

S $47.00 * 11-537 Desk,   wood, lateral Brown, few scratches, 36" w x 72" d x 30 h.  Fair $25

S $12.00 * 11-540 File Cabinet,   wood, lateral Brown, 3 drawers with keys, 20" w x 30" d x 44" h  Good $10
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SASKATOON, Innovation Saskatchewan, 1 North Access Road

Contact: Kyla Ledingham 306-370-4068, kyla.ledingham@innovationsask.ca

S $3,500.00 12-551 Front Mount Tractor 2005 John Deere 1420 4x2 878cc, 3 cylinder, gas Hydrostatic heat and 
a/c, 4 counterweights included, 1 key gard cab, PTO (Power Take-Off), no attachments 
included, tire size front 23x10.5-12 and rear 18x8.5-8, GVW 816.5 kg without mower deck, 
green, , 3,245.2 hrs, Known Recent Repairs: Oil changes were done at 200 hours, greasing is 
done monthly, PTO switch was replaced August 30th, 2024, engine was rebuilt in 2019, new 
air filter cap and new gaskets and hardware were installed on September 9th, 2024, , As is, 
where is

3,245.2 hrs $2,600 TC1420G050098

S $5,557.00 12-550 UTV 2013 John Deere HPX 4x4 617cc, V-twin, gas CVT 1 key enclosed cab, 2 inch ball hitch , 
GVW 1,383 kg, tire size front: 24X9.5-10 rear: 24X10.5, green, , 3,286.7 hrs, Known Recent 
Repairs: Oil changes done between 100 and 200 hours, transaxle oil changed roughly every 
800 hours, KNOWN PROBLEMS: windshield wiper motor is damaged and does not work, poor 
battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

3,286.7 hrs $3,000 1M0HPXGSADM110552

SASKATOON, SaskBuilds and Procurement, Hangar 17 Wayne Hicks Lane

Contact Eric Braaten 306-491-8565, eric.braaten2@gov.sk.ca or Tim Sawatzky 306-385-2164, tim.sawatzky@gov.sk.ca

S $26.88 12-540 Inspection Scope,   VideoStik, VSXX-10WW Video based, flexible, picture quality is poor, 
operational.  Fair

$1

S $55.00 12-541 Shelving, Lot of 35  metal 27 - 15" x 36" shelves, 8 - 78" vertical supports, two supports have 
diagonal bracing.  Fair

$1

S $12.00 12-542 Shelving, Lot of 5  metal 5- 15" x 36" shelves, no vertical  supports.  Fair $1

S $21.50 12-543 Shelving, Lot of 13  metal 7 - 24" x 36" shelves, 2 - 78" vertical supports (minor bends at the 
top), 4 - 48" vertical supports, all pieces are in good condition.  Fair

$1

S $1.00 12-544 Television, Lot of 2  2011 Insignia 32-inch LCD/LED Both are operational, no remote controls.  
Fair

$1 J168AJA039541 & J1689JA034529

S $360.00 12-545 Work Seat,   EIDOS, metal Has wheels, backrest and seat height are adjustable,  operational, 
has not been used in years.  Fair

$1
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SASKATOON, Saskatchewan Research Council, 143 - 11 Research Dr

Contact Roger Dauvin 306-385-4035, roger.dauvin@src.sk.ca

S $500.00 12-511 Cleanroom,   Vention Enclosure with a Guardian air home electric air purification system, plug-
in, operational, will be disassembled with instructions for reassembly.  Good

$1

S $557.00 12-512 Safety Cabinet,   Forma Scientific Class II A/B3 biological, plug-in, operational, it will need a 
HEPA filter.  Good

$1

SASKATOON, Western Canada Lottery Corp , 1914 1st Ave N

Contact: David Tutka 306-933-6926 or 306-230-0905, tutkad@sk-wclc.com

S $6,789.10 12-554 Van 2021 Dodge Promaster City ST RWD 2.4 L, inline 4, gas 9 speed auto air, tilt, cruise 
control, power windows and locks, remote start, 2 sets of keys GWV 2,447 kg, wheel base 
3109mm, tire size P215/55R16 4 ply, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection.  It is unknown if 
any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. 
Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 238,266 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: 
front axle and wheel bearing seized, not drivable,  poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As 
is, where is

238,266 
km

$1 ZFBHRFCB1M6S89663

TISDALE, Agriculture, 1105 99th St

Contact Teresa Casavant 306-878-8842, teres.casavant@gov.sk.ca or Kacey Palidwar 306-878-8843, kacey.palidwar@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid 12-546 Hand Sprayer,   Green Turf-Care, metal, plastic Operational.  Good $1

S $1.00 12-547 Hand Sprayer,   Premier Pro, metal, plastic White and blue, operational.  Good $1

S $167.20 12-548 Post Hole Auger,   Briggs & Stratton, metal 2-man, 206cc 5HP, gas powered, operational.  Fair $1

S $11.02 12-549 Powered Forage Probe,   metal Gas powered, operational.  Good $1
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