SaskBuilds and Procurement

SaskSurplus Sale #11
From Feb 04 to Feb 11, 2026
Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time

Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Goveror;ment SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
A Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1
SALE SUMMARY LIST

Fax: 306-787-2092

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as
described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding.

Vehicles and equipment are sold “AS IS, WHERE IS”, there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.

- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.
It is the Bidder’s responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.
Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.
Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,

- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3300,

- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or

- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.

WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.
No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.
Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

2/12/2026,3:33 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #11
From Feb 04 to Feb 11, 2026
Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time

Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
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Item #

Description

Kms

Min Price

Serial Number

REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca

2,688.88

11-010

Car 2008 CHEVROLET Impala FWD 3.5L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player,
power mirrors/locks/windows/left front seat, power trunk release, keyless entry-2 fobs, 2
keys , grey, TOW ONLY —

This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 205,507 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:
Right CV joint, LESA front control arm bushing, alignment needed, foggy head lamps, rockers.
Hood dented/road rash/scratches, front bumper cracked, rear bumper scratches, left front
fender scratches/road rash, left rear fender chips, right front fender road rash, right rear
fender dent, both rocker panels rust/road rash, left side doors rust/dents/scratches/road
rash, right rear door missing trim piece, tailgate rust/scratches, no first aid kit/fire
extinguisher, windshield chips, left head light fogged, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>,
As is, where is

205,507

$1,961 2G1WB58K581359442

501.00

11-011

Car 2008 CHEVROLET Impala LS FWD 3.5L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player,

This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any
required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 321,391 km, ,
KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Front sway bar broken, both lower ball joints, TPMS
light on, rear pads/rotors, park brake not fully releasing, left fronts signal bulb, wiper blades,
headlight assembly foggy, right front door binds on fender, both rocker panels rusted out.
Hood chips/scratches, both bumpers’ chips/scratches, left front fender rust/chips/ scratches,
right front fender chips, right rear fender rusted, both rocker panels rusted out, left side
doors rust, right front door rust/binds/chips, right rear door rust, tailgate rust/scratches, no
first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat sagging, head lights fogged,
missing left rear wheel cover, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

321,391
power mirrors/locks/windows/left front seat, keyless entry 2 fobs, 2 keys , grey, TOW ONLY — km

$387 2G1WB58K681358168

2/12/2026,3:33 PM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.



SaskBuilds and Procurement SaskSurplus Sale #11

Govero':me”t SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From Feb 04 to Feb 11, 2026
A Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092
Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
1,100.00 11-014 Car 2011 DODGE Avenger SXT FWD 2.4L, inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 267,681 $654 1B3BD4FB5BN507433
power mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry 2 fobs , white, TOW ONLY — km
This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any
required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 267,681 km, ,
KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Front and rear pads/rotors, both wiper blades,
foggy head lamps, rocker panels, both visor clips.
Hood chips/hail/scratches, front bumper chips, left front fender scratches, right rear fender
rust, both dog legs rusted, both rocker panels rusted, all doors rust/road rash, roof paint
faded/rust/hail, trunk lid hail/rust, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips,
headlights faded, visor clips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is
1,510.00 * 10-022 SUV 2014 CHEVROLET Equinox LS 4WD 2.4L, inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power 294,939 $1,258 2GNFLEEK8E6234000

mirrors/locks/windows/left front seat, keyless entry-2 key fobs 5 passenger, grey, TOW ONLY km
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is

sold in “As is, where is” condition., 294,939 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:

Drive belt, radiator support mounts missing, alignment needed.

Hood chips/dents, both bumpers’ chips/scratches, left side fender road rash, right rear fender
rust, all door rust inside bottom, right front door window trim dents, roof scratches, tailgate
rust/glass scratched, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, headlights fogged,

poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

2/12/2026,3:33 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 3
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Item #

Description Kms
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3,088.88

11-009

SUV 2014 CHEVROLET Equinox LS AWD 2.4L, inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power 265,777
mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs , grey, TOW ONLY — km
This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is

sold in “As is, where is” condition., 265,777 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:
Exhaust manifold, exhaust leak, front links, alignment needed, front fenders.

Hood chips/scratches/dents, both bumpers’ chips/scratches/hitch cover loose, left front

fender rust, left rear fender road rash/over spray, right side fenders road rash/rust/chips, left
front door chips, left rear door chips/scratches/rust, right front door dents/chips/ scratches,

right rear door chips/scratches, roof chips/scratches, tailgate rust/paint poor/glass scratched,

no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As

is, where is

$1,689 2GNFLEEK7E6235204

1,800.00

11-001

SUV 2015 CHEVROLET Equinox LS AWD 2.4L, inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power 261,022
mirrors/locks/windows/left front seat, keyless entry-2 key fobs 5 passenger, white, TOW km
ONLY -

This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by

the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any
required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 261,022 km, ,

KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Front lower arm bushing torn/damaged, right lower

ball joint boot torn apart, E-brake pedal missing cover, both rocker panels rust holes/ rear

right.

Grille broke, hood chips, both bumpers’ chips/scratches, left front fender rust/chips, right

side fenders road rash, both rocker panels rusted, right side doors road rash, roof dents,

tailgate rusted/glass scratched, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, scratches

right roof rail above doors, washer fluid cap missing, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>,

As is, where is

$848 2GNFLEEKOF6318278

2/12/2026,3:33 PM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 4
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&F SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From Feb 04 to Feb 11, 2026
A saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

Government

Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

5,995.00 11-008 SUV 2014 CHEVROLET Tahoe LTZ 4WD 5.3L, V8, gas auto Front and rear AC/heat, tilt, cruise, 283,559 $5,156 1GNSK2EQ7ER183365
AM/FM/CD player, power front seats/windows/locks, keyless entry-1 fob, 1 key front tow km
hooks, grille inserts, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, mud flaps, white, TOW ONLY —

This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 283,559 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:
Left upper ball joint, all pads/rotors, alignment needed, both rear door/window locks.

Hood chips/rust, both bumpers’ chips/scratches, left front fender chips, left rear fender road
rash, right side fenders road rash/rust, right front door trim around mirror broken, right rear
door does not open form inside, missing rear door pop-up locks, roof chips/small rust
spots/scratches, 8 holes in roof - sealed, tape on spoiler, no first aid/fire extinguisher,
windshield chips, hole drilled in dash, head liner, rear storage area, missing molding in cargo
area, molding loose on rear seat, left head rest ripped, no jump seat, poor battery, minor
exterior damage.>, As is, where is

7,000.00 11-002 SUV 2017 DODGE Durango 4WD 5.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, rear A/C and 161,068 $6,158 1C4SDJFTOHC651272
heat, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows/ left front seat, keyless entry-2 key fobs ~ km
driving lights, hitch, trailer wiring, 5 passenger, steel wheel on rear right, white, TOW ONLY —

This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 161,068 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:
transmission axle noise, alignment, left fog light.

Hood paint peeling/dents, left rear door road rash/rust at bottom, right front door small rust-
inside front, one hole in roof sealed, tailgate chips/glass scratched/door gasket ripped, no
first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, right rear seat trim loose, holes in head liner,
inside trim on B pillar modified, holes drilled in both rear door around window frames inside,
holes drilled in rear door panels, holes drilled in console, both rear door missing pop up locks,
poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

2/12/2026,3:33 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 5
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Item #

Description

Kms

Min Price Serial Number

No Bid

11-003

Truck 2018 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 4WD, crew cab, 6'7" box 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt,
cruise, AM/FM, power mirrors/locks/windows/left front seat, keyless entry-2 fobs, 2 keys
side steps, front tow hooks, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, toolbox
behind cab no key, has back seat, grey, TOW ONLY —

This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 308,303 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:
Front struts leak, rear shocks leaking, exhaust flex pipe separating, left upper ball joint, both
plate bulbs non-operational, high mount bulb non-operational.

Front bumper bent/road rash, right front fender dents/scratches, right rear fender scratches/
road rash, right side doors scratches, roof badly dented, tailgate scratches/hard to open, no
first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat worn/sagging, front valance
loose, left A pillar dented/road rash, right side step bent, poor battery, minor exterior
damage.>, As is, where is

308,303
km

$7,269 3GCUKNEC7)G107040

6,899.50

11-004

Truck 2006 CHEVROLET Silverado 2500 HD 4WD, extended cab, 6'7" box 6.0L, V8, gas auto
A/C dual zone, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, 3 keys front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer
wiring, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY —

This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 247,349 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:
Left exhaust manifold leaking and broken bolt, left front axle stub seized in front differential-
cannot fix, left front axle seal leaking without opening front differential, right park brake not
releasing all the way, right wiper blade.

Hood road rash/dents, rear bumper holes drilled, left rear fender cents/chips/road rash, right
road rash/dents, both rocker panels paint worn, left/right rear door dents, no first aid
kits/fire extinguishers, windshield chips, left front seat worn/ripped, both box rails dented,
front of box bent, floor of box dent, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

247,349
km

$3,856 1GCHK29U56E274613

2/12/2026,3:33 PM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 6
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
6,000.00 * 10-007 Truck 2014 DODGE/RAM 2500 4WD, crew cab, 6'4" box 5.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 271,195 $4,732 3C6TR5CT4EG212111
AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-1 key fob front tow km

hooks, grille inserts, mud flaps, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, trailer wiring, OEM trailer
brakes, has back seat, brown, TOW ONLY —

This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 271,195 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:
Check engine light on codes (P0456 EVAP small leaks, P0463 fuel level sensor, V0159 lost
com. parking, V1403 fuel level), all four ball joints, U-joints, manifold leaks, gas gauge non
operational.

Hood stone bruises/chips/scratches, front bumper rust spots, rear bumper rust/paint poor,
left side fenders road rash/scratches/dents, right side fenders rust/scratches/dents, rocker
panels road rash/rust, left side doors dents/scratches, right front door chips/scratches, right
rear door rust/chips/scratches, roof chips/rust/scratches, tailgate rust/dent/scratches/guard
bent, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, inside box scratched, vehicle has bush
scratches, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

6,001.00 * 9-016

Truck 2015 DODGE/RAM 2500 4WD, crew cab, 6'5" box 5.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 291,726 $5,717 3C6TR5CT7FG592353
AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-1 key fob front tow km
hooks, grille inserts, mud flaps, sidestep, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, headache

rack with beacon, front and rear wig wags-operational, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY —

This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is

sold in “As is, where is” condition., 291,726 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:

Right headlight has water and loose.

Hood chips, both bumpers chips/scratches, left rear fender paint worn/road rash/chips/
dents/rust, right rear fender dents/scratches, both rocker panels road rash, roof black sealant

on roof, one hole sealed antenna, tailgate hard to open/chips/dents/molding loose, spare tire
loose in box may not be compatible with vehicle, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield
chips, small holes in left front seat, front of box bent, box rusted badly/ scratched, beacon

does not work, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

2/12/2026,3:33 PM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 7
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
5,501.99 * 9-017 Truck 2016 DODGE/RAM 2500 4WD, crew cab, 6'5" box 5.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 297,316 $5,291 3C6TR5CT4GG118572
AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs front tow km

hooks, grille inserts, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, box liner,
headache rack, wigwags front and rear, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY —

This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 297,316 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:
TPMS light on, left headlight assembly full of water.

Hood hail, front bumper scratches/chips, rear bumper dents/scratches/rust, left rear fender
dents/scratches/road rash, right rear fender dents/road rash, both rocker panels road rash,
left front door dents, left rear door scratches, right front door scratch, roof hail, tailgate
dents/rust/bent/chips/molding loose, spare on rear left , wheel wrench/jack loose under
back seat, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, back seat soiled, left front floor
mat worn, front of box bent, left cab corner dents, left rear seat floor storage lid broke,
missing left rear wheel hub cap, left front headlights moisture, wigwags non-operational,
poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

4,487.15

11-013

Truck 2013 DODGE/RAM 1500 SLT 4WD, quad cab, 6'3" box 4.8L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 219,390 $3,987 1C6RR7GP1DS558868
AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows/left front seat, keyless entry-2 key km
fobs, 1 key for toolbox front tow hooks, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes,
Challenger Gull wing toolbox-lid does not stay open, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY —

This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is

sold in “As is, where is” condition., 219,390 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:

Both lower ball joints, rear links, left front hubs, front fenders.

Hood paint peeling/chips, left side fenders badly rusted/chips, right side fenders rusted, both
rocker panels rusted, left side doors chips/dents, tailgate will not open/rusted/dented, wheel
wrench/jack loose under back seat, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left

front seat worn/ripped, left side step in box, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is,

where is

2/12/2026,3:33 PM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 8
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Item #

Description Kms

Min Price

Serial Number

No Bid * 10-026

Truck 2019 FORD F150 4WD, supercrew, 6'5" box 5.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, 420,852
power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-1 key fob, 1 key for topper front  km
tow hooks, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, ARE topper, has a back seat,

white, TOW ONLY —

This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is

sold in “As is, where is” condition., 420,852 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:

Drive belt, left inner tie rod, left outer tie rod, front and rear pads/rotors, alignment needed,
windshield, missing mud flaps, wiper blades, washer switch, plate light.

Transmission chatters and surges, mobile for short trips, diagnosed with internal transmission
issues, need replacement transmission, grille broken, hood chips/road rash, rear bumper

dented, left side fenders road rash, right rear fender road rash, right front door chips, tailgate
corner bent, unknown if wheel wrench is under the back seat, no first aid kit/fire

extinguisher, windshield cracked, left mirror housing broken, topper tailgate or lock non
operational, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

$8,270

1FTFW1ES5XKKE71275

7,161.33 * 10-027

Truck 2016 FORD F250 SD 4WD, crew cab, 6'5" box 6.7L, V8, diesel auto A/C, tilt, cruise, after 313,317
market AM/FM radio, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs km
front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, headache rack,
box liner, wig wags front and rear, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY —

This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is

sold in “As is, where is” condition., 313,317 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:

Engine codes: P2464E exhaust gas (B154), P24C7 part matter sensor, P2463 soot
accumulation(B1), P246F exhaust gas (B154), pit man arm, right outer tie rod, rear

pads/rotors, 4WD not working, driver seat ripped.

Multiple codes, 4WD problems, power lock problems, steering and brake issues, spare tire

key for winch missing, signs of coolant between transmission and engine, both bumpers
rusted/dented/scratched, left front fender road rash, left rear fender rust/dents/road rash,

right side fenders road rash/rust/dents, left rocker panel rusted, left side doors
rusted/chips/dents, right side doors rusted/chips/dents/road rash, roof rusting/chips, tailgate
poor/rusted/dented, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, both mirror housing
broken, left seat badly worn/cushion visible/holes, right seat worn/torn, left cab corner

rusted, trim loose inside left front door, interior soiled, holes in front bump mat, switch for

wig wags hanging, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

$4,956

1FT7W2BTOGEB63809

2/12/2026,3:33 PM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.



SaskBuilds and Procurement SaskSurplus Sale #11

&F SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From Feb 04 to Feb 11, 2026
A saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

Government

Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

No Bid * 9-019 Truck 2017 FORD F250 SD 4WD, crew cab, 6'10" box 6.2L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 334,118 $9,920 1FT7W2B60HEE88021
aftermarket AM/FM radio, power heated trailer tow mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless  km
entry-2 key fobs front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer
brake, box liner, headache rack, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY —

This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 334,118 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:
Exhaust manifold, front shocks, left outer tie rod, alignment needed, rear brake line not
secured.

Grille holes drilled, hood dents/stone chips, front bumper chips, rear bumper rusted/holes
drilled, left front fender chips, left rear fender scratch, right rear fender small dents, left front
door dents, tailgate chips/small dents, no first aid kit/fire extinguishers, windshield chips, left
front seat sagging, holes drilled in box rails, front valance broken, poor battery, minor
exterior damage.>, As is, where is

9,080.70 11-018 Van 2006 CHEVROLET Express 3500 Cargo RWD, 14' x 7'6" Unicell Cube 7'h 6.0L, V8, gas auto 33,214 km $7,369 1GBJG31U761253858
A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, 3 keys rollup rear door, HD step, 6’ x 12” grated step at rear, van
body mirrors, dual rear wheels, white, TOW ONLY —

This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 33,214 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:
Engine light on, misfiring, oil cooler lines, power steering pump, exhaust leak from left
exhaust manifold gasket, windshield wiper wash broken off, left front wipers not clearing
windshield.

Hood paint poor/dents, left front fender rusted, both rocker panels rusted, left front door
rust/chips, roof poor paint/large dent, spare tire loose in back may not be compatible with
vehicle, no wheel wrench/jack/first aid kit/fire extinguishers, windshield chips/scratches, left
front seat badly worn, right cab corner rusted, cube scratches at left rear corners, sealant
loose on both rear corners, rollup door scratches, front of cube road rash, molding loose on
right side, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

2/12/2026,3:33 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 10



SaskBuilds and Procurement SaskSurplus Sale #11
Govero':me”t SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From Feb 04 to Feb 11, 2026
A Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092
Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
1,200.00 11-015 Van 2012 DODGE Grand Caravan SE FWD 3.6L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 224,408 $962 2C4RDGBG7CR272148

player, power mirrors/windows/locks, keyless entry-2 fobs, 1 key 7 passenger, Stow-N-Go 3rd km
row seat only, copper head, TOW ONLY —

This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical
Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any
required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 224,408 km, ,
KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Check engine light on codes: P0152, 02B251, P1129
closed loop, P2098 fuel trim, tires cupped, both rocker panels rusted through.

Grille upper right broke, hood scratches/chips/paint peeling, front bumper chips, rear
bumper holes, left front fender scratches, left rear fender rust/scratches, right front fender
dent/road rash, right rear fender rust/scratches/road rash, both dog legs rust, both rocker
panels rusted through, left front door road rash, left rear door dent/rust/road rash, roof rust
at front edge, tailgate glass scratched, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor
exterior damage.>, As is, where is

2/12/2026,3:33 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 11
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SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #11

From Feb 04 to Feb 11, 2026

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca
25.00 * 10-107 Tires, Lot of 2 225/60R16, Goodyear Integrity, M+S Manufacture date, week 23, year 2008. $20
Fair
109.00 * 10-103 Tires, Lot of 4 225/65R17, Firestone Weathergrip, Snowflake, M+S Manufacture date week $100
31, year 2020. Fair
No Bid * 9-113 Desk, L-shape, wood Light brown, 5 drawers with lock and 2 keys, adjustable feet, comes S1
with hardware, main 66.5"w x 35.5" d x 29.5" h, return side 43.5"w x 20.5"d x 28" h, comes
with monitor riser with pull-out tray, some scratches and water damage, missing one
adjustable foot. Fair
No Bid * 9-114 Desk, L-shape, wood Light brown, 5 drawers with lock and 2 keys, adjustable feet, no s1
hardware, main 66.5"w x 35.5" d x 29.5" h, return side 43.5"w x 20.5"d x 28" h, comes with
monitor riser with pull-out tray, some scratches and water damage. Fair
No Bid * 9-115 Desk, U-shape, wood Dark brown, 1 drawer, adjustable feet, has hardware, main 108" w x S1
20" w, left return, 72.25" w x 32.5" d, right return 120" w x 20.5" w x 29.5" h, some
scratches, surface laminate lifting, back has cracked. Fair
20.00 11-101 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise 600, M602X Operational (powers on, no noises, $1 CNCCF2NO1V
no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair
20.00 11-102 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise 600, M602X, floor model Operational (powers $1 CNBCD941G9
on, no noises, no further testing) on wheels, some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.
Fair
25.00 11-103 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise, M605X Operational (powers on, no noises, no S$1 CNDCJ8LOCY
further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair
18.29 11-104 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise, M605X Operational (powers on, no noises, no S1 CNDCIB21NS
further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair
150.00 11-105 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise, M605X Operational (powers on, no noises, no S$1 CNDCIDC141
further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair
150.00 11-106 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise, M605X Operational (powers on, no noises, no S1 CNDCIDC14B

further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair

2/12/2026,3:33 PM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 12



Government SaskBuilds and Procurement SaskSurplus Sale #11

&F SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From Feb 04 to Feb 11, 2026
A Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092
Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
27.00 11-107 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise, M605X Operational (powers on, no noises, no S1 CNDCK1R007
further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair
55.00 11-108 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise, M608X Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1 CNBCK651SS
further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair
55.00 11-109 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise, M608X Operational (powers on, no noises, no S1 CNBCK651T5
further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair
55.00 11-110 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise, M608X Operational (powers on, no noises, no S1 CNBCLBS1T8
further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair
49.00 11-111 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise, M608X Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1 CNBCM3N12Z
further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair
51.00 11-112 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise, M608X Operational (powers on, no noises, no S1 CNBCMBX2F4
further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair
101.00 11-113 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro, M479FDN, Color MFP Operational (powers on, no S1 CNCRP2L4QR
noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair
56.56 11-114 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet, M527F MFP Operational (powers on, no noises, no S1 MXBCHBTOVG
further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair
20.00 11-115 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet, P4015X Operational (powers on, no noises, no further S1 CNDY839624
testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair
20.00 11-116 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet, P4015X Operational (powers on, no noises, no further S1 JPDF272697
testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair
49.00 11-117 Printer, Lexmark International Inc, XC4140, floor model Operational (powers on, no noises, S1 7528744011TV2
no further testing) on a cart with wheels, some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair
50.00 11-118 Printer, Lexmark International Inc, XM1145 Operational (powers on, no noises, no further S$1 70156PHH1447T

testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair

2/12/2026,3:33 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 13
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

LA RONGE, Environment, 800 Poirier St
Contact Mark Duffy 306-425-7595, mark.duffy@gov.sk.ca

2,413.00 11-530 ATV,2008 Arctic Cat 366 4X4366c¢c, 1 cylinder, gasstandard 1 key1434 kmKNOWN 1434 km
PROBLEMS: Has a new carb but needs a tune up to get running. As is, where is

S1 RFBO8ATV28K6T4931

377.00 11-526 Outboard Motor, Suzuki 2.2 hp With internal fuel tank, was operational when placed into S1

storage. Fair

711.00 11-527 Outboard Motor, Suzuki 30 hp 2 stroke With oil tank, was operational when put into S$1 03003-461880

storage. Fair

433.33 11-528 Outboard Motor, Suzuki 4 hp With internal fuel tank, was operational when put into S1

storage. Fair

LA RONGE, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, Hangar 2 Athabasca Airways Rd
Contact Mike Towill 306-425-4585, mike.towill@gov.sk.ca or JD Faubert 306-425-4587, jeandenis.faubert@gov.sk.ca
645.56 11-553

Air Condition Servicing Units, Lot of 2 Mother boards are no good, parts only, non- S1
operational. Beyond Repair

6,500.00 11-554 Engine Stands, Lot of 2 CL215 These stands are not certified and will be sold as scrap. Poor $100
1,366.60 11-555 Golf Cart, Battery powered golf cart with solar charging panel, batteries are dead. Fair $200
600.00 11-556 Hydraulic Jacks, Lot of 4 For low wing aircraft. Fair $100
1,250.00 11-557 Starter Tester, Aircraft D/C, testing clutch, operational when removed from service. Fair $100
1,250.00 11-558 Tester, Aircraft D/C, generator test unit, operational when removed from service. Fair $100
211.11 11-559 Welder, Acklands, Tungsten, arc AC/DC, operational when removed from service. Fair $100
750.00 11-560 Welder, Syncrowave 351, Millerwelder AC/DC welding power source, works intermittently, $100

problem unknown. Fair

2/12/2026,3:33 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 14
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Govero':me”t SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From Feb 04 to Feb 11, 2026
‘ Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092
Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

MEADOW LAKE, Environment, 311 6th St E
Contact Chad Doherty 306-240-9989, chad.doherty@gov.sk.ca

2,145.00 11-531 Snowmobile 2008 Polaris 550 Touring 550cc, 1 cylinder, gas 1 key,,,4123.6 km,, KNOWN 4123.6 km S1 SINT5B558C358579
PROBLEMS: Tune up needed, poor battery, has never been registered with SGI, minor
exterior damage.>, As is, where is

2,100.00 11-529 Snowmobile 2007 Yamaha Venture Lite 1 cylinder, gas 1 key, , , unknown km, , KNOWN unknown S1 JYE86J0077A000998
PROBLEMS: Tune up needed, was operational when last used several years ago, dead battery, km
has never been registered with SGI minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

MEADOW LAKE PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks Culture and Sport, Highway 224
Contact Heath Harpham 306-839-7323, heath.harpham@gov.sk.ca

889.00 11-552 Snowmobile year unknown Ski Doo Alpine gas single ski, electric start, 1 key, orange, , 3,508 km $400 2583282B
3,508 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: will run but may be hard to start, poor windscreen, poor
paint, poor body, poor battery.>, As is, where is

OUTLOOK, Agriculture, 410 Saskatchewan Ave W
Contact Ben Lalonde 306-867-6469, ben.lalonde@gov.sk.ca or Outlook Front Desk 306-867-5500, stacey.stutters@gov.sk.ca

No Bid 11-509 GPS Base Radio, Pacific Crest PDL 4335 GPS 430-450Mhz radio for GPS system, significant S5 8,091,658
wear, unknown if still operational, stored in a cool dry place for many years, no cables
included. Poor

10.00 11-510 Leveling Rod, 1 set of 5m, aluminum, unknown brand, brown leather or vinyl case Total $10
height 5m, set has 4 pieces that clip together, carrying case included case is blue nylon, case
is brown leather or vinyl, rods have not been used for decades, stored in a cool dry place,

noticeable wear present, calibration likelv required. Fair
No Bid 11-511 Leveling Rod, 1 set of 5m, aluminum, unknown brand, brown leather or vinyl case Total $10

height 5m, set has 4 pieces that clip together, carrying case included case is blue nylon, case
is brown leather or vinyl, rods have not been used for decades, stored in a cool dry place,

noticeable wear present, calibration likelv required. Fair
No Bid 11-512 Leveling Rod, 1 set of 5m, aluminum, unknown brand, brown leather or vinyl case Total $10

height 5m, set has 4 pieces that clip together, carrying case included case is blue nylon, case
is brown leather or vinyl, rods have not been used for decades, stored in a cool dry place,
noticeable wear present, calibration likely required. Fair

No Bid 11-513 Surveying Tripod, Duratech, wood, flat head Stored in a cool dry place, clamps are $20
somewhat loose, one leg is partially detached from the hinge (needs a new screw), noticeable
wear present, tightening and calibration likely required. Fair

2/12/2026,3:33 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 15
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Fax: 306-787-2092
Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
30.00 11-514 Surveying Tripod, Leica, wood, flat head Stored in a cool dry place, clamps are somewhat $25
loose, noticeable wear present, tightening and calibration likely required. Fair
No Bid 11-515 Surveying Tripod, Leica, wood, telescoping antenna pole Stored in a cool dry place, clamps $30

are somewhat loose, noticeable wear present, tightening and calibration likely required. Fair

PRINCE ALBERT, Community Safety, 1827 - 1 Ave W

Contact Richard LaClaire, richard.laclaire@gov.sk.ca or Graham Topoorowski, graham.toporowski@gov.sk.ca

1.00 11-506 Oven, Moffat, MCB757DM2WW 30 inch range, self cleaning, oven door hinges broken, door S1 TS508812P
not attached, stove top elements work but are in poor condition, operational. Broken
Repairable

PRINCE ALBERT, Community Safety, 3021 1st Ave W

Contact Tonya Granberg , tonya.granberg@gov.sk.ca or Nola Boechler, nola.boechler@gov.sk.ca
No Bid 11-507 Cups, Lot of 12 ceramic White. Fair S1

No Bid 11-508 Napkin Holders, Lot of 9 Stainless steel. Poor S1

PRINCE ALBERT, Environment, 301 Red Wing Drive

Contact Kory Bertrand 306-941-8675, kory.bertrand@gov.sk.ca, Chance Prestie 306-420-4306, chance.prestie@gov.sk.ca, Doug Gullickson, doug.gullickson@gov.sk.ca ol

360.00 11-517 Generator, Honda EB 2200 2200 watt, 120 volt output, pulls over but needs a tune up. Fair S1
480.00 11-518 Generator, Honda EB 5000x 5000 watt, 120/240 volt output, pulls over but needs a tune up, S1
has modified exhaust that can be removed. Fair
770.00 11-519 Outboard Motor, Honda 15 hp, longshaft outboard motor, operational, slow leak from S1 BAAS-1801168
bottom end. Good
450.00 11-520 Outboard Motor, Johnson 25 hp, long shaft, black, unknown if operational. Fair S1 G04171118
400.00 11-521 Outboard Motor, Johnson 25 hp, long shaft, white, unknown if operational. Fair S1 R08620767
456.78 11-523 Trailer,1975 Homebuilt utility, 10'l x 5' single axle, wooden sided, wiring for lights, lights are S$1 SASK90577000393

non-operational, 2” receiver, used for snowmobile, could be used for hauling other
equipment Asis, where is

2/12/2026,3:33 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 16
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
678.90 11-524 Trailer,1971 utility, 9'7"l x 7'w single axle trailer for quad, expanded metal sides, wiring for S1 Nw11971
lights, lights are non-operational, 2” receiver Asis, where is
1,580.00 11-525 Trailer,1985 tandem axle, 15'9"1 x 6'4"w wooden deck with fold down ramps, wooden sides S1 2LSF2T7F6FP000037
and front, 2 5/16 receiver, wiring for lights, lights are non-operational, brakes are present,
unknown if functional, two flat tires As is, where is
125.25 11-522 Trolling Motor, Minn Kota Vector Electric, 55 lbs of thrust, operational. Fair S1

REGINA, Health, 3475 Albert St
Contact: Steve Fairbairn 306-530-7703, steve.fairbairn@health.gov.sk.ca or Vicki Buchanan 306-787-8308, vicki.buchanan@health.gov.sk.ca

No Bid 11-546 Truck-Mount Cold Fogger, 2003 Maxi Pro 145 Ultra-low volume aerosol generator designed $2,000 293
for mosquito and fly control applications, 18 HP Briggs & Stratton gasoline engine with
electric start, single Dyna-Fog Multi-Mist nozzle, engineered to produce 90% of droplets
below 20 microns, output control available with a gear pump or FMI piston pumping system,
constructed with welded steel and powder-coat finishes for corrosion resistance. Unit has
been flushed with isopropyl alcohol and washed after each use but the tanks that hold the
pesticide cannot be cleaned.

**Please see the attached Deltagard SC Insecticide PDF below for handling instructions and
proper Personal protective equipment (PPE) requirements. The successful bidder must sign a
disclaimer attached below in acknowledgement of the potential hazards, and PPE
requirements before payment will be accepted. *Online viewing only - serious inquires may

c Il

No Bid 11-547 Truck-Mount Cold Fogger, 2003 Maxi Pro 145 Ultra-low volume aerosol generator designed $2,000 292
for mosquito and fly control applications, 18 HP Briggs & Stratton gasoline engine with
electric start, single Dyna-Fog Multi-Mist nozzle, engineered to produce 90% of droplets
below 20 microns, output control available with a gear pump or FMI piston pumping system,
constructed with welded steel and powder-coat finishes for corrosion resistance. Unit has
been flushed with isopropyl alcohol and washed after each use but the tanks that hold the
pesticide cannot be cleaned.

**Pplease see the attached Deltagard SC Insecticide PDF below for handling instructions and
proper Personal protective equipment (PPE) requirements. The successful bidder must sign a
disclaimer attached below in acknowledgement of the potential hazards, and PPE
requirements before payment will be accepted. *Online viewing only - serious inquires may
request an appointment for viewing on-site Excellent

2/12/2026,3:33 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 17
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Item #

Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

No Bid

11-548

Truck-Mount Cold Fogger, 2003 Maxi Pro 145 Ultra-low volume aerosol generator designed $2,000 295
for mosquito and fly control applications, 18 HP Briggs & Stratton gasoline engine with
electric start, single Dyna-Fog Multi-Mist nozzle, engineered to produce 90% of droplets
below 20 microns, output control available with a gear pump or FMI piston pumping system,
constructed with welded steel and powder-coat finishes for corrosion resistance. Unit has
been flushed with isopropyl alcohol and washed after each use but the tanks that hold the
pesticide cannot be cleaned.

**Please see the attached Deltagard SC Insecticide PDF below for handling instructions and
proper Personal protective equipment (PPE) requirements. The successful bidder must sign a
disclaimer attached below in acknowledgement of the potential hazards, and PPE
requirements before payment will be accepted. *Online viewing only - serious inquires may
request an appointment for viewing on-site Excellent

No Bid

11-549

Truck-Mount Cold Fogger, 2003 Maxi Pro 145 Ultra-low volume aerosol generator designed $2,000 294
for mosquito and fly control applications, 18 HP Briggs & Stratton gasoline engine with
electric start, single Dyna-Fog Multi-Mist nozzle, engineered to produce 90% of droplets
below 20 microns, output control available with a gear pump or FMI piston pumping system,
constructed with welded steel and powder-coat finishes for corrosion resistance. Unit has
been flushed with isopropyl alcohol and washed after each use but the tanks that hold the
pesticide cannot be cleaned.

**Please see the attached Deltagard SC Insecticide PDF below for handling instructions and
proper Personal protective equipment (PPE) requirements. The successful bidder must sign a
disclaimer attached below in acknowledgement of the potential hazards, and PPE
requirements before payment will be accepted. *Online viewing only - serious inquires may
reqguest an appointment for viewing on-site Excellent

No Bid

11-550

Truck-Mount Cold Fogger, 2003 Maxi Pro 145 Ultra-low volume aerosol generator designed $2,000 296
for mosquito and fly control applications, 18 HP Briggs & Stratton gasoline engine with
electric start, single Dyna-Fog Multi-Mist nozzle, engineered to produce 90% of droplets
below 20 microns, output control available with a gear pump or FMI piston pumping system,
constructed with welded steel and powder-coat finishes for corrosion resistance. Unit has
been flushed with isopropyl alcohol and washed after each use but the tanks that hold the
pesticide cannot be cleaned.

**Please see the attached Deltagard SC Insecticide PDF below for handling instructions and
proper Personal protective equipment (PPE) requirements. The successful bidder must sign a
disclaimer attached below in acknowledgement of the potential hazards, and PPE
requirements before payment will be accepted. *Online viewing only - serious inquires may
reaquest an annointment for viewing on-site Fxcellent

2/12/2026,3:33 PM
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

REGINA, Legislative Assembly Service, 515 Henderson Drive
Contact: Karen Plumb 306-787-8167, kplumb@legassembly.sk.ca

No Bid * 8-501 Uninterruptable Power Supply with Batteries and Power Modules, Lot of 11 APC Symmetra 1 $1,000
APC Symmetra LX UPS, SYAF16KRMT, 7 APC Symmetra LX Battery Module, SYBT5, 2 APC
Symmetra LX Power Module, SYPM4KP, 1 APC Symmetra LX Power Module, SYPM4KPQ. UPS:
19”w x 27”d x 33”h, (shipping 42 x 24 x 40) 500Ibs, each battery is 18 kg, 4 batteries in box, 3
loose, unknown what condition batteries are in, no power cord as it has to be direct wired
into building power. Sold as is. UPS: QD1037260148, in-box batteries: 502007760139,
5D2018T65313, 502018765320, 5D2007T60123, loose batteries: 502005T15219,
5D2007T60147, 502007760138, SYPM4KP, power modules: QD1513380215, AD2033110087,
SYPM4KPQ power module: AQ2106210005, operational. Fair

REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 1702 Park St
Contact Shola Babarinde 306-787-5864, sbabarinde@slga.com or Tyrone Smith 306-787-1934, tsmithl@slga.com

No Bid 11-533 Cabinet, wood, lateral Brown, 2 drawers, few scratches, 20" w x 36" | x 29" h. S15
Fair

No Bid 11-534 Cabinet, wood, lateral Brown, few scratches with tape residue, 20" w x 37" d x 29" h. S15
Fair

32.00 11-535 Chair, mesh Black, adjustable. Good S5

No Bid 11-536 Desk, wood, lateral Brown, few scratches, 21.5" w x 72" d x 30" h Fair $25

No Bid 11-537 Desk, wood, lateral Brown, few scratches, 36" w x 72" d x 30 h. Fair $25

32.00 11-538 File Cabinet, metal, lateral Beige, 4 drawer, 1 shelf with key, 36" w x 19.4" d x 66" h, top S10

panel only engages lock on one side. Fair

32.00 11-539 File Cabinet, metal, lateral Black, 3 drawer, 1 shelf, no key, 36" w x 19.5" d x 53" h. Good $10
No Bid 11-540 File Cabinet, wood, lateral Brown, 3 drawers with keys, 20" w x 30" d x 44" h Good $10
5.25 11-541 Table, wood Brown, rectangular, few scratches, 19.5" w x 29" d x 20" h. Fair S5
25.83 11-542 Table, wood Brown, steel legs, rectangular, 30" w x 60" d x 28" h. Fair $10
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

25.22 11-543 Table, wood Brown, steel legs, rectangular, 36" w x 72" d x 29" h. Good $10

26.66 11-544 Table, wood Brown, steel legs, rectangular, 36" w x 72" d x 29" h. Fair $10

5.00 11-545 Table, wood White, steel legs, 23.5" w x 20" d x 28.5" h. Poor S1

1,111.00 11-503 Forklift Clark TM20 electric max capacity 1587.6 Kg, 1 key comes with charger, green, ,
unknown hrs, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Non-operational, battery needs
replacement, will not charge, tires heavily worn, seat is torn, lights and horn unknown if

operational, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

unknown S1 TM 247-0443-9058FB

250.00 11-502 Pallet Jack Crown 60PE electric max capacity 2721.6 Kg, 2 keys comes with charger, grey, ,
2,517 hours, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Non-operational, battery needs
replacement, will not charge, tires heavily worn, unknown if horn is operational, minor

exterior damage.>, As is, where is

2,517 S1 W-48224
hours

52.01 * 10-508 Server Racks, metal 23.5"w x 37.5" d x 81.5"h, good shape, four wheels, with a front single

door only, front door has a lock but no key. *Online Viewing Only* Good

$25

1,278.00 11-532 Snowmobile 2001 Polaris Sport Touring 550cc, 2 stroke, gas, direct inject oil mixture belt
driven, clutch 2 up - rear seat, 1 key available to view on February 8, 2026 between 12:00PM
and 3:00PM at the Rowan’s Ravine Provincial Park maintenance yard, , , 8,741 km, , KNOWN
PROBLEMS: Initial start is difficult, poor brakes, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is,

where is

8,741 km S1 4XAST5BS31C134648

No Bid * 8-540 Pipe Fittings, grooved 5 pallets, never used or installed. New- Unused

$500
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Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

No Bid * 9-512 Dehydrator, Hungry Giant, HGF-320ML Operational, put into use 2020 (RFQ 1920-011 ;
256532). Good

$15,000 HGF320ML-CAN1601-001

2,525.25 11-501 Van 2019 Dodge Grand Caravan SE 2WD 3.6L, V6, gas auto Air/tilt/cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 332,130 S1 2C4RDGBG9KR734336
power windows/locks/seat, 2 key fobs 6 speed, cargo barrier, GVW 2,745 kg, wheel base km
3078mm, tire size 225/65R17, 4 ply, 2nd row seating stowed, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGlI
Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed
SGl Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. ,
332,130 km, Known Recent Repairs: new front tires, KNOWN PROBLEMS: Missing 3rd row
seats, dead battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

51.45 11-504 Depth Finder, Lowrance Elite - 4x With transducer, speedo cable unit. (1 attachment), S1 104,761,844
operational. Good

51.45 11-505 Depth Finder, Lowrance Elite - 5x With mount, power cord and transducer. (1 attachment), S1 103,385,625
operational. Good

2,165.60 11-516 Snowmobile 1999 Polaris Indy Trail Touring 2 stroke, gas , blue, , km unknown, Known km $100 4XAET4ESSOXC069026
Recent Repairs: carb has been serviced over the past two years, KNOWN PROBLEMS: unknown
Unknown if operational, machine has not been used for 2 years, As is, where is
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