

## **SALE SUMMARY LIST**

**PLEASE NOTE:** Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit [www.SaskSurplus.ca](http://www.SaskSurplus.ca) for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with \* have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on [www.SaskSurplus.ca](http://www.SaskSurplus.ca) web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from [www.SaskSurplus.ca](http://www.SaskSurplus.ca) or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3300,
- by email to [sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca](mailto:sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca), or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

**MT = (Ministry Transfer)** This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.

**WD = (Withdrawn)** This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.

**No Bid =** Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles</b>				
<b>Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca</b>				
<b>2,999.99 8-017</b>	<p>Car 2013 DODGE Avenger SE FWD 2.4L, inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/locks/windows/trunk release, keyless entry-2 key fobs , blue, TOW ONLY – This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 247,318 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Driver belt worn, front struts leaking, front sway bar bushing, rear sway bar bushing has play, rear pads/rotors rusted out, head lights fogged, note both front inside wheel wheels have damage.</p> <p>Grille chrome pitted, hood hail/scratches/paint bubbling, front bumper faded, rear bumper scratches/scrape, left side fenders scratches/chips, right front fender chips, right rear fender dents, both front fenders liner broken, both dog legs road rash, both rocker panels road rash/rust, left front door rust, left rear door rust/road rash, right rear door rust/road rash, roof hail damage/rust, trunk lid hail/scratches, no first aid kit/fire extinguishers, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	247,318 km	\$2,438	1C3CDZAB0DN604523
<b>4,545.45 8-001</b>	<p>Car 2016 FORD Fusion S FWD 2.5L, inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/windows/locks, keyless entry-2 key fobs , black, TOW ONLY – This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 258,954 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Low tread on all 4 tires.</p> <p>Hood chips/scratches, front bumper chips/scratches/faded, left and right rear fender road rash/paint poor, both dog legs road rash, left rear door road rash, trunk lid scratches, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, right mirror paint peeling, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	258,954 km	\$3,700	3FA6P0G76GR220381

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>7,000.00 8-002</b>	<p>SUV 2012 CHEVROLET Suburban 2500 LS 4WD 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/locks/windows/left front seat, keyless entry-1 fob, 1 key cargo barrier, power inverter, wig wag front/rear, 5 passengers, plywood, spare tire cover loose in rear, white, TOW ONLY –</p> <p>This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 178,364 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Engine light on codes: P0171/P0174, TPMS light on, left/right upper ball joint loose, front rotors rusted, front/rear wheel alignment, windshield cracked, wiper blades, rear tires don’t match.</p> <p>Hood scratches/chips, front bumper broke, left front fender paint chipping, left rear fender rusted, right front fender paint chipping, right rear fender rusted, both dog legs rusted, left side doors chips, right front door dent, roof rust spots, 10 holes in roof sealed, tailgate rust/dent, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, hole in dash, poor battery, minor exterior</p>	178,364 km	\$3,921	1GNWK5EG3CR195865
<b>No Bid * 7-007</b>	<p>Truck 2018 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 4WD, crew cab, 6’6" box 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry-1 key, 1 fob front tow hooks, wigwags on grille/headache rack, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, box liner, headache rack, beacon, Brute tool-box commercial class 1 key locks intermittent, has back seat, grey, TOW ONLY –</p> <p>This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 387,040 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Both lower ball joints, right inner tie rod, front rotors, rear pads/rotors, alignment needed, oil low/oil change due, both wiper blades.</p> <p>Hood scratches/dents/chips, front bumper bent/chips, rear bumper chips/scratches, left front fender road rash/scratches, left rear fender road rash/dents/scratches, right front fender road rash, right rear fender dents/scratches/road rash, left front door dent/scratches, right front door dent/scratch, roof small stone chips/dent, tailgate scratches/dents, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat sagging, tool box dented, all seat soiled, poor battery, minor exterior damage &gt; As is, where is</p>	387,040 km	\$5,771	3GCUKNEC5JG158729

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
8,505.00 8-003	<p>Truck 2012 DODGE Ram 2500 4WD, crew cab, 6'4" box 5.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs box liner, rubber mat on floor of box, headache rack, has back seat, blue, TOW ONLY –</p> <p>This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 261,227 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Right front door binding with right front fender, left fender rusted out at bottom, right inner fender damaged.</p> <p>Hood scratches, front bumper rusted/pitted/scratched, rear bumper bent/rusted/dent, left front fender rust hole, left rear fender rust/road rash/scratches, right front fender rusted/bent/scratches, right rear fender road rash/scratches, left rocker panel road rash, right rocker panel road rash/rust, left side doors scratches, right front door scratches/dents/binds, right rear door scratches/dents, roof scratches on exterior, tailgate rust spots/bent at top and bottom, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat sagging, seats are soiled, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt; , As is, where is</p>	261,227 km	\$5,986	3C6TD5CT1CG195036
No Bid 8-004	<p>Truck 2015 DODGE Ram 2500 4WD, crew cab, 6'4" box 5.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power windows/locks, keyless-2 key fobs, 2 keys for toolbox front tow hooks, grille inserts, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, headache rack with beacon, box liner, Brute Gullwing toolbox-fair condition, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY –</p> <p>This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 293,041 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Both upper ball joints slight play, park brake will not hold in reverse.</p> <p>Hood chips, front bumper rust spots, rear bumper rust/dent/missing sensor, left and right rear fender road rash/chips, rocker panels both road rash/surface rust, right front door dents, roof small rust spots, 1 hole in roof sealed, tailgate chips/dents/molding broke, wheel wrench/jack loose under back seat, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chip, left front seat worn at seam, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt; , As is, where is</p>	293,041 km	\$10,937	3C6TR5CT3FG592348

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
5,288.88 8-018	<p>Truck 2013 DODGE/RAM 1500 4WD, quad cab, 7' box 4.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power windows/locks/left front seat, keyless entry-2 key fobs, 1 key front tow hooks, mud flaps, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, tonneau cover(hard), has back seat, white, TOW ONLY –</p> <p>This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 264,768 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Exhaust manifold gasket leaking, right front coil spring, TPMS-both front sensors dead, front pads/rotors, high mount bulb, left front fender rusted out.</p> <p>Hood dents, front bumper chips, rear bumper dents, left front fender rust-hole, left rear fender rust/chips, right rear fender road rash/rust, left side doors paint peeling, right front door chips, right rear door paint peeling, tonneau cover dents/holes, tailgate scratches, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, two small holes in front hump floor mat, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	264,768 km	\$3,086	1C6RR7GP6DS558865
6,700.00 8-020	<p>Truck 2014 DODGE/RAM 3500 4WD, crew cab, 8' box 5.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power tailer tow mirrors heated, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs, 1 key front tow hooks, grille inserts, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, headache rack, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY –</p> <p>This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 299,061 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Check engine light on codes P0456 EVAP leak, left lower ball joint/left upper ball joint loose, front shocks leak, left fender rusted through, left rear park aid sensor popped out of socket, two rear hub caps missing.</p> <p>Hood chips, front bumper dents/rust spots, rear bumper dents/scratches/missing sensor, left front fender rust hole, left front inter fender broke, left rear fender rust, right front fender rust, right rear fender rust/road rash, rocker panels road rash/surface rust, tailgate paint worn/dents/scratches, wheel wrench loose under back seat, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat cushion sagging, left corner cab small dent, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	299,061 km	\$5,936	3C63R3GT1EG203381

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
16,888.88 8-005	<p>Truck 2012 DODGE/RAM RWD, Williamsen dump body 9'6" x 7'5" 6.7L, inline 6, diesel auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated trailer tow mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs Buyers toolbox mounted on right side-fair, aluminum drop down sides, 2 beacons, condition of electrical and mechanical equipment unknown, front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, trailer brakes-electric, dual rear wheels, Wanco sign board, model WVMBM-3LP, controller mounted in cab-condition of sign board and components unknown, Waltco model DT16 lift gate, condition of all components unknown, white, TOW ONLY –</p> <p>This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 226,367 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: DEF system failure, broken gas cap, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher.</p> <p>Grille paint bubbling, hood chips/dents, front bumper rusted/faded/missing molding, left front fender dent, left front door small rust spots/road rash, right front door sill rusted, roof rust spots, 1 hole in roof sealed (antenna), no spare tire/wheel wrench/jack, windshield chips, left front seat sagging, platform badly rusted, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	226,367 km	\$9,551	3C7WDMEL3CG194602
2,015.02 8-006	<p>Truck 2007 FORD F150 RWD, extended cab, 6'6" box 4.6L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, 2 keys hitch, trailer wiring, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY –</p> <p>This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 208,664 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: All 4 ball joints, tires, rear pads/rotors, alignment needed, both battery ends, no park brake, right rear quarter panel dented near rocker, light at rear of cab, head lamps foggy, left plate light.</p> <p>Grille broke, hood scratches, left front fender road rash/rust, left rear fender rust holes, right front fender road rash/rust, right rear fender rust/scratches, left front door road rash, right front door road rash, right rear door dent/chips, roof scratches, tailgate dents, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat worn/sagging/hole, cup holder broke, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	208,664 km	\$865	1FTRX12W07FB24030

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
6,077.77 8-007	<p>Truck 2010 FORD F250 SD 4WD, crew cab, 6'10" box 5.4L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated trailer tow mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 fobs, 2 keys front tow hooks, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, trailer brakes, side steps, headache rack, box liner, holes drilled in box rails, 5 passengers, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY –</p> <p>This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 243,031 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: left upper ball joint, left lower ball joint, pit arm, alignment needed.</p> <p>Grille broke, front bumper rust/dents/scratches, rear bumper rust/dents, left front fender rust/paint poor, left rear fender rust/road rash, right front fender rust, right rear fender dent/road rash, left side doors rust/road rash, right side doors road rash, roof scratches/rust spots, 2 hole in roof sealed, tailgate dent, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left mirror housing hole, both cab corners surface rust, no jump seat, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	243,031 km	\$5,434	1FTSW2B58AEA01414
7,988.63 8-008	<p>Truck 2010 FORD F250 SD 4WD, supercab, 6'10" box 5.4L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power heated extended mirrors, power front windows/locks, keyless entry-2 fobs, 3 other keys grille inserts, front tow hooks, mud flaps, wheel flares, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brakes, has back seat, grey, TOW ONLY –</p> <p>This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 210,993 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Rear pads/rotors, passenger mirrors.</p> <p>Hood road rash, front bumper rusted, rear bumper dent/scratches/rust spots, left rear scratches/faded, right rear fender scratches, left side doors rust along bottom, right side doors scratches, right front door lower weather stripping, roof has small rust spots, tailgate dents/scratches, no first aid kit/fire extinguishers, windshield chips, right mirror glass shattered, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	210,993 km	\$5,808	1FTSX2B50AEA01419

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
9,636.07 8-009	<p>Truck 2013 FORD F250 SD 4WD, crew cab, 6'10" box 6.2L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated tow mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry 2 key fobs front tow hooks, grille inserts, mud flaps, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, box liner, headache rack, has back seat, red, TOW ONLY –</p> <p>This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 220, 827 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Transfer case input seal leak, pitman arm and drag link has play, left brake bulb. Grille holes drilled, hood scratches, both bumpers' chips/scratches/road rash, left and right rear fender scratches/dents, rocker panels rusted, all four doors scratches/chips/rusted, roof scratches, 2 holes in roof sealed, tailgate rust/dents/paint, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, right mirror hope-taped over, left mirror holes in housing, holes drilled in dash, front valance cracked, left cab corner scratches, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt; , As is, where is</p>	220, 827	\$5,206	1FT7W2B66DEA25438
9,666.66 8-010	<p>Truck 2016 FORD F250 SD 4WD, crew cab, 6'10" box 6.2L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power heated tow mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs grille inserts, front inserts, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, headache rack, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY –</p> <p>This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 220,110 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Transfer case output seal leak, rear shocks left and right leak, washer sprayers broken. Front bumper chips/rust, rear bumper chips/dents/scratches/pad screwed down, left front fender chips, left rear fender road rash/rust/chips, right front fender road rash, right rear fender road rash/rust, rocker panels rust, all doors rust/chips, left front door missing weather strip, roof chips/rust, five holes in roof sealed, tailgate rust/paint cracked/peeling/dents, wheel wrench/jack loose in back, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, holes drilled in box rails, both cab comers rust, center arm rest hole, left B-pillar trim broke, hole in head liner, holes drilled in dash, missing lower center trim in dash, floor of box rusted, right side step missing pad, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	220,110 km	\$9,072	1FT7W2B60GED05439



Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>No Bid 8-011</b>	<p>Truck 2018 FORD F250 SD 4WD, crew cab, 6'10" box 6.2L, v8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, after market AM/FM, power heated trailer tow mirrors, power windows/locks, keyless entry-2 key fobs front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, box liner, headache rack with beacon and wigwags, has back seat, grey, TOW ONLY –</p> <p>This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 318,842 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Left tire worn out, front pads/rotors 3mm, wipers streaky, note hood ajar lights stay on. Grille broken, hood chips/scratches, both bumpers' scratches/chips/rust spots, all fenders scratches/chips, left side doors chips/scratches, right side doors parking lot dent, 1 tape covering hole in roof, tailgate dent/scratches/chips, spare tire loose in box may not be compatible with vehicle, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips left front seat sagging, broken wig wag on grille, exhaust noisy, back up assist not working, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	318,842	\$14,979	1FT7W2B69JEB32639
<b>2,368.68 8-022</b>	<p>Truck 2013 FORD F250 Super Duty XL 4WD, supercab, 6'10" box 6.2L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated mirrors, power locks/front windows, keyless entry-1 key fob front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, trailer tow mirrors, has a back seat, blue, TOW ONLY –</p> <p>This vehicle has a VERY UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Body Integrity Inspection and a Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 294,861 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Track bar, both outer tie rods, rear shocks, rear pads/rotors, alignment needed, turn signal switch, no plate lights, no park brake, windshield, rocker panels, cab corners.</p> <p>Grille broken, hood dents/scratches/chips, front bumper rust spots, rear bumper dented/rusted, left front fender dents/scratches/road rash/rust, left rear fender road rash/rust/chips/dents, right front fender scratches, right rear fender road rash/rust/dents, rocker panels rusted (PMVI), left side doors road rash/dents/chips/scratches, right front door road rash/dents, right rear door road rash/dents/rust, tailgate paint flaking/scratches/missing molding, floor of box hole/bent/dents, spare tire loose in box may not be compatible with vehicle, no first aid/fire extinguisher/wheel wrench/jack, windshield badly cracked, left front seat back worn/padding visible, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	294,861	\$745	1FT7X2B64DEA00681

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
12,108.02 8-012	<p>Van 2012 CHEVROLET Express 1500 Cargo AWD 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 162,844 km            player, rear heat, power locks/front windows, remote locks 1 fob, 3 keys cargo barrier, shelving, plywood floor, roof rack with beacon, map box no key, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, power inverter-condition unknown, white, TOW ONLY –            This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 162,844 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: TPMS light on, left front C/V axle boot cut open, front rotors rusted, front brake pads at 2mm, alignment needed, park brake not working, left rear signal and brake light out. Both bumpers’ dented/chips, left rear fender dented/chips, right front fender paint peeling, right rear fender dents/rust, right dog leg rust, both rocker panels dented/rusted, left front door paint peeling, right front door chips/paint peeling, right rear door dents/chips, roof rust, 1 hole in roof sealed, tailgate dents/chips/left dented, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front worn/sagging, left rear quarter panel extended molding broke, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	162,844 km	\$5,982	1GCSHAF43C1129642
10,700.00 8-013	<p>Van 2012 CHEVROLET Express 1500 Cargo AWD 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 137,855 km            player, power locks/front windows, rear heat, keyless entry-2 fobs, 3 keys hitch, trailer wiring, pintle hook, electric trailer brakes, 2 mini reflector kits, beacon, mud flaps, plywood floor in rear, map box no key, cargo barrier, shelving with blue parts bins, power inverter-condition unknown, white, TOW ONLY –            This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 137,855 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Rear rotors rusted, rear pads at 2mm, alignment needed front and rear, left head light non-operational, left rear door does not open. Hood paint poor/dents/chips, front bumper chips/road rash, left front fender paint peeling, left rear fender rusted, right rear fender rusted, both rocker panels rusted, right front door chips, roof rust, 1 hole in roof sealed, tailgate left door will not open, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, right mirror scrape on housing, left front seat vinyl cracked-worn, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	137,855 km	\$5,778	1GCSHAF41C1130014

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
9,250.50 8-014	<p>Van 2012 CHEVROLET Express 1500 Cargo AWD 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/CD player, power front windows/locks, rear heat, keyless entry-2 fobs, 3 keys hitch, trailer wiring, trailer brakes, mud flaps, map box no key, cargo barrier, shelving, plywood floor, roof rack with beacon, power inverter-condition unknown, white, TOW ONLY – This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 156,346 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Front and rear brake pads 2 mm, front and rear wheel alignment, park brake does not hold, left taillight assembly failing off, right low beam headlight out, hole in driver’s seat. Hood chips/dents, front bumper upper cover cracked, both bumpers’ dents/chips, left rear fender dents/scratches, right rear fender rusted, right dog leg rusted, rocker panels rusted, left front door sill rusted, right front door dents, 1 hole in roof sealed, tailgate small dents/weather stripping loose, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	156,346 km	\$5,782	1GCSHAF43C1134002
3,677.77 8-015	<p>Van 2013 DODGE Grand Caravan SE FWD 3.6L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, rear HVAC, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows/1/4 glass windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs 7 passengers, Stow-N-Go 3rd row seat only, white, TOW ONLY – This vehicle has an UNSAFE SGI VIN status. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Mechanical Safety Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 245,044 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Front pads/rotors, alignment needed, weather strip on right rear door. Hood hail/paint bubbling, front bumper chips/scratches, rear bumper broke/hole, left front fender chips/scratches, left rear fender dents/rust, dog legs both rusted, rocker panel right rusted, left/right front door rust bottom/missing molding, roof rust/hail, tailgate glass scratched, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, trim panels loose for 3rd row seats in rear, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	245,044 km	\$2,548	2C4RDGBG7DR634125

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous</b>				
<b>Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca</b>				
<b>No Bid * 4-122</b>	Disposable Emergency Stretcher, Weave canvas, black. Excellent		\$10	
<b>No Bid * 4-101</b>	Flashlights, Lot of 6 Garrity 5 hand held, 1 other, with 2-6V batteries. Fair		\$1	
<b>No Bid * 2-106</b>	Rear Seat, Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, head rest loose. Fair		\$5	
<b>No Bid * 2-107</b>	Rear Seat, Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, rear trim loose. Fair		\$5	
<b>No Bid * 2-108</b>	Rear Seat, Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, seat belt buckle not protruding. fair		\$5	
<b>No Bid * 2-109</b>	Rear Seat, Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row. Fair		\$5	
<b>No Bid * 6-102</b>	Tires, Set of 3 LT265/70R/17, Sumitomo Encounter AT, Snowflake, Load Range E Manufacture date, week 16, year 2024. Good		\$600	
<b>No Bid * 4-130</b>	Chair, Swivel, cloth Black, 5 caster, adjustable height, no arms. Fair		\$1	
<b>No Bid * 4-132</b>	Chair, Swivel, cloth Blue, 5 caster, adjustable height and arms. Fair		\$1	
<b>No Bid * 4-133</b>	Chair, Swivel, cloth Grey, 5 caster, adjustable height, no arms. Fair		\$1	
<b>1.00 * 4-135</b>	Chairs, Lot of 2 Swivel, mesh Green, 5 caster, adjustable height no arms. Fair		\$1	
<b>No Bid * 4-136</b>	Chairs, Lot of 3 Swivel, mesh back Black, 5 caster, adjustable height, arms worn, seats soiled. Poor		\$1	
<b>2.00 * 4-137</b>	Desk, L-Shape Pepperdust, 72" w x 36" d x 29" h, return attached pedestal 2 drawers, 42" w x 19.25" d x 29" h attach pedestal 2 drawers, no locks, keyboard mount not attached, screws included. Poor		\$1	
<b>No Bid * 4-138</b>	Desk, L-Shape Pepperdust, 72" w x 36" d x 29" h, return, 42" w x 19" d x 29" h, pedestal 18" w x 24.5" d x 26.5" h on wheels, locks, no key, keyboard tray mount underneath, screws included. Poor		\$1	
<b>2.00 * 7-107</b>	Printer, Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Enterprise 600, M602X Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	CNDCG5W10S
<b>2.00 * 7-108</b>	Printer, Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Enterprise 600, M602X Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, with power cord. Fair		\$1	CNBCD5N3B8

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
123.00 * 7-112	Printer, Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Enterprise, M652DN Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	JPBCKC115K
123.00 * 7-114	Printer, Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Enterprise, M652DN, floor model Operational, on wheels, (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	JPBCM4G05T
10.50 * 7-120	Printer, Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet, P4015X Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	CNDYB25957
20.00 * 7-121	Printer, Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet, P4015X Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, with power cord. Fair		\$1	CNDYC34914

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number	
<b>BEAUVAL, Corrections, Policing, and Public Safety, Parcel Z, Hansen Street - Call for Directions</b>					
<b>Contact: Kyle Drumheller 306-240-7599, kyle.drumheller@gov.sk.ca</b>					
7,214.56	8-504	Trailer with Boat and Outboard Motor 1999 Crestliner 2050 Sportfish 20' long V6, 150 hp, 2-stroke, Johnson Open-bow, step ladder, public address system, hydrofoil, 1 key for the boat, includes EZ Loader trailer, 2-inch ball receiver, single tire, tire size ST215/75R14, 2 ply, boat: US-NOR62925C999, motor: G 04696990,, blue/ white, , 240 hrs, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Boat: motor has not run since August 2024, motor did smoke when last ran, unknown engine compression, leaks oil at motor rear, boat was stored outdoors without a tarp causing mildew to form on the interior, boat front navigation pole light is missing, rear navigation pole light unknown if operational, paint scratched and chipped. Trailer: trailer non-operational, bent axle, brake lines broken, poor tires, uneven wear, lights unknown if operational, no safety inspection. TOW ONLY - Buyer assumes full responsibility, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is	240 hrs	\$1	1ZEAAAYPR4XA019379
<b>BIG RIVER, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, Box 249 - Call for Directions</b>					
<b>Contact Alan Dunn 306-469-2500 or 469-7601, alan.dunn@gov.sk.ca</b>					
1,356.79	8-517	ATV 2005 Yamaha Kodiak 2x4,4x4 single cylinder 450cc, gas auto winch, tire size front 25 8-12 rear 25 10-12, red, , unknown hrs, , KNOWN PROBLEMS:ATV is non-operational, problems unknown, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is	unknown hrs	\$1	5Y4AJ14W1GA305135
1,356.79	8-516	ATV 2014 Yamaha Kodiak 2x4, 4x4 single cylinder 450cc, gas auto winch, tire size front 25 8-12 rear 25 10-12, red, , unknown hrs, , KNOWN PROBLEMS:ATV is non-operational, problems unknown, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is	unknown hrs	\$1	5Y4AJ65W3EA302019
<b>LLOYDMINISTER, Highways, 3603 44th Street</b>					
<b>Mark Eisenkirch 306-526-9103, Mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca</b>					
8-503	Sander, 2006, Hi Way E2500 slide in Good		\$2,500	125,083	
<b>MEADOW LAKE PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks, Culture and Sport, Meadow Lake Provincial Park - Call for Directions</b>					
<b>Contact Heath Harpham 306-839-7323, heath.harpham@gov.sk.ca or Reg Bayko 306-240-4513, reg.bayko@gov.sk.ca</b>					
440.00	8-502	Tires, General Tire size, 15.5-25, 12 ply, tubeless. Poor		\$25	
322.00	8-525	Trailer 2000 American utility dual axle, orange, , , KNOWN PROBLEMS: The signs have been sitting unused for a number of years, unknown condition, unknown if operational, As is, where is		\$25	1A9BS3311YZZZ8067
250.00	8-526	Trailer,2004 American utility single axleorangeKNOWN PROBLEMS: The signs have been sitting unused for a number of years, unknown condition, unknown if operational As is, where is		\$25	1A9BS331042228295

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>MEADOW LAKE PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks, Culture and Sport, Meadow Lake Provincial Park, Park Gate - Call for Directions</b>				
<b>Contact Rick Gollings 306-240-5041, rick.gollings@gov.sk.ca</b>				
<b>1,777.00</b>	<b>8-506</b>	SUV 2006 Jeep Liberty Sport 4x4 V6, 3.7L, gas auto Air, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 1 key roof rack, 2" receiver hitch, GWV 5600, tire size 225/75R16, 2 ply, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 185,487 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Battery is missing, mechanic stated that when the weather gets hot the unit has trouble starting, but otherwise runs good, the windshield is cracked and has large stone bruise on left side, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is	185,487 km	\$500 1J4GL48K76W177230
<b>2,000.00</b>	<b>8-505</b>	Truck 1987 Ford F800 RWD inline 6, 7.8L, diesel auto Heater, AM radio, 1 key GVW 33,000, single axle, wheel base 178, dual tire, tire size 11R 22.5, 5 ply, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 63,142 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Heater does not work well, interior is very poor, the seat has tears in it and the area around the speaker on the dash is damaged, the unit was used as recently as 3 years ago, the box was taken off and put on another newer truck, battery, exterior, paint and interior all in poor condition, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is	63,142 km	\$100 1FDPT84AXHVA27983
<b>MOOSE JAW, Highways, 1 km. South of Moose Jaw on Hwy. #2</b>				
<b>Contact Allan Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca</b>				
<b>751.99</b>	<b>8-533</b>	Crane, 1978, HIAB, 650, attachment Reservoir cap broken and tank dented, has some minor hydraulic leaks, operational. Poor		\$500 90,165
<b>OUTLOOK, Corrections, Policing, and Public Safety, 420 Saskatchewan Ave</b>				
<b>Contact Scott Andrew 306-420-6427, scott.andrew@gov.sk.ca</b>				
<b>516.00</b>	<b>8-514</b>	Boat and Trailer, year unknown Homebuilt tilt-deck Springbok boat, with roller guides, 2" ball hitch, tire size HR78-15red/silver KNOWN PROBLEMS: Boat in poor condition, trailer not currently towable and both boat and trailer will need to be hauled away on separate trailer, trailer wiring needs to be redone as breaks are visible and no connector, left side tires won't hold air, it is unknown if this trailer has ever been registered through SGI and, as such, it might not have had a license plate affixed to it. SGI may have to generate and supply a new VIN number to this trailer, so contact with SGI could be necessary if you want to plate this trailer and have it legal to drive on roadways., minor exterior damage.> As is, where is		\$1 Boat: H487 Trailer: unknown

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>PRINCE ALBERT, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 3021 1st Ave W</b>				
<b>Contact: Tonya Granberg 306-953-3005, <a href="mailto:tonya.granberg@gov.sk.ca">tonya.granberg@gov.sk.ca</a> or Nola Boechler, <a href="mailto:nola.boechler@gov.sk.ca">nola.boechler@gov.sk.ca</a></b>				
<b>No Bid</b> 8-520	Blanket, Lot of 2 light material, unknown material No tag, blue Good		\$1	
<b>No Bid</b> 8-521	Coffee Filter Basket, Lot of 18 plastic brown Poor		\$1	
<b>No Bid</b> 8-522	Coffee Pots , Lot of 21 plastic With metal bottom. Poor		\$1	
5.60 8-523	Towels, Lot of 12 Cardinal New, 100% cotton. New- Unused		\$1	CA 02494
5.65 8-524	Towels, Lot of 12 Cardinal New, 100% cotton. New- Unused		\$1	CA 02494
<b>PRINCE ALBERT, Environment, 201-1061 Central Ave.</b>				
<b>Contact: Emelyn Feliciano 306-953-3233, <a href="mailto:emelyn.feliciano2@gov.sk.ca">emelyn.feliciano2@gov.sk.ca</a> or Mary Jane Mackie, <a href="mailto:maryjane.mackie@gov.sk.ca">maryjane.mackie@gov.sk.ca</a></b>				
25.00 8-515	Headache Rack, Westcan, aluminum Silver, broken welds, 72.8" w x 29.5" d x 22.4" h. Poor		\$1	
<b>PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 47 - 12th St</b>				
<b>Contact: Justin Pearce 306-953-3492, <a href="mailto:justin.pearce@gov.sk.ca">justin.pearce@gov.sk.ca</a></b>				
<b>No Bid</b> * 6-532	File Cabinet, metal, lateral Grey, 4 drawer, drawers open and close properly and smoothly, 18" w x 28"d x 51"h. Good		\$1	
<b>No Bid</b> * 6-533	Projector, Kodak Carousel 4200 Black, comes with a corded remote and a power cord, unknown if operational. Good		\$1	SERM: 10-20-20
<b>PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Ave</b>				
<b>Contact: Suzanne Goota 306-941-7217, <a href="mailto:suzanne.goota2@gov.sk.ca">suzanne.goota2@gov.sk.ca</a></b>				
<b>No Bid</b> * 7-512	File Cabinet, metal, lateral 18"w x 28" d x 51" h, doors open properly, no lock. Fair		\$1	
<b>No Bid</b> * 7-513	File Cabinet, metal, lateral 18"w x 28" d x 51" h, doors open properly, no lock. Fair		\$1	
<b>No Bid</b> * 7-514	File Cabinet, metal, lateral 18"w x 28" d x 51" h, locks, no key, doors open properly. Fair		\$1	
<b>No Bid</b> * 7-515	File Cabinet, metal, lateral 18"w x 28" d x 51" h, locks, no key, doors open properly. Fair		\$1	



Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>REGINA, Innovation Saskatchewan, 200 - 10 Research Dr</b>				
<b>Contact: Azmina Punjani 306-551-5106, azmina.punjani@innovationsask.ca or Nick Wilkes 306-539-9022, nick.wilkes@innovationsask.ca</b>				
<b>125.00 * 1-551</b>	<p>Desk, Reception, wood Previously used reception desk has been professionally dismantled and is ready for transport, includes the main counter sections (a durable quartz countertop - 2-piece, piece 1- 8'7" l x 31" w x 1-1/8" thick, piece2 – 7'7" l x 31" w x 1-1/8" thick, side panels, and internal shelving components, minimal wear and tear from previous use. This desk is being sold in its component pieces and will require reassembly. Assembly instructions are NOT included. Reassembly will require some technical skill and potentially additional tools and hardware.</p> <p>Please carefully inspect the photos and consider arranging a viewing to assess the completeness and condition of all parts before bidding.</p> <p>Due to the size and weight of the components, transporting this desk will require more than one person. The buyer will be responsible for arranging their own pickup and transportation of all desk components between 8:00 am - 4:30 pm Mon-Fri. Innovation Saskatchewan will not be responsible for any transport or haul. Viewings will be permitted by appointment only.</p>		\$100	
<b>REGINA, Legislative Assembly Service, 515 Henderson Drive</b>				
<b>Contact: Kadence McMillen 306-787-0337, kcmcmillen@legassembly.sk.ca or Karen Plumb 306-787-8167, kplumb@legassembly.sk.ca</b>				
<b>No Bid 8-501</b>	<p>Uninterruptable Power Supply with Batteries and Power Modules, Lot of 11 APC Symmetra 1 APC Symmetra LX UPS, SYAF16KRMT, 7 APC Symmetra LX Battery Module, SYBT5, 2 APC Symmetra LX Power Module, SYPM4KP, 1 APC Symmetra LX Power Module, SYPM4KPQ. UPS: 19"w x 27"d x 33"h, (shipping 42 x 24 x 40) 500lbs, each battery is 18 kg, 4 batteries in box, 3 loose, unknown what condition batteries are in, no power cord as it has to be direct wired into building power. Sold as is. UPS: QD1037260148, in-box batteries: 5D2007T60139, 5D2018T65313, 5D2018T65320, 5D2007T60123, loose batteries: 5D2005T15219, 5D2007T60147, 5D2007T60138, SYPM4KP, power modules: QD1513380215, AD2033110087, SYPM4KPQ power module: AQ2106210005, operational. Fair</p>		\$5,000	
<b>REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor &amp; Gaming Authority, 1702 Park St</b>				
<b>Contact: Kirsten Nelson 306-787-0179, knelson@slga.com or Tyrone Smith, tsmith1@slga.com</b>				
<b>No Bid * 5-652</b>	<p>Chairs, Lot of 4 fabric Blue, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Fair</p>		\$1	
<b>No Bid * 5-653</b>	<p>Chairs, Lot of 2 fabric Blue, 5 casters, adjustable seat height, black armrest. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Fair</p>		\$1	
<b>11.11 * 5-654</b>	<p>Chairs, Lot of 2 fabric Grey, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good</p>		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>No Bid * 5-660</b>	Chairs, Lot of 6 fabric, wood frame Assorted colours, dark blue, light blue, pink, teal, and brown. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Fair		\$1	
<b>16.50 * 5-679</b>	Desk, L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72" w x 36" d x 28" h, extension 42" w x 20" d x 28" h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$1	
<b>25.00 * 5-680</b>	Desk, U-Shaped, wood Burgundy, hutch side 70" w x 20" d x 29" h, hutch 66" w x 15" d x 37.5" h, middle 37.5" w x 24" d x 29" h, right side 70" w x 36" d x 29" h, entire 104" w x 70" d, 48" opening from left to right, currently disassembled, no assembly instructions, comes with hardware to assemble. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$1	
<b>No Bid * 5-663</b>	Desk, L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72" w x 36" d x 28" h, extension 42" w x 20" d x 28" h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$1	
<b>No Bid * 5-664</b>	Desk, L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72" w x 36" d x 28" h, extension 42" w x 20" d x 28" h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$1	
<b>15.00 * 5-665</b>	Desk, L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72" w x 36" d x 28" h, extension 42" w x 20" d x 28" h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$1	
<b>25.00 * 5-666</b>	Desk Riser, Varidesk, 49900, laminate, metal, wood Black, adjustable height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$1	
<b>10.10 * 5-672</b>	Pedestal, laminate, lateral Beige, no key, with casters, 3 drawer, 24.5" w x 17.5" d x 26.5" h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$1	
<b>5.00 * 5-674</b>	Standing Desk Work Station, Ergotron, laminate, steel Black, dual monitor and keyboard, adjustable height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$1	
<b>15.00 * 5-687</b>	Table, laminate, metal base Brown, round, 36" diameter x 29.5" h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$1	
<b>15.00 * 5-688</b>	Table, laminate, metal base Brown, round, 41.5" diameter x 29.5" h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>SASKATOON, Highways, 126 105th St E</b>				
<b>Contact Brett Button 306-933-5262, brett.button@gov.sk.ca or Shaun Bowditch 306-933-5265, Shaun.Bowditch@gov.sk.ca, Richard Leibel 306-933-5262, Richard.Leibel@gov.sk.ca</b>				
<b>4,444.44 * 5-573</b>	Grader 1995 John Deere 770BH RWD JD 6076 7.6L, inline 6, diesel standard 8 gears forward 4 reverse, rear axle tandem drive, single tire, tire size 17.5R25, Moe board 10 feet, GVW unknown, differential unknown, there is no key. , yellow, , 13,330 hours, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Motor knocks, burns oil, low compression and will not start. Transmission slips out of gear, exhaust is rusted out, pins and bushing seized and worn, numerous electrical issues, some lights not working, numerous hydraulic leaks, tires worn out cracked and leaking, right back tire flat, windshield cracked/chipped, motor/transmission/brakes/exhaust/windshield washer/wipers/paint/interior/lights/mirrors/horn poor, battery removed, minor exterior damage. As is where is	13,330 hours	\$4,000	548,968
<b>SASKATOON, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 910-60th Street East</b>				
<b>Contact: Trevor Targerson, 306-956-8844, trevor.targerson@gov.sk.ca or Shelly Brewster, 306-956-8815, shelly.brewster@gov.sk.ca</b>				
<b>80.00 8-518</b>	Cooler, 2001, QBD, 470011202 Part # 347026, 115V single phase, 30.5"w x 29.5"d x 78"hp, 4 racks, leaks from refrigerant line, non-operational, cannot be recharged without being repaired, view PDF for repair quote. Broken Repairable		\$1	1BX130104229131
<b>SASKATOON, Parks, Culture and Sport, 1100 - 3530 Millar Ave</b>				
<b>Contact Nicole Lester 306-290-8460, nicole.lester@gov.sk.ca or Jason Lessard 306-221-2632, jason.lessard@gov.sk.ca</b>				
<b>28.00 8-527</b>	Air Cart System, Breathing bottled air cart system with breathing pack. Excellent		\$1	3AL2216
<b>1,000.11 8-528</b>	Self Contained Breathing Apparatus, MSA SCBA, 5-978-1 Apparatus, included in case, compressed cylinder holds air, straps and harness in excellent condition, facepiece and carry frame in good condition, stored indoors, pressure reduction and demand regulator, not serviced in a few years, operational, pressure gauge, low-pressure warning device, monitoring and alarm system all operational. Excellent		\$1	DG104928
<b>1,000.11 8-529</b>	Self Contained Breathing Apparatus, MSA SCBA, 5-978-1 Apparatus, included in case, compressed cylinder holds air, straps and harness in excellent condition, facepiece and carry frame in good condition, stored indoors, pressure reduction and demand regulator, not serviced in a few years, operational, pressure gauge, low-pressure warning device, monitoring and alarm system all operational. Excellent		\$1	DG104870
<b>80.00 8-530</b>	Self Contained Breathing Apparatus, MSA SCBA, 5-978-1 Apparatus, included in case, compressed cylinder holds air, straps and harness in excellent condition, facepiece and carry frame in good condition, stored indoors, pressure reduction and demand regulator, not serviced in a few years, operational, pressure gauge, low-pressure warning device, monitoring and alarm system all operational. Excellent		\$1	DG104896

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
80.00 8-531	Self Contained Breathing Apparatus, MSA SCBA, 5-978-1 Apparatus, included in case, compressed cylinder holds air, straps and harness in excellent condition, facepiece and carry frame in good condition, stored indoors, pressure reduction and demand regulator, not serviced in a few years, operational, pressure gauge, low-pressure warning device, monitoring and alarm system all operational. Excellent		\$1	DG104890
80.00 8-532	Self Contained Breathing Apparatus, MSA SCBA, 5-978-1 Apparatus, included in case, compressed cylinder holds air, straps and harness in excellent condition, facepiece and carry frame in good condition, stored indoors, pressure reduction and demand regulator, not serviced in a few years, operational, pressure gauge, low-pressure warning device, monitoring and alarm system all operational. Excellent		\$1	DG127645
<b>SASKATOON, Saskatoon Public Library, 311 - 23rd St E.</b>				
<b>Contact Brian MacLean 306-290-9450, b.maclean@saskatoonlibrary.ca</b>				
No Bid * 7-537	Chair, mesh, fabric Black, 5 castor, adjustable height and arms, not all controls work perfectly. Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 7-539	File Cabinet, Steelcase, metal 15"w x 28.5"d x 51"h, grey with orange doors, 4 drawers, needs replacement S123 key. Fair		\$1	
6.50 * 7-541	Magazine Rack, wood 3'w x 1' 1"d x 5' 1"h, brown, four shelves. Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 7-542	Pamphlet/Booklet Rack, wood, metal 19.25"w x 16"d x 60"h, black with brown sides, 22 holders. Fair		\$1	
<b>SASKATOON, Saskatchewan Research Council, 143-111 Research Drive</b>				
<b>Contact Roger Dauvin 306-385-4035, roger.dauvin@src.sk.ca</b>				
4,308.08 8-519	Van, 2012 Chevrolet Express 3500 EXT RWD6L, V8, gasauto Air, tilt, cruise, AM/FM CD, 4 keys Cargo barrier, beacon - operational, 2" receiver, backup alarm, trailer brake controller, GVW 2928 lbs, 6 speed transmission, tire size 245/75R16greyTOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 229,924kmKNOWN PROBLEMS: Cracked windshield, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> As is, where is	229,924km	\$1	1GAZGZFG5C1135896
<b>SASKATOON, Saskatchewan Research Council, Bay 2D 820 51st St E</b>				
<b>Contact Aamir Bakhsh 306-370-8011, Aamir.Bakhsh@src.sk.ca or Gina Zimmer 306-250-9690, gina.zimmer@src.sk.ca</b>				
450.00 8-534	Door, overhead, Steelcraft, large 1 pallet, 7 panels, 2' x 12', disassembled, sold as is, may require additional parts to install. Fair		\$200	
350.00 8-535	Door, overhead, Steelcraft, small 1 pallet, 4 panels - 2' x 8', disassembled, sold as is, may require additional parts to install. Fair		\$200	
25.00 8-536	Mixer Motors, Lot of 3 1 pallet, photos include name plates, unknown if operational. Good		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
148.98 8-537	Motor, large 1 pallet, photo of nameplate included, unable to use as it is not CSA approved, unknown if operational. Good		\$1	
15.50 8-538	Motor, medium Photo of nameplate included, unable to use as it is not CSA approved, unknown if operational. Good		\$1	
27.55 8-539	Motors, Lot of 2 small Photo of nameplate included, unable to use as it is not CSA approved, unknown if operational. Good		\$1	
No Bid 8-540	Pipe Fittings, grooved 5 pallets, never used or installed. New- Unused		\$500	
15.00 8-541	Vibrators, Lot of 3 small For hopper/bin, 0.37kw, 380V, 2850r/min., not CSA approved, unknown if operational. Good		\$1	
<b>SASKATOON, Western Canada Lottery Corporation , 1914 1st Ave North</b>				
<b>Contact: David Tutka 306-933-6926, tutkad@sk-wclc.com</b>				
3,020.10 8-507	Van 2017 Dodge Grand Caravan SE FWD 3.6L, V6, gas auto Air, tilt, cruise, AM/FM CD, power locks/windows GVW 2745KG, cargo barrier, rear cargo mat, 6 speed transmission, wheel base km 3078mm, tire size 225/65R17, 4 ply , white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 296,454 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: passenger sliding door latch broken, power door locks works intermittently, radio non-operational, battery is dead, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is	296,454	\$1	2C4RDGBG8HR582252
<b>THE BATTLEFORDS PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks, Culture &amp; Sport, Cochin, The Battlefords Provincial Park - Call for Directions</b>				
<b>Contact: Darcy Ouellete, 306-386-2212, darcy.ouellette@gov.sk.ca</b>				
312.00 8-509	Lawn Sprayer, Hardi Unknown if operational, parked for several years. Fair		\$1	
*WD 8-510	Post Pounder, Wheat Heart High and Heavy Hitter Unknown if operational, parked for several years. Poor		\$1	208,919
4,400.44 8-511	Rock Picker, Cherrington Unknown if operational, parked for several years. Good		\$1	
750.00 8-512	Tool Box Topper, Weather stripping on doors is coming off. Fair		\$1	
1,299.89 8-508	Trailer, 2002 Trail Tech Utility 7' x 12' GVW 2998 lbs, 2-inch ball receiver, comes with 1 new spare tire with rim, tire size ST205/75R15 KNOWN PROBLEMS: wiring connector is missing, lights non-operational. minor exterior damage.> As is, where is		\$1	2CUBFBC2622011358
737.73 8-513	Wood Chipper, Split Fire Tires are no good, unknown if operational, not used for several years. Fair		\$1	