
SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #7
From Oct 01 to Oct 08, 2025

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

SALE SUMMARY LIST

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as 
described.  Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding.  Vehicles 
and equipment are sold “AS IS, WHERE IS”, there is no implied or express warranty. 

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.
     - Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
     - SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.
It is the Bidder’s responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.
Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.
Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways: 
     - by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
     - by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3300,
     - by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
     - by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1.
  (If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)
- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer)     This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry. 
WD = (Withdrawn)               This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller. 
No Bid =                                  Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

10/9/2025,10:17 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  1
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REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca

S 2,877.00 7-004 Car 2013 CHEVROLET Impala LS FWD 3.6L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 
power mirrors/locks/windows/trunk release/left front seat, keyless entry-2 keys, 2 fobs , 
grey, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be 
signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 233,254 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Exhaust manifold leak, flex pipe/Y pipe damage, stabilizer bar cracked, rack and pinion 
binding, sway bar cracked, links, bushing-bar-steering rack failed dead spots while turning, oil 
change needed.
Hood scratches/chips, both bumpers’ scratches/chips, left and right rear fenders scratches, 
left side doors rust inside bottom, roof chips/scratches, trunk lid scratches/badge, no first aid 
kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

233,254 km $1,927 2G1WA5E32D1169169

S 2,677.00 7-008 Car 2009 FORD Focus SE FWD 2.0L, inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 
power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 keys, 1 fob , red, TOW ONLY, 
This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes 
full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, 
where is” condition., 133,292 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Rear lateral links-
bushings blown, front sway bar bushing-play, right inner tie rod play, rear trail arm bushing 
damage, wheel alignment needed-parts needed, front rotors-rust out inside, rockers showing 
surface rust-pass.
Hood scratches/chips, both bumpers’ scratches/weathered, left front fender clear coat 
peeling, left rear fender dent, right rear fender dent, both dog legs rust, both rocker panels 
road rash/surface rust, left rear door dent/chips/road rash, right rear door road rash, trunk lid 
scratches, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, mirrors chrome/both mirrors 
pitted, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

133,292 km $1,520 1FAHP35N09W115640

10/9/2025,10:17 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  2
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S 3,275.00 7-002 Car 2009 FORD Focus SE FWD 2.0L, inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 
power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 keys, 2 fobs , grey, TOW ONLY, 
This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes 
full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, 
where is” condition., 137,120 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Front links, both 
rear lateral links, oil leak.
Grille chrome pitted/peeling, hood chips/scratches, front bumper weathered, left side 
fenders scratches/road rash, right front fender road rash, right rear fender dents, both dog 
legs road rash/rust, both rocker panels road rash, left rear door dents, right front door road 
rash, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield small chips, left and right both chrome 

itt d b tt i t i d > A i h i

137,120 km $1,770 1FAHP35N09W115637

S 2,775.00 7-005 Car 2009 FORD Focus SE FWD 2.4L, inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 
power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-1 key, 1 fob , blue, TOW ONLY, 
This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes 
full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, 
where is” condition., 132,319 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Rough idle, both 
front lateral links, right rear wheel bearing, rear shocks, front pads/rotors, wiper blades.
Hood hail/scratches, both bumpers’ scratches, both dog legs rust, left rear door rust at 
bottom, roof hail/small rust spots, trunk lid hail, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, both mirrors 
chrome pitted, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

132,319 km $1,850 1FAHP35N29W115641
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S No Bid 7-007 Truck 2018 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 4WD, crew cab, 6'6" box 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, 
cruise, AM/FM, power mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry-1 key, 1 fob front tow hooks, 
wigwags on grille/headache rack, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer 
brakes, box liner, headache rack, beacon, Brute tool-box commercial class 1 key locks 
intermittent, has back seat, grey, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A 
TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI 
Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required 
inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 387,040 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Both lower ball joints, right inner tie rod, front rotors, rear 
pads/rotors, alignment needed, oil low/oil change due, both wiper blades.
Hood scratches/dents/chips, front bumper bent/chips, rear bumper chips/scratches, left 
front fender road rash/scratches, left rear fender road rash/dents/scratches, right front 
fender road rash, right rear fender dents/scratches/road rash, left front door dent/scratches, 
right front door dent/scratch, roof small stone chips/dent, tailgate scratches/dents, no first 
aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat sagging, tool box dented, all seat 
soiled, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

387,040 km $5,771 3GCUKNEC5JG158729
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REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca

*WD 5.00 * 4-122 Disposable Emergency Stretcher,    Weave canvas, black.  Excellent $10

S No Bid * 4-101 Flashlights, Lot of 6  Garrity 5 hand held, 1 other, with 2-6V batteries.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 2-106 Rear Seat,    Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, head rest loose.  Fair $5

S No Bid * 2-107 Rear Seat,    Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, rear trim loose.  Fair $5

S No Bid * 2-108 Rear Seat,    Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, seat belt buckle not 
protruding.  fair

$5

S No Bid * 2-109 Rear Seat,    Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row.  Fair $5

S 3.00 * 4-119 Shovel,    Wooden shaft 50”l, metal scoop 14.5”w x 18”d.   Poor $1

S 77.77 7-101 Sprayer,   Chaplin Pro Series, Model 61500, plastic 15 litre, backpack, operational.  Good $70

S No Bid * 6-102 Tires, Set of 3  LT265/70R/17, Sumitomo Encounter AT, Snowflake, Load Range E  
Manufacture date, week 16, year 2024.  Good

$600

S 161.00 7-102 Toolbox,   Brute Commercial Class, Gullwing Chest  71” long x 20” wide, tray inside box, 2 
keys, removed from a 2014 Ram 2500.  Good

$150 800,194

S 27.00 7-103 Vehicle Kit,   Canadian Tire Winter Safety kit 12 pieces, tow strap, traction aid, booster cables, 
flashlight, batteries, fleece blanket, torque, knit gloves, hand warmers, snow brush, scraper, 

b G d

$20

S 16.00 7-104 Vehicle Kit,   Voyageur 10 pieces, 94" booster cables, S.O.S sign, blanket, shovel, siphon hose, 
6" glow stick, 2 candles and matches, emergency poncho, flashlight, carrying case.  Good

$10

S No Bid * 4-130 Chair,   Swivel, cloth Black, 5 caster, adjustable height, no arms.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 4-132 Chair,   Swivel, cloth Blue, 5 caster, adjustable height and arms.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 4-133 Chair,   Swivel, cloth Grey, 5 caster, adjustable height, no arms.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 4-135 Chairs, Lot of 2  Swivel, mesh Green, 5 caster, adjustable height no arms.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 4-136 Chairs, Lot of 3  Swivel, mesh back Black, 5 caster, adjustable height, arms worn, seats soiled.  
Poor

$1
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S No Bid * 4-137 Desk,   L-Shape Pepperdust, 72" w x 36" d x 29" h, return attached pedestal 2 drawers, 42" w 
x 19.25" d x 29" h attach pedestal 2 drawers, no locks, keyboard mount not attached, screws 
included.  Poor

$1

S No Bid * 4-138 Desk,   L-Shape Pepperdust, 72" w x 36" d x 29" h, return, 42" w x 19" d x 29" h, pedestal 18" 
w x 24.5" d x 26.5" h on wheels,  locks, no key, keyboard tray mount underneath, screws 
included.  Poor

$1

S 1.00 * 4-139 Drafting Table,   wood, laminate 52"w x 30"d x 31"h.  Poor $1

S 1.12 * 9-118 Keyboard Holder Mount,   metal 30"w x 11"d, bracket 17"w x 7"d, black.  Fair $1

S 1.20 7-105 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, Color LaserJet, CP4025DN Operational (powers on, no noises, no 
further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 JPBCB7D02Y

S 1.20 7-106 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, Color LaserJet, M750dn, MFP Operational (powers on, no noises, 
no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CNDCJ140LB

S No Bid 7-107 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Enterprise 600, M602X Operational (powers on, no 
noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CNDCG5W10S

S No Bid 7-108 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Enterprise 600, M602X Operational (powers on, no 
noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, with power cord.  Fair

$1 CNBCD5N3B8

S 61.00 7-109 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Enterprise, M608X Operational (powers on, no noises, no 
further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CNBCKDT08S

S 61.00 7-110 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Enterprise, M608X Operational (powers on, no noises, no 
further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CNBCLBS1SW

S 10.00 7-111 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Enterprise, M651DN Operational (powers on, no noises, 
no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 JPCCG6Y0SS

S No Bid 7-112 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Enterprise, M652DN Operational (powers on, no noises, 
no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 JPBCKC115K

S 11.00 7-113 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Enterprise, M652DN Operational (powers on, no noises, 
no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 JPBCM192TB

10/9/2025,10:17 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  6
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S No Bid 7-114 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Enterprise, M652DN, floor model Operational, on wheels, 
(powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 JPBCM4G05T

S 67.77 7-115 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Pro, M477FDN, Color MFP Operational (powers on, no 
noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 VNCKM1H2C3

S 67.77 7-116 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Pro, M477FDN, Color MFP Operational (powers on, no 
noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, with power cord.  Fair

$1 VNBKK9725R

S 67.77 7-117 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Pro, M479FDN, Color MFP Operational (powers on, no 
noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 MXBCM7H05N

S 67.77 7-118 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Pro, M479FDN, Color MFP Operational (powers on, no 
noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 MXBCMBX1QS

S 61.00 7-119 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet, M528F, MFP Operational (powers on, no noises, no 
further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 MXBCM4P1BN

S No Bid 7-120 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet, P4015X Operational (powers on, no noises, no further 
testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CNDYB25957

S No Bid 7-121 Printer,   Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet, P4015X Operational (powers on, no noises, no further 
testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, with power cord.  Fair

$1 CNDYC34914
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BLACKSTRAP PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks, Culture & Sport, Dundurn SK, PO Box 104

Contact Sean Antoniuk 306-371-1616, sean.antoniuk@gov.sk.ca

S 2,525.25 7-536 Van 2008 DODGE Grand Caravan 2WD 3.3L, V6, gas auto A/C, cruise, AM/FM GVW 6050 kg, 6 
gears, single rear axel, standard differential, single tire, tire size 225/65R16, 2 ply, white, 
TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection.  It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). 
Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs 
if required. , 144,661 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Needs new tires and battery, brakes are 
rusty, body has minor rust and damage, windshield is cracked, no back seats, poor battery, 
minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

144,661 km $1 1D4HN11H08B139918

MEADOW LAKE Provincial Park, Parks, Culture and Sport, Meadow Lake Provincial Park Maintenance Yard - Call for Directions

Contact Heath Harpham 306-839-7323, heath.harpham@gov.sk.ca

S 1,651.00 7-551 Truck - Parts Only 2008 GMC Sierra 2500HD 4WD, Ext Cab, 3/4 Ton  6.0L, V8, gas auto A/c, 
cruise, tilt AM/FM radio GVW 4,173 kg, tire size LT245/75R16E, white, FOR PARTS ONLY, NO 
SGI INSPECTION.**THIS VEHICLE IS FOR RECYCLING PURPOSES ONLY AND NOT FOR RESALE. 
THIS VEHICLE CANNOT BE REGISTERED WITHIN ANY JURISDICTION. **, Approx.. 250,600 km, , 
KNOWN PROBLEMS:  Alternator is not mounted properly, tailgate missing, keys missing, body 
has lots of rust, at least one tire is completely flat, truck has not been running in years, 
electrical system may be damaged, estimated mileage from oil change notes: 250,600 kms. 
This truck is a TOW ONLY vehicle.  This truck will not run.  poor battery, minor exterior 
damage.>, As is, where is

Approx.. 
250,600 km

$1  1GTHK29K38E209468

S 451.00 7-550 Truck- Parts Only 2005 CHEVROLET 2500HD 4WD, Ext Cab, 3/4 Ton  6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, 
tilt, one key GVW 4,173 kg, single rear axel, tire size LT245/75R16, white, FOR PARTS ONLY, 
NO SGI INSPECTION.**THIS VEHICLE IS FOR RECYCLING PURPOSES ONLY AND NOT FOR 
RESALE. THIS VEHICLE CANNOT BE REGISTERED WITHIN ANY JURISDICTION. **, km unknown, 
, KNOWN PROBLEMS: Condition of motor, transmission, brakes, A/C  and horn unknown, 
poor tires, tailgate, rear bumper, back-left window, instrument cluster, driver seat, radiator & 
fan, exhaust parts and step bars all missing, ¾ of lights missing, poor windshield washer & 
wipers lots of rust.  This truck is a TOW ONLY vehicle.  It is for parts only.  Will not run.  This 
truck has been parted out - including the instrument cluster and therefore the mileage 
cannot be checked., poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

km 
unknown

$1 1GCHK29U65E302644
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OUTLOOK, Agriculture, 901 McKenzie St. S

Contact Stacey Stutters 306-867-5500 stacey.stutters@gov.sk.ca or Tammie Wood 306-787-8034, tammie.wood@gov.sk.ca

S 288.80 7-552 Soil Sample Drying Oven,   metal 26" w x 22"d x 29"h, operational.  Fair $1

S 2,600.00 7-553 Trailer year unknown Home built  metal, wood    Flat deck, 20'l x  6'10" w, 2 5/16”, ball 
hookup, tires size, ST225/ 75R15, 7 pin connection, lights operational, , , , , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS: slight bend on frame at back, this trailer has never been registered through SGI 
and, as such, has never had a license plate affixed to it. SGI may have to generate and supply 
a new VIN number to this trailer, so contact with SGI could be necessary if you want to plate 
this trailer and have it legal to drive on roadways., As is, where is

$500

S 1,300.00 7-554 Trailer year unknown Weigh wagon DWS-100-10 metal    Frame, 12'l x 4'3" w, grain tank, 8' l x 
4'3" w x 5' h, 2" ball hookup, 4 pin connection, tire size, G78- 15, frame is in good condition, , 
, , , KNOWN PROBLEMS: scale and lights non-operational, this trailer has never been 
registered through SGI and, as such, has never had a license plate affixed to it. SGI may have 
to generate and supply a new VIN number to this trailer, so contact with SGI could be 
necessary if you want to plate this trailer and have it legal to drive on roadways., As is, where 
is

$150

PRINCE ALBERT, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, 3021 1st Ave W

Contact Don Balan 306-961-8232, donald.balan@gov.sk.ca or Darcy Perlitz, darcy.perlitz@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 5-675 Blankets, Lot of 2  Homemade, synthetic fiber 42”w x 80”l, thin padding, one is green grey 
with rips, one is dark grey does not have any major rips but seams are coming out.  Poor

$1

PRINCE ALBERT, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, 3021 1st Ave W

Contact Don Balan 306-961-8232, donald.balan@gov.sk.ca or Derek Skrudland, derek.skrudland@gov.sk.ca

S 112.00 7-549 Clothing Racks, Lot of 56  metal 5 feet long, on wheels.  Good $1

PRINCE ALBERT, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, 3021 1st Ave W

Contact Tonya Granberg 306-953-3005, tonya.granberg@gov.sk.ca or Nola Boechler, nola.boechler@gov.sk.ca

S 10.89 7-555 Roaster Oven,   Rival, 18 quart Operational, fits 22lb turkey, heavy duty lid, stainless steel 
housing, variable temp control, in box.  Fair

$1 RO1855B-3BS-033

S 10.89 7-556 Roaster Oven,   Rival, 18 quart Operational, fits 22lb turkey, heavy duty lid, stainless steel 
housing, variable temp control, in box.   Fair

$1 RO1855B-3BS-033
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S 10.89 7-557 Roaster Oven,   Rival, 18 quart Operational, fits 22lb turkey, heavy duty Lid, stainless steel 
housing, variable temp control, no box.  Fair

$1 RO1855B-3BS-033

S 10.89 7-558 Roaster Oven,   Rival, 18 quart Operational, fits 22lb turkey, heavy duty Lid, stainless steel 
housing, variable temp control, no box.  Fair

$1 RO1855B-3BS-033

PRINCE ALBERT, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, RM 114 - 800 Central Ave

Contact Carla Chadwick 306-953-2897, carla.chadwick@gov.sk.ca or Ariel Kasko 306-953-2322, ariel.kasko@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 5-676 Chairs, Lot of 8  vinyl, pleather  Black, 5 castor, adjustable height, some have wear, the odd 
tear and some have some other marks.  Fair

$1

PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Polytechnic, 1100-15th St E

Contact Ken Pichula 306-765-1585, pashipping@saskpolytech.ca or Leslie Morin 306-765-1585, pashipping@saskpolytec.ca

S 5.55 * 5-537 Amplifier,   Tortech, PA1060 Public address amplifier, operational.  Good $1 SADJ2004-0246756

PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 47 - 12th St

Contact: Justin Pearce 306-953-3492, justin.pearce@gov.sk.ca

S 5.00 * 6-517 Blood Pressure Monitor,   Bp Tru Light grey blood pressure monitor with 3 cuffs (s, m, l), it 
has a plug-in cord and is operational, with user manual.  Good

$1 SK8573

S 2.00 * 6-518 Blood Pressure Monitor,   Life Source UA-767 Plus Grey blood pressure monitor with 2 cuffs, 
missing the power cord, unknown if operational.  Good

$1 SERM: 99-13-51

S 21.89 * 6-519 Cabinet,   Wood 3 shelves and 2 drawers, 36' w x  21" d x 76" h, with glass doors, very good 
condition, door and drawers work excellent.  Good

$1

S 7.50 * 6-530 CD Player,   MP3 Brand Blue and silver CD player and radio, potential for MP3 hook-up, has a 
power cord, operational.  Good

$1

S 3.50 * 6-531 Speaker System,   with Subwoofer, Altec Lansing VS 4121 Black and silver, has cable, user 
guide, unknown if operational.    Good

$1

S No Bid * 6-532 File Cabinet,   metal, lateral Grey, 4 drawer, drawers open and close properly and smoothly, 
18" w x 28"d x 51"h.  Good

$1

S No Bid * 6-533 Projector,   Kodak Carousel 4200 Black, comes with a corded remote and a power cord, 
unknown if operational.  Good

$1 SERM: 10-20-20

S 7.58 * 6-534 Speaker System,   with Subwoofer, Logitech Z-2300 Black and silver, has remote, unknown if 
operational.  Good

$1 PID: A524
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PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Ave

Contact: Suzanne Goota 306-941-7217, suzanne.goota2@gov.sk.ca

S 30.00 7-504 Bottles, Lot of 1750  plastic Clear, 1 liter, with caps.  New- Unused $1

S 103.25 7-505 Chainsaws, Lot of 2  STHIL 036 45cc, over 20 years old, parts no longer available, unknown if 
operational.  Broken Repairable

$1

S 55.69 7-506 Chainsaws, Lot of 2  STIHL 036 45cc, over 20 years old, parts no longer available, unknown if 
operational.  Broken Repairable

$1

S 151.00 7-507 Chainsaws, Lot of 2  STIHL 036 45cc, over 20 years old, parts no longer available, unknown if 
operational.  Broken Repairable

$1

S 103.25 7-508 Chainsaws, Lot of 2  STIHL 036 45cc, over 20 years old, parts no longer available, unknown if 
operational.  Broken Repairable

$1

S 103.25 7-509 Chainsaws, Lot of 2  STIHL 036 45cc, over 20 years old, parts no longer available, unknown if 
operational.  Broken Repairable

$1

S 203.00 7-510 Chainsaws, Lot of 2  STIHL 036 45cc, over 20 years old, parts no longer available, unknown if 
operational.  Broken Repairable

$1

S 2.00 7-511 Door,   metal 36"w x 2"d x 83" h, does not include frame, lock operational, no keys.  Good $1

S No Bid 7-512 File Cabinet,   metal, lateral 18"w x 28"d x 51" h, doors open properly, no lock.  Fair $1

S No Bid 7-513 File Cabinet,   metal, lateral 18"w x 28"d x 51" h, doors open properly, no lock.  Fair $1

S No Bid 7-514 File Cabinet,   metal, lateral 18"w x 28"d x 51" h, locks, no key, doors open properly.  Fair $1

S No Bid 7-515 File Cabinet,   metal, lateral 18"w x 28"d x 51" h, locks, no key, doors open properly.  Fair $1

S 222.22 7-516 Pallet Jack,   with scale, BFC6 / BFC6-II Electric, 2000kg capacity, forks 45 1/2"l x 28 "w, comes 
with battery and charger, operational.  Good

$1

S 20.00 7-517 Quad Tire,   Cheng Shin 22 x 11.00 - 8, studded, tubeless.  Fair $1

S 29.89 7-518 Tire,   steel belted Radial with rim, P215/70R15.  Good $1

S 160.00 7-519 Tires, Set of 4  WinterQuest 225 / 65R 17 102H, without rims.  Good $1

S 120.00 7-520 Water Pump,   Honda, WB 20 XT Non-operational.  Broken Repairable $1 ABT1212603

S 120.00 7-521 Water Pump,   Honda, WB 20 XT Non-operational.  Broken Repairable $1

S 120.00 7-522 Water Pump,   Honda, WB 20 XT Non-operational.  Broken Repairable $1 ABT1387152
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S 120.00 7-523 Water Pump,   Honda, WB 20 XT Non-operational.  Broken Repairable $1 5,096,629

S 25.25 7-524 Water Pump,   Intek 206 Briggs & Stratton 1 1/2" suction and discharge, unknown if 
operational.  Poor

$1

S 25.25 7-525 Water Pump,   Power Fist  6.5 HP, 2 inch suction and discharge size, unknown if operational.  
Poor

$1

S 25.25 7-526 Water Pump,   Power Fist  6.5 HP, 2 inch suction and discharge size, unknown if operational.  
Poor

$1

S 29.00 7-527 Water Pump,   Power Fist  6.5 HP, 2 inch suction and discharge size, unknown if operational.  
Poor

$1

S 67.99 7-528 Water Pumps, Lot of 6  Waterous Floto The manufacture discontinued production of pumps 
and parts 5 years ago, have been culled as they return from the field broken, requires repairs. 
Broken Repairable

$1

S 60.00 7-529 Water Pumps, Lot of 6  Waterous Floto The manufacture discontinued production of pumps 
and parts 5 years ago, have been culled as they returned from the field broken, requires 
repairs.  Broken Repairable

$1

S 75.00 7-530 Water Pumps, Lot of 6  Waterous Floto The manufacture discontinued production of pumps 
and parts 5 years ago, have been culled as they returned from the field broken, requires 
repairs.  Broken Repairable

$1

S 55.55 7-531 Water Pumps, Lot of 6  Waterous Floto The manufacture discontinued production of pumps 
and parts 5 years ago, have been culled as they returned from the field broken, requires 
repairs.  Broken Repairable

$1

S 55.55 7-532 Water Pumps, Lot of 6  Waterous Floto The manufacture discontinued production of pumps 
and parts 5 years ago, have been culled as they returned from the field broken, requires 
repairs.  Broken Repairable

$1

S 55.55 7-533 Water Pumps, Lot of 6  Waterous Floto The manufacture discontinued production of pumps 
and parts 5 years ago, have been culled as they returned from the field broken, requires 
repairs.  Broken Repairable

$1

S 125.00 7-534 Water Pumps, Lot of 6  Waterous Floto The manufacture discontinued production of pumps 
and parts 5 years ago, have been culled as they returned from the field broken, requires 
repairs.  Broken Repairable

$1 various

S 125.00 7-535 Water Pumps, Lot of 6  Waterous Floto The manufacture discontinued production of pumps 
and parts 5 years ago have been culled as they returned from the field broken requires

$1 Various
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REGINA, Corrections, Policing & Public Safety, 1850-1881 Scarth St.

Contact Brittany Stachura 306-787-5991, brittany.stachura@gov.sk.ca or Brenda Kelly 306-787-7009, brenda.kelly@gov.sk.ca

S 12.75 7-546 Kraft Paper,   roll Brown, 36" x 1000'. *Online Viewing Only* Good $1

S 6.75 7-547 Kraft Paper,   roll Brown, 24" x 1000'. *Online Viewing Only* Fair $1

S 5.00 7-548 Tying Twine,   Polypropylene 7,000 feet, green and white. *Online Viewing Only* Fair $1

REGINA, Innovation Saskatchewan, 200 - 10 Research Dr

Contact: Azmina Punjani 306-551-5106, azmina.punjani@innovationsask.ca or Nick Wilkes 306-539-9022, nick.wilkes@innovationsask.ca

S No Bid * 1-551 Desk,   Reception, wood Previously used reception desk has been professionally dismantled 
and is ready for transport, includes the main counter sections (a durable quartz countertop - 
2-piece, piece 1- 8’7” l x 31” w x 1-1/8” thick, piece2 – 7’7” l x 31” w x 1-1/8” thick, side 
panels, and internal shelving components, minimal wear and tear from previous use. This 
desk is being sold in its component pieces and will require reassembly. Assembly instructions 
are NOT included. Reassembly will require some technical skill and potentially additional 
tools and hardware.
Please carefully inspect the photos and consider arranging a viewing to assess the 
completeness and condition of all parts before bidding.
Due to the size and weight of the components, transporting this desk will require more than 
one person. The buyer will be responsible for arranging their own pickup and transportation 
of all desk components between 8:00 am - 4:30 pm Mon-Fri. Innovation Saskatchewan will 
not be responsible for any transport or haul. Viewings will be permitted by appointment only. 
G d

$300

REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor & Gaming Authority, 1702 Park St

Contact: Kirsten Nelson 306-787-0179, knelson@slga.com or Tyrone Smith, tsmith1@slga.com

S No Bid * 5-652 Chairs, Lot of 4  fabric Blue, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Fair

$20

S No Bid * 5-653 Chairs, Lot of 2  fabric Blue, 5 casters, adjustable seat height, black armrest.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Fair

$10

S No Bid * 5-654 Chairs, Lot of 2  fabric Grey, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$10

S No Bid * 5-660 Chairs, Lot of 6  fabric, wood frame Assorted colours, dark blue, light blue, pink, teal, and 
brown.

$5

S 10.00 * 5-677 Desk,   laminate, metal Brown, 1 drawer, 36”w x 24”d x29.5”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$10
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S No Bid * 5-679 Desk,   L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72”w x 36”d x 28”h, extension 42”w x 20”d x 28”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$25

S No Bid * 5-680 Desk,   U-Shaped, wood Burgundy, hutch side 70”w x 20”d x 29”h, hutch 66”w x 15”d x 
37.5’h, middle 37.5”w x 24”d x 29”h, right side 70”w x 36”d x 29”h, entire 104”w x 70”d, 48" 
opening from left to right, currently disassembled, no assembly instructions, comes with 
hardware to assemble.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good

$150

S No Bid * 5-663 Desk ,   L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72”w x 36”d x 28”h, extension 42”w x 20”d x 28”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$25

S No Bid * 5-664 Desk ,   L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72”w x 36”d x 28”h, extension 42”w x 20”d x 28”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$25

S No Bid * 5-665 Desk ,   L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72”w x 36”d x 28”h, extension 42”w x 20”d x 28”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$25

S No Bid * 5-666 Desk Riser,   Varidesk, 49900, laminate, metal, wood Black, adjustable height.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$75

S No Bid * 5-672 Pedestal,   laminate, lateral Beige, no key, with casters, 3 drawer, 24.5”w x 17.5”d x26.5”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$10

S 12.00 * 5-673 Pedestal,   laminate, lateral Beige, with key, no casters, 2 drawer, 24.5”w x 17.5”d x 26.5”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$10

S No Bid * 5-674 Standing Desk Work Station,   Ergotron, laminate, steel Black, dual monitor and keyboard, 
adjustable height.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$20

S No Bid * 5-687 Table,   laminate, metal base Brown, round,  36” diameter x 29.5”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$15

S No Bid * 5-688 Table,   laminate, metal base Brown, round, 41.5” diameter x 29.5”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$15

S 15.00 * 5-691 Table,   laminate, steel Mahogany, rectangle, 72”w x 30.25”d x 30”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$15

S 15.00 * 5-692 Table,   laminate, steel Mahogany, rectangle, 72”w x 30.25”d x 30”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$15
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SASKATOON, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, 910 - 60th St E

Contact: Renee Pound, 306-956-8817, renee.pound@gov.sk.ca or Danielle Corriveau 306-956-8869, danielle.corriveau@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 5-565 Chair,   leather Black, leather is peeling, arms are worn.  Poor $1
S No Bid * 5-566 Document Holders, Lot of 7  plastic Grey , 10 1/2"w  x 13 1/2"h x 1 1/2"thickness, with clip 

board.  Fair
$1

S No Bid * 5-567 File Folders, Lot of 14  Pendaflex A88GD-10, paper 14 boxes, 250 per box, end tabs folders 
with reinforced tab, letter size, full tab, 13.5 pt., ivory.  New- Unused

$1

S 50.00 * 5-569 Safety Toe Covers, Lot of 18  steel, rubber, Uline  2 small new, 2 small used, 3 medium new, 6 
medium used, 1 large new, 4 large used, white/red/yellow, slips quickly over shoes, sneakers 
and boots, complete sole coverage with slip-resistant tread.  Good

$1

S No Bid * 5-570 Tables, Lot of 2  wood Both pepperdust, 24" round x 18"h.  Fair $1

SASKATOON, Highways, 126 105th St E

Contact Richard Leibel 306-933-5262, Richard.Leibel@gov.sk.ca or Shaun Bowditch 306-933-5265, Shaun.Bowditch@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 5-573 Grader 1995 John Deere 770BH RWD JD 6076 7.6L, inline 6, diesel standard  8 gears forward 
4 reverse, rear axle tandem drive, single tire, tire size 17.5R25, Moe board 10 feet, GVW 
unknown, differential unknown, there is no key., yellow, , 13,330 hours, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS: Motor knocks, burns oil, low compression and will not start. Transmission slips 
out of gear, exhaust is rusted out, pins and bushing seized and worn, numerous electrical 
issues, some lights not working, numerous hydraulic leaks, tires worn out cracked and 
leaking, windshield cracked/chipped,   motor/transmission/brakes/exhaust/windshield 
washer/wipers/paint/interior/lights/mirrors/horn poor, battery removed, minor exterior 
damage.>, As is, where is

13,330 
hours

$8,000 548,968

SASKATOON, Highways, 126 105th St E

Contact Richard Leibel 306-933-5262, Richard.Leibel@gov.sk.ca 

S 6,650.00 7-501 Wheel Loader 1996 Komatsu WA-120-1 AWD Cummins 94 hp, inline 4, diesel manual 1 key, 
bucket 1 to 1.5 yards  3 gears forward 3 reverse, rear axle single, standard differential, single 
tire, tire size 17.5R25, GVW 8000 kg estimated, yellow, , 4,142 hours, ,  KNOWN PROBLEMS: 
Motor runs ok but leaks, transmission slips, exhaust is rusted out, bucket pins and bushing 
seized and worn, numerous electrical issues, rollover protective structure (ROPS) is rusted 
out, cab is rusted out, numerous hydraulic leaks, 
motor/transmission/brakes/exhaust/windshield/wipers/paint/interior/lights/mirrors/horn 
poor, AC/tilt/AM/FM not working, battery removed, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

4,142 hours $5,000 A20376
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SASKATOON, Saskatoon Public Library, 311 - 23rd St E.

Contact Brian MacLean 306-290-9450, b.maclean@saskatoonlibrary.ca

S No Bid 7-537 Chair,   mesh, fabric  Black, 5 castor, adjustable height and arms, not all controls work 
perfectly.  Poor

$1

S 3.00 7-538 Chair,   mesh, vinyl  Black, 5 castor, adjustable height and arms, not all controls work 
perfectly.  Poor

$1

S No Bid 7-539 File Cabinet,   Steelcase, metal 15"w x 28.5"d x 51"h, grey with orange doors, 4 drawers, 
needs replacement S123 key.  Fair

$1

S 30.00 7-540 Folding Tables, Lot of 3  plastic, metal  6'w x 2' 5"d x 2' 7"h, grey.  Fair $1

S No Bid 7-541 Magazine Rack,   wood 3'w x 1' 1"d x 5' 1"h, brown, four shelves.  Fair $1

S No Bid 7-542 Pamphlet/Booklet Rack,   wood, metal 19.25"w x 16"d x 60"h, black with brown sides, 22 
holders.  Fair

$1

S 7.00 7-543 Rug,   fabric 11' 6"w x 8' 2"d, colourful children's rug with continents and alphabet, oval.  Fair $1

S 7.00 7-544 Rug,   fabric 9'w x 6'd, colourful children's rug with trains and alphabet, rectangular.  Fair $1

SASKATOON, Saskatchewan Research Council, 820D 51st Street E

Contact Roger Dauvin 306-385-4035, roger.dauvin@src.sk.ca

S 7,767.00 7-545 Truck 2004 GMC Sierra 2500 4WD, Ext. Cab, Short Box, 3/4 Ton  6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, 
cruise, tilt, 1 key, 1 fob 4 gears, tires single, tire size 245/75R16, headache rack, spray-in box 
liner, gold, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection.  It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns 
exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full 
responsibility for repairs if required. ,  158,075 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: poor mechanical 
condition, runs and drives, but has check engine light and codes. Power windows and power 
locks work intermittently, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

 158,075 km $1 1GTGK29U54Z128889
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YORKTON, Highways, 245 York Road East

Contact Cory Palko 306-960-5152 or 306-621-7379, cory.palko@gov.sk.ca

S 21,333.00 7-502 Loader 1994 John Deere 544G 4WD 6059 TDW05, inline 6, diesel auto A/C unknown if 
operational, 1 key 3 yard bucket, GVW approx. 10,886 kg, 4 gears, limited slip differential, tire 
size 20.5R25, yellow, , 7,755 hours, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Coolant leaks, engine cover is 
corroded, rad is corroded badly, front differential bolts are corroded badly and could snap, 
alternator not charging, exhaust manifold gaskets need replacing, master switch is seized, oil 
cooler is badly corroded, steering pins and bushings have play in them, need frame bosses 
bored or sleeved, front fenders badly corroded with holes, all lift arms, z-bar pins, bucket 
pins, and bushings have wear and will not take grease, park brake pads need replacing, 
remaining parts of unit very corroded, tires in poor shape, rims are very corroded, cab is 
rusted out and ROPS needs replacement, poor lights/body exterior/exhaust/paint, poor 
battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

7,755 hours $1,500 44GB539446

S 6,666.00 7-503 Motor Grader 2006 Volvo G940 4WD D7E GBE3 7.2L, diesel Powershift, THE 840 A/C, tilt, 1 
key GVW 37,00lbs, 8 gears forward/4 reverse, tandem rear axel, APR70 differential, tire size 
445/8R25, front mount scarifier not included, yellow, , 11,298 hours, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: 
Needs engine replaced, poor transmission, tandem grease seals pushed out cannot replace, 
just need to replace bearings with the seals, differential is leaking, lights non-operational, 
circle needs adjustment, left turn circle leaking, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, 
where is

11,298 
hours

$1,500 40,103
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