
SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #6
From Sept 03 to Sept 10, 2025

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

SALE SUMMARY LIST

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as 
described.  Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding.  Vehicles 
and equipment are sold “AS IS, WHERE IS”, there is no implied or express warranty. 

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.
     - Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
     - SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.
It is the Bidder’s responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.
Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.
Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways: 
     - by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
     - by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3300,
     - by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
     - by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1.
  (If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)
- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer)     This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry. 
WD = (Withdrawn)               This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller. 
No Bid =                                  Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

9/10/2025,4:22 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  1



SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca

S 3,595.00 6-007 Car 2013 CHEVROLET Impala LS FWD 3.6L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 
power mirrors/locks/windows/left front seat/trunk release, keyless entry-2 keys, 2 fobs , white, 
TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes 
full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where 
is” condition., 251,959 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Both outer tie rod ends, 
left lower ball joint, front brake pads.
Hood dents/chips, front bumper chips/scratches, left side doors rust-inside bottom, roof rust 
front edge, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, right mirror housing broke, 
headlights fogged, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

251,959 
km

$2,862 2G1WA5E39D1186549

S 8,915.75 6-001 SUV 2012 CHEVROLET Suburban 2500 LS 4WD 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 
player, rear HVAC, power mirrors/locks/windows/left front seat, 1 key 6 passenger-no third row, 
front tow hooks, side steps, rear mud flaps worn out, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, 
roof rack-no key, rear storage space has plywood cover, partition, extra spare tire may not be 
compatible with vehicle, cargo barrier behind back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a 
FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle 
requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for 
repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 155,726 
km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: All rotors severely rusted, alignment needed, 
park brake sticking, both rear mud flaps broken, right rear rust on quarter panel, front bumper 
cracked, right front fender rust hole, exhaust leak possibility when cold.
Hood road rash/dents, front bumper chips/scratches/broken, rear bumper pad loose in back, 
left side fenders rusted, right front fender rust(hole), right rear fender rusted, no first aid kit/fire 
extinguisher, windshield chips, rear defroster not working, small hole in right front floor cover, 
poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

155,726 
km

$2,518 1GNWK5EG1CR195749
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S 26,500.00 6-003 Truck 2008 DODGE/RAM 5500 4WD, extended cab, Brand FX service body 6.7L, inline 6, diesel 
auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/locks/heated mirrors, 3 keys service 
body 6 compartments/2 beacons-fair condition, front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, inverter, 
trailer wiring, trailer brakes, HD rear bumper pintle hook, cabinets secured to floor, no rear seat 
or seat belts, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY 
Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be 
licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This 
vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 147,115 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and 
OBSERVATIONS: Both upper ball joints loose, park brake not working, head lights cloudy, left 
low beam head light not working, rear seat and belts missing.
Hood hail, both bumpers’ faded/pitted/rust spots, rear bumper bent, left front fender chips, 
roof rust spots, 3 holes in roof sealed, wheel wrench/jack right rear front compartment/ OEM 
wrench/bar/extension socket, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, glass chips, left front seat cover 
worn/hole, head lights fogged, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

147,115 
km

$13,918 3D6WD78A28G226109

S 11,600.00 6-004 Van 2012 CHEVROLET Express 1500 Cargo AWD 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 
player, power locks/front windows, rear heat, keyless entry-2 key fobs, 3 GM keys, 1-extra roof 
rack with beacon, map box, cargo barrier, 2 shelves, plywood floor, converter-condition 
unknown , white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer 
must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 108,764 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Steering rack leaking, front wheel alignment, park brake not working, battery tray broken, 
license plate light is out, glove box lid broke, wires hanging at rear.
Grille big screen, hood paint poor, front and rear bumper faded/rusted/scratches, rear bumper 
cover loose, left front fender paint poor, left rear fender road rash, right front fender paint poor, 
right rear fender dent/rust/road rash, right side dog leg rust, right rocker panel dent/rust, left 
side rocker panel rust, right rear door dent/chips, tailgate chips/small dents, no first aid kit/fire 
extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat worn/sagging/vinyl cracked, poor battery, minor 
exterior damage.>, As is, where is

108,764 
km

$4,990 1GCSHAF40C1128979
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S 2,018.00 6-005 Van 2008 DODGE Grand Caravan Cargo FWD 3.3L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 
player, power windows/locks, keyless entry-2 key fobs cargo barrier, steel floor in cargo area, 
map box, roof rack brackets-no roof rack, hitch, no keys for map box or storage compartment at 
rear, handle mounted on roof at the rear, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI 
Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a 
PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 277,617 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Left outer tie rod, left lower ball joint, both front links, both 
quarter panels rusted out, A/C not cold.
Hood dents, front bumper broke, rear bumper scratches, left front fender rusted/dented, left 
rear fender badly rusted, both dog legs rusted, left rear door frame/trim bubbling, right front 
door frame dented/scratched/binds, right rear door trim cracked, 3 holes in roof sealed, tailgate 
rusting/paint cracked, wheel wrench missing, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, 
left front seat worn/sagging, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

277,617 
km

$900 1D4HN11H88B139925

9/10/2025,4:22 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  4



SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #6
From Sept 03 to Sept 10, 2025

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca

S 30.00 * 3-102 Cabinet,   metal Wall mount, suitable for keys, 100 internal hooks, black, locking, 1 key, 16.75”w 
x 3.75”d x 16.75”h, scratches in exterior and interior.  Fair

$25

S No Bid * 4-122 Disposable Emergency Stretcher,    Weave canvas, black.  Excellent $10

S No Bid * 4-101 Flashlights, Lot of 6  Garrity 5 hand held, 1 other, with 2-6V batteries.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 2-106 Rear Seat,    Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, head rest loose.  Fair $5

S No Bid * 2-107 Rear Seat,    Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, rear trim loose.  Fair $5

S No Bid * 2-108 Rear Seat,    Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, seat belt buckle not 
protruding.  fair

$5

S No Bid * 2-109 Rear Seat,    Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row.  Fair $5

S No Bid * 4-119 Shovel,    Wooden shaft 50”l, metal scoop 14.5”w x 18”d.   Poor $1

S 355.55 6-101 Tires, Set of 4  225/65R17, Firestone Winterforce, Snowflake, Studded on steel Rims Black, may 
be compatible with a 2020 Dodge Grand Caravan, manufacture date, week 33, year 2020.  Good

$300

S No Bid 6-102 Tires, Set of 3  LT265/70R/17, Sumitomo Encounter AT, Snowflake, Load Range E  Manufacture 
date, week 16, year 2024.  Good

$600

S 21.00 * 5-103 Triangle Warning Kit,   James King brand, model 1005 17”, 3 in kit, with storage box, box is 
broken.  Good

$20

S 21.00 * 5-104 Triangle Warning Kit,   James King brand, model 1005 17”, 3 in kit, with storage box.  Good $20

S No Bid * 4-130 Chair,   Swivel, cloth Black, 5 caster, adjustable height, no arms.  Fair $1
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S No Bid * 4-132 Chair,   Swivel, cloth Blue, 5 caster, adjustable height and arms.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 4-133 Chair,   Swivel, cloth Grey, 5 caster, adjustable height, no arms.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 4-135 Chairs, Lot of 2  Swivel, mesh Green, 5 caster, adjustable height no arms.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 4-136 Chairs, Lot of 3  Swivel, mesh back Black, 5 caster, adjustable height, arms worn, seats soiled.  
Poor

$1

S No Bid * 4-137 Desk,   L-Shape Pepperdust, 72" w x 36" d x 29" h, return attached pedestal 2 drawers, 42" w x 
19.25" d x 29" h attach pedestal 2 drawers, no locks, keyboard mount not attached, screws 
included.  Poor

$1

S No Bid * 4-138 Desk,   L-Shape Pepperdust, 72" w x 36" d x 29" h, return, 42" w x 19" d x 29" h, pedestal 18" w 
x 24.5" d x 26.5" h on wheels,  locks, no key, keyboard tray mount underneath, screws included.  
Poor

$1

S 50.00 * 4-139 Drafting Table,   wood, laminate 52"w x 30"d x 31"h.  Poor $1

S No Bid * 9-118 Keyboard Holder Mount,   metal 30"w x 11"d, bracket 17"w x 7"d, black.  Fair $1
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SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #6
From Sept 03 to Sept 10, 2025

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

CYPRESS HILLS INTERPROVINCIAL PARK, Parks, Culture & Sport, Maintenance Yard - Call for Directions

Contact Wayne Welte 306-662-5419, wayne.welte@gov.sk.ca or Maggie Wenzel 306-661-7138, maggie.wenzel@gov.sk.ca

S 211.00 * 5-601 Truck Topper,   Arrow 100" long, has metal rack on top, red, removed off of a 1998 Ford long 
box.  Fair

$1

DUCK MOUNTAIN, Corrections, Policing, and Public Safety, 51°38'14"N, 101°38'27"W, or 51.63715, -101.6408, 25 km east of the town of Kamsack, extending into Manitoba

Contact Travis Hourd 639-941-7074, travis.hourd@gov.sk.ca or Tristin Tkachyk 306-590-7198, tristin.tkachyk@gov.sk.ca

S 200.00 6-503 Trailer 1995 Homebuilt     Metal, 2" ball coupler, deck is 121"l x 101"w x 25"h, length of trailer 
with receiver is 173", 7 pin round connector, tire size P235/75R15, attached toolbox 71”w x 
11.5”d L-Shaped no lock and key, running lights operational, two metal ramps included. , , , , , 
KNOWN PROBLEMS: Right turn signal on trailer did not blink, but stayed solid, toolbox lid 
damaged, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

$1 SK400681093

FORT QU'APPELLE,  Corrections Policing and Public Safety, 203 Victoria Ave

Contact Morgan Loeffler 306-332-3215, morgan.loeffler@gov.sk.ca or Sgt. Colin Lawson 306-728-7489, colin.lawson@gov.sk.ca

S 1,111.11 * 5-605 ATV 1999 POLARIS Sportsman 4x4 4WD CVT, 500cc, single cylinder, gas  dual sensing engine 
braking system winch, tire size 23 x 7 - 10, 24 x 11 - 10, green, , 664 hrs, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: 
Does not run, motor will not start, transmission, brakes, battery, exhaust and lights all in 
unknown condition., As is, where is

664 hrs $1 99-29904

KENOSEE LAKE, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, (1-5) SK Highway 9

Contact Rob Stolz306-575-8880, rob.stolz@gov.sk.ca. Stephen Dagg 306-575-6150, stephen.dagg@gov.sk.ca

S 456.78 6-504 ATV 2002 POLARIS 425 Xpedition 2WD / 4WD 425cc, single cylinder, gas standard 5 gears, 1 
reverse tire size AT25x11x12, winch mounted in front, camo plastic, , unknown hrs, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS: Does not start, hasn't run in 5 plus years, unsure why it will not start, 5 years ago, 
fresh fuel in it and tried a new battery in it and it still would not start, unsure what is wrong with 
it, battery is dead will not show kms or hrs, no seat. Due to the lack of storage room it has been 
stored outside, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

unknown 
hrs

$1 4XAGK42AB2B758196

LA RONGE, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 800 Poirier St

Contact Brad Johns 306-425-4240, brad.johns@gov.sk.ca

S 2,851.00 6-508 Snowmobile 2011 Ski-DOO Tundra Sport  550 Rotax, 2 stroke, gas standard 137-inch track, key 
start, hand warmers, has reverse sometimes , yellow, , 12,000 miles, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: 
Needs servicing to start, motor runs fine but jack shaft and both clutches need replacing, needs 
a battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

12,000 
miles

$1 2BPSGKBA1BV00269
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MELFORT, Corrections Policing and Public Safety, NE-31-44-18-W2 - Call for Directions

Contact Ryan Yaworski 306-920-7729, ryan.yaworski@gov.sk.ca or Cody Osborne 306-920-7149, cody.osborne@gov.sk.ca

S 12.00 * 5-504 Cattle Box,   wood Chute designed for large animals, will need a trailer to load.  Fair $1

S 21.00 * 5-506 Clay Pigeon Thrower,   metal Spring tension, make unknown.  Fair $1

S 2.50 * 5-507 Easel,   Black Magic Art, metal, paper   Fair $1

S 2.50 * 5-512 Pipe,   PVC 1", approximately 25'.  Fair $1

S 5.50 * 5-516 Tree Stand Platform,   metal   Fair $1

S 5.50 * 5-519 Weedwhacker,   Green Machine, metal Unknown if operational.  Poor $1

MELFORT, Corrections Policing and Public Safety, 108 Crawford Ave E

Contact Ryan Yaworski 306-920-7729, ryan.yaworski@gov.sk.ca or Cody Osborne 306-920-7149, cody.osborne@gov.sk.ca

S 1.50 * 5-528 Camera,   Canon PowerShot A570 IS, digital Zoom lens 4 x optical, 5.8 - 23.2mm 1:2.6-5.5, 
internal memory wiped, unknown if operational.  Fair

$1 5,052,110,449

S 2.50 * 5-530 Camera,   Sony MVC-FD200 FDMavica, digital 2.0 mega pixels, 6x precision digital zoom, duel 
media, mpeg movie does not have audio comes with rechargeable battery pack, AC power 
adapter, video connecting cable, USB cable, no charger for rechargeable batteries, internal 
memory wiped, unknown if operational.  Fair

$1 694,877

MOOSE JAW, Highways, 1 km South of Moose Jaw on Hwy. 2

Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca

S 16,000.00 6-509 Motor Grader 2011 Volvo G940 RWD 7.2L (D7E GBE3), inline 6, diesel Powershift air number of 
gears 8 forward/4 reverse, differential type standard, single tire, tire size 17.5R22.5, yellow, , 
12,113 hours, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Transmission slips, transmission and oil cooler need 
replacing, moldboard slide cylinder needs repair, left front tire slow leak, poor batty, minor 
exterior damage.>, As is, where is

12,113 
hours

$13,000 VCE0G940C0S525345
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S 4,501.00 6-515 Truck 1994 International 4700 2WD, 14' x 8' flat deck DT 408, inline 6, diesel standard, Fuller 
FS5106A 1 key, radio, single axle, 6 speed, differential standard, wheelbase 206”, dual, 11R22.5, 
14ply, GVW 14,600 kgs cabinets on deck no locks or keys, yellow, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. 
It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to 
be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 247,022  km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS: Transmission some small leaks, hub axle cap leak driver side, lower rad hose weep, 
oil pan weep, drivers side mirror light not working, rust jacking between main frame and insert, 
has had mice in the cab in the past cleaned, windshield couple stone chips, poor battery, minor 
exterior damage., As is, where is

247,022  
km

$4,500 1HTSCACL9RH574609

NORTH BATTLEFORD, Justice & Attorney General, 1146 - 102nd St

Contact David Bourdon 306-441-0472, david.bourdon@gov.sk.ca

S 5.00 * 5-606 Bookshelf ,   wood White, 12" w x 48" d x 87" h.   Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-607 Cabinet,   metal Grey, 20" x 36", 2 door, with lock and keys.  Poor $1

S No Bid * 5-609 Chair,   plastic White, no arms.  Fair $1

S 23.00 * 5-610 Chairs, Lot of 10  metal Tan, no arms.  Poor $1

S 11.00 * 5-611 Chairs, Lot of 5  metal, plastic Black, no arms.  Fair $1

S 33.00 * 5-612 Chairs, Lot of 15  metal, plastic Grey, no arms.  Fair $1

S 50.00 * 5-613 Chairs, Lot of 23  metal, plastic Tan, no arms.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-614 Coat Rack,   metal Black, 16" w x 16" d x 70" h.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-615 Credenza ,   wood Brown, 72"w x 20" d x 30" h, 6 drawer, 2 doors.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-616 Desk,   wood Brown, 34" w x 60" w x 40" h, 8 drawer.
  Fair

$1

S No Bid * 5-617 Desk,   wood Grey, 36" w x 30" d x 32" h.  Fair $1
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S No Bid * 5-618 Desk, Lot of 2  wood Grey, 74" w x 66" d x 32" h, with keyboard riser.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-619 Desk,   wood Grey, 78" w x 42" d x 32" h.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-620 Desk, Lot of 3  wood Grey, desk 28" w x 39" d x 32" h, one side 39"w x 39" d x 32" h, other side 
28" w x 39" d x 32" h.  Fair

$1

S No Bid * 5-621 Desk,   wood Red, 36" w x 72" d x 36"h, 6 drawer, with scuffs and wood chips.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-622 Desk,   wood Red, 72" w x 30" d x 32" h.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-623 Desk, Lot of 2  wood Red, one side 30" w x 48" d x 32" h,  other side 30" w x 48" d x 32" h.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-624 Desk,   wood White, 24" w x 38" d x 36"h.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-625 Desk,   wood, metal Dark brown, 36" w x 84" d x 32" h, 4 drawers.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-626 Desk,   wood, metal Light brown, 30" w x 60" d x 32"h, 5 drawers.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-627 Desk , Lot of 2  wood , with hutch Grey, desk 30" w x 60" d x 32" h, hutch 15" w x 60" d x 40" h.  
Fair

$1

S No Bid * 5-629 Desk Set , Lot of 4  wood, with hutch Grey, one side 32" w x 39" d x 32" h, one side 39" w x 39" 
d x 32" h, other side 32" w x 39" d x 32" h, hutch 16" w x 42" d x 40"h.  Fair

$1

S No Bid * 5-630 Desk Suite, Lot of 3  oak Brown, one side of desk, 42" w x 30" d x 29"h, other side 72" w x 30" d 
x 29" h, drawer 36" w x 42" d x 36" h.
  Fair

$1

S No Bid * 5-631 File Cabinet,   wood, lateral Brown, 20" w x 36" d x 42" h.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-633 Hutch,   wood Grey, 17" w x 42" d x 54" h.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-632 Hutch,   wood Grey, 17" w x 60" d x 40" h.  Fair $1
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S No Bid * 5-634 Hutch,   wood Grey, 17" w x 72" d x 42"h.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-635 Hutch,   wood Grey, 48" w x 17" d x 36" h.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-636 Magazine Rack,   metal Grey, brown, 37" w x 48 " d.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-637 Table,   round, wood Light brown, 48" w x 48" d x 28" h.   Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-638 Table,   wood Brown, 36" w x 96" d x 42" h.  Poor $1

S No Bid * 5-642 Table ,   wood Brown, 32" w x 56" d x 42" h.  Fair $1

PREECEVILLE, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 239 Highway Ave E

Contact Darren Henry 306-547-5661, 306-231-6074, darren.henry@gov.sk.ca or Nathan Dutchak 306-547-5662, 306-590-7636, nathan.dutchak@gov.sk.ca

S 2,197.99 6-502 Snowmobile 1996 Arctic Cat Bearcat  440cc, 2 cylinder, gas auto 1 key, handlebar warmers and a 
thumb warmer, tracks 156” long, 15” wide with a lug height of 0.75”, has reverse gear cargo 
rack, green, , 3,354 miles, Known Recent Repairs: New voltage regulator., KNOWN PROBLEMS: 
Speedometer does not work, electric starter needs replacing, crack in windshield, poor battery, 
minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

3,354 miles $500 9,637,020

PRINCE ALBERT,  Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, Nisbet Compound off Highway 2

Contact Casey Howey ph. 306-758-6254, c. 306-961-9763 casey.howey@gov.sk.ca

S 1,050.00 6-507 ATV 2005 Arctic Cat 400 4WD 400cc, 1 cylinder, gas manual  4 stroke, 5 speed hi/low, tire size 
front 25x8, rear 25x12, winch mounted on front, standard size, front storage box , green, , 2,255 
km, Known Recent Repairs: 4 Stroke Air/oil cooled brand new fan installed last year., KNOWN 
PROBLEMS: Motor will not start, needs battery, both upper and lower ball joints, front axle 
boot, front axle, both rear wheel bearings, left rear axle, front differential is leaking, needs seal 
replacement, needs stator and regulator, seat worn with holes, minor exterior damage.>, As is, 
where is

2,255 km $1 4UF05ATV05T206531

PRINCE ALBERT, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, 3021 1st Ave W

Contact Don Balan 306-961-8232, donald.balan@gov.sk.ca or Darcy Perlitz, darcy.perlitz@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 5-675 Blankets, Lot of 2  Homemade, synthetic fiber 42”w x 80”l, thin padding, one is green grey with 
rips, one is dark grey does not have any major rips but seams are coming out.  Poor

$1
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PRINCE ALBERT, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, 3021 1st Ave W

Contact Candice Dawson, 306-953-3978, candice.dawson@gov.sk.ca

S 623.00 6-536 Rubber Mats, Lot of 30   Black, 84"l x 60"w,thickness 1/2",  gym equipment was put on top. Skid 
steer will be available to load the mats if a proper vehicle/trailer is brought to load.   Poor

$1

PRINCE ALBERT, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, RM 114 - 800 Central Ave

Contact Carla Chadwick 306-953-2897, carla.chadwick@gov.sk.ca or Ariel Kasko 306-953-2322, ariel.kasko@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 5-676 Chairs, Lot of 8  vinyl, pleather  Black, 5 castor, adjustable height, some have wear, the odd tear 
and some have some other marks.  Fair

$1

PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Polytechnic, 1100-15th St E

Contact Ken Pichula 306-765-1585, pashipping@saskpolytech.ca or Leslie Morin 306-765-1585, pashipping@saskpolytec.ca

S No Bid * 5-537 Amplifier,   Tortech, PA1060 Public address amplifier, operational.  Good $1 SADJ2004-0246756

S 11.36 * 5-548 Speakers, Lot of 2  Soundtube, CM 50 Operational.  Good $1 3437/3439

PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 47 - 12th St

Contact: Justin Pearce 306-953-3492, justin.pearce@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid 6-517 Blood Pressure Monitor,   Bp Tru Light grey blood pressure monitor with 3 cuffs (s, m, l), it has a 
plug-in cord and is operational, with user manual.  Good

$1 SK8573

S No Bid 6-518 Blood Pressure Monitor,   Life Source UA-767 Plus Grey blood pressure monitor with 2 cuffs, 
missing the power cord, unknown if operational.  Good

$1 SERM: 99-13-51

S No Bid 6-519 Cabinet,   Wood 3 shelves and 2 drawers, 36' w x  21" d x 76" h, with glass doors, very good 
condition, door and drawers work excellent.  Good

$1

S 32.00 6-520 Camcorder,   Sony DCR-PC9 Light blue, silver with a separate attachable flash, comes with 3 
battery packs, charge chord, remote, user manual, carry case, SD card removed, functionality 
unknown.  Good

$1 SERM: 10-18-79

S 32.00 6-521 Camcorder,   Sony Digital 8 Dark and light blue camcorder, in a black Optic case, with charger, 
user manual, cleaning cloth, additional cables for TV hook up, SD card removed, unknown if 
operational.  Good

$1 SERM: 10-18-50
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S 12.00 6-522 Camera,   Canon Power Shot S3 1S Black, alkaline battery, and memory card slot, card not 
included, unknown if operational.  Good

$1 SERM: 10-27-09

S 56.00 6-523 Camera,   Canon Powershot A3100 1S Red with a digital screen, black Optex carry case, has a 
rechargeable battery and a wall charger, no cables, HDMI card is not included, unknown if 
operational.  Good

$1 SERM: 10-31-10

S 56.00 6-524 Camera,   Canon Powershot A3100 1S Red with a digital screen, black Optix carry case, user 
guide and CD, has 2 wall chargers for the batteries, cables for TV and photo extraction, HDMI 
card slot, not included, unknown if operational.  Good

$1 SERM: 12-54-80

S 56.00 6-525 Camera,   Canon Powershot A3100 1S Red with a digital screen, no carry case, has a 
rechargeable battery, wall charger, cables to connect to TV and a slot for HDMI card, not 
included, unknown if operational.  Good

$1

S 22.00 6-526 Camera,   Canon Powershot SX 120 1S Black, alkaline battery, has a memory slot, card not 
included, no case or extra cable, the flash requires a watch battery, not included, unknown if 
operational.  Good

$1

S 12.00 6-527 Camera,   Canon Z740 Silver, battery, has a memory card slot,  Lowprop black carry case, TV 
cables to transfer pictures, SD card removed, unknown if operational.  Good

$1 SERM: 10-81-42

S 21.55 6-528 Car Booster,   with air compressor, MotoMaster - Nautilus 011-1592-8  Recreational power pack 
and air pump, black and blue, unknown if operational.  Good

$1

S 8.89 6-529 Car Booster ,   with air compressor, MotoMaster, Eliminator Battery Pack Black and silver, 1000 
peak battery amps and 500 cold crank amps, unknown if operational.  Good

$1

S No Bid 6-530 CD Player,   MP3 Brand Blue and silver CD player and radio, potential for MP3 hook-up, has a 
power cord, operational.  Good

$1

S No Bid 6-531 Speaker System,   with Subwoofer, Altec Lansing VS 4121 Black and silver, has cable, user guide, 
unknown if operational.    Good

$1

S No Bid 6-532 File Cabinet,   metal, lateral Grey, 4 drawer, drawers open and close properly and smoothly, 18" 
w x 28"d x 51"h.  Good

$1

S No Bid 6-533 Projector,   Kodak Carousel 4200 Black, comes with a corded remote and a power cord, 
unknown if operational.  Good

$1 SERM: 10-20-20
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S No Bid 6-534 Speaker System,   with Subwoofer, Logitech Z-2300 Black and silver, has remote, unknown if 
operational.  Good

$1 PID: A524

S 12.00 6-535 VHS & DVD Player,   Toshiba D-Vr7-K-TC2  Black, has remote and cables, unknown if operational.  
Good

$1 SERM: 10-26-99

REGINA, Highways, 1610 Park St

Contact: Cory Obleman 306-526-9135, cory.obleman@gov.sk.ca or Mike Johnson 306-530-7843, mike.johnson@gov.sk.ca

S 107.00 * 5-588 Sign Post, Lot of 45-50  wood 4”x 6”, 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially 
treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for 
assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; 
Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be 
loaded by Ministry staff.  Fair

$1

REGINA, Innovation Saskatchewan, 200 - 10 Research Dr

Contact: Azmina Punjani 306-551-5106, azmina.punjani@innovationsask.ca or Nick Wilkes 306-539-9022, nick.wilkes@innovationsask.ca

S No Bid * 1-551 Desk,   Reception, wood Previously used reception desk has been professionally dismantled and 
is ready for transport, includes the main counter sections (a durable quartz countertop - 2-piece, 
piece 1- 8’7” l x 31” w x 1-1/8” thick, piece2 – 7’7” l x 31” w x 1-1/8” thick, side panels, and 
internal shelving components, minimal wear and tear from previous use. This desk is being sold 
in its component pieces and will require reassembly. Assembly instructions are NOT included. 
Reassembly will require some technical skill and potentially additional tools and hardware.
Please carefully inspect the photos and consider arranging a viewing to assess the completeness 
and condition of all parts before bidding.
Due to the size and weight of the components, transporting this desk will require more than one 
person. The buyer will be responsible for arranging their own pickup and transportation of all 
desk components between 8:00 am - 4:30 pm Mon-Fri. Innovation Saskatchewan will not be 
responsible for any transport or haul.  Good

$300
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REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor & Gaming Authority, 1702 Park St

Contact: Kirsten Nelson 306-787-0179, knelson@slga.com or Tyrone Smith, tsmith1@slga.com

S 12.89 * 5-643 Chair,   fabric Black, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$10

S 12.89 * 5-644 Chair,   fabric Black, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$10

S 12.88 * 5-645 Chair,   fabric Black, high back, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$10

S 50.00 * 5-649 Chairs, Lot of 3  fabric Blue, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height, black armrest.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$15

S 18.00 * 5-650 Chairs, Lot of 3  fabric Blue, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height, black armrest.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Fair

$15

S 12.52 * 5-651 Chairs, Lot of 2  fabric Blue, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height, black armrest.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$10

S No Bid * 5-652 Chairs, Lot of 4  fabric Blue, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Fair

$20

S No Bid * 5-653 Chairs, Lot of 2  fabric Blue, 5 casters, adjustable seat height, black armrest.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Fair

$10

S No Bid * 5-654 Chairs, Lot of 2  fabric Grey, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$10

S 15.88 * 5-655 Chairs, Lot of 3  fabric Grey, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$15

S 10.00 * 5-658 Chairs, Lot of 2  fabric Navy, 5 casters, adjustable seat height.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$10
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S No Bid * 5-660 Chairs, Lot of 6  fabric, wood frame Assorted colours, dark blue, light blue, pink, teal, and brown.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Fair

$5

S No Bid * 5-677 Desk,   laminate, metal Brown, 1 drawer, 36”w x 24”d x29.5”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$10

S 50.80 * 5-678 Desk,   L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72”w x 36”d x 28”h, extension 42”w x 20”d x 28”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$25

S No Bid * 5-679 Desk,   L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72”w x 36”d x 28”h, extension 42”w x 20”d x 28”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$25

S No Bid * 5-680 Desk,   U-Shaped, wood Burgundy, hutch side 70”w x 20”d x 29”h, hutch 66”w x 15”d x 37.5’h, 
middle 37.5”w x 24”d x 29”h, right side 70”w x 36”d x 29”h, entire 104”w x 70”d, 48" opening 
from left to right, currently disassembled, no assembly instructions, comes with hardware to 
assemble.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$150

S No Bid * 5-663 Desk ,   L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72”w x 36”d x 28”h, extension 42”w x 20”d x 28”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$25

S No Bid * 5-664 Desk ,   L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72”w x 36”d x 28”h, extension 42”w x 20”d x 28”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$25

S No Bid * 5-665 Desk ,   L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72”w x 36”d x 28”h, extension 42”w x 20”d x 28”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$25

S No Bid * 5-666 Desk Riser,   Varidesk, 49900, laminate, metal, wood Black, adjustable height.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$75

S 10.00 * 5-668 File Cabinet,   metal, lateral Beige, no key, 4 drawer, 36”w x 18”d x 51.5”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Fair

$10

S 11.00 * 5-670 File Cabinet,   metal, lateral Beige, with key, 4 drawer, 36”w x 18”d x 54”h. 24 hours’ notice for 
pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$10
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S 25.00 6-511 Folding Table,   laminate, metal Brown, rectangle, 72"w x 30"d x 29"h, small scratch. 24 hours’ 
notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$15

S 25.00 6-512 Folding Table,   laminate, metal Brown, rectangle, 72"w x 30"d x 29"h. 24 hours’ notice for pick-
up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$15

S 25.00 6-513 Folding Table,   laminate, metal Brown, rectangle, 72"w x 36"d x 29"h, small scratch. 24 hours’ 
notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$15

S 25.00 6-514 Folding Table,   laminate, metal Brown, rectangle, 96"w x 30"d x 29"h. 24 hours’ notice for pick-
up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$15

S 10.00 * 5-671 Pedestal,   laminate, lateral Beige, no key, no casters, 3 drawer, 24.5”w x 16.75”d x 26.5”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$10

S No Bid * 5-672 Pedestal,   laminate, lateral Beige, no key, with casters, 3 drawer, 24.5”w x 17.5”d x26.5”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$10

S No Bid * 5-673 Pedestal,   laminate, lateral Beige, with key, no casters, 2 drawer, 24.5”w x 17.5”d x 26.5”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$10

S 12.00 * 5-685 Pedestal,   metal, vertical Beige, no key, 3 drawer, 12.25”w x 23”d x 27.5”h
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$10

S 6.76 * 5-686 Pedestal,   metal, vertical Black, with key, 3 drawer, 15”w x 29”d x 27.25”h, few scratches on 
top.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Fair

$5

S No Bid * 5-674 Standing Desk Work Station,   Ergotron, laminate, steel Black, dual monitor and keyboard, 
adjustable height.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$20

S No Bid * 5-687 Table,   laminate, metal base Brown, round,  36” diameter x 29.5”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$15

S No Bid * 5-688 Table,   laminate, metal base Brown, round, 41.5” diameter x 29.5”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$15
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S 20.59 * 5-689 Table,   laminate, steel Mahogany, rectangle, 72”w x 30.25”d x 30”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$15

S 15.51 * 5-690 Table,   laminate, steel Mahogany, rectangle, 72”w x 30.25”d x 30”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$15

S No Bid * 5-691 Table,   laminate, steel Mahogany, rectangle, 72”w x 30.25”d x 30”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$15

S No Bid * 5-692 Table,   laminate, steel Mahogany, rectangle, 72”w x 30.25”d x 30”h.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Good

$15

ROSETOWN, Highways, 707 Loken Rd

Contact Richard Leibel 306-933-5262, richard.leibel@gov.sk.ca or Cody Cordes 306-229-3680, cody.cordes@gov.sk.ca

S 3,555.47 6-516 Gravel Truck 1999 VOLVO WG64  Volvo VED 12B, 6 cylinder, diesel Eaton Fuller  10 speed, 
tandem axle, wheel base Eatons H981977998, front ratio, 404-04, rear H981977625, ratio 
4.4330, tire size 22.5, yellow, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection.  It is unknown if any repairs or 
safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes 
full responsibility for repairs if required. ,  75,3031 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Engine oil leaks, 
engine cranks but won't start, brakes are seized, frame corroded and won't pass SGI inspection, 
cabs rotted out, numerous air and hydraulic leaks, tires, air, tilt and cruise all non-operational, 
battery, windshield glass, paint and mirrors all in poor condition., As is, where is

 75,3031 
km

$2,000 4VHJCAGF0XN865384

SASKATOON, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, 910 - 60th St E

Contact: Renee Pound, 306-956-8817, renee.pound@gov.sk.ca or Danielle Corriveau 306-956-8869, danielle.corriveau@gov.sk.ca

S 102.00 * 5-535 Oven,   Baker's Pride Non-operational but all controls have been dismantled and only turns on to 
350 degrees F, 31”w x 26”d (31" with handle) x 25 1/8”h.  Broken Repairable

$1

S 103.00 * 5-536 Oven,   Baker's Pride Non-operational but all controls have been dismantled and only turns on to 
350 degrees F, 31”w x 26”d (31" with handle) x 25 1/8”h.  Broken Repairable

$1

S 101.00 * 5-534 Oven,   Baker's Pride Operational, but all controls have been dismantled and only turns on to 
350 degrees F, 31"w x 26"d (31" with handle) x25 1/8"h.  Good

$25
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S No Bid * 5-565 Chair,   leather Black, leather is peeling, arms are worn.  Poor $1

S No Bid * 5-566 Document Holders, Lot of 7  plastic Grey , 10 1/2"w  x 13 1/2"h x 1 1/2"thickness, with clip 
board.  Fair

$1

S No Bid * 5-567 File Folders, Lot of 14  Pendaflex A88GD-10, paper 14 boxes, 250 per box, end tabs folders with 
reinforced tab, letter size, full tab, 13.5 pt., ivory.  New- Unused

$1

S 20.01 * 5-568 Pedestal,     Pepperdust, 3 drawers, locking with no key, 17.25”w x 24.25”d x 26.75”h.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 5-569 Safety Toe Covers, Lot of 18  steel, rubber, Uline  2 small new, 2 small used, 3 medium new, 6 
medium used, 1 large new, 4 large used, white/red/yellow, slips quickly over shoes, sneakers 
and boots, complete sole coverage with slip-resistant tread.  Good

$1

S No Bid * 5-570 Tables, Lot of 2  wood Both pepperdust, 24" round x 18"h.  Fair $1

SASKATOON, Highways, 126 105th St E

Contact Richard Leibel 306-933-5262, Richard.Leibel@gov.sk.ca or Shaun Bowditch 306-933-5265, Shaun.Bowditch@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 5-573 Grader 1995 John Deere 770BH RWD JD 6076 7.6L, inline 6, diesel standard  8 gears forward 4 
reverse, rear axle tandem drive, single tire, tire size 17.5R25, Moe board 10 feet, GVW 
unknown, differential unknown, there is no key., yellow, , 13,330 hours, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: 
Motor knocks, burns oil, low compression and will not start. Transmission slips out of gear, 
exhaust is rusted out, pins and bushing seized and worn, numerous electrical issues, some lights 
not working, numerous hydraulic leaks, tires worn out cracked and leaking, windshield 
cracked/chipped,   motor/transmission/brakes/exhaust/windshield 
washer/wipers/paint/interior/lights/mirrors/horn poor, battery removed, minor exterior 
damage.>, As is, where is

13,330 
hours

$8,000 548,968
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Fax: 306-787-2092

Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

S 4,653.00 6-501 HEAVY VEHICLE 2002 Volvo VHD64F gravel truck VED12C 385 Horse Power, 6 cylinder, diesel 
standard, Super 10  tandem plow, yellow, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection.  It is unknown if any 
repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer 
assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. ,  584,532 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood 
bushings wore out, numerous air leaks, air bag light on, 3rd axel torque rod bushings, intake 
heater light on, cross chain is wearing into truck frame, bottom of cab is rusting out, cross 
member is rusted out, spring pins have play, suspension blocks worn out, A/C non-operational, 
exhaust leaks, hood is cracked, left side door doesn't close, finding repair parts has become an 
issue, motor has oil leak, transmission output shaft loose, battery removed, windshield glass 
cracked, tires, brakes, body exterior, exhaust and lights all in poor condition., As is, where is

 584,532 
km

$1,000 4V5KC9GG12N329870

S 1,188.80 6-505 Trailer 1963 Columbus DTM15    24' long x 8' width pintle hitch standard size, dual tires, 
tandem, tire size 8.25R15, yellow, , , , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Deck boards are rotted, brake issues 
and parts are no longer available, electrical plug is cut off, tilt deck has been welded down, unit 
will not pass a safety inspection, not all the lights operational, tires/brakes are poor, minor 
exterior damage.>, As is, where is

$200 4,035

SPIRITWOOD, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, 116 1st St E

Contact: Brendon Smith 306-883-8513, brendon.smith@gov.sk.ca or Jason Reddekopp 306-883-8505, jason.reddekopp@gov.sk.ca

S 2.00 * 4-508 ATV/Snowmobile Attachments, Lot of 3  metal ATV rack black, two snowmobile double up seat, 
black, unknown make or model.  Fair

$1

S 5.00 * 4-510 Boat Canopy,    32"w x 48"d x 21.5"h, without attachment points, no Hardware provided.  Fair $1

S 1.50 * 4-511 Console Seats, Lot of 2  cloth Grey, unknown make of truck console seats, stained, soiled.  Good $1

S 1.50 * 4-513 Flood lights, Lot of 2  plastic Handhelds, hardwired, black, unknow watts/volts, unknown if 
operational.  Poor

$1

S No Bid * 4-517 Platform Stand,   homebuilt, fiberglass No hardware provided.  Poor $1

S 1.11 * 4-519 Platform Stand,   homebuilt, wood,  With ladder, no hardware provided.  Poor $1
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SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #6
From Sept 03 to Sept 10, 2025

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

SWIFT CURRENT, Highways, 1200 South Service RD W 

Contact Tayler Sanderson 306-778-8353 or 306-741-6317, tayler.sanderson@gov.sk.ca

S 5,100.00 6-506 Wheel Loader 2003 Hyundai HL740-3 4WD Cummins 5.9L, inline 6, diesel ZF/auto A/C 3 yard 
bucket, 4 speed, tires single, tire size 20-5x25, 12 ply, yellow, , 4,629 hours, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS: Seized alternator, belt missing, fuel shutoff sticky, foot feed broken, transmission 
shifter disassembled, unit was used for Loading salt and gravel trucks and shows issues related 
to the working conditions of unit, tires/exhaust/interior/horn poor, poor battery, minor exterior 
damage.>, As is, where is

4,629 
hours

$500 L70310963

YORKTON Highways, 245 York Rd E

Contact Randy Potter 306-621-4791, randy.potter@gov.sk.ca or Cory Palko 306-960-5152, cory.palko@gov.sk.ca

S 182.00 6-510 Sign Posts  Lot 50 - 60  wood, spruce    Used, 4 inches x 6 inches by 8 to 12 feet approximately, 
mix of treated and untreated spruce posts, old broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs., 
must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided 
loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. 
Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Please note lifts are now smaller to 
make handling safer 50-60 posts per lift. , , , , , , Fair

$1
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