

## **SALE SUMMARY LIST**

**PLEASE NOTE:** Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold “AS IS, WHERE IS”, there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit [www.SaskSurplus.ca](http://www.SaskSurplus.ca) for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with \* have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on [www.SaskSurplus.ca](http://www.SaskSurplus.ca) web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from [www.SaskSurplus.ca](http://www.SaskSurplus.ca) or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3300,
- by email to [sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca](mailto:sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca), or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer)	This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.
WD = (Withdrawn)	This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.
No Bid =	Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
5,650.00	5-003	SUV 2014 FORD Explorer 4WD 3.5L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, rear HVAC, power mirrors/locks/windows/left front seat, keyless entry-2 key fobs 7-passenger, hitch, trailer wiring, white, PASSED SGI Inspection. This vehicle can be driven off premises with an SGI Permit or a registered, active license plate attached. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 292,399 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Grille road rash/faded, hood paint cracked, front bumper road rash/cracked, rear bumper scratches, left front door panel separating, left side doors rust inside bottom, front right door dent/scratches, right rear door scratches, right side doors rust inside bottom, roof chips/small rust spots, 1 hole in roof sealed, tailgate rusted/glass scratched, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat slightly worn, poor battery, minor exterior	292,399 km	\$3,197	1FM5K8B88EGB69646
3,865.25	5-002	Truck 2015 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 4WD, crew cab, 6'5" box 4.3L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry-2 keys, 2 fobs side steps, mud flaps, front tow hooks, rear windows-tinted, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 297,741 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Engine & traction light, cylinder #3 missing piston ring, cylinder wall damaged when ring was lost bad misfire, engine shaking, emergency brake seized, requires rear park brake cables and levers freed up, front & rear wheel alignment, left license plate light out, chipped paint on cab. Grille lower broke, front bumper lower bent/scratches, left front fender road rash, left rear fender dent, right side fenders road rash, left rear door paint peeling, right front door paint chips, roof dented, 3 sealed holes in roof, tailgate inside paint peeling, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat worn, paint peeling on both A pillars, paint inside box peeling, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> , As is, where is	297,741 km	\$1,999	3GCUKPEH5FG266962

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
2,302.00	5-001	<p>Van 2014 DODGE Grand Caravan SXT FWD 3.6L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/heated mirrors, keyless entry-2 key fobs 7 passenger, Stow-N-Go, roof rack, beige, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 137,813 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Motor seized, no oil in motor, right axle boot, right front strut leaking, front &amp; rear pads/rotors rusted, could not check some articles due to no motor, right sliding door damaged, rear wiper blade.</p> <p>Hood paint bubbling/scratches, both bumper's scratches, left side fenders scratches/rusted, right rear fender scratches, both dog legs rusted, left rear door molding broke, right rear door large dent, tailgate rusted/scratches, no first aid/fire extinguisher, windshield chipped, rear right seat head rest/seat maybe damaged, interior soiled, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	137,813 km	\$711	2C4RDGBG6ER286450
5,040.30	5-004	<p>Van 2008 GMC Savana 3500 RWD 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power mirrors/locks/windows, 2 keys Unicell fiber glass body 12'long x 7'wide x 6'6"high, single rear wheels, metal plate on floor, mud flaps, extended mirrors, doghouse tray taped on, rolling tail gate door-condition poor, HD step on rear, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 271,839 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Check engine light on for catalytic converter efficiency P0420, engine oil light on, oil cooler liners, left outer ball joint worn, right outer tie rod extremely loose, front/rear wheel alignment needed, right side mirror cracked.</p> <p>Grille missing GMC badge, hood chips/dents, front bumper rusted/dented, both rocker panels rust, left front door rust lower inside/dents/paint poor, right front door dents/paint poor, no spare tire/wheel wrench/jack/first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield glass cracked, right mirror glass cracked, left front seat worn/sagging, both rub rails bent/scratches/rust/cracks, metal step plate rusted, poor battery, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, where is</p>	271,839 km	\$4,451	1GDHG31K681211494

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
5,051.00	5-005	Van 2008 GMC Savana 3500 RWD 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power windows/locks/mirrors, 2 keys Unicell fiber glass body 12'long x 7'wide x 6'6"high, single rear wheels, metal plate on floor, mud flaps, extended mirrors, rolling door-condition fair, rolling tail gate door-condition poor, HD step on rear of van body, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 364,897 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: King pins/ball joints has play and the boot is open, noise from bell housing, engine oil low/dirty, flex plate, front/rear wheel alignment needed, left power mirror non-operational, windshield stone chips. Hood paint poor/road rash/dents, front bumper road rash/scrape/pad screwed on, left front fender paint poor/dent, left front door dents/rusted inside bottom/paint poor, right front door rusted inside bottom/paint poor, roof rusted/paint poor, no spare tire/wheel wrench/jack/first aid/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, right mirror paint poor/housing cracked, left seat sagging/ripped/worn, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is	364,897	\$4,048	1GDHG31K881212307
5.00	5-101	Booster Cables, 15' long, red. Fair		\$5	
No Bid *	3-102	Cabinet, metal Wall mount, suitable for keys, 100 internal hooks, black, locking, 1 key, 16.75"w x 3.75"d x 16.75"h, scratches in exterior and interior. Fair		\$25	
No Bid *	4-122	Disposable Emergency Stretcher, Weave canvas, black. Excellent		\$10	
No Bid *	4-101	Flashlights , Lot of 6 Garrity 5 hand held, 1 other, with 2-6V batteries. Fair		\$1	
7.00 *	2-104	Rear Seat, Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 2nd row, captain chair. Fair		\$5	
7.00 *	2-105	Rear Seat, Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 2nd row, captain chair. Fair		\$5	
No Bid *	2-106	Rear Seat, Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, head rest loose. Fair		\$5	
No Bid *	2-107	Rear Seat, Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, rear trim loose. Fair		\$5	
No Bid *	2-108	Rear Seat, Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, seat belt buckle not protruding. fair		\$5	
No Bid *	2-109	Rear Seat, Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row. Fair		\$5	
6.00 *	4-112	Shovel, Mastercraft Wooden shaft 32.5"l, metal scoop 9"w x 12.5"d. Fair		\$5	
No Bid *	4-119	Shovel, Wooden shaft 50"l, metal scoop 14.5"w x 18"d. Poor		\$1	

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
245.00	5-102	Tires, Set of 4 225/65R17, Firestone Destination LE2, M+S Manufacture date. Week 45, year 2021. Good		\$180	
125.00	5-105	Tires, Set of 4 225/65R16, Firestone All Season, M+S Manufacture date, week 08, year 2017. Poor		\$40	
136.00	5-106	Tires, Set of 4 225/65R17, Yokohama Avid S33, M+S Manufacture date, week 32, year 2018. Fair		\$120	
6.00	5-103	Triangle Warning Kit, James King brand, model 1005 17", 3 in kit, with storage box, box is broken. Good		\$20	
6.00	5-104	Triangle Warning Kit, James King brand, model 1005 17", 3 in kit, with storage box. Good		\$20	
20.00 *	4-105	Trouble Light, Noma Max 75 Watts, type A, 50' cord. Fair		\$5	
10.00 *	4-125	Vacuum, Eureka, Easy Clean, model 71 Type B4 electric, 120 volts AC 60 Hz 5.5 amps, one thin nose attachment, suction operational, spinning brush non-operational. Fair		\$10	UH437002419
No Bid *	4-130	Chair, Swivel, cloth Black, 5 caster, adjustable height, no arms. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	4-132	Chair, Swivel, cloth Blue, 5 caster, adjustable height and arms. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	4-133	Chair, Swivel, cloth Grey, 5 caster, adjustable height, no arms. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	4-135	Chairs, Lot of 2 Swivel, mesh Green, 5 caster, adjustable height no arms. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	4-136	Chairs, Lot of 3 Swivel, mesh back Black, 5 caster, adjustable height, arms worn, seats soiled. Poor		\$1	
No Bid *	4-137	Desk, L-Shape Pepperdust, 72" w x 36" d x 29" h, return attached pedestal 2 drawers, 42" w x 19.25" d x 29" h attach pedestal 2 drawers, no locks, keyboard mount not attached, screws included. Poor		\$1	
No Bid *	4-138	Desk, L-Shape Pepperdust, 72" w x 36" d x 29" h, return, 42" w x 19" d x 29" h, pedestal 18" w x 24.5" d x 26.5" h on wheels, locks, no key, keyboard tray mount underneath, screws included. Poor		\$1	
No Bid *	4-139	Drafting Table, wood, laminate 52"w x 30"d x 31"h. Poor		\$1	
No Bid *	9-118	Keyboard Holder Mount, metal 30"w x 11"d, bracket 17"w x 7"d, black. Fair		\$1	
8.80 *	4-145	Water Cooler, Vitapur, plastic Black, operational, no water jug, unknown if cool or hot is operational. Poor		\$1	
276.20	5-600	Plasma Cutter, Hypertherm Powermax 1000 Non-operational, needs new circuit breaker. Broken Repairable		\$1	1000-038622

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid	5-601	Truck Topper, Arrow 100" long, has metal rack on top, red, removed off of a 1998 Ford long box. Fair		\$1	
1,275.07	5-603	Trailer 1997 GM SSTK 16 Stock tandem axle, 88" w x 16' l, tire size 235/85 R16, poor, dual tire, has a spare in poor condition, GVW unknown, blue, , , , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Has patches of rust in outside and inside, floor needs to be rebuilt, tow only as it has extensive rust in the floor and walls, has panel to separate interior into two sections, has had metal tubing welded into the window frames, condition of undercarriage is unknown, electrical hook up unknown, plug is broken, does not have trailer brakes, lights non-operational., As is, where is		\$1	46,160,197
5,214.05	5-602	Trailer 1998 REAL INDUSTRIES Stock tandem axle, 80" w x 17'6" l, tire size 235/85 R16, fair, dual tire, has a spare tire, good, GVW 5531 kg, 7 pin hook up, green, , , , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Has patches of rust on outside and inside, floor seems to be solid, has panel to separate into 2 sections, condition of undercarriage is unknown, unknown if trailer brakes are operational, unknown if lights are operational., As is, where is		\$1	2R9G7LB29W1020749
581.14	5-550	SUV 2006 JEEP Liberty 4WD 3.7L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt tow hitch, wired for trailer lights, GVW 4950 lb, 4 speed, wheel base 104.2", single tire, tire size P235/65R17, silver, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 320,999 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Computer issues, ABS light on, traction control light on, cruise control non-operational, rear door non-operational, tires, windshield washer and wipers, paint, lights all in poor condition, exhaust and horn unknown condition. , As is, where is	320,999 km	\$20	1J4GL48K66W256727
400.00 *	4-525	Truck 2000 FORD F150 2WD, supercab, long box, 1/2 ton 5.4L, V8 gas auto A/C, tilt tow hitch, 4 pin trailer harness, GVW 6000 lb/2721 KG, 4 speed, wheel base 157.1" single tire, tire size P235/70R165L, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 210,315 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: broken taillight/brake light cover - drivers side, needs transmission, has rust issues - on frame by doors. NOTE: extra tailgates in truck box are not included. Motor/body exterior/windshield glass/windshield washer & wipers/paint/interior/mirrors fair, transmission/tires/brakes/lights poor, battery missing, exhaust/horn unknown condition.>, As is, where is	210,315 km	\$20	2FTZX1725YCA93330

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
201.00	5-551	Truck 2006 FORD F150 2WD, supercab, long box 5.4L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt tow hitch, 4 pin, trailer harness, GVW 8200lb/3720 kg, 4 speed, wheel base 163", single tire, tire size LT245/70R17, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 175,970 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Parts only, missing radiator and battery, scratches, dent drivers door, ripped seat cover left side, rust on bottom door frames both sides, rear passenger taillight, brake light non-operational, does come with tail gate, tires, brakes, windshield glass, windshield washer and wipers, paint and lights all in poor condition, exhaust and horn in unknown condition., As is, where is	175,970 km	\$20	1FTVX12536NB24260
581.14	5-549	Truck 1998 GMC 1500 2WD, extended cab, long box 5.4L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt tow hitch, trailer harness, GVW 6200 lb/2812 kg, 4 speed, wheel base 157.1", single tire, tire size p235/75R15, green, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 196,617 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hard to start, has been overheated, needs ball joints, rust on body including fenders, motor, transmission, body exterior, windshield glass, windshield washers and wipers, paint, interior, mirrors fair, tire, brakes, lights poor, battery missing, exhaust, horn unknown condition.>, As is, where is	196,617 km	\$20	1GTEC19M3WE538809
1,865.00	5-605	ATV 1999 POLARIS Sportsman 4x4 4WD CVT, 500cc, single cylinder, gas dual sensing engine braking system winch, tire size 23 x 7 - 10, 24 x 11 - 10, green, , 664 hrs, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Does not run, motor will not start, transmission, brakes, battery, exhaust and lights all in unknown condition.. As is, where is	664 hrs	\$1	99-29904
3,355.00	5-604	ATV 2004 YAMAHA Big Bear Pro 400 4WD manual, 386cc, single cylinder, gas electric start winch, tire size 25 x 8 x 12 front, 25 x 10 x 12 rear, green, , 1,165 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Condition of battery unknown.. As is, where is	1,165 km	\$1	113,933
6,602.22	5-564	Boat with Motor and Trailer, 2004 Lund Rebel boat, Yamaha motor, EZ loader, Model 14 40HP, 4 stroke 3 blade prop, gas, engine does not run, 16' aluminum, floor is rotten. 16' trailer, 2" ball hitch, plug four flat, tire size ST175/80R13 KNOWN PROBLEMS: lights do not work, cover is ripped. Poor		\$1	Motor -1015694 Boat- ZLUMA011H304 Trailer-1ZEAAYKA45AQ10292
31.56	5-501	Bear Bait Barrels, Lot of 16 metal, plastic Assorted. Poor		\$1	
1,525.00	5-521	Boat and Trailer, 1967 LUND metal 14', will need a flat deck trailer to load, has an adjustable ball hitch, tire size 5.20-12, no spare tire, no lights or light harness As is, where is		\$1	Boat 257250 Trailer 2673449
201.00	5-502	Boat Motor, Johnson 4hp, 2 stroke, unknown if operational. Poor		\$1	
501.00	5-503	Boat Motor Package, Evinrude 15hp, 2 stroke, 2 oars, 3 gas tanks, unknown if operational. Fair		\$1	

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid	5-504	Cattle Box, wood Chute designed for large animals, will need a trailer to load. Fair		\$1	
51.00	5-505	Charcoal Briquettes, Lot of 14 Ten 20lb bags, four 5lb bags. Fair		\$1	
86.00	5-506	Clay Pigeon Thrower, metal Spring tension, make unknown. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-507	Easel, Black Magic Art, metal, paper Fair		\$1	
12.00	5-508	Fishing Nets, Lot of 4 dipnets, metal 5 assorted, no holes. Fair		\$1	
1.23	5-509	Floor Mats, Lot of 2 Husky, rubber Front seat, 31 1/2" x 18". Good		\$1	
1.23	5-510	Hitch, metal Hidden. Poor		\$1	
1.23	5-511	Medical Equipment, Lot of 7 plastic Eye wash bottle and 6 air splints. Good		\$1	
No Bid	5-512	Pipe, PVC 1", approximately 25'. Fair		\$1	
5.00	5-513	Post Hole Digger, wood, metal Manual. Fair		\$1	
75.00	5-514	Quad Storage Box, Kimpex, plastic Good		\$1	
4.56	5-515	Tires, Lot of 24 used Assorted. Poor		\$1	
450.00	5-522	Trailer, 1992 Home-built Utility wood, metal Flat deck, 9' l x 6.5' w, has 1 7/8" ball hitch, tire size 6.70-15LT, tire condition fair, no spare tire, has 4 pin light harness which is broken, unknown if lights are operational. red As is, where is		\$1	SK400560277
No Bid	5-516	Tree Stand Platform, metal Fair		\$1	
111.11	5-517	Treestand, Double Seat, metal Has ladder assembly. Poor		\$1	
129.99	5-518	Treestand, Double Seat, metal Has ladder assembly. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-519	Weedwhacker, Green Machine, metal Unknown if operational. Poor		\$1	
11.00	5-520	Welder Package, Lot of 3 Linde 295, metal Comes with mask and welding rods, unknown if operational. Poor		\$1	



Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
3.00	5-523	Audio Recorder, Olympus, digital, voiceWS-801 4" l x 1.5" w, USB plug in, 1 AAA battery required, not included, internal storage wiped, microSD card not included, operational. Fair		\$1	100,147,795

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
3.00	5-524	Audio Recorder, Sony IC, ICD-PX312 4.5"l x 1.5"w, 2 AAA batteries required, not included, internal storage wiped, microSD not included, operational. Fair		\$1	1,599,824
11.00	5-525	Binoculars, Bushnell InstaFocus 10 x 50, 288ft at 1000yds, 96m at 1000m, field 5.5 degrees, comes with Bushnell case. Fair		\$1	
28.88	5-526	Binoculars, Pentax XCF 10 x 50, 6.5 degrees, comes with Bushnell case. Fair		\$1	1,007,035
1.20	5-527	Camera, Nikon L35 AF Corroded battery in terminal, internal memory wiped, unknown if operational. Broken Repairable		\$1	2,174,440
No Bid	5-528	Camera, Canon PowerShot A570 IS, digital Zoom lens 4 x optical, 5.8 - 23.2mm 1:2.6-5.5, internal memory wiped, unknown if operational. Fair		\$1	5,052,110,449
11.00	5-529	Camera, Fujifilm FinePix S1800, digital 18 x optical, f=5.0 - 90.0mm 1:3.1 - 5.6; 12megapixels, with carrying case, internal memory wiped, unknown if operational. Fair		\$1	0UB04328
No Bid	5-530	Camera, Sony MVC-FD200 FDMavica, digital 2.0 mega pixels, 6x precision digital zoom, duel media, mpeg movie does not have audio comes with rechargeable battery pack, AC power adapter, video connecting cable, USB cable, no charger for rechargeable batteries, internal memory wiped, unknown if operational. Fair		\$1	694,877
25.25	5-531	Metal Detector, Whites 3900/D Pro Plus Some minor corrosion in battery terminal, has carrying case, unknown if operational. Fair		\$1	29,145
128.88	5-532	Metal Detector, Whites Classic II Has carrying case, unknown if operational. Fair		\$1	4072-0295-022
6.00	5-533	Portable Vacuum, Euro-pro, EP033CA The Original Shark Turbo Hand Vac, 700 watts, comes with accessories and carry case, operational. Fair		\$1	3,408
101.00 *	4-522	Roller 1976 Massey SP912 Self propelled Ford 300, inline 6, gas Funk, 4 speed tire size, 7.5 x15, 14 ply, yellow, , unknown hrs, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Motor, transmission, brakes, and battery all condition unknown, possible parts missing like transmission, tires etc., tires, body, paint, exhaust all in poor condition, lights non-operational.>, As is, Where is	unknown hrs	\$100	239
*WD	5-553	Hose Crimper, Weatherhead, T-462-2 Portable, hydraulic, 4 sets of dies. 1/4,3/8,1/2", operational. Good		\$1	26,897
112.00	5-552	Plow , 2002, Les Produit Metalique, AT-1012, metal One way, yellow, 12' length x 5' height, attached hitch plate, non-operational. Poor		\$1	22-489
No Bid	5-606	Bookshelf , wood White, 12" w x 48" d x 87" h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-607	Cabinet, metal Grey, 20" x 36", 2 door, with lock and keys. Poor		\$1	
6.00	5-608	Cabinet, wood Grey, 13" w x 26" d x 36" h, 2 door. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-609	Chair, plastic White, no arms. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-610	Chairs, Lot of 10 metal Tan, no arms. Poor		\$1	
No Bid	5-611	Chairs, Lot of 5 metal, plastic Black, no arms. Fair		\$1	

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid	5-612	Chairs, Lot of 15 metal, plastic Grey, no arms. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-613	Chairs, Lot of 23 metal, plastic Tan, no arms. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-614	Coat Rack, metal Black, 16" w x 16" d x 70" h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-615	Credenza, wood Brown, 72" w x 20" d x 30" h, 6 drawer, 2 doors. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-616	Desk, wood Brown, 34" w x 60" w x 40" h, 8 drawer. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-617	Desk, wood Grey, 36" w x 30" d x 32" h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-618	Desk, Lot of 2 wood Grey, 74" w x 66" d x 32" h, with keyboard riser. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-619	Desk, wood Grey, 78" w x 42" d x 32" h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-620	Desk, Lot of 3 wood Grey, desk 28" w x 39" d x 32" h, one side 39" w x 39" d x 32" h, other side 28" w x 39" d x 32" h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-621	Desk, wood Red, 36" w x 72" d x 36" h, 6 drawer, with scuffs and wood chips. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-622	Desk, wood Red, 72" w x 30" d x 32" h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-623	Desk, Lot of 2 wood Red, one side 30" w x 48" d x 32" h, other side 30" w x 48" d x 32" h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-624	Desk, wood White, 24" w x 38" d x 36" h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-625	Desk, wood, metal Dark brown, 36" w x 84" d x 32" h, 4 drawers. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-626	Desk, wood, metal Light brown, 30" w x 60" d x 32" h, 5 drawers. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-627	Desk, Lot of 2 wood, with hutch Grey, desk 30" w x 60" d x 32" h, hutch 15" w x 60" d x 40" h. Fair		\$1	
36.01	5-628	Desk Set, Lot of 2 oak Brown, one side of desk 30" w x 42" d x 29" h, other side 30" w x 60" d x 29" h.		\$1	
No Bid	5-629	Desk Set, Lot of 4 wood, with hutch Grey, one side 32" w x 39" d x 32" h, one side 39" w x 39" d x 32" h, other side 32" w x 39" d x 32" h, hutch 16" w x 42" d x 40" h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-630	Desk Suite, Lot of 3 oak Brown, one side of desk, 42" w x 30" d x 29" h, other side 72" w x 30" d x 29" h, drawer 36" w x 42" d x 36" h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-631	File Cabinet, wood, lateral Brown, 20" w x 36" d x 42" h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-632	Hutch, wood Grey, 17" w x 60" d x 40" h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-633	Hutch, wood Grey, 17" w x 42" d x 54" h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-634	Hutch, wood Grey, 17" w x 72" d x 42" h. Fair		\$1	

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid	5-635	Hutch, wood Grey, 48" w x 17" d x 36" h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-636	Magazine Rack, metal Grey, brown, 37" w x 48" d. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-637	Table, round, wood Light brown, 48" w x 48" d x 28" h. Fair		\$1	
65.00	5-638	Table, wood Brown, 36" w x 96" d x 42" h. Poor		\$1	
*WD	5-639	Table, wood Grey, 72" w x 36" d x 36" h. Fair		\$1	
2.00	5-640	Table, wood Red, 30" w x 30" d x 21" h. Fair		\$1	
2.00	5-641	Table, wood Red, 30" w x 48" d x 24" h. Fair		\$1	
66.00	5-642	Table, wood Brown, 32" w x 56" d x 42" h. Fair		\$1	
155.55	5-557	Blade, John Deere, metal 48", yellow was used on a JD 345 lawn tractor, undermount with bolts, nut rods, hasn't been used in years, operational. Fair		\$1	M03481X071873
175.00	5-558	Broom, John Deere 49.5", 51" quick hitch, yellow, hasn't been used in years, unknown if operational. Poor		\$1	M051RBX010433
627.27	5-559	Broom, John Deere 51", PTO, yellow, quick hitch connect for front or rear if equipped PTO, hasn't been used in years, unknown if operational. Poor		\$1	M01671X115525
66.25	5-560	Flooring Roller, metal Operational, red, rust forming on rollers. Fair		\$1	
405.00	5-561	Mower Deck, 1996, John Deere 16.5", 48C Convertible, yellow, was used on a JD 345 tractor, hasn't been used in years, unknown if operational. Fair		\$1	M048CAC018531
627.27	5-562	Snow Blower Attachment, John Deere 47" w, quick hitch, hasn't been used in years, operational. Fair		\$1	M0475BX041750
805.00	5-563	Trailer, 1997 Utility tilt 12' l x 80" w, 2" ball hook up tire size ST205/75R15, no spare tire, 1 tire doesn't hold air KNOWN PROBLEMS: Non-operational, no trailer plug or lights, floor has holes. As is, where is		\$1	2CUBFBC29V2002837
No Bid	5-675	Blankets, Lot of 2 Homemade, synthetic fiber 42" w x 80" l, thin padding, one is green grey with rips, one is dark grey does not have any major rips but seams are coming out. Poor		\$1	
No Bid	5-676	Chairs, Lot of 8 vinyl, pleather Black, 5 castor, adjustable height, some have wear, the odd tear and some have some other marks. Fair		\$1	
326.00	5-575	Tool Storage, Jobmaster Chest, KNAACK, model 4824, metal Brown, comes with locks and keys but haven't been tested to see if they work, 48" w x 24" d x 28" h, customer needs to come with a truck, and it requires 2 people to load them. Good		\$1	

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
350.00	5-574	Tool Storage , Jobmaster Chest, KNAACK, model 42, metal Brown, comes with locks and keys but haven't been tested to see if they work, 42" w x 19" d x 23.25" h, customer needs to come with a truck, and it requires 2 people to load them. Good		\$1	
No Bid	5-537	Amplifier, Tortech, PA1060 Public address amplifier, operational. Good		\$1	SADJ2004-0246756
11.11	5-538	Document Camera, Elmo, TT-12i Operational. Good		\$1	1,527,549
11.11	5-539	Document Camera, Elmo, TT-12i Operational. Good		\$1	1,527,542
11.11	5-540	Document Camera, Elmo, TT-12iD Operational. Good		\$1	1,354,335
11.11	5-541	Document Camera, Elmo, TT-12iD Operational. Good		\$1	1,310,093
36.00	5-542	Document Camera, Elmo, TT-12iD Operational. Good		\$1	1,310,094
21.00	5-543	Document Camera, Elmo, TT-12iD Operational. Good		\$1	1,310,098
15.00	5-544	Document Camera, Elmo, TT-12iD Operational. Good		\$1	1,328,347
35.00	5-545	Pen Tablet, Elmo, CRA-1 Wireless, operational. New- Unused		\$1	5,854
201.00	5-546	Projector, Epson Powerlight, PL700U With mounting brackets, operational. Good		\$1	X55X920127L
100.99	5-547	Sound Bar, Creston, UC-SB Operational. Good		\$1	1924CR084380
No Bid	5-548	Speakers, Lot of 2 Soundtube, CM 50 Operational. Good		\$1	3437/3439
62.00	5-587	Sign Post, Lot of 45-50 wood 4"x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-588	Sign Post, Lot of 45-50 wood 4"x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	
127.17	5-589	Sign Post, Lot of 45-50 wood 4"x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	
101.17	5-590	Sign Post, Lot of 45-50 wood 4"x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
101.17	5-591	Sign Post, Lot of 50-59 wood 4"x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	
101.17	5-592	Sign Post, Lot of 55-65 wood 4"x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	
101.17	5-593	Sign Post, Lot of 55-65 wood 4"x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	
231.17	5-594	Sign Post, Lot of 70-80 wood 4"x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	
101.17	5-595	Sign Post, Lot of 50-60 wood 4"x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	
101.17	5-596	Sign Post, Lot of 45-50 wood 4"x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	
101.17	5-597	Sign Post, Lot of 45-50 wood 4"x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid *	1-551	Desk, Reception, wood Previously used reception desk has been professionally dismantled and is ready for transport, includes the main counter sections (a durable quartz countertop - 2-piece, piece 1- 8'7" l x 31" w x 1-1/8" thick, piece2 – 7'7" l x 31" w x 1-1/8" thick, side panels, and internal shelving components, minimal wear and tear from previous use. This desk is being sold in its component pieces and will require reassembly. Assembly instructions are NOT included. Reassembly will require some technical skill and potentially additional tools and hardware. Please carefully inspect the photos and consider arranging a viewing to assess the completeness and condition of all parts before bidding. Due to the size and weight of the components, transporting this desk will require more than one person. The buyer will be responsible for arranging their own pickup and transportation of all desk components between 8:00 am - 4:30 pm Mon-Fri. Innovation Saskatchewan will		\$500	
No Bid	5-643	Chair, fabric Black, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$10	
No Bid	5-644	Chair, fabric Black, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$10	
No Bid	5-645	Chair, fabric Black, high back, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$10	
25.00	5-646	Chair, fabric Blue, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height, black armrest. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$10	
46.05	5-647	Chairs, Lot of 5 fabric Black, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$40	
36.05	5-648	Chairs, Lot of 4 fabric Black, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$32	
No Bid	5-649	Chairs, Lot of 3 fabric Blue, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height, black armrest. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$15	
No Bid	5-650	Chairs, Lot of 3 fabric Blue, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height, black armrest. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Fair		\$15	
No Bid	5-651	Chairs, Lot of 2 fabric Blue, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height, black armrest. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$10	
No Bid	5-652	Chairs, Lot of 4 fabric Blue, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Fair		\$20	
No Bid	5-653	Chairs, Lot of 2 fabric Blue, 5 casters, adjustable seat height, black armrest. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Fair		\$10	
No Bid	5-654	Chairs, Lot of 2 fabric Grey, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$10	



Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid	5-655	Chairs, Lot of 3 fabric Grey, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$15	
30.05	5-656	Chairs, Lot of 3 fabric Navy, 5 casters, adjustable seat height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$24	
36.05	5-657	Chairs, Lot of 4 fabric Navy, 5 casters, adjustable seat height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$32	
No Bid	5-658	Chairs, Lot of 2 fabric Navy, 5 casters, adjustable seat height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$10	
25.51	5-659	Chairs, Lot of 2 fabric, mesh Black, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$16	
No Bid	5-660	Chairs, Lot of 6 fabric, wood frame Assorted colours, dark blue, light blue, pink, teal, and brown. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Fair		\$5	
195.99	5-661	Chairs, Lot of 3 mesh Black, 5 casters, adjustable arms/ seat height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Fair		\$24	
195.99	5-662	Chairs, Lot of 3 mesh Black, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Fair		\$24	
No Bid	5-677	Desk, laminate, metal Brown, 1 drawer, 36"w x 24"d x 29.5"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$10	
No Bid	5-678	Desk, L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72"w x 36"d x 28"h, extension 42"w x 20"d x 28"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$25	
No Bid	5-679	Desk, L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72"w x 36"d x 28"h, extension 42"w x 20"d x 28"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$25	
No Bid	5-680	Desk, U-Shaped, wood Burgundy, hutch side 70"w x 20"d x 29"h, hutch 66"w x 15"d x 37.5'h, middle 37.5"w x 24"d x 29"h, right side 70"w x 36"d x 29"h, entire 104"w x 70"d, 48" opening from left to right, currently disassembled, no assembly instructions, comes with hardware to assemble. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$150	
No Bid	5-663	Desk, L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72"w x 36"d x 28"h, extension 42"w x 20"d x 28"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$25	
No Bid	5-664	Desk, L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72"w x 36"d x 28"h, extension 42"w x 20"d x 28"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$25	
No Bid	5-665	Desk, L-Shape, laminate Beige, 72"w x 36"d x 28"h, extension 42"w x 20"d x 28"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$25	
No Bid	5-666	Desk Riser, Varidesk, 49900, laminate, metal, wood Black, adjustable height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$75	



Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
40.00	5-667	File Cabinet, metal, lateral Beige, no key, 3 drawer, 36"w x 18"d x 39.5"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$10	
No Bid	5-668	File Cabinet, metal, lateral Beige, no key, 4 drawer, 36"w x 18"d x 51.5"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Fair		\$10	
10.00	5-669	File Cabinet, metal, lateral Beige, with key, 3 shelves with flip top lid, 1 drawer, 36"w x 18"d x 54"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$10	
No Bid	5-670	File Cabinet, metal, lateral Beige, with key, 4 drawer, 36"w x 18"d x 54"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$10	
35.00	5-681	Folding Table, laminate, metal Brown, rectangle, 72"w x 30"d x 29"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$15	
35.00	5-682	Folding Table, laminate, metal Brown, rectangle, 72"w x 30"d x 29"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$15	
30.00	5-683	Folding Table, laminate, metal Brown, rectangle, 72"w x 30"d x 29"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$15	
35.00	5-684	Folding Table, laminate, metal Brown, rectangle, 96"w x 30"d x 29"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$15	
No Bid	5-671	Pedestal, laminate, lateral Beige, no key, no casters, 3 drawer, 24.5"w x 16.75"d x 26.5"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$10	
No Bid	5-672	Pedestal, laminate, lateral Beige, no key, with casters, 3 drawer, 24.5"w x 17.5"d x 26.5"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$10	
No Bid	5-673	Pedestal, laminate, lateral Beige, with key, no casters, 2 drawer, 24.5"w x 17.5"d x 26.5"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$10	
No Bid	5-685	Pedestal, metal, vertical Beige, no key, 3 drawer, 12.25"w x 23"d x 27.5"h 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$10	
No Bid	5-686	Pedestal, metal, vertical Black, with key, 3 drawer, 15"w x 29"d x 27.25"h, few scratches on top. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Fair		\$5	
No Bid	5-674	Standing Desk Work Station, Ergotron, laminate, steel Black, dual monitor and keyboard, adjustable height. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$20	
No Bid	5-687	Table, laminate, metal base Brown, round, 36" diameter x 29.5"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$15	

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid	5-688	Table, laminate, metal base Brown, round, 41.5" diameter x 29.5"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$15	
No Bid	5-689	Table, laminate, steel Mahogany, rectangle, 72"w x 30.25"d x 30"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$15	
No Bid	5-690	Table, laminate, steel Mahogany, rectangle, 72"w x 30.25"d x 30"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$15	
No Bid	5-691	Table, laminate, steel Mahogany, rectangle, 72"w x 30.25"d x 30"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$15	
No Bid	5-692	Table, laminate, steel Mahogany, rectangle, 72"w x 30.25"d x 30"h. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Good		\$15	
No Bid *	2-525	Chair, cloth Brown, adjustable, 5 castor, no armrests. Good		\$5	
No Bid *	2-528	Credenza, wood Pepperdust, 4 drawers, 2 doors, 72" w x 20" d x 28" h. Good		\$20	
15.00 *	2-530	File Cabinet, metal, lateral Beige, 4 drawers, locks, no keys, 18" w x 28" d x 51" h. Good		\$8	
50.00 *	2-531	File Cabinet, metal, lateral Beige, 5 drawers, locks, no keys, 36" w x 18" d x 64" h. Good		\$8	
No Bid *	2-534	Table, wood, round Brown, 60" diameter, 29" h. Good		\$50	
No Bid	5-535	Oven, Baker's Pride Non-operational but all controls have been dismantled and only turns on to 350 degrees F, 31"w x 26"d (31" with handle) x 25 1/8"h. Broken Repairable		\$1	
No Bid	5-536	Oven, Baker's Pride Non-operational but all controls have been dismantled and only turns on to 350 degrees F, 31"w x 26"d (31" with handle) x 25 1/8"h. Broken Repairable		\$1	
No Bid	5-534	Oven, Baker's Pride Operational, but all controls have been dismantled and only turns on to 350 degrees F, 31"w x 26"d (31" with handle) x 25 1/8"h. Good		\$25	
No Bid	5-565	Chair, leather Black, leather is peeling, arms are worn. Poor		\$1	
No Bid *	2-512	Desk, particle board Brown desk, main part of desk, 71" w x 35 1/2" d x 28 1/2" h, other side, 23 1/2" w x 35" d x 28 1/2" h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	2-513	Desk, particle board Brown, two drawers, no locks, 45" w x 24" d x 29 1/2" h, some damage on side. Fair		\$1	
10.00 *	2-514	Desk Riser, wood, metal 34" long x width when extended 28 1/52". Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-566	Document Holders, Lot of 7 plastic Grey, 10 1/2"w x 13 1/2"h x 1 1/2"thickness, with clip board. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-567	File Folders, Lot of 14 Pendaflex A88GD-10, paper 14 boxes, 250 per box, end tabs folders with reinforced tab, letter size, full tab, 13.5 pt., ivory. New- Unused		\$1	
No Bid	5-568	Pedestal, Pepperdust, 3 drawers, locking with no key, 17.25"w x 24.25"d x 26.75"h. Fair		\$1	

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid	5-569	Safety Toe Covers, Lot of 18 steel, rubber, Uline 2 small new, 2 small used, 3 medium new, 6 medium used, 1 large new, 4 large used, white/red/yellow, slips quickly over shoes, sneakers		\$1	
No Bid	5-570	Tables, Lot of 2 wood Both pepperdust, 24" round x 18"h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	5-573	Grader, 1995 John Deere 770BH RWDJD 6076 7.6L, inline 6, diesel standard 8 gears forward 4 reverse, rear axle tandem drive, single tire, tire size 17.5R25, Moe board 10 feet, GVW unknown, differential unknown, there is no key. yellow 13,330 hours KNOWN PROBLEMS: Motor knocks, burns oil, low compression and will not start. Transmission slips out of gear, exhaust is rusted out, pins and bushing seized and worn, numerous electrical issues, some lights not working, numerous hydraulic leaks, tires worn out cracked and leaking, windshield cracked/chipped, motor/transmission/brakes/exhaust/windshield washer/wipers/paint/interior/lights/mirrors/horn poor, battery removed, minor exterior damage.> As is, where is	13,330 hours	\$8,000	548,968
8,330.00	5-572	Loader, 1997 Samsung ST-120-2 AWD Cummins 6BT 5.9L, inline 6, diesel standard Air, tilt 1.5 yard bucket, 3 gears forward 3 reverse,, rear axle single, standard differential, single tire, tire size 20.5R25, GVW unknown yellow 5,330 hours KNOWN PROBLEMS: Motor has a miss and hasn't ran in a while, has one key, does not run, transmission has shifting and electrical issues, exhaust is rusted out, bucket pins and bushing seized and worn, numerous electrical issues, ROPS is rusted out, cab is rusted out, numerous hydraulic leaks, tires are cracked and leaking, windshield cracked/chipped, motor/transmission/tires/brakes/exhaust/windshield washer/wipers/paint/interior/lights/mirrors/horn poor, battery removed, minor exterior damage.> As is, where is	5,330 hours	\$5,000	LDY0040
10,001.51	5-571	Wheel Loader, 2005 Komatsu WA-250 5MC AWD Cummins 5.9L, inline 6, diesel standard Air, tilt, 1 key 2.5-yard bucket, 4 speeds, standard differential, single tire, tire size 20.5R25, GVW unknown yellow 4,817 hours KNOWN PROBLEMS: Motor runs rough with a miss, transmission has electrical issues, exhaust is rusted out, bucket pins and bushing seized and worn, numerous electrical issues, ROPS is rusted out, shifting issues, numerous hydraulic leaks, motor poor, transmission poor, brakes poor, exhaust poor, windshield & wipers poor, windshield chipped/cracked, lights/mirrors/horn poor, paint/interior poor, battery removed, minor exterior damage.> As is, where is	4,817 hours	\$5,000	1,791
*WD	* 3-542	Magazine Shelf, metal 37.5"l x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square shelf on the inside. Fair		\$1	
*WD	* 3-543	Magazine Shelf, metal 37.5"l x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square shelf on the inside. Fair		\$1	
*WD	* 3-544	Magazine Shelf, metal 37.5"l x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square shelf on the inside. Fair		\$1	

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
*WD	* 3-545	Magazine Shelf, metal 37.5"l x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square shelf on the inside. Fair		\$1	
*WD	* 3-546	Magazine Shelf, metal 37.5"l x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square shelf on the inside. Fair		\$1	
*WD	* 3-547	Magazine Shelf, metal 37.5"l x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square shelf on the inside. Fair		\$1	
*WD	* 3-548	Magazine Shelf, metal 37.5"l x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square shelf on the inside. Fair		\$1	
*WD	* 3-549	Magazine Shelf, metal 37.5"l x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square shelf on the inside. Fair		\$1	
*WD	* 3-550	Magazine Shelf, metal 37.5"l x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square shelf on the inside. Fair		\$1	
*WD	* 3-551	Magazine Shelf, metal 37.5"l x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square shelf on the inside. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	* 4-508	ATV/Snowmobile Attachments, Lot of 3 metal ATV rack black, two snowmobile double up seat, black, unknown make or model. Fair		\$1	
5.26	* 4-509	Bicycle, Hyper, Boundary Trail 24 18 speed, brakes work, frame size 24", comes with bell. Poor		\$1	
No Bid	* 4-510	Boat Canopy, 32"w x 48"d x 21.5"h, without attachment points, no Hardware provided. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	* 4-511	Console Seats, Lot of 2 cloth Grey, unknown make of truck console seats, stained, soiled. Good		\$1	
No Bid	* 4-513	Flood lights, Lot of 2 plastic Handhelds, hardwired, black, unknow watts/volts, unknown if operational. Poor		\$1	
No Bid	* 4-517	Platform Stand, homebuilt, fiberglass No hardware provided. Poor		\$1	
No Bid	* 4-519	Platform Stand, homebuilt, wood, With ladder, no hardware provided. Poor		\$1	
26.11	* 4-524	Truck Tool Boxes, Delta, metal 65"l x 10"w x 12"d, no hardware to attach, single compartment, no key, rail mounted. Fair		\$1	
107.00	5-576	Sign Posts, Lot of 87 wood Used, 4" x 6", range between 8 to 12 feet banded, in a bundle of 80 posts, Winning bidder must remove posts from ministry property in a timely manner, must supply an appropriate flatbed trailer, forklift and operator available during business hours. Fair		\$1	
63.00	5-577	Sign Posts, Lot of 42 wood Used, 4"x 6", range between 8 to 12 feet, banded, in a bundle of 48 posts, Winning bidder must remove posts from ministry property in a timely manner, must supply an appropriate flatbed trailer, forklift and operator available during business hours. Fair		\$1	

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
71.00	5-578	Sign Posts, Lot of 48 wood Used, 4"x6", range between 8 to 12 feet, banded, in a bundle of 42 posts, Winning bidder must remove posts from ministry property in a timely manner, must supply an appropriate flatbed trailer, forklift and operator available during business hours. Fair		\$1	
105.00	5-579	Sign Posts, Lot of 80 wood Used, 4"x6", range between 8 to 12 feet, banded, in a bundle of 87 posts, Winning bidder must remove posts from ministry property in a timely manner, must supply an appropriate flatbed trailer, forklift and operator available during business hours. Fair		\$1	
175.27	5-581	Sign Post, Lot of 50-60 wooden 4" x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	
175.27	5-582	Sign Post, Lot of 90-100 wooden 4" x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	
175.27	5-583	Sign Post, Lot of 90-100 wooden 4" x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	
175.27	5-584	Sign Post, Lot of 55-65 wooden 4" x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	
175.27	5-585	Sign Post, Lot of 55-65 wooden 4" x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	
175.27	5-586	Sign Post, Lot of 70-80 wooden 4" x 6", 8 to 14 feet long approximately, old broken, partially treated/painted, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs.; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair		\$1	

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
399.99	5-598	Welder, Lincoln Idealarc Mig Comes with Mig gun and gas regulators, come with cart, internal boards changed recently, making inconsistent welds, amperage would go all over the place, the control boards inside were changed to rectify this situation, the welder worked well for a time but is now back to making an inconsistent weld, likely has control board issues again, operational but doesn't make consistent weld, can likely be repaired. Fair		\$1	U1970910633
3,333.00	5-599	Welder, Lincoln, Ranger 225 Stick and TIG capable, gas-powered generator (engine-driven), Kohler CH730 4stroke 2-cylinder 23hp, 120/240V, 10,500 watts peak, 9000 watts continuous, 12 gallons, non-operational, low hours 6.9 hrs., no cables or other attachments. Fair		\$1	U1141208986
100.00	5-554	Sign Posts, Lot of 50-60 wood, spruce, 1 lift Used, 4" x 6" x 8' to 12' approximately, mix of treated and untreated spruce posts, old broken sign posts, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs, must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading, if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer, ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load, trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Please note lifts are now smaller to make handling safer 50-60 posts per lift. Fair		\$1	
100.00	5-555	Sign Posts, Lot of 50-60 wood, spruce, 1 lift Used, 4" x 6" x 8' to 12' approximately, mix of treated and untreated spruce posts, old broken sign posts, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs, must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading, if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer, ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load, trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Please note lifts are now smaller to make handling safer 50-60 posts per lift. Fair		\$1	
151.00	5-556	Sign Posts, Lot of 50-60 wood, spruce, 1 lift Used, 4" x 6" x 8' to 12' approximately, mix of treated and untreated spruce posts, old broken sign posts, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs, must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading, if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer, ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load, trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Please note lifts are now smaller to make handling safer 50-60 posts per lift. Fair		\$1	
180.00	5-580	Sign Posts, Lot of 50-60 wood, spruce Used, 4" x 6", 8 to 12 feet approximately, mix of treated and untreated, some are old and broken, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs., must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading, if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer, Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load, trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff, please note lifts are now smaller to make handling safer 50-60 posts per lift. Fair		\$1	

Bid Price	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
551.00 *	2-510	Leica GPS 1200 System, 2007, 1200 series 1200 series Composed of: GX1230 Base Controller, AX1202 Base Rover, GZS4-1 Height Hook, GDF122 Optical Tribrach, GRT146 Carrier w 5/8" thread, Pacific Crest PDL4535 Base Radio, RX1250XC Rover Controller, GHT56 Controller Mount, ATX1230 Receiver Rover, x4 GEB211 Batteries, GKL22 Battery Charger, Assorted power & connection cables, x2 plastic carrying cases w styrofoam interior. GPS Components manufactured in 2007 and 2008, components are green and/or white in colour. Noticeable wear present on most GPS components. cables, tribrach, carrier and height hook still in good condition. light dust present on most components. GPS system has been stored in a cool dry place for up to the past 10 years. Unknown if still fully operational. Still useful for spare parts. Fair		\$500	GX1230 Base Controller: 468771 AX1202 Base Rover: 07410156 RX1250XC Rover Controller: 311319 GHT56 Controller Mount: 107837 ATX1230 Receiver Rover: 185548 GKL22 Battery Charger: 0030865
		sXnX To MINISTRY, LOCATION, NAME, PHONE # , , , , , ,			
		s5n1 By SPL Brian McLean 306-290-9450 , , , , , ,			
		sXnX To MINISTRY, LOCATION, NAME, PHONE # , , , , , ,			
	Test	, , , , , ,			