SaskBuilds and Procurement

Goveror;ment SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
A Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1
SALE SUMMARY LIST

SaskSurplus Sale #4

From Jul 02 to Jul 09, 2025

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as
described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding.

Vehicles and equipment are sold “AS IS, WHERE IS”, there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.

- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.
It is the Bidder’s responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.
Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.
Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,

- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3300,

- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or

- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.
WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.
No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

7/9/2025,2:55 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #4

From Jul 02 to Jul 09, 2025

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

Bid Price Item #

Description Kms Min Price

Serial Number

REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca

3,408.00 4-003

Car 2007 CHEVROLET Impala LS FWD 3.5L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 220,898
power mirrors/locks/windows/left front seat/trunk release, keyless entry-2 fobs, 2 keys , km
brown, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must

be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is

sold in “As is, where is” condition., 220,898 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:

Front pads/rotors, front wheel bearing, rear pads/rotors, right rear wheel bearing noise, tire
TPMS, windshield cracked, left front door binding molding loose.

Hood debts/chips/scratches, both bumpers’ dents/chips/scratches, left front fender

dent/chips, left rear fender dents/rust, right front fender dent/scratches, right rear fender

rust, left front door rusted at bottom, left rear door rusted at bottom/scratches, right side

doors rusted at bottom, roof scratches, trunk lid scratches, no firs aid kit/fire extinguisher,
windshield chips/cracked, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

$854 2G1WB58K879342800

16,101.00 4-004

Truck 2012 DODGE/RAM 5500 SLT RWD, crew cab, 7'x10' dump body 6.7L, inline 6, diesel 309,009 $10,974 3C7WDMEL7CG196840

auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power tow mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless ~ km
entry-1 key fob grille inserts, front/rear wig wags-condition unknown, mud flaps, side steps,
hitch, trailer wiring, electric trail brake, dump body-condition unknow, drop down sides, dual
rear wheel, tailgate electric lift-rusted-condition of components unknown, has a back seat,
white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be
signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed.
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 309,009 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS:
Instrument warning light-other diagnosis required, park brake inoperable, rear rotors below,
oil change needed.

Grille paint peeling, front bumper rust/chips, roof small rust spots, one hole in roof(antenna),
no spare tire/wheel wrench/jack/first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front
seat worn/frame visible, instrument cluster cracked, tar both cab corners, hole under rear
right seat, small holes in front hump, no jump seat, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As
is, where is

7/9/2025,2:55 PM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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4,088.00 4-002

Truck 2017 FORD F250 4WD, super duty crewcab, 5'x10" box 6.2L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt,
cruise, AM/FM. Power mirrors/locks/windows, trailer tow mirrors, keyless entry-1 key fob, 1
other key front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake,
toolbox in box-condition unknown 1 key, box liner, headache rack with beacon wig wags
condition unknown, wig wags on grille condition unknown, has a back seat, blue, TOW ONLY,
This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes
full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is,
where is” condition., 304,843 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Check engine
light on note motor problem starter no engaging, miss firing/stalling, codes PO6E9 engine
stater performance, V3003 battery, P0300/P0301/302/305/306 misfire, came in flooded,
engine oil level over full and catalytic converter apparently plugged, #1 cylinder has low
compression, #3/#6 and #7 are slightly low, bore scape engine and reported had a cracked
valve spring-does not say which one will need to remove valve covers, right upper ball joint,
pit arm, alignment needed, poor battery, windshield, right rear tail light assembly, left front
marker.

Hood chips/scratches, front bumper badly rusted, rear bumper rusted/dented, left side
fenders road rash/scratches, right rear fender scratches/dent, tailgate
chips/scratches/molding broke, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips/cracked,
left front seat worn/sagging/ripped, left front seat back hole, poor battery, minor exterior
damage.>, As is, where is

304,843
km

$3,432 1FT7W2B63HEC26638

7,945.45 4-005

Van 2008 GMC Savana 3500 EXT RWD 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player,
rear HVAC, 2 keys hitch, trailer wiring, tinted windows, 15 passenger, grey, TOW ONLY, This
vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes
full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is,
where is” condition., 225,469 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Drivers head
light cuts out on high, no license plate light.

Hood dents/chips, front bumper pitted/cover broke, rear bumper scratches/dented, left rear
bumper rusted, right rear fender scratches/rusted, rocker panels rusted, left front door
rusted along bottom, right front door rusted at bottom, right rear door scraped, roof
scape/dents, tailgate paint around license plate trim, no wheel wrench/jack/firs aid kit/fire
extinguisher, windshield chips, pad damaged, all seats soiled, poor battery, minor exterior
damage.>, As is, where is

225,469
km

$4,742 1GJHG39KX81218837

7/9/2025,2:55 PM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.



SaskBuilds and Procurement SaskSurplus Sale #4

Govero':me”t SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From Jul 02 to Jul 09, 2025
A Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092
Bid Price Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca

2.00 4-121 Antennas, Lot of 6, Assorted 2-way radio antennas, various lengths. Fair S1
5.00 4-106 Blankets, Lot of 4 (3) polyester, (1) undetermined fibries, 1 carry bag, 1 queen sized blanket, S5
2 black blankets, 1-115cm X 180 cm blanket. Fair
5.00 4-107 Blankets, Lot of 5 (3) polyester, (1) undetermined fibries, (1) mylar, 1 carry bag, 3 black S5
blankets, thermal blanket, 115cm x180 cm blanket. Fair
No Bid * 3-102 Cabinet, metal, Wall mount, suitable for keys, 100 internal hooks, black, locking, 1 key, $120
16.75”w x 3.75”d x 16.75”h, scratches in exterior and interior. Fair
63.00 * 3-103 Cabinet, plywood, Gray and white, lockable no lock, 48”w x 12”d x 84”h, 12 compartments. $25
Fair
11.01 4-108 Casters, Lot of 2 metal, 3.75”, 2 of 4 are lockable, all are mounted to heavy duty frame. Fair $10
No Bid 4-122 Disposable Emergency Stretcher, , Weave canvas, black. Excellent $10
No Bid 4-101 Flashlights , Lot of 6 Garrity, 5 hand held, 1 other, with 2-6V batteries. Fair S1
23.00 4-102 Magnetic Antenna Assembly, PCTEL, 16' lead, 16" mast. Fair S5
30.00 4-103 Magnetic Antenna Assembly, PCTEL, MWV 1322 HD, 16'lead, 37" mast. Fair S5
20.00 * 3-110 Paint Sprayer, Cambell Hausfold, Fair S1
17.77 4-116 Pry Bar, Task, Wrecking , Nail pulling claw, 36"l. Fair $10
No Bid * 2-104 Rear Seat, , Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 2nd row, captain chair. Fair S5
No Bid * 2-105 Rear Seat, , Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 2nd row, captain chair. Fair S5
No Bid * 2-106 Rear Seat, , Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, head rest loose. Fair S5
No Bid * 2-107 Rear Seat, , Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, rear trim loose. Fair S5
No Bid * 2-108 Rear Seat, , Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, seat belt buckle not S5
protruding. fair
No Bid * 2-109 Rear Seat, , Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row. Fair S5
12.00 4-111 Shovel, Garant, Nordic Series, Wooden shaft 45”1, metal scoop 10”w x 13.5”d. Good $10
No Bid 4-112 Shovel, Mastercraft, Wooden shaft 32.5”], metal scoop 9”w x 12.5”d. Fair S5

7/9/2025,2:55 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 4
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Bid Price Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
1.00 * 3-112 Shovel, Suncast, Telescoping, metal shaft, 13” x 11” plastic scoop, 28.5” not extended, 36.5” S1
extended. Fair
6.75 4-113 Shovel, True Temper, Wooden shaft 36”1, metal scoop 12”w x 9”d. Fair S5
6.75 4-117 Shovel, True Temper, Wooden shaft 40.5”], metal scoop 11”"w x 9”d. Fair S5
6.75 4-118 Shovel, True Temper, Wooden shaft 47”1, metal scoop 10.5”"w x 13"d. Fair S5
6.00 4-114 Shovel, , Wooden shaft 44”|, metal scoop 13”w x 10.5"d. Fair S5
10.00 4-115 Shovel, , Wooden shaft 45”1, metal scoop 18” w x 13”d. Fair S5
No Bid 4-119 Shovel, , Wooden shaft 50”1, metal scoop 14.5”"w x 18”d. Poor S1
19.05 4-123 Tarp, Uline S-3886, poly, 16'x 20', 5 mil, blue. Excellent $10
40.00 4-124 Tire on Rim, 225/60R16, Goodyear Assurance, M+S, steel, May be compatible with a 2013 $25
Chevrolet Impala, manufacture date. Week 25, year 2011. Good
161.56 4-104 Tires, Set of 4 225/75R16, Firestone Winterforce 2, Snow flake, M+S, Manufacture date, $160
Week 04, year 2020. Good
7.80 4-120 Tow Rope, nylon, 13'l, yellow, braided, hooks on each end. Fair S5
No Bid 4-105 Trouble Light, Noma, Max 75 Watts, type A, 50' cord. Fair S5
No Bid 4-125 Vacuum, Eureka, Easy Clean, model 71, Type B4 electric, 120 volts AC 60 Hz 5.5 amps, one $10 UH437002419
thin nose attachment, suction operational, spinning brush non-operational. Fair
20.00 4-109 Vehicle Kit, Canadian Tire, 13 items. Carry case, flashlight-no batteries, S.0.S. sign, poncho, $10
booster cables, cables, tow rope, 2-pairs of gloves, funnel, blanket, 2 triangles, 1
screwdriver,1 plier. Fair
10.00 4-110 Warning Triangle Kit, James King, Model 1005, plastic, 3 triangles in kit, red storage box. S5
Fair
63.00 4-126 Book Case, Hon, lateral, metal, 3 shelf, black, 34"w x 12"d x 42"h. Poor S1
3.27 4-127 Book Case, Hon, lateral, metal, 3 shelf, black, 34"w x 12"d x 42"h. Poor S1
3.28 4-128 Book Case, Hon, lateral, metal, 3 shelf, black, 34"w x 12"d x 42"h. Poor S1
7.25 4-129 Book Shelf, wood, 3 shelves, 2 door, brown, sliding doors come off easily, trim peeling, S1
scratches, 43" w x 16" d x 48" h. Fair
No Bid 4-130 Chair, Swivel, cloth, Black, 5 caster, adjustable height, no arms. Fair S1
15.00 4-131 Chair, Swivel, cloth, Blue, 5 caster, adjustable height and arms, seat worn. Poor S1

7/9/2025,2:55 PM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 5
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No Bid 4-132 Chair, Swivel, cloth, Blue, 5 caster, adjustable height and arms. Fair S1
No Bid 4-133 Chair, Swivel, cloth, Grey, 5 caster, adjustable height, no arms. Fair s1
5.80 4-134 Chair, Swivel, mesh back, Black, 5 caster, adjustable height and arms, seat soiled. Poor S1
No Bid 4-135 Chairs, Lot of 2 Swivel, mesh, Green, 5 caster, adjustable height no arms. Fair S1
No Bid 4-136 Chairs, Lot of 3 Swivel, mesh back, Black, 5 caster, adjustable height, arms worn, seats soiled. S1
Poor

No Bid 4-137 Desk, L-Shape, Pepperdust, 72" w x 36" d x 29" h, return attached pedestal 2 drawers, 42" w S1
x 19.25" d x 29" h attach pedestal 2 drawers, no locks, keyboard mount not attached, screws
included. Poor

No Bid 4-138 Desk, L-Shape, Pepperdust, 72" w x 36" d x 29" h, return, 42" w x 19" d x 29" h, pedestal 18" S1
w x 24.5" d x 26.5" h on wheels, locks, no key, keyboard tray mount underneath, screws
included. Poor

No Bid 4-139 Drafting Table, wood, laminate, 52"w x 30"d x 31"h. Poor S1

1.00 4-140 File Cabinet, metal, lateral, 4-drawer, black, locks, no key, 36" w x 18" d x 54" h. Fair S1
No Bid * 9-118 Keyboard Holder Mount, metal, 30"w x 11"d, bracket 17"w x 7"d, black. Fair S1

1.00 * 9-123 Painting, wood, Anne Geddes, 36"w x 12"d. Good S1

30.00 * 12-131 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M401dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, S$1 VNG3703421
no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair

63.00 4-141 Table, laminate, wood, Brown, on 4 casters-2 can be lock, 60"w x 24"d x 30"h, missing right S1
front wheel. Poor

63.00 4-142 Table, laminate, wood, Brown, on 4 casters-2 can be lock, 60"w x 24"d x 30"h, missing right S1
rear wheel. Poor

15.00 4-143 Table, laminate, wood, Brown, on 4 casters-2 can be lock, 60"w x 24"d x 30"h. Fair S1

12.00 4-144 Table, laminate, wood, Brown, on 4 casters-2 can be lock, 60"w x 24"d x 30"h. Fair S1

No Bid 4-145 Water Cooler, Vitapur, plastic, Black, operational, no water jug, unknown if cool or hot is S1

operational. Poor

7/9/2025,2:55 PM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.



SaskBuilds and Procurement SaskSurplus Sale #4

Govero':me”t SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From Jul 02 to Jul 09, 2025
‘ Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092
Bid Price Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

CYPRESS HILLS INTERPROVINCIAL PARK, Parks, Culture & Sport, Maintenance Yard - Call for Directions
Contact Wayne Welte 306-662-5419 or 306-661 7135, wayne.welte@gov.sk.ca

858.00 4-526 Truck 2000 CHEVROLET Silverado 2WD, extended cab, 3 door, short box 5.3L, V8, gas auto 280,942 $20 1GCEC14W5YZ327826
A/C, tilt GVW 6400 Ib/2903 KG, 4 speed, single axle, wheel base 143.5", single tire, tire size ~ km
P235/75R16, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety
concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full
responsibility for repairs if required., 280,942 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: ignition switch
issues, tailgate doesn't close, hail damage, right front fender been replaced, damage to hood
on passenger side, missing body molding - driver's side. Motor/transmission/brakes/body
exterior/interior/mirrors fair, tires/windshield washer & wipers/paint/lights poor, battery
missing, exhaust/horn unknown, windshield glass good.>, As is, where is

No Bid 4-525 Truck 2000 FORD F150 2WD, supercab, long box, 1/2 ton 5.4L, V8 gas auto A/C, tilt tow hitch, 210,315 $20 2FTZX1725YCA93330
4 pin trailer harness, GVW 6000 Ib/2721 KG, 4 speed, wheel base 157.1" single tire, tire size  km
P235/70R165L, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety
concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full
responsibility for repairs if required. , 210,315 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: broken
taillight/brake light cover - drivers side, needs transmission, has rust issues - on frame by
doors. NOTE: extra tailgates in truck box are not included. Motor/body exterior/windshield
glass/windshield washer & wipers/paint/interior/mirrors fair, transmission/tires/brakes/lights
poor, battery missing, exhaust/horn unknown condition.>, As is, where is

LA RONGE, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 800 Poirier St
Contact Brad Johns 306-425-4240, brad.johns@gov.sk.ca

199.00 * 3-501 Snowmobile,2012 Skidoo TundralT 600 ACE ,600 ACE unknown kmKNOWN PROBLEMS: unknown S1 2BPSGHCA4CV000009
Motor is blown, needs clutches and new track, skis have been removed, boggie wheels need km
replacement and the cowling is missing, the unit had previously been on fire, for parts only.>
As is, where is

LOON LAKE, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 39 Golf Course Rd

Contact Beth Kelly 306-837-2413, beth.kelly@gov.sk.ca or Ben Lesage 639-836-7103, ben.lesage@gov.sk.ca

2.00 * 3-531 Tree Stand, metal, 2 person tree stand, rusted, no pins for assembly. Poor S1

7/9/2025,2:55 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 7
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‘ Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092
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MAPLE CREEK, Corrections, Policing & Public Safety, Hwy 21 Service Rd N

Contact: Tyler Hansen 639-236-7132, tyler.hansen@gov.sk.ca or Michael Banks 639-932-7043, michael.banks@gov.sk.ca

No Bid * 1-566 Booster Cables, light duty, Black, operational. Fair S1

No Bid * 1-567 Booster Cables, light duty, Smaller set of clamps, operational. Fair s1

MOOSE JAW, Highways, 1 km South of Moose Jaw on Hwy. 2
Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca

No Bid * 4-522 Roller 1976 Massey SP912 Self propelled Ford 300, inline 6, gas Funk, 4 speed tire size, 7.5  unknown $100 239
x15, 14 ply, yellow, , unknown hrs,, KNOWN PROBLEMS: Motor, transmission, brakes, and hrs
battery all condition unknown, possible parts missing like transmission, tires etc., tires, body,
paint, exhaust all in poor condition, lights non-operational.>, As is, Where is

NIPAWIN, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 711 Nipawin Rd E
Contact Brant Slater 306-862-1790 or 306-812-8345. brant.slater@gov.sk.ca

25.00 * 1-505 Centre Console Seat, , From a 2015 Dodge Ram 2500, with head rest. Good S1

No Bid * 1-516 Jig Saw, SKIL - 4960 T2, 2 speed, 115 volts, SPM 2800, operational. Fair S1

NORTH BATTLEFORD, Water Security Agency, 10030 Thatcher Ave

Contact Troy Watt 306-490-9073, troy.watt@wsask.ca or Ayold Elgersma 306-631-0460, ayold.elgersma@wsask.ca

655.55 4-504 Trailer 2003 Trailtech utility steel frame, wooden deck 8'6" w x 13'l, 2" ball, has loading $200 2CU3F7A1432012960
ramp, single tire, tire size ST205/75R16, 7-pin electrical connection , black,,,, KNOWN
PROBLEMS: One tire missing, no spare, lights non-operational.>, As is, where is

7/9/2025,2:55 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 8
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OUTLOOK, Agriculture, 410 Saskatchewan Ave W

Contact Ben Lalonde 306-867-6469, ben.lalonde@gov.sk.ca or Front Desk 306-867-5000, tammie.wood@gov.sk.ca

No Bid * 2-510

Leica GPS 1200 System 2007, 1200 series 1200 series Composed of: GX1230 Base S$500 GX1230 Base Controller: 468771

Controller, AX1202 Base Rover, GZS4-1 Height Hook, GDF122 Optical Tribrach, GRT146
Carrier w 5/8" thread, Pacific Crest PDL4535 Base Radio, RX1250XC Rover Controller, GHT56
Controller Mount, ATX1230 Receiver Rover, x4 GEB211 Batteries, GKL22 Battery Charger,
Assorted power & connection cables, x2 plastic carrying cases w styrofoam interior. GPS
Components manufactured in 2007 and 2008, components are green and/or white in colour.
Noticeable wear present on most GPS components. cables, tribrach, carrier and height hook
still in good condition. light dust present on most components. GPS system has been stored
in a cool dry place for up to the past 10 years. Unknown if still fully operational. Still useful for
spare parts.,, ,,,, Fair

AX1202 Base Rover: 07410156
RX1250XC Rover Controller:
311319 GHT56 Controller
Mount: 107837 ATX1230
Receiver Rover: 185548

GKL22 Battery Charger: 0030865

REGINA, Highways, 1100 - 1855 Victoria Ave

Contact Waneta Hardy 306-541-6150, waneta.hardy3@gov.sk.ca or Nolan Eberle 306-480-9736, nolan.eberle@gov.sk.ca

No Bid * 2-517 Chair, fabric, 5 castor, with arms, brown. Fair S1
No Bid * 2-516 Chair, fabric, 5 castor, with arms, blue. Fair S1
No Bid * 2-519 Chair, wood, No wheels, with arms, brown fabric. Poor S1
No Bid * 2-518 Chair, metal, No wheels, with arms, grey fabric. Fair S1

REGINA, Highways, 221 Winnipeg St N

Contact Waneta Hardy 306-541-6150, waneta.hardy3@gov.sk.ca or Nolan Eberle 306-480-9736, nolan.eberle@gov.sk.ca

7.00 * 2-543

File Divider Holder, Lot of 2 metal, 6 spots for files. Fair S1

7/9/2025,2:55 PM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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Govero':me”t SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From Jul 02 to Jul 09, 2025
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Bid Price Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

REGINA, Innovation Saskatchewan, 200 - 10 Research Dr

Contact: Azmina Punjani 306-551-5106, azmina.punjani@innovationsask.ca or Nick Wilkes 306-539-9022, nick.wilkes@innovationsask.ca

No Bid * 1-551 Desk, Reception, wood, Previously used reception desk has been professionally dismantled $500
and is ready for transport, includes the main counter sections (a durable quartz countertop -
2-piece, piece 1- 8'7” | x 31” w x 1-1/8” thick, piece2 — 7°7” | x 31” w x 1-1/8” thick, side
panels, and internal shelving components, minimal wear and tear from previous use. This
desk is being sold in its component pieces and will require reassembly. Assembly instructions
are NOT included. Reassembly will require some technical skill and potentially additional
tools and hardware.

Please carefully inspect the photos and consider arranging a viewing to assess the
completeness and condition of all parts before bidding.

Due to the size and weight of the components, transporting this desk will require more than
one person. The buyer will be responsible for arranging their own pickup and transportation
of all desk components between 8:00 am - 4:30 pm Mon-Fri. Innovation Saskatchewan will
not be responsible for any transport or haul. Good

REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 12252 Ewing Ave

Contact Al Kentz 306-787-4286, akentz@slga.com or Todd Leurer 306-510-4368, tleurer@slga.com

2,525.55 * 9-623 Forklift 2005 TOYOTA 7FBEU15 E-Forklift Electric signal lights, mirror, horn no charger, 23,2398 $1,000 14,298
orange/black, , 23,2398 hours, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Charger not included. No other known  hours
problems but no guarantees., As is, Where is

REGINA, Trade and Export Development, 300 - 2103 11th Ave

Contact: Hiren Khemani 306-787-8712, hiren.khemani@gov.sk.ca or Tosin Fatoyinbo, tosin.fatoyinbo2@gov.sk.ca

No Bid * 2-525 Chair, cloth, Brown, adjustable, 5 castor, no armrests. Good S5
No Bid * 2-528 Credenza, wood, Pepperdust, 4 drawers, 2 doors, 72" w x 20" d x 28" h. Good $20
No Bid * 2-529 Desk, laminate, Beige, 72" w x 36" d x 28"h. Good S15
No Bid * 2-530 File Cabinet, metal, lateral, Beige, 4 drawers, locks, no keys, 18" w x 28" d x 51" h. Good S8
No Bid * 2-531 File Cabinet, metal, lateral, Beige, 5 drawers, locks, no keys, 36" w x 18" d x 64" h. Good S8
No Bid * 2-534 Table, wood, round, Brown, 60" diameter, 29" h. Good S50
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SASKATOON, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, 910 - 60th St E

Contact: Renee Pound, 306-956-8817, renee.pound@gov.sk.ca or Danielle Corriveau 306-956-8869, danielle.corriveau@gov.sk.ca

No Bid * 2-512 Desk, particle board, Brown desk, main part of desk, 71" w x 35 1/2" d x 28 1/2" h, other S1
side, 23 1/2" wx 35" d x 28 1/2" h. Fair
No Bid * 2-513 Desk, particle board, Brown, two drawers, no locks, 45" w x 24" d x 29 1/2" h, some damage S1
on side. Fair
2.55 * 2-514 Desk Riser, wood, metal, 34" long x width when extended 28 1/52". Fair S1

SASKATOON, Highways, 126 105th St E
Contact: Richard Leibel 306-933-5262, richard.leibel@gov.sk.ca or Shaun Bowditch 306-933-5265, shaun.bowditch@gov.sk.ca
25.55 4-505 Diagnostic Tester, Monitor 4000E Deluxe, Operational. Fair S1

500.00 4-506 Diagnostic Tester, Pro link Nexig Tech 104004, Operational. Fair S1

SASKATOON, Saskatoon Public Library, 311 - 23rd St E
Contact Brian MacLean 306-290-9450, b.maclean@saskatoonlibrary.ca

No Bid * 3-542 Magazine Shelf, metal, 37.5"I x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square S1
shelf on the inside. Fair

No Bid * 3-543 Magazine Shelf, metal, 37.5"I x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square S1
shelf on the inside. Fair

No Bid * 3-544 Magazine Shelf, metal, 37.5"I x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square S1
shelf on the inside. Fair

No Bid * 3-545 Magazine Shelf, metal, 37.5"I x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square S1
shelf on the inside. Fair

No Bid * 3-546 Magazine Shelf, metal, 37.5"I x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square S1
shelf on the inside. Fair

No Bid * 3-547 Magazine Shelf, metal, 37.5"I x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square S1
shelf on the inside. Fair

No Bid * 3-548 Magazine Shelf, metal, 37.5"I x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square S1
shelf on the inside. Fair

No Bid * 3-549 Magazine Shelf, metal, 37.5"I x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square S1
shelf on the inside. Fair

No Bid * 3-550 Magazine Shelf, metal, 37.5"I x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square S1
shelf on the inside. Fair

7/9/2025,2:55 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 11
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From Jul 02 to Jul 09, 2025

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

Bid Price Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
No Bid * 3-551 Magazine Shelf, metal, 37.5"I x 17.5"w x 45"h slanted shelf on front opens to regular square S1
shelf on the inside. Fair
SASKATOON, Saskatchewan Research Council, 820 51st St E
Contact: Roger Dauvin 306-385-4035, roger.dauvin@src.sk.ca or purchasing@src.sk.ca
No Bid * 2-503 Dehydrator, Hungry Giant, HGF, RFQ 1920-011; 256532, Put into use 2020, operational. $20,000
Good
606.00 * 2-506 Negative Air Machine, Omnitec Omniaire 2000V Air Filtration System, Hepa cabinet, comes $500
with filters, operational. Good
705.00 * 2-507 Negative Air Machine, Omnitec Omniaire 2000V Air Filtration System, Hepa cabinet, comes $500

with filters, operational. Good

SPIRITWOOD, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, 116 1st St E

Contact: Brendon Smith 306-883-8513, brendon.smith@gov.sk.ca or Jason Reddekopp 306-883-8505, jason.reddekopp@gov.sk.ca

27.99 4-507 Air Compressor, Milder-Lyn, 3.5 gallon, no attachments, unknown if operational. Broken S1
Repairable
No Bid 4-508 ATV/Snowmobile Attachments, Lot of 3 metal, ATV rack black, two snowmobile double up S1
seat, black, unknown make or model. Fair
No Bid 4-509 Bicycle, Hyper, Boundary Trail 24, 18 speed, brakes work, frame size 24", comes with bell. s1
Poor
No Bid 4-510 Boat Canopy, , 32"w x 48"d x 21.5"h, without attachment points, no Hardware provided. S1
Fair
No Bid 4-511 Console Seats, Lot of 2 cloth, Grey, unknown make of truck console seats, stained, soiled. S1
Good
38.99 4-512 Double Ladder Stand, , Hardware provided for assembly, no other accessories are provided. S1
Poor
No Bid 4-513 Flood lights, Lot of 2 plastic, Handhelds, hardwired, black, unknow watts/volts, unknown if S1
operational. Poor
65.99 4-514 Ladder Stand, Big Game Treestands, The Guardian, Two person, hardware provided for S1
assembly, rachet straps. Fair
65.99 4-515 Ladder Stand, Muddy, Hardware provided for assembly, no other accessories are provided. S1
Fair
49.99 4-516 Ladder Stand, , With bear bait barrel, hardware provided for assembly, no other accessories S1

are provided. Fair

7/9/2025,2:55 PM
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No Bid 4-517 Platform Stand, homebuilt, fiberglass, No hardware provided. Poor S1
2.00 4-518 Platform Stand, homebuilt, metal, One ratchet strap, no hardware provided. Poor S1
No Bid 4-519 Platform Stand, homebuilt, wood, , With ladder, no hardware provided. Poor S1
36.99 4-520 Snares, Lot of 13 Ram Power, metal, 2 feet long when set, 4 feet long when extended. Fair S1
35.00 4-521 Safe, metal, 17.7"w x 23.6"d x 21.7"h, tan, 2', no key but door code will be provided, paint S1
chips. Fair
9.99 4-523 Stoves, Lot of 2 homebuilt, metal, Wood burning, large 13.5w" x 13.5"d x 13.5h, small 7"w x S1
8"d x 7"h, both have rust. Poor
No Bid 4-524 Truck Tool Boxes, Delta, metal, 65"l x 10"w x 12"d, no hardware to attach, single S1
compartment, no key, rail mounted. Fair
WADENA, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, SW 04-35-13 W2, Call for Directions
Contact Cole Schommer 306-750-6709 cole.schommer@gov.sk.ca or Stephen Acorn 306-941-7909, stephen.acorn@gov.sk.ca
2,301.00 4-501 Snowmobile 1997 Polaris Indy Lite Deluxe 340cc, 2 stroke, gas CVT electric start, blue, , 2,703 km $100 3,372,791
2,703 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: The unit has not been operated for a couple of years and
needs a minor tune up, unsure if electric start up works,
motor/transmission/brakes/exterior/exhaust/windshield/paint fair, poor battery.>, As is,
where is
WEYBURN, Agriculture, 60A - 18th St NE
Contact: Sharon Ivan 306-848-2857, sharon.ivan@gov.sk.ca or Karen Hennig 306-848-2857, karen.hennig@gov.sk.ca
No Bid * 2-535 Dymo Tape, , Various box. Good S1
No Bid * 2-536 Projector Bulbs, , Miscellaneous box. Good S1
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YORKTON, Water Security Agency, 269 Hamilton Rd

Contact Kyle Schmidt 306-621-2015, kyle.schmidt@wsask.ca or Ayold Elgersma 306-631-0460, ayold.elgersma@wsask.ca

3,610.00 4-502 ATV 2000 Honda Fourtrax TRX350ES 4x4, quad 329 cc, OHV single cylinder 4 stroke, gas auto, 3,096 km $1,200 478TE2566YA001160
5-speed wheel base 49.1" winch, GVW 511 Ibs, single tire, front tire size 25x8, rear tire size
25x10, 6 ply, green, , 3,096 km, Known Recent Repairs: Oil change and inspection on front
and rear differentials, CV boots, wheel and axle bearings, tires and controls in May 2023,
KNOWN PROBLEMS: Battery disconnected, motor/transmission/tires/brakes/body
exterior/exhaust/lights good, paint fair, seat in good shape, some rust on frame, As is, where
is

4,250.78 4-503 ATV 2012 Polaris Sportsman 500 4x4, quad 498 cc, OHV single cylinder 4 stroke, gas Auto, 5- 437 km/ $3,000 4AXAMH50AXCA533348
speed wheel base 50.5" winch, GVW 696 Ibs, single tire, front tire size 25x8-12 rear tire size  87.1 hours
25x10-12, 4 ply, yellow/black, , 437 km / 87.1 hours, Known Recent Repairs: Engine Oil
change, air filter, differential oils changed, inspected boots, axles, brakes and test drove.
Replaced battery, cleaned carburetor, and replaced right rear tire inner tube. June 2023,
440kms., KNOWN PROBLEMS: Battery needs to be replaced, some rust on frame,
motor/transmission/tires/brakes/body exterior/exhaust good, seat in good shape. Paint fair,
overall good condition, As is, where is

REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca

321.00 4-146 Tires, Set of 4 LT245/75R17, Sailun Terramax RT, Snowflake, M+S, Load range E, $250
manufacture date, week 50, year 2024. Excellent
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