SaskBuilds and Procurement

Goveror;ment SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
A Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1
SALE SUMMARY LIST

SaskSurplus Sale #3

From June 5 to June 12, 2024

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as
described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding.

Vehicles and equipment are sold “AS IS, WHERE IS”, there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.

- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.
It is the Bidder’s responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.
Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.
Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,

- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-787-2238,

- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or

- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.
WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.
No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

6/13/2024,2:14 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.



SaskBuilds and Procurement SaskSurplus Sale #3

Goveror;ment SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From June 5 to June 12, 2024
A Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092
Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.

2,221.27 3-008 Car 2013 CHEVROLET Impala LS FWD 3.6L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 302,326 $858 2G1WAS5E3XD1257032
power mirrors/locks/windows/left front seat/trunk release, keyless entry 2 fobs, 2 keys, km
grey, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be
signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed.

Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 302,326 km, , KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Power
steering leaking, left rear caliper sticky, needs exhaust resonator, right rear window switch,
poor battery.

KNOWN PROBLEMS: Grille lower broke, headlights fogged, hood scratches/chips/dents, both
bumpers scratches/chips, left front fender scratches, left front door dent/rust/inside trim
taped over, left rear door rust inside bottom, right side doors rust inside bottom, right rear
window switch missing, roof rust spots/dents, trunk lid scratches, no first aid kit/fire
extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat orange paint, orange paint sprayed throughout
interior, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

4,256.12 3-001 SUV 2014 CHEVROLET Tahoe 2WD 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, dual 254,410 $900 1GNLC2EO06ER207124
zone A/C, power mirrors/locks/windows/front seat, keyless entry 2 keys 1 fob front tow km
hooks, mud flaps, OEM steps, 5 passengers, no center console, white, TOW ONLY, This
vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes
full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is,
where is” condition., 254,410 km, , KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Internal engine failure
#1-cylinder misfire Power steering leak, all 4 tires at wear bars, front brake pads at 1mm,
needs alignment, TPMS light & oil change light on, trans fluid dirty, engine oil black, poor
battery.

KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood chips/dents, front bumper clear coat peeling, rear bumper chips,
left rear fender rust, right front fender road rash, left side door chips/road rash, right front
door road rash, both rear doors missing lock/unlock knobs, 7 holes in roof sealed, no first aid
kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat hole frame visible, rear cargo area holes
drilled, missing molding slots cut in both B pillar moldings, holes drilled in dash, missing vent
grilles, holes in liner, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

6/13/2024,2:14 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 2
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SaskSurplus Sale #3

From June 5 to June 12, 2024

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

Item #

Description Kms

Min Price Serial Number

2,119.00 3-007

SUV 2012 CHEVROLET Tahoe 2WD 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, rear HYAC, AM/FM/CD 250,565
player, power front seats/mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry 1 fob, 2 keys side steps, 5 km
passenger, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY

Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to

be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.

This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 250,565 km, , KNOWN INSPECTION

PROBLEMS: Miss firing #6 cylinder no compression, service Stabilitrak’s, service traction

control on driver information control centre (DIC), park brake doesn’t lock into place,

front/rear shocks excessive bounce, front wheel alignment, hard starting, rear washer
inoperative, poor battery.

KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood hail/chips, front bumper chips/scratches, left and right front

fender road rash/rust, right rear fender rusted, all doors road rash/chips, roof hail, 8 holes on
roof sealed, tailgate chips/scratches/holes drilled, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield
chips, both mirrors holes drilled/sealed, left front seat small hole, B pillar inside trim

modified, missing headliner console, headliner damaged, missing filler trim in front console,

front valance hanging, rear cargo area soiled, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

$500 1GNLC2E07CR293833

6,119.00 3-006

SUV 2015 CHEVROLET Tahoe PPV 2WD 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/G, tilt, cruise, rear HVAC, 291,521
AM/FM/CD player, power front seats/mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry 1 fob, 2 keys km
hitch, trailer wiring, side steps, wiring from equipment in front seats area, 5 passenger, white,
TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed

by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser
assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As

is, where is” condition., 291,521 km, , KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Right side marker,

right brake light, poor battery.

KNOWN PROBLEMS: Grille broke, hood dents, both bumpers chips/scratches/modified, left

front fender dents, left and right rear fender missing upper quarter panel filler/trim, right

rear door missing trim on inside/holes drilled in window frame, 7 holes on roof sealed,

tailgate inside trim loose/mollified, spare tire/wheel wrench/jack loose in rear, no first aid

kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, holes drilled in dash/floor pan, missing center console,
inside trim on B pillars trimmed, cargo area in rear soiled, dash missing trim, left/right door
frames holes drilled/scuffed, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

$4,971 1GNLC2EC2FR583637

6/13/2024,2:14 PM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 3
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SaskSurplus Sale #3

From June 5 to June 12, 2024

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

Item #

Description Kms

Min Price Serial Number

2,477.00 3-010

SUV 2013 JEEP Patriot North Edition 4WD 2.4L, Inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 212,332
player, power heated mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs 5 passenger, roof rails, km
driving lights, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY
Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to

be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.

This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 212,332 km, , KNOWN INSPECTION

PROBLEMS: Transmission poor/shutters on acceleration, trailing arm bushings have play, rear
stabilizer bar links broken, needs oil change, wiper blades front/rear, poor battery.

KNOWN PROBLEMS: Rear bumper paint poor, left rear fender dented, right rear
door/rusted/dented/poor paint, roof rust spots, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, minor

exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

$500 1C4NJRAB4DD214852

3,456.78 3-005

SUV 2013 JEEP Patriot Sport North Edition 4WD 2.4L, Inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 195,700
AM/FM/CD player, power heated mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry, 2 key fobs driving km
lights, roof rails, 5 passenger, blue, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A

TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGlI
Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required
inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 195,700 km, , KNOWN

INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Transmission poor/slipping/harsh vibration, power steering rack

leaking, front and rear struts, left front signal light assembly cracked, left sun visor clip, wiper
blades, poor battery.

KNOWN PROBLEMS: Grille paint chips, hood chips/scratches/stained, both bumpers’
chips/scratches, left front fender scratches/scuffs, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield
chips, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

$500 1C4NJRAB1DD214856

6/13/2024,2:14 PM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 4



SaskBuilds and Procurement SaskSurplus Sale #3

&F SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From June 5 to June 12, 2024
A saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

Government

Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

No Bid * 1-017 Truck 2015 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 4WD, crew cab, 6'7" box 5.L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, 318,636 $4,499 3GCUKPEC8FG208574
cruise, AM/FM, computer stand, power windows/locks/mirrors, keyless entry 2 keys, 2 fobs  km
grille inserts, front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes,
headache rack with beacon, “Lo Pro” tonneau cover-fair condition, box liner, has a back seat,
white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be
signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed.

Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 318,636 km, , KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Right
outer tie rod ends, alighment needed, tires poor, missing washer reservoir cap, poor battery.
KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood scratches/hail, front bumper pitted, rear bumper bent/scratches,
left front fender scuffs, left rear fender rust/chips, left front door dent/scratch, right front
door rust at bottom/interior soiled front door sills, rear doors paint peeling, roof hail/dented,
tailgate badly damaged, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat
worn/foam visible/soiled, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

4,505.02 3-002 Truck 2015 DODGE Ram 2500 4WD, crew cab, 6'3" box 5.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 191,161 $3,650 3C6TR5CT4FG544762
AM/FM, power heated mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry 2 key fobs grille inserts, front km
tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, extra step on rear
bumper, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW
ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI
Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required
inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 191,161 km, , KNOWN
INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Manifold leaks, transmission sloppy/slipping, front pads/rotors,
exhaust leaks, check engine light on codes: PO305 cylinder 5/P0300 multiple miss fire, TPMS,
oil leaks, poor battery.

KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood chips/hail, front bumper stone chips, left rear fender road rash,
left side rocker panel road rash/dent, left rear door dent, right front door rust at bottom, roof
hail/dents, hole in roof 5 sealed, wheel wrench loose in back seat, no first aid kit/fire
extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat worn/ripped/foam visible, front seat center
consul modified/no jump seat, hole drilled inside B pillar/molding, holes drilled rear
floor/dash, right front hub cover, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

6/13/2024,2:14 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 5
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Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

Item #

Description

Kms Min Price Serial Number

No Bid 3-004

Truck 2015 DODGE Ram 2500 4WD, crew cab, 6'3" box 5.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise,
power locks/windows/mirrors, keyless entry, 2 key fobs aftermarket AM/FM, grille inserts,
front recovery hooks, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM brakes trailer, mud flaps, jump
seat loose in back seat, blue, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW
ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI
Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required
inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 233,199 km, , KNOWN
INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Exhaust leak, both upper ball joints, park brake doesn't hold, rear
right window inoperative, poor battery.

KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood road rash/scratches, front bumper rusted, rear bumper
rusted/dents, front left fender rust hole rear left fender road rash/scratches, right fenders
road rash, both rocker panels road rash, left front door dents, left rear door holes drilled in
inside window frame, right doors dens/scratches, roof scratches/ small rust spots, hole in
roof 1 sealed, tailgate road rash/inside cracked, jack missing, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher,
windshield cracked, missing middle console. seat back left front small tare, front valance
loose, inside of box dented/scratched, b pillar trim modified, missing molding inside right rear
door, hole sealed in rear seat area, holes drilled in dash, right rear door glass
scratched/missing door lock button, head liner ripped, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where

is

233,199 $9,206 3C6TR5CT7FG674843
km

3,749.00 * 1-009

Truck 2003 FORD F550 RWD, regular cab, general service body 6.0L, V8, diesel auto A/C, tilt,
cruise, 1 key, 5 other keys dual rear wheels, front tow hooks, side steps, trailer tow mirrors,
mud flaps, HD rear bumper, trailer wiring, 2” receiver, electric trailer brake, service body-2
beacons and 3 panel sliding top, Cobra max lift crane 3305W 12V, 2 out rigger legs condition
unknown, general service body 8 compartments fair condition, white, TOW ONLY, This
vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes
full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is,
where is” condition., 402,877 km, , KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Left manifold broken,
engine oil leaks, steady bearing, battery light comes on, dash losing power, intermittent
stalling whole driving, rear brake cables, right front mud flap, tires fair.

KNOWN PROBLEMS: grille broken, front bumper faded, left and right front fenders chips/road
rash/rust, left and right front doors rusted/chips, roof rusted, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher,
windshield cracked, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

402,877 $3,494 1FDAF56P63EC72074

km

6/13/2024,2:14 PM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 6



SaskBuilds and Procurement SaskSurplus Sale #3

Goveror;ment SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From June 5 to June 12, 2024
A Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092
Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
13,115.00 3-011 Truck 2014 FORD F550 RWD, extended cab, no box just frame 6.7L, V8, diesel auto A/C, tilt, 331,015 $9,999 1FDOX5GT9EEB55032
cruise, AM/FM, power heated mirrors/front windows/locks, keyless entry-1 key fob front tow km
hooks, wig wags on grille-condition unknown, side steps on left side only, mud flaps, trailer
tow mirrors, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A
TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGlI
Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required
inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 331,015 km, , KNOWN
INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Truck is in limp mode PCM issues, fasteners damaged, star chip in
windshield .5” diameter in area swept by wipers, no taillight or plate lamps installed on
vehicle, poor battery.
KNOWN PROBLEMS: Grille lower rubber piece loose, no rear bumper, spare tire/jack missing,
no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips/cracked, left front seat cushion sagging,
rear seat in back not secured, holes drilled in dash, paint splatter in cab, OEM floor mat/liner
worn-hole, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is
18,999.90 3-003 Truck 2013 FORD F550 XL RWD, extended cab, service body 6.7L, V8, diesel auto A/C, tilt, 389,718 $12,573 1FDOX5GT2DEA25446

cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power trailer mirrors/locks/front windows, keyless entry 2 key km
fobs, 1 other key 8 compartment service body condition fair, sliding lid condition unknown,
step bumper with stabilizers, back up camera, 2 beacons condition unknown, hitch, trailer
wiring, OEM trailer brakes, side steps, front tow hooks, mud flaps, roll out in service body
condition unknown, dual rear wheels, has a rear seat, max lift 3300 Cobra crane with controls
condition unknown, unit has UMAC compressor condition unknown, white, TOW ONLY, This
vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes
full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is,
where is” condition., 389,718 km, , KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Front brake pads, right
rear brake cable rusty, left high light maker light, poor battery.

KNOWN PROBLEMS: Grille broke, hood chips, front bumper rust spots/dents, left front door
road rash/rust, no spare tire on hoist loose inside service box, jack missing, no first aid kit/fire
extinguisher, windshield chips, front lower valance broke upper rear tailgate sticky, minor
exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

6/13/2024,2:14 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 7
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
12,177.00 3-009 Van 2009 CHEVROLET Express 1500 Cargo AWD 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, 137,055 $7,512 1GCFH154991153245
rear aux heat, power locks, 3 keys hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brakes, 2 metal shelving km
units, plywood floor in rear, map box has 2 keys, cargo barrier, computer stand, amber
beacon-not working, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW
ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI
Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required
inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 137,055 km, , KNOWN
INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Both inner tie rods loose, exhaust leak between Cat converter/
muffler, rear brake pads 3mm- rotors rusty, both require replacement, front rotors rusty-
require replacement, alignment needed, left front tire slow leak, battery froze will not hold
charge, left rear mud flap broken,
KNOWN PROBLEMS: Grille broke, hood paint peeling/chips/dents, front bumper rusted, rear
bumper dents/scratches, right rear fender rust, rocker panel rust, left front door
dent/chips/paint peeling, 2 holes in roof sealed, tailgate chips/dents/paint peeling, no first
aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat cushion soft/worn, minor exterior
damaaao Ac ic \Whara ic
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.
No Bid 3-106 Antenna,, Vehicle roof top magnetic base, 33" mast, 142" cable, condition unknown. Fair S5
1,651.00 3-161 ATV, 1998, YamahaBig Bear, YFM3504x4,350 cc, 1 cylinder, 4 stroke Electric start green891 891 hrs $1,000 JY44WUWO8SWA032758
hrs KNOWN PROBLEMS: Carburator needs adjustment, throttle sticks, poor transmission. As
is, Where is
25.51 3-144 Cargo Barrier, Ranger Design Inc. metal, 66"w x 52.5"d, with glass window. Good $20

No Bid 3-134 Floor Insert, 2015, Chevrolet Suburban, Interior rear floor cabin insert, black. Excellent S1

500.00 3-145 Generator, Honda EM3500S, Unknown hours, gas, operational. Good $250 GC04-3418012

No Bid 3-146 Generator, Honda, EM3000C, Unknown hours, gas, non-operational. Good S$500 GCAE-1855442

478.00 3-147 Generator, Honda, EM3000C, Unknown hours, gas, operational. Good S400 GCAE-2155068

485.85 3-148 Generator, Honda, EM3000C, Unknown hours, gas, operational. Good $400 GCAE-1737523

1,799.00 3-149 Generator, Yamaha EF6300iSDE, Hard to start, operational, 30 hrs, includes trickle charger, $1,000 7CK-210470

operational. Good

500.00 3-150 Generator, Yamaha, EF2800I, 681 hours, gas, non-operational. Fair $250 7VU-1322035

200.00 3-151 Ladder Rack, Weatherguard, 7'w x 11'd x 2'h, with beacon, operational. Good $100

11.01 3-107 Power Inverter, Go Power, 600 W. 2 AC outputs, on/off switch, condition unknown, may not S5

be complete. Poor

6/13/2024,2:14 PM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
No Bid 3-108 Power Inverter, Prowatt 150, 150 watts of portable AC power, 1 AC output, on/off switch, S5
condition unknown, may not be complete. Poor
No Bid 3-109 Power Inverter, Samlexpower 450, 450 watts, 2 AC outputs, on/off switch, condition S5
unknown, may not be complete. Poor
5.27 3-110 Power Inverter, Samlexpower 450, 450 watts, 2 AC outputs, on/off switch, has 12v plug-in S5
cable, condition unknown, may not be complete. Poor
*MT 1-106 Rolling Cargo Bed, 3000, Attached to 3/4" piece of plywood, with box on top, box, 40"w x $800
91"d x 13 3/4"h, bed 33"w x 87"d x 2 1/2"h. Fair
6.66 3-101 Saucer Cones, Lot of 34360 Athletics, Multiple colors, metal carrying rack included, 7.5" S5
diameter. Fair
No Bid 3-116 Seat, 2007, Dodge Ram 3500, Rear, grey, leather edge. Excellent S50
78.00 3-117 Seat, 2011, Chevrolet Silverado 2500, Rear, black. Excellent S50
No Bid 3-119 Seat, 2011, GMC Yukon, Rear, black. Excellent S50
No Bid 3-120 Seat, 2013, Dodge Ram 3500, Rear, grey. Excellent S50
52.00 3-121 Seat, 2013, Ford F-150, Rear, grey. Excellent S50
79.00 3-122 Seat, 2014, Chevrolet Silverado 2500, Rear, grey. Excellent S50
No Bid 3-123 Seat, 2014, Dodge Ram 4500, Rear, grey. Excellent S50
No Bid 3-124 Seat, 2014, Dodge Ram 4500, Rear, parts, winter grille cover included, grey. Excellent S50
No Bid 3-125 Seat, 2014, Dodge Ram 5500, Rear, grey. Excellent S50
No Bid 3-126 Seat, 2015, Chevrolet Silverado 2500, Rear, grey. Excellent S50
No Bid 3-127 Seat, 2015, Dodge Ram 2500, Rear, grey. Excellent S50
No Bid 3-128 Seat, 2015, Dodge Ram 4500, Rear, grey. Excellent S50
No Bid 3-129 Seat, 2015, Ford F-250, Rear, grey. Excellent S50
No Bid 3-130 Seat, 2016, Chevrolet Suburban, Rear, black. Excellent S50
No Bid 3-131 Seat, 2016, Dodge Ram 3500, Rear, grey. Excellent S50
No Bid 3-132 Seat, 2017, Ford F-250, Rear, grey. Excellent S50
No Bid 3-133 Seat, 2018, Chevrolet Suburban, Rear, black. Excellent S50
27.59 3-143 Shelves, metal, 7'd x 15.5"d x 51"h, 5 shelves, one storage side. Good $20
No Bid 3-162 Shovel, Jobmate, Plastic scoop, 38"L, wooden shaft, D handle. Good S5
No Bid 3-163 Shovel, Melnor, Plastic scoop, 38"L, 2 piece metal shaft, D handle. Good S5
1.04 3-164 Shovel, , Plastic scoop, 38"L, 2 piece metal shaft, D handle. Good S1

6/13/2024,2:14 PM
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Government . .
&F SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales From June 5 to June 12, 2024
A Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092
Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
4,111.00 3-160 Snowmobile, 2011, Arctic Cat570,565 cc, 2 cylinder, 2 stroke, gas Electric start white19.5 hrs, 19.5 hrs, $1,000 4UF11SNW3BT102283
362 km KNOWN PROBLEMS: Battery is dead, body has some broken plastic. As is, Where is 362 km
105.51 3-152 Spare Truck Tire, 225/70R19.5, Continental, HSR, Manufacture date, week 06, year 2012, 10 $20
x 8.75" bolt pattern. Fair
No Bid 3-135 Tailgate, 2013, Chevrolet Silverado 2500, White. Excellent $500
551.51 3-136 Tailgate, 2014, Dodge Ram 2500, White. Excellent $500
No Bid 3-137 Tailgate, 2015, Chevrolet Silverado 2500, White. Excellent $500
No Bid 3-138 Tailgate, 2015, Chevrolet Silverado 2500, White. Excellent $500
No Bid 3-139 Tailgate, 2015, Ford F-150, White. Excellent $500
No Bid 3-140 Tailgate, 2017, Chevrolet Silverado 2500, White. Excellent $500
505.00 3-141 Tailgate, 2019, Chevrolet Silverado 2500, White, has a backup camera in tailgate handle, $500
unknown if operational. Excellent
No Bid 3-142 Tailgate, 2019, Chevrolet Silverado 2500, White. Excellent $500
No Bid * 2-102 Tailgate, OEM Chevrolet, metal, White, slight scratches with dents, maybe be compatible $150
with 2003-2005 and other years. 1500, 2500, 3500. Good
No Bid * 2-103 Tailgate, OEM Chevrolet, metal, White, slight scratches with dents, maybe be compatible $150
with 2003-2005 and other years. 1500, 2500, 3500. Good
160.00 3-102 Tire, 225/65R17, Sumitomo Ice Edge, Snow Flake, M+S, Manufacture date, week 24, year $35
2017. Good
160.00 3-103 Tire on Rim, 225/65R17, Winterquest Duration. Snow Flake, M+S, Mounted on a steel rim, $35
application of rim and tire unknown, manufacture date, week 27, year 2017. Good
60.00 3-105 Tires, Set of 2225/65R17, Salun Ice Blazer WST1, Snow Flake, M+S, Manufacture date, week $40
19, year 2018. Fair
No Bid 3-111 Tires, Set of 4225/55R17, Firestone All Season, M+S, Manufacture date. Week 38, year 2020. $160
Good
160.00 3-104 Tires, Set of 4225/60R16, Firestone FR710, M+S, Manufacture date, week 02, year 2017. Fair $120
300.00 3-112 Tires, Set of 4225/65R16, Firestone Winterforce 2, M+S, Snowflake, Manufacture date. Week $200
02, year 2020. Excellent
130.00 3-113 Tires, Set of 4225/65R16, Goodyear Ultra Grip, Winter, Snowflake, M+S, Manufacture date. $120
Week 25, year 2018. Fair
375.00 3-114 Tires, Set of 4225/65R17, Yokohama Avid S33, M+S, Manufacture date. Week 06, year 2020. $200
Excellent

6/13/2024,2:14 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 10
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Kms Min Price Serial Number

210.90

3-115

Tires, Set of 4235/65R17, Firestone All Season, M+S, Manufacture date. Week 43, year 2022.
Good

$160

172.00

3-165

Tires, Set of 4235/65R17, Continental Cross Country RX, M+S, Manufacture date. Week 48,
year 2020. Good

$160

186.00

3-166

Tires, Set of 4235/65R17, Firestone All Season, M+S, Manufacture date. Week 45, year 2021.
Good

$180

1,999.00

3-154

Trailer, 1986, Homebuiltfibre splicingenclosed, 10'l x 6'w x 4'h, 3" pintle hitch, tandem axle,
tires size 6.70-15LT. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Rusted, scratched, poor condition, lights non-
operational, may be repairable. As is, Where is

$500 TBOO3

788.00

3-153

Trailer, 1986, Homebuiltfibre splicingenclosed, 10'l x 6'w x 6'h, 3" pintle hitch, tandem axle
tire size, P225/75R15, includes inverter unknown if operational, charger unknown if
operational, A/C non-operational, and batteries in metal box in the front. KNOWN
PROBLEMS: Rusted, scratched, poor condition, lights non operational, right front door hinges

$500 TB004

444.44

3-155

Trailer, 1986, Homebuilt, GVW 3000lbs, 8'l x 4'w, 3" pintle hitch, single axle, tire size
ST205/75R15, lights operational. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Rusted, scratched, poor condition. As
is, Where is

$100 11,788

1,621.99

3-157

Trailer, 2001, MajestikUtility, 10'l x 5'w, 3"pintle hitch, single axle, tire size ST205/75R15.
KNOWN PROBLEMS: Rusted, scratched, poor condition. As is, Where is

$100 MAJECCUT01657

8,886.65

3-159

Trailer, 2014, Precision TrailersHighboyflat deck, Metal frame, wooden deck, GVW 22,200 Ib.,
3" pintle hitch, deck 21'l x 8'w, total length 33.33', dual axle, tire size LT235/80R16, comes
with a spare tire ST235/80R16, lights operational. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Rusted, scratched. As
is, Where is

$5,000 2P9BF9390EP078119

7,100.00

3-158

Trailer, 2011, SaturnSplit and Tilt Deck, Galvanized metal frame, wooden deck, GVW 12,000
Ib., 3" pintle hitch, deck 18'l x 6.3'w, total length 23.33', tandem axle, tire size LT235/80R16,
comes with a spare tire ST235/80R16, lights operational. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Rusted,
scratched. As is, Where is

$5,000 25917B328BW010107

2,679.99

3-156

Trailer, 1996, TrailtechUtility, 14'l x 6.5'w, deck with dovetail, 3" pintle hitch, tandem axle,
tire size ST205/75R15. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Rusted, scratched, poor condition, lights non-
operational, may need to be cleaned to work. As is, Where is

$1,000 2CU116EA6T2000853

35.00

* 1-103

Desk, Steelcase, Disassembled, main 63"w x 30"d x 30"h, L-side unknown 44"w 24"d x 30"h,
desk comes with two drawers no keys, modesty panels, surface tops and gables comes with
instruction booklet, scratches (wear and tear). Fair

$20

No Bid

* 1-105

Desk, Steelcase, Disassembled, main 63"w x 30"d x 30"h, L-side unknown 44"w 24"d x 30"h,
desk comes with two drawers no keys, modesty panels, surface tops and gables comes with
instruction booklet, scratches (wear and tear). Fair

$20

6/13/2024,2:14 PM
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CONDIE NATURE REFUGE, Parks Culture and Sport, Call for location directions.

Contact Jim Gatzke 639-382-4311, jim.gatzke@gov.sk.ca

5,162.44 3-591

Truck, 2004, DODGERam 25004WD, quad cab, 8' box,5.7L, V8 gas manual A/C, tilt, cruise 302,105
Standard, 5 speed, single axle, single tires, 265/70/R17, tire ply 2, GVW 5,500KGgreyTOW km
ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any).

Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs

if required. 302,105 kmKNOWN PROBLEMS: Motor/transmission/tires/brakes/battery/body
exterior/exhaust/windshield glass/windshield washers & wipers/interior/lights used

condition, paint chips mirrors/horn N/A As is, Where is

$1 3D7KU28D74G223319

CONDIE NATURE REFUGE, Parks Culture and Sport, Call for Directions

Contact Nathan Hafner 306-369-7445, nathan.hafner@gov.sk.ca or Brent Simon 306-533-3532, brent.simon@gov.sk.ca

61.01 3-554 Tires, Set of 4P225/70R16, Goodyear, Arctic M+S, 16". Good S1
46.00 3-555 Tires, Set of 4P225/60R16, Goodyear, Assurance M+S, 16". Fair S1
46.00 3-556 Tires, Set of 4P235/70R16, Goodyear, Ultragrip M+S, 16". Poor S1
KINDERSLEY, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, Provincial Protective Services, 113 2nd Ave E
Contact Ted Glass 306-460-4291, Ted.Glass@gov.sk.ca or Cory Loitz 306-867-5563, Cory.Loitz@gov.sk.ca
1.06 * 2-536 Bird Aviary, wood/wire mesh, 94" w x 46.5" d x 76" h, 3 separate holding areas - 1 (90" w x S1
38" h) and 2 (45" w x 25" h), sloped asphalt shingled roof. Good
No Bid * 2-509 Camera, Olympus Stylus Tough, Includes carry case, battery, charger, no memory card/no $25 G79622057
internal memory, operational. Good
5.06 * 2-512 Come-along Tool,, 8'single & 4' doubled length, damaged & missing parts. Broken S5
Repairable
No Bid * 2-516 Flashlight, Streamlight Stinger XT, Includes 120 V charger and 12 V Charger, lights $25 280,624
operational, needs new rechargeable battery. Good
No Bid * 2-517 Foot Rest, metal, Angled. Good S1
No Bid * 2-519 Helmets, Lot of 2, One Polaris size- XL, black & one North- size medium, blue. Poor S5
No Bid * 2-521 Literature Rack, Lot of 2Montel, 36" w x 46" h, 8 tier. Good S5
7.50 * 2-522 Multi-Tools, stainless steel, 1.5" w x 4" h (closed), 6.25" h (opened), includes screwdriver, S5
knife, pliers, wood saw, can/bottle opener, comes with a case. Fair
5.06 * 2-523 Personal Flotation Devices, Lot of 3Keep-A-Float universal , Adult, red key hole. Good S5
No Bid * 2-525 Punch,, 4 hole for legal size paper. Good S5
No Bid * 2-526 Reptile Habitat, glass terrarium, 30" w x 12" d x 13" h, with heat lamp, water bowl, artificial $25
foliage, thermometer, log, screen cover. Fair
No Bid * 2-530 Truck Tool Box, Challenger, 5'long, includes key and plastic tray. Good $50

6/13/2024,2:14 PM
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MAPLE CREEK, Highways, Maple Creek Service St (highways yard)or 500 Hwy 21 N

Contact Tayler Sanderson office: 306-778-3859/cell: 306-662-7155, Tayler.sanderson@gov.sk.ca

2,252.06 3-592

Bunkhouse, 1981, 12'x 30/, interior is in poor condition, tires are flat & are in poor condition, S1 J0O577
no noticeable mold, stairs included and can be removed prior to transport, trailer jacks in the

photos are affixed to the trailer and are included, no utilities are connected, unit is on a

towable frame. Fan/air conditioner included. Disclaimer: Loading required for removal. Buyer

will need to arrange mover and is responsible for loading. All tires are flat so a portable air

compressor will have to be brought in to pump tires up for pickup and removal preparation.

The tires may not be usable. Poor

MOOSE JAW, Highways, 1km South of Moose Jaw on Hwy#2

Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca

261.00

3-535

Spool Gun , ESAB, MT250 SG, aluminum, Operational, 25' lead. Good S1

NIPAWIN, Water Security Agency, 300 Timber Dr

Contact Ayold Elgersma 306-631-0460, ayold.elgersma@wsask.ca or Water Security Agency 306-862-1750.

901.87 3-501 Boat, Sears Model H-14SL, aluminum, 14'length, 20 H.P., 375 Ibs, unknown if operational. $250
Good
No Bid 3-502 Culvert, metal, galvanized, 46"diameter x 96" length, corrugated with rust. Poor $10
No Bid 3-503 Culvert Collar, metal, 36" diameter, with some rust. Good S10
No Bid 3-504 Culvert Collar, metal, 48"diameter, with some rust. Good $10
63.25 3-505 Culvert Couplers and Metal Sheets, Lot of 57, Assorted, metal, galvanized, Various sizes S50
between 1.6' to 2.6' dia (closed) couplers, 6'w x 2'd sheets, corrugated & smooth.
Excellent
No Bid 3-506 Culvert Gate, metal, 24" diameter, yellow, with some rust. Fair $10
No Bid 3-507 Culvert Gate, metal, 32" diameter, yellow, with some rust. Good $10
50.00 3-508 Culvert Gate, metal, 37" diameter, yellow, with some rust. Good $10
No Bid 3-509 Culvert Gate, metal, 43" diameter, yellow, with some rust. Good $10
No Bid 3-510 Culvert Gate, metal, 28" diameter yellow, with some rust. Good $10
No Bid 3-512 Culvert Gates, Lot of 3metal, 26" diameter, yellow, with some rust. Good $S10
No Bid 3-511 Culvert Gates, Lot of 7metal, 18" diameter, yellow, with some rust. Good $10
No Bid 3-513 Culvert Insert with Gate, metal, 13" length, 26" diameter, with some rust, no fittings S10

included. Fair

6/13/2024,2:14 PM
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
No Bid 3-514 Culvert Insert with Gate, metal, 50" length, 43" diameter, with some rust, manual wheel and $10
screw opener included. Fair
80.51 3-515 Generators, Lot of 2Suzuki Model SV1800P, Non-operational, gas, AC 120-60Hz, 12.5 A. $20
Broken Repairable
No Bid 3-516 Hoist, Stationary Frame, Not certified, frame 8' 7" length, base 6'w x 6' d. Fair $300
333.33 3-517 Scrap Metal, Approx. Lot of 500, Assorted angles, channel, rebar (48" w x 5/8" d), with $250
some rust. Fair
137.00 3-518 Sign Posts, Lot of 5wood, 10" w x 10" d x 16.5' h, unknown material. Fair $10
55.00 3-519 Tool Box, Lund, aluminium, For truck box, 60" w x 15" d x 12" h, locks, no key. Excellent $25
No Bid 3-520 Tool Box, Yukon Elite, aluminium, For truck box, 56.4" w x 14.4" d x 14.4" h, locks, no key. $25
Good
75.00 3-521 Tool Box, Yukon Elite, aluminium, For truck box, 68.4" w x 18" d x 15.6" h, locks, no key. $25
Good
1,095.00 3-525 Trailer, 2005, Ramp Master, Wood deck on metal frame, single axle, 14.5' w x 8' |, 205-75R- S500 2N9BS211X55044356
15 tires- 5 lug rims, spare included, 2" coupler, 3500 Ibs capacity, wire harness lighting,
unknown if operational, tie-down points every 2', removable front rock screen, xc Good
457.00 3-524 Trailer, 2002, Trailblazer, Wood deck on metal frame, 4.25'w x 8' |, single axle, 4.60 tires- 5 $200 5KTSCOB102F036876
lug rims, 2" coupler with 3500 Ibs tow capacity, plastic step-fenders over exposed wheels,
Excellent
327.27 3-522 Wagon, metal, 4'wx4'dx2'h,17/8" coupler, with some rust. Fair S75
389.00 3-523 Wire Mesh, Lot of 19, metal, Each roll approx. 7.5' w x 50' length, 5" w x 3" d mesh spacing, $200

with some rust. Good
OUTLOOK, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 420 Saskatchewan Ave

Contact Scott Andrew 306-420-6427, scott.andrew@gov.sk.ca

20.00 * 12-536 Reciprocating Saw, DeWalt DC385 18V, Includes case, battery charger, battery; battery does S1 264,702
not take charge, unknown if operational. Poor

PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Ave

Contact Alan Carswell 306-953-2423, alan.carswell@gov.sk.ca or Tammy McGunigal 306-953-2422, tammy.mcgunigal@gov.sk.ca

No Bid * 1-503 Air Purifier, Honeywell Power Alimentation, Operational, unknown if cleans air. Fair S1

6/13/2024,2:14 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 14
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

REGINA, Agriculture, 1610 Park St

Contact James Bush 306-798-0100, james.bush@gov.sk.ca

No Bid * 1-502 Autopippeting Robot, Tecan Computer Controlled Liquid Handling Robot, 42" x 41" x 44", $35,000
This needs software to function, and software is on a flash drive that is included. There is no
training manual, but usually Tecan would come out and train users on it. There is no risk to
sell to public. Operational. Good

REGINA, Agriculture, 3085 Albert St, Room 226

Contact Tanya Francis 306-787-5130, tanya.francis@gov.sk.ca

No Bid 3-536 Chair, metal, fabric, Brown/silver, no wheels, wooden armrests. Good S1

No Bid 3-537 Chair, swivel, fabric, 5 castors, black, high back, head rest, with armrests, one armrest is S1
damaged. Good

No Bid 3-538 Chairs, Lot of 2metal, fabric, Brown/silver, no wheels, hard plastic armrests. Good S1

No Bid 3-539 Chairs, Lot of 2metal, fabric, Dusty blue grey/silver, no wheels, hard plastic armrest. Fair S1

4.00 3-540 Chairs, Lot of 4metal, fabric, Green/silver, no wheels, wooden armrests. Good S1

REGINA, Immigration and Career Training, 10th Floor, 2103 - 11th Avenue

Contact Verna Ziegler 306-787-2580, verna.ziegler@gov.sk.ca or Kayla Swicheniuk 306-787-5014, kayla.swicheniuk@gov.sk.ca

93.40 3-586 Bookshelf , wooden, Brown, 2 removable shelves, 42" w x 15" d x 52" h. Good S5

114.15 3-587 Cabinet, wooden, glass, Brown, 2 doors, 5 shelves, 40" w x 13" d x 61" h. Good S5

41.00 3-588 File Caibnet, Global, metal, lateral, 5 drawer, Beige, 36" w x 18" d x 65.5" h, 2 keys included. S5
Good

20.00 3-589 File Cabinet, metal, 4 drawer, vertical, Beige, 18" w x 28.5" d x 52" h, keys included. Good S5

No Bid 3-590 Shelf, wooden, Brown, removable shelves, 29.5" w x 12" d x 24" h. Fair S5

REGINA, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, 300-1870 Albert St

Contact: Bianca Episkenew, 306-787-0817, bianca.episkenew2@gov.sk.ca

10.51 3-526 Chair, fabric, plastic, 5 casters, adjustable, beige/black, swivel, tilter, with armrests. Fair S1

6/13/2024,2:14 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 15
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REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 1702 Park St

Contact Kristen Nelson 306-787-0179, knelson@slga.com or Sherrie Sawin 306-787-309, ssawin@slga.com

5.00 3-576 Chairs, fabric, Wooden frame, green, with armrests, one chair has no foot pads. *NOTE: S5
Online viewing only & 24 hours’ notice for pick-up required. Fair
5.00 * 2-540 Desk, laminate, metal, rectangular, 36" w x 24" d x 28" h. *NOTE: Online viewing only & 24 $5
hours’ notice for pick-up required. Good
5.00 3-577 Desk, laminate, metal, rectangular, Beige, 60" w x 30" d x 29.75" h, right side 3 drawers. S5
*NOTE: Online viewing only & 24 hours’ notice for pick-up required. Fair
No Bid 3-578 Desk, laminate, metal, rectangular, Brown, 60" w x 30" d x 29.75" h, right side 3 drawers. S5
*NOTE: Online viewing only & 24 hours’ notice for pick-up required. Fair
10.50 3-579 File Cabinet, Global, metal, 2 drawer, vertical, Beige, with key, 15.25" w x 26.5" d x 29" h. S5
*NOTE: Online viewing only & 24 hours’ notice for pick-up required. Good
35.55 * 2-543 File Cabinet, Global, metal, 3 shelves & 2 drawers, lateral, Beige, no key, 36" w x 18" d x S5
35.25" h, adjustable shelves, no doors for the top 3 shelves. *NOTE: Online viewing only &
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required. Fair
10.50 3-580 File Cabinet, metal, 3 drawer, vertical, Black, with keys, 15" w x 29" d x 27.5" h. *NOTE: S5
Online viewing only & 24 hours’ notice for pick-up required. Fair
No Bid * 2-559 File Cabinet, Lot of 2Sankey Shelden, metal, 4 drawer, vertical, Grey, no keys, 28" w x 18" d x S5
51" h. *NOTE: Online viewing only & 24 hours’ notice for pick-up required. Fair
20.00 * 2-560 Hutch, solid wooden, 36" w x 19.75" d x 65 "h, top 2 door vertical, bottom 2 drawer lateral, $15
no key. *NOTE: Online viewing only & 24 hours’ notice for pick-up required. Good
66.00 3-581 Security Gate, metal, folding, Grey, 12" w (collapsed)/ 123" w (extended) x 1.5" d x 82" h, S50
with Key. *NOTE: Online viewing only & 24 hours’ notice for pick-up required. Good
11.00 3-582 Shelving Unit, metal, 3 shelves, 36" w x 14" d x 46.5" h, adjustable, shelves, bent clips, may S5
need replacement. *NOTE: Online viewing only & 24 hours’ notice for pick-up required. Fair
10.00 * 2-565 Storage cabinet, pressboard, White, with door, 2 shelves, 19.5" w x 15.5"d x 27.5" h, 4 S5
swivel casters. *NOTE: Online viewing only & 24 hours’ notice for pick-up required. Good
8.58 3-583 Table, laminate, metal, rectangular, 60" w x 30" d x 29.25" h. *NOTE: Online viewing only & S5

24 hours’ notice for pick-up required. Fair

6/13/2024,2:14 PM
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5.00 * 2-566 Table, wooden, rectangular, 54" w x 24" d x 30" h. *NOTE: Online viewing only & 24 hours’ S5
notice for pick-up required. Fair
5.00 3-584 Table, wooden, rectangular, 54" w x 24" d x 30" h. *NOTE: Online viewing only & 24 hours’ S5

notice for pick-up required. Fair

REGINA, SaskTel, 355 Longman Crescent

Contact Graeme Henneberg 306-221-3480,graeme.henneberg@sasktel.com or Isaac Ziegler 306-550-4187, isaac.ziegler@sasktel.com

No Bid 3-575 Fuel Storage Cage, Homebuilt, metal, 5'w x 7' 3/8" d x 7' h, door is padlock compatible, not $500
included, black. Excellent

ROWAN'S RAVINE Provincial Park, Parks Culture and Sport, Call for Location Directions.

Contact Nathan Hafner 306-725-5200, nathan.hafner@gov.sk.ca

4,100.00 3-585 Mower, 2021, John DeereZ355EZero Turn, 2WD, 2 cylinder, 22 hp, gas Hydrostatic 48" 202 hrs $2,000 1GX355EDHMM170482

mower deck202 hrs KNOWN PROBLEMS: Mower operates in new condition but does not
meet Government of Saskatchewan OH & S standard that requires roll-over protection (ROP)
for mowers with greater than 20.2HP. This mower doe not have roll- over protection and
cannot be retro-fitted therefore it currently on lock-out by SaskParks Safety Branch. Asis,
Where is

SASKATOON, Conseil des écoles fransaskoises / Francophone School Division, Legacy Bus, 4003 Brodsky Ave

Contact Mike Berko 306-933-3135, mike.berko@pro-tec.ca, Kent Fraser 306-491-4814, fraser.kent@legacybussales.com or Shravan Varmah 306-719-7420, svarmah@cef:

9,950.00 3-532 Bus, 2009, CHEVROLETExpress2WD,6.8L, V8, gas auto, Duramax A/C, cruise wheelchair 156,124 $9,000 1GBKG316991133862

accessible, lift, operational, dual tires, tire size 225 75 R16whiteTOW ONLY, NO SGI km
Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed

SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required.

156,124 km KNOWN PROBLEMS: Poor battery As is, Where is

*WD 3-529 Bus, 2013, FORDEIdorado, E4502WD,6.8L, V10, gas auto A/C, cruise wheelchair accessible, 113,029 $17,000 1FDFE4FS3DDA47951

lift, operational dual tires, tire size 225 75 R16whiteTOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is km
unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to

be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 113,029 km KNOWN
PROBLEMS: Poor battery, needs boost to start As is, Where is

*WD 3-530 Bus, 2011, FORDSuper Duty E4502WD,6.8L, V10, gas auto A/C, cruise dual tires, tire size 225 99,913 km $15,000 1FDFE4FS7BDB21238

75 R16whiteTOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns
exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full
responsibility for repairs if required. 99,913 km KNOWN PROBLEMS: Poor battery, needs
boost to start As is, Where is
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
13,743.00 3-531 Bus, 2012, FORDType A2WD,6.8L, V10, gas auto A/C, cruise wheelchair accessible, lift, 31,743 km $12,500 1FDFE4FS5CDB01362

operational, dual tires, tire size 225 75 R16whiteTOW ONLY, NO SGlI Inspection. Itis
unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to
be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 31,743 km KNOWN
PROBLEMS: Poor battery As is, Where is

SASKATOON, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, SCC, 910 60th St. E

Contact Renee Pound 306-956-8817, renee.pound@gov.sk.ca or Danielle Corriveau 306-956-8869 danielle.corriveau@gov.sk.ca.

*MT * 1-512 Locker, Lot of 2, metal, 1 grey single - 12"w x 17 5/8"d x 72"h, locks not included. Fair S1
25.25 * 1-511 Locker, Lot of 3, metal, 1 red double - 24"w x 19 1/2"d x 72"h; 1 red single - two doors, 12"w S1

x 18"d x 72"h and 1 red single locker 12"w x 19 1/2"d x 72"h, locks not included. Fair
*MT * 1-514 Locker, metal, 36"w x 21"d x 72"h, blue, 1 tier, 3 door, locks not included. Fair s1
31.00 * 1-515 Storage Container, Lot of 3, plastic, 29 1/2"w x 13"d x 28 1/2"h, white, on casters. Fair S1
No Bid * 2-594 Trivets, Lot of 10, aluminum, 16 3/4"w x 8 3/4"d. Good S1

SASKATOON, Highways, 126 105th St E

Contact Richard Leibel 306-933-5262, richard.leibel@gov.sk.ca or Shaun Bowditch, shaun.bowditch@gov.sk.ca

2,111.00 3-534 Forklift, 1992ClarkiT802WD,4.9 L, inline 6, gas Ford, auto 8,000 lbs max lift, 48" forks 4 5,350 hrs
speedyellow 5,350 hrs KNOWN PROBLEMS: Transmission brakes, and seat worn out, park
brake non-operational, steering leaks and locks up, transmission, hydraulic oil and engine oil
leak, motor, transmission, brakes, battery, body, exhaust, interior and horn all in poor
condition. As is, Where is

$1 IT581-61-445

1,727.99 3-574 Lathe, Mitchell Ensign, 7'6", comes with an assortment of tools and attachments, S1 7,000
operational but has power input issues, shorting out, shadow boards not included. Fair
No Bid 3-533 Truck, 1992GMCCC70COQil Distributor,Cat 3116, inline 6, 4 stroke, diesel Allison MT653, auto 255,448 $2,500 1GDM7H1J7NJ501421

Etryre Black Topper, SAM HW Ser# C-1147 6500 L tank, 5 speed, single axle, GVW 14,600 kg, km 10,020

205 hpyellowTOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns  hrs
exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full

responsibility for repairs if required. 255,448 km 10,020 hrs KNOWN PROBLEMS: Motor burns
and leaks oil, transmission needs a service, exhaust is rusted out, horn non-operational,
distributor asphalt pump does not turn, hydraulic pump noisy, spray bar and hydraulic lines

have numerous leaks, body exterior, paint, interior, lights and mirrors all in poor condition,
batteries need to be replaced, drivers door hinge is bent, windshield and wipers needs to be
replaced transmission fair, tires and brakes good. As is, Where is
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

PRINCE ALBERT, Highways, 81 North Industrial Dr

Contact Cory Palko 306-960-5152, cory.palko@gov.sk.ca or Zach McPherson 306-953-2474,zachariah.mcpherson@gov.sk.ca

101.00 3-527 Pressure Washer, Sioux, 350-C, 240V, 40A, 3 phase, 6,220 hrs, includes natural gas heat and S1 9,911,039
2 pumps, unknown if operational, parts no longer available, chemical injection is non-
operational. Poor
PRINCE ALBERT, SaskBuilds and Procurement, 1751 6th Ave W

Contact Mitchel Bieker 306-940-7845, mitchell.bieker@gov.sk.ca or Darren Whitehead, Darren. whitehead@gov.sk.ca

3,071.00 3-557 Backhoe Attachment, Bobcat 911, Includes bucket 14.5" w x 23"d, approx. digging depth 5'- $300
6', hydraulic hoses cracked, unknown if operational. Fair

PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Ave N
Contact Brent Zbaraschuk 306-953-2428, brent.zbaraschuk@gov.sk.ca or Bob Northey 306-930-8719, bob.northey@gov.sk.ca

No Bid * 2-604 Electric Motor, Leeson, VP, 460 volts, 29/10 amps, 25/6.3 H.P, was operational when put $500
away. Good

No Bid * 2-605 Fire Extinguishing Agent, Lot of 12Mono Ammonium Phosphate, Dry chemical powder, pails S1
of fire extinguishing agent. Poor

No Bid * 2-606 Fire Extinguishing Agent, Lot of 24Potassium Chloride , Dry chemical powder, pails of fire S1
extinguishing agent. Poor

No Bid * 2-633 Tires,Set of 224R21, Michelin X, Poor S1

PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Ave N

Contact Keri Roles 306-930-8305, keri.rolles@gov.sk.ca or Duane Barlow 306-953-3409, duane.barlow@gov.sk.ca

No Bid 3-541 Desk, Set of 3, wood, L-shape, Grey, 2 piece desks - approx. 78" w x 60" d X 28.5" hand 1 s1
pedestal - 17.5” w x 24.5” d x 27” h, 3 drawers, not on wheels, no keys. Fair
No Bid 3-542 Desk, Set of 3, wood, L-shape, Grey, 2 piece desks with a right side hutch - desk approx. 78" s1

wx 36" x28.5" hand 72"w x 42" d x 28.5" h, 1 hutch approx. 42" w x 42" d with one shelf &
locking key. Fair
No Bid 3-543 Desk, Set of 4, wood, L-shape, Grey, 2 piece desks with a right side hutch - desk approx. 78" s1
wx 72" d x28.5" h, 1 hutch approx. 42" w x 42" d, front of desk pealed off and 1 pedestal -
17.5” wx 24.5” d x 27” h, 3 drawer, not on wheels, no keys. Fair

No Bid 3-544 Desk, Set of 4, wood, L-shape, Grey, 3 piece desks with a left side hutch - approx. 84" w x S1
78" d x 28.5" h and 1 hutch approx. 42" w x 42" d. Good
5.00 3-545 Desk, Set of 5, wood, L-shape, Grey, 3 piece desks with a right side hutch - desk approx. 84" S1

wx 78" dx28.5" hand 1 hutch approx. 42" w x 42" d, front and side edge of desk pealed off
and 1 pedestal - 17.5” w x 24.5” d x 27" h, 3 drawer, not on wheels, no keys. Fair
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Ave N

Contact Wanda Dickie 306-953-3434, wanda.dickie@gov.sk.ca or Tammy Lukaszuk 306-953-3392, tammy.lukaszuk@gov.sk.ca

No Bid 3-546 Desk Extension, pepperdust, Left hand, 30" w x 48" d x 29" h. Good S1
No Bid 3-547 Desk Extension, pepperdust, Left hand, 42" w x 20" d x 28" h. Good S1
1.00 3-548 Desk Hutch, pepperdust, Right hand, two door cabinet, no shelf, 42" wx 17 1/2" d x 42" h, S1
bulletin board attached under cabinet. Good
*WD 3-549 Mini Fridge, Danby, White, 18 1/2" w x 20" d x 16 1/2" h, operational, includes ice cube tray S1
and small freezer box. Good
3.00 3-550 Office Chair, 5 Castor, with armrests, black, mesh back, back adjusting does not hold S1
position. Poor
10.51 3-551 Office Chair, 5-castor, with armrests, artificial leather, black, does not roll very well. Poor S1
10.51 3-552 Office Chair, 5-castor, with armrests, artificial leather, black, visible wear on material. Fair S1
No Bid 3-553 Pedestal, pepperdust, 3 drawer, lateral, 24" d x 16.5" w x 26.5" h, no key for the lock, wheels S1

are broken, bottom drawer has stain. Fair
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Ave N

Contact Suzanne Goota 306-941-7217, suzanne.goota2@gov.sk.ca or Karla Ens 306-953-3416, karla.ens@gov.sk.ca

No Bid 3-558 File Cabinet, metal, 4 drawer, lateral, Beige, no keys for the lock, 36" w x 19" d x 67" h. Good S1
6.00 3-559 Fire Rakes, Lot of 3, wood, metal, Handle 58” long, head 12” w. Fair S1
8.00 3-560 McLeod Fire Tools, Lot of 2, wood, metal, Handle 51” long, cutting head 12” w, 6 tine rake, S1

used in fire fighting. Fair
5.00 3-561 Projector Screen, 99" w x 120" long, wall mount, opens and closes properly. Good S1 CB-P120W5(SCW)
5.00 3-562 Shredder, GBC Shredmaster SC70, Strip cut, grey/black, 9 page max, operational, 16” w x 8” S1
dx11” h. Good
22.00 3-563 Tents, Lot of 6, 12' w x 14' d x Approx. 8’ to 10’ h, some with broken zippers and holes. S1
Broken Repairable
26.00 3-564 Tents, Lot of 6, 12' w x 14' d x Approx. 8 to 10" h, some with broken zippers and holes. S1
Broken Repairable
134.00 3-565 Tents, Lot of 6, 12' w x 14' d x Approx. 8’ to 10’ h, some with broken zippers and holes. S1
Broken Repairable
28.00 3-566 Tents,Lotof 5, 12'w x 14' d x Approx. 8 to 10" h, some with broken zippers and holes. S1

Broken Repairable
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40.00 3-567 Totes, Lot of 10, heavy plastic, Red, with lid, chain & hook to close, 33" w x 14" d x 10" h. S1
Fair
108.00 3-568 Totes, Lot of 10, heavy plastic, Red, with lid, chain & hook to close, 33" w x 14" d x 10" h. S1
Fair
40.00 3-569 Totes, Lot of 10, heavy plastic, Red, with lid, chain & hook to close, 33" w x 14" d x 10" h. S1
Fair
57.00 3-570 Totes, Lot of 10, heavy plastic, Red, with lid, chain & hook to close, 33" w x 14" d x 10" h. S1
Fair
57.00 3-571 Totes, Lot of 10, heavy plastic, Red, with lid, chain & hook to close, 33" w x 14" d x 10" h. S1
Fair
11.00 3-572 Water Backpacks, Lot of 11, Firetak, soft/foam, 16 1/2" w x 27 1/2" h, 19 liters/ 5 US gallons S1
capacity Fair
11.00 3-573 Water Backpacks, Lot of 11, Firetak, soft/foam, 16 1/2" w x 27 1/2" h, 19 liters/ 5 US gallons S1

capacity Fair
YORKTON, Highways, 245 York Rd E

Contact: Brian Perih 306-786-1651, brian.perih@gov.sk.ca or Ed Patzwald 306-786-1687, ed.patzwald@gov.sk.ca

252.00 3-528 Sign Posts ,Lot of 50-60, wood, Spruce, Some treated, some untreated and broken, S1
approximately 4" w x 6" d x 8' to 12' h, approximate weight of lift is 6500 Ibs. Must bring
deck-over-trailer for assistance with loading, if deck-over-trailer cannot be provided loading is
responsibility of buyer. Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers
with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Please note lifts are now smaller to make
handling safer. Fair
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