
SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #2
From May 07 to May 14, 2025

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

SALE SUMMARY LIST

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described.  
Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding.  Vehicles and equipment are sold 
“AS IS, WHERE IS”, there is no implied or express warranty. 

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.
     - Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
     - SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.
It is the Bidder’s responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.
Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.
Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways: 
     - by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
     - by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-787-2238,
     - by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
     - by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1.
  (If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)
- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer)     This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry. 
WD = (Withdrawn)               This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller. 
No Bid =                                  Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

5/15/2025,3:53 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  1



SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #2
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca

S 4,335.14 2-006 Car 2011 TOYOTA Camry FWD 3.5L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player/Bluetooth, power 
mirrors/locks/windows/left front seat, keyless entry-3 keys fobs, 1 key , grey, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a 
FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED 
SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This 
vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 325,566 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Brake 
pulsation, front/rear brake pulsation, low brake pedal.
Grille chips, hood chips/scratches, rear bumper chips/dent, left front fender chips, rocker panels road rash, right 
rear door dings, trunk lid paint poor/rust, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, tires worn, poor 
battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

325,566 km $2,822 4T1BK3EK1BU627828

S 3,666.00 2-010 SUV 2013 CHEVROLET Tahoe 4WD 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power 
windows/locks/left front seat, rear HVAC, keyless entry-2 fob, 2 key grille inserts, front tow hooks, hitch, trailer 
wiring, roof rails, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be 
signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full 
responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 242,792 
km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Power steering issues, rear shocks, left lower ball joint, right rear 
caliper missing bolt, power steering rack and pinions, exhaust manifold bolts broken, front and rear pads/rotors, 
needs oil change, battery fuse, left low beam, left head light assembly, right washer nozzle, right rear outside 
door handle, front bumper cover.
Hood road rash/rust, front bumper broke, rear bumper bent, left front fender dent, left rear fender road 
rash/rust, right rear fender road rash/rust, left rear door chips/rust/dents, right rear door road rash/rust/hard to 
open, right rear door glass scratched, both rear doors hard to open, loose trim panel in left front door, tailgate 
chips/rust, wheel wrench missing, jack loose, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, glass pitted, left front seat cushion 
sagging, left front head light broke, loose heater control trim in cup holder, poor battery, minor exterior 
damage > As is where is

242,792 km $3,324 1GNSK4E01DR248057

S 4,505.00 2-007 SUV 2009 DODGE Journey SXT AWD 3.5L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player/ Bluetooth, rear HVAC, 
power heated mirrors, power locks/windows/left front seat, keyless entry-1 key fob 7 passengers, driving lights, 
cargo net, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by 
the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility 
for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 155,534 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Right outer tie rod, alignment needed, wiper blades.
Grille lower broke, hood paint bubbling/dents, rear bumper cracked/scratched/chips, left and right rear fenders 
rust, left front door rust, left rear door dent/chips/rust/road rash, right front door rust, roof dents, tailgate plate 
bolt stripped/glass scratched/hard to close, 2nd full size spare tire loose in back may not be compatible with 
vehicle, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, both mirrors paint poor, gas filler door will not close, overhead 
compartment will not closed, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

155,534 km $1,682 3D4GH57V59T588681
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SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #2
From May 07 to May 14, 2025

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

S 4,124.00 2-002 Truck 2009 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 RWD, extended cab, 6'6" box 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 
AM/FM/CD player, power locks, keyless entry-2 fobs, 2 keys grille inserts, hitch, trailer wiring, 2-way radio mount 
on front hump, mud flaps, headache rack, beacon-condition unknown, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This 
vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle 
requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 183,041 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and 
OBSERVATIONS: Transmission issues, both inner tie rods, front struts leaking, front pads/rotors, gear indicator 
inoperable, TPMS light on, head lamps foggy, washer, spare tire hoist broke.
Hood chips/hail, front bumper road rash, right rear fender dent, left front door dents/chips, right rear door dent, 
hole in roof one sealed (antenna), tailgate dented, spare tire loose in box may not be compatible with vehicle, no 
first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield small chips, 2-small holes in floor pan under rear seat hump, seats soiled, 
poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

183,041 km $2,525 1GCEC19059Z239932

S 4,444.44 2-009 Truck 2009 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 RWD, extended cab, 6'7" box 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, 3 
keys-2 door keys, 1 good key grille inserts, hitch, trailer wiring, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a 
FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED 
SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This 
vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 173,398 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Power 
steering rack stiffness, left lower ball joint, alignment needed, park brake seized, driver door pins, rear driver side 
door handle, driver window handle, passenger seat level broken.
Hood dents/scratches, front bumper pitted, rear bumper bent, left rear fender rust/dent, right rear fender 
rust/badly dented, left side doors rusted/road rash, left front door binding/window crank, left rear door hard to 
open, right front door road rash/rust, roof rust spots, tailgate dented/bent/badge, front of box badly dented, 
both box rails dented, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, right front seat missing handle, left front seat back 
worn/ripped/sagging, rust perforation on box side above wheels, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> , As is, 
where is

173,398 km $2,314 1GCEC19079Z240032

S 4,524.00 2-003 Truck 2015 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 4WD, crew cab, 6'5" box 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM power 
windows/mirrors/locks, keyless entry-2 keys, 2 fobs grille inserts, front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, 
trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, box liner, headache rack, wigwags front/rear, beacon, has a back seat, white, 
TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. 
This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and 
any required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 328,532 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS 
and OBSERVATIONS: Both lower ball joints, left upper ball joint, oil leak, oils low, brakes squeal, windshield 
cracked, front wiper blades, license plate light, rear middle seat belt not routed correct, note-washer cap missing, 
paint peeling.
Hood hail, front bumper pitted, rear bumper dented/bent, left side fenders dents/road rash, right front fender 
paint peeling, right rear fender rust/dents/road rash, left front door sill worn, left rear door paint poor, right front 
door chips/rust, right rear door rust/paint poor, roof possible hail, tailgate chips/dents/bent/touching fender, no 
first aid kit/fire extinguisher, left front seat worn/foam visible/sagging, seats soiled, headlights fogged, center arm 
rest soiled, front of box bent, poor battery minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

328,532 km $4,135 3GCUKPEC9FG456476
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S 5,208.00 2-011 Truck 2015 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 4WD, crew cab, 6'6" box 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power 
windows/locks/mirrors, keyless entry-2 fobs, 2 keys grille inserts, front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, 
trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, box liner, headache rack with beacon, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This 
vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle 
requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 294,882 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and 
OBSERVATIONS: Misfire, right rear caliper pins, left lower ball joint, front and rear pads/rotors, alignment needed, 
windshield, wiper blades.
Hood hail/chips, front bumper road rash/dented, rear bumper dents/not aligned, left side fenders road 
rash/chips/scratches, right side fenders road rash, right rear fender dents/rust/chips/scratches, left rocker panel 
paint poor, left front door chips/sill-paint poor, left rear door chips/paint poor, right rear door paint poor, tailgate 
molding broke/chips/dents, wheel wrench loose under back seat, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield 
cracked, left front seat cushion sagging, left front back seat panel loose, right front back panel loose, seat soiled, 
left head light bezel broke, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

294,882 km $4,585 3GCUKPEC6FG267624

S 4,124.00 2-001 Truck 2018 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 4WD, crew cab, 6'6" box 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power 
mirrors/windows/locks, keyless entry-2 fobs, 2 keys front wigwags non-operational, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, 
trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, box liner, has a rear seat, black, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI 
Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI 
Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This 
vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 328,916 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Transmission 
issues/failure, left lower ball joint, both inner tie rods, driver’s door pins, windshield cracked, front grille and 
bumper damaged.
Grille broke, hood chips/scratches, front bumper large dent, rear bumper dents, left side fenders road 
rash/scratches, right side fenders road rash/dents, left side doors road rash/scratches, left front door sill area 
worn, right side doors road rash/scratches/dents, roof dents/scratches, tailgate road rash/scratches, wheel 
wrench/jack loose under back seat, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, left front seat sagging, 
hole drilled in front hump, overhead console loose, front wig wags not working, poor battery, minor exterior 
damage > As is Where is

328,916 km $3,818 3GCUKNEC1JG155939

S 3,676.99 2-005 Truck 2014 DODGE Ram 1500  4WD, crew cab, 6'4" box 5.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/Bluetooth, 
power heated mirrors, power locks/windows/mirrors, keyless entry-2 fobs, 2 keys, 4 keys for toolboxes hitch, 
tailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, mud flaps, front tow hooks, grille inserts, headache rack with beacon, 2 side 
mounted Brute toolboxes with keys, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY 
Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where 
is” condition., 325,646 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Right outer tie rod, alignment needed, both 
taillight assemblies, right brake light, windshield, both front fenders.
Hood paint peeling/hail, front bumper rust, rear bumper dent/not aligned, left side fenders rust, right front 
fender rust, right rear fender rust/dent, rocker panels road rash, left rocker panels dent, left front door road 
rash/rust/paint peeling at door window frame, right front door road rash, right rear door rust, roof hail, tailgate 
dented/molding broke/rust spots, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, both rear taillights broke, windshield chips, 
poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

325,646 km $2,800 1C6RR7TT6ES200413
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S 5,125.00 2-013 Truck 2012 DODGE Ram 5500 RWD, 10' x 8' tilting deck 6.7L, inline 6, diesel auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 
player, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-1 key fob front tow hooks, side steps, missing 
right mud flap, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED 
SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI 
Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This 
vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 314,511 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Engine light 
on, transmission does not shift, coolant leaking, both reverse lights, both outer tires cupping, rear view mirror, 
passenger lower side mirror, drivers front seat back exposing metal, interior soiled.
Hood dented/rust/chips, front bumper rusted, rocker panels rusted, left front door panel broke, left front door sill 
rust/molding broke, right rear door rust stain, roof small rust spots/rust stain, one hole in roof sealed (antenna), 
no spare tire/wheel wrench/jack/first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front frame visible, left front 
back worn frame visible, holes drilled in dash, rust stains left rear cab corner, condition of tilting deck equipment 
unknown, deck has no sides/tailgate or lift, no beacons, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

314,511 km $1,851 3C7WDMEL6CG196831

S 3,000.00 2-008 Truck 2014 FORD F250 Super Duty RWD, supercab, 8' box 6.7L, V8 turbo, diesel auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, 
power front windows/locks, power heated trailer tow mirrors, keyless entry-1 key fob grille inserts, front tow 
hooks, side steps, OEM trailer brake, wig wags on mirrors/grille, black hood, dark tint on windows, has a back 
seat, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for 
repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 371,192 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Check engine light on, misfire, trouble shifting, codes P127A fuel pressure 
failure, transmission codes, manifold leaks, front pads/rotors, alignment needed, no plate lights, right back up 
light.
Hood chips/scratches, front bumper road rash, rear bumper white paint/holes drilled, left side fenders 
chips/scratches/dents, roof paint on roof/small rust spots, spare tire loose in box may not be compatible with 
vehicle, windshield chips, left front mirror housing broke, missing lower part of jump seat, holes drilled in both 
box rails, paint on  areas of the exterior, in side of box rust/paint poor, paint of rear cab window, interior soiled, 

b d h

371,192 km $2,390 1FT7X2AT0EEB55026

S 10,124.00 2-012 Truck 2017 FORD F250 Super duty 4WD, crew cab, 6'10" box 6.2L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power 
trailer tow mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry-1 key fob front tow hooks, wig wags in grille, hitch received on 
front, side steps, mud flaps, rear hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, box liner, has a back seat, white, TOW 
ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This 
vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any 
required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 255,613 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and 
OBSERVATIONS: Check engine light codes P0300 random misfire, P0316 misfire on startup, P0420 catalyst 
efficiency bank 1 driver front, TPMS sensor, windshield cracked, right taillight assembly, wiper blades.
 Hood dent, front and rear bumper pitted/dented, rear bumper paint over spray, right front fender dented, two 
holes in roof sealed (antenna), tailgate missing, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, left front seat cushion sagging, 
over spray in cab, multiple holes in dash, paint mess in box, holes and rust in floor of box, poor battery, minor 
exterior damage.>, As is, where is

255,613 km $7,729 1FT7W2B62HEC26632
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S 5,713.63 2-004 Van 2006 GMC Savana 1500 RWD 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, rear heat, power locks, 2 
keys 8 passengers, beacon on roof, deflector mounted on hood, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI 
Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI 
Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This 
vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 172,235 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Power 
steering rack leaks, rear pads/rotors, drive belt, power steering hose, power steering pump, alignment needed, 
damaged door weather strip, right front fender, seat belts, broken window, wiper blades, left sun visor.
Hood paint poor, front bumper rusted, rear bumper chips/scratches, left side fenders paint poor, right front 
fender dent/missing molding, left front door sticking, right front door damaged/missing inside door trim, right 
rear doors weather stripping/window will not stay closed, roof paint poor, missing wheel wrench/jack, no first aid 
kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, missing wash reservoir cap, 2nd and 3rd row seats damaged, 2nd row seat 
missing buckle, left visor broken, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is

172,235 km $3,481 1GKFG15TX61252490

REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306, sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca

S 7.55 2-131 Emergency Items, Lot of 16 Coghlan's,  7 emergency stoves, 3 poncho's, 6 lightweight emergency blankets.  Fair $1

S No Bid 2-111 Rear Seat,  ,  Grey in color, unsure of 2nd or 3rd row and compatibility, stain spots.  Fair $5

S No Bid 2-110 Rear Seat,  ,  Grey in color, unsure of 2nd or 3rd row and compatibility.  Fair $5

S No Bid 2-104 Rear Seat,  ,  Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 2nd row, captain chair.  Fair $5

S No Bid 2-105 Rear Seat,  ,  Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 2nd row, captain chair.  Fair $5

S No Bid 2-106 Rear Seat,  ,  Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, head rest loose.  Fair $5

S No Bid 2-107 Rear Seat,  ,  Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, rear trim loose.  Fair $5

S No Bid 2-108 Rear Seat,  ,  Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row, seat belt buckle not protruding.  fair $5

S No Bid 2-109 Rear Seat,  ,  Removed from a Chev Uplander, brown in color, 3rd row.  Fair $5

S No Bid * 11-102 Seat Cover,  vinyl,  Rear seat cover kit, split bench seat covers, 3 head rest covers. 1 center arm rest cover, 
includes S hooks for installation, removed from a 2015 Durango.  Good

$20

S No Bid 2-101 Tire,  265/70R17, Maxxis Bravo 7S,  TEMPOARY USE ONLY- spare tire. Manufacture date. Week 39, year 2024.  
Excellent

$20

S 121.00 * 1-103 Tires, Set of 3  225/65R16, Firestone All Season, M+S,  Manufacture date. Week 25, year 2022  Fair $120

S 30.01 * 1-105 Tires, Set of 3  235/65R17, Continental Crosscontact RX M+S,  Manufacture date. Week 47, year 2020.  Fair $30
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S 140.12 2-132 Tires, Set of 4 225/55R17, Firestone All Season, M+S,  Manufacture date. Week 38, year 2020.  Fair $120

S 145.12 2-133 Tires, Set of 4 225/65R17, Goodyear Assurance, All Season, M+S,  Manufacture date. Week 15, year 2023  Fair $120

S 248.10 2-102 Tires, Set of 4  225/65R17, Roadx rxmotion 4S. All season,  Manufacture date. Week 12, year 2023.  Good $160

S 425.00 2-103 Tires, Set of 4  265/65R18, Michelin Primacy LTX, All Season,  Manufacture date. Week 50, year 2024.  Excellent $200

S 55.00 * 9-140 Toolbox,  Bruce Commercial class, dual lid Gullwing crossover,  Comes with a sliding tray, box is 70.5”w x 20”w x 
18”h, mounts on box rails, 1 lid does not stay up, no keys.  Fair

$1

S No Bid * 9-118 Keyboard Holder Mount,  metal,  30"w x 11"d, bracket 17"w x 7"d, black.  Fair $1

S 11.00 * 9-123 Painting,  wood, Anne Geddes,  36"w x 12"d.  Good $1

S No Bid * 12-133 Printer,  Desktop MFP, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro 400 MFP M425DN,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no 
further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CND8G17924

S 2.01 * 12-107 Printer,  Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200DTN,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), 
some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CNBX401894

S 5.55 * 12-116 Printer,  Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200DTN,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), 
some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CNGY209007

S 2.01 * 12-113 Printer,  Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200TN,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some 
scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 USGNX53048

S 2.01 * 12-117 Printer,  Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200TN,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some 
scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CNBX109336

S No Bid * 12-119 Printer,  Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200TN,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some 
scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CNBX403635

S No Bid * 12-123 Printer,  Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P4015X,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some 
scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CNDYC27273

S No Bid * 12-131 Printer,  Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M401dn,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), 
some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 VNG3703421

S No Bid * 1-112 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P4015X,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some 
scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CNDY118856

S 65.10 2-112 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, Color LaserJet, CP4025DN,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), 
some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 JPBCC6G6Q1
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S 65.10 2-113 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, Color LaserJet, CP4025DN,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), 
some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 JPBCC6M0NH

S 65.10 2-114 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, Color LaserJet, CP4025DN,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), 
some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 JPDCF9M0FC

S 65.10 2-115 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, Color LaserJet, CP4025DN, large,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further 
testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 JPBCC1F06R

S 65.10 2-116 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, Color LaserJet, CP4025DN, large,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further 
testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 JPDCF9M0NJ

S 65.10 2-117 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, Color LaserJet, CP4025DN, large, floor model,  On wheels, operational (powers on, no 
noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 JPBCC5K094

S 65.10 2-118 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, Color LaserJet, M750dn MFP,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), 
some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CNDCH7N0QZ

S No Bid 2-119 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Enterprise 600, M602DN,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further 
testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included.  Fair

$1 CNBCD7K351

S 2.00 2-120 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Enterprise 600, M602X,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further 
testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CNCCF840FF

S 2.00 2-121 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Enterprise 600, M602X,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further 
testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included.  Fair

$1 CNCCDCP051

S 63.00 2-122 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Pro M227, FDN, MFP,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), 
some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 VND3J01919

S 25.00 2-123 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Pro, M276nw,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some 
scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CNF8G1L079

S 7.55 2-124 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Pro, M402dn,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some 
scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 PHBQD81904

S 10.00 2-125 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet Pro, M452dw,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some 
scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 VNB3P31062

S 7.55 2-126 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet, 1536dnf, MFP,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some 
scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CNG8FDS02T

S 26.75 2-127 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet, 9050DN, large, floor model,  On wheels, operational (powers on, no noises, no 
further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included.  Fair

$1 JPRCD1V07L

S 3.00 2-128 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet, P4015X,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some 
scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 CNDY122557

S 5.55 2-129 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet, P4015X,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some 
scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.  Fair

$1 JPDF272273

S 5.55 2-130 Printer,  Hewlett-Packard, LaserJet, P4015X,  Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some 
scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included.  Fair

$1 JPDF265198
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CANDLE LAKE PROVINCIAL PARK, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, Candle Lake Field Office - Call for Directions

Contact Bonnie Greene 306-931-3210, bonnie.greene@gov.sk.ca

S 919.99 * 1-564 Snowmobile,2007 YAMAHARS Venture ,gas   blue 13,300 kmKNOWN PROBLEMS: Not running - needs new stator, 
motor good, battery removed, poor condition.> As is, where is

 13,300 km $50 JYE8GR0037A000799

COCHIN, Parks Culture & Sport, NW 1/4-11-48-17-W3, The Battlefords Provincial Park

Contact Raegan Zdunick 306-386-2212, raegan.zdunick@gov.sk.ca or Sharon Barlow 306-386-2212, sharon.barlow@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid 2-511 Safe,  Metal, No# C457722,  26.5" d x 26.5" w x 50.5" h,  combination code is known and lock is operational, the 
estimated weight of the item is 150 lbs, loading of the item is the buyers responsibility.  Good

$1

CONDIE NATURE RESERVE, Environment, RM of Sherwood, Call for Directions

Contact Aaron Springinotic 306-230-2978, aaron.springinotic@gov.sk.ca or Travis Williams 306-527-6185, travis.williams@gov.sk.ca

S 899.99 * 1-565 Snowmobile 1997 SKANDIC Rotax  368cc, 2 cylinder, gas CVT  , black/red, , 3,663 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: 
Motor, brakes, battery, exhaust and lights all in unknown condition., As is, where is

3,663 km $1 124,000,382

GREENWATER LAKE PROVINCIAL PARK, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety - Call for Directions

Contact Cory Thody 306-278-3515 or cory.thody@gov.sk.ca

S 2,951.00 2-566 ATV 2005 HONDA Foreman 4WD 500 cc, 1 cylinder, gas 5 speed, manual  , green, ,  7,100 miles, New carburetor , 
KNOWN PROBLEMS: Left taillight broken, bent muffler/bumper, right footwell plastic cracked, rust on rims, front 
fender cracked, needs new battery, body exterior some exterior body damage>, As is, where is

 7,100 miles $1 1HFTE312554002560

HUDSON BAY, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 501 Prince St

Contact Matt Hogan 306-865-4544, matt.hogan@gov.sk.ca

S 2,501.00 2-565 ATV 2005 SUZUKI Vinson Quad Runner 4WD 500cc, 4-stroke, gas 5 speed, manual (foot shift) electric start, 
high/low ranges front tires size 26x10x12, rear tires 26x12x12, winch, cargo box, green, , 7,557 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS: Rusting on metal racks/winch mount /rims, cracked plastic on front bumper, plastic lid on mounted 
tool box is cracked at the hinge, motor unknown if operational, has not run for 5 years - was running when it was 
parked, transmission-park does not work, tires/brakes/lights/exhaust/windshield glass fair, no battery, body 
exterior some rusting and cracked plastic.>, As is, where is

7,557 km $1 5SAAM43A-457103409

S 1,801.00 2-524 Snowmobile 2011 POLARIS IQ LXT  550cc, 2-stroke, gas CVT electric start, reverse 136" track, tunnel bag, rear 
rack, white, , 4665 miles, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Motor may be blown, does not start, does not run, track shows 
slight wear on edges, slight rust on rear rack and bumper, paint on rack bars chipped, both sides missing mirror, 
does not have a battery, transmission, brakes, body exterior, exhaust, windshield glass and lights all in fair 
condition tunnel has no rips As is where is

4665 miles $1 SN1PT5BE1BC133487
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MAPLE CREEK, Corrections, Policing & Public Safety, Hwy 21 Service Rd N

Contact: Tyler Hansen 639-236-7132, tyler.hansen@gov.sk.ca or Michael Banks 639-932-7043,  michael.banks@gov.sk.ca

S 1.78 * 1-566 Booster Cables,  light duty,  Black, operational.  Fair $1

S 1.78 * 1-567 Booster Cables,  light duty,  Smaller set of clamps, operational.  Fair $1

S 1.78 * 1-568 Booster Cables,  medium duty,  With heavier clamps, yellow and black, operational.  Fair $1

S 1.78 * 1-570 Ramps,  steel, 2 piece,  Ramp 94"w x 46"d x 2"h, frame 97"w x 49"d x 4"h, rusted, unknown if operational.  Poor $1

MOOSE JAW, Highways, 1 km. South of Moose Jaw on Hwy. #2

Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca

S 4.44 * 1-550 Reciprocating Saw ,  Makita, JR3020,  Operational, no blades included, blade lock mechanism not holding.  Poor $1 692,239

NARROW HILLS PROVINICLAL PARK, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 75 km. N. of Smeaton on Hwy. 106

Contact Eric Pulvermacher 306-426-2610, eric.pulvermacher@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 1-547 Camera,  Fuji Finepix, Digital, A33  ,  SD cards have been removed, no memory, missing charging cord and data 
transfer cables, takes AA batteries, operational.  Good

$1 4CB39929

S No Bid * 1-548 Camera,  Fujifilm 2600 Zoom, Digital,  SD cards have been removed, no memory, missing charging cord and data 
transfer cables, takes AA batteries, operational.  Good

$1 21A01308

NIPAWIN, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 711 Nipawin Rd E

Contact Brant Slater 306-862-1790 or 306-812-8345. brant.slater@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 1-509 Drill,  SKIL, variable speed,  3/8", 120 volts, 0-2500 R.P.M, missing cord, unknown if operational.  Beyond Repair $1 6225 T2

S No Bid * 1-510 Flashlight,  Energizer, TUF4C1,  Unknown if operational.  Fair $1

S 1.11 * 1-512 Front Grille,  Plastic,  Unknown what vehicle this was removed from.  Good $1

S No Bid * 1-513 GPS,  Eagle AccuNav, with case,  Turns on, picks up satellites, does not hold a charge, no charging cable with it, 
rechargeable.  Fair

$1 6,121,540

S 1.11 * 1-517 Keyboard Desk Mounts, Lot of 2 ,  One comes with a circular mouse holder, second comes with a square mouse 
holder for left or right side hidden underneath.  Good

$1

S 1.11 * 1-518 Molding, Lot of 2 Plastic,  For truck.  Good $1
S No Bid * 1-521 Under Seat Ventilation,  ,  Plastic.  Good $1
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OUTLOOK, Agriculture, 410 Saskatchewan Ave W

Contact Ben Lalonde 306-867-6469, ben.lalonde@gov.sk.ca or Front Desk 306-867-5000, tammie.wood@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid 2-510 Leica GPS 1200 System,  2007, 1200 series ,  1200 series Composed of: GX1230 Base Controller, AX1202 Base 
Rover, GZS4-1 Height Hook, GDF122 Optical Tribrach, GRT146 Carrier w 5/8" thread, Pacific Crest PDL4535 Base 
Radio, RX1250XC Rover Controller, GHT56 Controller Mount,  ATX1230 Receiver Rover, x4 GEB211 Batteries, 
GKL22 Battery Charger, Assorted power & connection cables, x2 plastic carrying cases w styrofoam interior. GPS 
Components manufactured in 2007 and 2008, components are green and/or white in colour. Noticeable wear 
present on most GPS components. cables, tribrach, carrier and height hook still in good condition. light dust 
present on most components. GPS system has been stored in a cool dry place for up to the past 10 years. 
Unknown if still fully operational. Still useful for spare parts. Fair

$500  GX1230 Base Controller: 
468771                 AX1202 
Base Rover: 07410156          
RX1250XC Rover Controller: 
311319             GHT56 
Controller Mount: 107837      
ATX1230 Receiver Rover: 
185548                    GKL22 

PRINCE ALBERT, Environment, 2120 Central Ave N

Contact: Suzanne Goota 306-941-7217, suzanne.goota2@gov.sk.ca or Brent Zbaraschuk 306-953-2428, brent.zbaraschuk@gov.sk.ca

S 2,567.89 2-561 Outboard Engine,  2001 Honda ,  130 horse power, for boat, 25'' transom, throttle controls included, hydraulic 
steering, operational, was winterized before removal, no known problems.  Good

$500 BZBE1201651

S 3,333.00 2-562 Outboard Engine,  2002 Honda ,  130 horse power, for boat, 20'' transom, throttle controls included, hydraulic 
steering, comes with a new spare propeller, operational, was winterized before removal, no known problems.  
Good

$500 BZBE1301790

S 200.99 2-563 Outboard Engine,  Mariner,  20 horse power, unknown if operational.  Poor $1 MAO65118

S 650.00 2-564 Rubber Boat,  1990's Zodiac,  Wooden transom and floor boards, multiple patches, 10' long, unknown if 
operational.  Poor

$1 ZZQ0866

PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Polytechnic, 1100 - 15th St E

Contact: Ken Pichula 306-765-1585, pashipping@saskpolytech.ca or Leslie Morin 306-765-1584, pashipping@saskpolytech.ca

S No Bid * 1-552 Scanner,  2014 ,Vidar GT68D,  42"w, no install CD but there is QR code and a manual, comes with USB cord, 
power cord included, operational.  Good

$150 GT67D6044L

REGINA, Agriculture, 226 - 3085 Albert St

Contact Jade Grad - Arndt 306-787-6566, jade.gradarndt@gov.sk.ca or Shawn Gibson 306-787-9768, shawn.gibson@gov.sk.ca

S 13.00 2-567 Cabinet,  rolling,  Four wheels, two sliding shelves, white, 27.5" w x 24" d x 32.5" h.  Fair $1

S 2.10 2-568 Chairs,  wood,  cushioned,  Side chair, red.  Fair $1

S 56.60 2-569 Projector Screen,  metal, large retractable ,  White, wall mounted, dimensions when screen is open, 99.5" w x 3" d 
x 102" h.  Excellent

$1

S 31.00 2-570 Toner,  HP 131A, Black,  New in box.  New- Unused $1

S 22.95 2-571 Toner,  HP 131A, Magenta,  New in box.  New- Unused $1

S 22.00 2-572 Toner,  HP 647A, Black,  New in box.  New- Unused $1

S 26.00 2-573 Toner,  HP 648A, Cyan,  New in box.  New- Unused $1

S 22.00 2-574 Toner,  HP 648A, Magenta,  New in box.  New- Unused $1

S 22.00 2-575 Toner,  HP 648A, Yellow,  New in box.  New- Unused $1
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REGINA, Environment, 3211 Albert St

Contact Mike Andersen 306-787-9127, mike.andersen@gov.sk.ca or Krista Campbell, krista.campbell@gov.sk.ca. For May 13 and 14 only, alternate will be Xin Xia at 306-787-8477.

S 425.00 2-554 Drone,  2015 DJI M100 drone, kit,  Complete kit, 3 batteries, includes Micasense Rededge 3 Multispectral camera, 
operational, deregistered, no camera cards, this drone exceeds 250 g in weight, please refer to the Transport 
Canada website for regulations.  Good

$200 M02DCG11010053

S 333.33 2-555 Drone,  Airframe 2015 DJI S1000,  8 prop airframe , carbon fiber airframe only, missing parts, no batteries, no 
remote, includes cube case, no registration, no camera. This drone exceeds 250 g in weight, please refer to the 
Transport Canada website for regulations.  Broken Repairable

$1 02Q0023874

S 801.00 2-556 Drone,  Inspire One , 2015 DJI, kit,  Complete kit, 2 batteries, remote, X3 camera, case, operational, deregistered, 
no camera card. This drone exceeds 250 g in weight, please refer to the Transport Canada website for regulations. 
Fair

$100 W13DCD21030948

S 251.00 2-557 Drone,  Phantom 3 Advanced, 2015 DJI,  1 battery, case, operational, deregistered, no camera card, this drone 
exceeds 250 g in weight, please refer to the Transport Canada website for regulations.  Poor

$1 P76DCI10016929

S 200.00 2-558 Drone,  Phantom 3, 2015 DJI, kit,  1 battery, case, operational,  deregistered, no camera card, this drone exceeds 
250 g in weight, please refer to the Transport Canada website for regulations.  Poor

$1 P76DCH10016581

S 333.33 2-559 Ronin M1 Gimble,  2015 DJI Ronin M1 3-Axis Gimble,  Complete kit, 1 battery, hard case, no camera, operational 
status unknown.  Good

$1 04H0010356

S 1,256.00 2-560 Velodyne LiDAR Kit,  2016 Velodyne AL3-32 LiDAR with IMU (KVH1725) and PC module, kit,  Complete system 
with mounting kit and Wi-Fi module, batteries, charger, cables, no longer supported by manufacturer. 
Operational.  Fair

$1,000 SN742415031 (LiDAR), 
SN1508K035 (IMU)

REGINA, Highways, 1100 - 1855 Victoria Ave

Contact Waneta Hardy 306-541-6150, waneta.hardy3@gov.sk.ca or Nolan Eberle 306-480-9736, nolan.eberle@gov.sk.ca

S 2.00 * 12-528 Chair,  5 caster, fabric, nightingale blue,  seat stained  Fair $1

S 3.26 2-516 Chair,  fabric,  5 castor, with arms, blue.  Fair $1

S No Bid 2-517 Chair,  fabric,  5 castor, with arms, brown.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 12-578 Chair,  faux leather,  5 caster, arms, black, arms torn, leather faded.  Poor $1

S 3.26 2-518 Chair,  metal,  No wheels, with arms, grey fabric.  Fair $1

S 1.00 2-519 Chair,  wood,  No wheels, with arms, brown fabric.  Poor $1

S 6.00 2-520 Chairs, Lot of 2 fabric,  5 castor, with arms, blue.  Fair $1

S No Bid 2-522 File Cabinet,  metal, lateral,  4 drawers, no keys, pepperdust, 36" w 19" d x 53" h.  Fair $1

S No Bid 2-521 File Cabinet,  metal, lateral,  4 drawers, no keys, pepperdust, 36.75" w x 30" d x 52.25" h.  Fair $1

S 12.80 2-523 File Cabinet,  metal, lateral,  5 drawer, no keys, light grey,  36" w x 20" d x 54" h.  Fair $1
S No Bid * 12-579 Keyboard Tray,  adjustable,  Black, mounts to desk.  Fair $1
S No Bid * 12-580 Keyboard Tray Attachment,  ,  Black.  Fair $1
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REGINA, Highways, 221 Winnipeg St N

Contact Waneta Hardy 306-541-6150, waneta.hardy3@gov.sk.ca or Nolan Eberle 306-480-9736, nolan.eberle@gov.sk.ca

S 175.00 2-537 Bookshelf, Lot of 2 metal, vertical,  5 shelves, 91.5"w x 15"d x 82"h, will need to be taken apart.  Fair $1

S 5.00 2-538 File Cabinet, Lot of 5 metal, vertical,  Pepperdust, 4 drawers, locks, 1 with key, 18.15"w x 26.5"d x 52"h.  Fair $1

S No Bid 2-539 File Cabinet, Lot of 5 metal, vertical, ,  5 drawers, pepperdust, locks, 2 with keys, 3 without keys, 38"w x 18"d x 
65.25"h.  Fair

$1

S No Bid 2-540 File Cabinet, Lot of 5 metal, vertical,  Pepperdust, 4 drawers, all with keys, 18.15"w x 26.5"d x 52"h .  Fair $1
S No Bid 2-541 File Cabinet, Lot of 5 metal, vertical,  Pepperdust, 4 drawers, no keys, 18.15"w x 26.5"d x 52"h.  Fair $1
S No Bid 2-542 File Cabinet, Lot of 5 metal, vertical,  Pepperdust, 4 drawers, no keys, 18.15"w x 26.5"d x 52"h.  Fair $1
S No Bid 2-543 File Divider Holder, Lot of 2 metal,  6 spots for files.  Fair $1

S No Bid 2-544 File Holder,  plastic ,  Adjustable, 3 spots for files.  Fair $1

S No Bid 2-545 File Holders, Lot of 2 metal,  3 spots for files.  Fair $1

S 1.00 2-546 Printing Calculator,  Sharp EL-2192R,  No rolls of paper included.  Fair $1

S 1.00 2-547 Printing Calculator, Lot of 2 Sharp EL-2615PIII,  No rolls of paper included.  Fair $1

S 1.01 2-548 Storage Box, Lot of 2 wood,  37.5"w x 14.5" d x 30"h.  Fair $1

REGINA, Highways, 7814 Hwy 6. South Service Rd. NE-36-16-20-W2

Contact Colt Haase 306-694-3710, colt.haase@gov.sk.ca or Mike Mallory 306-535-6820, mike.mallory@gov.sk.ca

S 1,500.00 2-576 Jersey Barrier, Lot of 6 concrete,  10' long, 24" wide at the bottom, 9" wide at the top and 32" tall, in good 
condition. Buyer will need to provide means of loading and transport for these jersey barriers. Each barrier 
weighs roughly 4000 lbs. The buyer is recommended to bring a small crane or an all-terrain forklift to load.  Good

$1

S 1,500.00 2-577 Jersey Barrier, Lot of 6 concrete,  10' long, 24" wide at the bottom, 9" wide at the top and 32" tall, in good 
condition. Buyer will need to provide means of loading and transport for these jersey barriers. Each barrier 
weighs roughly 4000 lbs. The buyer is recommended to bring a small crane or an all-terrain forklift to load.  Good

$1

S 1,500.00 2-578 Jersey Barrier, Lot of 6 concrete,  10' long, 24" wide at the bottom, 9" wide at the top and 32" tall, in good 
condition. Buyer will need to provide means of loading and transport for these jersey barriers. Each barrier 
weighs roughly 4000 lbs. The buyer is recommended to bring a small crane or an all-terrain forklift to load.  Good

$1

REGINA, Immigration and Career Training, 1000, 2103 - 11th Ave

Contact: Nickisha Robinson 306-787-5014, nickisha.robinson@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 12-532 Credenza,  metal,  With locking wheels and 2 keys for the doors, 48" w x 18" d x 29-1/2" h.  Excellent $100
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

REGINA, Innovation Saskatchewan, 200 - 10 Research Dr

Contact: Azmina Punjani 306-551-5106, azmina.punjani@innovationsask.ca or Nick Wilkes 306-539-9022, nick.wilkes@innovationsask.ca

S No Bid * 1-551 Desk,  Reception, wood,  Previously used reception desk has been professionally dismantled and is ready for 
transport, includes the main counter sections (a durable quartz countertop - 2-piece, piece 1- 8’7” l x 31” w x 1-
1/8” thick, piece2 – 7’7” l x 31” w x 1-1/8” thick, side panels, and internal shelving components, minimal wear and 
tear from previous use. This desk is being sold in its component pieces and will require reassembly. Assembly 
instructions are NOT included. Reassembly will require some technical skill and potentially additional tools and 
hardware.
Please carefully inspect the photos and consider arranging a viewing to assess the completeness and condition of 
all parts before bidding.
Due to the size and weight of the components, transporting this desk will require more than one person. The 
buyer will be responsible for arranging their own pickup and transportation of all desk components between 8:00 
am - 4:30 pm Mon-Fri. Innovation Saskatchewan will not be responsible for any transport or haul.  Good

$1,000

REGINA, Justice & Attorney General, 2425 Victoria Ave, Regina Kings Court Bench Courthouse

Contact: Brad Buehler 306-787-2068, brad.buehler@gov.sk.ca

S 14.00 * 1-539 Desk,  wood, glass countertop,  Right corner cutout, 60"w x 30"d x 30" h. *Online Viewing Only Good $1
S 5.01 * 1-545 Shelving Unit,  Glass panel countertop,  Brown,  96"w x 24.5"d x 31.5"h. *Online Viewing Only Good $1

REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 12252 Ewing Ave

Contact Al Kentz 306-787-4286, akentz@slga.com or Todd Leurer 306-510-4368, tleurer@slga.com

S No Bid * 9-623 Forklift 2005 TOYOTA 7FBEU15 E-Forklift Electric  signal lights, mirror, horn no charger, orange/black, , 23,2398 
hours, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Charger not included. No other known problems but no guarantees., As is, Where is

23,2398 
hours

$4,000 14,298

REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 2500 Victoria Ave

Contact: Kristen Nelson, 306-787-0179 knelson@slga.com or Tyrone Smith, tsmith1@slga.com

S 6.00 * 12-536 Chair,  fabric,  Blue 5 casters, adjustable arms & seat height, black armrest.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Fair

$5

S 7.50 * 12-545 Chair,  fabric,  Grey, 5 casters, adjustable arms & seat height, black armrest.
24 hours’ notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only.  Fair

$5

REGINA, Trade and Export Development, 300 - 2103 11th Ave

Contact: Hiren Khemani 306-787-8712, hiren.khemani@gov.sk.ca or Tosin Fatoyinbo, tosin.fatoyinbo2@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid 2-525 Chair,  cloth,  Brown, adjustable, 5 castor, no armrests.  Good $5

S No Bid 2-526 Chair,  cloth,  Grey, adjustable, 5 castor, one of the hand rests is damaged.  Fair $5

S 16.26 2-527 Chair,  mesh,  Black, one of the hand rests is damaged.  Fair $15

S No Bid 2-528 Credenza,  wood,  Pepperdust, 4 drawers, 2 doors, 72" w x 20" d x 28"  h.  Good $20

S No Bid 2-529 Desk,  laminate,   Beige, 72" w x 36" d x 28"h.  Good $15

S No Bid 2-530 File Cabinet,  metal, lateral,  Beige, 4 drawers, locks, no keys, 18" w x 28" d x 51" h.  Good $8
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S No Bid 2-531 File Cabinet,  metal, lateral,  Beige, 5 drawers, locks, no keys, 36" w x 18" d x 64" h.  Good $8

S 15.00 2-532 File Cabinet,  metal, lateral,  Beige, 5 drawers, locks, with keys, 36" w x 18" d x 64" h.  Good $10

S 17.80 2-533 Table,  wood top, metal legs,  Brown, 60" w x 30" d x 30" h.  Good $10

S No Bid 2-534 Table,  wood, round,  Brown, 60" diameter, 29" h.  Good $50

SASKATOON, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, 910 - 60th St E

Contact: Renee Pound, 306-956-8817, renee.pound@gov.sk.ca or Danielle Corriveau 306-956-8869, danielle.corriveau@gov.sk.ca

S 22.00 * 1-563 Medical Cart,  metal,  4 drawer, locking with keys, swivel casters, crack by wheel bracket.  31.5"w x 18.25"d x  
45.5"h, with handles.  Good

$1

S No Bid 2-549 Oven,  Bakers Pride Standex, metal,  Operational but all controls have been disabled and oven will only turn on to 
350 degrees F.  31"w x 25 1/8" tall x 26" deep (31" with handle). Part # 21859200(Oven 1)  Fair

$1 5,561,318,110,002

S No Bid 2-550 Oven,  Bakers Pride, metal,  Operational but all controls have been disabled and oven will only turn on to 350 
degrees F.  31"w x 25 1/8" tall x 26" deep(31" with handle). (Oven 2)  Fair

$1

S No Bid 2-551 Oven,  Bakers Pride, metal,  Operational but all controls have been disabled and oven will only turn on to 350 
degrees F.  31"w x 25 1/8" tall x 26" deep (31" with handle). (Oven 5)  Fair

$1

S No Bid 2-552 Oven,  Bakers Pride, metal,  Operational but all controls have been disabled and oven will only turn on to 350 
degrees F.  31"w x 25 1/8" tall x 26" deep (31" with handle). (Oven 6)  Fair

$1

S 8.00 2-553 Oven,  Bakers Pride, metal,  Operational but all controls have been disabled and oven will only turn on to 350 
degrees F. Door does not latch properly.  31"w x 25 1/8" tall x 26" deep (31" with handle). (Oven 8)  Fair

$1 N08J015

S No Bid 2-512 Desk,  particle board,  Brown desk, main part of desk, 71" w x 35 1/2" d x 28 1/2" h, other side, 23 1/2" w x 35" d 
x 28 1/2" h.  Fair

$1

S No Bid 2-513 Desk,  particle board,  Brown, two drawers, no locks, 45" w x 24" d x 29 1/2" h, some damage on side.  Fair $1

S No Bid 2-514 Desk Riser,  wood, metal,  34" long x width when extended 28 1/52".  Fair $1
S 2.00 2-515 File Cabinet,  metal, vertical,  Tan, 4 drawer locks with key, dented on front, 28" w x 18" d x  51" h.  Fair $1

SASKATOON, Saskatchewan Research Council, 820 51st St E

Contact: Roger Dauvin 306-385-4035, roger.dauvin@src.sk.ca or purchasing@src.sk.ca

S 156.00 2-501 Chainsaw,  Husqvarna,  28", comes with case, operational.  Good $1
S 495.95 2-502 Chainsaw,  Stihl,  28", comes with case, operational.  Good $1
S No Bid 2-503 Dehydrator,  Hungry Giant, HGF, RFQ 1920-011; 256532,  Put into use 2020, operational.  Good $20,000

S No Bid 2-504 Negative Air Machine,  Micro-Trap,  Hepa cabinet, operational but well-used  Fair $1

S No Bid 2-505 Negative Air Machine,  Micro-Trap,  Hepa cabinet, operational but well-used  Fair $1

S No Bid 2-506 Negative Air Machine,  Omnitec Omniaire 2000V Air Filtration System,  Hepa cabinet, comes with filters, 
operational.  Good

$500

S No Bid 2-507 Negative Air Machine,  Omnitec Omniaire 2000V Air Filtration System,  Hepa cabinet, comes with filters, 
operational.  Good

$500

S 107.00 2-508 Sprayer,  Chapin Industrial,  13.2 litre, new with components.  New- Unused $1
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S 18.00 2-509 Sprayer,  Chapin Sure Spray 27030,  New with components.  New- Unused $1

S 5,000.00 * 5-586 Storage Building,  Double Truss,  30'w x 80' d x 20' h, Coverall was partially erected. When assembling, the 
coverall blew over so the condition is fair, with some posts/components damaged after the fall. Material is on 

$5,000

SASKATOON, Water Security Agency,  10-3904 Millar Ave

Contact: Greg Holovach 306-631-1296, greg.holovach@wsask.ca or Lee Reinhart 306-230-3254, lee.reinhart@wsask.ca

S 19.81 * 12-523 Water Jar Mixer,  ,  4-place water jar mixer for trialing chemical dose with pipettes, operational.  Poor $10 93-4062

WEYBURN, Agriculture, 60A - 18th St NE

Contact: Sharon Ivan 306-848-2857, sharon.ivan@gov.sk.ca or Karen Hennig 306-848-2857, karen.hennig@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid 2-535 Dymo Tape,  ,  Various box.  Good $1

S No Bid 2-536 Projector Bulbs,  ,  Miscellaneous box.  Good $1
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