

SALE SUMMARY LIST

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-787-2238,
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.

WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.

No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number	
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles					
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.					
4,001.00	1-005	Car 2017 CHEVROLET Malibu Hybrid FWD 1.5L, inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/Bluetooth, power windows/locks/mirrors/left front seat, keyless entry-1 key fob this vehicle has a tire sealant/compressor kit, blue, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 243,316 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Coolant empty, oil/coolant from engine, rear bumper skin broke/sharp piece sticking out, wiper chattering. Heat exchanger leaking, coolant leaking into exhaust manifold-no parts, oil filter housing gasket leaking, timing cover leaking, trans cooler lines leaking, missing gas pedal pad. Grille scratches, hood chips/scratches, rear bumper broken, left front fender road rash, left and right rear fender inner fender loose, right front fender road rash/scratches, rocker panels road rash, left front door dents, roof scratches, trunk lid scratches, no spare tire/wheel wrench/jack/first aid/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is	243,316	\$2,153	1G1ZJ5SU2HF230562
6,100.00	1-006	SUV 2014 CHEVROLET Equinox LS AWD 2.4L, inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/Bluetooth, power mirrors/locks/windows/left front seat, keyless entry-2 key fobs 5 passenger, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 265,274 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Exhaust leaks, front/rear rotors, rear shocks, foggy head lamp. Grille lower broke, hood road rash/paint poor/scratches, both bumpers' chips/scratches, left rear fender chips/road rash/rust, right rear fender dent, tailgate dents/rust/paint poor, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, rear seat cushion stained, left front headlight fogged, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, where is	265,274	\$1,198	2GNFLEEK0E6229339

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
4,501.00 1-003	<p>Truck 2015 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 4WD, crew cab, 6'6" box 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power locks/windows/mirrors, keyless entry-2 keys, 2 fobs tow hooks, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, mud flaps, headache rack with beacon, box liner, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 309,264 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Front and rear pads/rotors, windshield, left plate light, right front marker, river seat.</p> <p>Shutter shift at speeds, hood hail, both bumpers' pitted/scratches, left side fenders road rash/scratches/dents, right rear fender dents/paint poor/dents, left rocker panel road rash, left side doors chips/paint poor, left front door sill worn, right front door rust inside bottom, right rear door paint poor, roof hail, tailgate chips/dents/scratches, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, left front seat worn/frame visible/sagging, interior soiled, head liner stained, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> , As is, where is</p>	309,264 km	\$1,504	3GCUKPEC3FG265233
6,001.00 1-001	<p>Truck 2015 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 4WD, crew cab, 6'6" box 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry-2 keys, 2 fobs grille inserts with wig wags, front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, headache rack with beacons & wig wags-condition unknown, box liner, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 313,460 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Both lower ball joints, right outer tie rod, rear pads/rotors, alignment with parts.</p> <p>Hood road rash/scratches, front bumper chips, rear bumper dents/scratches, left front fender road rash, left rear fender road rash/paint peeling/dents, right front fender road rash, right rear fender road rash/rust/scratches, rocker panels road rash, left rear door paint poor, right front door chips/rust inside bottom, right rear door paint poor, tailgate chips/scratches/dents, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat worn/ripped/sagging, seats soiled, paint poor both A-pillars, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> , As is, where is</p>	313,460 km	\$3,304	3GCUKPEC9FG456865

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
4,178.00 1-007	Truck 2008 FORD F350 SD 4WD, crew cab, 8' box 6.4L, V8, diesel auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power heated trailer mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-1 fob, 1 key, one tailgate key front tow hooks, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, trailer brakes, trailer tow mirrors, missing jump seat, box liner, dual rear wheels, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 330,451 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 4WD not engaging, oil change needed, engine oil leaks, SES illuminated, center high mount stop lamp inoperative, no rear mud flaps, two lamps inoperative on right side of box, driver's seat belt does not retract well, no hazard kit or extinguisher. Motor poor, grille broken, hood road rash, front bumper pitted, rear bumper rusted/bent, left front door road rash, left rear fender bent at tie down, right front fender road rash/rust, right rear fender scratches/missing inner liner, left front door rattle when closed, roof rust soft spots, tailgate missing left molding/aftermarket-condition unknown, no wheel wrench/jack/first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield left front trim loose, head liner modified, glove box broken, box floor bent/multiple holes, poor battery, minor exterior	330,451 km	\$1,178	1FTWW3DR9AEA01459
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous				
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.				
16.00 9-124	Antenna, Manufacture, PCTEL MWV1322HD, Vehicle roof top magnetic mount, 37.5" mast, 16' cable. Fair		\$15	
16.00 9-125	Antenna, Manufacture, PCTEL MWV1322HD, Vehicle roof top magnetic mount, 37.5" mast. 16' cable. Fair		\$15	
88.00 1-101	Handles, Lot of 15 metal, aluminum , 11.5" long. Good		\$60	
7.80 12-101	Safety Reflective Triangles, Lot of 2 James King, model 1005, plastic, Each side 17", florescent orange, collapsible. Fair		\$5	
7.80 12-102	Safety Reflective Triangles, Lot of 2 Strato-Flare 219, plastic, Each side 15 3/4 inches, florescent orange, collapsible, slightly damaged. Fair		\$1	
No Bid 11-102	Seat Cover, vinyl, Rear seat cover kit, split bench seat covers, 3 head rest covers. 1 center arm rest cover, includes S hooks for installation, removed from a 2015 Durango. Good		\$20	
No Bid 1-103	Tires, Set of 3 225/65R16, Firestone All Season, M+S, Manufacture date. Week 25, year 2022 Fair		\$240	

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid	1-105	Tires, Set of 3 235/65R17, Continental Crosscontact RX M+S, Manufacture date. Week 47, year 2020. Fair		\$60	
345.67	1-102	Tires, Set of 4 225/60R17, Goodyear Assurance Weather ready, Snow Flake, M+S, Manufacture date. Week 23, year 2023. Good		\$320	
345.67	1-104	Tires, Set of 4 225/65R16, Michelin X-Ice. Snow flake, M+S, Manufacture date. Week 35, year 2016 Good		\$320	
210.00	1-130	Tires, Set of 4 225/65R17, Firestone All Season, M+S, Manufacture date. Week 41, year 2020. Fair		\$120	
211.51	1-131	Tires, Set of 4 225/65R17, Yokohama Avid S33, M+S, Manufacture date. Week 06, year 2020. Good		\$160	
No Bid	9-140	Toolbox, Bruce Commercial class, Dual lid Gullwing crossover, Comes with a sliding tray, box is 70.5" l x 20" w x 18"h, mounts on box rails, 1 lid does not stay up, no keys. Fair		\$100	
300.00	1-132	Topper, aluminum, Raider brand, White, beacon, keys-tailgate only. 6 hold down clamps, 6'4" box length, from 2016 Ram 2500 crew cab, tailgate molding broke, left side shelf, damaged right front, rack bent. Poor		\$100	
No Bid	9-118	Keyboard Holder Mount, metal, 30"w x 11"d, bracket 17"w x 7"d, black. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	9-123	Painting, wood, Anne Geddes, 36"w x 12"d. Good		\$1	
No Bid	12-133	Printer, Desktop MFP, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro 400 MFP M425DN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	CND8G17924
No Bid	12-107	Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	CNBX401894
No Bid	12-116	Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	CNGY209007
No Bid	12-113	Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200TN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	USGNX53048
No Bid	12-117	Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200TN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	CNBX109336
No Bid	12-119	Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200TN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	CNBX403635

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
15.78 12-108	Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4350DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	CNGXD38700
7.78 12-110	Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4350TN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord include. Fair		\$1	CNRXL51878
7.78 12-118	Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4350TN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord include. Fair		\$1	CNRXG58387
No Bid 12-123	Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P4015X, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	CNDYC27273
7.78 12-124	Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P4015X, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	CNDYC35066
2.00 12-122	Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P4015X, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord include. Fair		\$1	CNDY833150
No Bid 12-131	Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M401dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	VNG3703421
52.55 1-106	Printer, Hewlett-Packard Color LaserJet M751dn MFP, large, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	JPBCM9J217
29.00 1-107	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise M605X, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair		\$1	CNDJC8L0BJ
51.00 1-108	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise M608X, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	CNBCLBS1T0
56.00 1-109	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise M652DN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	JPBCL260Y8
56.00 1-110	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise M652DN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	JPBCLB411J
42.00 1-111	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet M527F MFP, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	MXBCHCD09S
No Bid 1-112	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P4015X, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	CNDY118856
7.78 1-113	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P4015X, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	CNDY363115
52.55 1-114	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M227 FDN MFP, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	VNB3T04953

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
52.55 1-115	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M227 FDN MFP, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	VNG3J12400
52.55 1-116	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M227 FDN MFP, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	VNG3N12748
52.55 1-117	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M227 FDN MFP, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	VNG3N12751
52.55 1-118	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M227 FDN MFP, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), comes with start up guide/CD, some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	VNG3N12753
16.98 1-119	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M402dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	PHBQD78917
16.98 1-120	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M404dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	PHBB205000
40.00 1-121	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M428FDW MFP, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	MXBPND91CG
52.55 1-125	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M477FDN Color MFP, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair		\$1	VNBKLBQ5VR
43.00 1-122	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M477FDN Color MFP, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, install CD included, power cord included. Fair		\$1	VNBKL1KHY3
52.55 1-123	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M477FDN Color MFP, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	VNBKK9K4TZ
52.55 1-124	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M477FDN Color MFP, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	VNBKLBL23N
52.55 1-126	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M477FDN Color MFP, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	VNCKM1N548
52.55 1-127	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M479FDN Color MFP, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	CNCRP1DBZ2
52.55 1-128	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M479FDN Color MFP, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	MXBCM7H050
41.00 1-129	Printer, HP Colour LaserJet E55040dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair		\$1	JPBCQ5H0J3

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
BUFFALO POUND PROVINCIAL PARK, Corrections, Policing & Public Safety Buffalo Pound Provincial Park - Call for Directions				
Contact Dan Robinson 306-837-7555, dan.robinson@gov.sk.ca				
1,000.00	1-525 Snowmobile 2000 POLARIS Trail Touring 2 up - rear seat 550cc, 2 cycle, gas & oil mix belt driven/clutch , blue, , 8602.7 miles, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Difficult to start, battery dead, ripped/taped seat, crack at bottom of the windshield, motor/transmission/brakes/lights operational, paint fair.> , As is, where is	8602.7 miles	\$1	4XAST5BS2XC005180
CANDLE LAKE PROVINCIAL PARK, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, Candle Lake Field Office - Call for Directions				
Contact Bonnie Greene 306-929-8400, bonnie.greene@gov.sk.ca				
589.00	1-578 ATV 2010 POLARIS Sportsman 500 4x4 gas auto , red, , 4,500 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Missing ignition/tires, uses coolant, has not moved for 5 years. Motor/transmission/brakes unknown, tires poor, battery missing, missing side body panel, exhaust/paint good.> , As is, where is	4,500 km	\$50	4XAMH50A3BA043882
1,126.00	1-564 Snowmobile 2007 YAMAHA RS Venture gas , blue, , 13,300 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Not running - needs new starter, motor good, battery removed, poor condition.> , As is, where is	13,300 km	\$50	JYE8GR0037A000799
CONDIE NATURE RESERVE, Environment, RM of Sherwood, Call for Directions				
Contact Aaron Springinotic 306-230-2978, aaron.springinotic@gov.sk.ca or Travis Williams 306-527-6185, t				
928.28	1-565 Snowmobile 1997 SKANDIC Rotax 368cc, 2 cylinder, gas CVT , black/red, , 3,663 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Motor, brakes, battery, exhaust and lights all in unknown condition., As is, where is	3,663 km	\$1	124,000,382
GARDINER DAM, Water Security Agency, Call for Directions				
Contact Kimberly Kusch 306-860-7235, kimberly.kusch@wsask.ca or Craig Habermehl 306-631-7173, craig.				
No Bid	11-504 High Voltage Breaker, ABB 72 kV Type PMI dead tank breaker c/w bushing CTs, 72PMI31-30, 3000A 350kVBIL. Manufactured 2014. Collection of Purchase: the purchaser will need to line up a truck and crane to collect the infrastructure from WSA's property. WSA requires 10 business days notice of when the collection will occur to enable WSA to be on site to open the gate. The circuit breaker is located inside the compound fence (right at the fence line). The substation is currently de-energized. WSA will not provide any assistance other than opening locks. WSA will provide all documentation to the winning bidder. For any questions on these two items, please contact the contact person(s), listed. *ONLINE VIEWING ONLY Good		\$89,000	XAB14030-01

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid 11-505	High Voltage Transformer, Partner Technologies Incorporated (PTI) high voltage 3-phase transformer, ONAN/ONAF 65 deg C, 60 HZ c/w Power Ohm neutral ground resistor, 7.5 / 10 MVA, 72kV - 4.16kV, Delta - Wye configuration. Manufactured 2016. Collection of Purchase: the purchaser will need to line up a truck and crane to collect the infrastructure from WSA's property. WSA requires 10 business days notice of when the collection will occur to enable WSA to be on site to open the gate. The transformer is located outside of the fence, and inside construction fencing. The substation is currently de-energized. WSA will not provide any assistance other than opening locks. WSA will provide all documentation to the winning bidder. For any questions on these two items, please contact the contact person(s), listed. *ONLINE VIEWING ONLY Good		\$275,000	N15573-01
LA RONGE, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 800 Poirier St				
Contact Amelick Halkett 306-420-6833, amelick.halkett@gov.sk.ca or Jordan Ouellette 306-425-6606, jordan.ouellette@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid 11-521	Computer Monitor, E-Machines E200 HV, 20", works intermittently, could be loose connection. Poor		\$1	ETQ3Z0W0071330B1644321
MAPLE CREEK, Corrections, Policing & Public Safety, Hwy 21 Service Rd N				
Contact: Tyler Hansen 639-236-7132, tyler.hansen@gov.sk.ca or Michael Banks 639-932-7043, michael.banks@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid 1-566	Booster Cables, light duty, Black, operational. Fair		\$1	
No Bid 1-567	Booster Cables, light duty, Smaller set of clamps, operational. Fair		\$1	
No Bid 1-568	Booster Cables, medium duty, With heavier clamps, yellow and black, operational. Fair		\$1	
304.78 1-569	Ramps, aluminum, For truck box, custom folding system, super glide panels for loading snowmobile, operational. Fair		\$1	
No Bid 1-570	Ramps, steel, 2 piece, Ramp 94" l x 46" w x 2" h, frame 97" l x 49" w x 4" h, rusted, unknown if operational. Poor		\$1	
400.00 1-571	Utility Trailer, 1997, wood deck, metal sides, 4'w x 8"l, ball hookup, wood deck needs to be replaced, lights non-operational, portable lights not included, tires in poor condition, operational. Broken Repairable		\$1	SK400831168
MOOSE JAW, Agriculture, 45 Thatcher Drive E				
Contact: Shannon Friesen, 306-694-3412, shannon.friesen@gov.sk.ca or Nicole Fellner, 306-694-3899, nicole.fellner@gov.sk.ca.				
No Bid 12-513	Desk, Cubicle, L Shaped, 133" l x 23" w x 30" h, with adjustable keyboard tray, cosmetic damage and stains. The attached picture of the assembled desk is a similar unit. The surplus		\$1	
No Bid 12-560	Table, rectangular, Grey, 48" l x 30" w x 29.5" h, cosmetic damage. Fair		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid 12-561	Table, round, Grey, 48" dia. x 29.5" h, cosmetic damage. Fair		\$1	
MOOSE JAW, Highways, 1 km. South of Moose Jaw on Hwy. #2				
Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca				
220.99 1-522	Hoist, Coffing, JF1016.1, electric, Year unknown, 1000 lbs capacity, operational. Fair		\$10	JFD75H431T
22.00 1-523	Air Compressor, Fini Biscout, Year unknown, 4.2 gallon, 125 psi, operational. Fair		\$20	125,096
175.00 1-524	Seat, 114SD, Removed from 2024 Freightliner, new condition. Good		\$100	
No Bid 1-550	Reciprocating Saw , Makita, JR3020, Operational, no blades included, blade lock mechanism not holding. Poor		\$1	692,239
230.30 1-572	Roll Rite Covering , Lot of 2 Part # 10122, 1 is brand new, the other is slightly used, used to roll tarps over a truck box, operational Good		\$10	12,963
11.00 1-573	Triangle Flare Kit , Lot of 5 Grote, 3 per box, operational New- Unused		\$10	
7.00 1-574	Universal Hitch Receiver, Buyers 1804060, Class 2, operational New- Unused		\$1	
NARROW HILLS PROVINCIAL PARK, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 75 km. N. of Smeaton on Hwy. 10				
Contact Eric Pulvermacher 306-426-2610, eric.pulvermacher@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid 1-547	Camera, Fuji Finepix, Digital, A33 , SD cards have been removed, no memory, missing charging cord and data transfer cables, takes AA batteries, operational. Good		\$1	4CB39929
No Bid 1-548	Camera, Fujifilm 2600 Zoom, Digital, SD cards have been removed, no memory, missing charging cord and data transfer cables, takes AA batteries, operational. Good		\$1	21A01308
1,599.98 1-549	Trailer, , Requires new wiring, tires poor and flat but is still in towable condition otherwise, plastic water tank, no holes, foam generator operational. This trailer has never been registered through SGI and, as such, has never had a license plate affixed to it. SGI may have to generate and supply a new VIN number to this trailer, so contact with SGI could be necessary if you want to plate this trailer and have it legal to drive on roadways. Poor		\$10	SK#0892 FTT009
NIPAWIN, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 711 Nipawin Rd E				
Contact Brant Slater 306-862-1790 or 306-812-8345. brant.slater@gov.sk.ca				
67.58 1-501	Air Compressor, Air-o-Matic, Comes with cord and hose, pump starts, weld broken, can be rewelded. Broken Repairable		\$1	0358-247467
2,703.33 1-575	ATV, 2008 YAMAHAKodiak 450 4x4, 421cc, 4-stroke, gas auto toolbox and winch (operational) green 5,553 km KNOWN PROBLEMS: Motor/transmission/tires/battery/exhaust	5,553 km	\$100	5YAJ26W08A301020

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
18.00 1-502	ATV Helmet, BRP, XXL, with visor. Good		\$1	
111.77 1-503	Beaver Trap, Suit case, Ezee Set Ezee Catch, Rusty, does not operate properly, can be repaired. Broken Repairable		\$1	
19.00 1-504	Centre Console Seat, , From a 2010, Ford F-250 Supercab, with head rest. Good		\$1	
20.99 1-505	Centre Console Seat, , From a 2015 Dodge Ram 2500, with head rest. Good		\$1	
19.00 1-506	Chainsaw, Remington, electric, EL-1, Double insulated, operational. Fair		\$1	5,212
15.00 1-507	Chest Waders, Bushlite, Outdoor, Size 10, has a leak. Broken Repairable		\$1	
1.00 1-508	Drill, Sears Craftsman, variable speed, 3/8", reversable, operational. Fair		\$1	
No Bid 1-509	Drill, SKIL, variable speed, 3/8", 120 volts, 0-2500 R.P.M, missing cord, unknown if operational. Beyond Repair		\$1	6225 T2
No Bid 1-510	Flashlight, Energizer, TUF4C1, Unknown if operational. Fair		\$1	
2.00 1-511	Flashlights, Lot of 2 Mag-lite, One tall flashlight and one smaller flashlight, unknown if operational. Fair		\$1	Tall - Serial # D4004435986 Shorter - Serial # 34733000
No Bid 1-512	Front Grille, Plastic, Unknown what vehicle this was removed from. Good		\$1	
No Bid 1-513	GPS, Eagle AccuNav, with case, Turns on, picks up satellites, does not hold a charge, no charging cable with it, rechargeable. Fair		\$1	6,121,540
21.00 1-514	Gun Case, Woodstream, Hard plastic. Good		\$1	
13.00 1-515	Hammer Drill, Black and Decker, 3/8", 120 volts, operational. Fair		\$1	7928-04
1.00 1-516	Jig Saw, SKIL - 4960 T2, 2 speed, 115 volts, SPM 2800, operational. Fair		\$1	
No Bid 1-517	Keyboard Desk Mounts, Lot of 2, One comes with a circular mouse holder, second comes		\$1	
No Bid 1-518	Molding, Lot of 2 Plastic, For truck. Good		\$1	
325.00 12-514	Outboard Motor, 2015 Mercury 150 HP propeller, gas black unknown km KNOWN PROBLEMS: Counter balance shaft bearing failed and the shaft wrecked the block along with the metal that went through it, it needs a complete power head, does not have a propeller, missing spark plug wires, leg is in good condition, comes with moving pallet. As is, Where is	unknown km	\$1	2B144626
20.99 1-519	Snare, Power Ram, Rusty, operational. Fair		\$1	
19.00 1-520	Snowmobile Helmet, Zox, Large, heated visor, lifting face shield. Good		\$1	
No Bid 1-521	Under Seat Ventilation, , Plastic. Good		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
NIPAWIN, Water Security Agency, 300 Timber Dr				
Contact Amanda Wallington 306-862-1750, amanda.wallington@wsask.ca or Sheldon Ofukany 306-862-75				
No Bid	11-507	File Cabinet, Metal, lateral, 4 drawer, 36" w x 18"d x 56"h, beige. Fair	\$5	
No Bid	11-508	File Cabinet, Metal, lateral, 5 drawer, 36"w x 18"d x 65"h, grey, does not have keys. Fair	\$10	
5.00	11-510	File Cabinet, Metal, vertical, 4 drawer, 18"w x 28"d x 51"h, beige, does not have keys. Fair	\$5	
5.00	11-512	File Cabinet, Metal, vertical, 4 drawer, 18"w x 28"d x 51"h, beige, no lock, does not have keys. Fair	\$5	
No Bid	11-520	File Cabinet, Metal, vertical, 4 drawer, 18"w x 28"d x 51"h, beige. Fair	\$5	
PRINCE ALBERT, Corrections, Policing & Public Safety, Prince Albert Correctional Centre, 3021 1st Avenue W				
Contact: Graham Toporowski graham.toporowski@gov.sk.ca or Richard LaClaire, richard.laclaire@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid	12-515	Dishwasher, General Electric, model GBP655SSPSS, Leaking from the motor onto the floor, motor needs to be replaced, non-operational. Broken Repairable	\$1	HT801459C
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Polytechnic, 1100 - 15th St E				
Contact: Ken Pichula 306-765-1585, pashipping@saskpolytech.ca or Leslie Morin 306-765-1584, pashipping@saskpolytech.ca				
No Bid	1-552	Scanner, 2014 ,Vidar GT68D, 42"w, no install CD but there is QR code and a manual, comes with USB cord, power cord included, operational. Good	\$150	GT67D6044L
REGINA, Highways, 1100 1855 Victoria Ave				
Contact Waneta Hardy 306-541-6150, waneta.hardy3@gov.sk.ca or Nolan Eberle 306-541-6150, nolan.eberle@gov.sk.ca				
1.08	12-526	Chair, 5 caster, wheeled, fabric, black, , scuffs on arms Fair	\$1	
No Bid	12-528	Chair, 5 caster, fabric, nightingale blue, seat stained Fair	\$1	
No Bid	12-578	Chair, faux leather, 5 caster, arms, black, arms torn, leather faded. Poor	\$1	
No Bid	12-579	Keyboard Tray, adjustable, Black, mounts to desk. Fair	\$1	
No Bid	12-580	Keyboard Tray Attachment Black. , , , , , Fair	\$1	
REGINA, Environment, Fish and Wildlife Branch, 4th Floor, 3211 Albert St				
Contact: Erin Swerdfeger, 306-539-8402, erin.swerdfeger@gov.sk.ca or Tehlu Singh, 306-510-5824, tehlu.singh@gov.sk.ca				
1.23	12-508	Camera, Approx. 2010, Ricoh, G700SE, Waterproof, memory card has been removed, wiped, operational. Poor	\$1	3,100,264

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
REGINA, Immigration and Career Training, 1000, 2103 - 11th Ave				
Contact: Verna Ziegler 787-2580, verna.ziegler@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid	12-532	Credenza, metal, With locking wheels and 2 keys for the doors, 48" w x 18" d x 29-1/2" h. Excellent		\$100
115.00	12-533	Stand, oak, 16"w x 16" d x 30-1/2" h. Poor		\$25
120.00	12-534	Table, oak, 36" w x 24" d x 30" h. Good		\$100
REGINA, Innovation Saskatchewan, 200- 10 Research Dr				
Contact: Azmina Punjani 306-551-5106, azmina.punjani@innovationsask.ca or Nick Wilkes 306-539-9022, nick.wilkes@				
No Bid	1-551	Desk, Reception, wood, Previously used reception desk has been professionally dismantled and is ready for transport, includes the main counter sections (a durable quartz countertop -		\$1,000
REGINA, Justice & Attorney General, 515 Henderson Dr				
Contact: Brad Buehler 306-787-2068, brad.buehler@gov.sk.ca				
76.66	1-527	Cabinet, wood, Double door, Brown, 37" l x 13.5" w x 52" h. *Online Viewing Only Fair		\$1
66.66	1-528	Cabinet, Lot of 2 wood, 2 drawer, brown, 37" l x 22" w x 36" h. *Online Viewing Only Fair		\$1
25.00	1-529	Chair, Swivel, Purple, 5 caster, 19" l x 26" w x 36.5" h. *Online Viewing Only Fair		\$1
17.00	1-530	Chair, Wingback, Blue and yellow, 28" l x 33" w x 40"h. *Online Viewing Only Good		\$1
1.08	1-531	Chair, wood, Brown, with black seat cushion : 17" l x 18" w x 35" h. *Online Viewing Only Good		\$1
1.08	1-532	Chair, , 4 caster, no arms. 20"l x 21" w x 35.5"h. *Online Viewing Only Good		\$1
15.79	1-533	Chair, , Tan, 5 caster, 20" l x 23" w x 35"h. *Online Viewing Only Good		\$1
36.06	1-534	Chairs, Lot of 5 , Tan, 5 caster, 20" l x 23" w x 35"h. *Online Viewing Only Broken Repairable		\$1
15.00	1-535	Desk, Glass panel countertop, Brown, 6 drawer, 72" l x 36" w x 31" h, no locks. *Online Viewing Only Fair		\$1
31.67	1-536	Desk, wood, Brown with 6 drawers, 72" l x 35" w x 30" h, no locks. *Online Viewing Only Good		\$1
2.00	1-537	Desk, wood, Brown, 4 drawer, bottom right drawer locked, no key, 72" l x 24" w x 30.5" h. *Online Viewing Only Fair		\$1

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
1.08 1-538	Desk, wood, Brown, with wheels, 40" l x 29.5" w x 26"h. *Online Viewing Only Good		\$1	
No Bid 1-539	Desk, wood, glass countertop, Right corner cutout, 60" l x 30" w x 30" h. *Online Viewing Only Good		\$1	
2.18 1-540	Desks, Lot of 2 wooden , With lights, brown, 49" l x 25" w x 60" h, T-12 4-foot florescent tubes, unknown if operational. *Online Viewing Only Good		\$1	
20.00 1-541	File Cabinet, Lateral, 3 drawer, 36" l x 18" w x 39"h, locks, no keys. *Online Viewing Only Good		\$1	
27.00 1-542	File Cabinet, Lateral, metal, 4 drawer, 36" l x 18" w x 51" h, locks with key. *Online Viewing Only Fair		\$1	
22.00 1-543	File Cabinet, Lot of 2 Vertical, metal, 2 drawer, 18" l x 28" w x 28" h, no keys. *Online Viewing Only Fair		\$1	
25.00 1-544	File Cabinets, Lot of 4 Vertical, Grey, 5 drawer, 28" l x 17" w x 63" h, two have keys, two are locked with no keys. *Online Viewing Only Good		\$1	
55.66 1-545	Shelving Unit, Glass panel countertop, Brown, 96" l x 24.5" w x 31.5"h. *Online Viewing Only Good		\$1	
1.08 1-546	Table, Wood, Brown, 67" l x 32" w x 30.5" h. *Online Viewing Only Fair		\$1	
REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 12252 Ewing Ave				
Contact Al Kentz 306-787-4286, akentz@slga.com or Todd Leurer 306-510-4368, tleurer@slga.com				
No Bid 9-623	Forklift 2005 TOYOTA 7FBEU15 E-Forklift Electric signal lights, mirror, horn no charger, orange/black, , 23,2398 hours, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Charger not included. No other known	23,2398 hours	\$9,000	14,298
REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 2500 Victoria Ave				
Contact: Kristen Nelson, 306-787-0179 knelson@slga.com or Tyrone Smith, tsmith1@slga.com				
No Bid 12-536	Chair, fabric, Blue 5 casters, adjustable arms & seat height, black armrest. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Fair		\$5	
No Bid 12-545	Chair, fabric, Grey, 5 casters, adjustable arms & seat height, black armrest. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Fair		\$5	
29.00 12-557	Chairs, Lot of 4 fabric, Red, 5 casters, adjustable seat height, black armrest. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Fair		\$20	
29.00 12-559	Chairs, Lot of 4 fabric, Red, 5 casters, adjustable seat height, black armrest. 24 hours' notice for pick-up required, Online viewing only. Fair		\$20	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
SASKATOON, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, 910 - 60th St E				
Contact: Renee Pound, 306-956-8817, renee.pound@gov.sk.ca or Danielle Corriveau 306-956-8869, danielle.corriveau@gov.sk.ca				
77.77	1-553	Masks, Lot of 3 3M, 1870+, N95, Manufactured 09/10/2021, expire 09/10/2026, 3 boxes which contain 440 per each box, 1320 in total. New- Unused		\$1
25.55	1-554	Masks, Lot of 3 3M, 1870+, N95, Manufactured 09/10/2021, expire 09/10/2026, 3 boxes which contain 440 per each box, 1320 in total. New- Unused		\$1
107.77	1-555	Masks, Lot of 4 3M, 1870+, N95, Manufactured 09/10/2021, expire 09/10/2026, 4 boxes which contain 440 per each box, 1760 in total. New- Unused		\$1
33.33	1-556	Masks, Lot of 4 3M, 1870+, N95, Manufactured 09/10/2021, expire 09/10/2026, 4 boxes which contain 440 per each box, 1760 in total. New- Unused		\$1
350.00	1-557	Masks, Lot of 24 3M, 8210, N95, Manufactured 2021 and 2022, expire 2026 and 2027, 24 boxes which contain 8 boxes of 20, 3840 in total. New- Unused		\$1
498.90	1-558	Masks, Lot of 24 3M, 8210, N95, Manufactured 2021 and 2022, expire 2026 and 2027, 24 boxes which contain 8 boxes of 20, 3840 in total. New- Unused		\$1
212.22	1-559	Masks, Lot of 24 3M, 8210, N95, Manufactured 2021 and 2022, expire 2026 and 2027, 24 boxes which contain 8 boxes of 20, 3840 in total. New- Unused		\$1
101.11	1-560	Masks, Lot of 24 3M, 8210, N95, Manufactured 2021 and 2022, expire 2026 and 2027, 24 boxes which contain 8 boxes of 20, 3840 in total. New- Unused		\$1
200.00	1-561	Masks, Lot of 24 3M, 8210, N95, Manufactured 2021 and 2022, expire 2026 and 2027, 24 boxes which contain 8 boxes of 20, 3840 in total. New- Unused		\$1
200.00	1-562	Masks, Lot of 24 3M, 8210, N95, Manufactured 2021 and 2022, expire 2026 and 2027, 24 boxes which contain 8 boxes of 20, 3840 in total. New- Unused		\$1
52.22	1-563	Medical Cart, metal, 4 drawer, locking with keys, swivel casters, crack by wheel bracket. 31.5"w x 18.25"d x 45.5"h, with handles. Good		\$1
SASKATOON, Water Security Agency, 10-3904 Millar Ave				
Contact: Greg Holovach 306-631-1296, greg.holovach@wsask.ca or Lee Reinhart 306-230-3254, lee.reinhart@wsask.ca				
No Bid	12-523	Water Jar Mixer, , 4-place water jar mixer for trialing chemical dose with pipettes, operational. Poor		\$10 93-4062

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
SASKATOON, Western Canada Lottery Corporation, 1914 1st Ave N				
Contact David Tutka 306-933-6926 or 306-230-0905, tutkad@sk-wclc.com.				
5,201.99	1-576	Van 2019 DODGE Grand Caravan SE 2WD 3.6L, V6 6 speed auto A/C, tilt, cruise, power windows/steering/liftgate cargo barrier, GVW 2745KG, single axle, wheel base 3078mm, standard differential, Sngle tire 225/65/17, tire ply 4, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 288,830 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Motor/transmission/exhaust/windshield wipers & washers/lights/mirrors/horn good, tires/brakes/battery/body exterior/paint/interior fair.>, As is, where is	288,830 km	\$1 2C4RDGBG5KR737413
WEYBURN, Highways, Old Weyburn Highways Yard - Call for Directions				
Contact Joe Zerr 306-530-0847, joseph.zerr@gov.sk.ca				
9,111.00	1-577	Trailer 2002 MAJESTIC TRAILERS TD220 Tandem tailer with ramps GVW 20 ton, pintle hitch, tandem axle, 8'6" wide x 36' long, 7 round pin connection, pintle hitch is rated at 110,000lbs, dual tire, tire size 11R22.5, yellow, , , , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Trailer has holes in cross members due to rust, has a good deck on it, paint is nice, tires are fair\good, brakes/body exterior good., As is, where is		\$500 2M9FSB2T82R151567
11,111.00	1-579	Trailer 2009 Trailtech TD320 Has holes in cross members and deformation due to water and rust, will require SGI inspection to be licensed, has a good deck on it, paint is faded, tires are fair\good, tri axle, ramps, 4" pintle hook rated at 110,000 lbs, 8'6" wide by 34" long, 7 pin round connection, lights unknown if operational, dual tire, tire size 11R22.5, 14 ply., , , , , As is, where is		\$1 2CU4LLVSX92027416
YORKTON, SaskBuilds and Procurement, White spruce NE-35-TP26-R5-W2nd				
Contact: Mark Bigoraj 306-786-5871, mark.bigoraj@gov.sk.ca				
*WD	1-526	Fence , Chain link, metal, 300 feet, with poles and gates, concrete intact on some poles, could be heavy. Fair		\$1