
SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #10
From Jan 8 to Jan 15, 2025

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

SALE SUMMARY LIST

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as 
described.  Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding.  
Vehicles and equipment are sold “AS IS, WHERE IS”, there is no implied or express warranty. 

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.
     - Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
     - SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.
It is the Bidder’s responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.
Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.
Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways: 
     - by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
     - by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-787-2238,
     - by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
     - by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1.
  (If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)
- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer)     This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry. 
WD = (Withdrawn)               This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller. 
No Bid =                                  Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

1/15/2025,2:18 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  1



SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #10
From Jan 8 to Jan 15, 2025

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.

S 5,365.55 10-001 Car 2008 CHRYSLER Sebring Touring FWD 2.7L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 
player, power heated mirrors/locks/windows/trunk release, driving lights, keyless entry-2 key 
fobs , silver, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer 
must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be 
licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This 
vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 141,987 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and 
OBSERVATIONS: Rear pads/rotors, both rear trailing arm bushing.
Hood scratches/paint peeling/dents, rear bumper scratches, left front fender scratches/chips, 
left rear fender rust, left side doors rust at bottom, right front door rust, right rear door rust 
inside bottom, roof hail/paint stain, trunk lid hail, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield 
chips, left mirror paint peeling, both roof rails hail, head liner at rear hanging down, poor 
battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

141,987 
km

$1,467 1C3LC56R18N230463

*WD *WD * 9-015 Truck 2018 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 4WD, crew cab, 6'6" box 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, 
cruise, AM/FM, power mirrors/windows/locks, keyless entry-2 fobs, 2 keys front wigwags non-
operational, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, box liner, has a 
rear seat, black, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY 
Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to 
be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  
This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 328,914 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and 
OBSERVATIONS: Transmission issues/failure (pan full of debris), left lower ball joint, 
windshield cracked, dents on body and fenders.
Hood chips/scratches, front bumper chips/scratches, rear bumper dents, left side fenders 
road rash/scratches/dents, right side fenders road rash/dents/rust, left side doors road 
rash/scratches, left front door sill area worn, right side doors road rash/scratches/dents, roof 
dents/scratches, tailgate road rash/scratches, wheel wrench/jack loose under back seat, no 
first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, left front seat sagging, hole drilled in front 
hump, over head console loose, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

328,914 
km

$3,423 3GCUKNEC1JG155939
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S 6,565.55 * 9-016 Truck 2008 CHEVROLET Silverado 2500 HD 4WD, extended cab, 8' box 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, 
tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power locks, 2 keys Brand FX slide topper with roll out, side steps, mud 
flaps, front tow hooks, hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, white, TOW ONLY, This 
vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the 
purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes 
full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, 
where is” condition., 193,670 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Left and right 
upper ball joints loose, left and right inner tie rods loose, rear rotors rusty, both head lights 
hazy/fogged, rear seat and seat belts missing (bolts have been cut off for mounting a seat).
Hood dents/rust/stone chips, front bumper dented, left front fender rust, left rear fender 
road rash, right side fenders rusted, left rear door rust, roof rust spots/dents, 2 holes in roof 
sealed, OEM tailgate missing, wheel wrench/jack loose in back, no first aid kit/fire 
extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat worn/hole, sealed holes in roof of topper and 
hair line cracks-no keys-condition fair, holes drilled in rear seat floor board, poor battery, 
minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

193,670 
km

$6,565 1GCHK29K38E210569

S No Bid 10-004 Truck 2018 CHEVROLET Silverado 2500 HD 4WD, double cab, 8' box 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, 
tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power mirrors/locks/windows, trailer tow mirrors, keyless entry-1 fob, 1 
key box liner, headache rack, tow hooks, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, 
gray, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be 
signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. 
Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is 
sold in “As is, where is” condition., 255,530 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: 
Check engine light on codes: P0420 Cat low, P0340 Cat low, P0056 02 sensor, P0119 FCT, 
P0313 02 sensor, P0137/P0151/P0153, cwss04, C0045:04, C0050:04 Spud. Both outer tie 
rods, right inner tie rod, Pitman arm, alignment needed, ABS light on, front and rear shocks, 
park brake cable, right back up light, right taillight assembly.
Transmission harsh shift/burnt oil not repaired grille broke hood dents front bumper

255,530 
km

$5,836 1GC2KUEG9JZ259356
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S 4,499.99 10-007 Truck 2015 DODGE Ram 2500 4WD, crew cab, 6'6" box 5.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 
AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs grille inserts, 
tow hooks, mud flaps, side steps, trailer hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, box liner, 
headache rack with beacon, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A 
TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI 
Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required 
inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 310,737 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Traction light on, codes: U1449(ERS) implausible/P0579-00 
speed control/P0593-00/P0581-00, left upper ball joint, right lower ball joint, alignment 
needed.
Hood chips/dents/hail, front bumper pitted, rear bumper rusted, left side fenders road rash, 
left rear fender dents, right rear fender road rash/dents/scratches, rocker panels road 
rash/rusted, roof hail, wheel wrench/jack loose under back seat, no first aid kit/fire 
extinguisher, windshield chips, seat and seat back has recently new (front seat covers) 
condition of front seats unknown, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

310,737 
km

$2,993 3C6TR5CT2FG594382

S 7,352.95 * 9-051 Truck 2017 FORD F250 SD 4WD, crew cab, 6'10" box 6.2L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 
AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power windows/locks, keyless entry-2 key fobs wig wags on 
grille-condition unknown, tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, box liner, hitch, trailer wiring, 
OEM trailer brakes, headache rack with beacon and arrow board not connected at switch 
condition unknown, has back seat, blue, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  
A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI 
Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required 
inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 312,692 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: No power on acceleration (codes: U3013-08 input power C, 
U0401:02-08 invalid data, U0401:008A invalid data rec mod. A), ABS light on.
Grille cracked, hood road rash, front bumper bent, rear bumper rusted, left rear fender 
scratches, right side fenders dents/scratches, tailgate dents/scratches, no first aid kit/fire 
extinguishers, windshield chips, left front seat cushion sagging, hole in center arm rest, poor 
battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

312,692 
km

$5,249 1FT7W2B64HEE88037
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S No Bid 10-005 Truck 2012 FORD F550 4WD, Brand FX service body 6.8L, V10, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 
AM/FM/CD player, 2 OEM keys, 2 other keys tow hooks, trailer tow mirrors, OEM trailer 
brakes, trailer tow brakes, power invertor condition unknown, Brand FX service body with 
Honda EM 3000 generator and Warwick aerial ladder, condition of service body fair, 
condition of aerial ladder/generator unknown, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED 
SGI Inspection.  A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle 
requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for 
repairs and any required inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 
217,835 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Right upper/lower ball joints loose.
Grille broke/bug screen, hood dents, front bumper rusted/pitted, right rocker rust, left front 
door rust at bottom, left rear door rust at bottom inside and out/dents/holes drilled in inside 
panel, right rear door holes drilled inside panel/rust at bottom, wheel wrench/jack loose in 
back seat, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield small chips, left front seat worn/foam 
visible/sagging, seat back left front worn, left cab corner some rust, poor battery, minor 
exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

217,835 
km

$16,114 1FD0X5HY0CEB01609

S No Bid * 9-021 Truck 2012 FORD F550 4WD, extended cab, FX service body 6.8L, V10, gas auto A/C, tilt, 
cruise, AM/FM/CD player, trailer tow mirrors, 2 keys storage unit on left side of service body, 
Warwick ladder-condition unknown, HD rear bumper, pintle hook, trailer wiring, OEM trailer 
brake, front tow hooks, dual rear wheels, Brand FX service body 6 compartments condition-
fair, has back seat and belts, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection.  A 
TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI 
Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required 
inspections.  This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 200,572 km, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS and OBSERVATIONS: Park brake non-operational, rear brake pads at 2mm, rear 
rotors rusted, power assist for brakes not working properly, high mount brake light, left 
running board falling off.
Grille broke, hood hail, front bumper rusted/pitted, left side doors rust/chips, roof 
dents/rust, spare tire in box, wheel wrench/jack under back seat, no first aid kit/fire 
extinguisher, windshield small chips, left front seat worn/sagging/hole, left cab corner 
surface rust, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

200,572 
km

$19,253 1FD0X5HY0CEA94239
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REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.

S No Bid * 9-124 Antenna,  Manufacture, PCTEL MWV1322HD,  Vehicle roof top magnetic mount, 37.5" mast, 
16' cable.  Fair

$15

S No Bid * 9-125 Antenna,  Manufacture, PCTEL MWV1322HD,  Vehicle roof top magnetic mount, 37.5" mast. 
16' cable.  Fair

$15

S 6.02 * 3-124 Seat,  2014, Dodge Ram 4500,  Rear, parts, winter grille cover included, grey.  Excellent $1

S 6.02 * 3-127 Seat,  2015, Dodge Ram 2500,  Rear, grey.  Excellent $1

S 6.02 * 3-130 Seat,  2016, Chevrolet Suburban,  Rear, black.  Excellent $1

S 6.02 * 3-131 Seat,  2016, Dodge Ram 3500,  Rear, grey.  Excellent $1

S 15.45 * 3-133 Seat,  2018, Chevrolet Suburban ,  Rear, black.  Excellent $1

S 126.00 * 9-147 Tires, Set of 4 225/60R16, Firestone All Season, M+S,  Manufacture date week 25, year 2020.  
Fair

$120

S No Bid * 9-148 Tires, Set of 4 235/65R17, Continental Cross Contact RX, M+S,  Manufacture date week 47, 
year 2020.  Fair

$120

S No Bid * 9-140 Toolbox,  Bruce Commercial class, Dual lid Gullwing crossover,  Comes with a sliding tray, box 
is 70.5” l x 20” w x 18”h, mounts on box rails, 1 lid does not stay up, no keys.  Fair

$100

S No Bid * 9-136 Topper,  ARE brand, Commercial truck cap,  Truck box length 81.9”, side toolboxes. 7‘l, 5 ft 1” 
wide, has hold down clamps, has roof rack, some scratches, no keys, removed from 2018 
F250.  Good

$700 AAREN3496383

S No Bid * 9-108 Chair,  leather,  5 castor, dual arm, adjustable height, white, arm rests are cracked.  Fair $1

S 11.00 * 9-112 Desk,  wood,  brown, 64"w x 36"d x 29"h, R-side return 48"w x 20"d x 29"h.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 9-116 File Cabinet,  wood top, metal body,  142"w x 4"d x 36"h,  2 shelves, 2 sliding doors  Fair $1

1/15/2025,2:18 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  6
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S No Bid * 9-118 Keyboard Holder Mount,  metal,  30"w x 11"d, bracket 17"w x 7"d, black.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 9-122 Misc. Office Supplies,  ,  2 filing systems, pen caddy, 6 (lot of 2) book ends, 6 key boards, 2 
head sets, 4 wireless one ear head set, forearm keyboard rest, ethernet/aux cables, 8 power 
supplies.  Fair

$1

S No Bid * 9-123 Painting,  wood, Anne Geddes,  36"w x 12"d.  Good $1

S 3.00 10-101 Table,  Boardroom, wood,  142"w x 40"d x 30.5"h, brown, screws included. Non-operational 
due to disassembly of table top.  Good

$1

S 26.13 10-102 Table,  Conference, wood,  192"w x 42"d x 42"h, brown, screws included. Non-operational 
due to disassembly of table top.  Good

$1

S 5.02 10-103 Table,  Conference, wood,  192"w x 42"d x 42"h, brown, screws included. Non-operational 
due to disassembly of table top.  Good

$1

THE BATTLEFORDS PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks Culture and Sport, The Battlefords Provincial Park, Call for Directions

Contact Charlize Bonifacio 306-386-2212, charlize.bonifacio@gov.sk.ca

S 321.00 10-501 Car 2001 CHEVROLET Cavalier 2WD 2.2L, inline 4, gas auto air, tilt, cruise , blue, TOW ONLY, 
NO SGI Inspection.  It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a 
passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 
, 283,521 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: May need a new head gasket, hood and roof paint 
spotted, wearing off, motor, transmission, tires, brakes, battery and exhaust all in unknown 
condition.>, As is, Where is

283,521 
km

$100 1G1JC524X17347409

S 666.58 10-502 Van 2008 CHEVROLET Uplander 2WD 3.9L, V6, gas auto air, tilt, cruise, power locks, windows 
, brown, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection.  It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist 
(if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for 
repairs if required. , 242,934 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Stabilitrak light on, ABS light on, right 
side rear fender scratches and dents, some stains on the seats and rear floor, motor, 
transmission, tires, brakes, battery and exhaust all in unknown condition, windshield 
cracked > As is Where is

242,934 
km

$100 1GNDU23W88D163220
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BESNARD LAKE, Corrections Policing and Public Safety 20-17-02-W3

Contact Tiffany Pocha 306-953-3162, tiffany.pocha@gov.sk.ca or Kim Barnes 306-425-4014, kim.barnes@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 5-507 Milk Cooler,  Silver King, SKMAJ1CA,  15.25" l x 17.25" w x 39.5" h, operational.  Good $1 BRDP336904A

S 22.57 * 5-506 Toaster,  Omcan, 19938,  Commercial 10ʺ wide, conveyor with 3ʺ opening, 120 V, 1800W, 
operational.  Good

$1 68,351,810,136,027

S No Bid * 4-534 Weights, Lot of 2 plastic,  15 lb.  Good $1

S No Bid * 4-535 Weights, Lot of 2 plastic,  15 lb.  Good $1

CUTBANK, Water Security Agency, SE-12-27-07-W3

Contact Ayold Elgersma 306-631-0460, ayold.elgersma@wsask.ca or Jason Eliason 306-620-6377, jason.eliason@wsask.ca

S No Bid * 4-513 Chairs, Lot of 12 Metal, fabric,  Brown, grey, no wheels, with arms, 6 stackable and 6 non 
stackable.  Fair

$1

S No Bid * 4-515 Inclinometer Reel,  HMA Geotechnical system, 2014, Type UMI 40 G   ,  Includes attachments, 
hand control, foot control & auto stop pully, 1/28 ratio, 12 DC EMP Motor(M5-7172703), 
clock wise - 500ft, operational.  Excellent

$200 53,008,186

KENOSEE LAKE PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks Culture and Sport, Kenosee Lake Compound, Call for Directions

Contact Leigh Potter 306-577-7810, leigh.potter@gov.sk.ca

S 829.48 * 9-590 Truck 2007 CHEVROLET Silverado, 2500HD 4WD, extended cab, 8' box 6L, V8, gas auto air, 
tilt, cruise tire size, 245 75  R16, 10 ply, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection.  It is unknown 
if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. 
Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 248,241 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: 
Transmission needs repair, body exterior in poor condition.>, As is, Where is

248,241 
km

$1 1GCHK29K17E559440

MAPLE CREEK, Corrections Policing and Public Safety, Highway 21 North Service Rd

Contact Tyler Hansen 306-778-8205, tyler.hansen@gov.sk.ca

S 780.25 10-539 Snowmobile 2000 POLARIS Indy Trail Touring  550cc, 2 cycle, gas and oil mix belt 
driven/clutch 2 up - rear seat , blue, ,  6894.5 miles, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: ripped/taped seat, 
pull start only, motor/transmission/brakes/lights operational but initial start is difficult, 
battery dead, windshield glass/paint fair.>, As is, Where is

 6894.5 
miles

$1 4XAST5BS9XC004186
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MEADOW LAKE PROVINCIAL PARK, Culture & Sport, NW-33-62-18-W3, Box 70, Dorintosh, SK, S0M 0T0

Contact Rick Gollings 306-236-7680, rick.gollings@gov.sk.ca or Reg Bayko, reg.bayko@gov.sk.ca

S 1,345.67 10-543 Snowblower Attachment, ALLIED 8 foot,  Year unknown, 3 point hitch, quite a bit of rust, 
unknown if operational.  Poor

$25

S 82.00 10-544 Truck Topper,  Fibreglass, 5' truck box,  Approx.  60" l x 63" w, locks, does not have keys.  Fair $25

S 52.00 10-545 Truck Topper,  Fibreglass, 6.5' truck box,  Approx. 63" l x 78" w, locks, does not have keys.  
Fair

$25

S 8,300.00 10-542 Truck 2004 STERLING  LT9511 2WD 6 cylinder, diesel 10 speed manual A/C, tilt, cruise, radio 
gravel spreader, yellow, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection.  It is unknown if any repairs or safety 
concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full 
responsibility for repairs if required. ,  390,762 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: The unit has rust 
and requires batteries. The mileage was taken from inspection book, no batteries, 
motor/transmission/tires/brakes/windshield washers & wipers fair, body 
exterior/exhaust/paint poor, interior/lights/mirrors/horn good. The joystick control panel 
was removed.>, As is, Where is

 390,762 
km

$1,500 2FZHAZCV44AM25505

MOOSE JAW, Highways, 1 km South of Moose Jaw on Hwy 2

Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid 10-548 Sign Truck 2001 FREIGHTLINER FL112 4WD 11L, inline 6, diesel manual air, cruise , tilt Altec 
D947 digger derrick boom, gross vehicle weight 23,587 kg, 10 speed tandem axle, 266" wheel 
base, differential type 3 way lock up, dual tire, tire size rear 11R22.5 front 315 80R22.5, tire 
ply 16, yellow, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection.  It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns 
exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full 
responsibility for repairs if required. ,  698,860 km, ,  KNOWN PROBLEMS: Main frame 
corroded and would not pass safety inspection, deck is compromised as well due to corrosion 
and rust, has not had a recent boom inspection, not known if boom works. 
Motor/transmission/tires/battery/windshield washers & wipers/mirrors good, 
brakes/exhaust/windshield glass/interior fair, body exterior rusty, lights/horn working.>, As 
is, Where is

 698,860 
km

$9,000 1FVHBGA891HH89012

NIPAWIN, Water Security Agency, 300 Timber Dr

Contact Ayold Elgersma 306-631-0460, ayold.elgersma@wsask.ca or Water Security Agency 306-862-1750.

S No Bid * 3-503 Culvert Collar,  metal,  36" diameter, with some rust.  Good $10

S No Bid * 3-504 Culvert Collar,  metal,  48"diameter, with some rust.  Good $10
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S No Bid * 3-516 Hoist,  Stationary Frame,  Not certified, frame 8' 7" length, base  6' w x 6' d.  Fair $300

NORTH BATTLEFORD, Corrections Policing and Public Safety, A - 502 114th St

Contact Jon Huber 306-446-7417, jonathan.huber@gov.sk.ca or Karen Howard 306-446-7416, karen.howard@gov.sk.ca

S 126.00 10-547 Wildlife Feeder,  Trophy Hunter,  Metal.  Good $1

NORTH BATTLEFORD, SaskBuilds & Procurement, 502 114th St

Contact David Bourdon 306-446-7945 cell 306-441-0472, david.bourdon@gov.sk.ca

S 1,201.01 10-540 Lawn Tractor 1996 JOHN DEERE  2WD 20HP Liquid Cooled, 2 cylinder, gas hydrostatic rear 
PTO 54" mower deck, green, , 1683 hrs, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Has not run in 5 years, motor 
poor/burns oil, transmission/brakes unknown, tires/battery/body exterior/exhaust/paint 
lights poor.>, As is, Where is

1683 hrs $1 M00425A050441

S 900.00 10-541 Lawn Tractor  JOHN DEERE 345  2WD 20 HP liquid cooled, gas auto  Unknown year, green, , 
km unknown, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Motor poor/burns oil/ will not stay running, 
transmission/brakes/exhaust unknown, tires/battery/body exterior/paint/lights poor.>, As is, 
Where is

km 
unknown

$1 M00345A074279

S 1,277.00 10-538 Quad 1988 HONDA FourTrax TRX300  2WD 300cc, 1 cylinder, gas manual electric start/kick 
start 4 speed, front/rear rack, snow blade, chains for rear tires, red, , km unknown, , KNOWN 
PROBLEMS: Not used in years, motor/transmission/brakes/exhaust/interior/lights/horn 
unknown, tires/body exterior/paint fair.> , As is, Where is

km 
unknown

$1 JH3TE140JKO12064

S 100.00 10-546 Snow Blower  SEARS CRAFTSMAN  24" 205cc, 1 cylinder, gas 6 speed  Unknown year, grey, , , , 
KNOWN PROBLEMS: Snow blower condition poor, front auger bent, does not start, has been 
outside for a long time, motor/tires/body exterior/exhaust/paint/lights poor.>, As is, Where 
is

$1 804,018,801,631

PREECEVILLE, Corrections Policing and Public Safety, 239 Hwy Ave E

Contact John Petryshyn 306-547-7530, johnny.petryshyn@gov.sk.ca or Nathan Dutchak 306-590-7636, nathan.dutchak@gov.sk.ca

S 10.00 * 5-584 Truck Tool Box,  Challenger, Aluminum,  13" w x 13" d x 60" h, latch is non operational, no 
keys for lock.  Broken Repairable

$1
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PRINCE ALBERT, Highways, Northern Operations, 81 North Industrial Dr.

Contact  Cory Palko 306-960-5152, cory.palko@gov.sk.ca.

S 16,665.00 * 9-517 Wheel Loader 2000 CASE 621C 4x4 5.9L Cummins,  inline 6, diesel Powershift A/C, ride 
control GVW 12,000 KG, single tire, tire size 20.5x25, standard differential, 4 speed, Orange, , 
4,836 hrs., , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Cab rot, oil leaks, flat tire and transmission stuck in 1st gear, 
motor, brakes, body exterior, exhaust, windshield glass, windshield washer and wipers, paint, 
interior, lights, mirrors, horn all in fair condition, transmission, tires and battery all in poor 
condition As is Where is

4,836 hrs. $15,000 JEE0122962

PRINCE ALBERT, Environment, Forest Service, 319-800 Central Ave

Contact Ngozika Onyemeh 306-953-2221 ngozika.onyemeh@gov.sk.ca

S 11.11 10-519 inReach Explorer, Garmin ,  Non-operational, deactivated, rechargeable, black & orange   
Broken Repairable

$1 56F057326

S 11.11 10-520 inReach Explorer, Garmin ,  Non-operational, deactivated, rechargeable, black & orange   
Broken Repairable

$1 56F047340

S No Bid 10-518 Satellite Phone, Globalstar Qualconn, GSP - 1700 ,  Screen is blind, deactivated with 
rechargeable battery and charger, black   Good

$1 11601147053/N10D183DL

S No Bid 10-506 Satellite Phone, Globalstar Qualconn, GSP - 1700 ,  With rechargeable battery and charger, 
deactivated, memory has been wiped, black, operational.   Good

$1 11601179528/K2J9520V5

S No Bid 10-507 Satellite Phone, Globalstar Qualconn, GSP - 1700 ,  With rechargeable battery and charger, 
deactivated, memory has been wiped, orange, operational.   Good

$1 11601215525/K2J732150

S No Bid 10-508 Satellite Phone, Globalstar Qualconn, GSP - 1700 ,  With rechargeable battery and charger, 
deactivated, memory has been wiped, red, operational.   Good

$1 11601237642/K2J7500U0

S No Bid 10-509 Satellite Phone, Globalstar Qualconn, GSP - 1700 ,  With rechargeable battery and charger, 
deactivated, memory has been wiped, red, operational.   Good

$1 1161230589/K2J7444DV

S No Bid 10-510 Satellite Phone, Globalstar Qualconn, GSP - 1700 ,  With rechargeable battery and charger, 
deactivated, memory has been wiped, red, operational.   Good

$1 1160123071/K2J7421VR

S No Bid 10-511 Satellite Phone, Globalstar Qualconn, GSP - 1700 ,  With rechargeable battery and charger, 
deactivated, memory has been wiped, red, operational.   Good

$1 11601237631/K2J75157J

S No Bid 10-512 Satellite Phone, Globalstar Qualconn, GSP - 1700 ,  With rechargeable battery and charger, 
deactivated, memory has been wiped, red, operational.   Good

$1 11601237823/K2J751050

S No Bid 10-513 Satellite Phone, Globalstar Qualconn, GSP - 1700 ,  With rechargeable battery and charger, 
deactivated, memory has been wiped, red, operational.   Good

$1 11601195590/K2J7201L1

S No Bid 10-514 Satellite Phone, Globalstar Qualconn, GSP - 1700 ,  With rechargeable battery and charger, 
deactivated, memory has been wiped, red, operational.   Good

$1 11601237860/K2J7515HX

S No Bid 10-515 Satellite Phone, Globalstar Qualconn, GSP - 1700 ,  With rechargeable battery and charger, 
deactivated, memory has been wiped, red, operational.   Good

$1 11601237827/K2J75102N

S 32.56 10-516 Satellite Phone, Globalstar Qualconn, GSP - 1700 ,  With rechargeable battery and charger, 
deactivated, memory has been wiped, red, operational.   Good

$1 11601237785/K2J75159U
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S No Bid 10-517 Satellite Phone, Globalstar Qualconn, GSP - 1700 ,  With rechargeable battery and charger, 
deactivated, memory has been wiped, red, operational.   Good

$1 11601237846/K2J75145U

PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan PolyTechnic 1100 - 15th St E

Contact Ken Pichula 306-765-1584, pashipping@saskpolytech.ca

S 150.01 * 9-581 Binding Machine,  Powis Fastback ,  For binding books, 20 strip, operational.   Good $1 2,638

S 51.01 * 9-582 Paddy Wagon,  Challenger,  For printing purposes, operational.   Good $1

S No Bid * 9-583 Paper Cutter,  Polar Mohr, 55EM,  Operational.   Good $1 5,651,101

REGINA, Corrections Policing and Public Safety, University of Regina, West Block (Policing College)

Contact Enoch Ernest 306-787-4200, enoch.ernest@gov.sk.ca or Melanie Hart 306-787-8871, melanie.hart@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 9-579 Shooting Stands,  Cabela's,  For camera mounting.  Excellent $100

REGINA, Highways, Operations and Maintenance, 1610 Park St

Contact Waneta Hardy 306-541-6150, waneta.hardy@gov.sk.ca or Kyla Seebach 306-787-3201, kyla.seebach@gov.sk.ca

*WD *WD 10-503 Desk,  Wood, pepperdust,  Corner piece 42" l x 42" w x 29.5"h, left return runoff 42" l x 30" w 
x 29.5"h, missing finishing strip on left runoff.  Fair

$1

*WD *WD 10-504 Desk,  Wood, pepperdust,  Corner piece, 42" l x 42" w x 29.5" h, left runoff 42" l x 30" w x 
29"h.  Fair

$1

S 5.00 10-505 Pedestals, Lot of 2 Wood, pepperdust,  18"w x 24" d x 27"h, one two drawer, one three 
drawer.  Fair

$1

REGINA, Immigration and Career Training, 1955 Broad St

Contact Verna Ziegler 306-787-2580, verna.ziegler@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 9-626 Table,  Boardroom,  Grey, 120" l x 50" w x 30" h, comes apart at the middle, 60".  Good $200

REGINA, Justice and Attorney General, 515 Henderson Dr

Contact Aaron Wilgosh, aaron.wilgosh@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 5-588 Chair,  plastic,  Tan, 19.5" l  x 18.25" w x  30.5" h, no arms.  Excellent $1

REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 1702 Park St

Contact Kristen Nelson 306-787-0179, knelson@slga.com or Sherrie Sawin 306-787-3097, ssawin@slga.com

S No Bid * 4-544 Chair,  fabric,  Navy, 5 casters, adjustable arms/seat height, minor damage on one armrest. 
*NOTE: Online viewing only & 24 hours’ notice for pick-up required.  Fair

$5
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REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 12252 Ewing Ave

Contact Al Kentz 306-787-4286, akentz@slga.com or Todd Leurer 306-510-4368, tleurer@slga.com

S No Bid * 9-623 Forklift 2005 TOYOTA 7FBEU15 E-Forklift Electric  signal lights, mirror, horn no charger, 
orange/black, , 23,2398 hours, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Charger not included. No other known 
problems but no guarantees., As is, Where is

23,2398 
hours

$10,000 14,298

REGINA, Trade and Export Development, 300 2103 11th Ave

Contact Tosin Fatoyinbo 306-510-2943, tosin.fatoyinbo2@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 5-543 Desk,  laminate,  Grey, L-shape,  72"w x  80"d 'x 29"h, includes locking pedestal, unlocked but 
is missing key, the desk is currently taken apart and ready to move.  Good

$1

S No Bid * 5-544 Desk,  laminate ,  Grey, L-shape, 72"w x  80"d 'x 29"h, includes vertical storage, desk light, and 
keyboard tray, the desk is currently taken apart and ready to move.  Good

$1

SASKATOON, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, SCC, 910 60th St. E

Contact Renee Pound 306-956-8817, renee.pound@gov.sk.ca or  Danielle Corriveau 306-956-8869 danielle.corriveau@gov.sk.ca. 

S 23.00 * 5-552 Cabinet,  Particle Board,  Two shelves, 14.25" l x 30" w x 30" h.  Good $1
S No Bid * 5-554 File Folders, Lot of 11 Paper,  10 boxes of 10 and one box of 6 of the Pendeflex end tab 

classification folders.  Excellent
$1

S No Bid * 5-556 Organization Bins, Lot of 7 Metal,  Black, two metal trays, two plastic trays, one wall file 
holder and plastic dividers.  Good

$1

S 11.11 * 5-557 Pedestal, Lot of 2 Particle Board,  Casters are broken on bottom, 15.5" l x 21 .75" w x 27" h, 
locks, no key.  Fair

$1

S 1.80 * 5-558 Pedestal,  Particle Board,  Pepperdust, three drawer pedestal, no lock or cylinder, 17.5" l x 
24.5" w x 26" h.  Fair

$1

SASKATOON, Highways, 126 105th St E

Contact Richard Leibel 306-933-5262, richard.leibel@gov.sk.ca or Shaun Bowditch 306-933-5265, shaun.bowditch@gov.sk.ca

S 3.00 * 5-527 Air Purifier,  1997 NEOT, RP050BNA,  Non-operational.  Fair $1 RP-01-2205

S 3.00 * 5-528 Air Purifier,  1997 NEOT, RP050BNA,  Non-operational.  Fair $1 RP-01-2206

SASKATOON, Trade and Export Development, 219 Robin Cres

Contact Hiren Khemani 306-787-8712, hiren.khemani@gov.sk.ca or Brenda Stevenson 306-787-0272, brenda.stevenson@gov.sk.ca

S 22.50 10-521 Cabinet,  2 door, wood,  35" l x 18.5" w x 65.5" h, locks, no key.  Good $5

S No Bid 10-522 Credenza,  Wood,  36" l x 20" w x 29" h.  Good $5
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S No Bid 10-523 Desk,  L-shaped, wood,  One side 72" l x 36" w x 29" h , other side 78" l x 20" w x 29" h.  Good $5

*WD *WD 10-524 Desk,  L-shaped, wood,  One side 77" l x 23.5" w x 29.5"h, other side 59.5" l x 23.5" w x 
29.5"h.  Good

$5

*WD *WD 10-525 Desk,  L-shaped, wood,  One side 77.7" l x 23.5" w x 29" h, other side, 59.5" l x 23.5" w x 
29"h, locks, no key.  Good

$5

*WD *WD 10-526 Desk,  L-shaped, wood,  One side, 78" l x 36" w x 30" h, other side 72" l x 36" w x 30" h, locks, 
no key.  Good

$5

S 27.36 10-527 File Cabinet,  Metal, 3 drawer, lateral,  36" l x 18" w x 39"h, locks, no key.  Good $5

S 27.36 10-528 File Cabinet,  Metal, 3 drawer, lateral,  Beige, 36" l x 19" w x 41"h, locks, no key.  Good $5

S 7.00 10-529 File Cabinet,  Metal, 5 drawer, lateral,  35" w x 18" d x 65.5"h, locks, with key.  Good $5

S 10.00 10-530 Hutch,  Metal ,  41.5" l x 13" w x 14.5"h.  Good $5

S 10.00 10-531 Hutch,  Metal ,  Black, 41.5" l x 13" w x 14.5"h.  Good $5

S No Bid 10-532 Partition,  Metal ,  Black, 18" l x 3" w x 28" h.  Good $5

S No Bid 10-533 Partition,  ,  Black, 66" l x 3" d x 66"h.  Good $5

S 32.51 10-534 Shelf,  Metal,  On wheels, 47" l x 17.5" d x 78" h,   Good $5

S 32.51 10-535 Shelf,  Metal ,  With wheels, 47" l x 17.5" d x 78" h.  Good $5

SMEATON, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, Call for Directions

Contact Eric Pulvermacher 306-426-2610, eric.pulvermacher@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 5-511 Lawnmower,  Craftsman , 944.361210,  Air filter cover missing, non-operational.  Poor $1 052411M 004626

URANIUM CITY, Saskatchewan Research Council, Call for Directions

Contact Roger Dauvin 306-385-4035 roger.dauvin@src.sk.ca

S 4,700.00 10-536 Snowmobile 2012 BRP SKI-DOO  Renegade 550F  550cc, 2 cylinder, gas continuously variable  
, black, ,  2770 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Good overall conditions, runs, As is, Where is

 2770 km $4,000 2BPSMWCA8CV000091

S 4,590.50 10-537 Snowmobile 2012 BRP SKI-DOO  Renegade 550F  550cc, 2 cylinder, gas continuously variable  
, black, ,  3129 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Good overall conditions, runs, As is, Where is

 3129 km $4,000 2BPSMWCA3CV000113 

1/15/2025,2:18 PM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.  14



SaskBuilds and Procurement
SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #10
From Jan 8 to Jan 15, 2025

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number

WEYBURN, Justice and Attorney General, 301 Prairie Ave * Online Viewing Only*

Contact Kevin Duxbury 306-861-6839, kevin.duxbury@gov.sk.ca or Garth Stuart 306-861-3612, kenneth.stuart@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 5-530 Desk,  Corner piece,  Pepperdust,  42" l x 42" w x 29" h.  Good $1

S No Bid * 5-533 Desk,  Wood,  5-drawer, 72" l x 36" w x 29" h, brown.  Good $1

S No Bid * 5-536 Desks, Lot of 2 Right side wing,  Pepperdust,  60" l x 30" w x 29" h.  Good $1

S 5.00 * 5-537 File Cabinet,  Metal, lateral,  32"l x 18" w x 79"h.  Good $1

S 1.00 * 5-539 Hutch,  ,  Pepperdust, 60" l x 17.75" w x 42" h.  Good $1

S No Bid * 5-540 Table,  Wood, metal frame,  Black top, 60" l x 30" w x 29" h.  Good $1

YORKTON, Agriculture, 38 - 5th Ave N

Contact Ogonnaya Oji Maleschuk, ogonnaya.maleschuk@gov.sk.ca

S No Bid * 4-578 Chair,  Office,  Grey cloth with adjustable armrest & wheels - about 51" length.  Fair $1

S No Bid * 4-579 Chair,  Office,  Grey cloth with adjustable armrest & wheels - about 51" length.  Poor $1

YORKTON, Water Security Agency, 269 Hamilton Rd.

Contact Karen Ayers 306-551-9487, karen.ayers@wsask.ca or Ayold Elgersma 306-631-0460, ayold.elgersma@wsask.ca

S 1.01 * 4-567 Truck Tool Box,  UWS, Metal,  60"l x 29"d x 14"h, no key.  Good $1
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