

SALE SUMMARY LIST

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-787-2238,
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.
WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.
No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|--|--|------------|-----------|-------------------|
| REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles | | | | |
| Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306. | | | | |
| 6,089.89 3-001 | Car 2006 CADILLAC, DTS, FWD, 4.6L V8 gas Northstar, auto, Dual zone A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD/Bluetooth, power mirrors with directional arrows, front seat heated and cooling, power locks/windows/trunk release, keyless entry 3 fobs, 3 keys Extra set of mats in trunk, blue, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 243,400 km, , PROBLEMS: Rear shocks, driver seat switch, grille chrome peeling, hood scratches/scuffs, trunk lid scratches, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, normal wear on all seats, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is | 243,400 km | \$5,875 | 1G6KD57Y56U247363 |
| 4,089.89 3-002 | Car 2013 CHEVROLET, Impala LS, FWD, 3.6L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/locks/left front seat/trunk release/mirrors, keyless entry-2keys-2 fobs , white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 264,542 km, , PROBLEMS: Check engine light on Codes: P0496 EVAP purge valve/P0300 Random misfire(history misfire #3/#6), both outter tie rods, right front wheel bearing, rear tires cupped, need alignment, surface rust on rear rotors, left low beam, key marks in right quarter panel, grille lower broke, hood chips, front bumper chips, rear bumper scratches, left front fender dents, left rear fender dents/scratches, right rear fender dent, roof chips/rust, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is | 264,542 km | \$2,801 | 2G1WA5E3XD1254874 |
| *WD * 2-002 | Car 2013 CHEVROLET, Impala LS, FWD, 3.6L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/locks/mirrors/trunk release/left front seat, keyless entry 2 fobs, 1-key , black, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 202,815 km, , PROBLEMS: Motor seized (needs engine), front and rear pads and rotors need replacement, ABS light on, alignment, no back lights, wiper blades need replacement, both bumpers scratches/scrapes/chips, all doors rust along bottom, roof scratches, trunk lid dents/scratches/missing badge, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is | 202,815 km | \$1,895 | 2G1WA5E32D1257347 |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|-----------------------|---|---------------|-----------|-------------------|
| 4,777.00 3-003 | Car 2009 CHRYSLER, Sebring LX, FWD, 2.4L Inline 4 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows/trunk release, keyless entry-2 key fobs , white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 172,233 km , , PROBLEMS: Rack and pinion steering leaking, left lower ball joint, rear struts, tire pressure monitoring system light, hood paint bubbling/scratches, both bumpers' chips/scratches, left front fender dent, right front door rust along bottom inside and out, trunk lid scratches, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is | 172,233 km | \$963 | 1C3LC46B29N573460 |
| 4,589.89 3-004 | Car 2013 DODGE, Avenger SE, FWD, 2.4L Inline 4 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/locks/windows/trunk release, keyless entry-2 key fobs , blue, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 231,902 km , , PROBLEMS: Rear struts, rear tires cupped, tires noisy, need alignment, right front marker light, hood paint bubbling/scratches/chips, front bumper bent/scratches/chips, rear bumper scratches, right rear fender dent/scratches, rocker panels road rash, left side doors rust inside and outside bottom, left rear door road rash/scratches, right rear door rust inside bottom/road rash, roof scratches, trunk lid chips/scratches, small amount of rust, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is | 231,902 km | \$1,083 | 1C3CDZAB3DN604533 |
| 5,089.89 3-005 | SUV 2009 SATURN, Vue Green Line Hybrid, 2WD, 2.4L Inline 4 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/mirrors, keyless entry-2 keys-2 fobs , white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 170,178 km , , PROBLEMS: Starter and alternator module issues, left front head lamp foggy, hood dents, front bumper chips/scratches, rear bumper not aligned, left front fender scratches, left rear fender slight dent, left front door scratch, tailgate paint chips/peeling, no spare tire/wheel wrench/jack (OEM compressor sealant kit), windshield chips/stone bruise, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is | 170,178 km | \$517 | 3GSCL93Z79S619482 |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|---|---|-----|-----------|---------------|
| REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment | | | | |
| Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306. | | | | |
| No Bid * 10-116 | Floor Mats, Lot of 2 Rear, OEM fabric, grey May be compatible with years 2004-2009 Dodge Durago. Good | | \$5 | |
| No Bid * 10-117 | Floor Mats, Lot of 2 Rear, OEM fabric, grey May be compatible with years 2004-2009 Dodge Durago. Good | | \$5 | |
| No Bid * 2-101 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-102 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-103 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-104 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-105 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-106 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-107 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-108 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-109 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-110 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-111 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-112 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-113 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-114 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-115 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-116 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-117 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-118 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-119 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-120 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-122 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-123 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, red. Good | | \$2 | |
| No Bid * 2-124 | Key Float, foam, metal chain "Turn in Poachers and Clean Your Boat" logo, yellow. Good | | \$2 | |
| 11.00 * 2-512 | Microwave, Danby 21"w x 15"d x 12"h , white. Fair | | \$10 | |
| No Bid * 11-101 | Monitor and Processor, Robot MV96E, 16 channel processor, Speco VM10LCD Monitor. Mounted on a aluminum bracket. No remote control. Condition unknown for both items. Poor | | \$15 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|------------------------|--|-----|-----------|---------------|
| 2.00 3-119 | Pizza Saver, Lot of aprox. 800 Plastic 8 sealed packages, 100 supports in each package, white. Excellent | | \$2 | |
| 21.00 * 2-565 | Shop Vac Vacuum, Ultra 87716-15 22"w x 22"d x 37"h, wet/dry, 45l, silver and black, operational. Fair | | \$20 | |
| 211.00 * 1-118 | Tailgate, OEM Chevrolet, Silverado, Metal White in color, slight scratches, dents, chips, no lock, maybe be compatible with 2007-2013 Silverado, 1500, 2500, 3500. Good | | \$200 | |
| 220.00 3-101 | Tailgate, OEM. Chev Silverado, metal White in color, slight scratches, dents, chips, no lock, maybe compatible with 2007-2013 Silverado, 1500, 2500, 3500. Good | | \$200 | |
| 276.00 3-102 | Tailgate, OEM. Chev Silverado, metal White, slight scratches, dents, chips. No lock, maybe compatible with 2007-2013 Silverado, 1500, 2500, 3500. Good | | \$200 | |
| No Bid * 12-125 | Tire, 225/65R/17, Solum Inspire Manufacture date. Week 14, year 2019. Good | | \$40 | |
| No Bid * 10-120 | Tire, LT265/70R16, Artic Claw. Winter XSI. Snowflake, M+S. Mounted on a steel rim. May fit a 2012 Dodge Ram 1500. Manufacture date. Week 21, year 2012. Excellent | | \$100 | 437944.00 |
| No Bid * 3-103 | Tire, 225/60R/16, Firestone FR710, M+S. on steel rim May be compatible with a 2008 Chev. Impala, manufacture date. Week 17, Year 2016. Good | | \$50 | |
| No Bid * 12-121 | Tire, 225/65R/17, Sumitomo HTR Enhance C/X. M+S. Manufacture date, week 13, year 2018. Good | | \$40 | |
| 204.03 3-120 | Tires, Set of 4 225/55R/17, Firestone All Season.M+S Manufacture date. Week 37, year 2021. Good | | \$160 | |
| No Bid * 3-104 | Tires, Set of 4 225/60R/16, Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X, M+S Manufacture date. Week 08, Year 2017. Fair | | \$120 | |
| No Bid * 2-126 | Tires, Set of 4 225/60R/16, Sumitomo HTR Enhance. M+S Manufacture date. Week 25, year 2019. Fair | | \$120 | |
| No Bid * 11-113 | Tires, Set of 4 225/60R/17 Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X. M+S Manufacture date. Week 34, year 2017. Fair | | \$120 | |
| No Bid * 3-114 | Tires, Set of 4 225/65R/16, Firestone FR710. M+S Manufacture date. Week 12, year 2015. Poor | | \$40 | |
| 252.20 3-122 | Tires, Set of 4 225/65R/17, Bridgestone Aleenza A/S 02, M+S Manufacture date. Week 10, year 2022. Excellent | | \$180 | |
| 254.00 3-123 | Tires, Set of 4 225/65R/17, Bridgestone Aleenza A/S 02. M+S Manufacture date. Week 07, year 2022. Excellent | | \$200 | |
| 121.80 3-105 | Tires, Set of 4 225/65R/17, Goodyear Integrity, M+S Multiple manufacture dates. Fair | | \$120 | |
| No Bid * 1-108 | Tires, Set of 2 225/65R/17, Goodyear Ultra Grip Winter, Snow flake, M+S 1 tire, manufacture date week 30, year 2018, good, 2nd tire, manufacture date week 09, year 2016, poor. Fair | | \$30 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|-----------------------|---|-----|-----------|------------------|
| No Bid * 3-115 | Tires, Set of 2 225/65R/17, Sumitomo HTR Enhance C/X. M+S Manufacture date. Week 31, year 2018. Good | | \$160 | |
| 176.51 3-116 | Tires, Set of 4 235/65R/17, Continental CrossContact RX. M+S Manufacture date. Week 33, year 2020. Good | | \$160 | |
| 141.61 3-118 | Tires, Set of 4 P225/60R18 Winter, Blizzak LM-60 Manufacture date, week 16, year 2010. Fair | | \$100 | |
| No Bid * 2-129 | Tool box, Aluminum, Lund Challenger. Multiple vehicle applications, lid support broke, gull wing cross vehicle, has keys, locks do not work, 70"w x 20"d x 14"h. Broken Repairable | | \$75 | |
| No Bid * 1-105 | Topper, Leer, Fiberglass 74 "w , 84"d, charcoal grey, 1 key-locks do not work, sliding front window, light scratches, removed from a 2009 Ford F250, beacon-condition unknown. Fair | | \$200 | 435971.00 |
| No Bid * 2-700 | Water Cooler, Crystal Mountain, ALP A2WTW1 12"w x 12"d x 38"h, cold and room temperature, operational, white. Fair | | \$45 | 1101067020458.00 |
| 55.00 3-117 | Water Cooler, Crystal Mountain, GLED2WTW1AC 12"w x 12"d x 38"h, cold and room temperature, operational, white. Fair | | \$45 | 15150850063.00 |
| 40.00 3-106 | Cabinets, MDF 49"w x 25.25"d x 36"h, 3 doors, 1 selve adjustable, green top grey bottom. Good | | \$1 | |
| 91.00 3-107 | Cabinets, MDF 96"w x 24.5"d x 36"h, 3 doors, 1 selve adjustable, left and righth side missing toe board, green top grey bottom. Good | | \$1 | |
| 112.00 3-108 | Cabinets, MDF Hanging, 203"w x 12"d x 37"h, 4 open with 2 adjustable selves, 3 with doors, 1 selve adjustable, grey. Good | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-109 | Counter Top , L-Shape, wood Left side 62"w x 24.75"d x 2" thick, right side 60"w x 24.75"d x 2" thick, does not come with L-brackets to mount on wall, three cut out holes, green. Good | | \$1 | |
| 40.00 3-110 | Counter Top , Wood 104"w x 24.5"d x 1.5 thick, does not come with L-brackets to mount on wall, grey. Good | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-111 | Counter Top , Wood 41"w x 24.5"d x 1.5" thick, does not come with L-brackets to mount on wall, green. Good | | \$1 | |
| 2.00 3-112 | Counter Top , Wood 97"w x 24.5"d x 1.5" thick, does not come with L-brackets to mount on wall, green. Good | | \$1 | |
| 25.00 3-113 | Doors, Set of 2 wood 18.25"w x 31"h x 1" thick, lock with no key, has hinges no screws, burgundy. Good | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-124 | File Cabinet, Lateral, metal 36"w x 18"d x 28.5"h, 2-drawer, dents and scratches from ware and tear, lockable with key, grey. Fair | | \$20 | |
| No Bid * 3-125 | File Cabinet, Lateral, metal 36"w x 18"d x 28.5"h, 2-drawer, dents and scratches from ware and tear, lockable with no key, grey. Fair | | \$20 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|------------------------|--|-----|-----------|---------------------|
| No Bid * 3-126 | File Cabinet, Lateral, metal 36"w x 18"d x 28.5"h, 2-drawer, dents and scratches from ware and tear, lockable with no key, grey. Fair | | \$20 | |
| 20.00 3-127 | File Cabinet, Lateral, metal 36"w x 18"d x 28.5"h, 2-drawer, dents and scratches from ware and tear, lockable with no key, grey. Fair | | \$20 | |
| 20.00 3-128 | File Cabinet, Lateral, metal 36"w x 18"d x 28.5"h, 2-drawer, dents and scratches from ware and tear, lockable with no key, grey. Fair | | \$20 | |
| 22.00 3-130 | File Cabinet, Lateral, metal 36"w x 18"d x 52.5"h, 4-drawer, dents and scratches from ware and tear, lockable with key, grey. Fair | | \$20 | |
| No Bid * 3-129 | File Cabinet, Lateral, metal 36"w x 18"d x 52.5"h, 4-drawer, dents and scratches from ware and tear, lockable with no key, grey. Fair | | \$20 | |
| 20.00 3-131 | File Cabinet, Lateral, metal 36"w x 18"d x 52.5"h, 4-drawer, dents and scratches from ware and tear, lockable with no key, grey. Fair | | \$20 | |
| 21.00 3-132 | File Cabinet, Lateral, metal 36"w x 18"d x 52.5"h, 4-drawer, dents and scratches from ware and tear, lockable with no key, grey. Fair | | \$20 | |
| 11.27 * 2-133 | Printer, Desktop, Canon ImageFormula DR-2050C Untested, some scratches, no power cord. Fair | | \$1 | DL369737 |
| No Bid * 2-154 | Printer, Dot Matrix, Oki Microline 390Turbo/N 24 pin Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord, comes with CD. Fair | | \$1 | GE7200AAK11026057G0 |
| No Bid * 12-185 | Scanner, Flatbed, Canon CanoScan LiDE 700F Untested, some scratches, no power cord. Fair | | \$1 | KDTA11319 |
| No Bid * 12-118 | Scanner, Flatbed, HP ScanJet 6300C Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. May not work on Windows 10/11. Fair | | \$1 | SG08F261HNPE |
| 10.00 3-133 | Table, Round, wood/metal 36"d x 28.5"h, brown. Fair | | \$10 | |
| 10.00 3-134 | Table, Round, wood/metal 36"d x 28.5"h, brown. Fair | | \$10 | |
| 10.00 3-135 | Table, Round, wood/metal 36"d x 28.5"h, brown. Fair | | \$10 | |
| No Bid * 3-136 | Table, Round, wood/metal 36"d x 28.5"h, brown. Fair | | \$10 | |
| 18.77 3-137 | Table, Round, wood/metal 36"d x 28.5"h, brown. Fair | | \$10 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|--|--|------------|-----------|-------------------|
| GRENFELL Highways, Yard Hwy 1 West entrance. | | | | |
| Contact Cory Obleman 306-526-9135, cory.obleman@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| 175.00 3-530 | Sign Posts, Lot of 120-140 Wooden Some treated/painted, some broken, 4"w x 6"d x 8 to 14'h approximately and 4"w x 4"d x 8 to 14'h approximately, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided, loading is the responsibility of buyer. Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair | | \$1 | |
| KENOSEE LAKE, Parks Culture & Sport, Moose Mountain Provincial Park | | | | |
| Contact Leigh Potter 306-577-2605, leigh.potter@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| 779.00 3-514 | Mini Van, 2005DODGE CaravanFWD3.3L V6 gas autoA/C, cruise, tiltgreyTOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 149,070 kmPROBLEMS: No safety, motor/transmission/brakes/exhaust unknown condition, poor windshield washer/wipers/paint, windshield cracked, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | 149,070 km | \$250 | 1D4GP25R15B172632 |
| LA RONGE, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, Land Operations, 800 Poirier Street. | | | | |
| Contact Amelick Halkett 306-425-4413, amelick.halkett@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| No Bid * 12-544 | Camera, HP Packard R607 4.1 MP digital No charger, unknown if operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | CN48TB400Y |
| 1.25 * 12-549 | Fax Machine, Brother Facsimile Transceiver, MFC-420CNZ Unknown if operational. Good | | \$1 | U61084L5F710199 |
| No Bid * 12-555 | Television, RCA, Colortrak Plus, F31632ET 32", Not a flat screen, with Remote control, unknown if operational. Good | | \$1 | 540219150.00 |
| MOOSOMIN Yards, Highways 204 Park Avenue. | | | | |
| Contact Cory Obleman 306-526-9135, cory.obleman@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| No Bid * 3-533 | Sign Posts, Lot of 75-80 Wooden Some treated/painted, some broken, 4"w x 6"d x 8 to 14' approximately, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer;Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-532 | Sign Posts, Lot of 75-80 Wooden Some treated/painted, some broken, 4"w x 6"d x 8 to 14'h approximately, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer;Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair | | \$1 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|--|--|-----------|-----------|-------------------|
| No Bid * 3-531 | Sign Posts, Lot of 65-70 Wooden Some treated/painted, some broken, 4"w x 6"d x 8 to 14'h approximately, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Fair | | \$1 | |
| NORTH BATTLEFORD, Highways 502 114th Street. | | | | |
| Contact Mark Eisenkirch 306-526-9103, mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| 4,361.00 3-529 | Trailer, 2000JC 20 ton, GVW 18,000 kgs, rear axle tandem, tires dual, tire size 255/70R22.5, ply 10yellowPROBLEMS: Surface rust, poor paint/body exterior, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | | \$2,500 | 2J9B7A4C6YK001179 |
| 8,575.00 3-528 | Trailer, 2006Majestik 20 ton equipment, GVW 21,160 kgs, rear axle tandem, tires dual, tire size 255/70R22.5, ply 12yellow43,794 kmRecent Repairs: Routine maintenance, trailer plug shorting out correctedPROBLEMS: Surface rust, poor paint, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | 43,794 km | \$2,500 | 2M9FSA2T76R151141 |
| 5,330.00 3-527 | Trailer, 2007Majestik 20 ton equipment, GVW 21,160 kgs, rear axle tandem, tires dual, tire size 255/70R22.5yellowRecent Repairs: Routine maintenance, missing two deck boards at rear of trailer corrected.PROBLEMS: Surface rust, poor paint, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | | \$2,500 | 2M9FSA2TX7R151222 |
| NORTH BATTLEFORD, SaskBuilds and Procurement, Accommodations, 1 Jersey St (Sask Hosp). | | | | |
| Contact Dan Nahirney 306-440-4144, dan.nahirney@gov.sk.ca. | | | | |
| No Bid * 1-849 | Water Meter, Neptune Tru/Flo 6 inch Compound Meter 5 years old with 5 years warranty left, comes with strainer and TRICONE 420, TRICON E (4-20MA) XMITTERS, operational. Good | | \$5,000 | |
| No Bid * 1-850 | Water Meter, Neptune Tru/Flo 6 inch Compound Meter 5 years old with 5 years warranty left, comes with strainer and TRICONE 420, TRICON E (4-20MA) XMITTERS, operational. Good | | \$5,000 | |
| PREECEVILLE Corrections Policing and Public Safety, 239 Highway ave east PO Box 1028, S0A 3B0 | | | | |
| Contact Johnny Petryshyn office 306 547 5663 or cell 306 547 7530, johnny.petryshyn@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| 82.75 3-534 | Boat Motor, 2007Mercury 50 HP4 stroke gas Outboard, 3 prop propellerblackUnknownRecent Repairs: Carbs cleanedPROBLEMS: Engine was hard starting, spark plugs #3 was wet, compression test was done and found #3 to be very far off from the rest. As is. Where is | Unknown | \$1 | OTO98826 |
| PRINCE ALBERT, Highways, Northern Operations, 81 North Industrial Dr. | | | | |
| Contact Cory Palko 306-960-5152, cory.palko@gov.sk.ca. | | | | |
| No Bid * 3-559 | File Cabinet, Lateral, metal 36"w x 18"d x 69"h, 5 drawers, no keys, does not lock, some doors do not open properly. Fair | | \$1 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|---|---|-----|-----------|---------------|
| PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, Hwy #2 North, call for directions. | | | | |
| Contact Wanda Dickie 306-953-3434, wanda.dickie@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| No Bid * 2-667 | Chair, drafting 5 caster, adustable, black. Good | | \$1 | 108543.00 |
| No Bid * 2-668 | Chair, drafting 5 caster, adustable, black. Good | | \$1 | 108544.00 |
| No Bid * 2-669 | Chair, ergonomic 5 caster, adustable, arms, grey. Fair | | \$1 | 148627.00 |
| No Bid * 2-670 | Chair, ergonomic, leather 5 caster, adustable, arms, no longer being used, black. Fair | | \$1 | 148678.00 |
| REGINA, Environment, Condie Nature Area. | | | | |
| Contact Paige Collopy 306-537-8705, paige.collopy@gov.sk.ca or Curtis Kuntz 306-787-0539, curtis.kuntz@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| 326.26 3-602 | Trailer, Jolter, boat Ball hitch 2", 18' long, tires size ST205/75r14, white, side rollers, one set of rollers missing, operational. Fair | | \$1 | |
| REGINA, Corrections, Policing & Public Safety, 217 College West - 3737 Wascana Parkway. | | | | |
| Contact Cheryl McLean-Keil, 306-787-4200, cheryl.mcleankeil@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| 35.02 3-552 | Camcorder, Sony, Handycam HDR-CS210 Comes with original box, cords, cables and carry case. Lithium battery is included. Memory card has been removed. Item has not been used for a couple of years and was only used a few times. Excellent | | \$20 | 1223947.00 |
| 35.02 3-553 | Camcorder, Sony, Handycam HDR-CS210 Comes with original box, cords, cables and carry case. Lithium battery is included. Memory card has been removed. Item has not been used for a couple of years and was only used a few times. Excellent | | \$20 | 1224090.00 |
| 35.02 3-554 | Camcorder, Sony, Handycam HDR-CS210 Comes with original box, cords, cables and carry case. Lithium battery is included. Memory card has been removed. Item has not been used for a couple of years and was only used a few times. Excellent | | \$20 | 1223876.00 |
| 29.00 3-555 | DashCam, Garmin 45 Comes in original box with all cables, dash mount and camera. Instructions are included. Micro SD memory card removed. Unsure how much this was used as it looks to be in new condition. Excellent | | \$5 | 51G108448 |
| 26.50 3-556 | DashCams, Lot of 2 Garmin Dash Cam 20, Shadow Recorder Dash Cam GT680W The cables for both are included, along with extra cables for the Garmin. Good | | \$1 | 3EK006500 |
| 8.88 3-557 | Gun Cable Locks, Lot of 3 The Club Security Series - UTL881 Sealed in packages, lock comes with key. Effectively guards against the misuse of most firearms; prevents a round of ammunition from being chambered. New- Unused | | \$5 | |
| 2.00 3-558 | Media Streamer, Slingbox SB200-140 Enables you to watch TV from anywhere by turning any internet-connected computer or mobile device into a portable TV. Comes with the slingbox unit, CD rom, cables, instruction guide and the original box. Good | | \$1 | A2061209459 |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|---|---|-----|-----------|---------------|
| REGINA, Highways, Operations and Maintenance, 1610 Park Street | | | | |
| Contact Kelly Lima 306 787-4965, kelly.lima@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| No Bid * 3-560 | Benkelman Beam, Aluminum Alloy Beam with fulcrum testing device used to measure the rebound deflection of a flexible pavement. Assembled and complete beam is approximately 153"w x 4"d x 6"h; the one end has a battery powered vibration system used to improve gauge reading accuracy, dial gauge and battery not included. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-561 | Benkelman Beam, Aluminum Alloy Beam with fulcrum testing device used to measure the rebound deflection of a flexible pavement. Assembled and complete beam is approximately 153"w x 4"d x 6"h; the one end has a battery powered vibration system used to improve gauge reading accuracy, dial gauge and battery not included. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-562 | Benkelman Beam, Aluminum Alloy Beam with fulcrum testing device used to measure the rebound deflection of a flexible pavement. Assembled and complete beam is approximately 153"w x 4"d x 6"h; the one end has a battery powered vibration system used to improve gauge reading accuracy, dial gauge and battery not included. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-563 | Benkelman Beam, Aluminum Alloy Beam with fulcrum testing device used to measure the rebound deflection of a flexible pavement. Assembled and complete beam is approximately 153"w x 4"d x 6"h; the one end has a battery powered vibration system used to improve gauge reading accuracy, dial gauge and battery not included. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-564 | Benkelman Beam, Aluminum Alloy Beam with fulcrum testing device used to measure the rebound deflection of a flexible pavement. Assembled and complete beam is approximately 153"w x 4"d x 6"h; the one end has a battery powered vibration system used to improve gauge reading accuracy, dial gauge and battery not included. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-565 | Benkelman Beam, Aluminum Alloy Beam with fulcrum testing device used to measure the rebound deflection of a flexible pavement. Assembled and complete beam is approximately 153"w x 4"d x 6"h; the one end has a battery powered vibration system used to improve gauge reading accuracy, dial gauge and battery not included. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 30.00 3-566 | Dial Indicator, Mitutoyo, 2050S-11 Box included, operational. New- Unused | | \$1 | |
| 30.00 3-567 | Dial Indicator, Mitutoyo, 2050S-11 Box included, operational. New- Unused | | \$1 | |
| *WD 3-568 | Dial Indicator, Mitutoyo, 2416F-10 Box included, operational. New- Unused | | \$1 | |
| *WD 3-569 | Dial Indicator, Mitutoyo, 2416F-10 Box included, operational. New- Unused | | \$1 | |
| *WD 3-570 | Dial Indicator, Mitutoyo, 2416F-10 Box included, operational. New- Unused | | \$1 | |
| 30.00 3-571 | Dial Indicator, Mitutoyo, 2416F-10 Box included, operational. New- Unused | | \$1 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|--|---|-----|-----------|---------------|
| 30.00 3-572 | Dial Indicator, Mitutoyo, 2416F-10 Box included, operational. New- Unused | | \$1 | |
| 30.00 3-573 | Dial Indicator, Mitutoyo, 2416F-10 Box included, operational. New- Unused | | \$1 | |
| 30.00 3-574 | Dial Indicator, Mitutoyo, 2416F-10 Box included, operational. New- Unused | | \$1 | |
| 30.00 3-575 | Dial Indicator, Mitutoyo, 2416F-10 Box included, operational. New- Unused | | \$1 | |
| 30.00 3-576 | Dial Indicator, Mitutoyo, 2416F-10 Box included, operational. New- Unused | | \$1 | |
| 30.00 3-577 | Dial Indicator, Mitutoyo, 2416F-10 Box included, operational. New- Unused | | \$1 | |
| 10.02 3-578 | Dial Indicator, Mitutoyo, 2416F-10 No box, operational. Good | | \$1 | |
| REGINA, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, OHS, 6th floor 1870 Albert St | | | | |
| Contact Waneta Hardy 306-798-0312, waneta.hardy@gov.sk.ca, or Kayla Rauert 306-787-4518, kayla.rauert@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| No Bid * 3-535 | Cabinet, Wood, laminate 28 1/2"w x 40"d x 32"h, 2 drawers, 2 doors. Poor | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-518 | Calculator, Sharp Requires batteries, no paper rolls. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 5.22 3-536 | Chair, Swivel, fabric 5 castors, arms, black/grey, back is set at odd angle, could not fix. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 20.69 3-537 | Chairs, Lot of 4 Metal, fabric No wheels or arms, red/silver. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 15.44 3-538 | Chairs, Lot of 3 Swivel, fabric 5 castor, with arms, green/black. Good | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 11-553 | Desk, U-shaped, oak laminate finish A couple drawers are missing components and would need some metal bars for bracing to put together again, P-Top: 84.5"w x 41"d1 x 24"d2 x 29"h; Bridge: 42"w x 24"d x 29"h; Credenza: 84.5"w x 24.5"d x 29"h Total connected Length: 84.5"w x 106"d x 84.5"h Drawers included: 1 – 15" Box/Box/file, 1 – 15" file/file, 1 – 30" file/file, keyed alike Hutch: 106"w x 14.5"d x 68.5"h, 6 doors, keys. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-539 | File Cabinet, Metal, lateral 36"w x 18"d x 39 1/2"h, locks with one key, beige, 3 drawer. Poor | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-519 | Headset, GN2100 Base not included, unknown if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 1.01 3-520 | Headset, GN9120 With base, unknown if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 1.01 3-521 | Headset, GN9330e With base, unknown if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| S 3-522 | Headsets, Lot of 2 Jabra With base, ear piece, power cord, unsure if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| S 3-523 | Headsets, Lot of 5 Plantronics C540 With base, busy lamp, power cords, unknown if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-524 | Headsets, Lot of 2 Base not included, unknown if operational. Poor | | \$1 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|---|--|-----|-----------|---------------|
| No Bid * 3-525 | Monitor Riser, Black 15"w x 10"d. Good | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-526 | Toner Cartridge, Pitney Bowes 1630/2500 Unknown how old it is Poor | | \$1 | |
| SASKATOON, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, SCC, 910 60th St. E, Saskatoon | | | | |
| Contact Renee Pound 306-956-8817, renee.pound@gov.sk.ca or Danielle Corriveau 306-956-8869, Danielle.Corriveau@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| 440.00 3-580 | Angle, Lot of 5 Steel 2"x 3/16", 100' total length. Good | | \$407 | |
| 412.00 3-581 | Channel, Lot of 6 Steel 2", 120' total length. Good | | \$407 | |
| 760.83 3-582 | Channel, Lot of 6 Steel 3", 132' total length. Good | | \$177 | |
| No Bid * 3-583 | Flat Bar, Lot of 5 Steel 1/2" x 4", 93' total length. Good | | \$233 | |
| 72.00 3-584 | Flat Bar, Lot of 6 Steel 1/8" x 1", 120' total length. Good | | \$41 | |
| No Bid * 3-585 | Flat Bar, Steel 1" x 5", 15' total length. Good | | \$118 | |
| 266.00 3-586 | Flat Bar, Lot of 5 Steel 1/4" x 3", 93' total length. Good | | \$186 | |
| 111.00 3-587 | Flat Bar, Steel 1/4" x 6", 20' total length. Good | | \$66 | |
| 555.00 3-588 | Flat Bar, Lot of 42 Steel 3/16" x 1", forty 20' lengths, one 17' lengths and one 11' length, total 828' length. Good | | \$373 | |
| 366.00 3-589 | Flat Bar, Lot of 7 Steel 3/8" x 3", one 20' length, two 13' lengths, two, 11' lengths, one 8' length and one 9' length, total 85' length. Good | | \$43 | |
| 466.00 3-590 | Flat Bar, Lot of 4 Steel 3/8" x 4", 87' total length. Good | | \$297 | |
| No Bid * 1-723 | Freezer, Frigidaire, Upright 34"w x 30.25"d x 72"h, operational. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 108.00 3-591 | Tubing, Steel 3" x 3" x .125, square, 24' length. Good | | \$97 | |
| No Bid * 3-592 | Tubing, Lot of 38 Steel 1 1/4" x 1 1/4" x 16 gauge square, 745' length. Good | | \$529 | |
| 114.00 3-593 | Tubing, Lot of 2 Steel 2 1/2" x 2 1/2" x .125, 48' length. Good | | \$111 | |
| No Bid * 3-594 | Tubing, Steel 2 1/2" x 2 1/2" x .188, 8' length, flash removed. Good | | \$39 | |
| 210.00 3-595 | Tubing, Lot of 4 Steel 2" x 2" x .125, square, 96' length. Good | | \$182 | |
| No Bid * 3-596 | Tubing, Lot of 2 Steel 2" x 2" x .188, square, 15' length. Good | | \$42 | |
| No Bid * 3-597 | Tubing, Steel 2" x 2" x .250, square, 6' length. Good | | \$14 | |
| 112.00 3-598 | Tubing, Lot of 2 Steel 2" x 4" x .125, rectangular, 39' length. Good | | \$110 | |
| 126.00 3-599 | Tubing, Steel 3 1/2" x 3 1/2" x .25, square, 15' length. Good | | \$101 | |
| 126.00 3-600 | Tubing, Lot of 2 Steel 3" x 3" x .188, square, one 24' length & one 5' length, total 29' length. Good | | \$123 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|----------------|---|-----|-----------|---------------|
| 126.00 3-601 | Tubing, Lot of 2 Steel 4" x 4" x .188, square, one 19' length & one 8' length, total 27' length. Good | | \$123 | |
| 10.50 3-501 | Bookcases, Lot of 3 wood Cherry finish, has one adjustable shelf. 36"w x 12"d x 29" h. Poor | | \$1 | |
| 27.77 3-540 | Cart, Stainless steel 34"w x 19"d x 37 1/2"h, 3 shelves, with handle, on wheels, silver. Good | | \$1 | |
| *WD 3-541 | Chairs, Lot of 2 Metal, plastic Blue/silver, no arms. Good | | \$1 | |
| 35.50 3-542 | Chairs, Lot of 19 Metal, plastic Green/silver, no arms. Good | | \$1 | |
| 55.50 3-543 | Chairs, Lot of 25 Metal, plastic Grey/silver, no arms. Good | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-544 | Chairs, Lot of 2 Metal, plastic Purple/silver, no arms. Good | | \$1 | |
| 12.17 3-502 | Coffee Maker, Bunn 21"d x 34.5"w x 33.5"h, operational. Good | | \$1 | |
| 2.02 3-545 | CPU Bracket, Steel Black, under desk mounting. Good | | \$1 | |
| 3.03 3-503 | CPU Brackets, Lot of 2 plastic, metal CPU Holder, under desk mounting with 360 degree swivel mount for easy access to cables and ports. New- Unused | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-546 | Desk, Peppercorn, wood 68"w x 40"d x 29"h, rectangle. Good | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 1-544 | Desk, Wood, Cherry 48"w x 24"d x 29"h, with drawers. Good | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 1-545 | Desk, Wood, Cherry 48"w x 24"d x 29"h, with drawers. Good | | \$1 | |
| 16.00 3-504 | File Cabinet, CDF, lateral, metal Beige, four drawer, 36"w x 18"d 51.25"h, lockable, no key. Good | | \$1 | |
| *WD 3-505 | File Cabinet, HON, lateral, metal Beige, four drawer with lock and key, 36"wx 19.25"d x 53.25"h. Good | | \$1 | |
| 16.00 3-506 | File Cabinet, HON, lateral, metal Beige, four drawer, 36"w x 19.25"d x 53.25"h, lockable, no key. Good | | \$1 | |
| 16.00 3-507 | File Cabinet, HON, lateral, metal Beige, four drawer, 36"w x 19.25"d x 53.25"h, lockable, no key. Good | | \$1 | |
| 2.00 3-508 | File Cabinet, Superior, lateral, metal Beige, four drawer, lockable, 36"w x 18"d x 53.5"h, lockable, no key. Good | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-509 | File Cabinet, Superior, lateral, metal Beige, four drawer, lockable, 36"w x 18"d x 53.5"h, lockable, no key. Good | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-510 | File Cabinet, Superior, lateral, metal Beige, four drawer, lockable, 36"w x 18"d x 53.5" h, lockable, no key. Good | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-511 | File Cabinet, Superior, metal Beige, four drawer, lockable, 36"w x 18"d x 53.5"h, lockable, no key. Good | | \$1 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|--|--|-----|-----------|---------------|
| No Bid * 3-547 | Headset, Plantronics CO52 Power cord included, black, unknown if operational. Fair | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 1-557 | Hutch, For Desk, Wood Grey, 30"w x 14 5/16"d x 36"h, two doors with two shelves. Good | | \$1 | |
| 12.17 3-512 | Milk Dispenser, Silverking 26.25"w x 17.25"d x 31"h, operational. Good | | \$1 | |
| 44.56 3-548 | Monitor Arm System, Metal, M/Flex Silver. New- Unused | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-549 | Projector, LCD, Panasonic PT-LB50SU Not operational. Broken Repairable | | \$1 | |
| *WD 3-513 | Shelf, metal 6 shelves, 37.5"w x 15.25"d x 76"h. Good | | \$1 | |
| No Bid * 3-550 | Shelf, Omcan, metal Lid not included, operational. Good | | \$1 | |
| 11.12 3-551 | Toaster, Toast-Qwik, metal 14 1/2"w x 22 1/4"d x 13 1/2"h, silver, works intermittently. Poor | | \$1 | |
| SASKATOON, Saskatchewan Research Council, 2901 Cleveland Avenue. | | | | |
| Contact Roger Dauvin 306-385-4035 roger.dauvin@src.sk.ca | | | | |
| 202.00 3-579 | Wire, Lot of Approx 30 Accessories GXL high temperature automotive hookup wire mainly 18 g, various colour combinations, some single-colour, used to make wire harnesses. 1 partial roll, 12 g, 2 partial rolls, 16 g, several partial rolls of 20 g and 24 g, 2 partial thermocouple wire 16 g, type K and J. 3 partial rolls of wire loom tubing and 3 rolls of 1 1/2" heat shrink. Spools of partial wire, various styles. 20 g, 2 conductor shielded rubber jacketed microphone cable, tel 2pr-19 filled bdwa black, RG-8 10 g, SOL BC Duobond, 18 AWG Conductor plastic jacketed cable, and 22-2P STR TNC DATALENE O/A Beldfoil +90% TNC BRD SHD PVC JKT BLK CM. Konnect-It brand terminal blocks, covers, jumpers, 20A, 12AWG, 600V various colour. Various weather pack connectors and crimp on pins for connectors. Fair | | \$150 | |
| YORKTON, Highways, Fleet Services, 245 York Road East. | | | | |
| Contact Brian Perih 306-786-1651 brian.perih@gov.sk.ca or Ed Patzwald 306-786-1687 ed.patzwald@gov.sk.ca. | | | | |
| 165.00 3-515 | Sign Posts, Lot of 40-50 Wooden Some treated, some broken, 4"w x 6"d x 8 to 12'h approximately, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Please note lifts are now smaller to make handling safer. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 165.00 3-516 | Sign Posts, Lot of 40-50 Wooden Some treated, some broken, 4"w x 6"d x 8 to 12'h approximately, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Please note lifts are now smaller to make handling safer. Fair | | \$1 | |

| Item # | Description | Kms | Min Price | Serial Number |
|---|---|------------|-----------|-------------------|
| 165.00 3-517 | Sign Posts, Lot of 40-50 Wooden Some treated, some broken, 4"w x 6"d x 8 to 12'h approximately, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer; Ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by Ministry staff. Please note lifts are now smaller to make handling safer. Fair | | \$1 | |
| SASKATOON, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, SCC, 910 60th St. E, Saskatoon | | | | |
| Contact Renee Pound 306-956-8817, renee.pound@gov.sk.ca or Danielle Corriveau 306-956-8869, Danielle.Corriveau@gov.sk.ca | | | | |
| 14.00 3-603 | Beams, Lot of 2 Steel Both 16'1"w x 4"d x 4"h x 5/32" thick. Good | | \$1 | |
| 388.00 3-604 | Flat Bar, Lot of 40 Steel 39 pieces of steel, 59 1/4"w x 2 1/2"d x 1/4"thick, comes with cart. Good | | \$1 | |
| 7,760.00 3-605 | Forklift, Warner and Swasey 1600, Manufactured by Dahmer Steel Weight 15,200 lbs, 6375.8h, Ford engine 3 cyl, tractor # C627760, model DD311F, unit 9L2B, Engine 9K26A, | | \$1,000 | 16L4229DA |
| 10.55 3-606 | Tubing, Lot of 2 Steel 10'l x 2"w x 2"d x .125" thick. Fair | | \$1 | |
| 756.89 3-607 | Welder, Lincoln, Idealarc 250, stick operational, comes with cart. Good | | \$200 | |
| SASKATOON, Western Canada Lottery Corp, VLT Division, 1914 1st Ave North | | | | |
| Contact Curtis Adair 306-933-5425, cell 306-850-0165 or adairc@sk-wclc.com | | | | |
| *WD 3-609 | Mini Van, 2015DODGE Grand Caravan SE2WD3.3L V6 gas autoA/C, tilt, cruise, power windows/locks GVW 2495kg, cargo barrier, tire size 225/65R16, ply 4whiteTOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 293,030 kmPROBLEMS: Motor/brakes are poor, transmission/exhaust fair, dead battery, minor exterior damage > As is Where is | 293,030 km | \$1 | 2C4RDGBG6FR736048 |
| 3,555.09 3-608 | Mini Van, 2017DODGE Grand Caravan SE2WD3.3L V6 gas autoA/C, tilt, cruise, power windows/locks GVW 2495kg, cargo barrier, tire size 225/65R16, ply 4whiteTOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 309,191 kmPROBLEMS: Motor/transmission/brakes/exhaust fair, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is | 309,191 km | \$1 | 2C4RDGBG6HR582251 |