

SALE SUMMARY LIST

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-787-2238,
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.
WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.
No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number		
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles						
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.						
4,689.89	11-001	Car 2013 CHEVROLET, Impala LS, FWD, 3.6L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/locks/windows/left front seat/trunk release, keyless entry, 2 fobs, 2 keys , grey, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 234,515 km, , PROBLEMS: Both outer tie rods, rack and pinion leaking, both rear caliper pins sticking, four-wheel alignment, rockers surface rust, left tail head lamp, lower grille cracked, hood dents/scratches/chips, front bumper chips, rear bumper scrape, left side doors rust inside bottom, right rear door rust bottom inside and out, trunk lid scratches, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield multiple chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	234,515 km	\$3,173	2G1WA5E32D1253847	
Ministry Transfer to another Agency	*MT	11-002	Car 2009 CHRYSLER, Sebring LX, FWD, 2.4L Inline 4 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows/trunk release, keyless entry-2 key fobs, 2 keys Vinyl (clear) barrier between front and rear, white, PASSED SGI Inspection. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 216,691 km, , PROBLEMS: Head liner falling at rear, dome light hanging-broken, hood paint bubbling/flaking, both bumpers' chips/scratches, left rocker panel rusting, all doors rust along bottom in and out, roof small rust spots, trunk lid scratch/rust, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	216,691 km	\$1,491	1C3LC46BX9N573464
4,189.89	11-003	Car 2007 CHRYSLER, Sebring Touring , FWD, 2.7L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, fog lights, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows/left front seat/trunk release, keyless entry-2 key fobs , silver, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 228,165 km, , PROBLEMS: Rear struts, head light assembly foggy, left fog light, fuel door partially open, head liner loose, right roof rail hail, hood chips/dents/paint bubbling, both bumpers chips/scratches, left front fender scratches, left rear fender rust, right rear fender rust/scratches, left front door rust bottom inside and out, roof hail, trunk lid hail/scratches, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, left and right mirror paint chips, windshield chips, right front seat stain, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	228,165 km	\$850	1C3LC56R17N634698	
4,689.89	11-004	Car 2012 DODGE, Avenger SE, FWD, 2.4L Inline 4 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/mirrors/locks/trunk release, keyless entry-2 key fobs , red, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 254,803 km, , PROBLEMS: Power steering rack leaking, hood scratches/paint bubbling, front bumper cracked/paint chips, rear bumper scratches/scraped, left side fenders scratches/dents, right side fenders scratches, rocker panels road rash, left side doors rust at bottom/road rash, right side doors rust bottom inside/road rash, trunk lid scratches/rust, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	254,803 km	\$2,159	1C3CDZAB5CN213639	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
5,577.00 11-005	SUV 2015 JEEP, Patriot , FWD, 2.4L Inline 4 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs 5 passengers, white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 250,466 km, , PROBLEMS: Front right ball joint, tire pressure monitor system (TPMS) light on, anti-lock breaking system (ABS) light on, Codes U0125, C100A, C1073, C2116, hood chips/rust spot, front bumper scratches, left and right front door rust at inside bottom, roof rust at front above windshield, tailgate glass scratched, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	250,466 km	\$5,050	1C4NJPAB0FD274389
5,500.00 9-004	Truck 2011 DODGE, Ram 1500, 4WD, Quad Cab, 6'4" Box, 5.7L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, 4 keys Front tow hooks, grille inserts, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, side steps, has a back seat, red, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 282,028 km, , PROBLEMS: Right lower ball joints, check engine light P0513(Invalid key immobilizer) P0481(Cooling fan 2 control), alignment needed, 3rd brake light out, ignition poor, key tumbler needs to be replaced, washer nozzle, grille pitted, hood chips/paint cracked/scratches, left front fender clear coat peeling/rust, left rear fender rust/road rash, right front fender rust, right rear fender rust/road rash/dents/scratches, left rear door small rust spot, roof scratches, inside of box scratched, left rear upper cab scratched, tail gate will not open scratches/dents, right front seat worn, left front seat cushion frame visible/worn, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	282,028 km	\$4,511	1D7RV1GT4B5593485
*WD * 10-007	Truck 2013 DODGE, Ram 1500, 4WD, Quad Cab, 4.7L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry 2 key fobs, 1 key Antenna on roof, mud flaps, side steps, hood deflector, grille inserts, tow hooks, hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, headache rack with beacon/wigwags - condition unknown, box liner (buyers toolbox-condition unknown, has a back seat, blue, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 330,616 km, , PROBLEMS: Both lower ball joints need replacement, front wheels need alignment, start noise, holes in front hump and center arm rest, left side step missing pad, hood scratches, both bumpers paint peeling/chips/rust, left front fender rusted, rear right fender scratches/dents, right front fender rusted, right rear fender road rash/scratches, left front door dents, right front door dents, tailgate rust/chips/dents, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher windshield chips/scratches, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	330,616 km	\$7,216	1C6RR7FP0DS515978

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
*WD	* 9-030	Truck 2014 DODGE, Ram 2500, 4WD, Crew Cab, 6'4" Box, 5.7L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power locks/windows/mirrors, keyless entry-1 key fob Grille inserts, tow hooks, trailer receiver with tow bar, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, headache rack with beacon condition unknown, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 238,416 km, , PROBLEMS: Check engine light on code P0456 Evaporative emission control system leak (small), park assist service rear sensors, TPMS light on, left outer tie rod, all four ball joints, front wheel alignment, both head light assemblies have moisture, front middle seat belt buckle, hood chips, front bumper chips, rear bumper bent/rusted, left side fenders rusted/road rash/dents, right front fender rusted, rear right fender dented/rusted, rocker panel left paint worn, rocker panel right rusted, left and right front door dents, tailgate bent/dented/scratched/rust/molding broke, running board damaged, windshield chips, wheel wrench loose under back seat, left front mirror housing broken, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	238,416 km	\$15,802	3C6TR5CT0EG193038
*WD	* 10-009	Truck 2014 DODGE, Ram 2500, 4WD, Crew Cab, 6'4" Box, 5.7L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs Grille inserts, front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, trailer hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, headache rack, beacon, box liner, has a back seat, blue, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 283,731 km, , PROBLEMS: Check engine light on codes: P0562 battery/voltage low, P0305 cylinder 5 misfire, P0882 TCM power input, rear links, removed from service due to worn camshaft, grille broke, hood clear coat peeling/scratches/chips, front bumper rust, rear bumper dents/rust, left front fender clear coat/rust, left rear fender paint poor/dents, right side fenders paint poor/scratches/dents, rocker panels road rash, left side doors chips/scratches, right side doors rust at bottom, roof clear coat peeling/chips, tailgate dents/rust/molding broke will not open, wheel wrench loose under seat, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, left front seat worn frame visible, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	283,731 km	\$9,158	3C6TR5CT7EG207663

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
*WD	* 11-006	Truck 1999 DODGE, Ram 3500, RWD, Quad Cab, 8.0L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated mirrors, 1 key HD rear bumper with ball and 2" receiver trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, rack on box with beacon light bar-condition unknown, in back seat area-computer equipment and power inverter, equipment needed for overhead console controls, screen-front seat and head liner, program functionality -condition unknown, dual rear wheels, has a back seat. Trailer was used for skid testing and research work for highways, also used it to monitor bridges throughout the province as well, it had a gas generator as well as compressor, it has a positive displacement pump which is connected to the drive shaft and also had a 250 gallon water tank in the box, the trailer that comes with it would hold water in its tank and would have sensors to test skid resistance, it is a 2,000lb trailer which is still operation, white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 104,252 km, , PROBLEMS: Left front wheel inner tread below spec, high beam bulbs do not work, one high mount brake bulb is out, needs both front mud flaps, wipers and washer do not work, grille chrome peeling, hood chips/scratches, left rear fender flare road rash, right rear fender flare-scratches/road rash, right front door rust at bottom, tailgate chips/small dents, spare tire mounted in box, wheel wrench loose under back seat, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, left front seat ripped/worn. Windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>. As is, Where is	104,252 km	\$2,850	1B7MC33W7XJ602974
4,003.00	9-027	Truck 2015 DODGE, Ram 3500, 4WD, Crew Cab, 5.7L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry Grille inserts, tow hooks, side steps (beat), headache rack with beacon condition unknown, box liner, box rail guards, hitch with trailer bar, electric trailer brakes, trailer tow mirrors (heated), 8 foot box, white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 405 288 km, , PROBLEMS: Both front upper ball joints, passenger side exhaust manifold leak, both front mud flaps, grille broke, hood chips/dents, front bumper rust spots, rear bumper rusted/dents, left front fender dent, rear left fender dents/scratches, right front fender rust, rear right fender multiple dents, left rocker panel paint wore off, right side doors small rust spots, roof dents, tailgate bent/dented/missing molding/will not open, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>. As is, Where is	405 288 km	\$3,627	3C63R3GT7FG592691

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
4,513.00 10-010	Truck 2010 FORD, F250, RWD, Extended Cab, 8' box, 6.4L V8 diesel, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power locks/front windows, keyless entry-1 key, 1 fob Grille inserts, tow hooks, side steps, headache rack, hitch, trailer wiring, trailer tow mirrors, has a back seat, grey, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 294,070 km, , PROBLEMS: Park brake does not hold rear brake pads below spec, all 4 tires are below tread spec, left front exhaust manifold bolt broken, both battery under hood are missing hold downs, left rear mud flap missing, right rear backing plate missing, front wheel alignment is out of spec, rear door ajar light is on, tire pressure monitor light fault, front brakes are 4mm and rear brakes are 3mm - both need repair, washer fluid does not work and some hoses are broken, windshield is cracked, left front signal bulb/both reverse bulbs/right front marker bulb/left front low beam bulb/both plate bulbs are all burnt out, both tail lights broke, hood chips, front bumper rust spots, rear bumper bent/pad loose, left fenders road rash/badly rusted, right fenders road rash/rusted/dented, left front door paint peeling/not aligned to left front, left rear door rust along bottom, right rear door paint peeling at bottom, roof rust spots, tailgate badly damaged, spare tire in box flat, both side mirrors housing cracked/broke, tires poor, left front seat cover ripped/worn, missing wheel wrench/jack, no first aid/fire extinguisher, both cab corners rust, glove box latch broken, missing dash trim, holes in rear mat floor pan, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	294,070 km	\$4,504	1FTSX2AR0A01456
7,221.00 11-007	Truck 2013 FORD, F250 Super Duty, 4WD, Crew Cab, 6.7L V8 Powerstroke diesel, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated trailer tow mirrors, power windows/locks/mirrors, left front seat, keyless entry, 2 key fobs Front and rear wigwags, amber beacon, headache rack, front tow hooks, hood deflector, hitch, OEM trailer brakes, has a back seat, blue, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 406,415 km, , PROBLEMS: Right rear brake caliper bolt missing, park brake doesn't hold and cable broken, drag link excessive movement at pitman arm, track bar ball joint excessive movement, exhaust leak at rear of engine, front wheel alignment out of spec, trailer power cord badly damaged, three of four mud flaps missing, right reverse lamp and left high beam not operational, plate lamps broken from rear bumper and fog lamps missing, ABS lamp/red brake lamp and traction control lamps illuminated, radio antenna missing, left and right box sides cracked/holes, right step bent, left step loose, hood scratches/dents, rear bumper dented/pad screwed down, left front fender rusted, left rear fender rusted/dented/scratched/road rash, right front fender rusted, right rear fender rusted/dented/scratched/road rash, all doors side doors chips/dents/scratches/rust, roof two antenna's holes are sealed, tailgate dented/rusted/scratched, spare tire missing, wheel wrench loose under back seat, jack missing, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, right mirror housing cracked, windshield cracked, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	406,415 km	\$3,820	1FT7W2BT0DEA25425

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number	
*WD	* 10-011	Truck 2009 GMC, Sierra 3500, 4WD, Crew Cab, 8' Box, 6.0L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks, 2 keys Grille inserts, tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, headache rack, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 351,376 km, , PROBLEMS: No back up lights, passenger side wiper arm, front of box dented/bent, both box rails badly dented, holes drill in rear trim panels, holes in rear floor pan, hood stone chips/dents, front bumper rust spots, rear bumper dented/pad loose, left front fender rusted, rear right fender rusted/dented, right front fender rusted, rear right fender rusted/dented, left rear door rusted at bottom, roof rust spots, tailgate rust/bents/molding broke, spare tire missing, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	351,376 km	\$9,325	1GTHK73K79F161653	
Ministry Transfer to another Agency	*MT	11-008	Van 2008 CHEVROLET, Uplander, FWD, 3.9L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, power front windows, power locks/mirrors, keyless entry-1 fob, 2 keys 7 passenger, 2 captain chairs rear bench seat, brown, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 205,424 km, , PROBLEMS: Rear shocks, all pads and rotors, alignment, both front windows don't roll down properly, right windshield wash nozzle broke, head lights fogged, left front molding loose, left front inside panel loose, hood scratches/chips, both bumpers scratches/chips, left front fender road rash/rust, right front fender road rash/rust, dog leg road rash, left front door rust at bottom, tailgate rust/scratches, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	205,424 km	\$3,580	1GNDU23W18D164063
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.						
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.						
	No Bid	* 7-101	Bench Seat, Grey. Cloth fabric. 52"w x 28"dPoor		\$1	
	No Bid	* 7-102	Bench Seat, Grey. Cloth fabric. 52"w x 28"dPoor		\$1	
	1.63	11-103	Casters, Lot of 5 Plastic Each caster is mounted on an 8' metal bracket, maybe suitable for a Toshiba 47068 copier.Good		\$1	
	No Bid	* 8-102	Floor Mats, Lot of 4 OEM, Nissan Leaf, Black fabric 2 front, 2 rear, Leaf logo on front mats, may be compatible with 2022 Nissan Leaf. Excellent		\$35	
	No Bid	* 8-103	Floor Mats, Lot of 3 OEM, Ram, Black fabric 2 front, 1 full rear, with Ram logo on all mats, may be compatible with 2020 Ram Tradesman crew cab. Excellent		\$35	
	No Bid	* 8-104	Floor Mats, Lot of 3 OEM, Ram, Black fabric 2 front, 1 full rear, with Ram logo on all mats, may be compatible with other 2020 Ram Tradesman crew cab.Excellent		\$35	
	No Bid	* 10-116	Floor Mats, Lot of 2 Rear, OEM fabric, grey May be compatable with years 2004-2009 Dodge Durago.Good		\$5	
	No Bid	* 10-117	Floor Mats, Lot of 2 Rear, OEM fabric, grey May be compatable with years 2004-2009 Dodge Durago.Good		\$5	
	No Bid	* 9-186	Furniture Legs, Approx 45 Metal 8 1/2", adjustable. Good		\$1	
	No Bid	* 11-101	Monitor and Processor, Robot MV96E, 16 channel processor, Speco VM10LCD Monitor. Mounted on a aluminium bracket. No remote control. Condition unknown for both items.Poor		\$15	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
*WD	* 11-102		\$20	
	Monitor Mount, Gamber Johnson Heavy metal construction, may not be complete.Fair			
3.00	9-208		\$1	
	Nails, 2 1/2 Gallon Pail 2 1/2". New - Unused			
No Bid	* 11-110		\$50	
	Tailgate, OEM. Chev. Silverado. May be compatible with 2004 or newer 1500, 2500 or 3500, yellow in color, bent, molding broke, scratches, lettering poor, missing support cables, top guard is damaged.Poor			
No Bid	* 11-111		\$200	
	Tailgate, OEM. GMC Sierra. May be compatible with 2004 or newer 1500, 2500 or 3500, minor scuffs and scratches, yellow in color.Good			
No Bid	* 10-120		\$100	437,944
	Tire, LT265/70R16, Artic Claw. Winter XSI. Snowflake, M+S. Mounted on a steel rim. May fit a 2012 Dodge Ram 1500. Manufacture date. Week 21, year 2012. Excellent			
No Bid	* 9-123		\$40	
	Tire, 245/75R/17 Bravo A/T Maxis 771. NO RIM. FOR TEMPORARY USE ONLY. Manufacture date. Week 07, year 2022.Excellent			
134.56	11-105		\$120	
	Tires, Set of 4 215/65R/16 Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow flake. M+S Manufacture date. Week 22, year 2018.Fair			
130.00	11-106		\$120	
	Tires, Set of 4 225/55R/17 Firestone All Season. M+S Manufacture date. Week 28, year 2020.Fair			
195.75	11-107		\$160	
	Tires, Set of 4 225/60R/16 Firestone All Season. M+S Manufacture date. Week 32, year 2019.Good			
No Bid	* 11-108		\$160	
	Tires, Set of 4 235/65R/16 Continental Vancontact A/S. M+S Manufacture date. Week 32, year 2018.Good			
42.02	11-109		\$40	
	Tires, Set of 4 P215/60R/17 Firestone FR710. M+S Manufacture date. Week 05, year 2014.Poor			
195.75	11-112		\$160	
	Tires, Set of 4 215/65R/16 Firestone All Season. M+S Manufacture date. Week 39, year 2021.Good			
No Bid	* 11-113		\$120	
	Tires, Set of 4 225/65R/17 Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X. M+S Manufacture date. Week 34, year 2017.Fair			
No Bid	* 11-104		\$200	
	Truck Topper, White, fiberglass, Leer Brand 6 ft wide, 8 ft long. Has 2 keys, lock condition unknown, wig wags and beacon at rear-condition unknown. Removed from a 2008 Ford F350 crew cab. Rear top left corner has a crack.Fair			
No Bid	* 11-143		\$1	
	Chair, grey cloth, no arms task Fair			
No Bid	* 9-129		\$1	
	Chair, swivel, metal, cloth brown, four wheels.Good			
No Bid	* 1-104		\$1	
	Floor Mats - Front, GM Original Equipment Manufacturer (OEM), rubber, light grey in colour May be compatible with Chevrolet Astro.Excellent			
No Bid	* 6-127		\$5	
	Winter Front / Bug Screen, For a 2007 2008 Dodge Durango, Via WF 929-57 Snaps may be missing.Good			

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
GREENWATER LAKE Parks Culture and Sport, Maintenance Compound				
Contact Jeff Hingtgen (306) 278-8067, jeff.hingtgen@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 9-621	Ladder Rack , Steel Came off of Dodge Caravan, mounts not included. Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 9-624	Refrigerator, Kenmore Unknown if operational. Poor		\$1	
36.79 9-627	Truck Box Topper, Raider Brand, Fiberglass Construction Came off of Chevrolet Colorado ext. cab, rear hatch missing. Poor		\$1	1278835 76CCVAG
No Bid * 9-628	Water Heater, Commercial, A.O. Smith, BTRC199 118 Natural gas heated, 81 U.S. gallon capacity. Drained and removed from campground service center in 2014. Unsure if operational. Poor		\$1	0842M000406
MAKWA Lake, Parks, Culture & Sport, 39 Golf Course RD				
Contact Barry Rogers 306-837-2141, barry.rogers@gov.sk.ca				
2,203.00 11-547	Car, 2005CHRYSLER Sebring TouringFWD2.7L V6 gas autoA/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD, power locksgreyTOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 134,831 kmPROBLEMS: Broken lug nuts on driver front tire, not drivable, battery is dead minor exterior damage.>As is, Where is	134,831 km	\$1,000	1C3EL56R45N652280
MEADOW LAKE, Parks, Culture & Sport, NW-33-62-18-W3, Box 70, Dorintosh, SK, S0M 0T0				
Contact Rick Gollings 306-236-7680, rick.gollings@gov.sk.ca				
7,788.00 11-571	Tractor, 1981Motor Grader 4WD671 Detroit V6 diesel auto8 speed, 3 axles, tire size 17-5R25, tire ply, 12, newer tiresyellowPROBLEMS: The hydraulics are slow, poor brakes, exhaust, body and paint, lights and horn condition unknown, poor battery, and battery cables need replacing, minor exterior damage.>As is, Where is		\$500	740-21-1385-14558
1,103.00 11-572	Truck, 2005FORD F250 Super Duty2WD, Super Cab7.3L V8 diesel autoA.C, tilt, cruisesingle tire, tire size, LT245/75R17whiteTOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 308,962 kmPROBLEMS: This unit was having issues with the glow plugs and could not be started. It has been sitting for about 4-5 years. Poor tires, interior, paint, poor battery, brakes, exhaust, windshield washer, wipers and lights all unknown condition, minor exterior damage.>As is, Where is	308,962 km	\$100	1FTSX20P25EC68779
MELVILLE, Saskatchewan Crop Insurance Corporation, PO Box 3000				
Contact Lindsey Pringle 639-398-2289, lindsey.pringle@scica				
No Bid * 11-574	Chairs, Lot of 8 Black, with arms and casters.Excellent		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
MOOSE JAW, Highways & Infrastructure, Fleet Services, 1 km south of Moose Jaw on Highway #2.				
Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca				
1,300.00	11-570	Pavement Stripper, 1988FORD CF80002WD7.8L inline diesel standardCaboverpaint tanks, rear cab, single axle, standard differential, dual tire, tire size 11R22.5yellow1988, FORD HEAVY VEHICLE, Truck373,452 kmPROBLEMS: Transmission jumps out and or locks into gear - undiagnosed issue, parts not avialable. Several items removed over the years. Engine hasn't been run in 4 years but was running when parked. Poor motor, transmission, tires, brakes, exhaust, windshield/washer/wipers, paint, interior and mirrors. Lights and horn not working. Poor battery and minor exterior damage. As is, Where is	373,452 km	\$1,000 9BFYH81AXJDM00505
3,403.00	11-569	Tractor, 1986Case, Loader 580E2WDInline 4 - 390 diesel powershift63 hp4 speed, standard differential, single tireyellowunknown kmPROBLEMS: Cab rusted out, door rusted out ready to km fall off, side shields missing, multiple leaks, motor, transmission, tires, brakes, battery, exhaust, windshield glass and interior all in poor condition, windshield washer, wipers, lights and horn not in working condition, exterior and body paint rusted.As is, Where is	unknown	\$800 17,040,120
*MT	11-565	Snow Blower Attachment, 2000 Schulte, 1100 Center fan recently replaced, driveshaft is missing, Unknown if operational.poor		\$50 B88090056908
500.00	11-568	Tires , Lot of 6 Continental Hybrid HS3, 225/70/R19.5 New take offs, used 250km.Good		\$500
203.00	11-566	V - Snow Plow, 1958, Champion Unknown if operational.Poor		\$50 58-924
203.00	11-567	V - Snow Plow, 1966, Frink It is operational but may need repairs, hasn't been used in years, it would have been installed on a grader, buyer would have to fabricate there own mounting for whatever they plan to install it on, yellow.Fair		\$1
NARROW HILLS PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks Culture and Sport, at lower fishing lake. All items are located at the maintenance compound.				
Contact Janelle Franc 306-426-2625 or janelle.franc@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	9-595	RV Toilet and Sinks, Lot of 2 Assorted chimney pieces, unknown condition.Poor		\$1
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Avenue North				
Contact Brent Zbaraschuk 306-953-2428, brent.zbaraschuk@gov.sk.ca or Marlowe Rouault, marlowe.rouault2@gov.sk.ca				
5.66	11-502	Bags, Approx. 20 Canvas Yellow, used to haul fire camp tents, tents not included, approx dimensions 14" x 11" x 25", might have rips, holes and frays.Poor		\$1
8.00	11-503	Bags, Approx. 20 Canvas Yellow, used to haul fire camp tents, tents not included, approx dimensions 14" x 11" x 25", might have rips, holes and frays.Poor		\$1
7.77	11-504	Dishes, Lot of 607 Plastic 4".New- Unused		\$1
888.00	11-505	Hose, Lot of 58 Fire 1.5" dia x 100'l, 1/4 turn connector, purculating hose.New- Unused		\$250
25.00	11-506	Hose, Lot of 100 Fire, various sizes Less than 50', most without 3/4" turn quick connect, couplings have been removed.Fair		\$1
10.00	11-507	Hose, Approx. 100 Wildfire 1.5" dia, various lengths up too 100', most without 1/4 turn quick connect, has been culled due to holes, tears and burns.Poor		\$1

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
20.00 11-508	Hose, Approx. 100 Wildfire 1.5" dia, various lengths up too 100', most without 1/4 turn quick connect, has been culled due to holes, tears and burns.Poor		\$1	
5.00 11-509	Hose, Approx. 100 Wildfire 1.5" dia, various lengths up too 100', most without 1/4 turn quick connect, has been culled due to holes, tears and burns.Poor		\$1	
4.00 11-510	Hose, Approx. 100 Wildfire 1.5" dia, various lengths up too 100', most without 1/4 turn quick connect, has been culled due to holes, tears and burns.Poor		\$1	
6.00 11-511	Hose fittings, Approx. 75 Plastic Various 3/4" with shut off valve. Good		\$1	
22.50 11-512	Mess Kits, Lot of 3 Homemade, assorted Various numbers, but items include plastic cups, bowls, plates, metal knives, forks, spoons, and kitchen cleaning supplies such as soap, clothes. Some kits may have items missing.Good		\$1	
26.00 11-513	Mess Kits, Lot of 3 Homemade, assorted Various numbers, but items include plastic cups, bowls, plates, metal knives, forks, spoons, and kitchen cleaning supplies such as soap, clothes. Some kits may have items missing.Good		\$1	
27.50 11-514	Pans , Lot of 13 Cast Iron 10", rusted.Fair		\$1	
14.00 11-522	Silverware, Lot of 720 Metal, teaspoons New- Unused		\$1	
14.00 11-515	Sprinkler Boxes, Lot of 12 Plastic 0.25" , red, apporoximately 16"d x 30"w x 12"h. culled due to age and wear.Poor		\$1	
22.00 11-516	Sprinkler Boxes, Lot of 10 Plastic 0.25" , red, apporoximately 16"d x 30"w x 12"h. culled due to age and wear.Poor		\$1	
18.00 11-517	Sprinkler Boxes, Lot of 12 Plastic with lids 0.25" , red, apporoximately 16"d x 30"w x 12"h. culled due to age and wear.Broken Repairable		\$1	
2.66 11-518	Sprinkler Boxes, Lot of 12 Plastic with lids 0.25" , red, apporoximately 16"d x 30"w x 12"h. culled due to age and wear.Poor		\$1	
24.00 11-519	Sprinkler Boxes, Lot of 12 Plastic with lids 0.25" , red, apporoximately 16"d x 30"w x 12"h. culled due to age and wear.Poor		\$2	
22.00 11-520	Tarps, Lot of 40 Plastic, various sizes May have holes, tears or frayed stiching.Fair		\$1	
15.00 11-521	Tarps, Lot of 40 Plastic, various sizes May have holes, tears or frayed stiching.Fair		\$1	
120.00 11-523	Tents, Lot of 20 Plastic 8' x 16' with one zipper end entry, may have holes, tears or broken zippers.Broken Repairable		\$1	
22.76 11-524	Tents, Lot of 20 Plastic 8' x 16' with one zipper end entry, may have holes, tears or broken zippers.Broken Repairable		\$1	
5.66 11-525	Tents, Lot of 20 Plastic 8' x 16' with one zipper end entry, may have holes, tears or broken zippers.Broken Repairable		\$1	
10.00 11-526	Tents, Lot of 20 Plastic 8' x 16' with one zipper end entry, may have holes, tears or broken zippers.Broken Repairable		\$1	
7.66 11-527	Tents, Lot of 20 Plastic 8' x 16' with one zipper end entry, may have holes, tears or broken zippers.Broken Repairable		\$1	
7.66 11-528	Tents, Lot of 20 Plastic 8' x 16' with one zipper end entry, may have holes, tears or broken zippers.Broken Repairable		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
44.44 11-529	Tents, Lot of 20 Plastic 8' x 16' with one zipper end entry, may have holes, tears or broken zippers. Broken Repairable		\$1	
7.00 11-530	Warning Diamonds, Lot of 9 Reflective Bright orange, 6" w x 4" h. 75 per box. Excellent		\$1	
4.00 11-531	Water Barriers , Lot of 7 Vinyl Approx 20 gallons, unknown condition. Poor		\$1	
4.00 11-532	Water Packs, Approx. 26 Soft, plastic and vinyl Culled from the wildfire program, may have leaks or rusted parts. Fair		\$1	
6.00 11-533	Water Storage bags , Lot of 3 Relay, various sizes 60 to 150 gallons, condition unknown. Poor		\$1	
3,100.00 11-573	Truck, 2011 FORD F1504WD, Super Crew Cab 5.0L V8 gas AutoAir, cruise, tilt, power windows/door lockstopper, single tire, tire size LT265/70R17 blackTOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. 347,219 km Recent Repairs: 12/15/2022 Installed A/C compressor and service components, installed rear shocks/left front tie rod/shift cable/wheel alignment. PROBLEMS: Rebuild of the rear differential, colling system needs repair, poor battery, minor exterior damage. >As is, Where is	347,219 km	\$2,000	1FTFW1EF7BFB06683
REGINA, Agriculture Crops and Irrigation, 125-3085 Albert St				
Contact Laura Berriault 306-787-8034, laura.berriault@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 11-534	Fax Macine, RICOH, 3320L Operational, grey, 2 drawer, 19.5" w x 17" d x 21.5" h. Good		\$1	3,598,600,731
100.01 11-535	Paper Shredder, Shredmaster 5550X Operational, grey and silver, front door, 24" w x 19" d x 37" h. Good		\$1	SI24204J
100.01 11-536	Paper Shredder, Destroyit 3803 Operational, grey, front door, 24" w x 19" d x 37" h. Good		\$1	2,966,959
REGINA, Conflict of Interest Commissioner, 630-1855 Victoria Avenue				
Contact Sandra Arberry 306-787-0800, sarberry@saskcoic.ca				
*WD 11-561	Bookshelf, Cherrywood no damage; 72" w x 13" d x 30" h Good		\$20	
111.00 11-562	Desk, Executive, Cherrywood Some surface damage; 72" w x 30" d x 36" h. Good		\$20	
421.00 11-563	File Cabinets, Lot of 2 Cherrywood all drawers open and close smoothly, missing the interior brackets, no keys, 36" w x 19" d x 30" h Good		\$20	
421.00 11-564	Hutch and Credenza, Executive, Cherrywood hutch 69" w x 14" d x 45" h, minor damage to drawers, credenza 69" w x 20.5" d x 30" h Good		\$20	
REGINA, Highways, Operations and Maintenance, 1610 Park Street				
Contact Kelly Lima 306 787-4965, kelly.lima@gov.sk.ca or Iriny Moawad 306-519-3560, iriny.moawad2@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 11-539	Pavement Testing Tire, ASTM E501 Used for pavement testing, tread, 2 ply polyester and 2 plies fiber glass sidewall, 2 ply polyester. Fair		\$1	
728.80 11-537	Profilograph, Computer and Sensors, 1989 JamesCox and Sons Full aluminum frame assembled is 25', computer was operational when stored indoors in 2000. Push type Profiligraph, rigid frame, center profiling wheel, and support wheels, not sure if computer hardware works, as seen in the picture there are 3 parts, 2 identical end parts and 1 middle part. Approx. dimensions for 2 end parts, 8' l x 1.5' w x 2.5' d, approx. dimensions for 1 middle part, 8' l x 1.5' w x 2.5' d. Fair		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
2,156.80 11-538	Profilograph, Computer, Sensors and Trailer, 1989 JamesCox and Sons Full aluminum frame assembled is 25', computer was operational when stored indoors in 2000. Push type Profiligraph, rigid frame, center profiling wheel, and support wheels, not sure if computer works, as seen in the picture there are 3 parts, 2 identical end parts and 1 middle part. Approx. dimensions for 2 end parts, 8'1 x 1.5'w x 2.5'd. Approx. dimensions for 1 middle part: 8'1 x 1.5'w x 2.5'd.Fair		\$1	
303.00 11-540	Trailer, 1984, Homebuilt Originally made by PURD as a testing trailer then was modified to measure tire sound levels. Approx. dimensions: 5'l x 6.5'w x 3.5'h.Fair		\$50	
REGINA, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, OHS, 6th floor 1870 Albert Street				
Contact Waneta Hardy 306-798-0312, waneta.hardy@gov.sk.ca, or Kayla Rauert 306-787-4518, kayla.rauert@gov.sk.ca				
15.00 11-541	Back Cushion, Black, cloth Used, for chair.Fair		\$1	
31.63 11-542	Book Case, Cherry laminate finish Shelving, closed doors on bottom, 30"w x 15"d x 72"h.Good		\$1	
No Bid * 11-548	Chair, 5 castor, arms, black fabric high back, arms ripped.Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 11-549	Chair, 5 castor, wheels, arms, black fabric Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 11-550	Chair, 5 castor, wheels, arms, black fabric, mesh back Is missing one arm.Broken Repairable		\$1	
51.27 11-551	Desk, Pepperdust finish 72"w x 36"d x 29.5"h regular.Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 11-552	Desk, U-shaped, slate grey finish, Side with lateral is 23.25"w x 71"d, side with 3 drawer is 71"w X 29.7"d, keyboard tray area 19.75"d X 29"w; total one direction is 71.1"w x 92.4"d x 30"h,one set of drawers would need repair and metal braces.Broken Repairable		\$1	
*WD	* 11-553	Desk, U-shaped, oak laminate finish A couple drawers are missing components and would need some metal bars for bracing to put together again, P-Top: 84.5"w x 41"d1 x 24"d2 x 29"h; Bridge: 42"w x 24"d x 29"h; Credenza: 84.5"w x 24.5"d x 29"h Total connected Length: 84.5"w x 106"d x 84.5"h Drawers included: 1 – 15" Box/Box/file, 1 – 15" file/file, 1 – 30" file/file, keyed alike Hutch: 106"w x 14.5"d x 68.5"h, 6 doors, keys.Broken Repairable	\$1	
17.50 11-543	Desk, Wood finish, Keyboard tray, hard drive compartment, 2 shelves, 34"w x 20"d x 30"h.Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 11-554	Desk, Wood laminate finish 66"w x 30"d x 29.5"h regular, left attached pedestal.Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 11-544	Keyboard Tray, Black Wrist rest damaged.Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 11-545	Speaker, Black Docking station, unknown if operational.Fair		\$1	
*MT	11-555	Table, Grey finish 60"d when open, leaf 24"d, middle 12"d, 30"h, has wheels, 4 castor 60"w x 36"d x 30"h.Good	\$1	
No Bid * 11-546	Table, Metal legs, wood laminate Round, 48"d X 30.5"h.Fair		\$1	
REGINA, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, Corporate Services, 1870 Albert St.				
Contact Waneta Hardy 306-798-1353, waneta.hardy@gov.sk.ca, or Lianne Woulfe 306-787-2456, lianne.woulfe@gov.sk.ca, or Derek Wagner 306-787-1869, derek.wagner@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 9-543	Keyboard Platform, pepper dust finish Needs new hydraulics, keyboard for 3 piece desk, not curvilinear run-offsBroken Repairable		\$1	
No Bid * 9-544	Keyboard Trays, Lot of 2 black UsedPoor		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
7.00 11-575	Chairs, Lot of 7 5 castor, black, arms, leather finish Some scuffs, hydraulics and stability issues, all fixable. Broken Repairable		\$1	
No Bid * 11-576	Chair, 5 castor, black, arms, mesh back Missing a wheel. Broken Repairable		\$1	
No Bid * 11-577	File Cabinets, Lot of 2 metal, beige 4 Drawer lateral; 36"w X 18"d x 51.5"h, 5 Drawer lateral; 36"w X 18"d X 66"h. Fair		\$1	
44.44 11-578	File Cabinets, Lot of 4 Metal, beige, 4 drawer vertical, 3 - 28"w X 18"d X 52"h, beige 1 - 28"w X 18"d X 50"h, no keys. Fair		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid * 11-579	Keyboard Platform, Lot of 2 Pepperdust finish, diamond pattern 3 piece curve linear desk, will not stay in place. Broken Repairable		\$1	
SASKATOON, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, SCC, 910 60th street East, Saskatoon				
Contact Renne Pound 306-956-8177, renee.pound@gov.sk.ca or Danielle Corriveau 306-956-8869, Danielle.Corriveau@gov.sk.ca.				
No Bid * 10-502	Cabinet, Wood White with hanger rod, 36.5"w x 18"d x 66.25"h. Fair		\$1	
3.85 7-528	Respirator, 3M, 6100/07024 (AAD) Small Package opened, half facepiece, reusable. No expiry and used. Good		\$1	
SASKATOON, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, Employment Standards, 122 3rd Ave N				
Contact Karen Paulson 306-533-5295, karen.paulson@gov.sk.ca or Sandy Falk 306-933-5395, sandra.falk@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 11-556	Chair, 5 castor, wheels High back, arms have been removed will be sold with chair. Poor		\$1	
25.00 11-557	Chair, 5 castor, wheels, one green fabric Stained. Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 11-558	Desk, Pepperdust finish, metal legs 36"w x 24"d x 30"h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 9-516	File Cabinet, 4 drawer, vertical 18"l x 36"w x 52"h, no keys, grey. Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 9-517	File Cabinet, 5 drawer, lateral 36"l x 18"w x 62"h, no keys, beige. Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 11-559	Pedestal, Metal 2 drawer, no keys, 13"w x 21.5"d x 27.25"h. Fair		\$1	
*WD 11-560	Table, Pepperdust finish, black base Round, 42"d x 29.5"h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 9-519	Table, wood grain laminate, metal legs 54"l x 27"w x 29"h. Fair		\$1	
SASKATOON, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, Labour Relations and Mediation, 841 122 3rd Ave N				
Contact Shauna Altman 306-787-0817, shauna.altman@gov.sk.ca or Kristin Anderson 306-933-5880, kristin.anderson@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 9-547	Monitor Stand, metal, black Good		\$1	
No Bid * 9-574	Office Supplies, Misc Mesh file holders, desk organizers, document holders -black Good		\$1	
No Bid * 9-575	Table, Wood, square 29"l x 29"l x 19"h. Poor		\$1	
TISDALE, Agriculture Pastures, Regional Services Branch, Box 1480, 1105 99 Street.				
Contact Teresa Casavant 306-878-8842 teresa.casavant@gov.sk.ca				
60.00 11-501	Forage Probes, Metal Used condition, 23 and 24 inches. Poor		\$1	