

## **SALE SUMMARY LIST**

**PLEASE NOTE:** Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit [www.SaskSurplus.ca](http://www.SaskSurplus.ca) for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with \* have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on [www.SaskSurplus.ca](http://www.SaskSurplus.ca) web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from [www.SaskSurplus.ca](http://www.SaskSurplus.ca) or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-787-2238,
- by email to [sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca](mailto:sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca), or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

**MT = (Ministry Transfer)** This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.

**WD = (Withdrawn)** This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.

**No Bid =** Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles</b>				
<b>Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.</b>				
<b>4,679.00</b>	<b>10-001</b> Car 2009 CHRYSLER, CHRYSLER SEBRING LX 4DR, FWD, 2.4L Inline 4 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, heated power mirrors, power locks/windows/trunk release, keyless entry-2 key fobs-2 keys , Silver, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 201,349 km , , PROBLEMS: Headliner falling at rear, both headlights are fogged, hood scratches/paint bubbling, front and rear bumpers have cracks/scratches, front left fender is scratched, all four doors have rust/scratches/dents, roof has small rust spots, trunk has scratches, windshield has small chips, no first aid/fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	201,349 km	\$1,711	1C3LC46B69N573431
<a href="#">Ministry Transfer to another Agency</a>	<b>*MT</b> <b>*MT</b> <b>10-002</b> Car 2009 CHRYSLER, Sebring LX 4DR, FWD, 2.4L Inline 4 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs , silver, PASSED SGI Inspection. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 208,508 km , , PROBLEMS: Hood paint bubbling/scratched, both bumpers' scratches/chips, left front door rust, left rear door dent/rust, right front door dent/scraped, right side doors rust inside bottom, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, winds shield small chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	208,508 km	\$2,179	1C3LC46B89N573446
<b>5,495.50</b>	<b>10-003</b> Car 2011 DODGE, Avenger SE, FWD, 2.4L Inline 4 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/windows/mirrors/trunk release, keyless entry-2 key fobs , black, PASSED SGI Inspection. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 221,501 km , , PROBLEMS: Wiper blades need replacement, grille pitted/scratched, hood paint bubbling/scratches, bumpers chips/scratches, left front fender scratches, left rear fender rust, right rear fender scrape/rust, dog legs rusted/road rash, left front door rusts/dents, left rear door road rash, roof dent/scratches/rust, trunk lid scratches/rust, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	221,501 km	\$4,002	1B3BD4FB8BN507541
<b>2,299.99</b>	<b>10-004</b> Suv 2009 SATURN, Vue Green line Hybrid, 2WD, 2.4L Inline 4 gas, auto, A/C, tilt cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry-2 fobs-2 keys 5 passenger, compressor/cargo cover in rear-condition unknow, no tire sealant, white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 226,155 km , , PROBLEMS: TPMS (right rear), wiper blades, previous color of unit visible in places under white paint, grille chrome peeling, hood chips, both bumpers' chips, tailgate rusted/glass scratched, OEM not supplied from manufacture, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield stone bruise/chips, left front seat missing trim, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	226,155 km	\$1,170	3GSCL93Z69S619148

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
9,876.00	10-005	Truck 2015 CHEVROLET, Silverado 1500, 4WD, Crew Cab, 5'11" Box, 5.3L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, power mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry-2 keys 2 fobs Grille inserts, tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, trailer hitch, trailer wiring OEM trailer brakes, headache rack, box liner, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 252,529 km, , PROBLEMS: Engine Misfire, potential shifting problem, drive belt, left upper ball joint, front and rear pads/rotors, alignment, all 4 tires need replacement, 3rd brake light, windshield wipers, removed from service due to potential transmission problems, small cracks left and right on front of box, hood chips/dents, front bumper chips/scratches, rear bumper dent/bent/chips, left side fenders road rash/scratches/dents, right front fender road rash, right rear fender dents/road rash/scratches, left rocker panel paint worn inside, left front door chips, left rear door dent/chips, tailgate dent/molding broke/will not open, wheel wrench and jack loose under back seat, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, left front cushion soft/worn, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	252,529 km	\$8,631	3GCUKPECFXG208303
18,601.02	10-006	Truck 2012 DODGE, 5500, RWD, Crew Cab, 9' x 7'6" Steel Dump Body, 6.7L Inline 6 diesel, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player heated power trailer mirrors, power windows/locks, 1 key fob Electric trailer brakes Waltco model DT16 lift-rusted condition unknown, side fold down on dump body, remote for dump body under back seat, grille inserts, tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, dual rear wheels, no jump seat, white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 288,705 km, , PROBLEMS: Unknown fluid leak diagnosis required, recommend not starting, service engine soon lamp on, blower fan poor air delivery, roof mounted lamp out, hood chips/dented, bumper rust spots, left front door dents, roof dents/rust spots/antenna, no spare tire/wheel wrench/jack/first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, right front seat cushion worn-ripped, back left seat hole frame exposed, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	288,705 km	\$18,592	3C7WDMEL0CG196839
*WD	* 9-004	Truck 2011 DODGE, Ram 1500, 4WD, Quad Cab, 6'4" Box, 5.7L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, 4 keys Front tow hooks, grille inserts, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, side steps, has a back seat, red, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 282,028 km, , PROBLEMS: Right lower ball joints, check engine light P0513(Invalid key immobilizer) P0481(Cooling fan 2 control), alignment needed, 3rd brake light out, ignition poor, key tumbler needs to be replaced, washer nozzle, grille pitted, hood chips/paint cracked/scratches, left front fender clear coat peeling/rust, left rear fender rust/road rash, right front fender rust, right rear fender rust/road rash/dents/scratches, left rear door small rust spot, roof scratches, inside of box scratched, left rear upper cab scratched, tail gate will not open scratches/dents, right front seat worn, left front seat cushion frame visible/worn, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	282,028 km	\$5,061	1D7RV1GT4BS593485

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number	
*WD	* 10-007	Truck 2013 DODGE, Ram 1500, 4WD, Quad Cab, 4.7L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry 2 key fobs, 1 key Antenna on roof, mud flaps, side steps, hood deflector, grille inserts, tow hooks, hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, headache rack with beacon/wigwags - condition unknown, box liner (buyers toolbox-condition unknown, has a back seat, blue, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 330,616 km, , PROBLEMS: Both lower ball joints need replacement, front wheels need alignment, start noise, holes in front hump and center arm rest, left side step missing pad, hood scratches, both bumpers paint peeling/chips/rust, left front fender rusted, rear right fender scratches/dents, right front fender rusted, right rear fender road rash/scratches, left front door dents, right front door dents, tailgate rust/chips/dents, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher windshield chips/scratches, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	330,616 km	\$7,966	1C6RR7FP0DS515978	
	<b>3,251.00 * 9-007</b>	Truck 2007 DODGE, Ram 2500, 4WD, Quad Cab, 8' Box, 5.7L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 2 keys Tow hooks, grille inserts, trailer hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, headache rack - bent, side steps, silver, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 196,018 km, , PROBLEMS: Poor transmission – transmission slipping, transmission oil burnt, removed from service due to rust, no rear tail lights or signal lights, right box rail bent, left step bent, front of box bent, hood has scratches/chips, front bumper rust, rear bumper dented/bent, left front fender rust holes, left rear fender rust/dents/scratches, right front and rear fender rust, dents, scratches, left front door dents, left rear door glass scratches, right rear door large dent, tailgate dented/rusting/bent at bottom, windshield chips/scratches, left front seat worn-hole, wheel wrench lose under back seat, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	196,018 km	\$3,000	3D7KS28D07G811704	
Ministry Transfer to another Agency	*MT	10-008	Truck 2014 DODGE, Ram 2500, 4WD, Crew Cab, 6'4", 5.7L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry 2 key fobs 2 keys Tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, three ball hitch, OEM trailer brakes, box liner, headache rack with beacon and wig wags on grille and rack condition unknown, has a back seat, red, PASSED SGI Inspection. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 239,460 km, , PROBLEMS: Engine poor internal failure, right front and left front door glass scratched, grille broke, hood chips/scratches, both bumpers rust spots/bent/dents, left side fenders scratched/road rash, rocker panels road rash, left rear door dent, roof scratches, hole in roof sealed, tailgate scratches, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	239,460 km	\$14,096	3C6TR5CT1EG193033

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
*WD	* 9-030	Truck 2014 DODGE, Ram 2500, 4WD, Crew Cab, 6'4" Box, 5.7L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power locks/windows/mirrors, keyless entry-1 key fob Grille inserts, tow hooks, trailer receiver with tow bar, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, headache rack with beacon condition unknown, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 238,416 km, , PROBLEMS: Check engine light on code P0456 Evaporative emission control system leak (small), park assist service rear sensors, TPMS light on, left outer tie rod, all four ball joints, front wheel alignment, both head light assemblies have moisture, front middle seat belt buckle, hood chips, front bumper chips, rear bumper bent/rusted, left side fenders rusted/road rash/dents, right front fender rusted, rear right fender dented/rusted, rocker panel left paint worn, rocker panel right rusted, left and right front door dents, tailgate bent/dented/scratched/rust/molding broke, running board damaged, windshield chips, wheel wrench loose under back seat, left front mirror housing broken, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	238,416 km	\$17,252	3C6TR5CT0EG193038
*WD	* 10-009	Truck 2014 DODGE, Ram 2500, 4WD, Crew Cab, 6'4" Box, 5.7L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry-2 key fobs Grille inserts, front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, trailer hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brake, headache rack, beacon, box liner, has a back seat, blue, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 283,731 km, , PROBLEMS: Check engine light on codes: P0562 battery/voltage low, P0305 cylinder 5 misfire, P0882 TCM power input, rear links, removed from service due to worn camshaft, grille broke, hood clear coat peeling/scratches/chips, front bumper rust, rear bumper dents/rust, left front fender clear coat/rust, left rear fender paint poor/dents, right side fenders paint poor/scratches/dents, rocker panels road rash, left side doors chips/scratches, right side doors rust at bottom, roof clear coat peeling/chips, tailgate dents/rust/molding broke will not open, wheel wrench loose under seat, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, left front seat worn frame visible, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> , As is, Where is	283,731 km	\$9,158	3C6TR5CT7EG207663

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number	
<b>*WD</b>	<b>* 9-027</b>	Truck 2015 DODGE, Ram 3500, 4WD, Crew Cab, 5.7L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry Grille inserts, tow hooks, side steps (beat), headache rack with beacon condition unknown, box liner, box rail guards, hitch with trailer bar, electric trailer brakes, trailer tow mirrors (heated), 8 foot box, white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 405 288 km, , PROBLEMS: Both front upper ball joints, passenger side exhaust manifold leak, both front mud flaps, grille broke, hood chips/dents, front bumper rust spots, rear bumper rusted/dents, left front fender dent, rear left fender dents/scratches, right front fender rust, rear right fender multiple dents, left rocker panel paint wore off, right side doors small rust spots, roof dents, tailgate bent/dented/missing molding/will not open, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	405 288 km	\$4,627	3C63R3GT7FG592691	
<a href="#">Ministry Transfer to another Agency</a>	<b>*MT</b>	<b>* 9-024</b>	Truck 2009 DODGE, Ram 5500, RWD, Quad Cab, 8 x 10 Dump Body, 6.7L Inline 6 diesel, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/locks/mirrors, keyless entry-2 key fobs Dual Rear wheels, slip tank with fill rite 12v pump-condition unknown, power lift gate rusted-condition unknown, beacons and headache rack-condition unknown, tow hooks, grille inserts, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brakes, trailer tow mirrors, fold down sides-condition unknown, wired remote for dump-condition unknown, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 356,396 km, , PROBLEMS: Exhaust missing from muffler rearward, cab and plate lamp out, hood hail/chips, front bumper chips/rust, front left fender chips, all doors road rash, roof small rust spots/hail, front center arm rest worn, no spare tire/wheel wrench/jack/fire extinguisher/first aid kit, windshield chips, cluster cover cracked, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	356,396 km	\$35,900	3D6WC78L39G554127

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
*WD	* 10-010	Truck 2010 FORD, F250, RWD, Extended Cab, 8' box, 6.4L V8 diesel, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power locks/front windows, keyless entry-1 key, 1 fob Grille inserts, tow hooks, side steps, headache rack, hitch, trailer wiring, trailer tow mirrors, has a back seat, grey, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 294,070 km, , PROBLEMS: Park brake does not hold rear brake pads below spec, all 4 tires are below tread spec, left front exhaust manifold bolt broken, both battery under hood are missing hold downs, left rear mud flap missing, right rear backing plate missing, front wheel alignment is out of spec, rear door ajar light is on, tire pressure monitor light fault, front brakes are 4mm and rear brakes are 3mm - both need repair, washer fluid does not work and some hoses are broken, windshield is cracked, left front signal bulb/both reverse bulbs/right front marker bulb/left front low beam bulb/both plate bulbs are all burnt out, both tail lights broke, hood chips, front bumper rust spots, rear bumper bent/pad loose, left fenders road rash/badly rusted, right fenders road rash/rusted/dented, left front door paint peeling/not aligned to left front, left rear door rust along bottom, right rear door paint peeling at bottom, roof rust spots, tailgate badly damaged, spare tire in box flat, both side mirrors housing cracked/broke, tires poor, left front seat cover ripped/worn, missing wheel wrench/jack, no first aid/fire extinguisher, both cab corners rust, glove box latch broken, missing dash trim, holes in rear mat floor pan, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	294,070 km	\$6,004	1FTSX2AR0AEO1456
*WD	* 10-011	Truck 2009 GMC, Sierra 3500, 4WD, Crew Cab, 8' Box, 6.0L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks, 2 keys Grille inserts, tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, headache rack, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 351,376 km, , PROBLEMS: No back up lights, passenger side wiper arm, front of box dented/bent, both box rails badly dented, holes drill in rear trim panels, holes in rear floor pan, hood stone chips/dents, front bumper rust spots, rear bumper dented/pad loose, left front fender rusted, rear right fender rusted/dented, right front fender rusted, rear right fender rusted/dented, left rear door rusted at bottom, roof rust spots, tailgate rust/bents/molding broke, spare tire missing, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	351,376 km	\$10,325	1GTHK73K79F161653

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
4,576.23 10-012	Van 2009 DODGE, Grand Caravan Cargo, 2WD, 3.3L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power front windows/mirrors, keyless entry-2 key fobs Cargo barrier, steel floors, white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 189,973 km, , PROBLEMS: Front and rear pads/rotors, left rear tail light assembly, driver mirror housing broke, washer nozzle, driver seat ripped/worn, roof rack brackets no cross members, left front floor mat worn, holes in headliner, grille broke, hood paint bubbling, both bumpers cracked/dented, left and right dog legs rusted, left front door dented/paint cracked/rust, left rear door dented/rusted, right side doors dents/rust, hole in roof 3 sealed, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, no wheel wrench/jack, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	189,973 km	\$1,300	2D4HN11E19R683398
4,876.23 10-013	Van 2009 DODGE, Grand Caravan SE, 2WD, 3.3L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, rear HVAC, power front windows/mirrors/locks, keyless entry-2 key fobs 7 passenger, Stow-N-Go rear seat only, blue, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 172,296 km, , PROBLEMS: Both inner tie rods, right front struts, driver seat torn, driver seat belt frayed, left front seat arm rest, right front wheel cover, right head lap assembly, foggy right tail light, hatch dented, grille emblem missing, hood dents/scratches, rear bumper cracked/scratches, left side fenders road rash/dents/scratches, right side fenders road rash/dents, rocker panels paint worn inside at door, left front door glass scratched, left rear door dent, right side doors dents/scratches/paint cracked, roof scratches, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	172,296 km	\$3,489	2D8HN44E09R641526
<b>REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.</b>				
<b>Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.</b>				
No Bid * 7-101	Bench Seat, Grey. Cloth fabric. 52"w x 28"dPoor		\$1	
No Bid * 7-102	Bench Seat, Grey. Cloth fabric. 52"w x 28"dPoor		\$1	
No Bid * 8-102	Floor Mats, Lot of 4 OEM, Nissan Leaf, Black fabric 2 front, 2 rear, Leaf logo on front mats, may be compatible with 2022 Nissan Leaf. Excellent		\$35	801,854
No Bid * 8-103	Floor Mats, Lot of 3 OEM, Ram, Black fabric 2 front, 1 full rear, with Ram logo on all mats, may be compatible with 2020 Ram Tradesman crew cab. Excellent		\$35	801,631
No Bid * 8-104	Floor Mats, Lot of 3 OEM, Ram, Black fabric 2 front, 1 full rear, with Ram logo on all mats, may be compatible with other 2020 Ram Tradesman crew cab.Excellent		\$35	
No Bid * 10-116	Floor Mats, Lot of 2 Rear, OEM fabric, grey May be compatible with years 2004-2009 Dodge Durago.Good		\$5	
No Bid * 10-117	Floor Mats, Lot of 2 Rear, OEM fabric, grey May be compatible with years 2004-2009 Dodge Durago.Good		\$5	
No Bid * 9-186	Furniture Legs, Approx 45 Metal 8 1/2", adjustable. Good		\$1	



Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
5.00 * 9-122	Seat, Grey Fabric 53"w x 24"d x 34"h. May be compatible with a 2008 Ford E350.Seats 3 people.Fair		\$1	424,192
201.25 * 7-111	Tailgate, OEM, Chevy Silverado May be compatable with 2004 and newer 1500, 2500 + 3500, minor black marks, dents or scratches, yellow in color.Good		\$200	A04012 516229.
201.25 * 7-112	Tailgate, OEM, Chevy Silverado May be compatable with 2004 and newer 1500, 2500 + 3500, minor dents or scratches, yellow in colour.Good		\$200	A4011 516369
40.00 * 6-129	Tires, Set of 4 Sumitomo Enhance HTR LX. M+S. 215/65R/17, manufacture date. Week 26, year 2017.Fair		\$4	
No Bid * 9-123	Tire, 245/75R/17 Bravo A/T Maxis 771. NO RIM. FOR TEMPORARY USE ONLY. Manufacture date. Week 07, year 2022.Excellent		\$40	
170.00 10-101	Tires, Set of 4 225/65R16, Firestone Winter Force 2. Snow Flake, M+S Manufacture date. Week 02, year 2020.Good		\$160	
42.02 10-102	Tire, 235/65R17, Goodyear Assurance, Weather Ready.Snow Flake, M+S. Manufacture date. Week 15, year 2022. Fair		\$25	
210.00 10-103	Tires, Set of 4 235/65R18, Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow Flake. M+S Manufacture date. Week 22, year 2020.Excellent		\$200	
81.00 10-104	Tires, Set of 2 215/70R16, Firestone Winter Force 2. Snow Flake, M+S Manufacture date. Week 31, year 2020.Good		\$80	
180.00 10-105	Tires, Set of 4 235/70R17, Bridgestone Dueler H/T. M+S. Manufacture date. Week 35, year 2019.Good		\$160	
197.55 10-106	Tires, Set of 4 265/70R17, Firestone Fire Hawk. M+S 3 tires rated good. Manufacture date week 14, year 2019 and 1 tire rated fair. Manufacture date week 35, year 2016.Fair		\$120	
182.00 10-107	Tires, Set of 4 215/65R16, Firestone Winter Force 2UV. Snow flake, M+S Manufacture date. Week 03, year 2020.Good		\$160	
182.00 10-108	Tires, Set of 4 215/65R16, Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow flake, M+S Manufacture date. Week 23, year 2018.Good		\$160	
170.00 10-109	Tires, Set of 4 215/55R16, Firestone All Season. M+S. Manufacture date. Week 36, year 2020.Fair		\$120	
80.00 10-110	Tires, Set of 2 215/70R16, Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow flake, M+S Manufacture date. Week 21, year 2018.Good		\$70	
95.57 10-111	Tires, Set of 4 265/60R17, Firestone Firehawk GT. M+S. 1 tire rated fair, manufacture date week 47, year 2017. 3 tires rated poor, manufacture date. Week 35, year 2016.Poor		\$40	
54.05 10-112	Tires, Set of 3 225/65R16, Nitro SN2. Snow flake. M+S. Manufacture date. Week 24, year 2013.Good		\$50	
170.00 10-113	Tires, Set of 4 205/70R16, Artic Claw WXI. Snow flake, M+S. Manufacture date. Week 29, year 2019.Good		\$160	
205.00 10-114	Tires, Set of 4 225/55R17, Winter Quest, Duration. Snow flake, M+S. Manufacture date. Week 33, year 2016.Excellent		\$200	
201.00 10-115	Tires, Set of 4 235/50R18, Firestone Firehawk GT. M+S. Manufacture date. Week 47, year 2018. U-801268Excellent		\$200	

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
	180.00 10-118	Tires, Set of 4 215/70R16, Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snowflake, M+S Manufacture date. Week 21, year 2019.Good		\$160	
*WD	10-119	Tire, LT245/75R16, Trail Country, Dick Cepek. M+S. Mounted on a steel rim. May fit a 2008 Ford E350. Manufacture date. Week 38, year 2013.Excellent		\$100	424,192
No Bid *	10-120	Tire, LT265/70R16, Artic Claw. Winter XSI. Snowflake, M+S. Mounted on a steel rim. May fit a 2012 Dodge Ram 1500. Manufacture date. Week 21, year 2012. Excellent		\$100	437,944
No Bid *	11-143	Chair, grey cloth, no arms task Fair		\$1	
	5.00 * 9-128	Chair, side, wood, cloth brown, four legs.Good		\$1	
*WD	* 9-129	Chair, swivel, metal, cloth brown, four wheels.Good		\$1	
	31.51 * 9-112	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M276nw Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord.Fair		\$1	CNF8G1LOCK
	34.00 * 9-111	Scanner, Hewlett-Packard Scanjet 7500 Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, power cord is included.Fair		\$1	SG6C21102F
	3.00 * 9-117	Scanner, Hewlett-Packard Scanjet Pro 2500 F1 Untested, no power cord, some scratches.Fair		\$1	CN8C4A105K
	140.00 * 1-141	Tires, Set of 3 Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X. M+S 225/60R/16. Manufacture date - week 03, year 2017 Good		\$120	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>GREENWATER LAKE Parks Culture and Sport, Maintenance Compound</b>				
<b>Contact Jeff Hingtgen (306) 278-8067, jeff.hingtgen@gov.sk.ca</b>				
5.00 * 9-616	Bench Grinder, SIP 1/2 horsepower, was used for sharpening lawnmower blades. Fair		\$1	72-2452
No Bid * 9-621	Ladder Rack , Steel Came off of Dodge Caravan, mounts not included. Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 9-624	Refrigerator, Kenmore Unknown if operational. Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 9-627	Truck Box Topper, Raider Brand, Fiberglass Construction Came off of Chevrolet Colorado ext. cab, rear hatch missing. Poor		\$1	1278835 76CCVAG
No Bid * 9-629	Water Heater, Commercial, A.O. Smith, BT 199 Y00N000000 Natural gas heated, 86 U.S. gallon capacity. Drained and removed from campground service center in 2014. Unsure if operational. Poor		\$1	880-97-6-K0535
<b>LA RONGE Fire Base, Land Operations, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 800 Poirier St</b>				
<b>Contact Wes Boehr 306-425-4405, wes.boehr@gov.sk.ca or Ira Elderkin 306-758-6259, ira.elderkin@gov.sk.ca</b>				
No Bid * 9-561	BBQ, Broil King, propane, 986784X Burners are burnt out, shields rusted out and shelves are broken, non operational. Broken Repairable		\$1	425
No Bid * 9-563	Dryer, Inglis, 1J82001 Does not heat, elements are burnt out, non operational. Beyond Repair		\$1	MM2813215
No Bid * 9-567	Pressure Washer, Electric, Mastercraft Simmoniz Platinum, XE18 Has no pressure, non operational. Broken Repairable		\$1	XE181550201010056
<b>MOOSE JAW, Highways &amp; Infrastructure, Fleet Services, 1 km south of Moose Jaw on Hwy #2.</b>				
<b>Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca</b>				
4,716.34 10-511	Trailer, 2004 Trailtech TD220 20 tonyellow Recent Repairs: Ramp pins replaced PROBLEMS: tail lights need to be replaced, needs new safety chains, requires all deck boards, rusted out cross members in the center and on the sides of the deck, poor battery, minor exterior damage. >As is, Where is		\$2,000	2CU4CEVN842016526
<b>NORTH BATTLEFORD, Highways 502 114th St</b>				
<b>Contact Mark Eisenkirch 306-526-9103, mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca</b>				
10,227.00 10-501	Tractor, 2006 Komatsu Wheel Loader WA250-5Ly 4WD5.9L Cummins Inline 6 diesel auto A/C, tilt 3 speed, single axle, standard differential, tires single, tire size 20.5R25 ply 12yellow 4,609 hours PROBLEMS: Unit had bearing go in main hydraulic pump and sent filing throughout the complete hydraulic system, all pumps have been removed and are in a crate to go with unit, unit is in poor shape, engine ran fine before but cannot verify due to many parts being	4,609 hours	\$1,000	A73772
16,535.00 10-509	Tractor, 2004 Volvo G720B Grader 4WDD7D GBE2, Inline 6, diesel Powershift A/C, tilt 8 speed, single axle, standard differential, single tire, tire size, 17.5R25 12 pply yellow 12,035 hrs Recent Repairs: engine was replaced PROBLEMS: Unit has 12035 engine hours showing on dash and current engine has roughly 1500 hours, small engine and hydraulic leaks, poor battery, minor exterior damage. >As is, Where is	12,035 hrs	\$8,500	3,595

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
20,643.00	10-510	Tractor, 2007Volvo G960 Grader4WDD7E GBE3 Inline 6 diesel PowershiftA/C, tilt11 speed, GVW 17,840 kg, standard differential, single tires, tire size 17.5R25, 12 plyyellow4,643 hrsPROBLEMS: The unit shows 14,492 grader hours and 4643 engine hours on the dash, unit has some oil and hydraulic leaks, moldboard has some normal wear, unit has had driveline issues where steady bearing has been replaced numerous times. Poor battery, minor exterior damage.>As is, Where is	4,643 hrs	\$8,500	VCE0G960C00040297
<b>NARROW HILLS PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks Culture and Sport, at lower fishing lake. All items are located at the maintenance compound.</b>					
<b>Contact Janelle Franc 306-426-2625 or janelle.franc@gov.sk.ca</b>					
No Bid *	9-595	RV Toilet and Sinks, Lot of 2 Assorted chimney pieces, unknown condition.Poor		\$1	
<b>NIPAWIN, Highways, Fleet Services, 391 Hwy 35 N.</b>					
<b>Contact Cory Palko 306-960-5152, cory.palko@gov.sk.ca.</b>					
62.02 *	9-502	Broom, In house built front mounted for tractor 8', hasn't been used in years, hydraulic drive, hydraulic angle/ tilt, bristles very worn.Poor		\$1	
<b>PRINCE ALBERT, Corrections Policing and Public Safety, 1827 1 Ave. W</b>					
<b>Contact Richard LaClaire, richard.laclaire@gov.sk.ca or Graham Toporowski, graham.toporowski@gov.sk.ca</b>					
No Bid	10-508	Fridge, 30"w x 30"d X 65 1/2 "h, operational. Poor		\$1	
<b>PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, Land Operations, Nisbet Compound, Hwy #2 N</b>					
<b>Contact Daryl Sachkowski 306-953-2258, Daryl.Sachkowski@gov.sk.ca or Duane Barlow 306-953-3409, Duane.Barlow@gov.sk.ca</b>					
6,005.00	10-512	Camper Trailer, Layton, 2009, fibre glass cabin 24", missing outside cover for fridge, awning needs work, fridge and furnace need to be serviced, sleeps 8.Fair		\$6,000	1SE200N269G000388
<b>PRINCE ALBERT, Highways, Northern Operations, 81 North Industrial Dr.</b>					
<b>Contact Cory Palko 306-960-5152, cory.palko@gov.sk.ca.</b>					
85.85 *	9-505	Grader Hitch , Caterpillar, 140M Rear mounted.Fair		\$1	3377511G
<b>SASKATOON, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, SCC, 910 60th street East, Saskatoon</b>					
<b>Contact Renne Pound 306-956-8177, renee.pound@gov.sk.ca or Danielle Corriveau 306-956-8869, Danielle.Corriveau@gov.sk.ca.</b>					
No Bid *	10-502	Cabinet, Wood White with hanger rod, 36.5"w x 18"d x 66.25"h.Fair		\$1	
215.75	10-503	Clamps, Lot of 24 Assorted, various sizes From 24 1/2" to 108", operational.Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	7-528	Respirator, 3M, 6100/07024 (AAD) Small Package opened, half facepiece, reusable. No expiry and used.Good		\$1	
77.00	10-504	Saw Blades, Lot of 84 Assorted, various sizes 17 of 7 -7 1/4" 24 tooth carbide tipped, 38 of 7 1/4" 20 tooth carbide tipped, assorted 10" saw blades, 4 rabbit blades, operational, some unused.Fair		\$1	
100.00	10-505	Tools, Lot of 34 Assorted, various sizes Saws, planers rasp, drills, squares, brushes, wrenches, chisels, jig, caliper, punches, bits, operational, some unused.Fair		\$1	
76.25	10-506	Tools, Lot of 40 Assorted, various sizes Saws, planers, rasps, square, drills, brushes, wrenches, chisels, gauges, scrapers, screwdrivers, caliper, clamps, punches, bits, trammels, tin snips, jig, operational, some unused.Fair		\$1	
76.25	10-507	Tools, Lot of 36 Assorted, various sizes Saws, planers, rasps, square, drills, brushes, wrenches, chisels, gauges, scrapers, screwdrivers, caliper, clamps, punches, bits, trammels, tin snips, jigs, operational, some unused.Fair		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>SASKATOON, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, Employment Standards, 122 3rd Ave N</b>				
Contact Karen Paulson 306-533-5295, karen.paulson@gov.sk.ca or Sandy Falk 306-933-5395, sandra.falk@gov.sk.ca				
20.00 * 9-515	Desk, right run off with keyboard platform 42"l x 25 1/4"w x 29 1/2"h.Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 9-516	File Cabinet, 4 drawer, vertical 18"l x 36"w x 52"h, no keys, grey.Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 9-517	File Cabinet, 5 drawer, lateral 36"l x 18"w x 62"h, no keys, beige.		\$1	
5.00 * 9-519	Table, wood grain laminate, metal legs 54"l x 27"w x 29"h.Fair		\$1	
<b>SASKATOON, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, Labour Relations and Mediation, 841 122 3rd Ave N</b>				
Contact Shaunna Altman 306-787-0817, shaunna.altman@gov.sk.ca or Kristin Anderson 306-933-5880, kristin.anderson@gov.sk.ca				
5.00 * 9-572	Desk, Wood laminate 60"l x 30"w x 28.5"h.Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 9-547	Monitor Stand, metal, black Good		\$1	
No Bid * 9-574	Office Supplies, Misc Mesh file holders, desk organizers, document holders -black Good		\$1	
No Bid * 9-575	Table, Wood, square 29"l x 29"l x 19"h.Poor		\$1	
*WD * 9-576	Table, Wood, with drawer 48"l x 30"w x 28.5"h.Poor		\$1	
<b>SOUTHEND, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 10 College Dr</b>				
Contact Ira Elderkin 306-758-6259, ira.elderkin@gov.sk.ca or Wes Boehr 306-425-4405, wes.boehr@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 9-550	Electric Dryer, SAMSUNG, DV42H5000EW/AC Needs repairs, will not turn on.Broken Repairable		\$1	0AEG5BBG00138Z
<b>REGINA, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, Corporate Services, 1870 Albert St.</b>				
Contact Waneta Hardy 306-798-1353, waneta.hardy@gov.sk.ca, or Lianne Woulfe 306-787-2456, lianne.woulfe@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 9-543	Keyboard Platform, pepper dust finish Needs new hydraulics, keyboard for 3 piece desk, not curvilinear run-offsBroken Repairable		\$1	
No Bid * 9-544	Keyboard Trays, Lot of 2 black UsedPoor		\$1	
<b>REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, Corporate Services, 515 Henderson Dr</b>				
Contact Stephanie Larson 905-246-5035, slarson@gov.sk.ca				
36.50 * 8-565	Printer, Hewlett-Packard Officejet 250 Mobile All in One This item is UNTESTED and offered AS IS. No cords are included, but power cords can be requested (dependent upon stock).Fair		\$1	TH01Y750JX
<b>YORKTON, Highways, Fleet Services, 245 York Road East.</b>				
Contact Brian Perih 306-786-1651 or Ed Patzwald 306-786-1687 email: brian.perih@gov.sk.ca or ed.patzwald@gov.sk.ca.				
175.00 * 9-512	Sign Posts, Wood 4" x 6" x 14' long approximately, old broken sign posts, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer, ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by ministry staff. Please note lifts are now smaller to make handling safer & 50-60 posts per lift.Fair		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
175.00 * 9-513	Sign Posts, Wood 4" x 6" x 14' long approximately, old broken sign posts, approximate weight of lift is 6500 lbs; must bring deck over trailer for assistance with loading; if deck over trailer cannot be provided loading is responsibility of buyer, ministry staff will not load any trailer deemed unsafe to load. Trailers with fenders will not be loaded by ministry staff. Please note lifts are now smaller to make handling safer & 50-60 posts per lift.Fair		\$1	