
SALE SUMMARY LIST

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-787-2238,
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer)	This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.
WD = (Withdrawn)	This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.
No Bid =	Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number	
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles					
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.					
4,329.00	8-001	Car 2009 CHRYSLER, Sebring LX, FWD, 2.4L Inline 4 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated mirrors/locks/windows/trunk release, keyless entry-2 key fobs. , silver, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 230,602 km, , PROBLEMS: Left rack boot, rear pads and rotors, washer and nozzle, removed from service due to age, KM and maintenance cost, hood scratches/paint bubbling/dents, front and rear bumper scratches, left front fender and right front and rear fender scratches, left side doors front and rear rust along bottom, left rear door dent, ride side doors rust along inside bottom, windshield chips, right front seat stained, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	230,602	\$1,050	1C3LC46B49N573444
3,189.89	8-002	Car 2007 CHRYSLER, Sebring Touring, FWD, 2.7L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, driving/fog lights, power heated mirrors/trunk release/left front seat/windows/locks, 2 key fobs- keyless entry. , gold, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 255,700 km, Recent Repairs: battery replaced., PROBLEMS: Front struts, front and rear pads/rotors, needs four-wheel alignment, hood paint bubbling/scratches, front bumper cracked, rear bumper poor paint, left front fender scratches, left rear fender rust, right rear fender scratches, left and right rocker panel road rash/light rust, head lights fogged, windshield chips, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	255,700	\$550	1C3LC56R67N634776
6,777.00	8-003	Car 2013 DODGE, Avenger SE, FWD, 2.4L Inline 4 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/locks/windows/trunk release, keyless entry-1 key fob. , grey, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 135,983 km, , PROBLEMS: Front and rear pads/rotors, brakes pulsation, removed from road due to mechanical issues, rust on left front/left rear/right rear road rash inside doors, left rear door road rash, rear heated windows scratches, hood paint bubbling/dents/scratches, front and rear bumper chips/scratches, left front fender scratches, right and left rocker panel road rash, roof small rust spot leading edge, windshield small chips, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	135,983	\$2,184	1C3CDZAB4DN604508

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
3,640.58 8-004	Truck 2009 CHEVROLET, Silverado 1500 LT, 4WD, Extended Cab, 6'7" Box, 5.3L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/locks/windows/front seats, keyless entry-2 keys, 2 fobs. Grille inserts, front tow hooks, hitch, trailer wiring, mud flaps, dome fasteners in rear area on doors and roof liner, has a back seat., red, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 185,676 km, , PROBLEMS: Power steering rack and pinion leaking, slight play in lower ball joints, both rear shocks need replacement, rear shoes and machine drums need repair, front wheel alignment parts required, tire pressure monitoring system (TPMS) light on (tire sensor not working), missing jump seat, hood scratches, front bumper scrapes/dents, left rear fender badly dented/rusted, rights front fender scratches, right rear fender rusted/scratches, all doors surface rust/road rash, roof rusted at front/scratches, tailgate surface rust/poor paint, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips/scratches, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	185,676	\$1,953	1GCEK19019Z240742
4,577.00 8-005	Truck 2007 FORD, F150 Supercab, 2WD, Extended Cab, 6'6" Box, 4.6L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, 3 keys. Has a back seat., white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 171,575 km, , PROBLEMS: Steering linkage rack and pinion leaking, rear pads need replacement, license plate lights out, head lamps foggy, gas cap cover broken(stays open), box rusted through right fender well, front bumper dents, rear bumper bent, left front fender rust, left rear fender rust/dent, right rear fender rust/dent, right side doors creased from front door to rear right ¼ panel, tailgate bent/dented/binds hard to open, front of box bent, right dash marked up, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	171,575	\$3,200	1FTRX12W27FB24028

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
5,677.00 8-006	Truck 2008 GMC, Sierra, 4WD, Extended Cab, 6'7" Box, 5.3L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power locks/windows/mirrors, 1 key. Metal mounting bracket between the front seats, grille inserts, front tow hooks, headache rack, mud flaps, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, box liner, has a back seat., grey, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 222, 268 km, , PROBLEMS: Check engine light on P04200(low catalyst system efficiency), both lower ball joints, hood loose hood latch, box has surface rust around fenders, hood dents/scratches missing deflectors on hood, front bumper dented, rear bumper dent/bent/pad loose, left rear fender road rash/rust, right rear fender road rash/rust/scratches, left side doors road rash/scratches, right side doors dent/scratches/chips, hole in roof 1 sealed, tailgate dented/scratches, windshield chips, all seats soiled, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> , As is,	222, 268 km	\$3,594	1GTEK19058Z296682
3,177.00 8-007	Van 2008 CHEVROLET, Uplander LS, FWD, 3.9L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power front windows/mirrors/locks, keyless entry-2 keys-keyless function does not work- 1 fob. 7 passengers- 2nd row captain chairs- 3rd row split bench., brown, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 214,927 km, , PROBLEMS: Rack and pinion leaking, both outer tie rods, both front links, check engine light on message from info centre "A/C off for engine protection" VCIM code B1000 no communication with ECU, front wheel alignment parts required, seat buckle under seat, removed from service due to high repair estimate, hood chips/dents, left front road rash, right front fender road rash, dog leg road rash, left rear door scratches/dented, right rear door dents, roof dents/scratches, tailgate paint chip near high light, head lights fogged, left front seat cushion worn and ripped, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield small chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	214,927 km	\$860	1GNDU23WX8D163445
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.				
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.				
28.00 8-107	Beacon, ARBMG brand, Model 11.1193 SHO-ME, 15 foot power cable-no switch 10-3/4"w x 9-1/8"d x 2-3/4"h, no mounting hardware, beacon is functional.Fair		\$25	
No Bid * 7-101	Bench Seat, Grey. Cloth fabric. 52"w x 28"dPoor		\$1	
No Bid * 7-102	Bench Seat, Grey. Cloth fabric. 52"w x 28"dPoor		\$1	
No Bid * 8-109	Cables and Tow Strap, Lot of 2 Booster cables, 8 Gauge Booster cables -7 feet in length, tow strap-15 feet in length, 1 steel hooksand 1 loop.Fair		\$10	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid * 8-108	Cables and Tow Strap, Lot of 2 Booster cables, Gauge unknown Booster cable 7', tow strap-length unknown, 2 hooks. Fair		\$10	
No Bid * 8-110	Cables and Rope, Lot of 2 Booster cables advantage brand, Tow rope, Reese brand Booster cables 6 gauge-12 feet in length, tow rope 14 feet in length 2steel hooks, tow rope - braided polypropylene. Good		\$20	
No Bid * 8-102	Floor Mats, Lot of 4 OEM, Nissan Leaf, Black fabric 2 front, 2 rear, Leaf logo on front mats, may be compatible with 2022 Nissan Leaf. Excellent		\$35	801,854
No Bid * 8-103	Floor Mats, Lot of 3 OEM, Ram, Black fabric 2 front, 1 full rear, with Ram logo on all mats, may be compatible with 2020 Ram Tradesman crew cab. Excellent		\$35	801,631
No Bid * 8-104	Floor Mats, Lot of 3 OEM, Ram, Black fabric 2 front, 1 full rear, with Ram logo on all mats, may be compatible with other 2020 Ram Tradesman crew cab. Excellent		\$35	
350.00 * 6-103	Ladder rack, 64"w x 90"h Metal adjustable ladder rack with beacon. Mounting brackets included. White in color, unknown manufacturer. Good		\$150	171579, Sasktel 297197
180.00 8-112	Ladder Rack, Metal, adjustable With beacon, white, removed from a 2004 Chev Astro. May have other applications. Good		\$150	190,082
No Bid * 6-123	Manhole Gate Holder, Titan Stainless, aluminum 39"w x 46.5"d x 7.5"h, door hinge broken. Good		\$15	
221.00 8-113	Rear Step Bumper, OEM. GM. With mounting brackets, bolts and spare tire lock cylinder-no key. Compatible with 2005 GMC Sierra 1500, 2500, 3500, may be other applications. Good		\$200	516419, A05007
221.00 8-114	Rear Step Bumper, OEM. GM. With mounting brackets, bolts and spare tire lock cylinder-no key. Compatible with 2005 GMC Sierra 1500, 2500, 3500, may be other applications. Good		\$200	516443, A05009.
12.01 8-111	Tape Measure, Task Tools brand, Model TS740, Fiberglass tape 100 feet or 30 metres in length. Fair		\$10	
No Bid * 6-129	Tires, Set of 4 Sumitomo Enhance HTR LX. M+S. 215/65R/17, manufacture date. Week 26, year 2017. Fair		\$120	
No Bid * 7-108	Tires, Set of 4 225/65R17, Goodyear Assurance. M+S. Fuel max. M+S. Manufacture date: Week 37, year 2018. Poor		\$40	
*MT * 7-113	Tires, Set of 4 225/65R/16, Firestone All season. M+S. Manufacture date, week 45, year 2018. Good		\$160	
No Bid * 7-114	Tires, Set of 4 225/65R/16, Firestone FR710. M+S Manufacture date, week 22, year 2016. Good		\$160	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid * 8-105	Tire, Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X P215/60R/17, M+S, Manufacture date: Week 32, year 2018.Good		\$20	
No Bid * 8-106	Tires, Set of 3 Firestone FR710 P215/60R/17.M+S, Manufacture date: Week 15, year 2013.Fair		\$50	
165.20 8-115	Tires, Set of 4 Firestone Weathergrip Snow Flake, 215/65R/16, M+S. Manufacture date. Week 21, year 2020.Good		\$160	
*MT 8-101	Truck Box, White, Fits a 2012 Chevy Silverado Complete with tailgate, 74"w x 102"d x 76"h, outside front of box paint peeling.Good		\$3,500	436,854
No Bid * 6-127	Winter Front / Bug Screen, For a 2007 2008 Dodge Durango, Via WF 929-57 Snaps may be missing.Good		\$5	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
BEAUVAL, Highways, Operations and Maintenance, Lot Z Plan #79B13138 - Hansen Street				
Contact Mark Eisenkirch, 306-526-9103 mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca				
101.33	8-540	Snow Plow, 1991, One Way Poor	\$1	
101.33	8-541	Snow Plow, AT, Right Hand Wing, Model Number AT-132-11 Year Unknown 11" Poor	\$1	AT-23-585
101.33	8-542	Snow Plow, One Way Year Unknown Poor	\$1	
MEADOW LAKE, Corrections Policing and Public Safety, 301 - 6th Street East				
Contact Tangy Laird 306-236-7557, tangy.laird@gov.sk.ca or Tonya Williamson 306-236-7543, tonya.williamson@gov.sk.ca				
6,777.77	* 7-540	Boat, 1996, Lund 18 ft, black, unknown if operational, 2008 Mercury 115hp 4 stroke motor, according to receipts motors last service was 2017, boats been sitting for a year. Poor	\$1	1B586913
MOOSE JAW, Highways & Infrastructure, Fleet Services, 1 km south of Moose Jaw on Highway #2.				
Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca				
*MT	8-501	Broom Tractor, 2005 Ford Newholland, TV1454WD articulated inline 6, diesel hydrostaic A/C, loader arms 3 speed, GVW 14, 7115 lbs, wheel base 118", standard differential, single tire, tire size, 480/80R/34 Nokian, brakes, windshield washers, wipers and lights are all in working condition. Windshield glass is good, interior is fair with typical wear. yellow 3092 hrs PROBLEMS: Cab end power take-off (PTO) not working (would require transmission housing repair) transmission still works properly just PTO drive train removed. Hydraulic oil needs top up, quick couplers leaking, coolant low, cables for foot pedal and hydraulic functions stiff-need replacing. As is, Where is	3092 hrs \$3,000	RVS023659
65.00	8-503	Impact Air Wrench, Chicago Pneumatic, 1" Operational Good	\$1	06137K
NORTH BATTLEFORD, Highways 502 114th Street.				
Contact Mark Eisenkirch 526-9103, mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca				
302.00	8-502	Pallet Racking, Various lengths 8' to 20' lengths 4 feet wide, everthing there except bolts to put together. Good	\$300	
PRINCE ALBERT, Highways, Northern Operations, 81 North Industrial Dr.				
Contact Cory Palko 306-960-5152, cory.palko@gov.sk.ca.				
19,333.33	8-563	Grader, 1990 Champion RWD inline 6, diesel, Cummins L10 Powershift Unit is in over all fair condition 8 speed, standard differential, single tire, tire size, 1600 R24 TG. yellow 10721 hrs Recent Repairs: Tirres have been recently replaced PROBLEMS: Battery is poor. As is, Where is	10721 hrs \$15,000	20,776
367.77	8-564	Packer, 1973 Bros SP3000 RWD Self propelled roller inline 4, gas Hydrostatic Rollover protection structure (ROPS) yellow 6502 hrs Recent Repairs: PROBLEMS: Hasn't ran in years, missing fuel cap, battery and tires are poor. As is, Where is	6502 hrs \$1	8,290

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
REGINA, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, Corporate Services, 1870 Albert St.				
Contact Waneta Hardy 306-798-0312, waneta.hardy@gov.sk.ca, or Derek Wagner 306-787-1879, derek.wagner@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 6-580	Binders, 4 boxes Mostly black and white, varying sizes, used.Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 6-581	Headset, Agptek Headset only, no base so unable to determine if operational.Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 6-583	Headsets, Lot of 4 Jabra No bases.Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 6-584	Headsets, Lot of 3 Jabra With bases, unsure if operational.Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 6-585	Headsets, Lot of 5 Plantronics With bases, unsure if operational.Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 6-587	Painting, Picture of a tree, 10" w x 20" h.Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 6-589	Step File, Lot of 3 Black coating.Good		\$1	
REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor & Gaming Association, Procurement Services, 2500 Victoria Ave				
Contact Ryan Maduck 306-787-1934, rmaduck@slga.com				
2.01 8-544	Blade Server, HP Proliant, 460 Series, G7 Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	use2183ahs
2.01 8-545	Blade Server, HP Proliant, 460 Series, G7 Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	use2183ahw
2.01 8-546	Blade Server, HP Proliant, 460 Series, G7 Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	use231axxp
2.01 8-547	Blade Server, HP Proliant, 460 Series, G7 Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	use231b20p
2.01 8-548	Blade Server, Storage, HP Storageworks D2200sb Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	use231axad
2.01 8-549	Blade Server, Storage, HP Storageworks D2200sb Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	use2183ahy
2.01 8-550	Blade Server, Storage, HP Storageworks D2200sb Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	use2183aj0
2.01 8-551	Blade Server, Storage, HP Storageworks D2200sb Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	use231axac
2.01 8-552	Blade Server, VMWARE, HP Proliant 460 Series, Gen8 Blade system board components. Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	mxq2280ddt
2.01 8-553	Blade Server, VMWARE, HP Proliant 460 Series, Gen8 Blade system board components. Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	mxq22903x6
2.01 8-554	Blade Server, VMWARE, HP Proliant 460 Series, Gen8 Blade system board components. Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	mxq2280dff

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
2.01 8-555	Blade Server, VMWARE, HP Proliant 460 Series, Gen8 Blade system board components. Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	mxq2280df2
2.01 8-556	Blade Server, VMWARE, HP Proliant 460 Series, Gen8 Blade system board components. Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	mxq2280ddd
2.01 8-557	Blade Server, VMWARE, HP Proliant 460 Series, Gen8 Blade system board components. Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	mxq24400Z7
2.01 8-558	Blade Server, VMWARE, HP Proliant 460 Series, Gen8 Blade system board components. Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	mxq2280ddn
2.01 8-559	Blade Server, VMWARE, HP Proliant 460 Series, Gen8 Blade system board components. Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	mxq246034t
2.01 8-560	Blade Server, VMWARE, HP Proliant 460 Series, Gen8 Blade system board components. Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	mxq24400z6
2.01 8-561	Blade Server, VMWARE, HP Proliant 460 Series, Gen8 Blade system board components. Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	mxq32905ry
2.01 8-562	Blade Server, VMWARE, HP Proliant 460 Series, Gen8 Blade system board components. Needs hard drive to operate, hard drive not included. Fair		\$1	mxq34700ws
ST. WALBURG, Highways, Operations and Maintenance, Box338 #10 Service Road Highway 26				
Contact Mark Eisenkirch, 306-526-9103 mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca				
2.33 8-543	Snow Plow, 1990, One Way 11 ftPoor		\$1	
SASKATOON, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, SCC, 910 60th street East, Saskatoon				
Contact Jaqueline Danyluk 306-956-8913, jacqueline.danyluk4@gov.sk.ca or Danielle Corriveau 306-956-8869, Danielle.Corriveau@gov.sk.ca.				
28.00 8-504	Air Compressor, Model # LT5002, Campbell Hausfeld 1 HP, wired for 116 volts. Operational.Good		\$1	062584H-229419
150.00 8-505	Arc Welder, Electric, Lincoln, Model AC-225-S; Type K-1170 230V, 1 Phase. Unknown if operational.Good		\$1	21,973
68.00 8-506	Arc Welder, Marquette, Model 350BB Primary 220V, Secondary 200V Phase 1. Unknown if operational.Good		\$1	493,022
59.89 8-507	Band Saw Blades, Lot of 40 Assorted sizes.Good		\$1	
5.33 8-508	Bench Grinder, Electric 6", model KC-680 Phase 1, 110V, Hz50, RPM3450, Amp 4, Arbor Dia 1/2", W260. Unknown if repairablePoor		\$1	9,070,132
168.27 8-509	Bin, Steel Grey, approximately 5'w x 6'd x 4'h, scratched, has brackets for skid steer forks.Good		\$1	
305.10 8-510	Bolts, Lot of 120 Assorted boxes of bolts.Good		\$1	
305.10 8-511	Bolts & Nails, Lot of 90 Assorted boxes bolts and nails.Good		\$1	

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
	333.33 8-512	Bulldozer Blade, Metal 66.5"l x 97" w x 38"h, operational.Good		\$1	
	500.00 8-513	Cutterhead, Delta DJ 20 Electric Cutterhead. Model 37350 Voltage 230, Phase 1. Operational.Good		\$1	947
	926.00 8-514	Cutterhead, King Industrial 8" Jointer with Spiral Cutterhead. Model No. KC-85FX Voltage 220, Cycle 60 Hz, Amp 9A, Phase 1, RMP 3450. Operational.Good		\$1	
	56.00 8-515	Drill Press, Electric Sun Int'l Heavy Duty. Model SB-5; Franklin Mtr Model 1101091700 Cap: Chuck 5/8", 5 speed. Motor 115V/230. Unknown if operational.Good		\$1	87,496
	239.99 8-516	Drill Press, Electric, Delta, 16 1/2. Model No. 1312023 115V, Amp 12, Phase 1. Unknown if operational.Good		\$1	8,813
	319.99 8-517	Drill Press, Electric, Rexon Heavy Duty. Model No. RDM-150F; Motor Model: S63Y24BL-6340 115V, HP 1/2, RPM 1725, Phase 1. Unknown if operational.Good		\$1	
	162.00 8-518	Dust Collector, Metal, industrial. Grey, 6'l x 9'w x 17.25'h, (height approximate).Good		\$1	
	3.00 8-519	Floor Buffer, Kent Co. Industrial, Model KF-130 Volts 115, Phase 1, Hz 60, Motor 1, Amp 7.4, HP 50. Requires repair.Fair		\$1	1,000,686
*MT	8-520	Fuel Tank, Westeel Road, Vault, Mobile Petroleum White, 63 gallons, 54"l x 16.5"h x 21"h. Stand included, 80.5"l x 40.5" w x 63" h. New- Unused		\$1	67 18 01734
	1,725.50 8-521	Hole Punch, Geka, Hydracrop, 55/S. Model 555 Comes with accessories. 220V, Phase 3. Operational.Good		\$1	14,967
	547.89 8-522	Hydraulic Pipe Bender, Model 1700x, Allen Bradley, huth Manufacturing Unknown if operational.Good		\$1	1,715
	20.00 8-523	Induction Motor, Extra Max Energy Efficient Induction Motor. Model WJ1Y54FFAT Phase 3, 230/460V. Unknown if operational.Good		\$1	90,049,473
	5.00 8-524	Induction Motor, Leroy Somer Phase 3, 208/230/460V. Unknown if operational.Good		\$1	E0A77670
	557.00 8-525	Jig Saw & Blades, General Mfg Co Jig Saw . Model 490 top part, Model 530 bottom part. Comes with 3 blades, voltage 110, Cycle 60, HP 1/2, Amp 8.4, Phase 1, Hz 60. Unknown if operational.Good		\$1	Top Serial #S3330, Bottom Serial #016
	112.75 8-526	Mig Welder, Electric Memcomatic 250 Unknown if operational, unable to see any of the information on it as rubbed off.Good		\$1	
	450.00 8-527	Mitre Saw & Rotary Table, King Canada 10" with Jessem Rotary Table Model #04100 Compound sliding mitre saw with twin laser guide system, 15 Amp; 120V, Hz 50, RPM 5200. Unknown if operational.Good		\$1	142,760,200
	27.77 8-528	Nails and Staples, Lot of 15 Assortment.Good		\$1	
	202.50 8-529	Pavers, Lot of 500 Assorted Three pallets.Good		\$1	
	48.00 8-530	Peg Board Set, Lot of 6 Plastic 82 piece.New- Unused		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
589.89 8-531	Planer, King Industrial 15" Industrial, Electric. Model No. KC-382CFX Voltage 240, Phase 1, Hz 60, Amp 18A, RPM 3450, HP/CV 3. Operational.Good		\$1	TK15510
No Bid * 7-528	Respirator, 3M, 6100/07024 (AAD) Small Package opened, half facepiece, reusable. No expiry and used.Good		\$1	
30.00 8-532	Safety Goggles, Lot of 13 Pyramex, assorted New, goggles/glasses.New- Unused		\$1	
131.00 8-533	Sandblasting Cabinet, Metal, industrial. Blue, unknown if operational, 32.5"l x 51.75"w x 61"h.Good		\$1	
36.77 8-534	Saw and Blades, Lot of 75 Miscellaneous saw blades, hinge pins, back plates, 10" mitre saw. Unsure if saw is operational.Good		\$1	
68.00 8-535	Sewer Hoses, Lot of 2 Kevlar Coated with heat tracers, 205" diameter, approximately 150'.Good		\$1	
3.00 8-536	Tires, Wood and Brackets, Lot of 75 Assorted sizes, approx 10" in diameter, 4.10/3.5.0-4, make unknown.Good		\$1	
*WD * 8-537	Vice Grip, Workbench Blue, operational.Good		\$1	
48.00 8-538	Vice Grip, Workbench Blue, operational.Good		\$1	
247.00 8-539	Welding Supplies & Cart, Lot of 30 Steel Cart Assorted items, cart size, 34"l x 22"w x 19.5"h.Good		\$1	
SASKATOON, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, Employment Standards, 122 3rd Ave N				
Contact Leanne McCullough 306-933-5799, leanne.mccullough@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 7-562	Chair, Swivel, high back, black 5 castor, with arms.Fair		\$1	
TISDALE, SaskBuilds and Procurement, 1105-99 St Brocklebank Pl.				
Contact Cosette Koziel, 306-878-8800 cosette.koziel@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 6-523	Dumpster, metal, plastic top Floor has rust, rest of bin is good condition. Size is 6' wide x 5.5' deep x 5' tall at front and sloping to 4' tall at back.Fair		\$500	
YORKTON, Highways, Fleet Services, 245 York Road East.				
Contact Brian Perih 306-786-1651 or Ed Patzwald 306-786-1687 email: brian.perih@gov.sk.ca or ed.patzwald@gov.sk.ca.				
No Bid * 6-622	Pneumatic Torque Wrench Accessories, 2005 Sioux, Model TM50AO-1075 Includes regulator, case and reaction arm ring. Torque wrench itself is not included.Fair		\$25	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, Corporate Services, 515 Henderson Dr				
Contact Stephanie Larson 905-246-5035, slarson@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 8-565	Printer, Hewlett-Packard OfficeJet 250 Mobile All in One This item is UNTESTED and offered AS IS. No cords are included, but power cords can be requested (dependent upon stock).Fair		\$1	TH01Y750JX
No Bid * 8-566	Printer, Hewlett-Packard OfficeJet 250 Mobile All in One This item is UNTESTED and offered AS IS. No cords are included, but power cords can be requested (dependent upon stock).Fair		\$1	TH0267518F
No Bid * 8-567	Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet M806DN This item is UNTESTED and offered AS IS. No cords are included, but power cords can be requested (dependent upon stock). ***This printer is VERY LARGE & VERY HEAVY with NO WHEELS (meant for tabletop use). Pickup will require 2 very strong men or taken on a pallet (pallet provided) and an appropriate truck or other large vehicle. Warehouse has pallet jack for use at pickup.Fair		\$1	JPCCJ5V0B1
No Bid * 8-568	Printer, Epson XP-610 Printer/Scanner This item is UNTESTED and offered AS IS. No cords are included, but power cords can be requested (dependent upon stock).Fair		\$1	SN5Y090321