

SALE SUMMARY LIST

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to 304-787-2092; by phone 304-787-2042 or 304-787-2238,
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.

WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.

No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number	
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles					
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.					
4,678.78	7-001	Car 2009 CHRYSLER, Sebring LX, FWD, 2.4L, inline 4, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, trunk release, keyless entry-2 key fobs. , blue, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 191,329 km, , PROBLEMS: All pads and rotors need replacement and left rear upper knuckle bushing, hood scratches/chips, front and rear bumper chips/scratches/small dent, left front fender scratches/rust, trunk lid scratches, windshield cracked, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	191,329 km	\$1,570	1C3LC46B29N573474
3,678.78	7-002	Car 2007 CHRYSLER, Sebring Touring, FWD, 2.7L, V6, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player power heated mirrors, power locks/windows/trunk release/left front seat, keyless entry-2 key fobs. , gold, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 279,478 km, , PROBLEMS: Front pads and rotor, rear struts need replacement, needs four-wheel alignment, check engine code (P0051 H2O sensor, heater control circuit low (bank 2 sensor 1)), head lights fogged, headliner loose, hood paint bubbling/scratches/dents, front bumper scratches/chips, left front fender scratches, rear left fender rusted, rear right fender rusted, left and right front door glass scratched, roof hail dents, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	279,478 km	\$500	1C3LC56R67N629724
4,378.78	7-008	Car 2011 DODGE, Avenger SXT, FWD, 2.4L Inline 4 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/mirrors/lock/trunk release, keyless entry-2 key fobs. , silver, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 229,975 km, , PROBLEMS: Removed from road due to high repair estimate (potentially suspension and rad leak), Rear pads and rotors need replacement, rear caliper pins seized, tires are in poor condition, hood bubbling/scratches, front bumper cracked, rear bumper scratches, left front fender scratches/dents, left side doors rust inside bottom, left rear door road rash, rear side doors rust inside bottom/dent, roof scratches, trunk lid scratches/slight rust, windshield chips/stone bruise, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	229,975 km	\$1,536	1B3BD4FB4BN514051

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
2,125.00 7-003	Truck 2008 CHEVROLET, Silverado 1500, 4WD, Extended Cab, 6'7" Box, 5.3L, V8, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 1-key. Grill inserts, side steps, hitch, trailer wiring, has a back seat., black, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 357,160 km, , PROBLEMS: Both lower ball joints/AC belt/ rear shoes/rear drums/front pads and rotors/ wheel cylinder need replacement. Four-wheel alignment needed, engine light codes (P0036 H2O bank 1 sensor 2, P0056/P0138/P0141 (B152)), all four tires poor conditions, right head light fogged, grille broken, hood chips/scratches/dents, front bumper rust spots, left front and rear fender rust/road rash/scratches, right front and rear fender road rash/chips/scratches, right rear fender rust hole, rocker panel rust/road rash, right rear door hard to open, left front door outside handle loose, both sides front and rear door road rash/chips/rust, roof small dent/rust spots/scratches, tailgate dents/paint poor, windshield and driver mirror cracked, left front glass broken, needs new mud flaps, both plate lights foggy, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	357,160 km	\$1,016	1GCEK19038Z288189
5,600.00 7-004	Truck 2012 CHEVROLET, Silverado 2500 HD, 4WD, Extended Cab, 8' Box, 6.0L, V8, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player power windows/mirrors/locks, keyless entry-1 fob, 2 keys. Front tow hooks, sidestep, hitch, trailer wiring, original equipment manufacturer (OEM) trailer brakes, headache rack with beacon, mud flaps, has a back seat., white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 321,511 km, , PROBLEMS: Caliper pins sticking, right lower ball joint, front and rear rotors need changing, front and rear brake pads need changing, four-wheel alignment, anti-lock brakes (ABS) light on, check engine light code (C0045 left rear wheel speed short to ground), left rear taillight lens-hole (needs new assembly), front bumper chrome peeling, left front fender rusted-hole, rear left fender rusted, front rear fender rusted, rear right fender road rash, left front door road rash, windshield chips, left front cushion/ cover worn, wheel wrench and jack missing, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> , As is, Where is	321,511 km	\$3,965	1GC2KVCG2CZ204274

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
6,469.00 7-005	Truck 2007 DODGE, Ram 2500 SLT, 4WD, quad cab, 6'5" Box, 5.7L, V8, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, Am/FM/CD player, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows/left front seat, keyless entry-1 key fob, 1 broken key fob. Front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, UWS Gull Wing tool box-fair condition-key does not work, has a back seat., red, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 242,418 km, , PROBLEMS: Tie rod at pit arm needs replacement, left axle seal leaking, four-wheel alignment needed, motor has tick noise first start cold, grille chrome peeling, hood scratches/chips, left front and rear fender road rash/rust/ front has dents, rear right fender road rash, roof small chips, tailgate scratches, windshield chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	242,418 km	\$4,602	1D7KS28D97J612567
6,878.78 7-006	Truck 2013 FORD, F250 Super Duty, 4WD, crew cab, 6'8" Box, 6.2L, V8, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power windows/locks/mirrors, keyless entry-1 key fob. Side steps, grille inserts, hitch, trailer wiring, original equipment manufacturer (OEM) trailer brake, headache rack with beacon, plywood liner in box, trailer tow mirrors, front tow hooks., grey, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 271,066 km, , PROBLEMS: Signal switch broken, plate light needs replacement, driver seat ripped/worn, right front seat worn and ripped, hole in back seat, 2-holes in front hump, hood hail/scratches, front bumper scratches, rear bumper rust, left front and rear fender rust/scratches, right rear fender rust, left side doors front and rear rust at bottom/scratches, right side doors front and rear rust inside bottom/dents, roof hail/small rust spots, tailgate rust/dents/scratches/poor paint, windshield small chips, 2-way Kenwood radio removed-missing face plate, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	271,066 km	\$6,341	1FT7W2B63DEA25428

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
5,522.00 7-009	Truck 2009 GMC, Sierra 1500, 4WD, Extended Cab, 6'6" Box, 5.3L V8 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 2 keys. Better Built toolbox, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, front tow hooks, has a back seat., white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 231,376 km, Recent Repairs: driver floor trim repaired Sept 27/2022, PROBLEMS: Left lower ball joint needs attention, rear shoes cracked, both rear hub caps missing, tires make noise, front middle seat belt buckle damaged, drivers sun visor clip broken, both box rails dented/rusting, head ache rack bent/rusted, hood missing head deflector, rear bumper bent/dented, left rear fender road rash/rust/dent, right rear fender badly dented, all doors road rash, left front door missing seal at bottom, roof badly rusted, windshield chips, wheel wrench loose under seat, no first aid kits/fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	231,376 km	\$3,528	1GTEK19089Z245095
4,252.00 7-010	Van 2007 DODGE, Grand Caravan Cargo, FWD, 3.3L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks, remote start-non functioning, 2 keys. Loose map box, front weather tech mats, cargo barrier, carpet over plywood in rear, trailer hitch., white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 119,300km, , PROBLEMS: Nosie around engine area on startup, power steering leaking and making noise left side, block heater small leak, left rocker panel rusted out, hood chips, both bumpers chips/scratches, left front fender rust, right rear fender rust, rocker panel rusted, left side doors rusted at bottom, right side doors rusted inside bottom, left front door seal rusted, roof 11" x 11 metal piece sealed to roof, hole in roof sealed, tailgate scratches at top. No first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield small chips, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	119,300km	\$872	1D4GP23E07B214663

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
4,578.78 7-011	Van 2008 DODGE, Grand Caravan Cargo, FWD, 3.3L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power front windows/locks, keyless entry-2 key fobs. Roof rack brackets-no cross member, cargo barrier, steel floor, 2-shelves, hitch., white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 154,784 km, , PROBLEMS: Front link worn, front rotors rusted, windshield wipers need replacement, hood paint bubbling/chips/dents/bent left top corner, front bumper cracked, rear bumper dents/scratches, left rear fender rust, right front fender chips, right rear fender chips/scratches, left and right door chips/scratches, left front door rust/dents, left rear door road rash/dents, rust on left front inner door seal, handle on roof bent, left front floor mat worn, windshield chips, right front mirror scratched, no first aid kit, no fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor exterior damages.>, As is, Where is	154,784 km	\$1,750	1D4HN11H88B143893
4,252.00 7-007	Van 2008 DODGE, Grand Caravan, Cargo, FWD, 3.3L, V6, gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power front windows, power locks, keyless entry-2 key fobs. Roof rack brackets-no crossbars, hitch, map box, cargo barrier, steel floor, 1-shelf unit., white, TOW ONLY, FAILED SGI Inspection. Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 142,769 km, , PROBLEMS: Both lower ball joints need replacement, front differential leaking, battery needs to be secured, left washer nozzle broken, front and rear bumper cracked/chips/scratches/bent, left front and rear fender rust/dents, right front bumper rust/scratches, left front and rear door scratches/dents, right front and rear door small bend at bottom/scratches/dent, roof rust, three holes in roof, sealed, windshield cracked, dent above left rear window, handle on roof bent, floor mats worn, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	142,769 km	\$1,950	1D4HN11H08B139921
*MT *MT 7-012	Van 2008 DODGE/RAM, Grand Caravan Cargo, FWD, 3.3L V6 gas, auto, A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power front windows/locks, remote start-1 fob condition unknown, keyless entry-2 key fobs. Map box, cargo barrier, steel floor, shelving, trailer hitch, roof rack brackets no cross member., white, PASSED SGI Inspection. **Please note: the SGI Inspection currently provided is only valid for 30 days after the date of the inspection.** 127,040 km, , PROBLEMS: VIN on dash partially blocked, parking lot dents, rail handle on roof bent, hood paint bubbling, front bumper hole in front, rear bumper scratches/chips, both left fenders rust, right front fender dents, right rear fender rust, left side doors chips/scratches, right front door rust at bottom, hole in roof, three sealed, tailgate glass scratched, windshield small chips, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	127,040 km	\$2,750	1D4HN11H28B143582

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.				
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.				
No Bid * 7-101	Bench Seat, Grey. Cloth fabric. 52"w x 28"d Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 7-102	Bench Seat, Grey. Cloth fabric. 52"w x 28"d Poor		\$1	
No Bid * 6-103	Ladder rack, 64"w x 90"h Metal adjustable ladder rack with beacon. Mounting brackets included. White in color, unknown manufacturer. Good		\$150	171579, Sasktel 297197
No Bid * 6-123	Manhole Gate Holder, Titan Stainless, aluminum 39"w x 46.5"d x 7.5"h, door hinge broken. Good		\$15	
215.00 7-103	Rear Step Bumper, OEM G.M. With mounting brackets, bolts and spare tire lock cylinder-no key. Compatible with a 2005 GMC Sierra 1500, 2500, 3500. May be other applications. Good		\$200	A05010.
215.00 7-104	Rear Step Bumper, OEM G.M. With mounting brackets, bolts and spare tire lock cylinder-no key. Compatible with a 2005 GMC Sierra 1500, 2500, 3500. Missing plate light. May be other applications. Good		\$190	A05008.
*WD 7-111	Tailgate, OEM, Chevy Silverado May be compatible with 2004 and newer 1500, 2500 + 3500, minor black marks, dents or scratches, yellow in color. Good		\$200	A04012 516229.
*WD 7-112	Tailgate, OEM, Chevy Silverado May be compatible with 2004 and newer 1500, 2500 + 3500, minor dents or scratches, yellow in colour. Good		\$200	A4011 516369
36.02 * 11-125	Tires, Set of 3225/65R/16 Firestone FR710. M+S, manufacture date: week 47, year 2016. Good		\$1	
36.02 * 2-102	Tires, Set of 316 inch, 215/65R/16, Sumitomo HTR Enhance L/X manufacture date: week 27, year 2018. Good		\$1	
16.02 * 2-128	Tire, 16 inch, 225/65R/16, Sailun IceBlazer, Snowflake manufacture date. Week 16, year 2021. Good		\$1	
26.02 * 2-130	Tires, Set of 216 inch, 205/60R/16, Matrix Tour RD Multi-mile. manufacture date: week 44, year 2011. Fair		\$1	
62.02 * 3-107	Tires, Set of 4Dunlop Grantrek SJB. Snowflake. 215/65R/16, Manufacture date. Week 13, year 2009. Fair		\$1	
120.00 * 6-108	Tires, Set of 4 Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow flake. Mud and snow. 215/65R/16 Manufacture date. Week 22. Year 2018. Fair		\$120	
No Bid * 6-129	Tires, Set of 4Sumitomo Enhance HTR LX. M+S. 215/65R/17, manufacture date. Week 26, year 2017. Fair		\$120	
210.00 * 6-132	Tires, Set of 4Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow flake, M+S. 215/65R/16, manufacture date. Week 21, year 2018 Good		\$160	
160.00 * 6-133	Tires, Set of 3Sumitomo Ice Edge. Snow flake, M+S. 225/75R/17, manufacture date. Week 18, year 2018. Good		\$160	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
258.60 7-105	Tires, Set of 4P265/70R17, Firestone Destination. A/T2. M+S, Snow Flake. Manufacture date. Week 37, year 2021. Good		\$190	
171.00 7-106	Tires, Set of 4215/55R16, Firestone All Season. M+S. Manufacture date. Week 36, year 2020. Good		\$170	
317.51 7-107	Tires, Set of 4225/65R17, Firestone Weather Grip. M+S, snow flake. Manufacture date. Week 30, year 2020. Excellent		\$180	
*WD 7-108	Tires, Set of 4225/65R17, Goodyear Assurance. M+S. Fuel max. M+S. Manufacture date. Week 37, year 2018. Poor		\$40	
256.51 7-109	Tires, Set of 4225/70R17, Firestone Destination LE3. M+S. Manufacture date. Week 25, year 2021. Excellent		\$190	
No Bid * 7-113	Tires, Set of 4225/65R/16, Firestone All season. M+S. Manufacture date, week 45, year 2018. Good		\$160	
No Bid * 7-114	Tires, Set of 4225/65R/16, Firestone FR710. M+S Manufacture date, week 22, year 2016. Good		\$160	
190.00 7-115	Tires, Set of 4225/55R17, Firestone Winterforce 2. Snow flake, M+S Manufacture date, week 48, year 2019. Excellent		\$190	
225.00 7-110	Tool Box, Aluminum chest with beveled lid. To be mounted in the box of a truck. With keys. 48"w x 20"d x 17"h .May be compatible with a 2012 Chev Colorado. Excellent		\$150	436,995
7.50 * 6-125	Winter Front / Bug Screen, For a 2000 2002 Dodge Ram Van, Via WF 923-3 Snaps may be missing. Good		\$5	
11.11 * 6-126	Winter Front / Bug Screen, For a 2007 2008 Dodge Durango, Via WF 929-57 Snaps may be missing. Good		\$5	
No Bid * 6-127	Winter Front / Bug Screen, For a 2007 2008 Dodge Durango, Via WF 929-57 Snaps may be missing. Good		\$5	
No Bid * 5-112	File Cabinet, Metal 14"l x 27"w x 28"h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 5-117	File Cabinet , Metal, Vertical 17"l x 30"w x 29.5"h. Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 5-120	Table, Metal, Wood 36"l x 24.5"w x 27"h. Fair		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number	
BUFFALO NARROWS, Highways, Operations and Maintenance, 1900 Cummings Drive.					
Contact Mark Eisenkirch, 306-526-9103 mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca					
6,250.00	7-566	Dump Truck, 1989IHC25542WDDTA 466, diesel manual5 speed, box length 12', single axel, standard differential, wheel base 198" dual tire, tire size 11x22.5, 14 ply.yellow296,334 kmsRecent Repairs: Differential carrier and gears recently rebuilt.PROBLEMS: Box is getting very rusty, subframe very rusty, Unit runs and drives fairly well, cab floor has rust holes in it, rough shape unit, battery, windshield glass, wipers and interior all in poor condition. As is, Where is	296,334 kms	\$3,500	1HTZLDBR6KH669334
26,001.51	7-565	Grader, 2006VolvoG720B4WD7.1L, D7D GAE2, inline 6, diesel PowershiftA/C, tilt8 speed,standard differential, single tire, tire size 17.5R 25, 14 plyyellow13111 hrsRecent Repairs:PROBLEMS: 13111 hour unit so cosmetically not pretty but overall still a decent unit, very well used unit needs lots of TLC, battery, windshield glass and wipers in poor conditon. As is, Where is	13111 hrs	\$10,000	38,153
CUMBERLAND HOUSE, Highways, Operations and Maintenance, Lot 3&4 Block 17, Morin Ave					
Contact Brent Douglas 306-961-0525, brent.douglas@gov.sk.ca or Lindsey Brisbois 306-276-8524, lindsey.brisbois@gov.sk.ca					
616.00	7-567	Office Car , 1978Homebuilt 10' x 34', 6 man, comes with a microwave and gas stove and both are in good condition. See Terms and Conditions of Sale Document. Stove, bunk bed and work bench are included in the sale, as they are all bolted down. Microwave is also included and it is strapped down for transport. All utilites are disconnected. Towable it has a hitch on it. Poor		\$1	342,539
HUDSON BAY, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 501 Prince Street					
Contact Randy Carlson (306)-865-4400, Randy.Carlson@gov.sk.ca or Shelley Kraft-Schnell (306) 865-4400, shelley.kraftschnell@gov.sk.ca					
7.77	* 5-549	Chest Waders, Acton One size 10 and one sixe 11 chest waders. Unknown if they leak. Fair		\$1	
No Bid	* 5-557	Spotlight, Coleman Unknown if operational. Poor		\$1	
MEADOW LAKE, Highways, Fleet Services, Hwy #4 305- 9th St West.					
Contact Mark Eisenkirch 306-446-3358, mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca.					
11,765.00	7-552	Tractor, 1990Ford77102WDInline 4, diesel manualA/CTrubo diesel, 8 speed, standard differential, single, tire size 7.50-16 front 18.4-34 rear, front tires 6 PLY, rear tires 8 PLY.yellow3843 hrsPROBLEMS: Front right tire worn, tires/brakes are fair, back of mirrors rusted, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is	3843 hrs	\$5,000	BC29325
7,064.00	7-553	Tractor, 1983Case20902WDInline 6, diesel manualA/C108 horse power, 12 speed, standard differential, tires single, tire size front 10-16 rear 20.8-38, front tires 6 PLY, rear tires 8 PLY.yellow6,308 hrsPROBLEMS: Windshield cracked lower left, no windshield washer, moss growing in the interior, no brake lights, no horn, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is	6,308 hrs	\$5,000	9,927,685

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
MEADOW LAKE, Corrections Policing and Public Safety, 301 - 6th Street East				
Contact Tangy Laird 306-236-7557, tangy.laird@gov.sk.ca or Tonya Williamson 306-236-7543, tonya.williamson@gov.sk.ca				
*WD	7-540	Boat, 2008, Lund 18 ft, black, unknown if operational, Mercury 115hp 4 stroke motor, according to receipts motors last service was 2017, boats been sitting for a year. Poor	\$1	1B586913
1,060.00	7-541	Trailer, 1995, Snowmobile, ATV, Flatdeck, metal frame, wood deck 16'l x 8'w, 2" ball hitch, works fine. Poor	\$1	2N913521165504167
*MT	7-542	Trailer, Snowmobile, Metal, wood and plastic 4'w x 13'l, 2.5" ball hitch, bent axle and no ramp, useable just needs repairs, wears the tires quickly. Poor	\$1	
318.00	7-543	Trailer, Utility, metal and wood 10'l x 5.2'w, 2" ball hitch. Broken Repairable	\$1	
119.00	7-544	Trailer, Utility, metal and wood 8'l x 7.5'w, 1 7/8" ball hitch. Broken Repairable	\$1	
MEADOW LAKE, SaskBuilds and Procurement, 101 Railway Pl				
Contact Jim Wassing (306)-240-5407, jim.wassing@gov.sk.ca or Mathew Chuckrey (306)-304-5556, mathew.chuckrey@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid	* 5-523	A/C Unit, Ducane Model AC10B3C-A Unknown if operational. Poor	\$1	3,406,410,219
MOOSE JAW, Highways & Infrastructure, Fleet Services, 1 km south of Moose Jaw on Highway #2.				
Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca				
35,030.00	7-548	Broom Tractor, 1999FordNew Holland TV1404WDinline 6, diesel hydrostaticA/C110 horse power, 3 speed, standard differential, single tires, tires size 480/85R34.yellow4,879 hrsPROBLEMS: Engine oil leak (pan gasket, rear seal) battery cover missing, two broken fenders, one bent fender, parking brake is poor, windshield washer not working, some lights not working, tires/exhaust/windshield/interior are fair, poor battery, some body rust, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is	4,879 hrs \$3,000	D203902
8,521.77	7-547	Broom Tractor, 1990Ford7710RWDinline 4, diesel manualA/C85 horse power, GVW 10800 lbs, 8 speed, standard differential, single tire, tire size: Front, 11L-16/ rear 480/85R34.yellow4297 hrsPROBLEMS: Headliner ripped, no signal lights, front lights not working, steering oil leak from container mounting, transmission oil pipe leak, oil leak at rear of engine, brakes are in poor condition, paint is rusty. As is, Where is	4297 hrs \$3,000	BC63409
PRINCE ALBERT, Highways, Northern Operations, 81 North Industrial Dr.				
Contact Cory Palko 306-960-5152, cory.palko@gov.sk.ca.				
1,101.00	7-556	Boiler, 1975Saskatoon Boiler, Portable Operational when removed from service, requires certification. Fair	\$1	3,354
1,101.00	7-559	Boiler, Saskatoon Boiler, Portable, 30 HP Non operational. Poor	\$1	385
1,200.00	7-555	Grader-Mounted Ripper, Fits Deere 870D Motor Graders Yellow, hitch receiver bent. Fair	\$500	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
877.00 7-560	Snowplow , 1993, MHI Built, 12" variable Overall condition unknown. Poor		\$1	
51.00 7-554	Water Pump, Gas powered, Wissconsin ACN engine On home made wagon, unkown if operational. Poor		\$1	
1,365.00 7-561	Water Trailer , 800 Gallons Unknown if operational Poor		\$1	
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Avenue North				
Contact Brent Zbaraschuk 306-953-2428, brent.zbaraschuk@gov.sk.ca or Tyla Wills 306-953-3400, Tyla.wills@gov.sk.ca				
111.11 7-501	Camping Tents, Lot of 6 Approximately 10'w x 16'l x 6'h plastic tarp, without floors, some issues with the zippers, may have holes or fraying. Broken Repairable		\$1	
111.11 7-502	Camping Tents, Lot of 6 Approximately 10'w x 16'l x 6'h plastic tarp, without floors, some issues with the zippers, may have holes or fraying. Broken Repairable		\$1	
111.11 7-503	Camping Tents, Lot of 6 Approximately 10'w x 16'l x 6'h plastic tarp, without floors, some issues with the zippers, may have holes or fraying. Broken Repairable		\$1	
260.00 7-557	Chainsaws, Lot of 32 - Stihl 026, 1 - Sthil 036 Broken and repairable. Broken Repairable		\$1	239512086 274348629
252.00 7-504	Chainsaws , Lot of 54 - Shtil 026, 1 - Sthil 036 Broken, need repairing. Beyond Repair		\$1	245334099
152.00 7-558	Chainsaws , Lot of 44 - Sthil 026 Broken and repairable. Broken Repairable		\$1	243146397 238850533
26.87 7-505	Mess Kit, Lot of 5 Used at fire camps, have been washed but may be stained or dusty due to storage. Varoius quantity most likely containing camping pots, pan, plastic dishes, plastic cups and cutlery. Fair		\$1	
17.41 7-506	Mess Kit, Lot of 5 Used at fire camps, have been washed but may be stained or dusty due to storage. Varoius quantity most likely containing camping pots, pan, plastic dishes, plastic cups and cutlery. Fair		\$1	
128.00 7-507	Rubber Water Bags, 10+ bagsHeavy rubber, various sizes 3 feet wide by up to 70 feet long, with small to large holes or frays. Water bags were used are control dykes and may be repairable with patch kits. Water bags are stained, cut or have fraying leading to weakness in the bag. Beyond Repair		\$1	
28.00 7-508	Rubber Water Bags, 10+ bagsHeavy rubber, various sizes 3 feet wide by up to 70 feet long, with small to large holes or frays. Water bags were used are control dykes and may be repairable with patch kits. Water bags are stained, cut or have fraying leading to weakness in the bag. Beyond Repair		\$1	
2,525.00 7-509	UTV, 2009 Polaris Rhino 700FI, Fuel Injection Engine is blown, otherwise no mechanical issues known. Used for 262 hours. Broken Repairable		\$500	5Y4AM20W59A300530

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
REGINA, Highways, Operations and Maintenance, 1610 Park St				
Contact Ethan Reoch 306-510-0676 ethan.reoch@gov.sk.ca				
101.00	7-549 Borehole Logging Machine, 1981Well L, 1500 Operational when placed in storage 12 years ago. Good		\$1	248
102.00	7-551 Borehole Logging Machine, 2009Matrix Operational when placed in storage 12 years ago. Good		\$1	080C
55.55	7-550 Rolling Profiler, 2005International Cybernetics, ICC SURPRO 2000 Operational when placed in storage 12 years ago. Good		\$1	990,110,001
REGINA, Highways, Operations and Maintenance, 221 N Winnipeg St.				
Contact Ethan Reoch 306-519-3560 ethan.reoch@gov.sk.ca or Braden Huel 306-531-4705 Braden.Huel@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	4-506 Car Seats , Blue, three seat row with seat buckles. Unknown make. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	4-507 Car Seats , Grey, three seat row with seat buckles. Unknown make. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	4-508 Ducted Fume Hood, Includes vent, 30" x 65" x 47". Broken Repairable		\$1	
REGINA, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, Corporate Services, 1870 Albert St.				
Contact Waneta Hardy 306-798-0312, waneta.hardy@gov.sk.ca, or Derek Wagner 306-787-1879, derek.wagner@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	6-580 Binders, 4 boxes Mostly black and white, varying sizes, used. Fair		\$1	
No Bid *	6-581 Headset, Agptek Headset only, no base so unable to determine if operational. Poor		\$1	
No Bid *	6-583 Headsets, Lot of 4Jabra No bases. Poor		\$1	
No Bid *	6-584 Headsets, Lot of 3Jabra With bases, unsure if operational. Poor		\$1	
No Bid *	6-585 Headsets, Lot of 5Plantronics With bases, unsure if operational. Poor		\$1	
No Bid *	6-587 Painting, Picture of a tree, 10"w x 20"h. Fair		\$1	
*MT	* 6-588 Projector, Kodak Ektagraphic III Unsure if operational Poor		\$1	A-631031
No Bid *	6-589 Step File, Lot of 3 Black coating. Good		\$1	
SASKATOON, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, SCC, 910 60th street East, Saskatoon				
Contact Jaqueline Danyluk 306-956-8913, jacqueline.danyluk4@gov.sk.ca or Danielle Corriveau 306-956-8869, Danielle.Corriveau@gov.sk.ca.				
1,678.99	7-510 Band Saw, Acklands Limited Machine 350 MR, with Rails Cycle 60, phase 3, voltage 24V, comes with rails, operational. Good		\$1	6-1979-4
1,289.89	7-511 Band Saw, UE-250V OSA, horizontal with Induction Motor JE 250V CSA, 10", blade 1"x.32"x130", variable speed adjustments from 25 mpm to 75 mpm, blade size 129/10 1"x0.037, 220V, 60Hz, 1720 RPM, 15 amps, 2HP, in very good condition, movable with pallet jack. Good		\$1	0167
2,666.66	7-512 Band Saw, Hyd-Mech, S-20 240V, 50 Hz; 2HP, operational. Good		\$1	20,589,274

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
551.99 7-513	Connecticut Bending Brake, Metal Bender, Roper Whitney Company, U416 Not power assisted, operational . Good		\$1	
135.80 7-514	Dishwasher, CMA Dishmachines L-1X, Commercial, Metal 115V, 16 amps, non-operational. Poor		\$1	206,618
*MT 7-515	Floor Scrubber, Taski Swingo 1250B, Series 0208 24V, 1000W, max 240 kg, comes with batteries and charger. Good		\$1	7,511,207,037,272
206.00 7-516	Hydraulic Press, 6000 PSI Comes with 2 pails and hydraulic jack, orange/black, non-operational, unknown if repairable. Poor		\$1	
219.00 7-517	Hydraulic Press, Orange Requires a hydraulic pump to work. Good		\$1	
668.00 7-518	Lathe, Metal, Electric Unknown if operational, comes with multiple accessories and castor oil. Good		\$1	
1,619.13 7-519	Lathe, The Mysore Kirloskar Ltd., Metal, 1973 Size (mm) 165x1000. Basic functions work well, unknown if the autofeed works. This machine was used to make weld test coupons for many years. Good		\$1	
510.00 7-520	Meat Grinder, Hobart, Electric 208V. 60Hz. 1725 RPM. 12.6 amps. PH, 3. Temp, 400 AMB, unknown if operational. Good		\$1	1,001,350
4,525.00 7-521	Metal Punch, Kingsland Power, Metalworking Machine, J21A Green, operational, comes with 2 bits. Good		\$1	12,363
780.25 7-522	Metal Shear, Challenger, FS-P5Z1ZH Operational. Good		\$1	900,946
206.00 7-523	Mig Welder, Miller CP-200 Three phase, 60Hz, unknown if operational. Good		\$1	CT123972
247.00 7-524	Mixer, Hobart, Commercial, Model H6007 17390HP, Phase, 3, 3.2 amps; 60 cycles; 208V unknown if operational. Good		\$1	1,917,492
2,222.22 7-525	Overhead Crane Hoist, Kito Hoists, EF2-020. Land Crane, EF2-92SY7996 , 2 Ton Plain Trolley, TFP020 Volts: 115; phases: 1; hertz: 60; hoist motor: 0.73 HP; amps: 12.1; operational. Good		\$1	36,299
5.00 7-526	Particulate Filters P100, 3M, 2091/070000, Package of 2 Manufactured in August 2018, unopened, expires after 5 years from date of manufacture and that would only take effect if the filter is still in the package. Good		\$1	
365.00 7-527	Pipe Bender, Hydraulic, 16 Ton Orange, operational. Good		\$1	
No Bid * 7-528	Respirator, 3M, 6100/07024 (AAD) Small Package opened, half facepiece, reusable. No expiry and used. Good		\$1	
5.00 7-529	Respirator, 3M, 6200/07025 (AAD) Medium Package opened, half facepiece, reusable, no expiry and used. Good		\$1	
21.60 7-530	Respirator, MSA 10039982, Ultra Elite, Medium Made of hycar rubber for added durability, ergonomic design offers maximum comfort and protection, includes distortion-free lens that allows clear field of view, comes with 5-point harness for easy on/off, contains unique airflow that prevents the lens from misting, ideal for firefighting and civil disturbances, opened and used. Good		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
15.60 7-531	Respirator, MSA 10075905, Advantage 4000, Medium For air-purifying, supplied-air and powered air-purifying needs, , opened and used. Good		\$1	
15.60 7-532	Respirator, MSA 10075917, Advantage 4000, Large For air-purifying, supplied-air and powered air-purifying needs, , opened and used. Good		\$1	
25.99 7-533	Respirator, MSA 10084355, Ultra Elite Large, State of the art mask provides excellent comfort and protection, distortion-free lens allows wide field of view, 5-point harnesss allows easy on/off, opened and used. Good		\$1	
15.60 7-534	Respirator, North, 5400 Full face, complete protection for asbestos abatement and sandblasting, anti-scratch polycarbonate lens offers a 200 field of vision, threaded connectors secure cartridge and filters, opened, no expiry and used. Good		\$1	
103.25 7-535	Roller Jacks, With Miscellaneous Accessories Good		\$1	
300.00 7-536	Sand Blast Cabinet, Red and Blue, On Motor Made by Leroy-Somer; 65HP; 3600 RPM; Phase 1; 60Hz, unknown if operational. Good		\$1	Filter Box: 663 Motor: 201578
1,555.75 7-537	Shear Machine, Rush Worth, Metal 48W, 65 amps, 120V; 60Hz; Capacity 6' x 1/4", operational, comes with adjustable legs, cuts metal - any length. Good		\$1	
389.00 7-538	Spray Cleaner, Nacecare Solutions Electric, FoamTec Wall washer, 120V 60Hz 14 Amps. Good		\$1	
12.00 7-539	Winch, Motor with Steel Cable, Pull-A-Car Model No. 15, Motor Type, TEFC Electric motor, good working condition, manufactured by Brook Electric Motors. Cable length unknown. Good		\$1	Motor: X334180 Winch: 1004
SASKATOON, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, Employment Standards, 122 3rd Ave N				
Contact Leanne McCullough 306-933-5799, leanne.mccullough@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 7-562	Chair, Swivel, high back, black 5 castor, with arms. Fair		\$1	
26.02 7-563	Chairs, Lot of 9Swivel, blue 5 castor, with arms. Fair		\$1	
10.00 7-564	Table, pepperdust, metal legs 54"l x 27"w x 30"h. Good		\$1	
SASKATOON, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 200 Confederation Dr				
Contact Travis Wock 306-787-0179, twock@slga.com or Wanda Blythe 306-933-8216, wblythe@slga.com				
675.00 7-546	Power Lift Truck, Raymond 102T-F45L, Walkie, 102XM391 hours, operational. Good		\$1	102-15-36441
350.00 7-545	Power Lift Truck, Raymond 102T-F45L, Walkie6842 hours, operational. Fair		\$1	102-08-10691
SASKATOON, Water Security Agency, 10-3904 Millar Ave				
Contact Iain Phillips 306-290-9483, iain.phillips@wsask.ca or Ayold Elgersma 306-631-0460, ayold.elgersma@wsask.ca				
1,011.00 7-569	Boat Trailer, 2004EZ Loader TrailerEZL90 For boats under 6 m. Broken Repairable		\$500	1ZEAAEMB33A029739
603.00 7-568	Boat Trailer, 1985Univision, Single axle Set up for approximately 21' boat. Roller bunks, mechanical brakes, 2 inch ball. Fair		\$500	2UNBTGFX8FB000833
TISDALE, SaskBuilds and Procurement, 1105-99 St Brocklebank Pl.				
Contact Cosette Koziel, 306-878-8800 cosette.koziel@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 6-523	Dumpster, metal, plastic top Floor has rust, rest of bin is good condition. Size is 6' wide x 5.5' deep x 5' tall at front and sloping to 4' tall at back. Fair		\$500	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
YORKTON, Highways, Fleet Services, 245 York Road East.				
Contact Brian Perih 306-786-1651 or Ed Patzwald 306-786-1687 email: brian.perih@gov.sk.ca or ed.patzwald@gov.sk.ca.				
No Bid * 6-622	Pneumatic Torque Wrench Accessories, 2005Sioux, Model TM50AO-1075 Includes regulator, case and reaction arm ring. Torque wrench itself is not included. Fair		\$25	